



State of West Virginia
 Department of Administration
 Purchasing Division
 2019 Washington Street East
 Post Office Box 50130
 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for Quotation

RFQ NUMBER
 DNR211037

PAGE
 1

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF:
 FRANK WHITTAKER
 304-558-2316

VENDOR

RFQ COPY
 TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

Trinity Turf, Inc
P.O. Box 9
MT. Crawford, VA 22841

SHIP TO

DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS
 PARKS & RECREATION
 1900 KANAWHA BOULEVARD EAST
 BUILDING 6, ROOM B-451
 CHARLESTON, WV
 25305-0314

DATE PRINTED	TERMS OF SALE	SHIP VIA	F.O.B.	FREIGHT TERMS
10/01/2010				

BID OPENING DATE: 10/27/2010 BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM

LINE	QUANTITY	UOP	CAT NO.	ITEM NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
0001	1	LS		B35-37		
<p>FERTILIZER/FUNGICIDE AND/OR INSECTICIDE</p> <p>THE WEST VIRGINIA PURCHASING DIVISION, FOR THE AGENCY, THE WEST VIRGINIA DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES, IS SOLICITING BIDS FOR GOLF COURSE CHEMICALS AND FERTILIZER FOR TWIN FALLS STATE PARK PER THE ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS.</p> <p>ALL TECHNICAL QUESTIONS MUST BE SUBMITTED IN WRITING TO FRANK WHITTAKER IN THE WV PURCHASING DIVISION VIA EMAIL AT FRANK.M.WHITTAKER@WV.GOV OR VIA FAX AT 304-558-4115. DEADLINE FOR TECHNICAL QUESTIONS IS 10/12/2010 AT 4:00 PM. ALL TECHNICAL QUESTIONS WILL BE ADDRESSED BY ADDENDUM AFTER THE DEADLINE.</p> <p>BANKRUPTCY: IN THE EVENT THE VENDOR/CONTRACTOR FILES FOR BANKRUPTCY PROTECTION, THE STATE MAY DEEM THE CONTRACT NULL AND VOID, AND TERMINATE SUCH CONTRACT WITHOUT FURTHER ORDER.</p> <p>NOTICE</p> <p>A SIGNED BID MUST BE SUBMITTED TO:</p> <p>DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION PURCHASING DIVISION BUILDING 15 2019 WASHINGTON STREET, EAST CHARLESTON, WV 25305-0130</p>						

OCT 27 AM 9:39
 WV PURCHASING DIVISION

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS

SIGNATURE *Kurt Johnson* TELEPHONE *304-246-1847* DATE *10-25-10*

TITLE *President* FEIN *20 116 2584* ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



State of West Virginia
 Department of Administration
 Purchasing Division
 2019 Washington Street East
 Post Office Box 50130
 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for Quotation

RFQ NUMBER
 DNR211037

PAGE
 2

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF
 FRANK WHITTAKER
 304-558-2316

VENDOR

RFQ COPY
 TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

SHIP TO

DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS
 PARKS & RECREATION
 1900 KANAWHA BOULEVARD EAST
 BUILDING 6, ROOM B-451
 CHARLESTON, WV
 25305-0314

DATE PRINTED	TERMS OF SALE	SHIP VIA	F.O.B.	FREIGHT TERMS
10/01/2010				

BID OPENING DATE:

10/27/2010

BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM

LINE	QUANTITY	UOP	CAT. NO.	ITEM NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
<p>THE BID SHOULD CONTAIN THIS INFORMATION ON THE FACE OF THE ENVELOPE OR THE BID MAY NOT BE CONSIDERED:</p> <p>SEALED BID</p> <p>BUYER: 44</p> <p>RFQ. NO.: DNR211037</p> <p>BID OPENING DATE: 10/27/2010</p> <p>BID OPENING TIME: 1:30 PM</p> <p>PLEASE PROVIDE A FAX NUMBER IN CASE IT IS NECESSARY TO CONTACT YOU REGARDING YOUR BID: ----- 540-432-1420 -----</p> <p>CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT CLEARLY): ----- Kurt Fellenstein -----</p>						

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS

SIGNATURE	TELEPHONE	DATE
TITLE	FEIN	ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'

GOLF COURSE CHEMICALS AND FERTILIZER SPECIFICATIONS
TWIN FALLS RESORT STATE PARK

Item No.	Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Amount
1.	4 cases	Armor Tech PPZ 143 Fungicide. Active ingredient Propiconazole: 1 [(2,4 - Dichlorophenyl) 4 - Propyl -1, 3 - Dioxolan - 2 - YL] Methyl] - 1H -1, 2, 4 - Triazole. 14.3%; 2 x 2.5 gal. per case or equal. <i>Select</i>	500.00	2000.00
2.	4 cases	Rubigan Turf Fungicide. Active ingredient Alpha - (2 - Chlorophenyl) Alpha - (4 - Chlorophenyl) - 5 - Pyrimidine - Methanol (Fenarimol). 11.6%; 2 x 1 gal. per case or equal.	600.00	2400.00
3.	4 cases	Armor Tech IP 233 Fungicide. Active ingredient Iprodione: 3 - (3, 5 - Dichlorophenyl) - N - (1 - Methyl ethyl) - 2, 4 - D19XO - 1 - Imidazolidinocarboxamide. 23.3%; 2 x 2.5 gal. per case or equal. <i>E Pro</i>	337.50	1350.00
4.	4 cases	Armor Tech TM 462 Fungicide. Active ingredient Thiophanate - Methyl. 46.2%; 2 x 2.5 gal. per case or equal. <i>Select</i>	398.00	1592.00
5.	4 cases	Armor Tech GLT 720 Fungicide. Active ingredient Chlorothalonil (Tetrachloroisophthalonitrile). 54.0%; 2 x 2.5 gal. per case or equal. <i>Flu</i>	180.00	720.00
6.	4 cases	Quali-Pro Chlorothalonil 500 AN Flowable Fungicide. Active ingredient Chlorothalonil (Tetrachloroisophthalonitrile). 38.5%; 2 x 2.5 gal. per case or equal.	No Bid	
7.	4 cases	ProStar 70 WP Fungicide. Active ingredient Flutolanil N - [3 - (1 - Methyl ethoxy) Phenyl] - 2 - (Trifluoromethyl) Benzamide. 70.0%; 4 x 3 lb. per case or equal.	650.00	2600.00
8.	2 cases	Quali-Pro Mefenoxam AQ Fungicide. Active ingredient Mefenoxam (R) - 2 - [C2, 6 - Dimethylphenyl] Methoxyacetyl amino] Propionic Acid Methyl Ester. 22.5%; 2 x 1 gal. per case or equal.	1100.00	2200.00
9.	22 bags	Anderson's Fungicide IX. Active ingredient Chloroneb, (1,4 - Dichloro - 2, 5 - Dimethoxybenzene). 3.26%; 42.1 lb. bags per case or equal. <i>30 lb.</i>	65.00	1430.00
10.	3 cases	Dylox 420 SL Insecticide. Active ingredient Trichlorofon. 37.3%; 2 x 2.5 gal. per case or equal.	295.00	885.00
11.	4 cases	Gordon's Bensumec 4 LF Preemergent Grass & Weed Herbicide. Active ingredient Bensulide: S - (0, 0 - Diisopropyl Phosphorodithioate) Ester of N - (2 - Mercapto) Benzenesulfonamide. 46.0%; 2 x 2.5 gal. per case or equal.	525.00	2100.00
12.	5 cases	Riverdale MCPP -P4 Amine Herbicide. Active ingredient Dimethylamine Salt of (+) - R - 2 - (2 - Methyl - 4 - Chlorophenoxy) Propionic Acid. 26.0%. NOTE: Isomer Specific Method, Equivalent to: (+) - R - 2 - (2 - Methyl - 4 - Chlorophenoxy) Propionic Acid. 21.5%, 1.9 lbs. Contains the Single Isomer Form of Mecoprop-P. 2 x 2.5 gal. per case or equal.	No Bid	
13.	4 cases	Cascade Plus Deeper Roots Wetting Agent. Active ingredient Proprietary Blend of Sufacants, Polyethylene and Polypropylene Glycols. 100%; 2 x 2.5 gal. per case or equal.	No Bid	
14.	5 cases	Follar-Pak 22-0-4 Liquid Fertilizer. Active ingredient Total Nitrogen 22.0%, Urea 13.0%, Slowly Available Water Soluble Nitrogen 6.0%, Aminonical Nitrogen 1.5%, Nitrate Nitrogen 1.5%, Soluble Potash (K ₂ O) 4.0%, Iron (FE) 25.0%, Manganese (MN) 10.0%, Amino Acids By Volume 1.25%. 2 x 2.5 gal. per case or equal.	No Bid	
15.	4 cases	Turf Vigor 9-3-6 with Beneficial Microbes Liquid Fertilizer. Active ingredient Total Nitrogen (N) 9.00% (Urea Nitrogen), Available Phosphate (P ₂ O ₅) 3.00%, Soluble Potash (K ₂ O) 6.00%, Total Iron (FE) 0.60% (Chelated Iron), Total Manganese (MN) 0.05% (Chelated Manganese), Total Zinc (ZN) 0.05% (Chelated Zinc). 2 x 2.5 gal. per case or equal.	145.30	581.20

GOLF COURSE CHEMICALS AND FERTILIZER SPECIFICATIONS
TWIN FALLS RESORT STATE PARK

Page No. - 2 -

- 22-0-6

16.	100 bags	Fertilizer, 19-3-5 with Team Pro. .86%; 50 lb. bags per case or equal.	16.50	1650.00
17.	130 bags	Fertilizer, 21-0-8 with .2% Grubout. 50 lb. bags per case or equal. 20-0-5	22.00	2860.00
18.	40 bags	Fertilizer, Shaws 21-3-16, 97% Nutralene Greens. 50 lb. bags per case or equal. <i>Par Ex 21-3-16</i>	48.00	1920.00
19.	40 bags	Fertilizer, Shaws 19-0-19 with 73% M.U. Greens Homogenous. 50 lb. bags per case or equal. <i>Country Club</i>	36.50	1460.00
TOTAL				25,748.20

All items are to F.O.B. Destination. Freight or Delivery Charges must be included in the price of the line item cost.

VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application* is hereby made for Preference in accordance with *West Virginia Code*, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to construction contracts). *West Virginia Code*, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid) preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in accordance with the *West Virginia Code*. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

- _____ Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; **or,**
- _____ Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; **or,**
- _____ Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; **or,**

2. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

- _____ Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; **or,**

3. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

- _____ Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees or Bidder's affiliate's or subsidiary's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; **or,**

4. Application is made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

- _____ Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; **or,**

5. Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

- _____ Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is submitted; **or,**

6. Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

- _____ Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penalty against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to the contracting agency or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Division in writing immediately.

Bidder: _____ Signed: _____

Date: _____ Title: _____

*Check any combination of preference consideration(s) indicated above, which you are entitled to receive.

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the aggregate.

DEFINITIONS:

"Debt" means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers' compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

"Debtor" means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or business association owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions. "Political subdivision" means any county commission; municipality; county board of education; any instrumentality established by a county or municipality; any separate corporation or instrumentality established by one or more counties or municipalities, as permitted by law; or any public body charged by law with the performance of a government function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or municipalities. "Related party" means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total contract amount.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to chapter eleven of this code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (*West Virginia Code §61-5-3*), it is hereby certified that the vendor affirms and acknowledges the information in this affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE

Vendor's Name: _____

Authorized Signature: _____ Date: _____

State of _____

County of _____, to-wit:

Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this ____ day of _____, 20__.

My Commission expires _____, 20__.

AFFIX SEAL HERE

NOTARY PUBLIC _____