State of West Virginia Request for
Department of Administraton  Quotation
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East

Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JO ANN ADKINS
304-558-8802
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| GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS |
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

1. Awards will be made in the best interest of the State of West Virginia.
2. The State may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.
3, All quotations are governed by the West Virginia Code and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division.

4. Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division
and have paid the reguired $125 fea.

5. All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Order/Contracts are o be continued for the
term of the Purchase Order/Conftracts, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise
being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or
goods, this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.

6. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.

7. Interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

8. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

9. The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such. taxes.

10. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.

11. The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govern
all rights and duties under the Contract, including without limitation the validity of this Purchase
Order/Contract.

12. Any reference to automalic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written
agreement of the parties.

13. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendorfcontractor files for bankruptcy protection, the State may deem
this contract null and void, and terminate such contract without further order.

14, HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associale
Addendum {BAA), approved by the Attorney General, and available online at the Purchasing Division’s web site
(hitp:/f/www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/hipaa.htm) is hereby made part of the agreement.  Provided that,
the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health
Information (45 CFR §160.103) fo the vendor.

15, WEST VIRGINIA ALCOHOL & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT: If this Contract constitutes a public improvement
construction contract as set forth in Article 1D, Ghapter 21 of the West Virginia Code ("The West Virginia Alcohol
and Drug-Free Workplace Act”), then the following language shall hereby become part of -this Contract: "The
contractor and its subcontractors shall implement and maintain a written drug-free workplace policy in compliance
with the West Virginia Alcohol and Drug-Free Workplace Act, as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Cods. The confractor and its subcontractors shall provide a sworn statement in writing, under the
penalties of perjury, that they maintain a valid drug-free work place policy in compliance with the West Virginia
and Drug-Free Workplace Act. It is understood and agreed that this Contract shall be cancelled by the awarding
authority if the Contractor: 1) Fails to implement its drug-free workplace policy; 2) Fails to provide information
regarding implementation of the contractor's drug-free workplace policy at the request of the public authority; or
3) Provides to the public authority false information regarding the contractor's drug-free workplace policy."

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division.

2. SPECIFICATIONS: ltems offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the
specifications must be dlearly indicated by the bidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to the
specifications must be clearly defined. A bidder offeting an alternate should attach complete specifications
and literature to the bid. The Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications.

3. Complete all sections of the quotation form.

4. Unit prices shall prevail in case of discrepancy.
5. All quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless alternate shipping terms are clearly identified in the
guotation.

6. BID SUBMISSION: All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time
of the bid opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications:
Department of Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washington Street East, P.O. Box 50130,
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Rev, 5/15/09



State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
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State of West Virginia ReCluest for rrmaNEER T T TPRAGELT
Department of Administration Quctation
Purchasing Division
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Post Office Box 50130
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State of Wast Virginia
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Purchasing Division
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CLASS 1 AUTOMOBILE
Sub-Compact,
Front Wheel Drive, Wheelbase 95"
To include but not limited to:  Chevrolet Aveo, Toyota Prius

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

070-06-01-000

Manufacturer / Brand DODGE
Delivery 90 - 120 DAYS EST.
Mode! Name & Number CALIBER SE PMDL4g

HP TORQUE
Requirements:
Engine MIN: 75 HP 85 TORQUE 158 141
Transmission Autormnatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radic AM/FM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Qutside
license Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Standard tire w/ Jack
Rear Window/Dafogger Installed
Front Seat Bucket
Air Conditicning Instailed
Floor Mats Instailed
Front Air Bags Installed

EPA EPA
4 - DOOR VEHICLE HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline $14,889 27 23
Price Each Flex-Fuel NO BID
Options:
AM/FM wiCD Player STANDARD
Shop/Service Manual NOT AVAILABLE AT BID TIME
CD Service Manual NOT AVAILABLE AT BID TIME
Titt Wheel & Cruise Control $ 228.00
Keyless Entry e 3 1,001.00
Power Windows /Power Locks Ineludes Keyless Entry and Crulse $ 4,001.00
Side Air Bags FronSetamshitas e . S 328.00
Bodyside Mouldings CHROME M ULDINGS $ 46.00
Interior Upgrade ey NOT AVAILABLE
Exterior colors SEEBELOW 8
Delete Floor Mats {(Deduct) %@gﬁﬁ%@;@:ﬁ N/A
FOR Dealership: (Deduct) > {$50)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile - : = $ 1.40

Additional Information:
EXTERIOR COLORS: Bright Siiver, Brilliant Black, Light Sandstone, Stone White, Sunburst Orange

Additonal Cost Paint of $205 - Deep Water Blue, inferno Red.
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CLASS 2 AUTOMOBILE 070-06-02-000
Compact, 4 Door Sedan
Front Wheel Drive, Wheelbase 102.8"
Includes but is not Himited to: Ford Fusion, Toyota Corolla, VW Jeita, Honda Civic, Mitsubishi Lancer, Ford Focus,

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

DODGE

90-120 DAYS EST.

CALIBER SE PMDL49

HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 127 HP 128 TORQUE 158 141
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AMFM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Qutside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires Ail Season
Spare Tire Standard tire wi Jack
Rear Window/Defogger instailed
Front Seat Bucket
Air Conditioning installed
Fioor Mais installed
Front Air Bags instalied
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Price Each Gas $14,889 27 .23
Price Each Flex-Fuel NQ BID
Options: - ! )
AMIFM wi CD Player e STANDARD

Shop/Service Manual
CD Service Manual

NOT AVAILABLE AT BID TIME

NOT AVAILABLE AT BID TIME

Tt Wheel & Cruise Controt $§228
Keyless Entry $1,001
Power Windows / Power Locks $1,601
Side Alr Bags $228
Exterior colors %

Rubber matting BN/A

Delete Floor Mats {Deduct) $ -NA
Manual Transmission wiOverdrive {Deduct) ($524)
Remove Console {Delete} (Console between seats) $ -NA

FOB Dealership: (Deduct) {550}
EQB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile $1.40

Additiona! Information;

EXTERIOR COLORS: Bright Siiver, Brilliant Black, Light Sandstone, Stone White,

Sunburst Orange. Additionat Colors add $205 - Deep Water Blue, Inferno Red,
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CLASS 2A
SMALL STATION WAGON, FRONT
WHEEL DRIVE, 4 DOOR 2700 GVWR

070-06-062-010

Includes but is not limited to; Pontiac Vibe, Toyota Matrix, VW Jetta Sporiswagon
Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand DODGE
Delivery 90-120 DAYS EST.
Model Name JOURNEY SE
Model Number: JCDH49

HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 127 HP 128 TORQUE 173 166
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Qutside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Standard tire w/ Jack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed
Front Seat Standard
Air Conditioning Installed
Floor Mats installed
Front Air Bags Installed

EPA EFA
Price Each $15,338 HGWY CITY
Price Each Flex-Fuel NO BID

25 19

Options:
AM/FM with CD Player STANDARD
Shop/Service Manual NOT AVAILABLE AT BID TIME
Tilt Wheel & Cruise control Cruise Not Available
Keyless Eniry STANDARD
Power Windows - Power Doors STANDARD
Side Air Bags STANDARD
Delete Floor Mats (Deduct) {$27)
FOB Dealership: {Deduct) {$50)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile $1.40

Additional Information:

EXTERIOR COLORS: Bright Silver, Brilliant Black, Silver Steel, Stone White

Additional cost paint $200 - Deep Water Biue, Inferno Red.




CLASS 3 AUTOMOBILE 070-06-03-010
Midsize, 4 Door, Front Wheel Drive, Wheetbase 107.4"

C oo~k 0N =

inciudes but is not limited to: Toyota Camry, Saturn Aura, Chevrole Maiibu

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER BODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Detivery
Model Name & Number

DODGE

90-120 Days Est

Avenger SXT JSDH41

HP TOR
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 160 HP 156 TORQUE 173 166
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AMIFM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Quiside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Fuel Tank Factory Standard
Power Windows and Locks instafled
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Standard Tire wi Jack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed
Front Seat Standard Seating
Air Gonditioning installed
Foor Mats Instaited
Seating Capacily 5
Front Air Bags nstalled
EPA EPA
HEWY CITY
30 21
Price Each Gasoline $13,642
Price Each Flex Fuel — 2.7 V6 $14,973  |(Flex) 20 (Flex) 13
Options:
AM/FM w/ CD Player STANDARD

Shop/Service Manual
CD Service Manual
Tilt Whee! & Cruise Control

Not Available at Bid Time

Not Available at Bid Time

STANDARD

Keyless Entry STANDARD

Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrers Heated Mirrors Not Available
6-way Power driver seat {requires Power Windows & dours) $352

Side Air Bags STANDARD

Exterior colors _ SEE BELOW

Delete Floor Mats {Deduct) f $ -NA

Manual Transmission w/Qverdrive (Deduct) ‘ - N/A

Remove Console (Delete) {Console between seats) %ﬁﬁw § -NA

FQB Deatership: (Deduct) {$50)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile e $1.40

Additional information:
EXTERIOR COLORS:

Bright Silver, Brilliant Black, Siver Steel, Sione White, White Goid,

Additional Cost Paint $200 - Deep Water Blue, Infernc Red
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CLASS 5 AUTOMOBILE 070-06-05-001
Rear Wheel Drive, Full Size, 4 Door,
2,890 Curb Weight

Wheselbase 110"

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYGHEAERBjdsnot limited tor Chrylser 300, G8

Manufaciurer / Brand DODGE
Delivery 90-120 DAYS EST.
Model Name & Number CHARGER SXT LXDM48
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Reguirements:
Engine MIN: 210 HP 210 TORQUE 250 250
Transmission Automatic
Sieering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM{FM/CD
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Cutside
License Piate Mounts Front & Rear
Fuel Tank Factory Standard
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Standard tire w/ Jack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed
Front Seat Bucket
Air Conditiening installed
Floor Mats Installed
Seating Capacity 4 (5 PASSENGER IN CHARGER})
Front Air Bags Installed
EPA EFPA
HGWY CITY
25 17
Price Each Gasoline $17,949
Price Each Flex Fuel NO BID
Options:
Fult Size Spare Tire NOT AVAILABLE
Shop/Service Manual NOT AVAILABLE AT BID TIME
CD Service Manual ‘ NOT AVAILABLE AT BID TIME
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control e STANDARD
Keyiess Entry STANDARD
Power Windows / Power Locks / Heated Mirrors STANDARD
6-way Power Driver seat (requires power windows & doors STANDARD
Side Alr Bags i STANDARD
Exterior colors SEE BELOW
Detete Floor Mats {Deduct) $ - N/A
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) ($50)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile $1.40

Additional Information:

EXTERIOR COLORS: Bright Silver, Brilliant Black, Stone White, Dark Titanium,

Additional Pairt Cost $200 Deep Water Biug, inferno Red, Torred
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CLASS 6 AUTOMOBILE

Utility Small, 4 Wheel Drive/AWD, 4 Door

3,800 GVWR

103" Wheelbase

Vendor Name:_ COUNTRY CLUB CHERLES: BUPERot limited to: Toyota Rav4, Ford Escape

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

BODGE

90-120 DAYS EST.

NITRO SE 4X4 KABL74

076-06-06-001

HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 165 HP 161 TORQUE 210 235
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM
(Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Quiside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Snare Tire Standard tire w/ Jack
Rear Window/Defogger Instalied
Fuet Tank Standard
Front Seat Bucket
Rear Seal Bench
Air Conditioning instalied
Floor Mats installed
Front Air Bags
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
21 158

Price Each Gascline $17,956
Price Each Fiex Fuel NQO BID
Options: _
Fuli Size Spare Tire . . ] $428
Off Road Package Inciuding Limited Slip Rear Inciudes: o . $ Not Available

Axle-Trac-L.ok Differential ESP STANDARD &

Engine Cooling - Heavy Duty s :%ﬁﬁgﬁﬁ@gmm

Skid plate Group Not Available $

Suspension - Heavy Buty W/gas Shocks
Front and Rear Tow hooks
Hi & .o Gear 4WD or equivalent
Off Road Tires
Shop/Service Manual
CD Service Manual
Tit Wheel & Cruise Conirol
Keyless Entry
Power Windows / Power Locks
Rear Air and Heat
Tow Package
Exterior colors
Side Air Bags
Low Range 4 Whee! Drive Option
Spare Tire Carrier - External
Raoof-Top Luggage Rack
Third Row Seating
Slush/All Weather Mats {Driver & Passenger}
Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)
Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo)
Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)
Delete Cioth Seats (Deduct)
Defete Carpet (Deduct)
Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)
Remove Console (Delete) {Console between seats)
FOB Deatership: {Deduct)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Additiona! iInformation:

TR

e

Enter total off road

SEEEEETT NOT AVAILABLE AT BID TIME

NOT AVAILABLE AT BID TIME

Crdiseopt $428

STANDARD

STANDARD

NOT AVAILABLE

$523

$

STANDARD

NOT AVAILABLE

NOT AVAILABLE

NOT AVAILABLE

NOT AVAILABLE

$65.40

$

$47.20

s : er e A

- NfA

- NfA

- N/A

w el lenlen

- NiA

($50)

$1.40

TOW PACKAGE includes: Class |l Receiver Hitch, Full Size Spare, Heavy Duty Engine Cooling,

Power Steering Cooler, Trailer Sway Damping, 4 Pin Connector Wiring. Exterior Colors: Silver, Black, Stone White,

Light Sandstone, Dk. Charcoat. Addifional Chazge of $205 - Deep Water Biue, Inferno Red
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CLASS 10 TRUCK
Small Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive, Extended Cab, & Cylinder,
4200 GVWR, Short Bed
Inciudes but is not limited to; Ford Ranger, Toyota Tacoma, Mazda B2300

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Modet Name & Number

DODGE
90-120 DAYS EST.
DAKOTA EXT CAB 4X2 ND1L33

070-48-10-001

HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requiremenis:
Engine MIN: 200 HP 225 TORQUE 210 235
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power
Radio AMFEM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Piate Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetside
Bumper Rear Step Factory Installed
Tires All Season “**ON/OFF ROAD™™*
Spare Tire Fuil Size w/ Jack
Air Conditioning nstalled
Fron{ Seat Standard seating
Standard Floor Covering instalied
Front Air Bags Installed
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
20 16

Price Each Gasoling $13,177
Price Each Flex Fuel 4.7L V8 Engine $14,121
Options: y
AMIFM wi CD-Player Emsmmna g STANDARD
ShopiService Manual NOT AVAILABLE AT BID TIME
CD Service Manual T NOT AVAILABLE AT BID TIME
Limited Slip Rear End $299
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control $223

Keyless Entry

Power Windows / Power Locks

Exterior colors

Side Air Bags

Stush/All Weather Mats {Driver & Passenger)
Slush/All Weather Mats {Second Row}
Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo)

Slide Rear Window

Front seat bench

Bed Liner

Manuai Transmission w/QOverdrive {Deduct)
Delete Cloth Seats (Deduct)

Delete Carpet (Deduct}

FOB Dealership: {Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Additionat Information: Floor Mats $18.00

e
e o

Includes 2nd Row also

oot e

T
HoH Backags [
s Big Horn Package

)

Exterior colors: Bright Silver, Bright White, Brilliant Black, Mineral Gray

Adgitional Cost Paint $200 for Deep Water Blue, Inferno Red

BIG HORN PACKAGE: $1086. includes 17" Aluminum Wheels, Cargo Lamp, Keyless Entry,

Power Windows, Lacks & Mirrors, Premium Vinyt Door Trim w/imap pockets.

Included in Big Horn Package

Included in Big Horn Package

$

$570
$102.05
$
NOT AVAILABLE
$125
$498
$218
$ -NIA
$ -NA
$ -N/A
($50)
$1.40




CLASS 14 TRUCK

lL.arge Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive
8800 GVWR, L.ong Bed, Crew Cab
Includes but is not limited to: Dodge Ram 2500, Chevrolet 2500, Ford F250

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

DOPGE
90-120 DAYS EXT.
RAM 2800 CREW 4X2 LB DJ2L92

070-48-14-000

HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements: 380 404
Engine Mt 300 HP 360 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power
Radio AMIFM
Gilass Alt Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Quiside
l.icense Piate Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetside
Bumper Rear Step Factory Instalied
Tires Al Season
Spare Tire Fult Size wi Jack
Air Conditioning installed
Standard Floor Covering installed
Froni Air Bags Installed
Price Each Gasoline $21,844
Price Each Flex Fuei NO BIiD
Options:
Off Road Package including Limited Stip Rear, Includes: $404
Axle-trac-lok differential Beaaaa

Engine Cooling - heavy duly
Skid plate Group
Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks
All Terrain Tires
Tow Hooks
AMFM wi CD Player
Shop/Service Manual
CD Service Manual
Titt Wheel & Cruise Controd
Keyless Entry
Fower Windows / Power Locks
Tow Package
Snow Plow Package
Diesel Enging
V-8 Engine
Side Air Bags
Exterior coiors
Slide Rear Window
Running Boards
Swing out mirrors
Bed Liner
Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)
Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)
Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo)
Additioral Tanks
4 Wheel Drive
Manual Transmission w/Overdrive {Deduct)
DRelete Cloth Seats (Deduct)
Delete Carpet (Deduct)
FOB Dealership: (Deduct)
FOR Other than Metro Charieston - Per Mile
Available Axle Ratios

Additional Information:

4 Pin Connector, Ciast IV Hitch, 7 Pin Wiring Harness
Listitems mcluded m this group

i i

S Wwﬁ?
‘w&“rm«‘{wﬁé{??m ]

Extarior colors: Austin Tan, Brignt Siiver, Bright White, Brilliant Black, Light Graystone,

Mineral Gray, Additional Cost $181 Deep Water Biue, Inferno Red.

Chrome Accents Group includes: Chrome Bodyside Moldings, Chrome Tubutar Sice Steps,

Mopar Chrome Exhaust Tip and Chrome Fuel Filer Door

T

Enter total off-road pkg above

STANDARD

Mot Avallable at Bid Time

Not Avallable at Bid Time

$213
$162
STANDARD
STANDARD
Not Avallable
$6,375
STANDARD
STANDARD
SEE BELOW
NOT AVAILABLE
$964
$153
$208
$91.25
$77.90
Not Available
Not Available
$2,603
($995 Diesel Only}
A
NFA
(850}
$1.40

Mulinle Variations - Contact Vendor




CLASS 15 TRUCK
Large Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive,
8500 GVWR, Long Bed

Includes but is not limited to: Ford F250, Dodge Rar 2500, Chevrotet 2500

Vendor Name:_COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

DODGE
90-120 DAYS EST
RAM 2500 4x2 LB DJ2L62

070-48-15-000

HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE 380 404
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power
Radio AM/FM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounis Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetside
Bumper Rear Step Factory Installed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size w/ Jack
Alr Conditioning instailed
Standard Floor Covering Installed
Front Air Bags Installed
Price Each Gasoline $19,103
Price Each Flex Fuel NO BID

Options:

Extended Cab

Crew Cab

Limited Skp Rear End

AM/FM w/ CD Player

Shop/Service Manual

CD Service Manua}

Tilt Wheet & Cruise Control

Keyless Entry

Power Windows / Power Locks

10 Tow Package

11 Diesel Enging

12 V-8 Engine

13 Side Air Bags

14 Exterior colors

15 Slide Rear Window

16 Running Boards

17 Trailer Tow Mirrors

18 Bed Liner

19 Slush/Al Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger}
20 Slush/Ali Weather Mats {Second Row)

21 Slush/All Weather Mats {Cargo)

22 Delete Truck Bed {Deduct)

23 Manual Transmission w/Qverdrive {Deduct)
24 Delete Cloth Seats (Deduct)

25 Delete Carpet {Deduct)

26 FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

27 FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile
28 Avaiiable Axle Ratios

CO~GHbLWwN =

Additional information:

S A

CEEEE e R
-

Whicel Slandard £Ch

y: .:E’iv =

S s g
4 Pl Connoctor, Class [V Hitch, 7 Pin Wirlng Harness
e e s
EEsaa R =

O s ks
.
Requires Chrome Accents Group

R R

Exterior colors; Austin Tan Pear], Bright Silver, Bright White, Light Graystone, Mineral Gray

Additional Charge Paint of $181 - Deep Water Biue, Infernc Red.

Not Availlaable

$3,554

$276

ST

Not Avaitable at Bid Time

Not Available at Bid Time

$213
$625
$463
STD
$6,375
STD
STh
$
Not Available
$615
$85
$208
$81.25
§77.80
N/A
(52050  GAS ONLY
($995)  DIESEL ONL
N/A
N/A
(360}
$1.40

Multiple variations. Contact Vendor




CLASS 19 TRUCK
Large Pickup, 4 Wheet Drive,
8500 GVWR, Long Bed

Q70-48-18-00C

Includes but is not limited to: Ford F250, Dodge Ram 2500, Chevrolet Sierra 25G0

Vender Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Marusfacturer f Brand DODGE
Delivery 90-120 DAYS EST
Modef Name 8 Number Ram 2600 ST 4x4 DJ7LE2
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Reguirements:
Engine MIN: 295 MP 335 TORQUE 380 404
Transmission Automnatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS DIESEL
Radio AMIFM
Glass All Tinted 350 650
Mirrors Left & Right Owtside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Sox Fleetside
Bumper Rezr Step Factory [nstalled
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size wf Jack
Air Conditioning Instailed
Front Seat Bench
Auto Locking Hubs Instailed
Standard Floor Covering Instalied
Front Air Bags Instafied
EPA EFA
HOWY CITY

Price Each Gasoline $21,626
Price Fach Diesel $27,776
Price Each Flex Fusl NO 8iD
QOptions:
Off Road Package Incluging Limited Slip Rear, Includes: $448

Axle-frac-lok differential Eiearios

Engine Cooling - heavy duty STANDARD T

Skid plate Group B

Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks Enter total off road pkg above

All Terrain Tires i

Tow Hooks late Group
AMIFM wi CD Player e STANDARD
ShopfService Manual ) NOT AVAILABLE AT BID TIME
€O Service Manual B : NOT AVAILABLE AT BID TIME
Tit Wheel & Cruise Confrol Tilt Standard - Cruise $213 213
Limited S$#p Rear End %‘%ﬂ?ﬂfﬁ%ﬂiﬁg%m“ 276
Tow Package 4 Pin Connoctor, Class IV Hitch, 7 Pin Wizing Horness STANDARD
$now Plow Package R AR o i s Sy PN S e $115
Side Alr Bags } ) STANDARD
Exterior colors el SEEBELOW
Slide Rear Window o $118
Keyless Entry e $625
Power Windows, Locks, Power Healed Mirrors $463
SlushfAll Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) $91.25
Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) . . . $77.80
SlushfAll Weather Mats (Cargo) WW%W SNA
Bed Liner - ] e . § 208.00
Carpet Interior RSN R e $638
Cloth Seats Included in ST Popular Equipment Group $638
Addtlonal Tanks e e W
Extended Cab w/ Third and Fourth Door $3,534
Gas Ergine 450 CIix: /A
6 Cylinder (Deduct) N/A

Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)
Delete Floor Mats {Deduct)

Delete Cloth Seats (Deduct)

FOB Dealership: {Deduct)

FOB Cther than Metro Charleston - Per Mile
Availabie Axle Ratios

Additional Information;

ST POPULR EQUIPMENT GROUP includes: Cloth 40/20/40 Bench Seal, Floor Covering Carpet,

Front Floor Mats, Crutse Contrel, Sidus Radio. 8638 Reg Cab, $655 Crew Cab

EXTERIOR COLORS; Austn Tan, Bright Sitver, Brighl While, Brillant Black, Light Graystone, Rugged Brown,

Minaral Gray. Additional Gost Paint of $191- Infero Red, Deep Water Blue

{§085 - DIESEL ONLY)

SN/A

SNIA

(360}

$i.40

Multipte Variatiens. Contact Vendor
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Includes but is not limited to: Grand Caravan, Toyota Sienna

CLASS 24 VAN

7 Passenger, Front Wheel Drive,

110" Wheelbase

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

DODGE
90-120 DAYS EST.
GRAND CARAVAN SE RTKH63

070-93-24-001

HP TORQUE

Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 175 HP 165 TORQUE 175 205
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AMIFM
Giass Ali Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Qutside - 5" x 8" Minimum
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Sealing 7 Passenger
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Standard tire wiJack
Rear Window Wiper/Defogger Installed
Floor Mats Installed
Air Conditioning Installed
Front Air Bags Installed

Side & Rear
Doors Loading Doors wiGlass ERPA EPA

HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline V-6 $18,097 24 17
Price Each Flex-Fuel $18,097
16 (FLEX FUEL) {11 (FLEX FUEL

Options:
AM/FM wf CD Player ;M%WW% STANDARD
Shop/Service Manual NOT AVAILABLE AT BID TIME
CD Service Manual NOT AVAILABLE AT BID TIME
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control STANDARD
Keyless Entry gﬁ% e g,;a;““%“"w“f‘:m‘%% STANDARD
Extended Wheel Base STANDARD
Sunscreen Glass _;%ﬁf“w : $401.00 FOR SUNSCREEN
Rear Heat and Air $886.00
Drivers Side Sliding Door STANDARD
Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors STANDARD
Side Air Bags STANDARD
Stow N Go Seating STANDARD
Exterior colors $
Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)
Slush/Adl Weather Mats {Second Row)
Slush/All Weather Mats {Cargo)
Delete Center Row Seats (Deduct} $ - N/A
Delete Third Row Seats {Deduct) $ - N/A-THEY STORE IN FLOOR
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) {$50.00)

FOB Other than Meiro Charieston - Per Mile

Additional Information:
EXTERIOR COLORS:

Bright Sitver, Brilliant Black, Deep Water Blue, Stone White, White Gold

Add $200.00 for Biackberry Pearl, Inferno Red Crystal Pearl

$1.40
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Kev. 09/08 State of West Vit’dini_a_.

VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application* is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does notapply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is fo be used to request such preference, The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable.

-

Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked: ‘

____ Bidderis an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four {4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this certification; or,

_K__ Bidderis a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the
ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has
maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately
preceding the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headguarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

2. Application is made for 2,5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

X Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

3. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a
minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder's affiliate’s or subsidiary’s employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state
continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

4, Application is made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

¥ Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,

5. Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:
Bidder is an individual resident vendorwho is a veteran of the Uniited States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,
Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

i »

Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor’s bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penaity
against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to the contracting agency
or dedtcted from any unpaid batance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true
and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate
changes during the term of the contract, Bidder wil notify the Purchasing Division in writing immediately.

Bidder: ({ ountry C (ub Chrycle Dode Signed: IQ’/U?/ WW

Date: 617/ 2z / 69 Title: Frleet Manager

*Check any combination of preference consideration(s) indicated sbove, which you are entitted to receive.
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RFQ No. WO

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

VENDOR OWING A DEBT TO THE STATE:

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a provides that: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the
state or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective
vendor or a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount
greater than one thousand dollars in the aggregate.

PUBLIC IMPROVEMENT CONTRACTS & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT:

if this is a solicitation for a public improvement construction contract, the vendor, by its signature below, affirms
that it has a written plan for a drug-free workplace policy in compliance with Articte 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code. The vendor must make said affirmation with its bid submission. Further, public improvement
construction contract may not be awarded to a vendor who does not have a written plan for a drug-free
workplace policy in compliance with Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code and who has not
submitted that plan to the appropriate contracting authority in timely fashion. For a vendor who is a
subcontractor, compliance with Section 5, Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code may take place
before their work on the public improvement is begun.

ANTITRUST:

In submitting a bid to any agency for the state of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that if the bid is
accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or transfer to the state of West Virginia all rights, title and interest
in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and
the state of West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the particular
commodities or services purchased or acquired by the state of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made
and become effective at the time the purchasing agency tenders the initial payment to the bidder.

| certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm,
limited liability company, partnership or person or entity submitting a bid for the same materials, supplies,
equipment or services and is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. | further certify that | am
authorized to sign the certification on behalf of the bidder or this bid.

LICENSING:

Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and
requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia
Secretary of State's Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission, or any
other state agencies or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary releases to
obtain information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good
standing with the above entities.

CONFIDENTIALITY:

The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally
identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents fo the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the
agency’s policies, procedures and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality Policies and
Information Security Accountability Requirements, set forth in hitp://www state. wv.usfadmin/purchase/fprivacy/
noticeConfidentiality.pdf.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor
affirms and acknowledges the information in this affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

Vendors Name:  (ountry Club Chrysler

Authorized Signature: Kl V/)W Date: ¢f22]od

Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 01/01/38}




MV10 General Specifications/Information

This RFQ is to supply 2010 (or latest mode! year if successful vendor desires) vehicle to
the State of West Virginia Agencies and political subdivisions. An award shall be made for
each Vehicle Class to the lowest, responsible bidder meeting specifications using the base
price of the vehicle bid, including delivery cost and life-cycle costing, pursuant to the
changes in the West Virginia Code. The life-cycle costing to be used shall be the gasoline
consumption for 100,000 miles. This will only apply to vehicles < 8,500 GVWR.

Gasoline Costing Information:

100,000 + MPG Average (25% - City — 756% Highway)
Gasoline shall be based on $4.00 per gallon.

For example, if a vehicle were to average 25 MPG under the 25% city - 75% highway, the
life cycle costing would equal $12,000.00. (100,000 + 25 X $4.00) The cost of the
gasoline (based on $4.00/gallon) shall be added {o the base price and shall be added to
the cost shown on the bid for evaluation purposes.

Financial Information

Vehicles may be purchased from this contract by any West Virginia State agency or
political subdivision. West Virginia State agencies will either remit payment directly or use
a third-party financing company on contract with the State of West Virginia. The
Department of Administration, Purchasing Division Fleet Management Office (FMO)
usually arranges for third-party financing. This arrangement requires the vendor to submit
invoices to the Department of Administration, who, in turn forwards those to the third-party
financing company for prompt payment.

The time required for third party financing does not differ from the time required for
payment directly from the state as both are normally made within 30 days of receipt of
vehicle meeting specifications and appropriate invoice. The time period is provided as an
estimate only and is not guaranteed. Actual times required to process payment may vary.

Standard options shall be inciuded in the base price of each class with the
exception of XM Radio, Sirus and On-Star, these shall be deducted from ALL.
vehicle classes.

Options:

Option pricing shall be submitted with the bid, but will not be part of the evaluation

Page 10f 4
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MV10 General Specifications/Information

process. All option pricing shall be at dealer cost. Bidders must Sign the
Certification and return preferably with the bid. No awards shall be processed
without such Certification.

Options other than those stated in the final contract may occasionally be requested.
Those options may be considered by the State only if the dealer prices these items at
dealer cost and furnishes proof of dealer cost prior to the purchase order being submitted
by the agency. Dealer must provide verification of these prices from the manufacturer.

" Option Packages” (ex. Tow Package) must specify what items are included.
Pricing

Use the attached pricing pages for your quotation. Vendors should add their name to
each page. All vehicles should be quoted FOB Dunbar, West Virginia. Vendor may add
an additional per mile charge for delivery to other locations, but should be aware that
additional charges may impact the award.

Prices must remain firm for the life of this contract. Note: This contract is in effect for a
term of one year or until such time as the vendor notifies the Purchasing Division that the
model year build out date has been reached (unless the vendor chooses to supply next
model vehicles at price quoted), or until contracts are issued for the next model year.

Delivery Information
Deliveries must bé made Monday through Friday 9 a.m. to 3:30 p.m.

~ Vehicles delivered to Surplus Property will be inspected in a timely manner. Ordering
agencies will inform the dealers if the vehicles do not meet specifications outlined in the
purchase order. Additionally, they will work with the appropriate vendor to resolve any
issues.

Please contact Surplus Property, Gene Young, at 304-766-2626 to make delivery
arrangements. Mr. Young must be contacted five (5) working days in advance of
requested delivery date for authorization.

All deliveries of vehicles to other agencies (list attached) require 24-hour notice prior to
delivery.

Equipment Specifications and Requirements

NOTE: All vehicles_must be pre-drilled with hardware to meet specifications
that require both front and rear license plate prior to delivery. This is a
requirement under West Virginia State Law. Any vehicle delivered
without such holder shall be rejected until the dealer corrects the
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NOTE:

NOTE:

MV10 General Specifications/information
deficiency.
Options listed on the vehicle classification bid sheets must be quoted
with initial bid. These include such things as delivery costs, deduct for

pick-up of vehicles at dealership and optional beds for chassis cabs.

When options are priced, back-up alarms must be listed if they are
available from the manufacturer for that particular vehicle.

All vehicles shall be gasoline powered unless otherwise stated. Diesel, hybrid, Flex Fuel,
etc. may be specified on various models.

Vehicles must have all equipment found on the manufacturer's base model plus all other
items, packages, etc., needed to meet the specifications for each order class placed
against the contract.

All equipment/options must be manufacturer installed except tow hooks. Any other non-
manufacturer installed options must be approved by the Purchasing Division.

All vehicles shall have the full manufacturer's warranty.

Prior to delivery, all vehicles must include the following:

NoghwN -

© ®

10.
11.

12.

Reports:

Complete lubrication;

Fill crank case with oil;

Adjustment of engine to proper operating condition;

Inflate tires to proper pressure;

Verification of perfect operation of all mechanical and performance features;
Front end alignment and balancing of all tires;

Wash and clean inside and out including removai of all unnecessary tags,
stickers, papers, efc. Fleet Management does not want stickers in windows.
Owners manual;

Full tank of fuel. Bi-Fuel, hybrid, FFV, etc. vehicles must include all tanks full
upon delivery. This may require dealer to top off tanks immediately prior to
delivery to Surplus Property or other approved location;

Temporary West Virginia License if required;

Valid West Virginia Inspection Sticker affixed to windshield. The vehicle
must be inspected in the month delivered, thus providing a minimum of 11
months and maximum of 12 months before the next inspection must occur;
No dealer insignia or other advertising shall be affixed to the vehicle or
appear on mud flaps, bumpers, deck lids, etc. Vehicles delivered with such
advertising may be rejected.
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MV10 General Specifications/Information

Successful vendors shall be required to submit a report July 15, 2010 detailing the number
of vehicles by class and total amount of sales to that date under the MV10 contract. |t
would be helpful if this report included the agency/political sub making the purchase.
Submit report to: jo.a.adkins@wv.gov.

The following State Agencies require 24 hour notice prior to delivery.

Division of Highways West Virginia State Police
Division of Natural Resources Higher Education (Colleges)
Division of Forestry Elected Officials
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