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State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

NOTICE

Due to the size of this bid, it was impractical to scan
every page for online viewing. We have made an
attempt to scan and publish all pertinent bid
information. However, it is important to note that
some pages were necessarily omitted.

If you would like to review the bid in its entirety, please
contact the buyer. Thank you.
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Siate of West

RFQ COPY

TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

Townsend Chemical LLC

1] 9211 E. Jackson Street

Selma, IN 46383

Virginia

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130
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14, BIDDING SCHEDULE

NOTE:  Vendor should type bid price

CHEMICAL FORMUL ATION

HERBICIDES

Percent Concentration/
Pouhds per Galion
of Active ingredients

DOH-1H

DOM-2ZH

A)

D)

WATER SOLUBLE EMUL SIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:

Ammonium Salt of Fosamine with Surfaciani 4 lhsigation

Product Trade Name Krenite 8§

EPA Registration Number _ 352-395

Suppiied in 2 1/2 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons.
@%__ 5.0 per gallon (i.e. §_295.00 per fot)
Supplied in 15 gallon returnablefrefilable containers.

@%__ 49.00 per gallon (ie. §_ 735.00 per lot)

WATER SOLUBLE EMU! SIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate 50.2%

‘Phosphate Ester Surfactant

Product Trade Name Roundup Pro Concentrate

EPA Registration Number _ 524-529

Supplied in 30 gallon plastic returnable drums.

@%_ 48.90 per galton {i.e. § 1467.00 per drum)
Suppiied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons.
@%__49.50 per gallon {i.e. $§ 247,50 per iot)
Supplied in 15 gallon returnabie/refillable containers.

@% | No Bid per gallon (j.e. § *F¥sxk per lof)
Supplied in 150 galion retumable/refillable shutfie.

@5 _No Bid per gallon {i.e. § ****x per shutlie)

The “Bid Schedule” is available for dow .
nload on Purchasing’s W i
www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase mg’s Web site at

13



. 14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-3H

DOH-4H

DOH-5H

©)

DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING:

Sulfometuron Meihyl

Product Trade Nams Qust XP

EPA Registrafion Number _ 352-601

Supplied in 3 pound containers in lots of 24 pounds.

@$ __52.80 per pound {i.e. § _ 1267.20 per lot)
Supplied in 3 pound iug

@%___53.680 per pound (i.e. §_ 180.80 per jug)

WATER SOLUBLE AQUEOUS SUSPENSION CONTAINING:

Cryzalin

Product Trade Name Oryzalin 4 Pro

EPA Registration Number _72167-15-74477

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lois of 5 gallons.

@$__ 59.00 _pergallon (ie. § 295.00 per iot)

AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:
Imazapyr

Product Trade Name Arsenal Powerline

£PA Registration Number 241-431

Supplied in 1 guart containers in lots of 4 quarts

@%__46.90 perquart (i.e. $ __187.60 per lot)

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers ir lots of & gallons
@$% _165.20 per galion (le. $ __ 826.00 per iot)
Supplied in 15 galloh drums

@¢§_ 138.50 per gallon (i.e. $ _2302.50 per drum)

T5%

4 fbs/galion

2 hsigalion

14



14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

15

DOH-EH

A)

POH-TH

B)

C)

DOH-8H

-~ A)

C}

AQUEOUS CARRIER CONTAINING:

Pendimethalin 3.8 {bs/galion

Product Trade Name __Pendulum AguaCap

EPA Registration Number _ 241-416

Supplied in 2.5 gallon confainer in lots of 5 gallons

@$ __ 47.00 per gallon (e, § _235.00 per jot)

WATER SOLUBLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING: :
Triclopyr 3 lbs/gallon

Product “i”rade Name Garion 3A

EPA Registration Number _ 62719-37

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in tots of 5 gallons

@3 _61.80  pergalon(ie $_308.00  periot)

Supptied in 30 galion containers
@s__ 61.70 per galion {i.e. § 1861.00 per container)
Supplied in 15 gaflon confinuum returnable/refillable containers in paliets of & containers

@%___60.00 per gallon (e $ _ 8100.00 per palief)

WATER SOLUBLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Triclopyr ' 4 lIbsfgallon

Product Trade Name _ Garlon 4 Ultra

EPA Registration Number _ 62718-527

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 galions

@¥ 79.00 pér gallon (i.e. $ 395.00 per iof)

Supplied in 30 gallon containers

@s$__78.90 per gallon (i.e. $ _2367.00 per container)

Supplied in 15 gallon continuum returnable/refillable containers in pallets of @ containers

@s__77.20 per gallon (ie. $ 1042200 per paliet)



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CONT

16

DOH-3H

B)

DOH-10H

C)

DOH-11H

A WATER SOLUBLE DISPERSIBLE GRANULE CONTAINING:
Diuron _ 80.0%

Product Trade Name Karmex XP

EPA Registration Number __ 352-699

Supplied in 5 pound bags in lots of 10 bags

@%__ 3.5 per pound (i.e. § 17750 per lot)
Supplied in 25 pound bags

@%_ 3.5 perpound (i.e. § _88.75 per bag)

WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:
Dimethytamine Sait of 2, 4-D acid , 3.8 ibsfgalion

Product Trade Name DM A4

EPA Registration Number __62719-3

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

@$___ 15.50 ver galion (ie.$_77.50  periof)

Supplied in 30 galion drums

@%_ 15.30 per gallon (i.e. $ _ 459.00 per drum)

Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in pallets of 8 containers

@¢$__ 15.10 per gallon (L.e. $ _2088.50 per lot)

WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:

Diethanolamine Salt of Mefluidide 21.45%
Ammornium Salt of imazethapyr -4.09%

Ammonium Salt of imazapyr 0.15%

Product Trade Name Stronahold

EPA Registration Number  2217-802 '

Supplied in 1 galion containers in lots of 4 gallons

@$  363.00 per galion (i.e. § _1452.00 per fot)



14, SIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-12H

B)

WATER SOLUBLFE LIQUID CONTAINING:
Ammonium Salt of Imazapic 23.6%

Product Trade Name Piateau

EPA Registration Number _ 241-365

Suppiied in 1 galion containers in lots of 2 gallons
@%$__192.70 per galion (i.e. $ _ 385.40 per iot)
Suppiied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 galions

@$__ 192.70 per gallon (i.e. § _ 963.50 per iof)
Supplied in 1.44 oz packeis 14 packets per ot

@3% No Bid per packet (e, § _¥FAHF per lot)
Suppiled in 1 gt containers 4 gts per ot

@ $ ___No Bid perqi(ie § vk per lot)

Suppiied in 15 gallon containers

@%__182.00 pergailon {i.e. $ _2730.00 per lot)

A DISPERSIBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:

Hexazinone 2 thsigallon

Product Trade Name Velpar L

EPA Registration Number __ 352-581

Supplied in 2 ¥ gallon containers in ots of 5 gallons

@$ 68.10 per galion (i.e. § _ 340.50 per container)

17



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOM-14H

DOH-15H

POH-16H

A)

DRY FLOWABLE CONTAINING:

Metsuliuron Meihv 80%

Product Trade Name Escort XP

EPA Registration Number _ 352-438

16-8
Supplied in 8% 0z, containers in tots of 8 Ibs. (E8 oz, ctrs.)

@5 7.00 per oz, (e § 896.00 per lot)

g
Supplied in ¥ oz jug

@3% 7.10 peroz(ie % __56.80 per jug)

Supplied in 64 oz Jug returnable/refiliable

@%__6.85 peroz(le % _ 438,40 per jug)

WATER SOLUBLE GRANULE HERBICIDE CONTAINING:

Ammonium Salt of Glyphosaie 71.4%

Product Trade Name Roundup Pro dry

EPA Registration Name ok

Supplied in 23.25 1b. box

@% _ NoBid 23250 box (i.e. § __***** per 1b.)
DRY FLOWABLE CONTAINING:
Chiorsuffuron 75%

Product Trade Name __Telar XP

EPA Registration Number _ 352-654

16 8
Supplied in & x ¥6 ounce containers to a case

@%___15.30 perounce (ie. $__ 122,40 per container)

18



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOM-17H

A)

B)

DOH-18H

A)

B)

DOH-19H

A)

A LIQUIE SOLUTION CONTAINING:
Isooctyl ester of 2.4 Dichiorophenoxyacetic Acid

2-gfiwlhrxyl ester of +R-2-(2, 4-Dichlorophenoxy)
Propionic Acid

Dicamba {3, 6-Dicholoro-o-anisic Agid

Product Trade Name BK-BOD

EPA Registration Number 221-17-758

Supplied in 2.5 galion containers in Iots of 5 gallons
@%_ 68.60 pergalion (i.e. § _343.00 per lot)

Suppiied in 30 galion drums

®@% __ 67.70 per gallon (i.e. § 2031.00 per drum)
DRY FLOWABLE CONTAINING:

Tebuthiuron

Product Trade Name Spike 80 DF

EPA Registration Number __ 62719-107

Supplied in 4 pound bags in fots of 24 pounds

@%__24.95 per pound (e § _579.60 per lot)

Supplied in 25 pound bags

@$___22.65 per pound (i.e. $ _ 966.25 per Iot)

AWATER SOLUBLE EMULSFIABLE CONCERTRATE CONTAINING:

Clopyralid

Product Trade Name Transline

EPA Registration Number  §2719-259

Suppiied in 2.5 galion containers in lots of 5 gallons

@$% _335.90 per galion (ie. § _ 1679.50 per iot)

Suppiied in .5 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons

@%_ 168.00 per gallon (Le. § 672.00 per iot)

18

32.48%

15.80%

5.38%

80%

3 lbs/galion



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

20

DOH-20H

A}

DOH-21H

B)

DOH-22H

A}

DOH-23H

AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:

lsopropylamine Salt of Imazapyr 27.6%

Product Trade Name Stalker

EPA Registration Number _ 241-382

Supplied in 1 quart containers in iofs of 4 quarts
@% _63.70 per quart (le. 5 254.80 per iot)
AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:

Diglycolamine Salt of 3, 6-Dichioro-0- -
Anisic Acid 4 Ibsigation

Product Trade Name Vanauish

EPA Registration Number _ 228-397

Supplied in 2.5 galion containers in lots of 5 gallons
@%__ 53.90 per gailon (i.e. § 263,50 per iot)

Supplied in 15 gallon returnablefrefilable containers in
pailets of 8 containers

@%_ 53.30 per galion {i.e. $ _ 7195.50 per paliet)

AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:
Trictopyr .75 lbs/galion

Product Trade Name Pathfinder I

EPA Registration Number _62719-176

Supplied in 2.5 galion containers in lots of 5 gallons

@%__33.30 per gallon (i.e. $ __166.50 per lof)

WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
tsopropylamine Salt of Giyphosate 53.8%

Product Trade Name Bodee AguaNeat

EPA Registrafion Number  228-365

Suppfied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons
@%_ 3100 per gallon (i.e. $ _155.00 per lot)
Supplied in 30 galion plastic returnable drums or 15 gallon drums

@$%$_ 30.30 per galion (i.e. $_909.00 per drum)



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

- DOM-24H

B8)

DOH-25H

A)

DOH-26H

A)

DOH-27H

A LIQUID CONTAINING:
Aminopyrailid

Product Trade Name Milestons VM

EPA Registration Number _ 62719-53/

Suppiied in 1 quart confainers 12 containers per lot
@ 9§ _ No Bid par quart {j.a, § xR per iot)
Supplied in 2.5 galion containers 5 galions per ot

@$_ 292.60 per gallon (Le, § _ 1463.00 per lot)

WATER DISPERSIBLE GRANULAR MATERIAL CONTAINING:

Prodiamine

Product Trade Name __XK@006000¢ ProClipse 65

EPA Registration Number __ 228-434

Supplied in 10 pound containers 50 pounds per lot

@% 17.10 per pound {i.e. § _855.00 per lof)

EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Quizalofop P-Ethyl

Product Trade Name Assure It

Fkkdk

EPA Registration Number

Suppiied in 1 gallon containers in lois of 4 gallons

@ % _No Bid per gallon (i.e. § *kixk per lof)

EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Fluazifop-P-butyl

Product Trade Name Ormamec

EPA Registration Number Yok

Supplied in 1 galion containers in lots of 4 gallons

@%_NoBid -~ pergallon(ie § X per lot)

21

40.8%

65%

.88 lbs/galion

6.75%



14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOM-28H

A)

DOH-29H

A)

DOH-30H

A)

-DOM-31H

A DISPERSIBLE GRANULE CONTAINING:

imazapyr
Diuron

Product Trade Name Sahara DG

EPA Registration Number  241-372

Supplied in 10 pound bags in lois of 40 pounds.

@%_10.80 perpound (i.e. $ __424.00  periot)

AWATER SOLUBLE DRY GRANULE CONTAINING:

Sutfosulfuron

Product Trade Name Outrider

EPA Registration Number  524-500

Supplied in 20 oz bottles in lots of 200 oz

@%__12.50 peroz{i.e. § 2500,00

A LIQUID CONTAINING:
Diuron

Product Trade Name Diuron 41 - Direx 4L

EPA Registration Number _ 352-678

Supplied in 2.5 galion containers in lots of 5 gallons

@%$__21.00  pergaillon(ie $_ 105.00

A LIQUID CONTAINING
Fluroxypyr

Product Trade Name Vista XBY

EPA Registration Number __ 62719-586

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in fots of 5 gallons

@$__174.60  pergation (ie. §_873.00

per lot)

per iot}

per lot)

22

7.78%
62.22%

T5%

40%

26.2%



14, IDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-32H

A)

DOH-33H

23

WETTABLE GRANULE FORMULATION CONTAINING

Sodium sait of diflufenzopy: 2-[1-({3.5-difluorophenylamine} carbony})
hydrazeno} ethyt)-3-pyridinecarboxyiic acid, sodium 21.4%

Sodium salt of 3.8-dichioro-g-anisic acid

Product Trade Name Overdrive

55.0%

EPA Registration Number _ 7968-150

Supplied in 7 %2 Ib. jugs. 30 Ibs. per case

@%_38.90 perib, (le. $_1167.00

per case)

DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING
Sulfometuron Methyt
Chicrsulfuron

Product Trade Name ___Landmark XP

56.25%
18.75%

EPA Registration Number __ 352-645

Supplied in 4 Ib. jugs in lots of 32 Ibs.
@$_ 106.40  perib.(ie. $_ 3404.80

per case)

Supplied in 64 oz jug retumable/refilable

B) @%_ 6.0  peroz.(e$ 42240

DOH-34H

DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING

Sulforneturon Methyl
Metsulfuron Methyi

Product Trade Name Dust Extra

EPA Registration Number __ 352-622

per jug)

56.25%
15.60%

Supplied in 4 Ib. jugs in lofs of 32 Ibs.

@%$__52.80 perib. (i.e. $__ 1689.60

per lot)

Suppiied in 64 oz. refurnable/refillable

per jug)

@%._ 3.5 peroz (i.e. 5 208.00
Supplied in 12 b, jugs

@ $___N__O___Bl-__d___________ perlb. {i.e. $ Fodekkk

per jug}




14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-35H

A)

DOH-36H

A)

DOH-37H

A)

B)

DOH-38H

ADRY FLOWABLFE GRANULE CONTAINING:
Bromacil 40%
Diuron 40%

Product Trade Name Krovar | DF

EPA Registrafion Number _ 352-805

Supplied in 8 Ib containers in lofs of 8 containers

@$% _12.60 perib (e, §_607.20 per Iot)

ALIQUID CONTAINING;

Imazapic 8.13%
Glyphosate 21.94%

Product Trade Name Journey

EPA Registration Number ___ 241-417

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

@$__105.60 per galion (i.e. $ _528.00 per lot)

A LIQUID CONTAINING:

Dimethylamine Salt of 2,4-Dichlovophenoxyacetic Acid 24.58%
Dimethylamine Salt of Dicamba (3,6-Dichloro-o-Anisic Acid) 12.82%

Product Trade Name Veteran 720

EPA Registration Number  228-295

Supplied in 2.5 gallon coniainers in iots of 5 gallons

@$_ 27.00 per galion {i.e. $ _135.00 per iof)

Suppiied in 30 gallon drums

@%__26.5%0 per galion (i.e. $__795.00 per drum)

DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING

Chiorsulfuron 9,
Sulfometuron Methyi ' 18%

Sulfenirazone 48%

Product Trade Name Throttie XP

EPA Registration Number 352-725

Suppiied in 3.9 b, containers, 8 containers per case

@% 110.00 —__perbb(e $__3432.00 per case)

24



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-1A

DOH-2A

DOH-3A

A}

DOH-4A

DOH-5A

A)

DOH-6A

A)

ADJUVANTS

A WATER SOLUBLE BLUE LIQUID SPRAY PATTERN INDICATOR

Product Trade Name Bullseyve

Supplied in 2.5 galion _ containers in fots of 5 galions
@%_35.20 per gallon (i.e. $ _176.00 per lot)

AMISCIBLE-DISPERSIBLE LIQUID DEFOAMER (30% Active Ingredient)

Product Trade Name KnockTt 6b4

Suppliedin __ 1 QT containers in lots of 12

(e$ 72.00

@%__6.00 per per lot)

A DILUENT WITH EMULSIFIERS

Product Trade Name _ Hyarade EC or Arborchem Basal Oil or Bark Ot EC  Ax-It
Or Alenza Basal Oil or Penevator

Supplied in 15 gallon  containers in lots of _135 gallons
@%$__ 11.30 per galion (i,e, $ __ 1525.50 per lot)
NON-IONIC SURFACTANT (90% Active Ingredient)

Product Trade Name _Tnvade 90

Supplied in _ 25 gallon  containers in lots of galions
@%__14.20 per gallon (i.e. § _ 71.00 per iot)
A GRANULAR/FLAKE DRIFT CONTROL AGENT

Product Trade Name _ %%w#x

Supplied in _ *** containers in fots of ¥ containers
@ % __No Bid par  Fkkik (e §  *xk*x per lot)
A LIQUID DRIFT CONTROL AGENT

Product Trade Name _ MistTrol 336

Suppliedin __ 1 gallon  containers in iots of 4

@S _23.80 per _gallon (.e.$_95.20 per ot}




14,  BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOM-TA

A)

DOH-BA

DOH-10A

A)

DOH-11A

A)

B)

AQUATIC SURFACTANT

Product Trade Name _ SurfAx 100

Supplied in __ 2% gallon cortainers inlots of _ 5 gallons

@%_9.80 per galion (e § _ 48.00 per lot)

A WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID SPRAY PATTERN INDICATOR

FProduct Trade Name Biueprint Plus
Supplied in 2.5 galon coniainers in lots of 5 gallons
@3 No.Bid per galion (ie. § _ Akwkx per lot)

A NON-IONIC STICKER SPREADER

Product Trade Name Nu-Film-IR

Supplied in 2 ¥ gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

@%__ 27.80 pergallon (ie. $ _ 139.00 per jot)

A READY TO USE FORMULA CONTAINING PARFFINIC OIL EMULSIFIERS

Product Trade Name  Thinvert RTU

Supplied in 2 % gallon jugs. 5 gallon per case

@ % __No Bid per gallon (i.e. § _ Fdkw+ per case)

Supplied in 15 gallon drum

@%__15.60 per gallon

26



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOR-12A A CONCENTRATE FORMULA CONTAINING PARFINNK OIL EMULSIFIERS

AND SURFACTANTS

Product Trade Name Thinvert Concentrate

Supplied in 2 ¥ gallon jugs. & galion per case

A) @%___NoBid per galion (j.e. §  Fk*kx per case)

Suppiied in 15 gallon drum

3) @ $ __No Bid per gallon

27 .



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

BOH-15

A)

DOH-28

A)

"DOH-35

A)

DOH-48

A)

DOH-58

A)

SAFETY EQUIPMENT

EMERGENCY SPILL KIT CONTAINING:

15 Universal Plus Sorbent Pads
3 Cobra Coils

1 Pair Safety Goggles

1 Pair Latex Gloves

* Large Refuse Bag

1 List of Environmental Compliance Telephone Numbers

18" x 18" x 4"
Vacuum Packed in Puncture Resistant Foil

Product Trade Name Attack Pack

@$__67.50 per each

A GRANULAR/FILAKE SPILL ABSORBENT

Product Trade Name

Supplied in containers in lots of-

@ % _ No Bid per pound (e, §  Fewke

coniainers

per lof)

3 LAYER FABRIC COVERALLS (ALL SIZES)

Product Trade Name Kieen Guard

Supplied in 12 ealcase

@ $ _No Bid pereach (i.e. §  *kx*

DISPOSABLE COVERALLS

Product Trade Name Tyvek

Supplied in 25 ea/case

@% No Bid pereach (i.e, §  **r*F

per case)

per case)

32 0Z EYE WASH BOTTLE

Product Trade Name

Supplied per each

@$ __ No Bid pereach O

28



14.  BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-1M

DOH-2M

DOH-3M

DOH-4M

A)

B)

MISCELLANEOUS

PRESSURE RINSER

Product Trade Name Easy Rinse

Supplied per each

@ % _ No Bid ner sach

HAND SOAP WITH CITRUS Ol

Product Trade Name Zep

Suppiied in 32 oz. containers in iots of 20 containers per case

kkkkk

@% __ NoBid per container (i.e. $ per case)

A BIOSTIMULANT CONTAINING:

Soluble Potash
lron

Manure Exiract

Humic and Fulvic Acid Extract

Kelp Extract

Organo-Modified Silaxane Surfactant

Froduct Trade Name L.aunch

Suppiied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

@ % ___No Bid per gallon (i.e, §_ *xkx per lot)
AWORK BOOT
Product Trade Name iron Duke

Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170
Supplied per pair

@ Size (6-11)% _ No Bid per pair

@ Size (12+) $ __ No Bid per pair

1.00%
0.36%

79.30%
9.00%
1.20%
0.36%
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14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOM-5M

DOH-6M

DOH-TM

DOH-BM

C)

RUBBER BOOT/SHOE COVERS

Compiiance EPA 40 CFR 170
Suppiied per pair

@ Size M (89} § No_Bid per pair

@ Size L (10-11}% __ No Bid per pair

@ Size XL (12-13)$ _ No Bid per pair

SAFETY GOGGLES - indirect vent

Meets ANS1 28719 »fE 980

@% NoBid per each

FACE SHIELD -~ positive lock headgear

Meets ANS1T 287.1-1988 and
CAN1CSA-294 3-82 Specifications

@3 No Bid per each

A 5-GALLON BACKPACK SPRAYER

Product Trade Name Birchmeier

@%_191.50  persprayer

Gasket Set For Sprayer Pump

@%___ 20.00 per set

Hose Valve & Wand Repair Kit

@$__ 4.0 per kit
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14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-9M

A)

DOK-10M

DOH-11M

A)

NITRI-SOLVE 100% NITRILE GLOVES

15 mil 13" Nitrile Gloves
Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170
Sizes S, M, L, XL, or 2XL

@ $ __No Bid per pair

2-QUART HANDHELD PRESSURE SPRAYER

Product Trade Name Tolco

@ s 18.00 per sprayer

CLOSED SYSTEM BACKPACK SPRAYER

Proguct Trade Name Birchmier BCS

@%__ 188,20 per sprayer

Gasket set for sprayer pump

@8 40.00 per set

Hose Valve & Wand repair kit

@% _ 20.00 per kit
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STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIBAVIT

VENDOR OWING A DEBT TO THE STATE:

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a provides that: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the
state or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective
vendor or a related party fo the vendor or prospeactive vendor is a debtor and the debf owed is an amount
greater than one thousand dollars in the aggregate.

PUBLIC IMPROVEMENT CONTRACTS & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT:

I this is a solicitation for a public improvement construction contract, the vendor, by its signature below, affirms
that it has a written plan for a drug-free workplace policy in compliance with Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code. The vendor must make said affirmation with iis bid submission. Further, public improvement
construction contract may not be awarded to a vendor who does not have a written plan for a drug-free
workplace policy in compliance with Arficle 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code and who has not
submitted that plan to the appropriate confracting authority in timely fashion. For a vendor who is a
subcontractor, compliance with Section 5, Aticle 1D, Chapter 21 of the Wesf Virginia Code may take place
befora their work on the public improvement is begun,

ANTITRUST:

in submitting a bid fo any agency for the state of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that if the bid is
accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or transfer to the state of West Virginia alf rights, title and inferest
in and to all causes of action i may now or hereafter acquire under the aniitrust laws of the United States and
the state of West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable resiraints of trade relating fo the particular
commodifies or services purchased or acquired by the state of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made
and become effective at the time the purchasing agency tenders the initial payment {o the bidder,

| certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm,
limited fiability company, partnership or person or entity submitting a bid for the same materials, supplies,
equipment or services and is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. | further certify that | am
authorized to sign the certification on behalf of the bidder or this bid.

LICENSING:

“Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and iocal laws and
requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia
Secretary of State's Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission, or any
other state agencies or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary releases to
obtain- information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good
standing with the above enfities.

CONFIDENTIALITY:

The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally
identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclesure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant fo the
agency's policies, procedures and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality Policies and
Information Security Accountability Requirements, set forth in hitp://www state.wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy/

noticeConfideniiality.pdf.

Under. penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor
affirms and acknowledges the information in this affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

Date: 4}"‘24’6?




