*709030104

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

800-600~7258

CARGILI: INC DEICING TECHNOLOGY
24950 COUNTRY CLUB BLVD #450

NORTH OLMSTED OH 44070

Request for
Quotation

804-558-2402

MICHAEL AUSTIN

BY ORDER

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

08/15/2008

BiD OPENING DATE:

HROM :

TO:

pGOL

kdhdhkix

3

BID OPENING |

08/20

08/27

1

THIS

NO OTHER CHANGES

i

SODIUM CHLOR]

08 AT 1:30 P.M.

08 AT 1:3p P.M.

LS T75-45

[DE

ADDENDUM| NO. 1

DATE AND TEME CHANGED

IS THE ENpP OF RFQ

669C0002 #*%*%%% TOTAL:

F%ECENED
0BAUG 26 AM 2:39

PURCHASING DIVISION

WY

Jeanne Fredericy

Rt 600-7258

P ugust 25, 2008

ustomer Solutions-Spec %ﬁ%1*0177680

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'
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12.

13.

14.

15,

GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

Awards will be made in the best interest of the State of West Virginia.
The State may accept or reject in pat, ot in whole, any bid.
All quotations are governed by the West Virginia Code and the Legisiative Rules of the Purchasing Division.

Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division and have
paid the required $125.00 registration fee.

All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Crders/Contracts are to be continued for the term
of the Purchase Order/Contract, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise being
made available. Inthe even! funds are not approprialed or otherwise available for these services or goods, this
Purchase Order/Coniract becomes void and of no effect after June 30,

Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.

interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

Vendor preference will ba granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and stale taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.
The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Crder/Contrac! upon 30 days written notice to the seller.

The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govern all rights
and duties under the Contract, including without limitation the validity of this Purchase Order/Contract.

Any refetence to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual writlen
agreement of the parties,

BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, this Contract may be deemed
null and void, and terminated without further order.

HIPAA Business Assotiate Addendum: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Atterney General, and available online at the Purchasing Division's web site
{hitp:/fwww.state wv.us/admin/purchasefvre/hipaa.htm) is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that, the
Agency meets the definition of a Covered Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health
information (45 CFR §160.103) o the vendor.

West Virginia Alcohol & Drug-Free Workplace Act: [f this Contract constitules a public improvement construction

contract as set forth in Aricle 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code ("The Waest Virginia Alcoho! and Drug-Free Wotkplace
Act™), then the following language shall hereby become part of this Contract: "The contractor and its subcontractors shall
implement and maintain a written drug-free workplace policy in compliance with the West Virginia Alcchol and Drug-Free
Workplace Act, as sét forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code. The contractor and its subcontractors shall
provide a sworn statement in writing, under the penalties of perjury, that they maintain a valid drug-free work place policy in
compliance with the West Virginia Alcohol and Drug-Free Workplace Act. 1t is understood and agreed that this Contract shall be
cancelled by the awarding authority if the Contractor: 1) Fails to implement its drug-free wortkplace policy; 2) Fails to provide
information regarding implementation of the contractor’s drug-free workplace policy at the request of the public authority;

or 3) Provides to the public authority false information regarding the contractor’s drug-free workplace policy.”

L U T

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS
Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division.

SPECIFICATIONS: ltems offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the specifications
must be clearly indicated by the bidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to the specifications must be
clearly defined. A bidder offering an altetnate should altach complete specifications and literature to the bid. The
Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications. ‘

Compiete all sections of the quotation form.

Unit pfices shall prevaii in cases of discrepancy.

Al quotations are considered ¥.0.8B. destination unless alternate shipping terms are clearly identified in the quotation.
BiD SUBMISSION: All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time
of the bid opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications:

Department of Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washmgton Street East, P.O. Box 50130'
Charleston Wwv 25305—0130

R‘ev. 701/08



State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Qffice Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*709030104 800-600-72

24950 COUNTRY CLUR BLVD #4

NORTH O&MSTEQ'OH 44070

CARGILIL INC DEICING TECHNOLOGY

Request for =
Quotation

669C0002

o ADPRESS CORBESFONDENCE TOALIENTON OF ity

MICHAEL. AUSTIN
304~

558-2402

58

50
BY

ORDER

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

08/13/2008

BiD OPENING DATE: 08/20/2008

BID

OPENING TIME

01:

30PM

o011 ¥

FODIUM CHL.ORIDE

NOTE: SEE 3, |BIDD

TO PROVIDE ALL LABOR ,
SUPPLY SODIUNM CHLORIDE

HXHIBTT 3

IFE OF CONTRACT: THT

EAR OR UNTIL SUCH
ECESSARY TO|OBTAI
RIGINAL CONTRACT
OT EXCEED TWELVE
IME"
EASON UPON GIVING
RITTEN NOTICE,

THE
(12)

THE

LESS SPECIFIC PROVIST
N THIS CONTRACT DOCUME
RICING SET HEREIN ARE
ONTRACT .

ENEWAL: THIS$ CONTRACT
RITTEN CONSENT OF THE

ING INSTRUCTIONS,

OPEN END CONTRACT

75-45

2ND

PARAGRAPH.

MATERIALS AND EQUIPMENT TO

TC THE WV DIVIS]

g TON OF HIGHWAYS
AND WV PARKWAY AUTHORITY AT THE LOCATIONS AND IN THE
ESTIMATED QUANITIES PER THE ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS.

S CONTRACT BECONES EFFECTIVE ON

"REASONABLE TIN
MONTHS. DURING

ANDD EXTENDS FOR A FRERIOD OF ONE
TREASONABLE TIME"
[N A NEW CONTRACT OR RENEW THE
PERICD SHALL
"REASONABLE
THE VENDOR NMAY TERMINATE THIS CONTRACT FOR ANY

"
THIS

(1}

THEREAFTER AS IS

DIRECTOR OF PURGHASING 30 DAYS

CNS ARE STIPULA'

'ED ELSEWHERE

CONDITIONS AND

NT, THE TERMS,
FIRM FOR THE LI

E OF THE

MAY BE RENEWED WPON THE MUTUAL

SPENDING UNIT

b VENDOR,

“‘“"'55'66‘56(5 2

Jeanne Frederlcy

0~7258

DATE

August 25, 2008

FEIN

éﬁﬁz

Al1=0177680

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

mmer_ﬁalm:m

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for &=

Quotation

L BEO MUMBER -

6639C0002

&ICHAEL AUSTIN

*709030104

800-600-7258

CARGILL INC DELCING TECHNOLOGY
24950 COUNTRY CLUB BLVD #450

NORTH OLMSTED OH 44070

304-558-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

/13/2008

BID OPENING DATE:

08/20/2008

BID OPENING TIME

01:30PM

DPEN MARKET
UTHCRIZE A

STIMATE,

RDERED FOR

ETAINED BY

BE IN ACCORD
ORIGINAL CCN
1) YEAR PER

CANCELLATION
RIGHT TO CAN
NOTICE TO TH
FUPPLIED ARE
TO THE SPECT

REKET, WITH
ITEMS S
MMEDIATE DE

HAT THE CONTRACT
HETHER MORE |CR L

RDERING PROQEDUR
RITTEN STATH
HE VENDOR FQR CO
HE ORIGINAL |COPY
ENDOR AS AUTHORI
ILED TO THE PUR

UNIT.

DELIV

CON

THE 8

BUBMITTED TOiTHE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30)
PAYS PRIOR T® THE |EXPIRATICN DATE,
CE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE
RACT [AND $HALL BE LIMITED|TO TWO (2}

SUGH RENEWAL SHALL

ONE

THE { DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE
iS5 CONTRACT IMMEDIATHLY UPON WRITTEN
OR I¥ THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES
INFERIOR QUALITY OR|DOC NOT CONFORM
ONS QF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.

THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING MAY
NG UNIT TO PURCHASE (N THE OPEN
E FILING OF A REQUISITION OR CQOST
ECIFIED ON THIS CONTRACT FOR

IN EMERGENCIES DUE TO UNFORESEEN
BUT JOT LIMITED TO DELAYS IN TRANS-
ANTICIPATED INCREASE

IN THE VOLUME

TIES | LISTED IN THE REQUISTTION ARE
Y, BASED CON ESTIMATES
IT I8 UNDERSTOOD AND AGREED
SHALIL, COVER THE QUANTITIES ACTUALLY
RY DURING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT,
88 THAN THE QUANTITIHZS SHOWN.

SUPYLIED BY

SPENDING UNIT(S} SHALL ISSUE A
RACT ;ORDER (FORM NUMBER WV-39) TO
MODITIES COVERED BY THIS CONTRACT.
OF THE WV-39% SHALL BH MAILED 70O THE
ATION FOR SHIPMENT, A SECCND COPY
HASING DIVISION, AND|A THIRD COPY
ENDING UNIT.

fﬁgg%tflﬁz;&yQV

Jeanne Fredericy

TELEPHONE
800-600-7258

DATE

August 25, 2008

Lfﬁustomer’%oluf}gns Spec

¥ 41-0177680

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN FIE&P@NijNG TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




State of West Virginia Request for AR NOMBER T

Department of Administration  Quotation 669C000 2
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East

Post Office Box 50130 p—— —
ICHAEL: AUSTIN
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 i’m EEB-2402
*¥709030104 800-600-7258

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

CARGILL INC DEICING, TECHNOLOGY
24950 COUNTRY CLUB BLVD #450

NORTH OLMSTED OH 44070

08/13/2008
BID OPENING DATE: 8/20/2G08 BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM

BANKRUPTCY: {IN THE EVENT THE VENDOR/CONTRACTOR FILES
FOR BANKRUPTCY PROTECTION, THIS CONTRAGT TS AUTOMATI-
CALLY NULL ARD VOID, AND IS TERMINATED | WITHOUT FURTHER
DRDER .

THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS CONTAINED IN THIS CONTRACT
PHALL, SUPERSEDE AWNY AND ALL SUBSEQUENT | TERMS AND
PONDITIONS WHICH MAY APPEAR ON ANY ATTACHED PRINTED
DPOCUMENTS SU¢H AS|PRICE LISTS, ORDER FQRMS, SALES
RGREEMENTS OR MAINTENANCE AGREEMENTS, INCLUDING ANY
ELECTRCNIC MEDIUM|SUCH|AS CD-ROM.

b

REV. 04/11/2001

PURCHASING CARD AQCEPTANCE: THE STATEIOF WEST VIRGINIA
CURRENTLY UTILIZES A VISA PURCHASING CARD PROGRAM WHICH
IS ISSUED THROUGE|A BANK. THE SUCCESSFUL VENDOR

NUST ACCEPT THE STATE (QF WEST VIRGINIA|VISA PURCHASTING
CARD FOR PAYMENT ¢F ALl ORDERS PLACED BY ANY STATE
AGENCY AS A CONDITION OQF AWARD.

VENDQR PREFERENCE CERTIFI(ATE

CERTIFICATION AND|APPLICATION* IS HERERY MADE FOR
PREFERENCE IN ACCORDANCE WITH WEST VIRGINIA CODE,
5A-3-37 (DOES$ NOTI|APPLY TO CONSTRUCTICN CONTRACTS) .

. APPLICATION I3 MADE FOR 2.5% PREFERENCE FOR THE
EASON CHECKED:

) BIDDER|IS AN INDIVIDUAL RESIDENT |VENDOR AND
AS RESIDED ONTINUOUSILY IN WEST VIRGINIA FOR FOUR
4) YEARS IMNEDIATELY PRECEDING THE QATE OF THIS

SIGNATURE HE! TELEPHDNE DATE
Dy et P Jeanne Fredericy 800-600-7258 August 25, 2008
lECustomer mﬂS@Pec "5‘“) 41-0177680 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



Stale of West Virginia -
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2018 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*7339030104 800-600-72

24950 COUNTRY CLUB BLVD #4

NORTH OLMSTED OH 44070

CARGILL INC DEICING TECHNOLOGY

Request for

Quotation

669C0002 4

iICHAEL AUSTIN

04-558-2402

58

50

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

VARIOQUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

08/13/2008

_BID OPENTING TIME 01:30PM

CERTIFICATION; OR

WEST VIRGINIA FOR|FOUR

WHO HAS MATNTAINED ITS

CERTIFICATION; OR

WHICH HAS AN |AFFILIATE

ERTIFICATION,

APPLICATION I3 MADR
EASON CHECKED:

) BIDDER|IS A|RESIDENT VENDOR WHO (ERTIFIES THAT,

URING THE LIFE OF THE

5% OF THE ENPLOYEES WQRKING ON THE PROQJECT BEING BID
E RESIDENTS OF WEST VIRGINIA WHO HAVE RESIDED IN
FOR THE TWO YEARS IMMEDIATELY

HE STATE CONTINUQUSLY
RECEDING SUBMISSION CF
R

) BIDDER|IS A|NONRESIDENT VENDOR EMPLOYING A
STATE RESIDENTS [OR IS A
ONRESIDENT VENDOR WITH AN AFFILIATE OH SUBSIDIARY
HICH MAINTAINS ITS HEADQUARTERS OR PRINCIPAL PLACE

INIMUM OF ONE HUNDRED

}) BIDDER|IS A|PARTNERSHIP, ASSOCIATION CR CORPORA-
TICN RESIDENT VENDOR AND HAS MAINTAINED ITS HEAD-
QUARTERS OR PRINCIPAL PLACE OF BUSINES$ CONTINUOUSLY IN
(4) YEARS IMMEDIATELY PRECEDING
THE DATE OF THIS CERTIFICATION; OR 80% |CF THE OWNERSHIP
INTEREST OF BIDDER IS HELD BY ANOTHER INDIVIDUAL,
PARTNERSHIP, | ASSOCIATION OR CORPORATION RESIDENT VENDCR

HEADQUARTERS

OF BUSINESS CONTINUOUSLY IN WEST VIRGINIA FOR FOUR (4)
YEARS IMMEDIATELY|PRECEDING THE DATE OF THIS

) BIDDER|IS A|CORPORATION NONRESIDENT VENDOR
OR SUBSIDIARY WHICH EMPLCYS
MINIMUM OF [ONE HUNDRED STATE RESIDENTS AND WHICH
S MAINTAINED IT$ HEAQUARTERS OR PRINCIPAL PLACE OF
USINESS WITHIN WEST VIRGINIA CONTINUOWSLY FOR THE
OUR (4) YEARS IMNEDIATELY PRECEDING THE DATE OF THIS

FOR 2.5% PREFERENCE FOR THE

CONTRACT, ON

THIS BID;

OR | PRINCIPAL: PLACE

AVERAGE AT LEAST

1e

- TELEPHONE.- '
Jeanne Fredericy 800~

DATE
600-7258 August 25, 2008

LA et ey,
F?E'Customer Scolutions ig#%@ 41-0177680

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

v WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130

Request for

AR DB E R i

Quotation

£69C0002

LDR

B

[TCHAEL AUSTIN

S CORBE S FONDENCETO AL ENTIGN GRS

*709030104

NORTH OLMSTED OH

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

800-~600-7258

CARGILL INC DEICING TECHNOLOGY

304-558-2402

DIVISICON OF HIGHWAYS

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

24950 COUNTRY CLUB BLVD #450

44070

BY

ORDER

08/13/2008

BID OPENING DATE:

08/20/2008

BID OPENING TIME

01:30PM
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PURING THE L
75% OF THE E
SUBSIDIARY 'S
WHO HAVE RES
YEARS IMMEDI
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Jeanne Fredericy

TELEPHONE

800-600-7258

DATE

LA
7@%Stomer’801utions,Sggb.

FEN  41-0177680

August 25, 2008
ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPORDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



State of West Virginia Request for = NIRRT -
Department of Administration  Quotation 662C0002 6
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East DDRESS CORPESE]
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 ICHAEL AUSTIN
04-558-2402
£709030104 800-600-7258

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

CARGILL INC DEICING TECHNCLOGY
24950 COUNTRY CLUB BLVD #450

NORTH OLMSTED OH 44070

08/13/2008
BID OPENING DA

08/20/2008 BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM

Cargill Incorporatdd Deicing
BIDDER . Technology Busineds Unit

PATE:

$IGNEID

TITLE

¥ CHECK ANY (COMBINATION OF PREFERENCE (ONSIDERATION(S)
IN EITHER "AY OR 7B", QR BOTH "A" AND Y4YB" WHICH YOU
ARE ENTITLED|TO RﬁCEIVE. YOU MAY REQUEST UP TO THER
MAXIMUM 5% PREFERENCE FOR BOTH "A" AND ["B",

REV. 12/00)

NOTICE

A SIGNED BID|MUST |BE SUBMITTED TO:
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
PURCHASING DIVISIQN

BUTLDING 15
2019 WASHINGTON STREET, EAST
CEARLESTON, WV 2%305-~0130

THE BID:SHOUEQ-CONTAIN THIS INFORMATICHN ON THE FACE OF
THE ENVELCPE [OR THE BII) MAY NOT BE CONSIDERED:

$EALED BID

BUYER : N 33

STGNATURE e ”7Té;EP;;~€f:” nE DATE
/g%@/%Muauc;7ehékﬁl4xziéi—w Jeanne Fredericy 800-600-7258 Auvgust 25, 2008
Cﬁustomer Solutlonéﬁﬁgf,szN 41-0177680 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




State of West Virginia Request for TRECNONVEERS

Department of Administration  Quotation 669C0002 7
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East

Past Office Box 50130

MICHAEL AUSTIN
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 b04-558-2400
*709030104 800-600-7258
CARGILL INC DEICING TECHNOLOGY
24950 COUNTRY CLUR BLVD #450

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

NORTH OLMSTED OH 44070

08/13/2008
BID OPENING DATE. 08/20/2008 BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM

RFQ. NO.: _ 665C0002
BID OPENING PATE: - 08/20/2008
BID OPENING TIME: 1:30 PM

PLEASE PROVIDE A FAX NUMBER IN CASE IT|IS NECESSARY
TO CONTACT YU REGARDING YOUR RID:

mmmmmmmmmmmm BR8~738-8705_ -

CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE| PRINT CLEARLY) :
Mary Kleiner

FRxdxx  THIS| IS THE END OF RFQ 669C0QY02 *x*xxx TOTAL:

T{waé%@m Jeanne FrederlcyT 800-600~7258 August 25, 2008
Sustomer So 1“% ons S?acﬁ” 41-0177680 : ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




4. CONTRACT AWARD

2ll qualified Vendors who submit a valid bid for "FOB Vendor's Storage Site" will
be awarded a contract for this item ( see section 11 ).

oualified Vendors who submit a valid bid for "FOB Division's Storage Site" will be
awarded a contract for those locations for which their bid is low.

In the event a Vendor fails to conform to the reguirements set out in this contract
document, the State Contract Purchase Order or the governing specifications, the
Purchase Order Contract may be canceled and re-awarded to the next low bidder.

5. DELIVERY

State Contract Purchase Orders (8C0) for delivery to individual Division of
Highways Storage Sites will be issued to the Vendor awarded a contract for the
county locations (see Bid Schedule}.

From December 1, 2008 through March ‘31, 2069 delivery shall be made within seven
{7} calendar days after vendor is notified by the Divisicon of Highways.

Original delivery tickets for each delivered load to the Division’s storage 51tes
must be signed and retained by a DOH employee at the delivery location.

In the event the Vendor to which the SCO is issued is unable to comply with the
specified delivery schedule the Division may, at its optiom, cancel all or part of
the 8CO and obtalin the required quantity of Sodium Chloride £rom the most
economical available source.

6. SAMPLING AND TESTING

Upon award of contract, the Vendor shall provide the Division with the proposed
source of supply. Acceptance shall be based on suppliers’ certification of quality
and gradation. This information shall be directed to:

West Virginla Division of Highways
Materials Division

190 Dry Branch Road

Charleston, West Virginia 25306
Phone Number 304-558-3175

The Division may conduct sampling and testing to verify material quality or
gradation.

7. WEIGHING MATERIALS DELIVERED BY TRUCK

Material delivered by truck shall be weighed in accordance with Section 308.5 of
the West Virginia Department of Transportation, DPivision of Highways Standard
gpecifications Roads and Bridges, Adopted 2000 as modified by the current
Supplemental Specifications.

8. SUPPLYING OTHER ORGANIZATIONAL ENTITIES

In accordance with Chapter 5A, Article 3, Section 9 of the Code of West Virginia
the commodities or services contracted For herein shall be available to all local
governmental bodies im accordance with the same prices, terms and conditions
afforded to the State of West Virginia.

In the event any Vendor does not wish to extend the above prices, terms and
conditions of his bid and subsequent contract to all political sub-divisions of the
State, he must so indicate in a clear and unambiguous manner in his bid. This
indication does not prejudice the award of the contract. If a Vendor deoes not



1. SPECIFICATIONS

The following sections of the West Virginia Department cf Transportation, Division
of Highways Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted 2000 as modified by
the current Supplemental Specifications shall apply to the administration cof this
contraci: Sections 101, 102.4, 102.,5, 105.1, 105.3, 105.4, 105.10, 105.11, 1G65.12,
105.13, 106.3, 1l06.4, 106.5, 106.6, 106.7, 106.9, 107.%, 107.2, 107.3, 107.14,
107.19, 107.2C, 108.8, 109.1, 109.2 and 109.20.

The requirements of the West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of
Highways, Standard Specifications Section 10%.20, PRICE ADJUSTMENT FOR LOAD LIMIT
VIOLATIONS shall apply to all material suppiied under this contract. Thig will
include material Loaded by the vendor into Division of Highways owned and/or rented
trucks.

The terms "Contractor" and "Vendor" used in the above specifications of this
contract are interchangeable. Contractor shall mean Vendor and Vendor shall mean
Contractor.

West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways' Standard
Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted 2000 as modified by the current
Supplemental Specifications may be obtained from:

West Virginia Division of Highways
Engineering Division, Technical Division
Building 5, Room A-650

1900 Kanawha Blvd., East

Charleston, West Virginia 235305

Phone: 304-558-2885

Sodium Chloride shall conform to the requirements of ASTM D632-83
and Type I, Grade 1 and shall be delivered in bulk.

2. ACCEPTANCE AND DELIVERY GUARANTEE

The Division of Highways guarantees acceptance of seventy (70) percent of the total
estimated quantity awarded to an individual wvendor. However, conditions may
dictate adiustment of the actual gquantities delivered to specified sites.

The Vendor shall guarantee delivery, as requested by the Division of Highways, of
one hundred and twenty-five (125) percent of the total estimated award quantity
stated in this contract. All guaranteed deliveries shall be completed prior to
March 15, 2008.

Bidder agrees, by execution of this bid, that the guaranteed accepted quantity
(seventy percent of total estimated needs) shall be delivered to Division of
Highways storage sites or in a Department of Envirconmental Protection approved
stockpile{s) by December 15,6 2008.

3. BIDDING INSTRUCTIONS

The purpose of this contract is to provide for the delivery of Sodium Chloride to
the wvarious locations listed in the bidding schedule. Actual cuantities to be
delivered to each location wili be specified in State Contract Purchase Orders
(8co), which will be issued by the Department of Highways at the time delivery is
required. . '

Bidders submitting bids for a specific county shall bid all of that county’s
locations - one unit price - for the county sites listed on the attached Bid
3chedules. This shall apply to the listed Interstate and Corridor sites as well.

any qualification of bids or any modification of the specifications or conditions
governing the bids may be cause for their rejection.



indicate his refusal to extend the prices, terms and conditions of his bid to other
entities of the State he is bound to extend them upon issuence of a purchase order
by these entities.

Other organizatiomal entities using this provision of the contract shall do so
without any involvement of the Division of Highways. That is, the entity shall
make 1ts own purchase arrangements with the Vendor and shall make ites own
arrangements for payment.

9. VENDCR'E INVOICES

vendor's invoices must be submitted in original and one copy and contain the
following:

a) All Weight Ticket numbers for material delivered during the invoicing
period.

) Division of Highways State Contract Purchase Order (SC0) Number, and this
Contract Number.

c) Total quantity and unit price with the total cost of each type of material
furnished.

NOTE: Under no circumstance will the West Virginia Division of Highways accept, or
pay for, quantities of materials in excess of the quantity stated on the State
Contract Purchase Orders (SCQ). :

10



NOTE:
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Vendor should type Bid Schedule - Bid Schedule available for download on Purchasing’s Web site at

10. BID SCHEDULE

Delivery

www.state.wv,us/admin/purchase

F.0.B. Divigilon's Storage Site

SCDI0M CHLORIDE

(DOH CLASSIFICATICN 011-010-000001)

DISTRICT 1

ESTIMATED County Bid

COUNTY DELIVERY SITE NEEDS (TONS) Price

(PER TON)
Boone Clinton @ WV 85 1000
Boone Rock Creek 1500
Boone Seth 1000

$78.82
Clay Widen Rd. @ Cr 11 1600
Clay Maysel 500

$76.57
Kanawha Chelyan 2500
Kanawha Elkview 2200
Kanawha North Charleston 3000
Kanawha 8t. Albans 2500
Kanawha I-64 @ Scary 1600
Kanawha I-64 @ Rt. 119 & Penn Ave. 2000
Kanawha I-77 @ S8isgsonville 1600
Kanawha I-79 @ Amma 2000
Kanawha Corridor G @ Alum Creek 2000

$74.56
Mason Point Pleasant 3500

$71.67
Putnam Red House 150¢C
Putnam Hurricane @ Rt. 34 1500

$67.11



10. BID SCHEDULE {Continued)

Delivery:

F.O0.B.Division's Storage Site

80DTUM CHLORIDE

{DOE CLASSIFICATION 011-010-000001}

12

DISTRICT 2
ESTTMATED County Bid

COUNTY DELIVERY SITE NEEDS (TONS) Price

{PER "TON)
Cabell Barboursville 2500
Cabell I~64 @ Huntington 1400

i

Ne—Bid——lg—
Lincoln West Hamlin 1200
Lincoln Yawkey 800
Lincoln Harts 800

No Bid

Logan Chapmanville 0
Logan Corridor @ @ Chapmanville 1800
Logan Wilkinson 1300
Logan Man 800

No Bid
Mingo & Corr. G. Miller's Creek 2300
Mingo Gilbert 700

No Bid
Wayne Pritchard 1160
Wayne Wayne 1800
Wayne Crum 600



10. BID SCHEDULE (Continued)

Delivery: F.0.B. Division's Storage Site
S0DIUM CHLORIDE

{(DOH CLASSIFICATION 011-010-000001)

DISTRICT 3
ESTIMATED County Bid
COUNTY DELIVERY SITE NEEDS (TONS) Price
(FER TON)
Calhoun Miilstone 1000
No Bid
Jackson Ripley 3000
Jackson I-77 @ Medina 1500
No Bid
Pleasants Belmont 2000
No Bid
Ritchie Ellenbora 3000
Ritchie Corridor D @ Nutter Farm 800
Ritchie Corridor D @ Greenwood 500
Ritchie Corridor D @ Ellenboro 1000
No Bid
Roane Lefthand @ WV 36 750
Roane Amber Hill @ US 119 400
Roane Spencer 15G00
Mo Bid
Wirt Elizabeth 1500
No Bid
Wood Parkershurg @ Rt. 958 4500
Wood I-77 @ Parkersburg 1500
Wood Riverhill US50 500

No Bid
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10. BID SCHEDULE (Continued)

Delivery: F.O0.B., Divigion's Storage Site

SODIUM CHLORIDE
{DOH CLASSIFICATION 011-010-000001)

DISTRICT 4
ESTIMATED County Bid

COUNTY DELIVERY SITE NEEDS (TONS) Price

(PER TON)
Doddridge Smithburg 1700

No Bid
Harri=zon Gore 2800
Harrison Baltwell 1000
Harrison I-79 @ Lost Creek 2500
APD 50 Tunnel Hill 2500

No Bid
Marion Falrmont 2000
Marion Mannington 1200

Noe Bid
Monongalia Sabratcon 3700
Monongalia Pentress 1600
Monongalia I-79 @ Goshen Rd. 2500

Ne Bid
Pregton Albright 2500
Preston Bruceton 1600
Preston Terzra Alta 1200
Preston Fellowsville 1400
Preston AUrora 2000
I-68 Cooper's Rock 4000

No Bid
Taylor Fetterman/Prunytown 2500

No Bid
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10. BID SCHEDULE (Continued)

Delivery:

F.0.B. Divigion's Storage Site
SODIUM CHLORIDE

{DOH CLASSIFICATION 011-010-000001)

DISTRICT 5
ESTIMATED County Bid
COUNTY DELIVERY SITE NEEDS (TONS) Price
(PER TON}
Berkeley & I-81 Martinsbury 3000
$87.06
Grant Petershurg 1000
Grant ML, Btorm 2000 2}(
No Bid \
Hampshire Romney 1400
Hampshire Capon Bridge 1200
Hampshire Slanesville 700
$97.50
Hardy Moorefield 1500
Hardy Bakar 2000
No Bid
Jefferson Charles Town 2000
—$86.73
Mineral New Creek 900
Mineral Sky Line 1000
Mineral Short Gap 750
Mineral District Headguarters 500
$94.00
Morgan Berkeley Springs 200
Morgan " Largent 350



10. BID SCHEDULE (continued)

Delivery:

F.O0.B. Division's Storage Site

S0ODIUM CHLORIDE

{DOH CLASSIFICATION 011-010~000001)
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DISTRICT 6
ESTIMATED County Bid
COUNTY DELIVERY SITE NEEDS (TONS) Price
{(PER 'TON)
Brooke Wellsburg 2500
Brocke Weirton 2500
—No Bid
Hancogok New Manchester 2500
o Bi
Marshall Glen Dale 3500
Marshall Cameron 1500
e Bl
Qhio Triadelphia 3000
Ohio I-70 @ Triadelphia 2500
No Bid
Tyler Sistersville 1500
Tyler Centerville 1000
No Bid
Wetzel New Martinsville 2000
Wetzel Pine Grove 1000
Wetzel Hundred 1200 0(
No Bid b



10. BID SCHEDULE (Continued)
Delivery: F.0.B. Division's Storage Site
S0DIUM CHLORIDE
(DOH CLASSIFICATION 011-010-000001)
DISTRICT 7
] ESTIMATED County Bid
COUNTY DELIVERY SITE NEEDS (TONS) Price
{PER TON}
Barbour Phillipi 2000
Barbour Belington 2000
$69.32
Braxton Gassaway' 1100
Braxton Heaters 540
Braxton I-79% @ Coon EKnok 1400
Braxton I-79 @ Burngvilie 1400
$73.34
Gilmer Glenville 1500
$69.64
Lewis Weston {(Ben Dale) 2000
Lewis Corridor H @ Mudlick 1200
$69.16
Upshur Clow Lot @ Buckhannon 2300
Upshur Tennerton 200
Upshur Kanawha Head 800
Upshur Corridor H @ Buckhannon 0
$66.14
Webster Cherry Falls 1200
Webster Cowen 800
Webster Hacker Valley 500

$75.26

17



10. BID SCHEDULE (Continued)
Delivery: F.O0.B, Divieion's Storage Slte
50DIUM CHLORIDE
{DOH CLASSIFICATION 011-010-000001)
DISTRICT 8
ESTIMATED County Bid

COUNTY DELIVERY SITE NEEDS (TONS) Price

{PER TON)
Pendleton Franklin 1000
Pendlieton Judy Gap 600
Pendieton Brandywine 400
Pendleton Onego 380

—$85.18
Pocahontas Marlinton BCO
Pocahontas Seebert 7006
Pocahontas Green Bank 500
Pogahontas Rartow (Thornwood) 600
Poczhontas Slaty Fork 700

——$88.25
Randolph Elkins. 3500
kRandolph Harmon 1500
Randolph Coalton 2000
Randolph Valley Head 700
Randolph Mill Creek 1500
Randolph Pickens 450

$68.24

Tucker Parsons 1500
Tucker Thomas 1800

$68.80

18
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10. BID SCHEDULE (Continued)

Delivery: ¥.0.B. Division's Storage Site
S0DTUM CHLORIDE

(DOE CLASSIFICATION 011-010-000001)

DISTRICT 9
BESTIMATED County Bid
COUNTY DELIVERY GSITE NEEDS (TONS) Price
{PER TON)
Fayette Oak Hill 1000
Fayette Corridor L @ Oak Hill 1000
Fayette Lockout 2000
Fayette Glen Ferris 500
—No _Bid _
Greenbrier Lewisburg 1200
Greenbrier Crawley 2000
Greenbrier . I-64 @ Harts Run 1500
No Bid
Monroe Union 1000
Monroe Peterstown 400
No Bid
Nicholas Summersville 2000
Nicholas Curtin 1200
Nicholas Corridor L @ Muddlety 2000
No Bid
Summers Hinton 2000
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10. BID SCHEDULE (Continued)
Delivery: F.O0.B. Division's Storage Site
S0DIUM CHLORIDE
(DOH CLASSIFICATION 011-010-000001)
DISTRICT 10
ESTIMATED County Bid
COUNTY DELIVERY SITE NEEDS {TONS} Price
{PER TON)
McDowell Havaco 2200
McDowell Yukon 250
McDowell Jolmnycake ME. 500
McDowell Raysel 200
Mercer Princeton @ WV 20 2000
Mercer Flat Top 200
Mercer I-77 @ Princeton 1400
No—Bid
Raleigh Skelton 2000
Raleigh Rolt 1500
Raleigh I-64 @ Bragg 3000
Wyoming Pineville 2100
Wyoming Still Run 950
Wyoming Hanover 800

No Bid



10. BID SCHEDULE

{Continued)

Delivery:

F.0.B. Division's Storage Site

(DOH CLASSIFICATION 011-010-000001)

S0DIUM CHLORIDE

WV Turmnpike

BESTIMATED County Bid
COUNTY DELIVERY SITE NEEDS ('TONS) Price
(PER TON}
Xanawha Chelvyan 400
Kanawha Standard 2500
$74.56
Mercer Princeton 1800
No Bid
Raleigh Beckley 7000
Raleigh Ghent 4300

Ko Bid

21



BIDDING FOB VENDORS STORAGE LOT

11i. Bidding F.0.B. Vendor's Storage Site

Bid Price (§/Ton)
F.0.B Vendor's

Iocation of Storage Site Storage Site (Note 1)
Baltimore, MD No_Bid
Elkins, WV No Bid
Ironton, QH No Bid
Wevers Cave, VA No Bid

Note 1 : Bid price shall include cost of vendor
Loading Division trucks.
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DISTRICT CONTACT INFORMATION

Anthony Carovillano

District One Engineer/Manager

1334 Smith Street

Charleston, West Virginia 25301-1492
Phone: 304-558-3001

Keith Chapman

District Two Engineer/Manager

801 Madison Avenue

Huntington, West Virginia 25712-0880
Phone: 304-528-5625

Rusty Roten

District Three Engineer/Manager

624 Depot Street

Parkersburg, West Virginia 26102-0308
Phone: 304-420-4648 '

Greg Phillips

District Four Engineer/Manager

I-79 & Meadowbrook Road
Clarksburg, West Virginia 26302-2570
Phone: 304-842-1550

Lee Thorne, Acting

District Five Engineer/Manager

US Route 50

Post Office Box 99

Burlington, West Virginia 26710-0099
Phone: 304-289-3521

West Virginia Parkway Authority
Post Office Box 1469
Charleston, West Virginia 25325

Bob Whipp

District Six Engineer/Manager

1 DOT Drive

Moundsville, West Virginia 26041-1665
Phone: 304-843-4008

Ron Hooton

District Seven Engineer/Manager
255 Depot Street

Weston, West Virginia 26452-1228
Phone: 304-269-0414

Mike Moran, Acting

District Eight Engineer/Manager
US 219 North

Elkins, West Virginia 26241-1516
Phone: 304-637-0215

Steve Cole, Acting

District Nine Engineer/Manager
103 1/2 Church Street
Lewisburg, West Virginia 24901
Phone: 304-647-7450

John McBrayer

District Ten Engineer/Manager

270 Hardwood Lane

Princeton, West Virginia 24740-2737
Phone: 304-487-5228
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RFQ No. 66900002

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

VENDOR OWING A DEBT TO THE STATE:

Wesf Virginia Code §5A-3-10a provides that: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the
state or any of its political subdivisions fo any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective
vendor or a relaied party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount
greater than one thousand dollars in the aggregate.

PUBLIC IMPROVEMENT CONTRACTS & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT;

West Virginia Code §21-1D-5 provides that: Any solicitation for a public improvement construction coniract
shall require each vendor that submits a bid for the work to submit at the same time an affidavit that the vendor
has a written plan for a drug-free workplace policy in compliance with Addicle 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code. A public improvement construction contract may not be awarded to a vendor who does not
have a written plan for a drug-free workplace policy in compliance with Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code and who has not submitted that plan to the appropriate contracting authority in timely fashion.
For a vendor who is a subcontracior, compliance with Section 5, Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia
Code may take place before their work on the public improvement is begun.

ANTITRUST:
in submitting a bid to any agency for the state of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that if the bid is

accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or transfer o the state of West Virginia all rights, title and interest
in and fo all causes of action it may now or hereafier acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and
the state of West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the particular
commodities or services purchased or acquired by the state of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made
and become effective at the time the purchasing agency tenders the initial pay ment to the bidder.

I certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm,
limited liability company, partnership or person or entity submitting a bid for the same materials, supplies,
equipment or services and is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. | further certify that | am
authorized to sign the cerification on behalf of the bidder or this bid.

LICENSING:

Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and
requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia
Secretary of State’s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission, or any
other state agencies or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary releases to
obtain information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good
standing with the above entities.

CONFIDENTIALITY:

The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally
identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents tc the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the
agency’s policies, procedures and rules. Vendors should visit www.state.wv.us/admin/purchasefprivacy for
the Notice of Agency Confidentiality Policies.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code §61-5-3), it is hereby cerfified that the vendor
acknowledges the information in this said affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

Vendor's Name: Cargill Incorperated Deicing Technoloev Business Init

Authorized Signature: g~ ' =6~ Datel __August 25, 2008 e

el
Purchasing Affidavit {Revised/07/01/08) Jeannegﬂderlcy
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POWER OF ATTORNEY

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS, That Cargill, Incorporated, a Corporation
duly organized and existing under the Jaws of the State of Delaware, and having its Home Office
in the City of Minneapolis, Minnesota, has made, constituted and appointed, and does by these
presents, constitute and appoint:

Donna Bidak Nadine Gifbert Monica Sue Petkac
Tom Blaclunan Kenneth (. Howe Stewart Petrick
Gloria Bohman Gail Hubbell Sean M. Riley
Magjorie E. Bonner Robin Kiewatt Chyistine M. Rupert
David Bryden Mary Kleiner Andrew Samson
Stanley Carlin Phillip E. Knapp Robin Sanders
Carol Chandler Denise A. Koch Jeanne Schulz
Annette Cillian Sarah Liederbach famie Skelton
Tony DiPietro Mildred Lindsey Jennifer Tyminski
Ken Ellen Alison Marincek Gord Williams
Joshua D. Eveic Bill Miller Irving Williamson
Dale Fehrenbach Brett Miiler Chet Womack
Jason Fenske L.isa Montonaro Lilian Wong Keet
Jeanne Fredericy Jean Percira

Chris Gampfer Angele Peterson

cach its true and lawful Attorneys-in-Fact, with full power and authority hereby conferred in its
name, place and stead, to execute, seal, acknowledge and deliver bids, bid bonds, contracts,
performance bonds, and such other documents as may be necessary or required in connection
with the bid, sale or delivery of mineral rock salt, solar salt, salt chemical mixtures, evaporated
salt, and/or road defcing salt, to any state, county, city, municipality, or corporate body with
which the Company may do business and to bind the Corporation thereby as fully and to the
same extent as if such documents were signed by an officer of Salt, scaled with the Corporate
Seal of the Corporation and duly atested by its Assistant Corporate Secretary, hereby ratifying
and confirming all the said Attorney(s)-in-Fact may do in the premises.

IN WITNESS WHERFEOF, Cargill, Incorporated has caused these presents to be signed by
its President, Deicing Technology, and its Assistant Corporate Secretary, and its Corporate Seal
to be hereunto affixed this 24™ day of July, 2008

Cargill, Incorporated

=
v
By: & // “/,1/ e,

“Dile A. Fehrenpch, President, Deicing Technology

ey

{,.

: / ,
canne Y. &mith, Assistant CorpoTats Secretary

2016618



STATE OF OHIO
) ss

COUNTY OF CUYAHOGA

On Monday, August 25, 2008 , before me, a Notary Public in and for said
County and State, residing therein, duly commissioned and sworn, personally appeared

Jeanne Fredericy , known to me to Attomey-in-Fact of CARGILL,

INCORPORATED, the Corporation described in and that executed the within and fore-going
instrament, and known to me to be the person who executed the said instrument in behalf of
the said corporation; and he duly acknowledged to me that such corporation executed the

same,

IN WITNESS WHEREOQF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my official seal,
the day and year stated in the certificate above.

( ) G “Notary Public

ENNIFER TYMINSK
NOTASY BUBLIC, STATE OF OHIO
WY COMMISSION EXPIRES Th 247D
RECORDED N CUYAROGA COUNTY




Cargill

Technical Information

DESCRIPTION:

Bulk lce Conirol Salt 5 a coarse screened, fransiucent o white
crystalling sofid obtained from underground bedded salt deposits
by physicat mining. The salt is exploited by driling and blasting
with explosives In o manner similar to that used in other types of
rpineral mining.  The mined salt is then crushed, screened and
hoisted to the surface where it is sfockpiled awaiting distribution as
a highway deicing product.

COMPLIANCE:

Bulk fce Confrol Salt 5 not approved for human or animal
consumption. it is infended for use only as a chemical deicer on
reccways and thoroughfares. This salt compilies fully with ASTM
Specification D 632-99 Type 1, Grade 1.

ADDITIVES:

Bulk fee Confrol Salt may contain Yellow Prussiate of Soda, which is
added to improve caking resistance,

APPLICATIONS:

Bulk lce Conlrel Salf is infended for use as on ice and snow
removal agent on highways and other readways.

PACKAGING AND SHIPPING:

Bulk lce Conirol Salf is avaitable only in bulk form. Bulk quantities
are shipped by rail or fruck,

METHODS OF ANALYSIS:

Methods of analysis and product performance evaluation are
taken from the ASTM designations D 632-99 and E 534-98,

CARGILL SALY
P.O. Box 5621
Minneapolis, MN
55440

1-888 385-7258

CHEMICAL ANALYSIS:

Component Units | Typical | Specification
Sodium  Chioride {cry % 958 95.0 min.
basis}!

Calcium & Magnesium {as %o 1.8 - -
Ca}?

Sulfate {as SO4)! % 2.7 -
Waler Insojubles! % 0.4 2.0 max.
Surface Moisture? T 0.1 1.0 max.
Yellow Prussiate of Sodg? pEM 50 100 max.

By difference of impurities before conditioning.
2110eC for 2 hours before conditioning.
Optional anficaking agent [sodium ferocyanide decahydrate).

SIEVE ANALYSIS:
U.5.5. QOpening Opening
Mesh Inches Microns Typical | Specification
1/2" 0.500 12500 100 100 miin,
3/8" 0.375 500 28 25 - 100
4 0,187 4750 71 20-9%90
8 0.0937 2360 39 1G- 60
a0 0.0232 &00 i1 15 max,
Note: Sieve andlysis is reported as percent passing.
BULK DENSITY:
Parameter Typical Specification
Pounds per Cubic Foot 75 7i-79
Grams per Liter 1200 1135 - 1265

Note: Bulk density is reported as loose {uncompacted).

PRODUCING LOCATION: CLEVELAND, OH

No. 4700 Revised May 2007

NOTICE: Al of the above statements, recommendaotions, suggestions and data are based on our
laboratory results, and we believe same to be rellable.
showing an express guaranty {such as in the case of products specifically designed for use as nuirient
supplements), all such statements, recommendations, suggestions and dafa hereinabove presented
are made without guaranty, warranty or responsibility of any kind on our part.

Nevertheless, with the exception of data



c rg ’ , ’ ) echnical ormation I

DESCRIPTION: CHEMICAL ANALYSIS:
Bulk fce Conbrol Sait is a coorse screened, fransiucent o white Component Units | Typical | Specificafion
crystalline solid obtained from a domal salt deposit in Louisiana by Sodium  Chiotide {dry 7, 98.9 95 .0 min.
physical mining. The salt is exploited by drilling and blasting with basis)?
explosives in a manner simifar fo that used in other types of mineral Calcium & Magnesium {as A 0.30 -
mining. The mined salt is then crushed, screened and hoisted fo Ca)
the surface where i is loaded directly into barges. Sulfate [as SO4)! 4 0.74 -
COMPLIANCE: Water Insolubles % 0.07 2.0 max.

Surface Moisiure? T 0.02 0.1 max.
Bulk lce Conirol Salt is not approved for human or animal Yellow Prussiate of Soda? pom 50 100 max.
corsumption, Fis infended for use only as a chemicdt deicer on By difference of impurifies before conditioning.
roadways and thoroughfares. This salt complies fully with ASTM 2110eC for 2 hours before condiioning.
Specification D 632-99 Type 1, Grade 1. sOpfional anficaking agent (sodium ferrocyanide decahydrate).
ADDITIVES: SIEVE ANALYSIS:
Butk tce Conirof Salt coniains Yeliow Prussicte of Soda, which is L.8.5. Opening Opening
added to improve caking resistance. Mesh Inches Microns Typical | Specification

2 0.500 12500 100 100 min,
APPLICATIONS: /8" 0.375 2500 28 95-100
4 0.187 4750 79 20- 90

Bulk ice Conifrol Salf is infended for use as an ice and snow 8 0.0937 2360 42 10 - 60
removal agent on highways and other roadways. 3G 0.0232 600 11 15 max.

Note: Sieve analysis s reported as percent passing.
PACKAGING AND SHIPPING:

BULK DENSITY:
Bulk lce Contrel Salf is avallable only in bulk form. Bulk gquantities
are shipped by barge. Parameter Typical | Specificalion
Pounds per Cubic Foot 74 70-78
METHODS OF ANALYSIS: Grams per Liter 1185 1120- 1250

Note: Bulk density is reported as loose (uncompacted).
Methods of analysis and product perfformance evaiuation cre
faken from the ASTM designations D 632-99 and £ 534-98,

PRODUCING LOCATION: AVERY ISLAND, LA

No. 5701 Revised May 2007

Product Code N997

CARGILL SALT NOTICE:  All of the above statements, recommendations, suggestions and data are based on our
P.O. Box 5621 laboratory resulis, and we believe same to be reliable. Neveriheless, with the exception of data
Minneapolis, MN showing an express guaranty {such as in the case of producs specifically designed for use as nutrient
55440 suppiemends). all such stalements, recormmendations, suggestions and data hereinabove presented

are made without guaranty, warranty or responsibility of any kind on our part,
1-888 385-7258




c rg ’ ’ I Material Safety Data Sheet

Note: This MSDS has been compiled as a response to customer requests. 1t is not required under current OSHA regulations.

1. CHEMICAL PRODUCT AND COMPANY INFORMATION

Chemical Product Name Sodium Chloride (Salf)
Chemical Family Alkali Metal/Halide
Chemical Name Sodium Chloride

INCI Name SODIUM CHIL.ORIDE

INN Name sodium chloride

Formula NaCi

Molecular Weight 58.44

Commercial Name Ice Control Salt
Manufacturer Emergency Telephone Numbers
Cargill Salt CHEMTREC (800) 424-9300
P.O. Box 5621

Minneapolis, MN 55440

2. COMPOSITION/INFORMATION ON INGREDIENTS

Description
White crystalline solid

Ingredient Name

CAS Number Exposure Limits Concentration (%)
Sodium Chloride 7647-14-5 958 -09.8
Sodium Ferrocyanide Decahydrate 13601-19-9 0.6030 - 0.0100

3. HAZARDS IDENTIFICATION
EMERGENCY OVERVIEW
None for Salt {(Sedium Chloride) — GRAS Substance (Generally Recognized As Safe),

HMIS Health: 1, Flammability: 0, Reactivity: 0, Protective Equipment: A

Potential Health Effects

Route(s) Of Entry: Ingestion, skin/eye contact, inhalation.

Human Effects and Symptoms of Qverexposure;

Acute Inhalation: Irritation of the respiratory tract.

Chronic Inhalation: No applicable information found for chronic system effects.

Acute Skin Contact: Large amounts can cause irritation, and, if applied to damaged skin, absorption can occur
with effects similar to those via ingestion.

Chronie Skin Contact: No applicable information found for chronic system effects.

Acute Eye Contact: Irritation with burning and tearing (salt concentrations greater than the normal saline present).
i



Chronic Eye Contact: No applicable information found for chronic systemic effects,

Acute Ingestion: Intake of large amounts has generally occurred for deliberate reasons: suicide, absorption, and to
induce vomiting. The following effects were observed; nausea and vomiting, diarrhea, cramps, restlessness,
irritability, dehydration, water retention, nose bleed, gastrointestinal tract damage, fever, sweating, sunken eyes,
high blood pressure, muscle weakness, dry mouth and nose, shock, cerebral edema (fluid on brain), pulmonary
edema (fluid in lungs), blood cell shrinkage, and brain damage (due to dehydration of brain cells). Death is
generally due to cardiovascular collapse or CNS damage. Less than a few grams would not be harmful. For larger
quantities, drink large amounts of water or milk.

Chronic Ingestion: No applicable information found for chronic systemic effects.

Carcinogenicity
NTP: Not listed as carcinogen or mutagen.
IARC: Not listed as carcinogen or mutagen.
OSHA: Not listed as carcinogen or mutagen.

Medical Conditions Aggravated by Exposure: In some cases of confirmed hypertension, ingestion may result in
elevated blood pressure.
4, FIRST AID MEASURES
First Aid for Eyes: For eye contact, flush with water immediately, lifting evelids occasionally.
First Aid for Skin: Remove clothing from affected area. Wash skin thoroughly, Rinse carefully.

First Aid for Inhalation: If person breathes large quantities, remove to fresh air at once. If breathing stops, apply
artificial respiration immediately.

First Aid for Ingestion: Less than a few grams would not be harmful. For larger quantities, drink large amounts of
water or milk.
5. FIRE AND MEASURES
Flash Point: N/A
Extinguishing Media: N/A. This product is nonflammable.

Special Fire Fighting Procedures: N/A

6. ACCIDENTAL RELEASE MEASURES
Spill or Leak Procedures: Contain spills to prevent contamination of water supply or sanitary sewer systen.
Vacuum or sweep into containers for proper disposal.
7. HANDLING AND STORAGE
Storage Temperature (min./max.): Avoid humid or wet conditions as product will cake and become hard.
Special Sensitivity: Avoid contact with strong acids.

Handling and Storage Precantions: Becomes hygroscopic at 75% relative humidity.



8. EXPOSURE CONTROLS/PERSONAL PROTECTION
Eye Protection Requirements: Eyeglasses or goggles should be worn in dusty areas.
Skin Protection Requirements: Protective clothing may be worn in dusty areas, but is generally not required.
Respiratory/Ventilation Requirements: NIOSH/MSHA approved respirator for particulates.

Exposure Limits: Not listed,

9. PHYSICAL AND CHEMICAL PROPERTIES
Physical Form: White crystalline solid with slight halogen odor.
Color: White to opaque.

Odor: Halogen odor when heated.
Boiling Point {760mm Hg)(°C): 1465
Melting Point/Freezing Point (°C): 801
pH: 6.7-10.0

Selubility in Water (g/ce)(%): 264
Specific Gravity (H,0 = 1): 2.16

Bulk Density (Ibs./f%): 35-83

% Volatile by Weight: N/A

Vapor Pressure (mm Hg/747°C): 2.4

Vapor Density (Air=1): N/A

16. REACTIVITY
Stability: Stable
Incompatibilities: Avoid contact with strong acids. Becomes corrosive to metals when wet.

Decompeosition Products: May evolve chlorine gas when in contact with strong acids.

11.  TOXICOLOGICAL INFORMATION

Description: Not listed.

12.  ECOLOGICAL INFORMATION

Ecotoxicity: Not fisted.



Environmental Degradation: Not listed.

13. DISPOSAL CONSIDERATIONS

Waste Disposal Method: Follow applicable Federal, state, and local regulations.

14. TRANSPORTATION INFORMATION
D.O.T, Shipping Name: Not listed.
Technical Shipping Name: Not listed.
D.O.T. Hazard Class: Not listed.
UN./N.A. Number: Not listed.
Product Rq (Ibs.): N/A
D.O.T. Label: Not listed.
D.O.T. Placard: N/A
Freight Class Bulk: N/A
Freight Class Package: N/A

Product Label: N/A

15. REGULATORY INFORMATION
OSHA Status: Not listed.
TSCA Status: Listed as non-hazardous.

CERCLA Reportable Quantity SARA Title 111
Section 302 Extremely Hazardous Substances: Not listed.

Section 311/312 Hazard Categories: Not an OSHA hazardous material.
Section 313 Toxic Chemicals: Not listed.

RCRA Status: Not listed.

EINECS Number: 231-598-3

ENCS Number: 1-236

ECL Serial Number: KE-31387
SWISS Number: G-2580

HMIS Rating: 100A



State Regulatory Information

Company Name/Cas Number Concentration State Code
N/A

16. OTHER INFORMATION

Reason for Issue: Regulatory compliance.

Prepared By: Steve Karl
Approved By: Dave Merriweather
Title: Technical Director
Approval Date: May 2007
Supersedes Date: February 2005
MSDS Number: NB2

Disclaimer: All statements, technical information and recommendations contained herein are, to the best of our knowledge, reliable and accurate; however,
ne warranty, either expressed or implied is made with respect thereto, nor wili any lizbility be assumed for damages resultant from the use of the material
described.

It is the responsibility of the user to compiy with all applicable Federal, state and local laws and regulations. It is also the responsibility of the user to
maintain a safe workplace. The user should censider the health hazards and safety information provided herein as a guide and should take the necessary
steps to nstruct employees, and to develop work practice procedures to easure a safe work environment.

This information is not intended as a license to operate under, or a recommendation to practice or infringe upon any patent of this Company or others
covering any process, composition of matter or use,





