VIRGINIA LINEN SERVICE, INC.

“SINCE 1934”7

875 EAST BANK STREET + P. O. BOX 189 * PETERSBURG, VIRGINIA 23803 804-732-3312
804-748-5841
800-756-3315

Reply to: P.O. Box 869
Petersburg, VA 23804
(804) 732-3315
VIA FEDEX -

April 19, 2007

Mr. Butch Chittum
Purchasing Division !
2019 Washington Street East :
Post Cffice Box 50130 3
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 -
RE: DNR 80160 Linen Rental, Laundry & Dry Cleaning Service -

Dear Mr. Chittum,

Enclosed please find our completed bid guotations for Chief
Logan Lodge/Conference Center and Holly River State Parks.
Addendum #1, Addendum #2 and the Addendum Acknowledgement form
are included as well,

Also enclosed are “No-Bids” for Berkeley Springs State
Park, Blackwater Falls State Park, Cabwaylingo State Forest,
Cacapon Resort State Park, Kumbrabow State Forest and Lost River
State Park. Please kesep us on your list for future bid
reguests. 2

We appreciate the opportunity to work with you on Chief 3
Logan Lodge/Conference Center and Holly River State Parks and we
look forward to receiving the bid results.

Regards, ;
(@z&aﬁ, gorn | F

David M. Struminger
President

cc:  Kevin Clem, Gensral Manager

DMS/cpm

Enclosures

AN ENERGY EFFICIENT RECYCLING COMPANY PROTECTING THE HEALTH OF THE COMMUNITIES WE SERVE”




State of West Virginia Request for o wonmEsz—=
Department of Administration  Quotation
Purchasing Division

2019 Washingion Street East

Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 BUTCH CHITTUM
304-558-8806

*702035738 304-485-5406
SANITARY LINEN SE%@
PO BOX 343 EEW

PARKERSBURG WV 2 6 10 l

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

04/05/2007
BiD OPENING DATE: 04/24/2007 EID

ADDENDUM #1

TO CHANGE THE BID) OPENING DATE FROM: (4/10/2007
TO: (4/24/2007

ADDENDUM ACKHNOWLEBDGEMHENT IS ATTACHED. | THIS DOCUMENT
SHOULD BE SIGNED |AND RETURNED WITH YOUR BID. FAILURE
TO SIGN AND {RETURN MAY RESULT IN DISQUALIFICATION OF
YOUR BID.

END OF ADDENDUM #1

0001 LS 954-05
1
LINEN RENTAIL, LAUNDRY, & DRY CLEANING |SERVICE

*#***%% THIY IS THE END OF RFQ DNR8{(160 ***%*x* TOTAL;

OEE REVERSE SIDEFORTERMSAND: CONDITION
TELEPHO

e e 495~ 5904, 4/r7/n7

s 0T BE ~ANRE ?0 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*709035738
SANITARY LINEN SERVICE INC
PO BOX 343

PARKERSBURG WV 26101

304-485-5406

Request for

Quotation

REQNOMBER: ==

DNRB801&0 1

BUTCE CHITTUM
304-558-8806

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

E@EDWEm
AR 300 |

ATE PRINTEL

04/11/2007

BID OPENING DATE:

04/24/2007

0001

ADDENDUM #2

TO PROVIDE ADDITIONAL
THE ATTACHED.

ORIGINAL RFQ
ATTACHED.

DISQUALIFICATION

END OF ADDENDUM #$#2

.S
1

LINEN RENTAIL, LAUNDRY,

k%k%%%* THIG

IS THE END OF RFQ

1. TO ANSWER QUESTIONS THAT HAVE BEEN SUBMITTED, AND
INFORMATION FOR

2. TO REPLACE THE CO$T BID SHEETS SUBPLIED IN THE
WITH REVISED COST BID SHEETS AS PER THE

3. "ADDENDUN ACKNOWLEDGEMENT IS ATTACHED.
DOCUMENT SHQULD BE SIGNED AND RETURNEL
FATLURE TO $IGN AND RETURN MAY RESULT
OF YQUR RBID.

954-05

& DRY CLEANING

DNRB8(Q160 #*****% TOTAT

THE BID AS PER

THIS
WITH YOUR BID.
IN

SERVICE

- SFE PEVERSE SI0E FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS

SbW\%

TELEPHONE
304

DATE
5406 4=16-07

485

TITLE

President

i '
\\j R

FEIN

55=0354280

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS [N SPACE ABOVE LABELED VENDOR'




Addendum #2 Questions and Answers and Additional Information for DNRBﬂlﬁ"

1. Where does the “on hand” inventory reside?

Answer. The “on hand” inventory is the inventory amount to be on hand at the
park at all times.

2. Estimated Usage Quantity for Berkeley Springs State Park: “Is the total in that box
Annually, Monthly or Weekly™?

Answer. These are “Monthly™ estimates.

| Does the “Total” at the bottom of the bid page include the 1 each replacement cost for
each item?

Answer. No. The total on the bid page should §i5E include the replacement cost
for each item.

4. 'What number do you want in the “Unit Price” box, individual cost or monthly cost?

Answer. Individual cost.

NOTES:
1. Some quantities have changed, per the attached revised bid cost sheets.
2. Some items have been deleted from Chief Logan Lodge cost sheet.

3. Initial Delivery: The vendor shall contact the park prior to the first delivery date to
request the quantities of/and specific items to be included in the initial delivery.

4. Payment: Vendor shall invoice the park for all items delivered with the initial
delivery. Subsequent weekly invoices shall be only for the actual number of items
cleaned and delivered to the park by the vendor each week.




Berkeley Springs State Park
2 South Washington Street
Berkeley Springs, WV 25411

' Telephone: 304-258-5860

Item # Estimated Description Unit Price Extended
Monthly Amount
Usage Qty.
1 1500 Twin Bed Sheets, Flat, 66” x 104", amount on hand at all times: 800  |§ %
2 300 Pillow Cases, Standard, 22“ x 44", amount on hand at all times: 100 |4 $
3600 Bath Towels, 24" x 44" minimum size, 11 ibs/doz min; amount on $ $
hand st alf times: 1200
4 1200 Face/Hand towel, 16" x 27", 3 Ibs/doz minimum; amount on hand at $ $
all imes: 600
5 1000 Bath Mats, 18" x 24", 7 ths/doz; amount on hand at all fimes: 400 $ $
6 75 Blankets, cotton flannel, 96" x 66°, 100% cotton; amount on hand at  {$ $
all times: 25
7 36 Entrance mats for the main bathhouse lobby and roman bathhouse $ $

lobby shall be exchanged on a weekly basis. (6 each ~ 3'x 57; {2 each

64 (64 each) 3'x 10" mats $ $
24 (12 each) 3’ x 5 Mats - $ $

10 21 Vacumat Entrance Mat, 3’ x 5’ — 21 mats $ $
11 64 Vacumat Entrance Mat, 3" x 10’ — 64 mats $ $
12 12 Entrance Mat, Vacumat, 3’ x 5 rubber back, polyester, color: red $ $
13 12 Entrance Mat, Vacumat, 3’ x 10 rubber back, polyester, color: red $ $

Replacement cost for lost or mlm items:

1 Each Twin Bed Sheets, Flat, 66" x 104" $
15 1 Each Pillow Cases, Standard, 22" x 44 %
16 1 Each Bath Towels, 24” x 44" minimum size, 11 Ibs/doz min, $
17 1 Each Face/Hand towel, 16" x 27", 3 Ibs/doz minimumn, $
18 1 Each Bath Mats, 18" x 24", 7 Ibs/doz. $
19 1 Each Blankets, cotton flannel, 96" x 66”, 100% cotton. $
20 1 Each Entrahce mats for the main bathhouse lobby and roman bathhouse $
Hobby ( 3" % 5: (3'x 10).
21 1 Each Entrance mats for the main bathhouse areas (3' X 5% and (3' X 107} $
22 1 Each Vacumat Entrance Mat, 3' x 5 ‘ $
23 1 Each Vacumat Entrance Mat, 3' x 10 (3
24 1 Each Entrance Mat, Vacumat, 3’ x 5’ rubber back, polyester, color: red $
Entrance Mat, Vacumat, 3’ x 10’ rubber back, polyester, color: red %

"No Bid" on this Park. Please Keep us on bid list
for future gquotations.




Blackwater Falls State Park

Rt. 29, PO Drawer 490

R e e s S
Item # Description Unit Price Extended
Monthly Amount
Lisane Oty
1 40 White Brad Chef Coats, Sizes §, M, L, XL, XXL $ $
2 200 White Chef Bib Apron, Sizes: 5, M, L, XL, XXL £ $
3 400 Soda Towels, 127 x 15" $ %
4 36 White Tablecloths, Linen, 52" x 52" $ $
5 100 White Tablecloths, Linen, 52” x 1207 $ $
6 400 White Table Napkins, Linen, 19 1/2"x 19 1/2" $ $
7 8 Nyion Laundry Bag H43"x W33" w/Stand $ $
8 300 |Grill Wipes Approximately 127 x 15" $ $
9 27 Walnut Brown Carpet Mat, 3' x &' $ $
10 14 Walnut Brown Carpet Mat, 3' x 10' $ $
11 21 Walnut Brown Carpet Mats, 4’ x &' $ $
All delivered items must be clean, neat and free of wrinkles, burrs, soils
and imperfections. Items shall be wrapped and dlearly labeled for easy
identification of contents and sizes. Unacceptable items will be returned
for exchange or credit. Successfu! bidder should provide emergency
nurbers for off hours contact or orders. Successful bidder should
provide contact name for resolution of complaints or issues.
Name: Phone:
Laundry to inciude the following park owned items:
12 1 Each |Mattress covers ' $ $
13 1 Each |Shower curtain $ $
14 1 Each |Similar misc. item $ $
Dry cleaning items owned by the Park -
15 1 Each  |Couch covers $ $
16 1Each |Bolster covers $ $
17 1Each [Blankets $ $
18 1 Each |Drapes, Short $ $
19 1 Each |Drapes, Long $ $
20 1 Each {Mattress Pads $ $
Total $
Replacement cost for lost for missing items:
Price to be quoted for each piece specified
21 1 Each [White Brad Chef Coats, Sizes: S5, M, 1, XL, XL $
22 1 Each |White Chef Bib Apron, Sizes: 5, M, L, XL, XXL %
23 1Each |Soda Towels, 12" x 15" [
24 1 Each |White Tablecloths, Linen, 52" x 52" $
25 1 Each |White Tablecloths, Linen, 527 x 1207 $
26 1Each |White Table Napkins, Linen, 19 1/2" x 19 1/2” $
27 1Each |Nylon Laundry Bag H43"x W33" w/Stand &
28 1 Fach |[Grill Wipes Approximately 12" x 15" $
29 1 Fach |Walnut Brown Carpet Mat, 3" x 5 $
30 1 Fach |Walnut Brown Carpet Mat, 3" x 10’ 3
31 1Each [Walnut Brown Carpet Mats, 4'x 6' §
Pickup and deliver weelly to and from the State Forest by vendor's
truck. The initial delivery for the current season shall be April 2, 2007;
the initial delivery shall be the Monday following April 1 thereafter. A
-{park representative will contact the vendor prior to the first delivery to
{specify the quantily of linens to be delivered. e = -
"No Bid" for this Park. Please keep us onbid list
for future quotations.

-




Cabwaylingo State Forest

Rt. 1, Box 85
Duniow, WV 25511
Telephone: 304-385-4255

Color - Bone

Item # Estimated Description Unit Price Extended
Monthly Amount
Usage Otv,
1 400 |Queen Sheets, Flat & Fitted $ $
z 100 |Twin Sheets, Flat & Fitted $ $
3 350  |Piflowcases 42" x 36" $ $
4 250  |Bath Towels, 25" x 46"; 11 Ibs/doz $ $
S 250 Face/Hand Towels, 16" x 24"; 3 Ibs/doz $ $
3 250  |Wash Cloths, 12" x 12" 1 Ibs/doz $ $
7 250  |Kitchen/teafdish towels, 157 x 25" $ $
8 200  iDish Cloths/rags $ $
9 $ 3$

Slm:Iar misc. |tem 7

10 1Each |Cotton blankets $ ¥
11 1 Each |Bedspreads $ 3
12 1Each |Mattress covers $ ¥
13 1 Each  |Shower curtain $ $
i4 1 Each $ 3

15 1 Each Couch COvers $ $
16 1Each |Bolster covers $ $
17 1 Each |Biankets $ $
18 1 Each |Drapes, Short $ $
19 1Each |Drapes, Long $ $
20 1 Each |Mattress Pads $ $
: . Total
Replacement costs for lost and/or missing items
{Price to be quoted for each piece specified)
21 1Each |Queen Sheets, Flat & Fitted $
22 1Each |Twin Sheets, Flat & Fitied $
23 1Each [Piliowcases 42" x 36" $
24 1Each |Bath Towels, 25" x 46" $
25 1 Each |Face/Hand Towels, 21" x 28" $
26 1 Each iWash Cloths, 15" x 25" $
27 1 Each |Kitchen/tea/dish towels $
28 1 Each  |Dish Cloths/rags $
29 1 Each |Walk-Off Mats, 3' x 5’ rubberized $
Pickup and deliver weekly to and from the state forest by vendor's truck,
The initial delivery for the current season shall be April 2, 2007; the
Hinitial delivery shalt be the Monday following April 1 thereafter, A park
B representative will contact the vendor prior to the first delivery to
; specify the guantity of linens to be delivered. The final linen pickup of
= =1the season shall be on or about November 1 of gach year.
"No Bid" on this Park. Please keep us on bid list

for future guotations.

7

v




Cacapon Resort State Park
818 Cacapon Lodge Dr.
Berkeley Springs, WV 25411-3300

Itemn #  ]Estimated Monthiy| Pascription Unit Price Extended Amount
Usage Qty.

1 1,000 Table Cloths, White, Fine Dining,85” x 85", Minimum stock all times 500 |g $

2 1,000 Table Cloths, White, Fine Dining, 52"x114", Minimum Stock 500 $ 3

3 300 Table Cloths, Red, Fine Dining, 857 x 85", Minimum stock all times 150 |$ $

4 300 Table Cloths, Red, Fine Dining, 52" x 114", Minimum Stock 150 § $

5 3,200 Napkins, White, Fine Dining, 20" x 20", Minimum Stock 800 3 $

6 100 Napkins, Red, Fine Dining, 20" x 20", Minimum Stock 800 g $

7 100 Walk Off Mats, Gray 3" x 5, Minimum Stock 50 5 3

B 100 Walk Off Mats, Gray 3" x 10°, Minimum Stock 50 $ $

9 100 Walk Off Mats, Gray, 4’ x 6", Minimum Stock 50 $ $
Total $

Replacement costs for lost and/or missing iftems
{Price to be quoted per each piece specified)

10 1 Each Table Cloths,White,Fine Dining, 85" x B5” $

11 1 Each Table Cloths, White, Fine Dining, 52"x114" $

12 1 Each Table Cloths, Red, Fine Dining, 85" x B5” $

13 1 Each Table Cloths, Red, Fine Dining, 52" x 114" %

14 1 Each Napkins, White, Fine Dining, 20" x 20" $

15 1 Each Napkins, Red, Fine Dining, 20" x 20" $

16 1 Each Walk Off Mats, Gray 3'x 5 $

17 1 Each Walk Off Mats, Gray 3’ x 10" $

1B 1 Each Walk Off Mats, Gray, 4’ x &' 3

"No Bid" for this Park. Please keep us on bid list

for future guotations.




Chief Logan Lodge/Conference Center State Park

1000, Conference Center Dr., Logan, WV 25601
304-855-6100

Item # Estimated Description Unit Price | Extended Amount
Monthly Usage
Qty.
Linen/Sheets : =
1 3,000 King white 108" x 115" $ .54 $ 1,620.00
2 4,000 Piliow cases king white 42" x 46" $ .21 $ 840.00
Bath = e
3 4,106 Bath towel white 257 x 54" 13.5 Ib/dz $ .32 $ 1,313.92
4 4,106 Hand towel white 16" x 30™ 3.0 Ib/dz $ .20 1% 821.20
5 4,106  |Wash cloth white 12" x 12" 1.0 Ib/dz $ .11 S 451 .66
6 1,369 Bath mat white 20" x 30" 7.0 Ibfdz $ $
Restaurant Items -
7 548 Food service aprons, white bib top $ .30 $ 164,40
8 1,095 Food service bar mops, non terry $ 14 $.153.130
9 183 Food service grilt wipes $ 14 $ 25.62
10 2,013 Dinner napkins, white starched 21" x 21* 100% cotton 3 10 $ 2n1 _2n
il 912 Dinner napkins, colored starched 21” x 217 100% cotton $ 1A $ 91.20
12 171 Round table doths 90" $1.60 $ 273.60
i3 274 [Table cloth 52" x 52" white $ .an $ 184,40
14 137 -~ [Table eloth 52" x-52" colored T BT énT 18 82,20
15 183 Table cloth 527 x 120" white $1.50 $ 274.50

Table cloth 527 120" colored

3x5 rubber backing

, $2.35 s 47.00
18 4 3x10 rubber backing $4,.00 $ 16.00
15 12 4x6 rubber backing $3.10 $ 37.20
20 20 4x6 scraper 3 3

Other
21 1 Each Dust mop 18” $.90 % .90
22 1 Each Dust mop 36" 1.25
Dry clearﬁﬁg items oui;hed by Ehé Park : T
23 1 Each Table skirting 13 $13.00 $ 13.00
24 1 Each Draperies 827 x 72" pinch pleat £30.00 $ 30.00
25 1 Each Draperies 82" x 68" pinch pleat $28.00 $28.00
26 tEach  |[Draperies 74" x 99" pinch pleat $32 00 $ 29 a0
27 1Each  |Draperies 74" x 89" pinch pleat § L)
= Laundﬁ.ltems Owned by the Park

28 " 1 Each Bedspreads
29 - 1 Each Blankets
30 1 Each Mattress Pads




. Chief Logan Lodge/Conference Center State Park T

1000, Conference Center Dr., Logan, WV 25601
304-855-6100

Replacement cost for fost or miséing items:

) Linen/Sheets o :
31 1 Each King white 108" x 115" $20.68
32 1Each |Pillow cases king white 42" x 46" $ 4.05
33 TEach  |Bath towel white 25" x 54 13.5 Ibjdz § 6.17
34 1 Each Hand towe! white 16" x 30 1.0 Ib/dz 3 2.10
35 1 Each Wash cloth white 12" x 12" 1.0 Ib/dz $ .57
36 1 Each Bath mat white 20" x 30" 7.0 Ib/dz $ 5.21
Restaurant Items
37 1Each- |Food service aprons, white bib top s 4,28
38 1 Each Food service bar mops, non terry $ 1.13
39 . 1 Each Food service grilf wipes $ .42
40 1 Each Dinner napkins, white starched 21" x 21" 100% cotton $ 1.20
41 1 Each Dinner napkins, colored starched 217 x 21”7 100% cotton $ 2.21
42 1 Each Round table cloths 90" $23._48
43 1 Each Table cloth 52" x 52" white § o =4
44 1 Each Table doth 52" x 52" colored $10 22
45 1 Each Table cloth 52 x 120" white $1a0 2c
45 1 Each Table cioth 52" 120" colored $ z
Entry Mats T
47 1 Each 3x5 rubber backing $§ 59.93
48 1 Each 3x10 rubber backing $121.88
49 1 Each 4x6 rubber backing $ 90.11
50 1 Each 4x6 scraper $ 93.74
Other
5t 1 Each Dust mop 187 $ -
52 1 Each Dust mop 36" $15.60




Holly River State Park
P.O. Box 70, Route 20
Hacker Valley, WV 26222

304-453-6353
Ttem # Estimated Description Unit Price Extended Amount
Monthly Usage
Oty.
1 450 Double Sheets, flat, 81" x 108-110” 5 .60 $ 270.00
2 350 Pillow Cases 42" X 36 $ .35 3 122.50
3 450 Bath Towels, 25" x 46" (11 |bs/doz) $ .38 $ 171.00
4 400 Face/hand Towels, 16" x 26" (3 Ibs/doz) § .24 3 Qi .00
5 125 Bath Mats, 21" x 28" (7 Ibs/doz) $ 29 $ 40 .00
] 400 Wash Clothes, 12" x 12" (1 Lb/doz) - $ .15 3 60.00
7 300 Kitchen Towels, 15" x 25", hemmed edges, cotion $ .21 3 63.00
8 20 Walk-off mats, 3'x 5, rubberized $ 41 =N § an NN
Total $ 912.50
Replacement costs for lost and/or missing items
(Ph’ce to be quoted per each pliece specified.)
g 1 Each Double Sheets, flat, 81" x 108-110" $ 13.10
10 1 Each Pillow Cases 42" X 36" $ 4.05
11 1 Each Bath Towels, 25" x 46~ (11 Ibs/doz) $ 5.17
12° 1 Each Facefhand Towels, 16" x 26" (3 ibsfdoz) $ o 10
13 1 Each Bath Mats, 21" x 28" (7 Ibs/doz) $ = 91
13 1 Each Wash Clothes, 12" x 12" (1 lbfdoz) $ =~
15 1 Each Kitchen Towels, 15" x 25", hemmed edges, cotton $ 1 an
16 1 Each Walk-off mats, 3’ x 5, rubberized $

Pickup and-delivery instructions; :

First delivery shall be the week of the third Monday in March. The park |

will call vendor prior to the initial defivery date with initial inventory.
Then biweekly deiiveries beginning the second Monday in April through
November 30, except the park needs weekly deliveries during July and
August, The end of season pickup shall be on or about December 1.




Kumbrabow State Forest

Rt 219-16

P.0. Box 65
Huttonsvilie, WV 26273
ele

Pick up and delivery to and from Kumbrabow State Forest is to be
arranaed with the Forest Superintendent.

Vendor must list items on invoice as shown on confract

In case of an error in delivered supplies or shortage of linens, the

vendor will arrange for additional Einens to be deliverad to the spending

unit with 24 hours,
Ermergency contact number:

"No Bid" for this Park. Please keep us on bid list
for future guotations.

Ttem # Estimated Description Unit Price  j Extended Amount
Monthly Usage - -
Qty.

1 500 Full Sheets, Flat, 81" x 110" $ $

2 600 Twin Sheets, Flat 66" x 115" $ 3

3 800 Piliowcases, 42" x 36" $ $

4 700 Bath Towels, 25" x 46”; 11 Ibs/doz $ $

5 700 FacefHand towels, 16" x 24"; 3 lbs/doz $ $

6 800 Wash Clothes, 12" x 127; 1 Ihs/doz $ 3

7 450 Kitchen Towels, 15" x 25* [ 5

8 40 Walk-off Mats, 3' x 5, rubberized ) $
Total $

Replacement costs for lost and/or missing items
Price to be quoted per each piece specified

9 1 Each Full Sheets, Flat, 81" x 110" $

10 1 Each Twin Sheets, Flat 66 x 115" §

11 1 Fach Pillowcases 42 x 36" $

12 1 Each Bath towels, 25" x 467 $

13 1 Each FacefHand Towels, 217 x 28" 3

14 t Each Wash Clothes, 12” x 12" $

15 1 Each Kitchen Towels, 15” x 25" $

16 1 Each Walk-off Mats, 3" x 5’ rubberized $

10

i




Lost River State Park

321 Park Drive

Mathias, WV 26812
Telephone: 304-897-5372

Item # Estimated Description : Unit Price Extended Amount
Monthly Usage
D
1 275 Sheets, flat, double, 81" x 1087 § $
2 200 Pillow Case, 427 x 36" $ $
3 250 Towel, 24" x 507, 11 Ib/doz . %
4 250 Towel Face/Hand, 16" x 277, 3 Ib/doz $ %
5 250 Washcloth, 127 x 127, 1 Ib/doz $ $
6 60 Mat, Bath, 18" x 24", 7 Ib/doz $ $
7 160 Towel, Kitchen, 15 x 25" $ 3
8 10 Mat, 3" x 5”, burgundy $ 3
9 5 Mat, wipe, rubberized, black scrapper $ $
10 10 Mop, dust treated, 12" x 14”. Handles need to be supplied. $ $

Lndry to include the follig park owned items:

11 1 Each Bedspreads $ $
12 1 Each Mattvess pads $ $
13 1 Each Mattress covers $ $
14 1 Each Cotton bfankets $ $
15 1 Each Shower curtaing $ $
16 1 Each Dust mop heads $ $
17 1 Each Curiains § $
18 1 Each Tablecloths $ $

19 1 Each Wool blanke o ] - R $
20 1 Each Draperies $

Réplacement oosts for lost and/or missing items
Price to be quoted per each piece specified) £

21 1 Each Sheets, flat, double, 81" x 108" $
22 1 Each Pillow Case, 427 x 36" 3
23 1 Each Towel, 24" x 507, 11 Ibfdoz 3
24 1 Each Towel Face/Hand, 16" x 27", 3 ib/doz $
25 1 Each Washcloth, 12% x 12", 1 Ib/doz $
26 1 Each Mat, Bath, 18" x 247, 7 Ib/doz $
27 1 Each Towel, Kitchen, 15" x 25" $
28 1 Each Mat, 3” x 57, burgundy 3
29 1 Each Mat, wipe, rubberized, black scrapper 3
30 1 Each Mop, dust treated, 12" x 14”. Handies need to be supplied. 3

& 25 f & i Sk 4

"No Bid" for this Park. Please keep us on bid 1list
for future guotations.

ey
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wvasa STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA Buyer: Page Reqg.orP. 0. No.:
PURCHASING CONTINUATION SHEET _ ~ DNR80160
Spending Unit:
Vendor Sanitary Linen Service,Inc. .
DNR80160

Requisition No.:

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following checked addendum(s) and have made
the necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specifications, efc.

Addendum No.'s:

No. 1 X
No. 2 X
No.3
No. 4

No.5

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of the addendum(s) may be

cause for rejection of bids.

(N D

\.—/Signature

SMW'Q{T\( l———l-\.‘k.r\\: S&'?LL)’C‘\:"' Zrle-
LCompany
‘%/ b O F
Date

Exhibit 10

Rev. 11/96




