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State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washinglon Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

306-558-2602
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PFAFF & SMITH BUILDERS SUPPLY
PO BOX 2508

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

CHARLESTON WV 25329

12/17/2006
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State Of West Virgin.ia. . Reques! for i AP VB R M A
Department of Administration Quotation 667C0017 5
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JOHN JOHNSTON
306-558-24602

¥709035120 306-362-4171
PFAFF & SMITH BUILDERS SUPPLY
PO BOX 2508

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

CHARLESTON WV 25329

12/17/2006
BID OPENING DATE:

NONRESIDENT VENDOR WITH AN AFFILIATE OR SUBSIDIARY
WHICH MAINTAINS ITS HEADQUARTERS OR PRINCIPAL PLACE

OF BUSINESS WITHIN WESIT VIRGINIA EMPLOYING A MINIMUM
DF ONE HUNDRED STATE RESIDENTS WHO CERTIFIES THAT,
DURING THE LIIFE OF THE| CONTRACTY, ON AVERAGE AT LEAST
75% OF THE EMPLOYEES OR BIDDERS' AFFIL|IIATE'S OR
SUBSIDIARY'S EMPLOYEES| ARE RESIDENTS OF WEST VIRGINIA
WHQ HAVE RESIDED jIN THE STATE CONTINUOUSLY FOR THE TWO
YEARS IMMEDIATELY PRECEDING SUBMISSION OF THIS BID.

BIDDER UNDERSTANDS IF [THE SECRETARY OF TAX & REVENUE
DETERMINES THAT Al BIDDER RECEIVING PREFERENCE HAS
FATLED TO CONTINUE TO MEET THE REQUIREMENTS FOR SUCH
PREFERENCE, THE SECRETARY MAY ORDER THE DIRECTOR OF
PURCHASING TO: (A) RESCIND THE CONTRALCT OR PURCHASE
ORDER ISSUED;; OR [(B) ASSESS A PENALTY AGAINST SUCH
BIDDER IN AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED 5% OF THE BID AMOUNT
AND THAT SUCH PENALTY WILL BE PAID TO [THE CONTRACTING
AGENCY OR DEDUCTED FROM ANY UNPAID BALANCE ON THE
CONTRACT OR PURCHASE ORDER.

BY SUBMISSION OF |THIS [CERTIFICATE, BIDDER AGREES TO
DISCLOSE ANY| REASONABLY REQUESTED INFORMATION TO THE
PURCHASING DIIVISIDN AND AUTHORIZES THE| DEPARTMENT OF
TAX AND REVENUE TO DISCLOSE TO THE DIRECTOR OF
PURCHASING APPROPRIATE] INFORMATION VERIFYING THAT
BIDDER HAS PAID THE RERUIRED BUSINESS TAXES, PROVIDED
THAT SUCH INFORMATION DOES NOT CONTAIN THE AMOUNTS OF
TAXES PAID NOR ANY OTHER INFORMATION DEEMED BY THE TAX
COMMISSIONER) TO BE CONFIDENTIAL.

UNDER PENALT|Y OF LAW FOR FALSE SWEARING (WEST VIRGINIA
CODE 61-5-3), BIDDER HEREBY CERTIFIES THAT THIS
CERTIFICATE |IS TRUE AND ACCURATE IN ALL RESPECTS; AND
THAT IF A CONTRACT IS |[ISSUED TO BIDDER| AND IF ANYTHING
CONTAINED WITHIN ITHIS ICERTIFICATE CHANGES DURING THE

ETH

e B 30v) 3va-417!
i PRESIDIENT e 85 -028380 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'
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Stéte of West Virginia -Request for ¢ TRFONUNMEER

Department of Administration  Quotation E—
Purchasing Division 667C0017 6

2019 Washington Street East ADDRESE CORRESE
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JOHN JOHNSTON
ANG-HKh8-2402
%709035120 306-362-4171

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS L OCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

PFAFF & SMITH BUILDERS SUPPLY
PO BOX 2508

CHARLESTON WV 25329

12/17/2006
BID OPENING DATE:

01,10/2007 BID OPENING T

TERM OF THE CONTRACT, [BIDDER WILL NOTIFY THE PURCHASING
DIVISION IN WRITING IMMEDIATELY.

BIlDDER: Pfﬂff_t' SM!TPLBWLI)E.Rs SvprLy Co

DATE ¢ - _}_.—'P—.—..l-'?.gj uuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuu

m—————
STGNED: b - - S el 2 C et
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% CHECK ANY [COMBINATION OF PREFERENCE ICONSIDERATION(S)
IN EITHER “A™ OR ["B™, OR BOTH "AY™ AND ["B"™ WHICH YOU ARE
ENTITLED TO RECEIVE. JYOU MAY REQUEST UP TO THE MAXIMU
5% PREFERENCE FOR| BOTH "A™ AND "B".
(REV. 12/700)

NOTIICE

A SIGNED BID MUST BE SUBMITTED TO:

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
PURCHASIING DIVISION

BUILDING 15
2019 WASHINGTON STREET, EAST
CHARLES[TON, WV 25305-0130

THE BID SHOULD CONTAIN THIS INFORMATION ON THE FACE OF
THE ENVELOPE, OR THE BIID MAY NOT BE CONSIDERED:

ey N G C304) 324171 ] -16 -2007

T PREUDENT Y 55-0253810 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




CHARLESTON WV

709035120
PFAFF & SMITH BUILDERS SUPPLY
PO BOX 2508

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

306~34G42-6171

25329

Request for
Quotation

ARG NOMBERES
667C0017

JOHN JOHNSTON

206-558-24602

BIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

1271772006

BID OPENING DATE:
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e
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Note:

11.

ITtem
No.

vendor should type bidding schedules

RIDDING SCHEDULE

Unit Bid Price for

(5imiles of Vendor'

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

Items A through I,
s Plant.

to include delivery within five

1z

DISTRICT L PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

2-2.99CY 3-3.98CY 4-4,99CY 5CY & Over
Class A Concrete, 137.40/CY 109.80/CY 99.60/CY 86.20/CY
Class B Concrete, 131.20/CY 103.60/CY 93.40/CY 79.80/CY
Class C Concrete, NB /CY NBR /CY NB /CY NB /CY
Class D Concrete, NB /CY NB /CY NB /CY NB /CY
Class K Concrete, 137.80/CY 110.00/CY 99.80/CY 86.40/CY
Modified Class K
Concrete, 8-1/2 Bag
Mix, Siliceous Sand 146.40/CY 118.80/CY 108.60/CY 95.20/CY
CLSM Type A 116.20/CY 88.60/CY 78.40/CY 64.80/CY
CLSM Type B 112.80/CY 85.20/CY 75.00/CY 61.40/CY
ClL.8M Type C 121.60/CY $4.00/CY 83.80/CY 70.20/CY
Will Class B Concrete supplied at prices
quoted above contain limestone sand? NO
If so, state additicnal charge to provide
c¢lass B Concrete using siliceous sand NA. /CY
Charge per bag for increased cement
content above the target value. 5.80 /cy

Additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both
Divigion of Highways will select the most cost

Option A § NA per

Option B $  6.40 per

optionsg; however, the

effective option.
cubic yvard per mile

truck load per mile



1l

13

BIDDING SCHEDULE (continued) DISTRICT 1
M. Admixture, per cubic yard
1) Water-reducing set retarder 8 2.00 Cy
2) Water reducer g INC CY
3) Calcium chloride based accelerator
(HE-122 or approved egual S 0.04 07
4) Non-Calcium chloride based accelerator S 0.11 0Z
(Darex Set Accelerator or approved equal
5) Super plasticizer (Bucon 37 or approved
Hgual S 6.80 CY
&) Fiber 8 6.20 CY
7) Heated Concrete $ 3.50 CY
8) Ige $ (.36 per pound
N. Due to time constraints, the cement may have to be added

to the transit mixer at the project site using Division

personnel. Please gstate any additional charges as

folliows:
1) Cement provided and transported to
project site by vendor $ NO BID /CY
2) Cement provided by vendor and transported
from Vendor’s plant to project site by
Division $ NO BID /CY
0. Penalty Charge for unleoading time

in excess of ten (10) minutes per cubic

vard. $  2.00 per truck minute

Plant Location SPRING & BULLITT STREETS CHARLESTON WV




Note:

1.

Item
NG.

Vendor should type bidding schedules

BIDDING SCHEDULE

Unit Bid Price for Items A through I, to include delivery within five

(5)miles of Vendor’s Plant.

ORDER SIZE TN CUBIC YARDS

DISTRICT 2

B

RICE PER CUBIC YARD

14

2-2.99CY 3-3.88CY 4-4,99CY 5CY & Over
Clags A Concrete, 137.40/CY 109.80/CY 99.60/CY 86.20/CY
Class B Congrete, 131.20/CY 103.60/CY 93.40/CY 79.80/CY
Class C Concrete, NB /CY WB /CY NB /CY Ng /oy
Class D Concrete, NB /CY NB /oy NB /CY NB /CY
Class K Concrete, 137.60/CY 110.00/CY 99.80/CY 86.40/CY
Modified Clasg K
Concrete, 8~-1/2 Bag
Mix, Siliceous Sand 146.40/CY 118.80/CY 108.60/CY 95.20/CY
CLSM Type A 116.20/CY 88.60/CY 78.40/CY 64.80/CY
CLSM Type B 112.80/CY 85.20/CY 75.00/0Y 61.40/CY
CLSM Type C 121.60/CY 94.00/CY 83.80/CY 70.20/CY
Will Class B Concrete supplied at prices
quoted above coniain limestone sand? NG
If so, state additional charge to provide
class B Concrete using siliceous sand NA /CY
Charge per bag for increased cement
content above the target value. 5.80 /CY

Additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both
Division of Highways will select the most cost

Option A $ NA& per

Cption B §  6.40 per

options; however, the

effective opticn.
cubic yard per mile

truck load per mile



11.

BIDDING SCHEDULE {continued) DISTRICT 2
M. Admixture, per cubic yard
1) Warer-reducing set retarder 3
2) Water reducer S
3) Calcoium chloride based accelerator
{HE-122 or approved equal 5
4) Non~Calcium chloride based accelerator $
(Darex Set Accelerator or approved equal
5) Super plasticizer (Eucon 37 or approved
Equal 3
6) Fiber S
7) Heated Concrete 3
8) Ice 3
N. Due to time constraints, the cement may have to be added

to the transit mixer at the project site using Divigion
personnel. Pleage gstate any additional charges as

follows:
1) Cement provided and transported to
project site by vendor $ NO BID /CY
2) Cement provided by vendor and transported
from Vendor’s plant to project site by
Division S NO BID JCY
0. Penalty Charge for unloading time

in excess of ten (10) minutes per cubic
S 2.00 per truck minute

vard.

Plant Location SPRING & BULLITT STREETS CHARLESTON WV

2.08

INC
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0.36
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CyY
CY
cY
per pound



Note:

1l.

Ttem
No.

Vendor should type bidding schedules

BIDDING SCHEDULE

Unit Bid Price for Items A through I,

(5)miles of Vendor’s Plant.

Additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both options; however, the

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

DISTRICT 3

to include delivery within five

PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

Division of Highways will select the most cost effective option.

Option A $ NA per cubic vard per mile

Option B $  6.40 per truck lead per mile

16

2-2.99CY 3-3.99CY 4-4.58CY 5CY & Qver
Class B Concrete, 137.40/CY 109.80/CY 99.60/CY 86.20/CY
Class B Concrete, 131.20/CY 103.60/0Y $3.40/CY 79.80/CY
Class C Concrete, NB /CY NB /CY NB /CY NB /CY
Class D Concrete, NB /CY NBE /CY NB /CY NB /CY
Class K Concrete, 137.60/CY 110.00/CY 99.80/CY 86.40/CY
Modified Class K
Concorete, 8-1/2 Bag :
Mix, Silicecus Sand 146.40/CY 118.80/CY 108.60/CY 95.20/CY
CLBM Type A 116.20/CY 88.60/CY 78.40/CY 64.80/CY
CLSM Type B 112.80/CY 85.20/CY 75.00/CY 61.40/CY
CLSM Type C 121.60/CY 94.00/CY 83.80/CY 70.20/CY
Will Class B Concrete supplied at prices
gquoted above contain limestone sand? NO
If so, state additional charge to provide
clags B Concrete using siliceous sand NA& /CY
Charge per bag for increased cement
content above the target value. 5.80 /CY



il.
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BIDDING SCHEDULE (continued) DISTRICT 3
M. Admixture, per cubic vard
1) Water-reducing set retarder $ 2.00 CY
2) Water reducer s INC v
3) Calcium chloride based accelerator
({HE-122 or approved equal $ 0.04 027
4) Non-Calcium chloride bhased accelerator $ 0.11 0z
{Darex Set Accelerator or approved egqual
5) Super plasticizer (BEucon 27 or approved
Equal $ 6.80 CY
g) Fiber $ 6.20 CY
7) Heated Concrete $ 3.50 CY¥
8) Ice $ 0.36 per pound
N. Due to time constraints, the cement may have to be added

to the transit mixer at the project site using Division
personnel. Please state any additional charges as

follows:
1 Cement provided and transported to
project site by vendor ¢ NO RBID /CY
2) Cement provided by vendor and transported
from Vendor’s plant to project site by
Divisgsion $ NO BID /CY
Q. Penalty Charge for unlocading time

in excess of ten (10} minutes per cubic
$ 2.00 per truck minute

vard.

Plant Locaticon SPRING & BULLITT STREETS CHARLESTON WV




Jan 10, 2007 3:220M W PURCHASING ACA SECT Fax 304-558-4115 Jan Ne. 154 13:09P, 2m2/002
an. 10, :

RFQ No. 667C0017

AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states:

No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of iis political subdivisions to any
vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party to the vendor or

prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owned is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the
aggregate '

DEFINITIONS:

"Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any
of its political subdivisions because of a Judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted
workers' compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently deflinquent or due and required to be

paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued
thereon.

“Debtor” means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited iability company or any other form
or business association owing a debt 10 the state or any of ifs political subdivisions. “Political subdivision®
means any county commission; municipality: county board of education; any instrumantality established by a
county or municipality; any separate cotporafion or instrumentality established by one or more counties or
municipalities, as permitted by law; or any public body charged by law with the performance of a govemment
function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or municipalities. "Related party” means
a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limjted fiabitity company or any other form
or business association or other entity whatsoever, related ta any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or
contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the
party will actually or by effect receive or control a pottion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from

performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the
total confract amount.

EXCEPTION:

The prohibitian of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to
chapter eleven of this code, workers’ compensation premiuni, permit fee or environmental fee or assassment
and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and
the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

LICENSING:

CONFIDENTIALITY:

The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personaily
identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, Unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to fthe disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the
agency's palicies, procedures and rules. Vendars should vislt www,state.wv‘usladmm!purchase!prlvacy for
the Notice of Agency Confidentiality Policies.

Under penalty of law for false swearihg (West Virginia Code, §61-6-3), 1t is hereby certified that the vendor
acknowledges the information in this said affidavit and are in compliance with the requirements as stated.

Vendor's Name: . Pfﬂff T STl Buoiprrs Syppiv Co‘n\eﬂwv
Authorized Signature: ™ v, . S @9@\, Date: L8, (/ te) [ 07
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