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SPECIFICATIONS

The following sections of the West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways
Standard Specification Roads and Bridges, adopted 2000, as medified by the current Supplemental
Specifications shall apply to the administration of this Contract: 101, 102.4, 1025, 105 1, 105.3,
1054, 105.10, 105.11, 105.12, 105.13, 106.3, 106 4, 106.5, 1066, 106.7, 1068, 107.1, 107.2,
107 .3, 107 .14, 107.19, 107 20, 108 8, 109.1, 109.2, and 109.20

The terms “"Contractor” and "Vendor” used in the above specifications or this contract are
interchangeable. Contractor shall mean Vendor and Vendor shall mean Contractor,

West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways Standard Specifications Roads
and Bridges, adopted 2000 and the current Supplemental Specifications may be obtained from:

Office of the Director of Contract Administration Division
Room A-729

West Virginia Division of Highways

State Capitol Complex, Building 5

Charleston, West Virginia 25305

Herbicide furnished under this contract shall conform to the physical and chemical properties set out
in the EPA Registration of the product provided by the Vendor.

BIDDING INSTRUCTIONS
Vendors may quote on any or ali of the chemical products fisted herein.

It is the intent to award a Statewide Contract for each chemical product listed herein. The contract
will be awarded to the lowest compliant bidder for each item. The award for each item will be based
on the bid price per gallon, pound or ounce and not the lot or container amount.

The vendor shall list the trade name and EPA Registration Number, where applicable, on the Bidding
Schedule for each chemical product bid. Failure to list this information may result in the
disqualification of the vendor's bid on that product.

Vendors shall not qualify bids. Any qualification of bids or any modification of the specifications or
conditions governing the bids may be cause to reject bids.

The successful vendor shall furnish two product labels, for each product awarded, to the West
Virginia Division of Highways. The labels shall provide pertinent information regarding product
storage and handling or this information shall otherwise be provided with each shipment.

Equivalency where requested as, chemical name or equivalent, shall mean equal and not
necessarily identical. Prior to award of low bid the Division of Highways may require samples for
evaluation to determine equivalency when applicable  Product specifications and technical
information should be submitted with bid and may also be used to determine equivalency. The final
determination of equivalency will be made by the Division of Highways and award will be based upon
the item providing the intended service or result and unit price.




CONTRACT AWARD

Qualified vendors who submit a valid low bid will be awarded a contract for those items for which
their bid is low.

The State of West Virginia reserves the right to make multiple awards on this contract when it is in
the best interest of the State to do so.

ACCEPTANCE PLAN

With each delivery of herbicide products to the Division, the vendor shall certify that the products so
delivered do conform to the properties described in the EPA Registration.

Material failing to comply with the quality requirement will not be accepted

TESTING PROCEDURES

Upon award of contract, the successful vendor shall supply the Division of Highways, Materials
Control, Soil and Testing Division, 312 Michigan Avenue, Charleston, West Virginia 25311, the
proper testing procedures to determine the presence and concentration of the Herbicide in flowing

water,

BID QUANTITIES

Vendor should base quotation on estimated herbicide use as follows:

DOH-1H 4,000 galfons
DOH-2H 4,000 gallons
DOH-3H 100 pounds
DOH-4H 250 galions
DOH-5H 150 gallons
DOH-6H 100 gallons
DOH-7H 250 gallons
DOH-8H 100 galions
DOH-9H 2500 pounds
DOH-10H 100 galions
DOH-11H 25 gallons
POH-12H 250 gallons
DOR-13H 250 gallons
DOH-14H 50 pounds
DOH-15H 100 cases
DOH-16H 10 pounds
DOH-17H 100 gallons
DOH-18H 100 pounds
DOH-18H 50 gallons
DOH-20H 50 gallons
DOH-21H 100 gallons
DOH-22H 100 gallons
DOH-23H 200 gallons
DOH-24H 50 pounds

DOH-25H 100 pounds




10

DOH-26H 16 gallons
DOH-27H 16 galions
DOH-28H 50 pounds
DOH-29H “ 400 ounces
DOH-30H 100 galions

Vendors are cautioned that the above quantities are estimates only. Actual orders will be for the
required needs of the Division of Highways.

DELIVERY

Materials under this contract are io be shipped prepaid F OB. delivery to West Virginia Division of
Highways District Storerooms as follows:

District One Charleston
District Two Huntington
District Three Parkersburg
District Four Clarksburg
District Five Burlington
District Six Moundsville
District Seven Weston
District Eight Elkins
District Nine Lewisburg
District Ten Princeton

Materials should be shipped to the location and in the quantity specified in State Contract Purchase
Orders (SCOs) within 20 days after the SCO is issued by the Division of Highways.

VENDOR'S INVOICES

Vendor's invoices must be submitted in original and four copies and contain the following:

a. Division of Highways State Contract Order (SCO) Numbers, and
this Contract Number.

b, Total quantity and unit price with the total cost of each fype
of material furnished.

Note: Under no circumstance will the West Virginia Division of Highways accept, or pay for,
guantities of material in excess of the quantity stated on the State Contract Purchase Order.

RESTRICTED AND NON-RESTRICTED HERBICIDES

Herbicide products which have been declared RESTRICTED in their use by the Environmental
Protection Agency (EPA) must be applied under the supervision of a licensed herbicide applicator.
The Department reserves the right to disallow the use of RESTRICTED herbicides when non-
restricted herbicides are available to achieve the same objective.




10.

1.

12.

13.

TRAINING AND TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE

In order to bid on and be awarded items on this contract the vendor must have a competent
representative available fo provide training and technical assistance as required or upon request by
WVDOH personnel, including but not limited fo, the annual West Virginia Division of Highways
Vegetation Management Seminar and aftend the mandatory prebid meeting at the end of the
seminar. Each bidder should submit name and telephone number of representative with bid. The
representative shall have a valid Category 7 certfication in West Virginia and the company shall
have a valid Category 12 certification in West Virginia. Copies of these certifications shouldl be

submitted with the bid.

Failure to comply will result in awarding that vendors tems to the next lowest comptiant bidder

11

NAME OF REPRESENTATIVE PHONE NUMBER ADDRESS
Nive Kravse. 17 2k ELE) G433 Ko »0*«?
LIST OF APPROVED HERBICIDES . 7 A B
- 12055

The Product Trade Name shown is the approved herbicide to be bid. No substitutes will be
accepted.

ADJUVANTS, SAFETY EQUIPMENT AND MISCELLANEQUS

Unless a Product Trade Name is requested these ltems will be awarded based on the lowest unit
price bid for acceptable performance. Lowest unit price bid will be determined by comparing
minimum label recommendations per 100 gallons of spray solution and unit price. Acceptable
performance will be determined by District personnel assessment of desired resulis and may
include, but is not limited to, field test evaluations.

MANDATORY PRE-BID

There will be a mandatory pre-bid conference at Mountaineer Park on February 15, 2007 at
1:00.



State of Wast Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*709005h844% 717-666-6661
ARBORCHEM PRODUCTS CO DIV ASPL
943 NIXON DRIVE

MECHANICSBURG PA 17055

Request for =

REGNUMBER —o e nPAGE S

Quotation

667C0013 1

RO DRESS CORRESPONDENCE TOATTENTION OF Do

JOHN JOHNSTON

504-558-2602

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

DATEPRINTED -

02/27/2007

BID OPENING DATE:

03/14/2007

BID OPENING TIME_

01:30PM _

0001

ADDENDUM NO. 2

NO OTHER CHANGES.

LS 675-85
1
HERBICIDES

3 € % X X%

THE ATTACHED| REVISED BJID SCHEDULE REPLACES THE
PREVICGUS BID, SCHEDULE |IN ITS ENTIRETY.

SIGN IN SHEE[TS ATTACHED FOR MANDATORY PRE-BID
MEETINGS HELDD ON 02-15-07 AND 02-27-07|.

BID OPENING |[DATE AND T|IME REMAINS 03-14-07 @l:30 P.M.

THIS| IS THE END OF RFQ 667C0013 *xxxx%xx TOTAL:

i SEE REVERSE SIDE-FOR TERMS:AND! CONBITIONS::

SIGNATUHE ( 1/

o /7\1///?:%

TELEPHONE DAT!

) Nele LauLQl

22057

TITLE

\f( FElN:)\_ng'——],7rj-;O

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




14 BIDDING SCHEDULE

Vendors please type prices

HERBICIDES

Pearcent Concentration/
Pounds Per Gallon

CHEMICAL FORMULATION of Active Ingredienis

DOH-1H

DOH-2H

WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Ammaonium Salt of Fosamine with Surfactant 4 |bs/galicn

Product Trade Name Krenite S

EPA Regisiration Number _ 352-395

Supplied in 2 1/2 gallen containers in lots of 5 galions
@3 45.29 pergallon{ie $ﬁ1 45 per lof)
Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers

@$_42.89  pergallon(ie $_643-35  periot)

WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
isopropyiamine Salt of Glyphosate ' 50 2%
Phosphate Ester Surfaciant

Product Trade Name Roundup Pro Concentrate

EPA Registration Number 524-529

Supplied in 30 gallon piastic returnable drums

@%_ NO BiD pergalon(ie $ _ per drum)
Supplied in 2 5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons.

@s. 70 BID pergallon{ie § _ per lot)
Supplied in 15 galion returnabie/refillable containers

@% NC BID pergalion{ie $ per lot)

Supplied in 150 galton returnable/refillable shutile

@$_ HC BID pergallon{ie $ per shuttle)



14 BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-3H

DOH-4H

DOH-5H

WATER SOLUBLE DISPERSIBLE GRANULE CONTAINING:
Sulfometuron Methyl

Product Trade Name Qust XP
352-601

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 3 pound containers in lots of 24 pounds.

@$ 66. 90 perpound (ie ¢ $2605.6C  perlot
Supplied in 3 pound jug

@$_é6-90 ~_perpound(ie. $ _ 200.70 perjug)

WATER SOLUBLE AQUEOUS SUSPENSION CONTAINING:
Oryzalin

Product Trade Name Oryzalin 4 Pro
12167 ~15-T4477

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 2 5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons.

295.00

@$ 59.00 __pergallon(ie $ per lot)

AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:
Imazapyr

Product Trade Name Arsenal
241-346

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 4 guarts

_ 0% _795° periog

@$ perquart (ie. $
Supplied in 2.5 galion containers in lots of 5 galions

@$ _229.74 pergalion(ie $__ 1145. 70 periot)
Supplied in 15 gallon drums

@$_225.20  pergalion{ie $__ 3378.00 per drum)

75%

4 |bs/gallon

2 Ibs/gallon




14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-6H

DOH-7H

DOB-8H

AQUEOUS CARRIER CONTAINING:
Pendimethaiin 3 8 Ibs/gailon

Product Trade Name Pendulum Aguacap

EPA Registration Number __ 241-416

Supplied in 2.5 gallon container in lots of 5 gallons

@s$_37.69 pergallon(ie $_188.45 periot)

WATER SCLUBLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Triclopyr 3 Ibs/gallon

Product Trade Name Garlon 3A
62719~37

EFA Registration Number

Supplied in 2.5 galion containers in lots of 5 galions
@s% 63.90 pergalon{ie $ 319.50 per iot)
Supplied in 30 gallon containers

@%_~3,80 pergallon(ie $ 1917.00 per container)

Supplied in 15 gallon continuum refurnable/refillable containers
in pallets of 9 containers

@$_ 250 pergalion(ie 5_ 7627 50per paliet)

WATER SOLUBLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING: '
Triclopyr 4 |bs/gallon

Product Trade Name Garlon 4 Uttra

EPA Registration Number (o 113- 5]

Supplied in 2 5 galion containers in lots of 5 gallons
@$__76.90  pergallon(ie $_ 384.50 perlot)

Supplied in 30 gallon containers

@% __76.90 pergalion(ie $__2307.00 percontainer)




14 BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-9H

B)

DOH-10H

DOH-11H

Supplied in 15 galion continuum returnable/refillable containers
in pallets of 9 containars

@$ _77.96 pergalion(ie $10524.60 per paliet)

A WATER SOLUBLE DISPERSIBLE GRANULE CONTAINING:
Diuron B0.0%

Product Trade Name Karmex XP

EPA Registration Number __ 1812-362

Supplied in 5 pound bags in lots of 10 bags
@$ 2,98 __perpound (ie $ _ 149.00 per lot}
Supplied in 25 pound bags

@% 2.98  perpound{ie $ 74.50  _ perbag)

WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:
Dimethytamine Salt of 2, 4-D acid 3 B Insigallon

Product Trade Name D Ad
71368~1

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 2 5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

@%$_ 14,19 pergalon(ie $§ __7C.95 per lot)

Suppiied in 30 gallon drums
@% 14.19 _pergalion {ie $425.70 per drum)

Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in pallets of 9 containers

@$_NC BID pergalion(le $ per lot)

WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:

Diethanotamine Salf of Mefluidide 2145%
Ammonium Salf of Imazethapyr 4 08%
Ammonium Salt of Imazapyr 0.15%

Product Trade Name Stronghold




14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CONT

A)

DOH-12H

DOH-13H

EPA Registration Number 2+ | 1 ~802

Suppiied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gaflons

@%272.00C pergallon(ie. $__1088.00 perlot)

WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:
Ammonium Salt of Imazapic 23 6%

Product Trade Name Plateau

EPA Regstration Number _ 241-365

Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons

@$ _277 00 _pergallonfie $_ 92490 periony
Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

@83 217.00 per galion (ie §
Supplied in 1 44 oz packets 14 packets per ot
@%$_NQ _BID perpacket(ie $ per jot)

Supplied in 1 gt containers 4 gts per lot

@% e B_ID pergt(ie § per lot)
Supplied in 15 gallon containers

ele ' .
@3 all pergallon{ie $ 4255.00 _perfat)

A DISPERSIBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:
Hexazinone 2 fes/galton

Product Trade Name Velpar L

552~392

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 2 ¥ gallon containers in fots of 5 gallons

@s 220 per gallon e §__143:00  per container)




14 BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-14H

A}

B)

DOM-15H

DOH-16H

A DISPERSIBLE GRANULE CONTAINING:
Metsuifuron Methyl 60%

Product Trade Name Escort XP

EPA Registration Number 352-439

Supplied in 16 oz containers in iots of 8 Ibs (8-16 oz cirs )

@$_9.00  peroz (ie.$___ 1152.00 perlot)
Supplied in 16 oz. jug

@%__9.00 peroz(ie $__144.00 per jug)

Supplied in 64 oz Jug returnable/refillable
@s$__9.00 peroz(le $ __ 576.00  perjug)

WATER SOLUBLE GRANULE HERBICIDE CONTAINING:

Ammonium Salt of Glyphosate 71 4%
Product Trade Name Roundup Pro dry

EPA Registration Name 524-505

Supplied in 2325 b box

@8 o BID_ 23251b box {ie $ perib)

A DISPERSIBLE GRANULE CONTAINING:

Chlorsulfuron 75%
Product Trade Name Telar XP

EPA Registration Number 352-654

Supplied in 8 x 16 cunce containers to a case

@s$17.25 per ounce {ie $ 276.00 per container)




14 BIDDING SCHEDULE CONT

DOH-17H

R

B)

DOH-18H

B)

DOH-19H

A LIQUID SOLUTION CONTAINING:

Isonctylester of 2 4 Dichlorephenoxyacetic Acid

Butoxyethanolester of 2-(2,4-Dichlorophenoxy)
Propionic Acid

Dicamba {3, 6-Dicholoro-o-anisic Acid

Product Trade Name BK-800

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 2 5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

WM RTD
AN I 5 S

m
L

®

Supplied in 30 gallon drums

WO BID
@9 per gallon {ie $ per drum)

AWETTABLE POWDER CONTAINING:
Tebuthiuron

Product Trade Name Spike 80 DF
62719-107

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 4 pound bags in lots of 24 pounds

510.24

@s$ 21.26 perpound (ie § per lot)

Supptied in 25 pound bags
@s 21.26 per pound (ie $ 531.50 per lot)

AWATER SOLUBLE EMULSFIABLE CONCERTRATE CONTAINING:

Clopyraiid

Product Trade Name Transline
62719~259

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 2.5 galion containers in lots of 5 gallons

@% 234.00 per galion (ie $ 1474 5Operlot)
Supplied in 5 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons
@$3 148.95 pergalion(le $ 595.80 per fot)

3248%

30 66%

5.38%

80%

3 Ibs/gallon




14 BIDDING SCHEDULE CONT

DOR-20H AQUEQOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:

tsopropytamine Sal of imazapyr 36%
Product Trade Name Stalker
EPA Registration Number ___ 241-398

Supplied in 1 quart containers in iots of 4 quarts

A) @$ 77.95 perquart(ie § __ 511.80 per lot)
DOH-21H AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:
Diglycoiamine Salt of 3, 6-Dichloro-0-
Anisic Acid 4 Ibs/gallon
Product Trade Name Vanguish
100--884

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 2 5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons
A) @3%_ 63.50  pergaion(ie $__317.50 periot)

Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in
pallets of 8 containers

B) @s 65.43 pergalion{ie $_9373.45 per paliet)

DOH-22H AQUEDUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:
Triclopyr

75 ]bs/gallon

Product Trade Name Pathfinder 1l
62718-176

EPA Regisfration Number

Supplied in 2 5 galion containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @$_32.20 pergalion(ie $§_161.00  periot)

DOH-23H WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Isopropyiamine Salt of Glyphosate 538%

Product Trade Name Rodeo

EPA Registration Number _ ©2719-324




14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CONT

A)

B)

DOH-24H

A)

B)

DOH-25H

A)

DOMH-26H

Supplied in 2 5 galion containers in lats of 5 gallons
@§_36.70 per gallon (i.e. $ 183.50 per lat)
Supplied In 30 gatfon plastic retumable drums
@8%._36.70__ pergallon(ie $__1101.00 pardrum)

A LIQUID CONTAINING:
Aminopyralid 60.0%

EPA Ragistration Number

Supplled n 1 guert containers 12 containers per ot

@3%_T76.57  perquartfie §__ 91884 parigy
Y

Supplied in 2 5 gallon containers § gailons per lot

@%_276,00 pergafiontie $__ 1580, 00 perlon)

WATER DISPERSIBEE GRANULAR MATERIAL CONTAINING:
Prodiamine 65%

Product Trade Name Endurance

EPA Registration Number = 225—398

Supplied in 10 pound containers 50 pounds per lot

@$ 28.77 per pound (ie § __ 1438.50 par lot)

EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Quizatofop P-Ethy! 0.88 ibs/gallon

Product Trade Name Assure ||
352-541

EPA Registralion Number

Supplled in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 galions

@3 126.84 pergailon (ia. % 507. 36 _per jot)



14 BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOR-27H

A)

DOH-28H

A)

DOH-28H

A)

DOH-30H

EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:

Fluazifop-P-butyl 1 70%

Product Trade Name QOrnameg 170

EPA Registration Number
Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lofs of 4 gallons

@%_ YO BID pergallon(ie $ per lot)

A DISPERSIBLE GRANULE CONTAINING:

imazapy R

Dioron 62 22%
Product Trace Name Sahara DG

EPA Registration Number 241-372

Supplied in 10 pound bags in lots of 40 pounds

@%_8.33 per pound (ie $33%.20 per lof)

AWATER SALUBLE DRY GRANULE CONTAINING:

Sulfosulfuron 75%
Product Trade Name Qutrider

EPA Registration Number 224-500 -

Supplied in 20 oz bottles in lots of 200 0z

@%_ NO BID peroz(ie $ per lot)

A LIQUID CONTAINING:

Diuron 40%
Product Trade Name Diurex 4L

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 2.5 galion containers in lots of 5 gations

@s% 10 BID pergalon{ie $ per lot)

7 78%

11




14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-31H

A)

DOH-32H

A)

DOH-33H

B)

A LIQUID CONTAINING
Fluroxypr

Praduct Trade Name Vista

EPA Registration Number 62719~308

Supplied in 2 5 gallon containers in lats of 5 galions

@3 83.63 per gallon (i.e. $ 418.15  perlot)

DRY DISPERS|BLE GRANULE CONTAINING

Sodium salt of diflifenzopy. 2-(1-({3 S-difluorophenylamino} carbony})
hydrazono)ethyl)-3-pyridinecarboxylic ecld, sodium

Sodium sait of 3 6-dichioro-g-anisic acid

Product Trads Name Overdrive

EPA Registration Number 7969~150

Supplled in 7 ¥z b jugs 30 Ibs. per case

@$__5_6°Lperlb e $__ 1080.00 npercase)

A DRY FLOWARBILE CONTAINING
Sulfometuron Methy!
Chorsulfuron

Product Trade Name 1 andmarik XP

EFA Registration Number 352-645

Supplied in 4 Ib jugs In lots of 32 ibs.

@8 134:40  perib.fie §__4300.80 percase)
Suppiled in 64 oz. jug returnable/refilable

@% 8.00 peroz.{ie § 512.00  perjug)

1z

26 2%

21 4%
55 0%

56 25%
18.75%




14 BIDDING SCHEDULE CONT

OOH-34H

A)

B)

DOH-35H

A)

DOH-38H

WATER SOLUBLE DISPERSIBLE CONTAINING

Sufformeturon Methyl 56 25%
Melsolfuron Methyl 15.00%
Product Trace Name Qust Extra

EPA Registration Number 353& 'b'a(?\

Supplied in 4 [b. jugs in lots of 32 Ibs

@s 66.90 perib (ie.5___2140.80 perlot)

Suppiled in 64 0z jug retumable/reflitable

@s 4 s 18 per oz (ie g 267 s 52 parjug)

A DRY FLOWABLE GRANULE CONTAINING:

Bromacil 40%
Diuron 40%
Product Trade Name Krovar | DF

EPA Registration Number _> 22 =505

Supplied in 6 Ib containers in lots of 8 containers

@s$_ 000  permgies_480.00  perioy

A LIQUID CONTAINING:

Imazapic 8.13%
Glyphosate 2154%
Product Trade Namse Journay

EPA Registration Number 41 =417

Supplied in 2.5 gallon cantainers in lots of 5 gallons

@3 104.79 par gallon (i e $__i5_9i par lof)



14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-37H

A)

B)

DOH-38H

DOH-1A

DOH-2A

A LIQUID CONTAINING:

Dimethylamine Salt of 2,4-Dichlovophe Noxyacetic Acid 24 59%
Dimethylamine Salt of Dicarmba (3,6-Dichlovo-Q-Anisic Acid) 1282%

Product Trade Name Veteran 720

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 2 5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

@53 30 BID pergalion{ie $ per lot)

Supplied in 30 galion drums

NG BID
pergalion(ie $ per drum)

DISPERSIBLE GRANULES

Chlorsulfuron 9%
Sulfometiron methyt 18%
Sulfentrazone 48%
Product Trade Name Throttle XP

EPA Registration Number 2359\‘ ’]ag

Supplied in 3.9 Ih. containers, & containers per case

@s 170.80 perlb (ie $§_5328.96 per case)

ADJUVANTS

A WATER SOLUBLE BLUE LIQUID SPRAY PATTERN INDICATOR

Product Trade Name Bullseye
Suppliedin ___ 2.5 gallon _ containers in lots of 5 galions
@s¢_ MO BID per galion {ie $ per lot)

A MISCIBLE-DISPERSIBLE LIQUID DEFOAMER (30% Active Ingredient)

\RBORCHENM DERQAMT
Product Trade Name ARBORCHEN DEFCAIMEL

1 gt

12

Supplied in containers in lots of

@%_£8.24 per (ie $98.88 per lot)




14 BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-3A

DOM-4A

DOH-5A

DOH-6A

DOH-7A

A DILUENT WITH EMULSIFIERS

Product Trade Name  Hvgrade EC or Arborchem Basal Cil or Bark Oil EC

Suppliedin__ 2.5 Gal containersinlotsof ___ 5 gallons
@$___7.70 per gallon (ie, § _35.50 per lot)
NON-IONIC SURFACTANT (90% Active Ingredient)

Product Trade Name ~_CHEMSURE SO

Supplied in’ 1 Gal containers in lots of 4 gallons
@% 12.85 pergalion({ie § 55.40 per o)

A GRANUL ARIFLAKE DRIFT CONTROL AGENT

Product Trade Name SAY AG &1-A

Supplied in 32 oz containers in lots of 12 . containers

@% ©.38 per oz (ie$ 1Iﬂr5"92perlot)
TABEL RATE 207/100 GAL

A LIQUID DRIFT CONTROL AGENT

Product Trade Name 5O BID

Supplied in containers in lots of

@$ per (ie § pér lot)

AQUATIC SURFACTANT

Product Trade Name ~_CHEMSURZ 90

Supplied in 1 Gal containers in fots of 4 gallons

@3 13.85 pergallon(ie $ 55.40 per iot)
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14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-8A

DOH-0A

A)

DOH-10A

A)

DOH-11A

AWATER SOLUBLE LIQUID SPRAY PATTERN INDICATOR

Product Trade Name BlugprintPhrs Lo~ biERD

Supplied in ___2.5 gallon __ containers in iots of _ 5 gallons
@s$ 28.58° per galion (ie $ 142.90 per lot)
Supplied in 1 quart containers in lofs of ___quarts

A DISPERSIBLE LIQUID SPRAY OIL ADJUVANT

Product Trade Name Penevator

Supplieq in ____containers in iots of galions
MO BID

@¥% per gallon {ie $ per lot)

A NON-IONIC STICKER SPREADER

Product Trade Name Nu-Fim-iR
Supplied in 2 %% gallon containers in lots of > gallons
@$_24.00 per gallon (ie $ 120.00 per lot)

A READY TO USE FORMULA CONTAINING PARFFINIC OIL EMULSIFIERS

Product Trade Name Thinvert RTU

Supplied in 2% gallon jugs 5 galton per case

50.00

@$ 0-00 pergalion(ie $ per case)

Supplied in 15 galion drum

@3 2.90 per galion




14 BIDDING SCHEDULE CONT

DOH-12A

DOH-18

DOH-28

A CONCENTRATE FORMULA CONTAINING PARFINNK OIL EMULSIFIERS

AND SURFACTANTS

Product Trade Name Thinvert Concentréte

Supplied in 2 ¥ gallon jugs 5 gallon per case

@$% 21.00 pergalion(ie $ 105.00 per case)

Supplied in 15 gallon drum

@9 20 * O_O per gallon

SAFETY EQUIPMENT

EMERGENCY SPILL KIT CONTAINING:

15 Universal Plus Sorbent Pads

3 Cobra Coils

1 Pair Safety Goggies

1 Pair Latex Gloves

1 Large Refuse Bag

1 List of Environmental Compliance Telephone Numbers
18" x 18" x 4"
Vacuum Packed in Puncture Resistant Foil

Product Trade Name  ATK~153 Aftack pak

@3 48,00 per each

A GRANULAR/FLAKE SPILL ABSORBENT
- SPILL GUARD

Product Trade Name

Supplied in 2.5 containers in lots of 4 containers

12,00 240.00

@3S perpound (ie § per iot)

17



14 BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-38

DOH-45

DOH-58

DOH-1M

3 LAYER FABRIC COVERALLS (ALL SIZES)

Product Trade Name Klesn Guard

Supplied in 12 ealcase

@53 5.35 pereach(ie $ 71.40

DISPOSABLE COVERALLS

Product Trade Name Tyvek

Supplied in 25 ealcase

@3 HO BID pereach(ie $

per case)

per case)

3202 EYE WASHBOTTLE
mYE WASH BOTTLE

Product Trade Name

Supplied per each
@s 15.50

per each

MISCELLANEOUS

PRESSURE RINSER

Product Trade Name Easy Rinse

Supplied per each

@% 37.50 per each

18




14 BIDDING SCHEDULE CONT

DOH-2M HAND SOAP WITH CITRUS OfL

Product Trade Name Zep

Supplied in 32 oz containers in lots of 20 containers per case

A} @% 8.50 per container (i e $ 170. OO_ per case)
DOH-3M A BIOSTIMULANT CONTAINING:

Soluble Potash 1.00%
lron 0 36%
Manure Extract 79.30%
Humic and Fulvic Acid Extract 9.00%
Kelp Extract 120%
Organc-Modified Silaxane Surfactant 0 36%
Product Trade Name Launch

Supplied in 2 5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @3%$ MO BID pergailon(ie $ _per iot)
DOH-4M A WORK BOOT
Product Trade Name iron Duke

Compiliance EPA 40 CFR 170

Supplied per pair

¥0O BID
A) @ Size (6-11) 8 per pair

MO BID  porpai

B) @Size(12+) §

DOH-5M RUBBER BOOT/SHOE COVERS

Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170

Supplied per pair

A) @ Size M (8-9) § NO BID per pair
B) @ Sizel (10-11) % NO BID per pair
NO BID

C) @ Size XL (12-13) § per pair




14 BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-6M

DOH-7M

DOH-8M

DOH-9M

A)

DOH-10M

SAFETY GOGGLES - indirect vent

Mests ANS1 287 1-1989

NO BID
per each

FACE SHIELD — positive lock headgear

Meets ANS1 287 1-1989 and
CAN1TCSA-294 3-92 Specifications

HO BID
per each

A 5-GALLON BACKPACK SPRAYER

Product Trade Name Birchmeier

224,00 per sprayer

@%

Gasket Set For Sprayer Pump

@%_12.00 per set

Hose Valve & Wand Repair Kit

@$_17.50 perki

NITRI-SOLVE 100% NITRILE GLOVES

15 mil 13" Nitrile Gloves
Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170

Sizes 8, M, L, XL, or 2ZXL

210 per pair

@s

2-QUART HANDHELD PRESSURE SPRAYER

Product Trade Name Tolco

@53 14,95 persprayer

20



14 BIDDING SCHEDULE CONT

DOH-11M

CLOSED SYSTEM BACKPACK SPRAYER

Product Trade Name Birchmier BCS

210.00 per sprayer

@$

Gasket set for sprayer pump

@%__12.00 per set

Hose Valve & Wand repair it

@% 17.50 per kit

21



State of West Virginia Request for [ —rronowsern L PRGER T
Department of Administration Quotation 667C0013 1
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East C T T ADDRESS CORHESPONGENCETOAT —
Post Office Box 50130
TOHN JOHNSTON
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 R 04-558-2402
... *705005844 717-666-6661 -

| DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

| ARBORCHEM PRODUCTS CO DIV ASPL
v} 943 NIXON DRIVE

0| MECHANTCSBURG PA 17055

FREGHT TERvS

0272172007
oy sl K N O
BID GPENING DATE: 37147200

g - S
VELINT - OUFE

ADDENDUM NO. 1

A SECOND MANDATORY PRE-BID CONFERENCE WILL BE

HELD AT THE PURCHASING DIVISION'S CONFRERENCE RCOM,

2019 WASHINGTON STREET|, EAST, CHARLESTDN, WV

ON 02/27/07 AT 10(:00 A.M. FAILURE TO ATTEND THE
PRE-BID CONFERENCE WILL RESULT IN BID DISQUALIFICATION.

TF YOU WERE [IN ATTENDANCE AND SIGNED THE PRE-BID SHEET
AT THE FIRST| PRE-BID CONFERENCE AT MOUNTAINEER PARK
IN CHESTER, WV ON 02-15-07 AT 1:00 P.M., IT IS NOT
MANDATORY YOQU ATTEND THIS CONFERENCE.

BID CPENING DPATE AND T[IME CHANGED

FROM: 02-28/-07 Al' 1:30C P.M.
T'O: 03-14-07 Al 1:30 P.M.

NO OTHER CHEHANGES.

0001 LS 675-85
1

HERBICIDES

T T SEEPEVERSESIOE FORTEANS AND GONDIIONS T 1L

SIGNATURE ) j:r{’ __,Z%@ TELEPHONE-? {,7 /7@( ( '{(;.g/ DATE \EU; /?(/7

TTLE yop v REN 2313 755 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'
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Page of

Pie-Bjd Conference

SIGN IN SHEET

[Please Print]

Request for Proposal No : éé 7€ P020/3 Date: 2 - /507

Firm & Representative Name Malling Address Izlephone &
FAX Numbers
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AP herrloobin Oy rek_ Beach Ver $/0-5#506%T7
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10 rT ]’}ﬂqwbw& 100 North Concdnhon Dr. T 570- 457 54
Alenza> Hazleton, A 1820 F. 576 - <9 $500

Please print or write legibly. The fax number is essantial to contact the attendees Jn a timely manner.
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v PURCHﬂSING ACA SECT Fax 3bd-55R-4115 Feb  ZUUf Yyialam ruverug

Page / of 3 |
SIGN IN SHEET
REQ# &Lt 7Co2/T
Date: IS -7
Firm & Representative Name: Mallzng Address: Phone, Pax,@?ﬂ
L D Scheak Frgon joas pA10-5 35— 06T

UA’P brﬁLr‘. ‘ov ond [T\ Besck PQ/??S?S’"D/,{;?
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E'mail J—’_D‘_Tf{l po Ty {p "fﬂ‘/ft?ﬁlﬂc.. "’d--—q ,

4 M 5%@@ , 204 Spmwmpws Do F

CWe Cremuoar (Cloverdde U 2407 F

E-mail CACevieaion ® pop
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Lo
Please print or wriie legibly!

Your fax # is essential to contact you timely!




WV PURCHRSING ACA SECT Fax 304-55B-4115 Fob 7 9007 “1:dbam WUNAJUUS

Page of 4
SIGN IN SHEET
RFQ # o
Date: r &L ‘fz .
Firm & Representative Name: Mailing Address: Phone, Fax, ._SE §-MZF.>
L, ;f,&g/ %MU Bt 7 Harpew, Mite PO P S¥o 772-SS00
_ Waveesy VA 23890 F S §52-5503

E-mail ﬂ{&uﬂg&@ggg g[%gr{ﬁf._ca )

z/éd” ;7' ﬁj/ﬁ@”ﬁﬁ SmmitSals e powd Lo P

- F
E-mail
3 Dzw@ lA/fdaJé/ ?’f/ M)@n ﬁﬁa{’ P &/0 308- 20077
Agfédﬁm /Mec@mfc.;ggﬁf 2 A 17055 £ 07 795 - y23e/

E—mail@ dewve ke @ ehorc o ;

. COYA
4. W@«%ﬁ ﬂ Ce | P

F

E-mail

SRR A W 1[
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com

5 M@@m&d p

F -

E-mail 'é!’la-ﬁw!)tbb\ @db,}ﬂﬂla}
| (o

Please print or write legibly!

Your fax # is essential to contact you timely!




wv.36a STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
: Buyer: Page Req. or PO No.

PURCHASING CONTINUATION SHEET | ;;35 | 5 66700013

Vendor

Spending Unit:

Addendum No.'s:
No. b/

No.

No.

No.

No.

T understand that failure to confirm the receipt of the addendum(s)

may be cause

acknowledge receipt of the following checked addendum(s) and

necessary revisions to

1

2

Requisition No,: 66700013

ADDENDUM ACENOWLEDGEMENT

aon risions to my propoesal, plans and/or gpecifications,

for rejection of bids.

c-/g.o Kot

Signature

P\( oot C.\\ve,w‘qt aQ XS (D .

Company

WAl

Date

EXHIBIT 10
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State of West Virginia
Depariment of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*709005844 717-666-6661
ARBORCHEM PRODUCTS CC DIV ASPL
943 NIXON DRIVE

MECHANICSBURG PA 17055

Request for
Quotation

i BEQENUMBER - - s PR GE T
667C0013 1

i ADDRESS CORRES
JOHEN JOHNSTON
304-558-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LCCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

DATE PRINTED

EYAV IS aL6

(1]
<P
HE

)]

DREMIEN
TEILLIN LN

BID OPENING DATE:

GO0l

ADDENDUM NO.

HELD ON 02-15-07

BID OPENING DATE

NC OTHER CHANGES.

LS 675-85
1

HERBICIDES

hexxxdkx  THTS

IS THE END OF RFQ

SIGN IN SHEETS ATTACHED FOR MANDATORY
AND 02-27-07.

AND T|IME REMAINS 03-18-07.

667C0013 *%**x%* TOTAL:

PRE-BID MEETINGS

. SEEPFEVERSE SIDE FORTERMS AND CONDITIONS 7~ == o

TELEPHONE F ot pind
=\ Fste (ola(,]

DATE 3{ {2 /{j ?

TITLE

smmunEC/ﬁ W -

Q FEIN

by 22100171550

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABQVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'
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Please print or write legibly The fax number is essential to contact the aftendeges in a timely manner.
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Page / of

SIGN IN SHEET
RIQ¥ 4L 7C 605

Date: v AR 4
Firm & Representative Name: Mailing Address: Phone, Fax (& E/Ma;i
L ED S0 et 7ﬂ%&m o} é 09105 L 5 DZ?Z; ]

N - -
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Please print or write legibly!

Your fax # is essential to contact you timely!
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_ 4
Page of
SIGN IN SHEET
REQ # éé ool S
Date: P S = .;a/"?"
Firm & . epresematlve Name: Mailing Address: Phone, Fax, &f-Mall
1 f z‘;’,f,/ //51 el 7 Harle Mite £0 P S%o 792-5Sc0
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2 L0019 (e Y SpmmiFSales @ pone  Can p
_ - F
E-mail
ij .‘F ? N j ;i o - g . M y ﬁ < - e F -
3 _LAace: Biggse 7Y 1oL 1 P_L/0 368-20C 7
Aff%dfa"%f@:f% Meclonic. fﬁwjf{ /A 17055 F 37 9582 3
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Please print or write legibly!

Your fax # is essential to contact you tifi
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SIGN IN SHEET
RFQ # ey
Date: .__2——.:2’7 & 7
Firm & Representative Name: Mailing Addfess: Phone, Fax, & F-Mail:
I Veson Toothme ¥ Box 21757 P g 585-554 /
Noxi s \bgofstton livtaf _(blonbos ov yz22, Fprs/ A6 - 753/
e R .
2 7%3’3 /\/LO(S&; LG 70 Zieprr S Z/ﬂ—aﬁf ;\Dﬁ, P 304 . 755 3P,
LiESCO , n/e Stz A, S corr Dty wol/ F B0 755-5/67
ASK¢o
E-mail
3 i 7S I i (Y Sfana fLood R P Jou-C73-te77
brecal or Seace” A’ock‘/(;-,v, Lt 2¥22/  F Jo- Ly - FL5D
E-mail
4 p
F
E-mait
5 p
F
E-mail

Please print or write legibly!

Your fax # is essential to contact you timely!
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i —-EOR USE ONLY IN CATEGORIES ABGVE — ]
WEST VIRGINIA CERTIFICATION :

Expires: 12/31/07 C04461
Commercial Applicator

David L. Krause

Asplundn

943 Nixon Drive

Mechanicsburg, /?i % “““““ ; ,
NOT

TRANSFERARLE ,wmmuzpa REPRESENTATIVE




sv.36s STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA Buve page = "0 N
uyer: ag eq or o

PURCHASING CONTINUATION SHEET | 533 | 23 | 687c0013

Spending Unit:

Vendor

667C0013

Requisition No.:

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following checked addendum(s) and
have made the necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specifications,

etc.

Addendum No.'s:

v
No. 1

e
No. 2
No. 3 e
No. 4
No. 5

T understand that failure to confirm the receipt of the addendum(s)

may be cause for rejection of bids.

é/MW

Signatur

; -/
4\* Corchom. ?‘f@&ut{;h (5

Company
|
Q{@[é?

Date

EXREIBIT 10




22
RFQ Ne 66700013

AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states:
No contract or renewat of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its political subdivisions to any

vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party to the vendor or
prospective vendor is a debior and the debt owned is an amount greater than one thousand dofiars in the

aggregate

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed fo the state or any
of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted

workers’ compensation premium, penaity or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be
paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued

thereon

"Debtor" means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other farm
or business association owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions “Palitical subdivision”
means any county commission; municipality; county board of education; any instrumentality estabiished by a
county or municipality, any separate corporation or instrumentality established by one or more counties or
municipalities, as permitted by law; or any public body charged by law with the performance of a government
function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or municipalities “Related party’ means
a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form
or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or
contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the
party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion cof the benefit, profit or other consideration from
performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amcunt that meets or exceed five percent of the

total contract amount

EXCEPTION:
The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to

chapter eleven of this code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment
and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and

the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement

LICENSING:
Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and

requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia
Secretary of State’s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission, or any
other state agencies or political subdivision Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary releases to
obtain information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good

standing with the above entilies

CONFIDENTIALITY:
The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclese to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally

identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, uniess the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disciosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the
agency's policies, procedures and rules Vendors should visit www .state wv us/admin/purchase/privacy for

the Notice of Agency Confidentizlity Policies

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor
acknowiedges the informaticn in this said affidavit and are in compliance with the requirements as stated

L ose Chawa m sk g [5
- 7. \ ;
(‘2}'{? s it <5 Date: 3[} Q-IDd?

v
No Debt Affidavit (Revised 10/13/06)

Vendor's Name:

Authorized Signature:




