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GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
PURCHASE ORDER/CONTRACT

1. ACCEPTANCE: Sefler shall be bound by this order and its terms and conditions upon receipt of this order.

2. APPLICABLE LAW: The laws of the State of West Virginia' and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing
Division shall govemn all rights and duties under the Contract, including without limitation the validity of this
Purchase QOrder/Contract.

3. - NON-FUNDING: All setvices performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Orders/Contracts are to be
continued for the terms of the Purchase Order/Contract, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the
Legislature or otherwise being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available
for these services or goods, this Purchase Order/Contract.becomes void and of no effect after June 30.

4, COMPLIANCE: Seller shall comply with all federal, state and local laws, regulations and ordinances including,
but not limited fo, the prevailing wage rates of the WV Division of Labor.

5. MODIFICATIONS: Tﬁi*s"'Writin’g is fh'e' béﬁiéé‘ final expression of intent. No modification of this 6rder shall be
binding unless agreed to in writing by the Buyer.

6. ASSIGNMENT: Neither this Order nor any monies due, or to become due hereunder may be assigned by the
Seller without the Buyer's consent.

7. WARRANTY: The Seller expressly warrants that the goods andfor services covered by this order will-
{a} conform to the specifications, drawings, samples or other description furnished or specified by the
Buyer; {b] be merchantable and fit for the purpose intended; andfor [c} be free from defect in material and
workmanship.

8. CANCELLATION: The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written
nofice to the seller.

9. SHIPPING, BILLING & PRICES: Prices are those stated in this order. No price increase will be accepted
without written authority from the Buyer. Al goods or services shall be shipped on or before the date
specified in this Order.

10. LATE PAYMENTS: Payments may only be made after the delivery of goods or services. Interest may be paid
on late payments in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

11. TAXES: The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse
such faxes.

12. RENEWAL: Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Confract may be renewed only upon
mutual written agreement of the parties. _

13. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptey protection, the State may deem this
contract null and void, and terminate such contract without further order.

14. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attomey General, is available online at www.state wv.us/fadmin/purchasefvre/hipaa.htm
and is _hereby made part of the agreement provided that the Agency meets the definiion of a Cover Entity
© (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health Information (45 CFR §160.103) fo the vendor. .

15. CONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such
personally identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the agency's
policies, procedures, and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality Policies and Information
Security Accountability Requirements, set forth in hitp/www . state.wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy/notice Confidentiality.pdf.

16. LICENSING: Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and alf state and local laws and
requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia Secretary
of State’s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission, or any other state agency
or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary releases to obtain information to enable the
Director er spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good standing with the above entities.

17. ANTITRUST: In accepting this purchase order or signing this contract with any agency for the State of West Virginia,
the vendor agrees fo convey, sell, assign, or transfer to the State of Wesi Virginia all righis, fitie, and inferest
- in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust jJaws of the United States and
the State of West Virginia for price fixing andfor unreasonable restraints of trade relating fo the particular
commodities or services purchased or acquired by the State of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made
and become effective at the time the purchasing agency tenders ‘the mitial payment to vendor. Vendor certifies
that this purchase order or contract is accepted or entered into without any prior understanding, agreement, or
connection fo any other entity that could be considered a violation of law. Vendor further cerifies that this
purchase order or contractis in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud.

Rev. 8/08/10
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FQOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Additional Information:

POWER WINDOWS INCLUDED WITH SE PACKAGE $940

CONV GROUP $431, CD PLAYER, AUTO LOCK DOORS AND KEYLESS ENTRY

CLASS 1 AUTOMOBILE 070-06-01-000
Sub-Compact,
Front Whee! Drive, 4-Door, Wheethase 95"
To include but not fimited to: Chevrolet Aveo, Toyota Prus

Vendor Name STEPHENS AUTO CENTER

Manufacturer / Brand FORD

Delivery 60-120 Days Est.

Modet Name & Number FIESTA

HP TORQUE

Requirements: 120/1.6L 112160
[Engine MIN: 75 HP 85 TORQUE

Teansmission Automatic

Steering Power

Brakes Power/ABS

Radio AMIFM

Glass All Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Outside

License Plate Mounts Front & Rear

Tires All Season

Spare Tire . Standard tire wi Jack

Rear Window/Defogaer S5TD

Front Seat Bucket

Ajr Conditioning STD

Floor Mats Installed - FRONT ONLY

Front Air Bags Installed

EPA ’ EPA

4 - DOOR VEHICLE HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline $13,374 38 29
Price Each Flex-Fuel NO BID

CD PLAYER SEE CONV GRQUP
ShopfService Manual $ 199.00

. GD Service Manual $ 199.00

Tilt Whee! & Cruise Confrol TILT-STD, CRUISE-NA
Keyless Entry SEE CONV GROUP

Power Windows /Power Lacks P.LOCKS-STD, P.WINDOWS-SEE
Side Air Bags §TD !

Bodyside Mouldings STD )

Interior Upgrade NA

-Exterior colars 81D

Detete Floor Mats (Deduct) NA

FOB Deazlership: (Deduct)

$ 10.00
b 1.59
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CLASS 2 AUTOMOBILE
Compact, 4 Door Sedan
Front Wheel Drive, Wheelbase 102.8" _
Includes but is not limited to: Ford Fusion, Toyota Corolla, VW Jetta, Honda Civic, Mitsubishi Lancer, Ford Focus,

7
070-06-02-000

Vendor Name: STEPHENS AUTO CENTER

Manufacturer f Brand FORD

Delivery

Model Name & Number 2012 FOCUS P3E

HP TORQUE

Standard Equipment Requiremeats: 140 136
Engine MIN: 127 HP 128 TORQUE

Transmission Aufomatic

Steering Power

Brakes Power/ABS

Radio ANIFM

Glass - All Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Quiside

License Plate Mounts Front & Rear

Tires. Al Season

Spare Tire Standard tire wf Jack

Rear Window/Defogger 40 Gallons Minimum - NA -

Front Seat Bucket

Air Conditioning STD

Fioor Mats Instalied

Front Air Bags Instalied

EPA EPA
HGWY CITY

Price Each Gas $14,607

Price Each Flex-Fuel NO BID I as
AMFM wi CD Player $ STD
ShopfSewvice Manual $ 199
CO Service Manual’ $ 189
Tilt Whee! & Cruise Control TILT-STD, CRUISE 218
Keyless Entry $ STD

Power Windows / Power Locks P.LOCKS-STD PW. SE PACK
Side Air Bags $ STD
Exterior colors $ STD
Rubber matting $ NA

Delete Floor Mats {Deduct) $ - NA

Manual Transmission wiOverdrive (Deduct) $ - 709
Remove Console (Delete) (Consale between seats) $ - NA

FOB Dealership: (Deduct) $ - 10
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile $ 1.5¢

‘Additional Information: :
CRUISE CONTROL REQUIRES SE PACKAGE

SE PACKAGE $827
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CLASS 3 AUTOMOSBILE 070-06-03-010
Midsize, 4 Door, Frant Wheel Drive, Wheelbase 107.4"
tncludes bul is not limited to: Toyota Camry, Saturmn Aura, Chevrole Malibu

Vendor Name: STEPHENS AUTQO CENTER
Manutacturer / Brand FORD
Defivery 60-120 Days est
Model Name & Number Fusion POG
HP TOR
Standard Equipment Requirements: ) 17502.5 14 17212.514
Engine MIN: 160 HP 156 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic 240/3.0 V6 228/3.0V6
Steering Power
‘Brakes PowerfABS
Radio AMIEM
Glass Al Tinted
Mirrars Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Fuel Tank Factory Standard
Power Windows and Lacks - instafied
Tires All Season
Spare Tire ) Standard Tire wi Jack
Rear Window/Defogger STD
Front Seat : Standand Seating
Alr Conditicning Instatled
Floor Mats : Installed
Seating Capacity 5
Front Air Bags instatied
EPA EPA
Price Gas Engine $15,125 HGWY CITY
3 22
Price Each Flex Fuel
Options:
AMAM w/ CD Player ‘R STD
ShaopiService Manual $ ) 199
CO Service Manual q $ 199
Tiit Wheel & Crulse Controf $ STD
Keyless Entry £ § . STD
Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mimors S STD
6-way Power drivet seat (requires Power Windows & doors) § incl. in SE Package
Side Alr Bags $ STD
Extertor colors $.257 Red Camdly Tint
Delete Floor Mats (Deducl) g $ - 48
Manual Transmission wiOverdrive (Deduct) $ - 761
Remove Consale (Delele) (Console between seats) N $ - NA
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) $ - 10
$ 1.59

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Additional Inforhation:

SE Package - $1314. 3.0L V6 requires SE package plus $1.460
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CLASS 5 AUTOMOBILE 0700605001 g
Full Size, 4 Door, Rear Wheel Diive
2,890 Curl Weight
Wheelbase 110°
Includes but is not limited to: Chryiser 300, G8

Vendor Name STEPHENS AUTQ CENTER
Manufaciurer / Brand DODGE
Detivery 60 - 120 DAYS EST.
Model Name & Mumber CHARGER LDDMA48
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements: 280/3.6L V6 260/3.61. V6
Engine MIN: 210 HP 210 TORQUE
Transmission Audomatic
Steering ’ ] Power
Brakes Powet/ABS
Radio AMIFMICD
Glass Al Tinted
Miccors ' Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Fuel Tank Factory Standard
Tires - All Season
Spare Tice standard tire wi jack
Rear Window/Defogger .. installed
Froni Seat ) STD
Alr Condiioning Instalted
Floor Mats ) _ Installed
Seating Capacily 4
Front Air Bags Instatled
EPA EPA
HEWY CiTY
l ' g
. i )
Price Each Gasoline $22605 | __ Re] | 18]
Price Each Flex Fuel NO BID -
Options:
Fult Size Spare Tire NA
Shop/Service Manual ‘VENDOR
CO Service Manual VENDOR
Tt Wheel & Cruise Control STD
Keyless Entry STD
Power Windows / Power Locks / Heated Mirrors MIRRORS NOT HEATED - STD
6-way Power Driver seaf (requires power windows & doors S0
Side Alr Bags S1D
Exerior colars 8ELOW
Delete Floor Mats (Deduct) NA
FOS Dealership: (Deduct) 10
1.59

FOB Other than Metro Chareston - Per Mile

Additional (nformation: _
BLACKBERRY AND TOXIC ORANGE $263, REDLINE 3 COAT $866 - OTHERS NQ CHARGE

29 V-8 Engine - $3386, 5.7L VB INCLS RT PACKAGE



CLASS 6 AUTOMOBILE 070-06-06-001
Smali Utility, 4 Wheel DrivelAWD, 4 Door

3800 GVWR 103" Wheelbase

Vendor Name:

Manutzcturer f Brand
Detivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine

includes but is SIEAMENIARQGERTRR . Ford Escape

FORD
60-120 Days Est
Escape USC or U9D

HP

TORQUE

17125 4
MIN. 165 HP 161 TORQUE

Transmission

Automatic 24013.0 V6

171254

223/3.0\V6

Steering

Power

Brakes

Radio

PowerlABS
AMFM

Glass

All Tmléd

Mirors

Left & Right Cufside
STD

License Plate Mounts

Tires

All Season

Spare Tire

standard fire wi Jack

Rear Window/Defogger

Instalied

Fuel Tank

Standard

“Front Seat

Bucket

Rear Seat

Bench

Alr Conditioning

Instatled

Floor Mats

Tastalled

Front Air Bags

Price Each Gasaline
Price Each Flex Fuel

Qptions
Full Size Sparce Tire

Off Road Package Including Limited Stip Rear Includes:

Axfe-Trac-Lok Differential
Engine Cooling - Heavy Duty
Skid plate Group
Suspension - Heavy Duty Wigas Shocks
Front and Rear Tow hooks
Hi & Lo Gear 4WD ot equivatent
Off Road Tires
Shop/Service Manual
CD Service Manual
Tilt Whee! & Cruise Control
Keytess Enty -
Power Windows / Power Locks
‘Rear Alr and Heat
Tow Package .
Duel Gas Tanks (gas only)
Side Alr Bags
Low Range 4 Wheel Diive Option
Spare Tire Candar - External
Roof-Top Luggage Rack
Third Row Seating
StustvAll Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)
SlushvAll Weather Mats (Second Row)
StushiAll Weather Mats (Cargo)
Delele Floor Mats (Deduct)

Delete Carpet (Deduct)
V-8 Engine

Craw Cab vf Thind and Counth Door

FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Chardeston - Per Mile

Addifional information:
XLT package - $ 1,360

EPA

EPA

I 28]

" $20597 Ve

$

T

. Enter total off voad pkg above

192

&

5
i

35185898

SB[
I
&

3l

g
g

B3

had b Sd LT L LY LA LU TTEY FUA N Y EEY FVS PEY PR FPA PPN PPY PPN PPN PP

sync $459  step bars $293

vehicle securily package $213 no available with remote sfart

remote start $293 privacy glass $294



Axje-Teac-Lok Differential
Engine Cooling - Heavy Duty
-Skid plate Group
Suspeasion - Heavy Duty W/gas Shacks
front and Rear Tow hooks
Hi & Lo Gear WD or equivalent
Off Road Tires
ShoplService Manuat
CD Service Manual
Tiit Wheel & Crulse Control
Keyless Entry
Power Windows / Power Locks
Rear Alr and - Heat
Tow Package
Duel Gas Tanks (gas only}
Side Al Bags
Low Range 4 Wheel Drive Option:
Spane Tire Carrler - External
-Roof-Top Luggage Rack
Thicd Row Seafing
SlustvAR Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)
SlushvAl Weather Mats (Second Row) )
Slush/All Weather Mats (Cacgo)
Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)

Delete Caipet (Deduct)
V-8 Engine
Crow Cab w Thind and Fouwrth Doar

FOB Deatership: (Deduct)
08 Other than Metro Charteston - Per Mile

Additiona inforration:

11

CLASS 6 AUTOMOBILE 070-06-06-001
Smal Utility, 4 Wheel Drive/AWD, 4 Door
3,800 GVWR 103" Wheelbase

Vendor Name: Includes but is SRERMENIAUNEISAENRER, Fard Escape

Manufacturer f Brand JEEP

Delivery 60 - 120 DAYS EST

Model Name & Number COMPASS

He TORQUE

Standard Equipment Requirements: 172 165
Engine MIN: 165 HP 161 TORQUE

Transmission Autornatic

Steedng Power
Brakes PowedABS

Radio ANUEM
Glass All Tinted

Mirvors Left & Right Outside

License Plate Mounts STD

Tices All Season

Spare Tire standaed tire wi jack

Rear Window/Defogger Installed

Fuel Tank Standard

Front Seat Bucket

Rear Seal Bench

Alr Conditioning Instafled <

Roor Mats Instalied

-Front Alr Bags

EPA EPA
HGWY cy
24 21

Price Each Gasaline $15.763

Prioz Each Flex Fue! NO BIO -

Options: -

Full Size Spare Tire INCLUDED WITH TRAILER TOW

Off fload Package Including Limited Sfip Rear includes: i $ 501

f

Enter fotal off road pkg above

CONTACT VENDOR

$ STD

INCLUDED WITH POWER LOCKS

E 723
e M = ———

223 ENG COOLER, FULL SPARE, WIRING

$ NA

$ _ 228

$ NA

$ NA

$ NA

$ NA

4 50

[ 30

$

$ - NA

$ -

$ - NA

$ - NA

$ - NA

§ - 1¢

$ 1.59
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CLASS 6A AUTOMOBILE 070-06-06-002
Mid-Size Utitity, Of-Road, 4 Wheel Drive,
5700 GVWR, 109" Wheelbase Indudes but is not imited fo: Jeep Grand Cherckee, Trailblazer
Vendor Name: STEPHENS AUTO CENTER
Manufactucer f Brand JEEP
Delivery 60 - 120 DAYS EST.
Model Name & Number GRAND CHERQKEE
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements: 290/3.6L V6 260/3.6L V6
Engine MIN: 200 HP 195 TORQUE
Transmission Automafic
Steering Power
Brakes PowerABS
Radio ANVFM
Glass All Tiated
WMirors Left & Right Oufside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Spare Tire ) Standard tire wf Jack
Rear Window/Defogger instalied
Fuel Tank Standard
Frant Seat k1 13)
Rear Seat Bench
Air Conditioning {nstalled
Fioor Mats Instalfed
Running Ground Clearance Af least 8.3 inches
Cargo Volume Rear Seat Up atfeast 35 cubic @
Cargo Volume Rear Seat Down atteast 67 cublc it
Front Alr Bags Instaited
Off Road Package Including Uimited Sfip Rear End lncludes: {nstalled
lnstafled
Installed
_Engine Cooling-heavy duty instalied - STANDARD DUTY
Suspension- Heavy Duty Wigas Shocks Instatied
Front and Rear Tow Hooks Instalted
Hi & Lo Gear 4WD or equivalent (switchable) Instaffed EPA EPA
Qff Road Tires Installed HEWY ciy
16
Price Each Gasaline $26,695
Price Each Flax Fuel NO BID
-‘Options:
All Terrain Tires INCLUDED
AMFM wi CD Player STD
Shop/Service Manual VENDOR
COD Service Mantzal VENDOR
Tilt Wheet & Cruige Control S0
Keyless Enfry ST
Power Windows / Power Locks ~_STD
Tow Package List fems Includad in this group §30
-Side Alr Bags - $ . STD
Exterdor oolors SEE BELOW
Thind Row Seafing $ NA
Duel Gas Tanks (gas only) $ NA
Spare Tire Carnier - External $ NA -
Englne, 8 Cyfinder, 5.7 Liter . 4.891 INCLUDES OTHER UPGRADES
Delate Running Boands and Luggage Racks (Deduct) $ - STD
Delete Floar Mats (Deduct) $ - NA
Defete Cloth Seats (Deduct) £ - NA
Delete Carpet (Deduc) $ -
Manual Transmission wiOverdrive (Daduct) $ - NA
Remove Console (Delete) (Console belween'seats) $ - NA
FOB Deatership: (Deduch) $ - 10
Hilch Drawbar wf devis $ 32

TRAILER TOW GROUP INCLUDES 7/4 PIN HARNESS, CLASS iv RECEIVER, DELETES REAR TOW HOOKS, READ LOAD LEVELING SUSPENSION

INFERNO RED AND BLACKBERRY $200 - OTHERS NO CHARGE

12



CLASS 8 AUTOMOBILE
Full-Size Utifity, 4 Wheel Drive, 4 Doors,
7400 GVWR

Includes but is nat limited fo: Chevrolet Sucburans, Ford Expedition

Vendor Name:
Manufactyrer f Brand

Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

STEPHENS AUTO CENTER

FORD
§0-120 days est.
Expedifion

HP

TORQUE

310/5.4L V8

365/5.4L v8

_Engine MIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE

Teansmission Automatic wiOverdrive

Steering Pawer

Brakes PowerdABS

Radio ANMPM

Gilass All Tinted

Birrors Left & Right Outside

License Plate Mounts Front & Rear

Tires All Season

Spare Tire Full Size w/ Jack

Rear Window/Defogaer STD

Fuel Tank ) Standard

Front Seat 510

Rear Seat Bench

Alr Conditioring fnstalled

Floor Mats lnstalled

Front Air Bags instatied

Price Each Flex Fuel $27,166
$27,186

Price Each Gasoline

1 Off Road Package tacluding Limited Slip Rear includes:
Axie-fraclok differential
Engine Cooling - heavy duty
Skid plate Group
Suspension - Heavy Duly W/gas Shacks
. All Teqzin Tices
Tow Hooks
ANMFM wi CD Player
ShopiService Manual
CD Service Manual
Tt Wheel & Cruise Control
Keyless Eatry
Power Windows / Power Locks
Tow Package
Side Air Bags
10 Extedor colors
11 StushiAl Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)
12 Siust'All Weather Mats (Second Row)
13 Skash/All Weather Mats (Carga)
14 Low Range 4 Wheel Didve
15 Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)
16 Delete Cloth Seats (Deducl)
17 Delele Carpet (Deduct)
18 Ouel Gas Tanks (gas only}
19 Remove Console (Delete) (Console between seafs)
20 FOB Dealership: (Deducy)
21 FOB Other than Metro Chardeston - Per Mile
22 3d Row Seating

oL N

Addiiionat tnk 6

;5.,
d

$
i s 189

$ 199
§ s STD

$ ST
- $ STD

$ 336

$ 51D

$ NA

$ Rutiber Flgor STD

$ Rubber Hoor STD

s NA

$ E117]

$ - NA

$ - NA_

$ - S1D

s - A

s - STD

§ - 10
i $ 1.59

$ 744

mmmmo.'mmm@gemwm.aﬁmmaﬁm

Sensing $336

front bucket seats are cloth, 2ad vinyt - to miake 2ad and 3rd ( ordered) add $102

XL¥ package add $4.271 XL without SV add $1,896

29 V-8 Engine
30 Crew Cab wf Third and Fourth Door

070-06-08-001

13
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CLASS 9 TRUCK 070-48-09-001
Small Pickup, 4 Cylinder, 2 Wheel Drive,
. 3500 GVWR, Short Bed
{ncludes but is not limited to: Ford Ranger, Toyota Tacoma, Mazda 82300
Vendor Name: STEPHENS AUTQO CENTER
Manufacturer f Brand EORD
Delivery 60-120 Days Est
Madel Name & Number Ranger RIA
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements: 143 154
Engine 4oyt MIN: 143 HP 154 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic
Steerng Power
Brakes Pawer
Radio AMEM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Bax Fleatside
Bumper Rear Step Factory lnstalled
Tires All Season
Spare Tite Full Size wf Jack
Ajr Conditioning STD
Front Seat Standacd seating
Standard Fleor Covering Installed EPA EPA
Front Alr Bags Instatled
HGWY ciTY
24 19
Price Each Gasoline $12,455
Price Each Flex Fuel NO 8I0
1 Of Road Package Including Umited Slip Rear Includes: $ NA
Axde-traclok differential $ NA
Engine Cooling - heavy duty $ NA
Skid plate Group $ NA
Suspensiaon - Heavy Duty Wigas Shocks $ NA
All Terrain Tires F NA
Tow Hooks E NA
2 AMFMwi CD Player $ ' 205
3 Shop/Sarvice Manual ! $ 199
4 CD Service Manual $ 189
5 TiltWheet & Cruise Control [ $ o 320
6 Side Alr Bags $ S0
7 Exfedor Colors - 3 STD
8 Traller Tow Package $ NA
8 Slush/All Weather Mats (iriver & Passengern) I $ 68
10 Slush/Alt Weather Mats (Secand Row) $ NA
11 SlushVAll Weather Mats (Cango) H $ NA
12 Power Windows, Locks $ NA
13 Sliding Rear Window - $ NA
14 Privacy Glass $ MNA
15 Bedliner $ 200
16 Bucket Seats Front $ NA
17 Delete Floor Mats (Deduct) " $ - NA
18 Duel Gas Tanks (gas only} $ - NA
19 Delele Campet (Deduct) $ - NA
20 Manual Transmission wiOverdrive (Deduct) $ - 830
21 FOB Dealership: (Deduct) s - 10
22 FOB Other than Metro Charesten - Per Mile $ 1.59

Additioral Information;

29 V8 Engine
30 Crew Cab w/ Third and Fourth Door



CLASS 10 TRUCK 070-48-10-001
Small Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive, Extended Cab, 6 Cylinder,
4200 GVWR, Shoti Bed
Includes but is not limited to: Ford Ranger, Toyota Tacoma, Mazda 82300
Vendor Name: STEPHENS AUTO CENTER
Manufacturer / Brand DODGE
Delivery 60 - 120 DAYS EST.
Model Name & Number DAKOTA NDIL33
HpP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements: : 210/3.7L V6 23513.7L V6
ﬂgine MIN: 200 HP 225 TORQUE
-Transmission Aufomatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power
Radio AMIFM
Glass All Tinted
Mimrors teft & Right Oulside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetside
Bumper Rear Sfep Factory Installed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size wf Jack
Air Conditioning STD
Front Seat Standard seating
Standard Floor Coveting Installed
Front Air Bags _Installed
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
20 15
Price Gas Engine $14,851
Price Each Flex Fuel $15,795
Options:
1 AM/FMw/ CD Player $ STD
2 ShoplService Manuat CONTACT VENDOR
3 CD Service Manual CONTACT VENDOR
4 Limited Slip Rear End $ 289
§ Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control TILY-STD, CRUISE $223
6 Keyless Entry $ NA
7 PowerWindows / Power Locks $ NA
8 Exterior colors SEE BELOW _
9 Side AlrBags $ S
10 Sfush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) $ 60
11 Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) $ NA
12 Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) $ NA
13 Stide Rear Window $ NA
44 Front seat bench $ NA
15 8ed Liner $ 218
16 Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) $ - NA
17 Delelo Cloth Seats (Deduci) $ - NA
18 Delele Carpet (Deduct) NA - FLOOR MATS $18
18 FOB Deslership: (Oaducy F i0
20 FOB Other than Metro Chadeston - Per Mile $ 1.59

Duel Gas Tanks (gas only}
Addifional Information;

DEEP CHERRY RED AND DEEP WATER 8LUE $200 - OTHERS NO CHARGE

TRAILER TOW $134

15
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BLACK TUBULAR RUNNING BOARDS $249

POWER WINDOWS, LOCKS, MIRRORS, KEYLESS ENTRY - STANDARD CREW CAB,

$955 EXT. CAS

CLASS 12 TRUCK 070-48-12-001
Large Pickup, 1/2 Ton, 2 Wheel Drive
6000 GVWR, Short Bed, (Approx. 57" bed)
includes but is not limited to: Ford F150, Dodge 1500, Chevrolet 1500
Vendor Name: STEPHENS AUTQ CENTER
Manufacturer f Brand FORD
Delivery 60-120 DAYS EST.
~ Made! Name & Number F150 F1C
- He TORQUE
300/3.7L. V6 27513 7L V6
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN 195 HP 235 TORQUE
Transmission Automafic
Steering Power
Brakes Power
Radio ANIFM
Glass All Tinted
WMimors Left & Right Qutside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetside
Bumper Rear Step Factory Instalted
Tires 40 Gallens Miniraum
Spare Tire Full Size wf Jack
Air Conditioning STD -
Front Seat Bench EPA EPA
Rubber Floor Covering Instalied HGWY City
Front Alc Bags instatied
F v‘ .“_ ]
Price Each Gasoline 1 .
Hybeid 1] I /Y4
Flex Fuel $14,389
Qptions:
AMFM wi CD Player $ 241
Shop/Service Manual $ 199
COD Setvioe Manual $ 199
Titt Whee! & Cruise Control $ TILT-STD, CRUISE-187
Umited Slip Rear End $ 249
Keyless Entry $ INCL W/ POWER WINOOWS
Power Windows / Power Locks $ 769
Tow Hooks $ NA _
tongBed . $ 272
"Extedor colors $ $TD
Siide Rear Window $ - 167
Side Air Bags $ STD
Engine Options $ NA
Engine Options $ 830
Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) $ 68
Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) $ 18
Stush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) o NA
Bed Liner $ 200
CrewfQuad Cab $ 6665
Extended Cab $ 3462
Manuat Transmission wiOvendrive (Deduct) $ - NA
DOuel Gas Tanks {gas only} $ - NA
Delele Campet (Deducy $ - STD
Delete Truck Bed (Deduct) '$ - NA
FO8 Daclacchin: fNaduch $ - 10
FOB Other than Melro Chardeston - Per Mite $ 1.59
Additional Informationc )
SPRAY INBED LINER $374  TAILGATE STEP $311  TOW PACKAGE $311

16



Vendor Name:

Manufacturer / Brand
Dekivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine

CLASS 12ATRUCK
Large Pickup, 1/2 Ton, 2 Whee! Drve
6000 GVWR, Short Bed
inclurdes butis not imited to: Ford F150, Dodge 1500, Chevrolet 1500

STEPHENS AUTO CENTER

FORD.
G0-120 DAYS EST.
F150 F1C

HP TORQUE
360/5.0L V8 380/5.0L v8

MIN 300 HP 300 TORQUE

Transmission

Automatic

Power

Power

AMEM

All Tinted

Lefi & Right Qutside

Front & Rear

Rear Slep Faclory instatled

Banch EPA EPA

ciry

:
¢
g
g

15 SlustiAll Weather Mats (Dvivor & Passenger)
16 Skest/Al Weather Mats (Second Row)

17 SiustvAll Weather Mals (Camga).

18 Bed Liner_

19 Crew Cab

20 Extended Cab

21 Monual Transmission wiOvendtive (Deduch
22 Delete Cioth Seats Daduct)

23 Delets Capet (Deduct)

24 Duel Gas Tanks (gas only)

25 FOB Dealership: (Deduc)

23 FOB Othershan Metra Chiadeston - Per Miie

AddiSional lnformation:

gD ' rlkf m

$15.192

$ 241
$ 199
$ 199
$ TILT-5TD, CRUISE 187

249
WINC 789

Ll
;
3

| 3

2
N

3

3

Option 1:
Opdlon 2: :

&'; 212

2 'aaigl

58

|

sias

Efy fo e §u

mh
o)

B}

SPRAY N BED LINER $374 _TAILGATE STEP $311 TOW PACKAGE $341
$249 '

BLACK TUBLUILAR RUNNING

BOARDS
POWER WINDOWS, LOCKS, MIRRORS, KEYIESS ENTRY - STANDARD CREW CAB
$355 EXTCAB

17

070-48-12-010



CLASS 14 TRUCK 070-48-14-000
Large Pickup,3/4 Ton, 2 Wheel Drve
8800 GVWR, Long Bed, Crew Cab
Includes but is Aot limited to: Dodge Ram 2500, Chevrolet 2500, Ford F250
Vendor Name STEPHENS AUTO CENTER
Manufacturer f Brand FORD
Detivery 60-120 DAYS EST
Madel Name & Number F250 W2A
HP TORQUE

385/6.2L V8 405/6.2L V8
Standard Equipment Requirements: ‘
Engine BMIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power
Radio AMIFM
Glass All Tinfed
Mirrors Left & Right Qutside
License Plate Maunts Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetside

" Bumper Rear Step Factory tastafled
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size wi Jack
Adr Conditioning STD -
Standacd Floor Covering lastalled
Front Air Bags Installed
Price Each Gasaline $20,530
Price Each Flex Fuel $20,530
$511

NN
NERRNNNNIZRI ANk 22 connann

Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, fncludes:
Axie-trac-ok differential
Engine Cooling - heavy duty
Skid plate Group
Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks
Al Terraln Tires
Tow Hoaks
AMFM wf CD Player
ShapfService Manual
CD Service Manual
Tilt Wheel & Crulse Control
Keytess Entry
Power Windows / Power Locks
Tow Package
Snow Plow Package
Diesel Engine
V-8 Engine
Side Alr Bags
Exterior colors
Stide Rear Window
Running Boards
Swing out mimors
Bed Liner
Duel Gas Tanks (gas only)
Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Raw)
Shsh/All Weather Mats (Cango)
Additional Tanks
4 Wheel Orive
Manual Transmission wiOverdrive (Deduc))
Betete Cloth Seats (Peduc)
Datete Capet (Deduct)
FOB Dealership: (Deduct)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

REVERSE ALARM $104

Enter total off-road pkg above

$228

$

s

$

TITLE STD - CRUISE 5185
INCL W/ P. WINDOWSLOCKS

$680
S0
$71.4X4 ONLY
$6,503
310,
ST0
510
104
26
510
200
NA
68
NA
NA
277
NA
S0
oL
10
1.59
$

UPFITTER SWITCHES $104; ALUM WHEELS $496, REMOTE START $162 REQUIRES PWR EQP

TAILGATE STEP $311; SPRAY IN BEDLINER $374

L]

18
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CLASS 15 TRUCK 070-48-15-000
Large Pickup, 3/4 Ton, 2 Wheel Drive,
8500 GVWR, Long Bed

includes but is not fimited to: Ford F250, Dodge Ram 2500, Chevrolet 2500

Vendor Name: STEPHENS AUTQ CENTER
Manufacturer / Brand FORD

Delivery 60-120 DAY EST.

Maodel Mame & Number F250 F2A

Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine

He TORQUE
385/6.2L V8 405/6.2L. v8

MIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE

Transmission

Automatic

Steeting

Power

Brakes

Power

Radio

AMFM

Glass

All Tinted

Mircars

Lett & Right Outside

License Plate Mounts

Front & Rear

Cargo Box

Fleetside

Bumper

STD

Tires

Alf Season

Spare Tire

Full Size wf Jack

Air Conditioning

Instalied

Standard Floor Covering

Installed

Frant Air Bags

Instalied

Gas
F