Purchase Order
State of West Virginia i
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

~ BEDDINGO9B ' 1

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

CORRECT PURCHASE OHDER NUMBER
MUST APPEAR ON ALL
INVOICES, AND SHI?PENG PAPEHS

AT.L. STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS

QUESTIONS CONGERNING THIS PUR-
CHASE ORDER SHOULD BE DIRECTED
TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BEI nw.

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

*222100951 724-834-4134
SEALY BEDDING CO
PO BOX 1821

GREENSBURG PA 15601

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR
TERMS AND CONDITIONS

AGENCY COPY

ALL STATE AGENCILES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARICUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

SATE ERINTED: EINSSN

STERMS:

147

CEREIGH T TERMS:

CCOUNTNURBER

DESTINATION PRERAID

BLANKET COPEN-END STATEWIDE CONTRACT

MATTRESSES,| BOX SPRINGS, AND PILLOWS TO ALL
WEST VIRGINIA STATE AGENCIES AND POLITICAL

SUBDIVISIONS, PER
BID DATED 9/18/08.

0001% JB
10/10/2008

BEDDING (AL{l. TYPES)

325-08 "

EXHIBIT 3

LIFE OF CONTRACT: THIS CONTRACT
10/15/2008,] AND HXTENDS FOR A PERIOD OF ONE
YEAR OR UNTIIL, SUCH "REASONABLE TIME"
NECESSARY 7|0 OBTAIN A NEW CONTRACT

BLANKET OPEN-END STATEWIDE CONTRAC TO PROVIDE

THE SPECIFICATIONS, AND VENDOR'S

.00000

BECOMES EFFECTIVE [ON

{1)

THEREAFTER AS 1S
CR RENEW THE

ORIGINAL CONTRACT. THE "REASONABLE TIME" PERIOD SHA
NOT EXCEED [TWELVE |{12) MONTHS. DURING THIS "REASONA
CPEN

inn
BLE

PURCHASING DIVISION
CERNHEDENCUMBERED

0CT 172008

END

IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE []

OPEN END

4 558 8802

APPROVED AS TO FORM BY
ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL

PUHCHASING DIVISION AUTHORI?ED SIGNATURE



GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
PURCHASE ORDER/CONTRACT

1. ACCEPTANCE: Seller shall be bound by this order and its terms and conditions upon receipt of this order.

2. APPLICABLE LAW: The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing
Division shall govern all rights and duties under the Confract, including without fimitation the validity of this
Purchase Order/Contract.

3. NON-FUNDING: All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Orders/Contracts are to be
continued for the terms of the Purchase Order/Contract, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the
Legislature or otherwise being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available
for these services or goods, this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.

4., COMPLIANCE: Seller shali comply with all Federal, State and local laws, regulations and ordinances including,
but not imited to, the prevailing wage rates of the WV Division of Labor.

5. MODIFICATIONS: This writing is the parties final expression of intent. No modification of this order shall be
binding unless agreed to in writing by the Buyer.

6. ASSIGNMENT: Neither this Order nor any monies due, or to become due hereunder may be assighed by the
Seller without the Buyer's consent,

7. WARRANTY: The BSeller expressly warrants that the goods andfor services covered by this order will:
{a} conform to the specifications, drawings, samples or other description furnished or specified by the
Buyer; {b} be merchantable and fit for the purpose intended; and/or {c} be free from defect in material
and workmanship.

8. CANCELLATION: The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Ordet/Contract upon 30 days written
notice to the seller.

9. SHIPPING, BILLING & PRICES: Prices are those stated in this order. No price increase will be accepted
without written authority from the Buyer. All goods or services shall be shipped on or before the date
specified in this Order.

10, LATE PAYMENTS: Payments may only be made after the delivery of goods or services. Interest may be
paid on late payments in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

11. TAXES: The State of West Virginia is exempt from Federal and State taxes and will not pay or reimburse
such taxes.

12. RENEWAL: Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Confract may be renewed only upon
mutual written agreement of the parties.

13. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptey protection, this Contract may be
deemed null and void, and terminated without further order.

14. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Assoclate
Addendum {BAA), approved by the Attorney General, and available online at the Purchasing Division's web site
{http://www.staie.wv.us/admin/purchase/vre/hipaa.htm) is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that,
the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Enfity (46 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health
information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.

15. WEST VIRGINIA ALCOHOL & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT: If this Confract constitules a public improvement
construction contract as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code ("The West Virginia Alcohol
and Drug-Free Workplace Act”), then the following language shall hereby become part of this Contract: "The
contracter and its subconfractors shall implement and maintain a written drug-free workplace policy in compliance
with the West Virginia Alcohol and Drug-Free Workplace Act, as set forth in Aricle 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code. The contractor and its subcontractors shall provide a sworn statement in wiiting, under the
penalties of perjury, that they maintain a valid drug-free work place policy in compliance with the West Virginia
and Drug-Free Workplace Act. It is understood and agreed that this Contract shall be cancelled by the awarding
authority if the Contractor: 1) Fails to implement its drug-free workplace policy; 2) Fails to provide information
regarding implementation of the contractor’s drug-free workplace policy at the request of the public authority; or
3) Provides to the public authority false information regarding the contractor's drug-free workplace policy.”

Rev. 7/01/08



Purchase Order
State of West Virginia e

Department of Administration ] BEDD TNGO 9B 2
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER
MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES,
INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS.
QoL Cotane e,
ALL STATE AGENCIES TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.

AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

BY ORDER ‘ SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR
TERMS AND CONDITIONS

*222100951 724-834-4134
SEALY BEDDING CO
PO BOX 1821

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOQUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

GREENSBURG PA 15601 BY ORDER

IERNMBORSAL

BEST WAXR DESTINATION PREPAID MO, - MUT,

TIME" THE VEENDOR MAY TERMINATE THIS CONTRACT FOR ANY
REASON UPON| GIVING THE DIRECTOR OF] PURCHASING 30 DAYS
WRITTEN NOTIICE.

UNLESS SPECIFIC PROVISIONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE
IN THIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT, THE TERMS, CONDITIONS AND
PRICING SET| HEREIN ARE FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE
CONTRACT.

RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL
WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR,

SUBMITTED THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30)
DAYS PRIOR [TC THE EXPIRATION DATE.] SUCH RENEWAL SHALL
BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS CONDITIONS OF THE
ORIGINAL CONTRACT [AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE
(1) YEAR PHERIODS.

CANCELLATION: THE DPIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE
RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN
NOTICE TO THE VENDOR. IF THE COMMODIITIES AND/OR SERVICES
SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALIL OR DO NOT CONFORM
TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID D CONTRACT HEREIN.

OPEN MARKET) CLAUSEH: THE DIRECTOR PURCHASING MAY
AUTHORIZE Al SPENDING UNIT TO PURCHASE ON THE OPEN
MARKET, WITHOUT TgE FILING OF A REQUISITION OR COST

ESTIMATE, ITEMS SPECIFIED ON THIS [CONTRACT FOR
IMMEDIATE DELIVERYI IN EMERGENCIES PUE TO UNFORESEEN

" IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE [

_ BY,
A T Bt PURCHASING DIVISION AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE




Purchase Order

State of West Virginia. TP RGE T
Department of Administration 3
Purchasing Division '
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER
MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES,
INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS,
CHASE ORDEA SHOULD BE DIRECTED
ALL, STATE AGENCIES TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.
© AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR
TERMS AND CONDITIONS
*¥222100951 724-834-4134
SEALY BEDDING CO ALL STATE AGENCIES
PO BOX 1821 AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
GREENSBURG PA 15601 BY ORDER

FREIGHETERMS
PREEATL

CACCOUNTNUNMBER

ML - MU,

CAUSES (INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED [TO DELAYS IN TRANS
PORTATION CR AN UNANTICIPATED INCREASE IN THE VOLUME
OF WORK.)

1

QUANTITIES:| QUANTITIES LISTED IN THE REQUISITION ARE
APPROXTMATIONS ONL{Y, BASED ON ESTIMATES SUPPLIED BY
THE STATE SPENDING UNIT. IT 1S ERSTCOD AND AGREHD
THAT THE CONTRACT |[SHALL COVER THE RUANTITIES ACTUALLYY
ORDERED FOR DELIVERY DURING THE TE OF THE CONTRACT,
WHEETHER MORE OR LHESS THAN THE QU ITIES SHOWN.

ORDERING PROCEDURE: SPENDING UNIT(
WRITTEN STATE CONTRACT ORDER (FO
THE VENDOR [FOR COMMCDITIES COVERE
THE ORIGINAL COPY OF THE WV-39 S
VENDOR AS AUTHORIZATION FOR SHIPM
MATILED TO THE PURCHASING DIVISION,
RETAINED BY| THE SBENDING UNIT.

<) SHALL ISSUE A

NUMBER WV-39) TO
BY THIS CONTRACT.
I, BE MAILED TO THE
T, A SECOND COPY
AND A THIRD COPY

BANKRUPTCY: IN THE EVENT 'THE VEN
FOR BANKRUBICY PROTECTION, THIS C
CALLY NULL AND VOED, AND IS TERMI
ORDER. ‘ :

R/CONTRACTOR FILHS
TRACT IS8 AUTOMATI
TED WITHOUT FURTHER

THE TERMS A
SHALL SUPER
CONDITIONS

IND  CONID)
SEDE AN
WHICH M

DOCUMENTS S

ITIONS CONTAINED

AY APPEAR ON ANY

JCH _AS

Y AND ALI, SUBSEQUENT TERMS AND

PRICE LISTS, ORDER FORMS, SALES

IN THIS CONTRACT

ATTACHED PRINTED

IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE []

APPROVED AS TO FORM

BY

ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL

BY.

PURCHASING DIVISION AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE



o Purchase Order
State of West Virginia B
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMSER
MUST APPEAR ON ALl PACKAGES,
INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS.
QUESTIONS CONCERNING THIS FUR-
CHABE ORDER SHOULD BE DIRECTED

ALI. STATE AGENCIES TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS TRHANGEORDER
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

BY ORDER

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR
TERMS AND CONDITIONS

*2221000951 724-834-4134
SEALY BEDDING CO
PO BOX 1821

ALL STATE AGENCILES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATEQ

GREENSBURG PA 15601 BY ORDER

R : MG OF S LEERUSON
10/10{2008 NET 30 363284147
: BREM T FREIGHT TERMS Y ACCOUNT NOMBER:
BEST WAY DESTTNATION PREPAID MUL-MUL

AGREEMENTS PR MAINTENANCE AGREEMENTS, INCLUDING ANY
ELECTRONIC MEDIUM [SUCH AS CD-ROM.

REV. 04/11/p001
EXHIBIT 6

PRICE ADJUSTIMENT PROVISION: ‘
THE STATE OF WEST [VIRGINIA WILL CONSIDER INCREASES THAT
CONTAIN PROVISIONS FOR PRICE ADJUSTIMENTS PRIOR TO THE
ORIGINAL EXPIRATI OF THE CONTRACT, PROVIDED THAT
SUCH PRICE ADJUSTMENT COVERS BOTH [UPWARD AND DOWNWARD
MOVEMENT OF| THE COMMODITY PRICE, AND THAT ADJUSTMENT
IS BASED ON| THE "PASS THROUGH" INCREASE OR DECREASE QF
RAW MATERIALS AND/IOR LABOR, WHICH MAKE UP ALL OR A
SUBSTANTIAL| PART OF A PRODUCT. ADJUSTMENTS ARE TO BE
BASED UPON ACTUAL DOLLAR FIGURE|, NOT A PERCENTAGE.
ALL PRICE JUSTMENT REQUESTS MUST| BE SUBSTANTIATED [IN
A MANNER ACCEPTAB TO THE DIRECTOR PURCHASING, E.G.
GOVERNMENT. BENCH MARKS, GENERAL MARKET INCREASE,

PUBLISHED ICE LISTS. SUCH REQUESTS FOR AND INCREASE
SHOULD BE RECEIVED IN WRITING BY THE DIRECTOR OF
PURCHASING AT LEAST 30 DAYS IN ADVANCE OF THE EFFECTIVE
DATE OF THHE INCREASE. ANY TIME THE VENDOR REQUESTS A
PRICE ADJUSTMENT, THE PURCHASING DIVISION MAY ELITHER
ACCEPT THE [PRICE ADJUSTMENT AND AMEND THE CONTRACT

IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE [

BY
A T Y L PURCHASING DIVISION AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE



Purchase Order
State of West Virginia

Department of Administration : BEDDINGO 9B 5
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 253050130

CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER
MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES, -
INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS.

- R
ALL STATE AGENCIES TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW,

AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR
TERMS AND CONDITIONS

*222100851 724 - 834 4134
SEALY BEDDING CO
PC BOX 1821

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAIL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIQUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

GREENSBURG PA 15601 BY ORDER

1363284147
EHEIGHT TERMS

PREPAID

e ACCOUNT NUMBER::

ACCORDINGLY OR REJECT THE ADUSTMEBT IN ITS ENTIRETY
AND CANCEL |THE CONTRACT.

PREFERRED HERMS:
IT IS PREFERRED THAT THE PRICES ON THIS CONTRACT ARH
FIRM FOR LIFE OF THE CONTRACT, AS |INDICATED IN THE LIFE
OF CONTRACT CLAUSE CONTAINED HEREIN, NOT TO EXCEED QgNE
(1) YEAR.

ALTERNATE TERMS:

(XX) THE RRICES QN THIS CONTRACT [WILL REMAIN FIRM EROR
90 DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THE
CONTRACT, PRICES WILL REMAIN |[FIRM AFTER EACH PRICE
ADJUSTMENT FQR A MINIMUM OF 90 DAYS.

IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE []

BY,
A ey GENERAL PURCHASING DIVISION AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE




BEDDINGO09 - SEALY BEDDING

1 -6 Mats Only
Size
Dble Sided Single Sided

38" X 75" $ 144.00
38" X 80” $ 151.00
54" X 75" $ 175.00
54" X 80" $ 187.00
60" X 80" $ 206.00
76" X 80" $ 269.00
TOTAL $ 1,132.00

Category il Style (NHI) Nursing Home Innerspring
Size 1-6 Sets 7 + Sets L
38" X 75" 24400 | $ 242.00 |l
38” X 80" 257.00 | $ 255.00 Jo
54" X 75" 30200 | % 289.00
TOTAL 803.00 | $ 796.00
Size 1 - 6 Mats Only 7 + Mats Only o
38" X 75” 164.00 | 3 162.00 i
38" X 80" 173.001 % 171.00 ¢
54" X 75" 205.00! % 202.00
TOTAL 1,647.00 | $ 1,630.00 |
Size 1 - 6 Box Springs Only 7 + Box Springs Only i
38" X 75" 91.00 | $ 89.00 |
38" X 80" 98.00|$ 95.00 f
54" X 75" 112.00 | $ 111.00 |2
TOTAL 2,153.00 | $ . 2,127.00 |

Category I Style (DIM } Dormitory Interspring Mattress :
Size 1 -6 Mats Only 7 + Mats Only
36" X 75" NO BID NO BID
36" X 80" NO BID NO BID
38" X 75" | 133.00 | $ 130.00
38" x 80" : 137.001 % 134.00 k
TOTAL . 270.00 | § 264.00

CategoryV | PILLOWS

ftem - Unit Price

Pillow: extra firm breathable NO BID
Pillow: reg. firm non-breathable NO BID
Pillow: extra firm non-breathable NO BID
Pillow: reg. firm breathable NO BID
TOTAL | ] |




. Purchase Order
State of West Virginia

Purchasing Division

Department of Administration S EPDINGOOD

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130

Chatleston, WV 25305-0130

CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER
MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES,
INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS.

| SR e,
ALI, STATE AGENCIES TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER ' SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR
TERMS AND CONDITIONS

*2221009851 724-834-4134
SEALY BEDDING CO ALL STATE AGENCIES
PO BOX 1821 ' AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
GREENSBURG PA 15601 BY ORDER

10_/10/2008 NET 30 __ 363284147

SEREIGHTTERMS:

iii'-i‘-ﬁCﬁ@UN:Tz‘-iN:UMBEEEE

LINE CATNO ITEM NUMBER DESCRIPTION

0001 325-08 BEDDING (_ALL TYPES)

SIGNATURE

RECEIPT TICKET FPOR PURCHASE ORDER:

DATE

BEDDINGOSB

QTY DATE

IF APPROVAL AS TQ FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE []

BY.

APPROVED AS TO FORM BY

ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL : ‘ PURCHASING DIVISION AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE



