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GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
PURCHASE ORDER/CONTRACT

1. ACCEPTANCE: Seller shall be bound by this order and its terms and conditions upon receipt of this order.

2. APPLICABLE LAW: The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing
Division shall govern all rights and duties under the Coniract, including without fimitation the validity of this
Purchase Order/Contract.

3. NON-FUNDING: Al services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Orders/Contracts are to be
continued for the terms of the Purchase Order/Contract, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the
Legislature or otherwise beihg made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available
for thase services or goods, this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.

4. COMPLIANCE: Seller shall comply with all Federal, State and local laws, regulations and ordinances including,
but not limited to, the prevailing wage rates of the WV Division of Labor.

5. MODIFICATIONS: This writing is the parties final expression of intenl. No muodification of this order shall be
binding unless agreed to in writing by the Buyer.

6. ASSIGNMENT: Neither this Order nor any monies due, or to become due hereunder may be assigned by the
Seller without the Buyer's consent.

7. WARRBANTY: The Seller expressly warrants that the goods andfor services covered by this order will:
{a} conform lo the specifications, drawings, samples or other description furnished or specified by the
Buyer; {b} be merchantable and fit for the purpose intended; and/or {c} be free from defect in material
and workmanship.

8. CANCELLATION: The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Ordet/Contract upon 30 days written
notice to the seller.

9, SHIPPING, BILLING & PRICES: Prices are those staled in this order. No price ihcrease will be accepted
without written authority from the Buyer. All goods or services shall be shipped on or before the date
specified in this Order.

10. LATE PAYMENTS: Payments may only be made after the delivery of goods or services. [nterest may be
paid on late payments in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

11. TAXES: The State of West Virginia is exempt from Federal and State taxes and will not pay or reimburse
such taxes.

12. RENEWAL: Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon
mutual written agreement of the parties.

13. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptey protection, this Contract may be
deemed null and void, and terminated without further order.

14. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, and available online at the Purchasing Division's web site
(http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/hipaa.htm) is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that,
the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health
Information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.

15. WEST VIRGINIA ALCOHOL & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT: [f this Confract constitutes a public improvement
consiruction contract as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code ("The West Virginia Alcohol
and Drug-Free Workgiace Act’), then the following language shall hereby become part of this Contract: "The
contractor and its subcontractors shall implement and maintain a written drug-free workplace policy in compliance
with the West Virginia Alcohol and Drug-Free Workplace Act, as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code.  The conlractor and its subcontractors shall provide a sworn statement in writing, under the
penalties of perjury, that they maintain a valid drug-free work place policy in compliance with the West Virginia
and Drug-Free Workplace Act. )t is understood and agreed that this Contract shall be cancelled by the awarding
authority if the Contractor: 1) Fails o implement its drug-free workplace policy; 2} Fails to provide information
regarding implementation of the contractor's drug-free workplace policy at the request of the public authority; or
3) Provides to the public authority false information regarding the contractor's drug-free workplace policy.”

Rev. 7/01/08
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BEDDINGO09 - IMPERIAL BEDDING CO.

Category | Style (UHS) Ultra Hospitality Sets
Size 1 - 6 Box Springs Only 7 + Box Springs Only
38” X 75" 98.00 | $ 78.00
38" X 80" 108.00 | $ 88.00
53" X 75" 125.00 | $ 105.00
53" X 80" 135.00 | $ 115.00
60" X 80" 153.00 | $ 133.60
76" X 80" 102.001 % 82.00
TOTAL 721.00 | § 601.00
Size 1 - 6 Mats Only 7 + Mats Only
Single Sided Single Sided | |
38" X 75" $ 169.00 $ 149.00 b -
38" X 80" $ 193.00 $ 173.00 |
53" X 75" $ 217.00 $ 1897.00 b
53" X 80" $ 237.00 $ 217.00 |-
60" X 80" $ 257.00 $ 237.00
76" X 80" $ 310.00 $ 290.00 |
TOTAL $ 1,383.00 $  1,263.00 |
Size 7 + Box Springs Only
38” X 75" $ 78.00
38" X 80" $ 88.00
53" X 75" $ 105.00
53" X 80" $ 115.00
60" X 80” 3 133.00
76" X 80" $ 82.00
TOTAL $ 601.00
Category | Style (SHS) Standard Hospitality Sets
. 7 + Mats Only
Size Single Sided
38" X 75" $ 124.00
38" X 80" $ 136.00 |
54" X 75" $ 163.00 |
54" X 80" $ 183.00 |
60" X 80” $ 197.00F
76" X 80" $ 239.00
TOTAL $ 1,042.00
Category I Style (PR6) 6" Pressure Relief Mattress
Size 1 - 6 Mats Only 7 + Mats Only L
36" X 75" 228.00 | $ 208.00 |
36" X 80" 235.00 1 $ 215.00
36" X 84" 24500 | § 22500 |
38" X 75" 235001 % 215.00
38" x 80" 245.00 | $ 22500 b
TOTAL 480.00 | § 44000 |
Category i Style (PRS) 5" Pressure Relief Foam
Size 1 - 6 Mats Only 7 + Mats Only o
36" X 75" 201.00 | $ 181.00 g,
36" X 80" 207.00 1 % 187.00 |
36" X 84" 217.00 | 197.00
38" X 75" 207.001 % 187.00
38" x 80" 217.00 | $ 197.00
TOTAL 424.00 | $ 384.00 |




BEDDINGO09 - IMPERIAL BEDDING CO.

Categorylll | Style (DM6 ) 6" Resilient Foam Mattress
Size 1 - 6 Mats Only 7 + Mats Only -
36" X 75" [ 8 198.00 | $ 17800}
36" X 80" $ 203001$ 183.00 | |
36" X 84” $ 210.00 | $ 190.00 |
38" X 75" $ 204.00 | $ 184.00 ||
38" x 80" $ 210.00 | $ 190.00 |
TOTAL $ . 41400 ] $ 374.00 1
Category lli Style (DM5 ) 5" Resilient Foam Mattress .
Size 1 - 6 Mats Only 7 + Mats Only e
36" X 75” $ 180.00 | $ 160.00 |- |
36” X 80” $ 185.00 { $ 165.00 | =
36" X 84" $ 190.00 | $ 170.00
38" X 75" $ 185.00 | $ 165.00 |
38" x 80" $ 190.00 | $ 170.00 |
TOTAL $ 375.00 | 335.00 |
Category V Pillows "
ltem Unit Price
Pillow: extra firm breathable NO BID
Pillow: reg. firm non-breathable NO BID
Pillow: extra firm non-breathable NO BID
Pillow: reg. firm breathable NO BID
TOTAL
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