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West Virginia 

Purchasing Division 

2019 Washington Street, East 
Charleston, WV 25305 
Telephone: 304-558-2306 
GeneralFax:304-558-6026 
Bid Fax: 304-558-'170 

The following documentation is an electronically‐
submitted vendor response to an advertised 
solicitation from the West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin within the Vendor Self‐Service portal at 
wvOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement process, and to maintain the 
transparency of the bid‐opening process, this 
documentation submitted online is publicly posted 
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to this solicitation submitted to the Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 

https://WVPurchasing.gov
https://wvOASIS.gov
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Procurement Folder: 1886131 

Procurement Type: Central Master Agreement 

Vendor lD: VS0000050666 ~ 
Legal Name: GCS Holdings, Inc. 

Alias/OBA: GCS 

Total Bid : $695.00 

Response Date: 04/14/2026 

Response Time: 13:27 

Responded By User ID: sjohnston_GCS 

First Name: John 

Last Name: Waterman 

Email: jwaterman@yourdatasmart1 

Phone: 8022746287 

so Doc Code: CRFQ 

SO Dept: 0803 

SO Doc ID: DOT2600000079 

Published Date: 3/31/26 

Close Date: 4114/26 

Close Time: 13:30 

Status: Closed 

Solicitation Description : WVDOT IT Temporary Staffing Services 
(81260081) 

Total of Header Attachments: 2 

Total ofAll Attachments: 2 



Department of Administration 
Purchasing Division 
2019 Washington Street East 
Post Office Box 50130 
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 

State of West Virginia 
Solicitation Response 

Proc Folder: 

Solicitation Description: 

Proc Type: 

1886131 

WVDOT IT Temporary Staffing Services (81260081) 

Central Master Agreement 

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version 

2026-04-14 13:30 SR 0803 ESR03302600000006554 1 

VENDOR 

VS0000050666 
GCS Holdings, Inc. 

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2600000079 

Total Bid: 695 Response Date: 2026-04-14 Response Time: 13:27:44 

Comments: GCS Holdings, Inc. submits this response in full compliance with all requirements of CRFQ DOT2600000079. All 
proposed rates are fully burdened hourly rates inclusive of wages, overhead, general and administrative expenses, 
and profit. Rates are firm for the contract term unless otherwise permitted by the solicitation. GCS is prepared to 
provide qualified GIS resources meeting or exceeding all stated requirements.  GCS has extensive experience 
providing GIS professionals, including ESRI-based environments, to public sector clients. 

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER 
John W Estep 
304-558-2566 
john.w.estep@wv.gov 

Vendor 
Signature X FEIN# DATE 

Date Printed: Apr 22, 2026 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05 



    

   

    

   

    

   

    

   

    

   

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount 
1 Senior Mainframe Application Analyst 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid Not within current service offering 

Extended Description: 
Senior Mainframe Application Analyst 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount 
2 Mainframe Application Analyst 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid Not within current service offering 

Extended Description: 
Mainframe Application Analyst 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount 
3 Senior Application Oracle Database 

Administrator 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid Not within current service offering 

Extended Description: 
Senior Application Oracle Database Administrator 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount 
4 Application Oracle Database Administrator 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid Not within current service offering 

Extended Description: 
Application Oracle Database Administrator 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount 
5 Senior Application DB2 Database 

Administrator 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Date Printed: Apr 22, 2026 Page: 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05 



    

   

    

   

    

   

    

   

    

   

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid Not within current service offering 

Extended Description: 
Senior Application DB2 Database Administrator 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount 
6 Application DB2 Database Administrator 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid Not within current service offering 

Extended Description: 
Application DB2 Database Administrator 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount 
7 PC Programmer Analyst 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid Not within current service offering 

Extended Description: 
PC Programmer Analyst 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount 
8 Senior PC Programmer Analyst 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid Not within current service offering 

Extended Description: 
Senior PC Programmer Analyst 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount 
9 Application SQL Server Database 

Administrator 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid Not within current service offering 

Extended Description: 
Application SQL Server Database Administrator 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount 
10 Senior Application Oracle Server Database 

Administrator 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Date Printed: Apr 22, 2026 Page: 3 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05 



   

   

 

   

   

 

   

   

 

   

   

 

   

   

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid Not within current service offering 

Extended Description: 
Senior Application Oracle Server Database Administrator 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount 
11 GIS Database Administrator 135.00 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Commodity Line Comments: 

Extended Description: 
GIS Database Administrator 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount 
12 Senior GIS Database Administrator 145.00 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Commodity Line Comments: 

Extended Description: 
Senior GIS Database Administrator 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount 
13 GIS Architect 160.00 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Commodity Line Comments: 

Extended Description: 
GIS Architect 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount 
14 GIS Application Developer 120.00 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Commodity Line Comments: 

Extended Description: 
GIS Application Developer 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount 
15 Senior GIS Application Developer 135.00 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Date Printed: Apr 22, 2026 Page: 4 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05 



 Commodity Line Comments: 

Extended Description: 
Senior GIS Application Developer 

Date Printed: Apr 22, 2026 Page: 5 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05 



 

   

 

 
 

 

  

  

  

  

   

 
 

 

 

 

  

  

   
  

 

  

Exhibit A - Pricing Page 
WVDOT Information Technology Staffing Services RFQ(81260081) 

CRQM DOT26*44 

Contract 

Item 
Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Year 1 Unit Cost 

Year 2 

Unit 

Cost 

Year 3 

Unit 

Cost 

Year 4 

Unit 

Cost 

Extended Cost 

4.1.1 Senior Mainframe Application Analyst 2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.2 Mainframe Application Analyst 2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.3 
Senior Application Oracle Database 

Administrator 
2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.4 
Application Oracle Database 

Administrator 
2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.5 
Senior Application DB2 Database 

Administrator 
2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.6 
Application DB2 Database 

Administrator 
2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.7 PC Programmer Analyst 2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.8 Senior PC Programmer Analyst 2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.9 
Application SQL Server Database 

Administrator 
2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.10 
Senior Application Oracle Database 

Administrator 
2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.11 GIS Database Administrator 2080 EA $135.00 $135.00 $135.00 $135.00 $280,800.00 

4.1.12 Senior GIS Database Administrator 2080 EA $145.00 $145.00 $145.00 $145.00 $301,600.00 

4.1.13 GIS Architect 2080 EA $160.00 $160.00 $160.00 $160.00 $332,800.00 

4.1.14 GIS Application Developer 2080 EA $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $249,600.00 

4.1.15 Senior GIS Application Developer 2080 EA $135.00 

0 
$135.00 $135.00 $135.00 $280,800.00 

Grand Total $1,445,600.00 



 
 

 
 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Exhibit A - Pricing Page 
WVDOT Information Technology Staffing Services RFQ(81260081) 

CRQM DOT26*44 

Contract 
Item 

Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Year 1 Unit Cost 
Year 2 
Unit 
Cost 

Year 3 
Unit 
Cost 

Year 4 
Unit 
Cost 

Extended Cost 

4.1.1 Senior Mainframe Application Analyst 2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.2 Mainframe Application Analyst 2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.3 Senior Application Oracle Database 
Administrator 

2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.4 Application Oracle Database 
Administrator 

2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.5 Senior Application DB2 Database 
Administrator 

2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.6 Application DB2 Database 
Administrator 

2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.7 PC Programmer Analyst 2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.8 Senior PC Programmer Analyst 2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.9 Application SQL Server Database 
Administrator 

2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.10 Senior Application Oracle Database 
Administrator 

2080 EA $0.00 

4.1.11 GIS Database Administrator 2080 EA $135.00 $135.00 $135.00 $135.00 $280,800.00 

4.1.12 Senior GIS Database Administrator 2080 EA $145.00 $145.00 $145.00 $145.00 $301,600.00 

4.1.13 GIS Architect 2080 EA $160.00 $160.00 $160.00 $160.00 $332,800.00 

4.1.14 GIS Application Developer 2080 EA $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $249,600.00 
4.1.15 Senior GIS Application Developer 2080 EA $135.00 

0 
$135.00 $135.00 $135.00 $280,800.00 

Grand Total $1,445,600.00 



Department of Administration 
Purchasing Division 
2019 Washington Street East 
Post Office Box 50130 
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 

State of West Virginia 
Centralized Request for Quote 

Service - Prof 

Proc Folder: 1886131 

Doc Description: WVDOT IT Temporary Staffing Services (81260081) 

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement 

Reason for Modification: 

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version 

2026-03-12 2026-03-31 13:30 CRFQ 0803 DOT2600000079 1 

BID RECEIVING LOCATION 

BID CLERK 

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION 

PURCHASING DIVISION 

2019 WASHINGTON ST E 

CHARLESTON WV 25305 

US 

VENDOR 

Vendor Customer Code: 

Vendor Name : 

Address : 

Street : 

City : 

State : 

Principal Contact : 

Vendor Contact Phone: 

GCS Holdings Inc. 

115

 South 4th Street West 

Missoula 

Montana Country : 

John Waterman, CTO 

802-274-6287 

USA 

Extension: 

Zip : 59801 

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER 
John W Estep 
304-558-2566 
john.w.estep@wv.gov 

Vendor 
Signature X FEIN# 260361551 DATE 04/24/2026 

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation 

Date Printed: Mar 12, 2026 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05 
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I 

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION 

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION: 

The West Virginia Purchasing Division is soliciting bids on behalf of the West Virginia Department of Transportation (WVDOT) to 
establish multiple open-ended contracts for information technology temporary technical staffing services. Per the Bid Requirements, 
Specifications, Terms and Conditions attached to this solicitation. 

INVOICE TO SHIP TO 

DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION 

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 
BLD. 5 RM-720 BLD. 5 RM-720 

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV 

US US 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price 

1 Senior Mainframe Application Analyst 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Extended Description: 
Senior Mainframe Application Analyst 

INVOICE TO SHIP TO 

DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION 

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 
BLD. 5 RM-720 BLD. 5 RM-720 

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV 

US US 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price 

2 Mainframe Application Analyst 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Extended Description: 
Mainframe Application Analyst 

Date Printed: Mar 12, 2026 Page: 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05 



  

  

   

  

  

   

I INVOICE TO SHIP TO 

DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION 

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 
BLD. 5 RM-720 BLD. 5 RM-720 

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV 

US US 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price 

3 Senior Application Oracle Database 
Administrator 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Extended Description: 
Senior Application Oracle Database Administrator 

INVOICE TO SHIP TO 

DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION 

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 
BLD. 5 RM-720 BLD. 5 RM-720 

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV 

US US 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price 

4 Application Oracle Database Administrator 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Extended Description: 
Application Oracle Database Administrator 

Date Printed: Mar 12, 2026 Page: 3 FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05 



  

  

   

  

  

   

I INVOICE TO SHIP TO 

DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION 

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 
BLD. 5 RM-720 BLD. 5 RM-720 

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV 

US US 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price 

5 Senior Application DB2 Database Administrator 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Extended Description: 
Senior Application DB2 Database Administrator 

INVOICE TO SHIP TO 

DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION 

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 
BLD. 5 RM-720 BLD. 5 RM-720 

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV 

US US 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price 

6 Application DB2 Database Administrator 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Extended Description: 
Application DB2 Database Administrator 

Date Printed: Mar 12, 2026 Page: 4 FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05 



  

  

   

  

  

   

I INVOICE TO SHIP TO 

DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION 

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 
BLD. 5 RM-720 BLD. 5 RM-720 

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV 

US US 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price 

7 PC Programmer Analyst 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Extended Description: 
PC Programmer Analyst 

INVOICE TO SHIP TO 

DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION 

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 
BLD. 5 RM-720 BLD. 5 RM-720 

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV 

US US 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price 

8 Senior PC Programmer Analyst 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Extended Description: 
Senior PC Programmer Analyst 

Date Printed: Mar 12, 2026 Page: 5 FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05 



  

  

   

  

  

   

I INVOICE TO SHIP TO 

DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION 

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 
BLD. 5 RM-720 BLD. 5 RM-720 

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV 

US US 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price 

9 Application SQL Server Database Administrator 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Extended Description: 
Application SQL Server Database Administrator 

INVOICE TO SHIP TO 

DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION 

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 
BLD. 5 RM-720 BLD. 5 RM-720 

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV 

US US 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price 

10 Senior Application Oracle Server Database 
Administrator 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Extended Description: 
Senior Application Oracle Server Database Administrator 

Date Printed: Mar 12, 2026 Page: 6 FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05 



  

  

   

  

  

   

I INVOICE TO SHIP TO 

DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION 

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 
BLD. 5 RM-720 BLD. 5 RM-720 

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV 

US US 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price 

11 GIS Database Administrator 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Extended Description: 
GIS Database Administrator 

INVOICE TO SHIP TO 

DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION 

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 
BLD. 5 RM-720 BLD. 5 RM-720 

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV 

US US 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price 

12 Senior GIS Database Administrator 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Extended Description: 
Senior GIS Database Administrator 

Date Printed: Mar 12, 2026 Page: 7 FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05 



  

  

   

  

  

   

I INVOICE TO SHIP TO 

DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION 

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 
BLD. 5 RM-720 BLD. 5 RM-720 

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV 

US US 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price 

13 GIS Architect 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Extended Description: 
GIS Architect 

INVOICE TO SHIP TO 

DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION 

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 
BLD. 5 RM-720 BLD. 5 RM-720 

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV 

US US 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price 

14 GIS Application Developer 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Extended Description: 
GIS Application Developer 

Date Printed: Mar 12, 2026 Page: 8 FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05 



I INVOICE TO SHIP TO 

DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION 

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 
BLD. 5 RM-720 

CHARLESTON WV 

US 

DEPT. OF TRANSPORTATION 

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, 
BLD. 5 RM-720 

CHARLESTON WV 

US 

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price 

15 Senior GIS Application Developer 

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model # 

80111609 

Extended Description: 
Senior GIS Application Developer 

SCHEDULE OF EVENTS 

Line Event Event Date 

1 Tech Questions due by 10:00am 2026-03-20 

Date Printed: Mar 12, 2026 Page: 9 FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05 



Document Phase Document Description Page 
10 

DOT2600000079 Final WVDOT IT Temporary Staffing 
Services (81260081) 
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