
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1814797

Solicitation Description: LEEBOY PAVER OEM PARTS AND COMPONENTS or EQUAL

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2025-11-13 13:30 SR 0803 ESR11132500000003122 1

VENDOR

VS0000045819
SWIPE RESOURCES LLC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2600000036

Total Bid: 26187 Response Date: 2025-11-13 Response Time: 12:02:35

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep
304-558-2566
john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 210340 - HYDRAULIC MOTOR 6.00000 EA 1129.000000 6774.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
26101304    

Commodity Line Comments: Alternate ID: LB210340
Brand: Leeboy & Rosco JS

Extended Description:
210340 - HYDRAULIC MOTOR

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 1008650-01 - STARTER 6.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25173902    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
1008650-01 - STARTER

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 240150 - JACK, SCREED 5.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
27121600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
240150 - JACK, SCREED

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 350050 - CLEVIS 8.00000 EA 20.000000 160.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31162400    

Commodity Line Comments: Alternate ID: LB350050
Brand: Leeboy & Rosco JS

Extended Description:
350050 - CLEVIS

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 750241 - SHIELD 6.00000 EA 834.000000 5004.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101700    
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Commodity Line Comments: Alternate ID: LB750241
Brand: Leeboy & Rosco JS
Description: FLASHING SET(2P

Extended Description:
750241 - SHIELD

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 608501005 - HYDRAULIC FILTER 12.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40161515    

Commodity Line Comments: NO Bid

Extended Description:
608501005 - HYDRAULIC FILTER

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 250010 - CONVEYOR BELT 8.00000 EA 1315.000000 10520.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
26111800    

Commodity Line Comments: Alternate ID: LB250010
Brand: Leeboy & Rosco JS

Extended Description:
250010 - CONVEYOR BELT

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 710130 - CHAIN 7.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31151600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
710130 - CHAIN

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 986341 - ROLLER ASSY 10.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
24101700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
986341 - ROLLER ASSY

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 210480 - BRAKE PAD 12.00000 EA   
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25171713    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
210480 - BRAKE PAD

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 314040 - HYDRAULIC TANK CAB 4.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
24111800    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
314040 - HYDRAULIC TANK CAB

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 370060 - THROTTLE CABLE 8.00000 EA 103.000000 824.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
26101750    

Commodity Line Comments: Alternate ID: LB370060
Brand:  Leeboy & Rosco JS

Extended Description:
370060 - THROTTLE CABLE

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 7505525RV - PADDLE ASSY 6.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
7505525RV - PADDLE ASSY

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 811316 - CAM FOLLOWER 5.00000 EA 581.000000 2905.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101500    

Commodity Line Comments: Alternate ID: LB370060
Brand:  Leeboy & Rosco JS

Extended Description:
811316 - CAM FOLLOWER
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 700081 - EXTENSION PLATE 7.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
700081 - EXTENSION PLATE
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