


From: Hope Fout <hope.fout@wvoasis.gov> 

Date: Wed, Oct 29, 2025 at 11:36 AM 

Subject: Important Information Concerning Solicitations that closed on 10/28/25 and 

10/29/25 

To: toby.l.welch@wv.gov <toby.l.welch@wv.gov>, james.w.atkins@wv.gov <james.w.atkins

@wv.gov>, john.w.estep@wv.gov <john.w.estep@wv.gov>, tara.l.lyle@wv.gov <tara.l.lyle@

wv.gov>, lhoskins@wvda.us <lhoskins@wvda.us>, larry.t.workman@wv.gov <larry.t.workm

an@wv.gov>, joseph.e.hageriii@wv.gov <joseph.e.hageriii@wv.gov> 

Cc: HelpDesk <HelpDesk@wvoasis.gov>, Finance Team <FinanceTeam@wvoasis.gov> 

 

It has come to our attention that the synchronization jobs between VSS and FIN have not 

been running successfully since approximately 12:30 PM on October 28, 2025. You are 

receiving this notification because one or more of your solicitations closed during this 

timeframe. 

Our team is actively investigating the issue and will provide an update once the 

synchronization has been restored. 

In the meantime, please refrain from awarding any solicitations that closed during this 

period until the issue has been resolved. 

Thank you for your patience and understanding. 

Hope 

 

Hope Fout 

West Virginia Enterprise Resource Planning Board 

1007 Bullitt St., Suite 400 

Charleston, WV  25301 

www.wvOASIS.gov 

 

 

WV Enterprise Resource Planning Board 

 



 

  

Notice:  This e-mail message, including any attachments, contains information of the West 

Virginia State Auditor’s OAice (1900 Kanawha Boulevard, E, Building 1, Room W-100, 

Charleston, West Virginia 25305) that may be confidential; proprietary copyrighted and/or 

legally privileged and is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity named on this 

message. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution of this email is 

prohibited.  If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by email, fax or 

telephone and destroy all paper and electronic copies of the original message. 

 



 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1800346

Solicitation Description: Repair Products for Bridges & Roads - Supplemental

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2025-10-28 13:30 SR 0803 ESR10152500000002592 1

VENDOR

000000229160
CRAFCO INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2600000028

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2025-10-20 Response Time: 16:57:01

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep
304-558-2566
john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Cold-Poured Joint & Crack Sealant,  Pkg/jug 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid - Crafco does not manufacture this type of product.

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Cold-Poured Joint & Crack Sealant,  Pkg/

drum
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid - Crafco does not manufacture this type of product.

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Sealant (ASTM 

D6690, Type I & II)
0.00000 LB 0.510000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: Meltable packaging is available at $0.54 per pound.

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Hot-Poured Aggregate-Filled Repair 

Materials, Pkg/container
0.00000 LB 0.530000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: Meltable packaging is available at $0.56 per pound.

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Hot-Poured Aggregate-Filled Repair 

Materials, Pkg/pallet
0.00000 LB 0.530000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: Meltable packaging is available at $0.56 per pound.

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Hot-Pour Non-Asphalt-Based Joint & Crack 

Seal. Pgk/container
0.00000 LB 2.290000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Hot-Pour Non-Asphalt-Based Joint & Crack 

Seal. Pgk/pallet
0.00000 LB 2.290000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Methyl Methacrylate Concrete Crack Sealers, 

Pkg/jug
0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid - Crafco does not manufacture this type of product.

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Methyl Methacrylate Concrete Crack 

Sealers,  Pkg/pail
0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid - Crafco does not manufacture this type of product.

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 Methyl Methacrylate Concrete Crack 

Sealers,  Pkg/drum
0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid - Crafco does not manufacture this type of product.

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 HMWM Concrete Crack Sealer, Pkg/pails 0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid - Crafco does not manufacture this type of product.

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 HMWM Concrete Crack Sealer, Pkg/drum 0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid - Crafco does not manufacture this type of product.

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 HMWM Concrete Crack Sealer, Pkg/tote 0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid - Crafco does not manufacture this type of product.

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 Water-Based Dual-Crystalline Conc/Mason 

Seal, Pkg/jug
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid - Crafco does not manufacture this type of product.

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 Water-Based Dual-Crystalline Conc/Mason 

Seal, Pkg/pail
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid - Crafco does not manufacture this type of product.

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 Water-Based Dual-Crystalline Conc/Mason 

Seal, Pkg/drum
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid - Crafco does not manufacture this type of product.

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 Water-Based Dual-Crystalline Conc/Mason 

Seal, Pkg/tote
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid - Crafco does not manufacture this type of product.

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 Geosynthetic Materials,  Packaged as 

individual rolls
0.00000 SF   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30121900    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid - Crafco does not manufacture this type of product.

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 High-Strength Non-Shrink Concrete Patch, 

Pkg/0.5 CU FT Kit
0.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid - Crafco does not manufacture this type of product.

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 High-Strength Non-Shrink Concrete Patch, 

Pkg/1.0 CU FT Kit
0.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid - Crafco does not manufacture this type of product.

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.



Date Printed: Oct 29, 2025 Page: 6 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 High-Strength Non-Shrink Concrete Patch, 

Pkg/5.0 CU FT Kit
0.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid - Crafco does not manufacture this type of product.

Extended Description:
See Pricing Page Attachment A (ATT A) for actual price.
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Repair Products for Bridges Roads - Supplemental 

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Instructions:

Vendor Name: CRAFCO, INC.

Contract 

Item # Contract Item Description

Vendor's Billing System Description 

(Section 4.2.5)*

Unit Of 

Measure Bid Price

1
Cold-Poured Joint & Crack Sealant, 

Packaged as individual jug
NO BID GL $

2
Cold-Poured Joint & Crack Sealant,

Packaged as drum
NO BID GL $

3
Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Sealant (ASTM D6690, Type I & II), 

Packaged as carton/cardboard box/meltable container
ROADSAVER 221 LB $0.51

4
Hot-Poured Aggregate-Filled Repair Materials (ASTM D8260), 

Packaged as cardboard box/meltable container
MASTIC ONE LB $0.53

5
Hot-Poured Aggregate-Filled Repair Materials (ASTM D8260), 

Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
MASTIC ONE LB $0.53

6
Hot-Poured Non-Asphalt-Based Joint & Crack Sealant, 

Packaged as meltable containers.
ROADSAVER 960 GRAY LB $2.29

7
Hot-Poured Non-Asphalt-Based Joint & Crack Sealant, 

Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
ROADSAVER 960 GRAY LB $2.29

Please provide a price for all Contract Items listed below.  Vendor may bid on any or all Contract Items.  Only MCS&T Qualified Purchase Order Materials (QPOM) list 

products may be bid on this supplemental. This is a multiple vendor award contract.  Vendor shall include delivery cost to any WVDOH location statewide within their bid 

price per unit.  No separate delivery charge will be permitted.  The Contract Item Description includes intended purchase method to indicate individual or bulk purchases, but 

the actual bid price should be broken down into the smallest unit of measure, as indicated in the Unit of Measure column.  Estimated purchase quantities are not available.  

No future use of the Contract or any individual item is guaranteed or implied.  

ATT A - Pricing Page Page 1 of 2 6626C009



Repair Products for Bridges Roads - Supplemental 

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Contract 

Item # Contract Item Description

Vendor's Billing System Description 

(Section 4.2.5)*

Unit Of 

Measure Bid Price

8
Methyl Methacrylate Concrete Crack Sealers, 

Packaged as jug
NO BID LB $

9
Methyl Methacrylate Concrete Crack Sealers, 

Packaged as bucket
NO BID LB $

10
Methyl Methacrylate Concrete Crack Sealers, 

Packaged as a drum
NO BID LB $

11
High Molecular Weight Methacrylate (HMWM) Concrete Crack Sealers, 

Packaged as individual pails
NO BID LB $

12
High Molecular Weight Methacrylate (HMWM) Concrete Crack Sealers, 

Packaged as drum
NO BID LB $

13
High Molecular Weight Methacrylate (HMWM) Concrete Crack Sealers, 

Packaged as tote
NO BID LB $

14
Water-Based Dual-Crystalline Concrete and Masonry Sealers, 

Packaged as individual jug 
NO BID GL $

15
Water-Based Dual-Crystalline Concrete and Masonry Sealers, 

Packaged as a pail
NO BID GL $

16
Water-Based Dual-Crystalline Concrete and Masonry Sealers, 

Packaged as drum
NO BID GL $

17
Water-Based Dual-Crystalline Concrete and Masonry Sealers, 

Packaged as tote
NO BID GL $

18
Geosynthetic Materials, 

Packaged as individual rolls
NO BID SF $

19
High-Strength Non-Shrink Concrete Patching Materials, 

Packaged as 0.5 CU FT Kit
NO BID EA $

20
High-Strength Non-Shrink Concrete Patching Materials, 

Packaged as 1.0 CU FT Kit
NO BID EA $

21
High-Strength Non-Shrink Concrete Patching Materials, 

Packaged as 5.0 CU FT Kit
NO BID EA $

NOTE:  Any Non-QPOM product listed above will be Disqualified.

ATT A - Pricing Page Page 2 of 2 6626C009



©2022, Crafco, Inc. All Rights Reserved 
 

GENERAL 
Crafco RoadSaver 221 sealant is a hot-applied asphalt-based product used to seal and fill cracks and joints in asphalt or Portland cement 
concrete pavements in hot to cold climates. RoadSaver 221 is supplied in solid form which when melted and properly applied forms a resilient, 
adhesive, and flexible compound that resists cracking in the winter and is resistant to flow and pick-up at summer temperatures. RoadSaver 
221 is used in highways, streets, and airfield pavements and is applied to pavement cracks and joints using either pressure feed Melter 
applicators or pour pots. At application temperature RoadSaver 221 is a free flowing, self-leveling product. RoadSaver 221 is a widely used, 
excellent performing sealant that has been a quality Crafco product for over 30 years. VOC = 0 g/l. 

 
 

SPECIFICATION CONFORMANCE  
RoadSaver 221 meets all requirements of ASTM D6690 (AASHTO M324), Type II, “Joint and Crack Sealants, Hot-Applied, for Concrete and 
Asphalt Pavements”, (formerly ASTM D3405 and AASHTO M301). It also exceeds requirements of ASTM D6690 (AASHTO M324), Type I, 
(formerly ASTM D1190, AASHTO M173), and Federal Specification SS-S-164. 

 
ASTM D6690 (AASHTO M324) 

Test              Type II Spec. Limits  
Cone Penetration      90 max.    . 
Softening Point      176 °F (80 °C) min. 
Resilience      60% min.  
Bond, -20 °F (-29 °C), 50% ext.    Pass 3 cycles  
Asphalt Compatibility      Compatible  
Minimum Application Temperature   380 °F (193 °C)  
Maximum Heating Temperature  400 °F (204 °C)   

 
 

INSTALLATION      
The unit weight of Crafco RoadSaver 221 is 10.5 lbs. per gallon (1.26 kg/L) at 60 °F (15.5 °C). Prior to use, the user must read and follow 
Installation Instructions for Hot-Applied RoadSaver, PolyFlex, Parking Lot and Asphalt Rubber Products to verify proper product selection, 
heating methods, pavement preparation procedures, application geometry, usage precautions and safety procedures. These instructions are 
provided with each pallet of product. 
 
 

PACKAGING   
Product is supplied in either cardboard boxes, or in meltable boxless packaging. Both package types are labeled in accordance with OSHA, 
GHS, and specification requirements; are sold by net weight; are interlock stacked on 48 x 40 in. (122 x 102 cm) 4-way pallets; can be stored 
outside; and are covered with a weather resistant pallet cover and 2 layers of UV protected stretch wrap. 
o BOX packaging consists of cardboard boxes containing 30 lbs. (13.6 kg) of product with 75 boxes per pallet, weighing approximately 

2250 lbs. (1020 kg). Boxes contain a quick melting release film for easy removal and are taped closed, without any staples. 
o Meltable packaging consists of approximately 30 lbs. (13.6 kg) completely meltable packages that are interlocked stacked on pallets. To 

use, the pallet wrap is removed, and individual blocks are placed in the Melter. There are no individual cardboard boxes to open, empty, 
handle, or dispose of. Meltable packaging quickly melts into the product without affecting specification conformance. Meltable packaged 
sealant products are sold by the pallet only and individual packages are not intended for sale. For more details on meltable packaging go 
to https://crafco.com/materials-documentation/ 

 
 
WARRANTY  
CRAFCO, Inc. warrants that CRAFCO products meet applicable ASTM, AASHTO, Federal or State specifications at time of shipment. 
Techniques used for the preparation of the cracks and joints prior to sealing or filling are beyond our control as are the use and application of 
the products; therefore, Crafco shall not be responsible for improperly applied or misused products. Remedies against Crafco, Inc., as agreed 
to by Crafco, are limited to replacing nonconforming product or refund (full or partial) of purchase price from Crafco, Inc. All claims for breach 
of this warranty must be made within three (3) months of the date of use or twelve (12) months from the date of delivery by Crafco, Inc. 
whichever is earlier. There shall be no other warranties expressed or implied. For optimum performance, follow Crafco recommendations 
for product installation. 

 
  
 6165 W Detroit St. • Chandler AZ 85226 
 +1 (602) 276-0406 • +1 (800) 528-8242 • FAX +1 (480) 961-0513 
 www.crafco.com 

Product Data Sheet 
ROADSAVER 221 
PART NO. 34221   

                                                                                         
DECEMBER  2022 

READ BEFORE USING THIS PRODUCT 

https://crafco.com/materials-documentation/


©2020, Crafco, Inc. #A1284 
 

 
  
 6165 W Detroit St. • Chandler AZ 85226 
 +1 (602) 276-0406 • +1 (800) 528-8242 • FAX +1 (480) 961-0513 
 www.crafco.com 

PRODUCT DATA SHEET 

MASTIC ONE  
PART NO. 33339     

                                                                            March 2020 

READ BEFORE USING THIS PRODUCT 
 
GENERAL   Mastic One is a hot-applied, pourable, aggregate filled, black color, polymer modified asphalt pavement repair mastic. M a s t i c  
O n e  c o m p l i e s  w i t h  A S T M  D 8 2 6 0  T y p e  I .  Mastic One is used for sealing, filling and repairing many distresses in both asphalt 
concrete and portland cement concrete pavements and bridge deck surfaces that are larger than those typically repaired by crack or joint 
sealing, but smaller than repairs requiring remove and replace patching procedures. Typical uses include sealing, filling and leveling of wide 
transverse or longitudinal cracks and joints, filling potholes and utility cuts, localized skin patch repairs, repairs prior to surface treatments, and 
leveling bridge approaches or faulted areas. When properly applied, Mastic One forms a well-bonded, flexible, durable, traffic resistant repair. 
To use, Mastic One is placed into an appropriate melter (Crafco Patcher units), mixed and heated until application temperature is reached, 
poured into the prepared repair area and then leveled. Mastic One is formulated   to provide neat feathered edge installation. Mastic One is 
then ready for traffic when it has cooled and solidified. VOC = 0 g/l. 

 PROPERTIES  Properties of the binder, aggregate and blended and heated Mastic One according to ASTM D8260 are as follows: 
 

Property       Requirement 
 
POLYMER MODIFIED BINDER 

  Cone Penetration, 77°F (25°C) (ASTM D5329)               60 max 
Cone Penetration,122°F (50°C) (ASTM D5329)               120 max 
Softening Point, (ASTM D36)                    200°F (93°C) min 
Flexibility, 1″ (25.4 mm), 180°, 10 sec) (ASTM D3111 modified)  Pass at 32°F (0°C) 

  
AGGREGATE    

         Abrasion Resistance (ASTM C131)      35% max  
 

 
BLENDED PRODUCT 

Flexibility, 32°F (0°C) (ASTM D5329)            Pass     
Adhesion, 77°F (25°C) (ASTM D5329)               25 PSI (172 KPA) min 
Specific Gravity      1.7 -2.0 
Minimum Application Temperature     375°F (190°C) * 
Maximum Application Temperature     400°F (204°C)  
 
 

Test ASTM D8260 Type I Specification Limits 
Mastic Resilience (ASTM (8260) 50% minimum 

Effects of Rapid Deformation (ASTM D2794) (-7℃) 3 passing specimens no chipping, cracking or separation 8 N-m 
Crack Bridging (ASTM C1305 modified) (-7℃) Pass 3 cycles 

Mastic Stability (ASTM D8260) (70℃) 40.0 mm maximum 
 
 

    *Refer to installation instructions if working on sloped pavements or repairing larger defects 
 
INSTALLATION     The density of Mastic One is 116 pcf (+/- 3%) and the weight per gallon is 15.5 lbs./gal (1.86 kg/l) at 60°F (15.5°C). Prior to 
use, the user must read and follow Installation Instructions for Mastic One to verify proper product selection, heating methods, pavement 
preparation procedures, application geometry, usage precautions and safety procedures. These instructions are available at www.crafco.com 
and provided with each pallet of Mastic One. 
PACKAGING Mastic One is supplied in either cardboard boxes, or in meltable, boxless PLEXI-melt packaging. Each package contains 
premeasured polymer modified binder and aggregate.   Both package types are labeled in accordance with OSHA, GHS, and specification 
requirements; are sold by net weight; are interlock stacked on 48 x 40 in. (122 x102 cm)  4-way pallets; can be stored outside; and are 
covered with a weather resistant pallet cover and 2 layers of UV protected stretch wrap. 
o BOX packaging consists of cardboard boxes containing approximately 40 lb. (18.1 kg) of product with 60 boxes per pallet, weighing 

approximately 2400 lb. (1088 kg).   Boxes contain a quick melting release film for easy removal and are taped closed, without any staples. 
o PLEXI-melt packaging consists of 30 lb. (13.6 kg) blocks of product with 70 packages per pallet, weighing 2100 lb. (952 kg). To use, the 

pallet wrap is removed, and individual blocks are placed in the melter.  There are no cardboard boxes or other cardboard components to 
open, empty, handle, or dispose of.  PLEXI-melt packaging quickly melts into the product without affecting specification conformance.     

 

WARRANTY CRAFCO, Inc. warrants that CRAFCO products meet applicable ASTM, AASHTO, Federal or State specifications at time of 
shipment.  Techniques used for the preparation of the cracks and joints prior to sealing or filling are beyond our control as are the use and 
application of the products; therefore, Crafco shall not be responsible for improperly applied or misused products.  Remedies against Crafco, 
Inc., as agreed to by Crafco, are limited to replacing nonconforming product or refund (full or partial) of purchase price from Crafco, Inc.  All 
claims for breach of this warranty must be made within three (3) months of the date of use or twelve (12) months from the date of delivery by 
Crafco, Inc. whichever is earlier.  There shall be no other warranties expressed or implied.  For optimum performance, follow Crafco 
recommendations for product installation. 

http://www.crafco.com/


© 2021 Crafco, Inc. All Rights Reserved 

 
   
6165 W Detroit St. • Chandler AZ 85226 
  +1 (602) 276-0406 • +1 (800) 528-8242 • FAX +1 (480) 961-0513  
www.crafco.com 

PRODUCT DATA SHEET 

ROADSAVER 960 GRAY SEALANT 
PART NO. 34960   
                                                                                                       APRIL 2022 

READ BEFORE USING THIS PRODUCT 
GENERAL    

Crafco RoadSaver 960 Gray Sealant is a gray colored, hot applied, single component, elastically modified composition of non-asphaltic 
ingredients and modifiers used to fill cracks and joints in asphalt and Portland cement concrete pavements. RoadSaver 960 Gray Sealant is 
supplied in powder/granular form in meltable bags which when melted and properly applied forms an adhesive and flexible compound that resists 
cracking in the winter and is resistant to flow at summer temperatures. RoadSaver 960 Gray Sealant is used in highway, street, and airfield 
pavements where the gray color is desired.   VOC=0 g/l.
 
SPECIFICATION CONFORMANCE  

Crafco RoadSaver 960 Gray Sealant meets all requirements of ASTM D6690 (AASHTO M324), Type I, “Joint and Crack Sealants, 
Hot-applied, for Concrete and Asphalt Pavements”. 
 

Test     ASTM D6690, AASHTO M324 Type I Spec. Limits  
Cone Penetration at 77 °F (25 °C) (ASTM D5329)  90 units max  
Softening Point (ASTM D36)    176 °F (80 °C) minimum   
Bond, non-immersed, 0 °F (-18 °C), 50% ext.   Pass 5 cycles   
Asphalt Compatibility (ASTM D5329)   Pass 
Maximum Heating Temperature    400 °F (204 °C) 
Minimum Application Temperature           380 °F (193 °C) 
  

  

INSTALLATION       
The unit weight of Crafco RoadSaver 960 Gray Sealant is 11.3 lbs. per gallon (1.35 kg/L) at 60 °F (15.5 °C). Prior to use, the user 

must read and follow Installation Instructions for Hot-Applied RoadSaver, PolyFlex, Parking Lot and Asphalt Rubber Products to verify proper 
product selection, heating methods, pavement preparation procedures, application geometry, usage precautions and safety procedures. 
RoadSaver 960 Gray Sealant can only be reheated one time after initial heating and shall not be maintained at maximum heating temperature 
for more than 8 hours. These instructions are provided with each pallet of product.  
 
PACKAGING  

Product is supplied in meltable bags each containing 35 +/- 2 lbs. (15.8 +/- 1 kg) of product with 60 bags per pallet. Bags are stacked 
and stretch wrapped on pallets containing approximately 2100 lbs. (953 kg). To use, the pallet wrap is removed, and individual bags are placed 
in Melter. There are no cardboard boxes or other components to open, empty, handle or dispose of. The bag melts into the product without 
affecting specification conformance.   
 
WARRANTY  

CRAFCO, Inc. warrants that CRAFCO products meet applicable ASTM, AASHTO, Federal or State specifications at time of shipment.  
Techniques used for the preparation of the cracks and joints prior to sealing or filling are beyond our control as are the use and application of 
the products; therefore, Crafco shall not be responsible for improperly applied or misused products.  Remedies against Crafco, Inc., as agreed 
to by Crafco, are limited to replacing nonconforming product or refund (full or partial) of purchase price from Crafco, Inc.  All claims for breach 
of this warranty must be made within three (3) months of the date of use or twelve (12) months from the date of delivery by Crafco, Inc. whichever 
is earlier.  There shall be no other warranties expressed or implied.  For optimum performance, follow Crafco recommendations for product 
installation 


	CoverSheet
	Screenshot 2025-10-29 145402
	seckmanch2_1132916_SR_0803_ESR10152500000002592_1
	3
	4
	5
	6
	7



