West Virginia

Purchasing Division

The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
wWVOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West Virginia’s
procurement process, and to maintain the
transparency of the bid-opening process, this
documentation submitted online is publicly posted
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses
to this solicitation submitted to the Purchasing
Division in hard copy format.
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Procurement Folder: 13385023 S0 Doc Code: CRFQ
Procurement Type: Central Master Agreement S0 Dept: 0313
Vendor ID: 000000174221 $| S0 Doc ID: DEP2600000024
Legal Name: FONDRIEST ENVIRONMENTAL INC FUDRshad Date: ARz
Alias/DBA: Close Date: 3/5/26
Total Bid: $99,700.00 Clone. Fime: 130
Response Date: 02/18/2026 Status: Closed
L Solicitation Description: Maintenance and Repair for Y51 Water
Response Time: 45028 Quality Meters -
4 Responded By User ID: LizFondriest & Total of Header Attachments: 0
First Name: Liz Total of All Attachments: 0
4
Last Name: Fondriest
L
Email: Liz@fondriest.com
Phone: 937-4256-2151
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Proc Folder: 1885023

Solicitation Description: Maintenance and Repair for YSI Water Quality Meters

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement
Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2026-03-05 13:30 SR 0313 ESR02182600000004939 1
VENDOR
000000174281

FONDRIEST ENVIRONMENTAL INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0313 DEP2600000024
Total Bid: 99700 Response Date: 2026-02-18
Comments:

Response Time: 15:08:44

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Joseph (Josh) E Hager llI

(304) 558-2306

joseph.e.hagerii@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X FEIN#

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Maintenance & Repair Service - Item 3.1.7.1  300.0000C HOUR 299.000000 89700.00
YSI
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
81112201

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
Reference Specification 3.1.5
For bidding purposes only please provide an hourly rate: Estimated quantity is 300 hours.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Parts Mark Up - Item 3.2.11 YSI 10000.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

81112201

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

Parts Multiplier based on $10,000.00 for bidding purposes only.
Reference Specification 3.1.11. Vendor should enter total cost of $10,000 plus markup.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Maintenance & Repair Service - Item 3.1.7.2  300.0000C HOUR
In-Situ
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
81112201

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Reference Specification 3.1.5
For bidding purposes only please provide an hourly rate: Estimated quantity is 300 hours.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Parts Mark Up - Item 3.2.11 - In-Situ

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

81112201

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Parts Multiplier based on $10,000.00 for bidding purposes only.
Reference Specification 3.1.11. Vendor should enter total cost of $10,000 plus markup.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Maintenance & Repair Service - Item 3.1.7.3  300.0000C HOUR
Onset
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
81112201
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Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Reference Specification 3.1.5
For bidding purposes only please provide an hourly rate: Estimated quantity is 300 hours.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Parts Mark Up - Item 3.2.11 - Onset

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

81112201

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Parts Multiplier based on $10,000.00 for bidding purposes only.
Reference Specification 3.1.11. Vendor should enter total cost of $10,000 plus markup.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Maintenance & Repair Service - Item 3.1.7.3  300.0000C HOUR
HOBO
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
81112201

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Reference Specification 3.1.5
For bidding purposes only please provide an hourly rate: Estimated quantity is 300 hours.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Parts Mark Up - Item 3.2.11 - HOBO

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

81112201

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Parts Multiplier based on $10,000.00 for bidding purposes only.
Reference Specification 3.1.11. Vendor should enter total cost of $10,000 plus markup.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Maintenance & Repair Service - Item 3.1.7.4  300.0000C HOUR
Hatch
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
81112201

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:

Reference Specification 3.1.5

For bidding purposes only please provide an hourly rate: Estimated quantity is 300 hours.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 Parts Mark Up - Item 3.2.11 - HATCH
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

81112201

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Parts Multiplier based on $10,000.00 for bidding purposes only.
Reference Specification 3.1.11. Vendor should enter total cost of $10,000 plus markup.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 Maintenance & Repair Service - Item 3.1.7.4  300.0000C HOUR
OTT Hydromet
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
81112201

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Reference Specification 3.1.5
For bidding purposes only please provide an hourly rate: Estimated quantity is 300 hours.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 Parts Mark Up - Item 3.2.11 - OTT Hydromet

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

81112201

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Parts Multiplier based on $10,000.00 for bidding purposes only.
Reference Specification 3.1.11. Vendor should enter total cost of $10,000 plus markup.
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