
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1690777

Solicitation Description: Roadway Salt - Sodium Chloride 6625C016

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2025-06-17 13:30 SR 0803 ESR06172500000007628 1

VENDOR

000000167452
MORTON SALT INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2500000073

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2025-06-17 Response Time: 10:00:07

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep
304-558-2566
john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Roadway Salt - Sodium Chloride - DELIVERY 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161506    

Commodity Line Comments: See Exhibit A attachment for pricing

Extended Description:
Delivery of roadway salt by Vendor to WVDOH Agency delivery locations, as specified on the ATT A Pricing Pages.
VENDOR NOTE:  Bid evaluation is based ATT A Pricing Page submissions.  Price entries or other notations made in the wvOASIS commodity 
lines description will not be considered for bid evaluation.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Roadway Salt - Sodium Chloride - PICK-UP 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161506    

Commodity Line Comments: See Exhibit A attachment for pricing

Extended Description:
Pick-Up of roadway salt by a WVDOH Agency from a Vendor's source site.
VENDOR NOTE:  Bid evaluation is based ATT A Pricing Page submissions.  Price entries or other notations made in the wvOASIS commodity 
lines description will not be considered for bid evaluation.







I, Kris Warner, Secretary of State of the State of 
West Virginia, hereby certify that

MORTON SALT, INC.

 a corporation formed under the laws of Delaware filed an application to be registered as 
a foreign corporation authorizing it to transact business in West Virginia.  The 
application was found to conform to law and a “Certificate of Authority” was issued by 
the West Virginia Secretary of State on August 04, 2010.

 I further certify that the corporation has not been revoked by the State of West Virginia 
nor has a Certificate of Withdrawal been issued to the corporation by the West Virginia 
Secretary of State.

 Accordingly, I hereby issue this Certificate of Authorization

CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORIZATION

February 10, 2025

Validation ID:6WV32_TH8E6

Notice: A certificate issued electronically from the West Virginia Secretary of State's Web site is fully and immediately valid and effective.  However, as an option, the issuance and validity of a certificate obtained electronically may 
be established by visiting the Certificate Validation Page of the Secretary of State's Web site, https://apps.wv.gov/sos/businessentitysearch/validate.aspx entering the validation ID displayed on the certificate, and following the 

instructions displayed.  Confirming the issuance of a certificate is merely optional and is not necessary to the valid and effective issuance of a certificate.

































Vendor Name:

Sodum Chloride Invoice/Billing Description (Delivery):

County Delivery Site Designation

Estimated 
Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 
(cost per ton)

Clinton @ WV85 1,300
Rock Creek 3,250
Seth 970

5,520 $94.79
Widen Road & CR 11 2,500
Maysel 230

2,730 $100.95
Chelyan 1,950
Elkview 2,850
North Charleston 2,850
St. Albans 3,250
I-64 @ Rt. 119 and Penn. Avenue 1,570
I-77 @ Sissonville 1,450
I-79 @ Amma 1,450
Corridor G @ Alum Creek 1,950

17,320 No Bid
Glenwood 650
Pt. Pleasant @ Fairground Rd. 6,550
Pt. Pleasant @ Jackson Ave. 70

7,270 No Bid
Red House 650
Hurricane @ Rt. 34 3,250
I-64 @ Scary Creek 1,300

5,200 $86.87

38,040DISTRICT 1 TOTAL 

Putnam County Total Estimated 

Mason County Total Estimated 

Morton Salt, Inc.

F140020000Z Bulk Safe-T-Salt

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6625C016
Attachment A Pricing Pages

 District 1 - Delivery

INSTRUCTIONS:  Vendor may provide a price per ton for the delivery of Roadway Salt to any or all counties listed below 
and shall not add, delete, or modify a column or row header, description, unit of measure, or estimated quantity. 

Vendor should list its description for the delivery of Sodium Chloride, as it will be shown on WVDOH billing/invoices.  
Providing this information will expedite WVDOH invoice payment processes.

EXH A - "WVDOH Delivery Site & Contact Listings" contains detailed location and contact information for delivery sites 
listed below.

Mason

Kanawha

Clay

Boone

Kanawha County Total Estimated 

Clay County Total Estimated 

Boone County Total Estimated

DISTRICT 1

Putnam

District 1 - Delivery Page 1 of 11 6625C016 - ATT A



Vendor Name:

Sodum Chloride Invoice/Billing Description (Delivery):

County Delivery Site Designation

Estimated 
Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 
(cost per ton)

Barboursville / Cabell Co. HQ 3,500
Huntington I-64 Section 1 1,800
Huntington 31st Bridge 500
Huntington 17th St. Bridge 0

5,800 $82.71
West Hamlin 2,500
Yawkey 1,000
Harts 1,200

4,700 $86.78
Corridor G @ Chapmanville 2,500
Wilkinson Substation 1,500
Man Substation 800
Hickory Lane 4,000

8,800 $93.23
Corridor G @ Miller's Creek, Bldg #03011 1,000
Mingo Cty @Miller's Creek, Bldg #03025 2,000
Gilbert Substation 750
Mingo 119 South 1,000

4,750 $92.42
Pritchard Substation 6,000
Wayne County Headquarters 2,000
Crum Substation 900
Heartland Intermodal Gateway 0

8,900 $83.16

32,950DISTRICT 2 TOTAL 

Cabell County Total Estimated  

Lincoln County Total Estimated

Logan County Total Estimated

Mingo County Total Estimated

Wayne County Total Estimated

Wayne

Mingo

Logan

Lincoln

INSTRUCTIONS:  Vendor may provide a price per ton for the delivery of Roadway Salt to any or all counties listed 
below and shall not add, delete, or modify a column or row header, description, unit of measure, or estimated quantity. 

Vendor should list its description for the delivery of Sodium Chloride, as it will be shown on WVDOH billing/invoices.  
Providing this information will expedite WVDOH invoice payment processes.

EXH A - "WVDOH Delivery Site & Contact Listings" contains detailed location and contact information for delivery 
sites listed below.

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6625C016
Attachment A Pricing Pages

 District 2 - Delivery

DISTRICT 2

Cabell

Morton Salt, Inc.

F140020000Z Bulk Safe-T-Salt

District 2 - Delivery Page 2 of 11 6625C016 - ATT A



Vendor Name:

Sodum Chloride Invoice/Billing Description (Delivery):

County Delivery Site Designation

Estimated 
Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 
(cost per ton)

Calhoun Millstone 3,400

3,400 No Bid
Ripley / Jackson Co. HQ 1,900
I-77 @ Medina 1,400

3,300 No Bid
Pleasants Belmont 1,800

1,800 No Bid
APD Pennsboro 4,100
Ellenboro / Harrisville Substation 100
Corridor D @ Nutter Farm 275
Smithville Substation 350

4,825 No Bid
Lefthand @ WV 36 450
Ambler Ridge Substation @ US 119 400
Roane County HQ 1,500

2,350 No Bid
Wirt Elizabeth Substation 1,100

1,100 No Bid
Parkersburg @ Rt. 95S 3,900
I-77 @ Parkersburg 1,700
Corridor D @ Riverhill 550

6,150 No Bid

22,925DISTRICT 3 TOTAL 

Calhoun County Total Estimated

Jackson County Total Estimated

Pleasants County Total Estimated

Ritchie County Total Estimated

Roane County Total Estimated

Wood

Roane

Ritchie

Jackson

Wirt County Total Estimated

Wood County Total Estimated

INSTRUCTIONS:  Vendor may provide a price per ton for the delivery of Roadway Salt to any or all counties listed below and 
shall not add, delete, or modify a column or row header, description, unit of measure, or estimated quantity. 

Vendor should list its description for the delivery of Sodium Chloride, as it will be shown on WVDOH billing/invoices.  Providing 
this information will expedite WVDOH invoice payment processes.

EXH A - "WVDOH Delivery Site & Contact Listings" contains detailed location and contact information for delivery sites listed 
below.

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6625C016
Attachment A Pricing Pages

 District 3 - Delivery

DISTRICT 3

Morton Salt, Inc.

F140020000Z Bulk Safe-T-Salt

District 3 - Delivery Page 3 of 11 6625C016 - ATT A



Vendor Name:

Sodum Chloride Invoice/Billing Description (Delivery):

County Delivery Site Designation

Estimated 
Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 
(cost per ton)

Doddridge West Union 1,200

1,200 No Bid
Harrison Co. HQ 5,000
Saltwell 600
Lost Creek Substation 1,000
Tunnel Hill Substation 1,000

7,600 No Bid
Marion Co. HQ 1,500
Mannington Substation 1,000

2,500 $86.79
Goshen Rd. Substation 1,500
Monongalia Co. HQ 5,000
Pentress Substation 500

7,000 No Bid
Bruceton Mills Substation 7,000
Preston Co. HQ 1,000
Terra Alta Substation 1,000
Fellowsville Substation 800
Aurora Substation 1,000
Cooper's Rock Substation 1,500

12,300 No Bid
Taylor Taylor Co. HQ 1,500

1,500 $82.10

32,100DISTRICT 4 TOTAL

Doddridge County Total Estimated 

Harrison County Total Estimated 

Marion County Total Estimated

Monongalia County Total Estimated

Preston County Total Estimated

Taylor County Total Estimated

Preston

Monongalia

Marion

Harrison

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6625C016
 Attachment A Pricing Pages

 District 4 - Delivery

DISTRICT 4

INSTRUCTIONS:  Vendor may provide a price per ton for the delivery of Roadway Salt to any or all counties 
listed below and shall not add, delete, or modify a column or row header, description, unit of measure, or 
estimated quantity. 

Vendor should list its description for the delivery of Sodium Chloride, as it will be shown on WVDOH 
billing/invoices.  Providing this information will expedite WVDOH invoice payment processes.

EXH A - "WVDOH Delivery Site & Contact Listings" contains detailed location and contact information for 
delivery sites listed below.

Morton Salt, Inc.

F140020000Z or F140010000Z Bulk Safe-T-Salt

District 4 - Delivery Page 4 of 11 6625C016 - ATT A



Vendor Name:

Sodum Chloride Invoice/Billing Description (Delivery):

County Delivery Site Designation

Estimated 
Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 
(cost per ton)

Martinsburg Headquarters - 0571 Storage Bldg 1,000
Berkeley County Headquarters 1,000
Tabler Station - 0502 Storage Bldg 500

2,500 No Bid
Grant Co. HQ 1,000
Mt. Storm Substation 800
Corridor H @ Knobley Road 1,200

3,000 No Bid
Hampshire Co. HQ 800
Capon Bridge Substation 500
Slanesville 400

1,700 No Bid
Hardy Co. HQ 800
Baker Substation 800

1,600 $108.77
Jefferson County Headquarters - 0519 Storage Bldg 1,200
9/340 Expressway Headquarters - 0564 Storage Bldg 1,200

2,400 $82.79
Mineral Co. HQ 700
Skyline Substation 500
Short Gap Substation 400
District 5 HQ 100

1,700 $105.66
Morgan Co. HQ 700
Largent Substation 400

1,100 $94.90

14,000

Hampshire County Total Estimated

Morton Salt, Inc.

F140010000Z Bulk Safe-T-Salt

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6625C016
Attachment A Pricing Pages

 District 5 - Delivery

DISTRICT 5

Hampshire

Grant

Berkeley

Berkeley County Total Estimated

Grant  County Total Estimated

INSTRUCTIONS:  Vendor may provide a price per ton for the delivery of Roadway Salt to any or all counties listed below and shall not 
add, delete, or modify a column or row header, description, unit of measure, or estimated quantity. 

Vendor should list its description for the delivery of Sodium Chloride, as it will be shown on WVDOH billing/invoices.  Providing this 
information will expedite WVDOH invoice payment processes.

EXH A - "WVDOH Delivery Site & Contact Listings" contains detailed location and contact information for delivery sites listed below.

DISTRICT 5 TOTAL

Morgan

Mineral

Jefferson

Hardy

Morgan County Total Estimated

Hardy County Total Estimated

Jefferson  County Estimated Total Estimated

Mineral County Total Estimated

District 5 - Delivery Page 5 of 11 6625C016 - ATT A



Vendor Name:

Sodum Chloride Invoice/Billing Description (Delivery):

County Delivery Site Designation

Estimated 
Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 
(cost per ton)

Brooke County HQ 4,500
US 22 Substation 1,500

6,000 $78.06
Hancock Hancock County HQ 1,000

1,000 $73.19
Marshall Co. HQ 700
Lynn Camp Substation 200
Cameron Substation 500
Sand Hill Substation 150

1,550 $88.25
Ohio Co. HQ 1,500
I-70 Interstate HQ 800

2,300 $79.16
Tyler Co. HQ 2,500
Centerville Substation 400

2,900 $76.24
Wetzel Co. HQ 800
Pine Grove Substation 300
Hundred Substation 500

1,600 No Bid

15,350

Ohio County Total Estimated

DISTRICT 6 TOTAL

Wetzel

Tyler

Ohio

Marshall

Marshall County Total Estimated

Tyler County Total Estimated

Wetzel County Total Estimated

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6625C016
Attachment A Pricing Pages

 District 6 - Delivery

DISTRICT 6

Brooke

Brooke County Total  Estimated 

Hancock County Total Estimated

INSTRUCTIONS:  Vendor may provide a price per ton for the delivery of Roadway Salt to any or all counties listed 
below and shall not add, delete, or modify a column or row header, description, unit of measure, or estimated quantity. 

Vendor should list its description for the delivery of Sodium Chloride, as it will be shown on WVDOH billing/invoices.  
Providing this information will expedite WVDOH invoice payment processes.

EXH A - "WVDOH Delivery Site & Contact Listings" contains detailed location and contact information for delivery sites 
listed below.

Morton Salt, Inc.

F140020000Z or F140010000Z Bulk Safe-T-Salt

District 6 - Delivery Page 6 of 11 6625C016 - ATT A



Vendor Name:

Sodum Chloride Invoice/Billing Description (Delivery):

County Delivery Site Designation
Estimated 
Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 
(cost per ton)

Barbour Co HQ-Shaw Field 500
Belington Substation (000113) 500

1,000 No Bid
Braxton County HQ (000444) 700
Heaters Substation (000431) 500
Coon Knob Substation (000405) 1100
Burnsville Substation (000432) 1300

3,600 No Bid
Gilmer Gilmer County HQ (001110) 600

600 No Bid
Lewis County HQ (002108) 1100
APD (Weston Mudlick)  (002187) 800

1,900 No Bid
Clow Lot/Upshur County HQ (004912) 2300
Kanawha Head 600

2,900 $89.64
Cherry Falls 400
RT 20/Cowen Substation (005110) 0
Webster County HQ @ Bolair 500
Hacker Valley Substation (005120) 100

1,000 No Bid

11,000DISTRICT 7 TOTAL

Barbour County Total Estimated

Braxton County Total Estimated

Gilmer County Total Estimated

Lewis County Total Estimated

Upshur County Total Estimated

Webster County Total Estimated

Webster

Lewis

Braxton

Upshur

Barbour

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6625C016
Attachment A Pricing Pages

 District 7 - Delivery

DISTRICT 7

INSTRUCTIONS:  Vendor may provide a price per ton for the delivery of Roadway Salt to any or all counties listed below and shall not 
add, delete, or modify a column or row header, description, unit of measure, or estimated quantity. 

Vendor should list its description for the delivery of Sodium Chloride, as it will be shown on WVDOH billing/invoices.  Providing this 
information will expedite WVDOH invoice payment processes.

EXH A - "WVDOH Delivery Site & Contact Listings" contains detailed location and contact information for delivery sites listed below.

Morton Salt, Inc.

F140020000Z or F140010000Z Bulk Safe-T-Salt

District 7 - Delivery Page 7 of 11 6625C016 - ATT A



Vendor Name:

Sodum Chloride Invoice/Billing Description (Delivery):

County Delivery Site Designation

Estimated 
Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 
(cost per ton)

Franklin, 220 North 400
Judy Gap Substation 350
Brandywine Stockpile 200
Sugar Grove Substation 150
Onego Stockpile 300
Franklin Rt. 220 South Lot 200

1,600 No Bid
Pocahontas County HQ 850
Seebert Stockpile 650
Green Bank Substation 450
Bartow Lot 400
Snowshoe Stockpile 100
Slaty Fork Stockpile 400

2,850 No Bid
Randolph Co. HQ 600
Harman Substation 450
Coalton Substation 750
Alpena Saltshed 400
Valley Head Substation 550
Mill Creek Substation 550
Pickens Substation 250
Corridor H 1000

4,550 No Bid
Tucker Co. HQ 600
Thomas Substation 600
Corridor H - Thomas 1000

2,200 $94.16

11,200DISTRICT 8 TOTAL

Pendleton County Total Estimated

Pocahontas County Total Estimated

Randolph County Total Estimated

Tucker County Total Estimated

Tucker

Randolph

Pocahontas

INSTRUCTIONS:  Vendor may provide a price per ton for the delivery of Roadway Salt to any or all counties listed below and 
shall not add, delete, or modify a column or row header, description, unit of measure, or estimated quantity. 

Vendor should list its description for the delivery of Sodium Chloride, as it will be shown on WVDOH billing/invoices.  
Providing this information will expedite WVDOH invoice payment processes.

EXH A - "WVDOH Delivery Site & Contact Listings" contains detailed location and contact information for delivery sites listed 
below.

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6625C016
Attachment A Pricing Pages

 District 8 - Delivery

DISTRICT 8

Pendleton

Morton Salt, Inc.

F140020000Z or F140010000Z Bulk Safe-T-Salt

District 8 - Delivery Page 8 of 11 6625C016 - ATT A



Vendor Name:

Sodum Chloride Invoice/Billing Description (Delivery):

County Delivery Site Designation

Estimated 
Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 
(cost per ton)

Oak Hill APD 2,900
Lookout Substation 2,700
Falls View Substation 600

6,200 No Bid
Greenbrier Co. HQ 1,800
Crawley Substation 3,500
Hart's Run Substation 700

6,000 No Bid
Monroe Co. HQ 1,000
Peterstown Substation 500

1,500 $108.09
Nicholas Co. HQ 2,400
Curtin Substation 900
Fenwick 900

Corridor L/Muddlety Substation 3,500

7,700 No Bid
Summers Summers Co. HQ 1,600

1,600 $111.76

23,000

INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor may provide a price per ton for the delivery of Roadway Salt to any or all counties listed 
below and shall not add, delete, or modify a column or row header, description, unit of measure, or estimated quantity. 

Vendor should list its description for the delivery of Sodium Chloride, as it will be shown on WVDOH 
billing/invoices.  Providing this information will expedite WVDOH invoice payment processes.

EXH A - "WVDOH Delivery Site & Contact Listings" contains detailed location and contact information for delivery 
sites listed below.

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6625C016
Attachment A Pricing Pages

 District 9 - Delivery

DISTRICT 9

Morton Salt, Inc.

F140020000Z or F140010000Z Bulk Safe-T-Salt

DISTRICT 9 TOTAL

Fayette County Estimated Total Estimated

Greenbrier County Estimated Total Estimated

Monroe County Estimated Total Estimated

Nicholas County Estimated Total Estimated

Summers County Estimated Total

Nicholas

Monroe

Greenbrier

Fayette

District 9 - Delivery Page 9 of 11 6625C016 - ATT A



Vendor Name:

Sodum Chloride Invoice/Billing Description (Delivery):

County Delivery Site Designation
Estimated 
Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 
(cost per ton)

McDowell County HQ 1,800
Yukon Substation 300
Johnny Cake Substation 450
Raysal 450

3,000 No bid
Mercer County HQ 2,350
Flat Top Substation 300
I-77 near Princeton 2,350

5,000 No bid
Raleigh County HQ 6,500
Bolt Substation 300
Bragg Substation 4,500
Coalfields Expressway 2,500

13,800 No bid
Wyoming County HQ 2,700
Still Run Substation 900
Hanover Outpost 400

4,000 $116.75

25,800DISTRICT 10 TOTAL

McDowell County Total Estimated

Mercer County Total Estimated

Raleigh County Total Estimated

Wyoming County Total Estimated

Wyoming

Mercer

Raleigh

INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor may provide a price per ton for the delivery of Roadway Salt to any or all counties listed 
below and shall not add, delete, or modify a column or row header, description, unit of measure, or estimated quantity. 

Vendor should list its description for the delivery of Sodium Chloride, as it will be shown on WVDOH 
billing/invoices.  Providing this information will expedite WVDOH invoice payment processes.

EXH A - "WVDOH Delivery Site & Contact Listings" contains detailed location and contact information for delivery 
sites listed below.

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6625C016
Attachment A Pricing Pages

District 10 - Delivery

DISTRICT 10

McDowell

Morton Salt, Inc.

F140020000Z or F140010000Z Bulk Safe-T-Salt

District 10 - Delivery Page 10 of 11 6624C091 - ATT A



Vendor Name:

Morton Salt, Inc.

Sodum Chloride Invoice/Billing Description (Pick-Up):

F140020000Z or F140010000Z Bulk Safe-T-Salt

Vendor Supplier/Storage Site Name and Address
Vendor Bid Price 

(cost per ton)

Baltimore Stockpile

1671 S. Highland Avenue

Baltimore, MD 21224

Clifton Forge Stockpile

501 W. Ridgeway Street

Clifton Forge, VA  24422

West Elizabeth Stockpile

1000 Madison Avenue

West Elizabeth, PA 15088

Portsmouth Stockpile

5150 Gallia Street  

Portsmouth, OH  45662

Parkersburg Stockpile

400 Buckeye Street

Parkersburg, WV 26101

$110.00

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6625C016
Attachment A Pricing Pages 

WVDOH Pick-Up

No bid

$110.00

No bid

No bid

INSTRUCTIONS:  Vendor may provide pricing per ton for WVDOH pick-up and include its supplier/storage 
site designation and address. Vendor should include the loading of Material into Agency vehicles in its bid 
pricing. 

*Vendor may duplicate this page to add more sites if needed.

WVDOH Pick-up Page 11 of 11 6626C016 - ATT A

























Anthony T. Patton
312-807-2496
312-896-9208
bids@mortonsalt.com
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ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION: 

The West Virginia Purchasing Division is soliciting bids on behalf of the West Virginia Division of Highways to establish an open 
end, multiple award contract with qualified vendors for the delivery of Sodium Chloride (Roadway Salt) to designated WVDOH 
locations, F.O.B., statewide.  Vendors may also provide pricing for the pick-up of Sodium Chloride from its storage sites.  Per the 
Bid Requirements, Specifications, Terms and Conditions attached to this solicitation.

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 Roadway Salt - Sodium Chloride - DELIVERY 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

46161506    

Extended Description:
Delivery of roadway salt by Vendor to WVDOH Agency delivery locations, as specified on the ATT A Pricing Pages.

VENDOR NOTE:  Bid evaluation is based ATT A Pricing Page submissions.  Price entries or other notations made in the wvOASIS 
commodity lines description will not be considered for bid evaluation.
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 Roadway Salt - Sodium Chloride - PICK-UP 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

46161506    

Extended Description:
Pick-Up of roadway salt by a WVDOH Agency from a Vendor's source site.

VENDOR NOTE:  Bid evaluation is based ATT A Pricing Page submissions.  Price entries or other notations made in the wvOASIS 
commodity lines description will not be considered for bid evaluation.

SCHEDULE OF EVENTS
Line Event Event Date
1 Tech Questions due by 10:00am 2025-06-13



Document Phase Document Description Page 
4

DOT2500000073 Final Roadway Salt - Sodium Chloride 
6625C016
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