West Virginia

Purchasing Division

The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
wWVOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West Virginia’s
procurement process, and to maintain the
transparency of the bid-opening process, this
documentation submitted online is publicly posted
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses
to this solicitation submitted to the Purchasing
Division in hard copy format.
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Budgeting Accounts Receivable

Accounis Payable

‘Welcome, Christopher W Seckman Procurement
Solicitation Response(SR) Dept: 0313 1D: ESR03092400000000999 Ver.: 1 Function: New Phase: Final

Comact Default Values | Discount | Document Information || Clarification Request

Procurement Folder: 1467708 50 Doc Code: CRFQ
Procurement Type: Cenfral Master Agreement SO Dept: 0313
Vendor ID: 000000104695 3| 50 Doc ID: DEPZ500000002
Legal Name: TLC PROPERTY MAINTENANCE INC Publizhed Date: 8/324
Alias/DBA: Close Date: 8/13/24
Total Bid: 241,250.00 Close Time: 13:30
Response Date: (08/09/2024 Status: Closed
Response Time: 1313 Solicitation Description: ali;l:ﬂrghnig;dinn Events Southem & y
Responded By User ID:  dramagueen $| Total of Header Attachments: 0
First Name: Shannon Total of All Attachments: 0

Last Name: Simmons

Email: tlcpromainig@yahoo.com

Phone: 304-553-6269
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Proc Folder: 1467708

Solicitation Description: REAP-Tire Collection Events Southern & Western Districts

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement
Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2024-08-13 13:30 SR 0313 ESR08092400000000999 1
VENDOR
000000104698

TLC PROPERTY MAINTENANCE INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0313 DEP2500000002
Total Bid: 241250 Response Date: 2024-08-09
Comments:

Response Time: 18:13:21

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Joseph E Hager lll

(304) 558-2306

joseph.e.hagerii@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X FEIN#

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed:  Aug 14, 2024 Page: 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 3.1.2 Trailer Dropped at Site (per event) 60.00000 EA
Southern District

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78142004
Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:
3.1.2 Trailer Dropped at Site (per event) Southern District
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 3.1.4 Trailer Mileage to Disposal Southern 200.0000C MILE

District

Comm Code Manufacturer

78142004

Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

3.1.4 Trailer Mileage to Disposal Southern District

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 3.1.3 Box Truck Per Truck Per Day Southern 25.00000 EA
District

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78142004
Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:
3.1.3 Box Truck Per Truck Per Day Southern District
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 3.1.3 & 3.1.4 Labor Per Hour for Employee 2000.000C HOUR

Southern District

Comm Code

Manufacturer
76122405

Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

3.1.3 & 3.1.4 Labor Per Hour for Employee Southern District

Line

Comm Ln Desc
5

Qty

Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

3.1.6 Trailer Rental Per Trailer Per Month
Southern District

120.0000C MO

Comm Code

Manufacturer
78142004

Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

3.1.6 Trailer Rental Per Trailer Per Month Southern District

Date Printed:  Aug 14, 2024

Page: 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 3.1.2 Trailer Dropped at Site (per event) 60.00000 EA 1500.000000 90000.00
Western District
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78142004
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
3.1.2 Trailer Dropped at Site (per event) Western District
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 3.1.4 Trailer Mileage to Disposal Western 200.0000C MILE 7.500000 1500.00
District
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78142004

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
3.1.4 Trailer Mileage to Disposal Western District

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 3.1.3 Box Truck Per Truck Per Day Western  25.00000 EA 1350.000000 33750.00
District

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78142004
Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

3.1.3 Box Truck Per Truck Per Day Western District

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 3.1.3 & 3.1.4 Labor Per Hour for Employee 2000.000C HOUR 40.000000 80000.00

Western District

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
76122405

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

3.1.3 & 3.1.4 Labor Per Hour for Employee Western District

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 3.1.6 Trailer Rental Per Trailer Per Month 120.0000C MO 300.000000 36000.00
Western District
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78142004

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
3.1.6 Trailer Rental Per Trailer Per Month Western District

Date Printed:  Aug 14, 2024

Page: 3

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05
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