
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1402041

Solicitation Description: Beet Based Deicing Product

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2024-04-18 13:30 SR 0803 ESR04152400000006037 1

VENDOR

VS0000009674
EnviroTech Services Inc.

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2400000087

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2024-04-15 Response Time: 18:45:23

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep
304-558-2566
john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 BeetHeat 275 gal tote 0.00000 EA 1650.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161506    

Commodity Line Comments: CAN DELIVER MONDAY THROUGH FRIDAY.
Product Name: Calcium Chloride with Boost
Delivery Days: 3-5

Extended Description:
per tote

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 BeetHeat, 1000-2000 gal delivered 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161506    

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Delivery Size Range:  1000-2000 gallons delivered

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 BeetHeat, 2001-4000 gal delivered 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161506    

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Delivery Size Range:  2001-4000 gallons delivered

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 BeetHeat, 4001 or greater gal delivered 0.00000 GL 2.340000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161506    

Commodity Line Comments: CAN DELIVER MONDAY THROUGH SUNDAY.
Product Name: Calcium Chloride with Boost
Delivery Days: 3-5

Extended Description:
Delivery Size Range: 4001 gallons or greater delivered

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 GeoMelt 55 275 gal tote 0.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161506    
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Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
per tote

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 GeoMelt 55 1000-2000 gal delivered 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161506    

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Delivery Size Range:  1000-2000 gallons delivered

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 GeoMelt 55, 2001-4000 gal delivered 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161506    

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Delivery Size Range:  2001-4000 gallons delivered

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 GeoMelt 55, 4001 or greater gal delivered 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161506    

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Delivery Size Range: 4001 gallons or greater delivered

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Demurrage, charged after 2 hour grace 

period, per each 1/4 H
0.00000 EA 50.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
76122401    

Commodity Line Comments: Product Name: Calcium Chloride with Boost
Delivery Days: 3-5

Extended Description:
Demurrage, charged after 2 hour grace period, per each 1/4 H





























































































 De‐Sugared Beet Juice De‐Icing Solution
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR NAME: EnviroTech Services, LLC

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: 
Vendor may bid any or all Contract Items listed.  Vendor shall select 
the Districts in Part 1 for which the bid pricing on this sheet applies.  If 
the same bid prices apply to both Districts, the vendor should mark 
both Districts and submit one ATT A.  However, if the vendors prices 
vary from one district to another, the Vendor should submit two 
ppricing pages, one per District, with their bid.  

This is a multiple vendor award contract.  The Contract is intended to 
provide Agencies with a purchase price on all Contract Items.  All 
qualified responsible Vendors shall be awarded a contract for those 
Contract Items bid which meet all mandatory requirements of this 
Contract. Vendors may bid any or all contract items, and any or all
Districts listed.  To determine the low bid vendor for individual 
projects, the WVDOH District Engineer or their designee will calculate 
the lowest overall total cost of the Contract Items required for 
individual projects.   No future use of the Contract or any individual 
item is guaranteed or implied.  

PART I:  WVDOH DISTRICTS BID (Required).  .   

District 8:  Pendleton, Pocahontas, Randolph and Tucker counties
District 9:  Fayette, Greenbrier, Monroe, Nicholas and Summers counties

PART II:  ENTER PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE FOR CONTRACT ITEMS BID.

Contract Item # Description Est. Qty
Unit of 
Measure

Delivery Size 
Range

List Price

1 BeetHeat (Beet Juice) 275 gallon tote. 20 Each ‐‐‐‐‐‐‐
Name of Equal to Product bid, if applicable:

Calcium Chloride with Boost

2 BeetHeat (Beet Juice),  per gallon delivered. 0 Gallon 500‐2000

3 Name of Equal to Product bid, if applicable: 15,000 Gallon 2001‐4000

4 Calcium Chloride with Boost 15,000 Gallon 4001 or greater $2.34
5 GeoMelt® 55 Liquid Organic Additive (Beet Juice) 275 gallon tote. 20 Each ‐‐‐‐‐‐‐
Name of Equal to Product bid, if applicable:

6 GeoMelt® 55 Liquid Organic Additive (Beet Juice),  per gallon delivered. 0 Gallon 500‐2000

7 Name of Equal to Product bid, if applicable: 15,000 Gallon 2001‐4000

8 15,000 Gallon 4001 or greater

11 Demurrage, charged after 2 hour grace period, per each 1/4 Hour 0 Each ‐‐‐‐‐‐‐ $50

$1,650

ATT A ‐ Pricing Pages Page 1 of 3 6624C061



Beet Based Deicing Solution
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: 

VENDOR NAME: EnviroTech Services, LLC

Contract 
Item # Description Est. Qty

Unit of 
Measure

Delivery Size 
Range

List Price

1 BeetHeat 275 gallon tote. 50 Each ‐‐‐‐‐‐‐
Proposed Equal: Calcium Chloride with Boost

2 BeetHeat,  per gallon delivered. 0 Gallon 1000‐2000
3 Proposed Equal: Calcium Chloride with Boost 0 Gallon 2001‐4000
4 12,000 Gallon 4001 or greater $2.34
5 GeoMelt® 55 Liquid Organic Additive  275 gallon tote. 50 Each ‐‐‐‐‐‐‐
Proposed Equal: 

6 GeoMelt® 55 Liquid Organic Additive,  per gallon delivered. 0 Gallon 1000‐2000
7 Proposed Equal:  0 Gallon 2001‐4000
8 12,000 Gallon 4001 or greater
9 Demurrage, charged after 2 hour grace period, per each 1/4 Hour 0 Each ‐‐‐‐‐‐‐ $50

1 BeetHeat 275 gallon tote. 20 Each ‐‐‐‐‐‐‐
Proposed Equal: Calcium Chloride with Boost

2 BeetHeat,  per gallon delivered. 0 Gallon 1000‐2000
3 Proposed Equal: Calcium Chloride with Boost 0 Gallon 2001‐4000
4 0 Gallon 4001 or greater $2.34
5 GeoMelt® 55 Liquid Organic Additive 275 gallon tote. 20 Each ‐‐‐‐‐‐‐
Proposed Equal: 

6 GeoMelt® 55 Liquid Organic Additive,  per gallon delivered. 0 Gallon 1000‐2000
7 Proposed Equal:  0 Gallon 2001‐4000
8 0 Gallon 4001 or greater
9 Demurrage, charged after 2 hour grace period, per each 1/4 Hour 0 Each ‐‐‐‐‐‐‐ $50

$1,650
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Vendors may bid any or all Contract Items, and any or all Districts listed below. All Contract Items bid must include a Product Data Sheet and Safety 
Data Sheet prior to award (Section 3.2.5).   If bidding a proposed equal, the vendor must provide the name of the product bid and supporting 
documentation (Section 3.2.4).  This is a multiple vendor award contract. A contract will be awarded to the lowest bidding vendor, per product, per 
District which meets all mandatory requirements of this Contract.  No future use of the Contract or any individual item is guaranteed or implied.  

ALL BID PRICES INCLUDE DELIVERY WITHIN THE UNIT PRICE BID; NO SEPERATE DELIVERY CHARGE IS PERMITTED.

$1,650
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Beet Based Deicing Solution
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR NAME: EnviroTech Services, LLC

Contract 
Item # Description Est. Qty

Unit of 
Measure

Delivery Size 
Range

List Price

1 BeetHeat 275 gallon tote. 20 Each ‐‐‐‐‐‐‐
Proposed Equal: Calcium Chloride with Boost

2 BeetHeat,  per gallon delivered. 0 Gallon 1000‐2000
3 Proposed Equal: Calcium Chloride with Boost 0 Gallon 2001‐4000
4 0 Gallon 4001 or greater $2.34
5 GeoMelt® 55 Liquid Organic Additive 275 gallon tote. 20 Each ‐‐‐‐‐‐‐
Proposed Equal: 

6 GeoMelt® 55 Liquid Organic Additive,  per gallon delivered. 0 Gallon 1000‐2000
7 Proposed Equal:  0 Gallon 2001‐4000
8 0 Gallon 4001 or greater
9 Demurrage, charged after 2 hour grace period, per each 1/4 Hour 0 Each ‐‐‐‐‐‐‐ $50

1 BeetHeat 275 gallon tote. 40 Each ‐‐‐‐‐‐‐
Proposed Equal: Calcium Chloride with Boost

2 BeetHeat,  per gallon delivered. 0 Gallon 1000‐2000
3 Proposed Equal: Calcium Chloride with Boost 0 Gallon 2001‐4000
4 20,000 Gallon 4001 or greater $2.34
5 GeoMelt® 55 Liquid Organic Additive 275 gallon tote. 40 Each ‐‐‐‐‐‐‐
Proposed Equal: 

6 GeoMelt® 55 Liquid Organic Additive,  per gallon delivered. 0 Gallon 1000‐2000
7 Proposed Equal:  0 Gallon 2001‐4000
8 20,000 Gallon 4001 or greater
9 Demurrage, charged after 2 hour grace period, per each 1/4 Hour 0 Each ‐‐‐‐‐‐‐ $50
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