West Virginia

Purchasing Division

The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
wWVOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West Virginia’s
procurement process, and to maintain the
transparency of the bid-opening process, this
documentation submitted online is publicly posted
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses
to this solicitation submitted to the Purchasing
Division in hard copy format.
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Legal Name: Stone Asphalt LLC
Alias/DBA:
Total Bid: 20.00

Response Date: 01/03/2024
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Email: stonematerials@yahoo.com
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ST Department of Administration
83 12 R Lo

) G Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1322263

Solicitation Description: WINTER GRADE ASPHALT PATCHING MIXTURE

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes

Solicitation Response

Version

2024-01-04 13:30

SR 0803 ESR01032400000003149

1

VENDOR

VS0000011728
Stone Asphalt LLC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2400000055

Total Bid: 0

Comments:

Response Date:

2024-01-03 Response Time:

14:05:06

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep

304-558-2566

john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X

FEIN#

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed:  Jan 4, 2024

Page: 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Bulk Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture  0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00
(Cold Mix)
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30121601

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE, ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Pre-Packaged Winter Grade Asphalt 0.00000 LB 0.000000 0.00
Patching Mixture (Cold Mix
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30121601

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE, ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jan 4, 2024 Page: 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05



Department of Administration State of West Virginia

\ |Purchasing Division
\ {2019 Washington Street East Centralized Request for Quote

5] [Post Office Box 50130 Highways
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Proc Folder: 1322263 Reason for Modification:

Doc Description: WINTER GRADE ASPHALT PATCHING MIXTURE ADDENDUM NO_1
Vendor Question and Response

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement
Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2024-01-02 2024-01-04  13:30 CRFQ 0803 DOT2400000055 2
BID RECEIVING LOCATION
BID CLERK
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON ST E
CHARLESTON WV 25305
us

VENDOR

Vendor Cus¥om§r Code: \/ S OO(\O Ol 3%
Vendor Name : S tong )\S p\‘\CL L+ | Ligt
Address: P() (Box a3

Street :
City: ReedSu il
State : WV Country: (|5 Zip: DO0H o

Principal Contact : R W h 0 o, % Yo n€
Vendor Contact Phone: 2 oM - g o4~ (9 L1 1(0 Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep

304-558-2566

john.w.estep@wv.gov

Signature X / - rewe 31- 1994900 oare 01)03)209Y

&
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed:  Jan 2, 2024 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05



ADDITIONAL INFORMATION =~ .~
ADDEENDUM NO_1
Addendum No_1 Issued to publish and distribute the attached information to the Vendor Community.
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION:
The West Virginia Purchasing Division is soliciting bids an behalf of the West Virginia Division of Highways to establish an open-end
contract for the delivery of Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture (Cold Mix), to be used for WVDOH maintenance and repair
projects throughout the state of West Virginia. Per the Bid Requirements, Specifications, Terms and Conditions attached to this
solicitation.
INVOICETO - R [swipTO
VARIOUS AGENCY STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
LOCATIONS
AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS
INDICATED BY ORDER

No City wv Ne City wv
us Us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 Bulk Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture 0.00000 TON

(Cold Mix)
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30121601
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE, ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
INVOICETO - - ' - SHIPTO - - - |
VARICUS AGENCY STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
LOCATIONS
AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS

INDICATED BY ORDER

No City wv No City wv
Us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 Pre-Packaged Winter Grade Asphalt Patching  0.00000 LB
Mixture {Cold Mix
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30121601
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE, ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jan 2, 2024 Page: 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05




SCHEDULE OF EVENTS

Line Event Event Date
1 Tech Questions due by 10:00am 2023-12-27

Date Printed:  Jan 2, 2024 Page: 3 FORM (D WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05



SOLICITATION NUMBER: CRFQ DOT2400000055

Addendum Number: 1
The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as CRFQ DOT24000000055
(“Solicitation”) to reflect the change(s) identified and described below.

Applicable Addendum Category:
[ 1 Modify bid opening date and time
[ 1 Modify specifications of product or service being sought
[ X] Attachment of vendor questions and responses
[ ] Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet
[ 1 Correction of error

[ ] Other

Additional Decumentation:
Vendor Questions and Responses

Bid Opening remains 01/04/2024 at 1:30pm

Terms and Conditions:
1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in full force and
effect.

2. Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by completing an
Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith. Failure to acknowledge addenda
may result in bid disqualification. The addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to
expedite document processing.



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: CRFQ DOT2400000055

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: [ hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[X] Addendum No. 1 [ 1 Addendum No.6
[ ] Addendum No. 2 [ 1 Addendum No.7
[ 1] Addendum No. 3 [ ] Addendum No. 8
[ ] Addendum No. 4 [ ] Addendum No.9
[ ] Addendum No. 5 [ ] Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. I
further understand that that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

Sone Asphalt \ L C

ompany

Yy

/ 7~ ‘Authorized Signature

01103)9094

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.



DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as the
Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this Contract.

(Printed Name and Title) R Chard %k’ N = \U\ﬁ’ V\’\b ey
(Address) G (")('m Y a5 Re {OCJSU{\\ t , \,{ V J (L SYT
(Phone Number) / (Fax Number) 20U -$eY - 420 / 20M-R0Y -H05 2

T

(email address) Y S Ypne Pa U‘mj @ rontierrat Nk

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wvOASIS, I certify that: 1 have reviewed this Solicitation/Contract in its entirety; that I
understand the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that
this bid, offer or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn;
that the product or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the
Solicitation/Contract for that product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor
accepts the terms and conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that
I am submitting this bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; that this bid or offer was
made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any entity submitting a bid or
offer for the same material, supplies, equipment or services; that this bid or offer is in all respects
fair and without collusion or fraud; that this Contract is accepted or entered into without any prior
understanding, agreement, or connection to any other entity that could be considered a violation of
law; that I am authorized by the Vendor to execute and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any
documents related thereto on Vendor’s behalf; that I am authorized to bind the vendor in a
contractual relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, the vendor has properly registered
with any State agency that may require registration.

By signing below, I further certify that I understand this Contract is subject to the
provisions of West Virginia Code § 54-3-62, which automatically voids certain contract
clauses that violate State law; and that pursuant to W. Va. Code 54-3-63, the entity
entering into this contract is prohibited from engaging in a boycott against Israel.

Slore Asohalt, L1 ¢
(Company) // / —‘/

(Signatur;/ﬂf Autthorized Representative
Richard Stone - (e mber 01]031 2004
(Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative) (Date&
S-S~ 0YAL 3 oy-KuH-4u0sz Lok
(Phone Number) (Fax Number)
(sYone Dauvig @Sy ontierney. B
(Email Address) 7

Revised 8/24/2023



CONTRACTOR LICENSE

AUTHORIZED BY THE

West Virginia Contracior
Licensing Board

4 WV055798
NUMBER:
CLASSIFICATION:
CENERAL ENCINEERING
ASPHALT
DEMOLITION
STONE ASPHALT LLC
¢ DBA STONE ASPHALT LLC
PO BOX 423
REEDSVILLE, WV 26547
DATE ISSUED EXPIRATION DATE

JAMUARY 1f

Authorized Signature Chair, West Virginia Contraclor
’ Licensing Board

il g EST VIRGINIA A copy of this license must be readily available for inspection by the Board on every job site where
ST contracting work is being performed. This license number must appear in all advertisements, on all
77 CONTRACTOR bid submissions, and on ali fully executed and binding contracts. This license is non-transferable.
&7 LICENSING BOARD. This license is being issued under the provisions of West Virginia Code, Chapter 30, Article 42.
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ACORD
V

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (MMIDD/YYYY}
12/28/2023

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S}, AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT:

If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.

If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, cerfain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

CONTACT

PRODUCER NAME: Edie Mathews
MVP Insurance LLG TN e (330) 549-5620 | A, Noy, 330-549-5622
PO Box 257 ADBREss: edie@mvpins.com e
_ - INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
New Springfield _ OH 44443 | wsurera: ERIE INSURANCE PROPERTY AND CASUALTY 26830
INSURED INSURER B :
STONE ASPHALT, LLC INSURER C :
P.O. BOX 423 INSURER D : -
INSURERE : _ i
REEDSVILLE WV 26547-0423 | insURERF -
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

THIS 15 TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERICD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TCO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALt THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

INSR [ADDL SUBR POLICY EFF__ POLICY EXP
LTR TYPE OF INSURANCE INSD WYD! POLICY NUMBER (MMIDD/YYYY) (MMIDDYYYY} LIMITS
| > | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY i ‘ EACH OCCURRENCE ~§ 1,000,000
. : DAMAGE TG RENTED ™ PO
|| CLAMS-MADE | occur PREMISES (Ea oceurrence)  § 1,000,000
! l : ‘ MED EXP {Any one person) s 5,000
Al : | Q41-5150518 05/01/2023 } 05/01/2024 personaL & apvINJURY s 1,000,000
 GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: P ‘ | GENERAL AGGREGATE 52,000,000
| | ; o - PYV
_POLICY | ! e | Loc | ; PRODUCTS - comprop AGG | § 2,000,000
OTHER: | i 3
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY ; 7 COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT
H | : (Ea accident} R s _ 1
. ANY AUTO | | : BODILY INJURY (Per person) I's
. OWNED " SCHEDULED | ! -
 AUTOS ONLY AUTOS I | . BODILY INJURY (Per accident) i B -
| HIRED NON-OWNED i : | i | PROPERTY DAMAGE S
_. | AUTOSONLY AUTOS ONLY | i : | ! [Per accident}
, ;
| ! ‘ ; | S
(| UMBRELLA LIAB OCCUR ‘ : ! EACH OCCURRENCE s 1,000,000
; |
A | EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE, X i Q29-5170312 05/01/2023 " 05/01/2024 * AGGREGATE __.s 1,000,600
i DED | RETENTIONS ‘ : . i 8
'WORKERS COMPENSATION i | SEETUTE } %{H-

' AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY YiN !
i ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE

| OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? I:I NiA
If yes, describe under ‘

: (Mandatory in NH}
| DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below

| E.L. EACH ACCIDENT __

_E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE
E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT

@ n

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES [ACORD 104, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

P.O. Box 50130

Charleston

WV 25305-0130

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DBESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORBANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS,

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

fjd‘j"‘:-)il"]_" T ilncnn =

ACORD 25 (2016/03)

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD




Vendor Name :

Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture
{Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE {ATT A)

Stone Asphalt, LLC

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall complete the Pricing Page (ATT A) by providing a bid price for each Contract item listed. Vendor shall factor into their bid prices all equipment, materials,
delivery, and labor required. Separate delivery charges will not be allowed. This is a Muitiple Vendor award contract, Qualified responsible vendors shall be awarded a contract for the item
bid meeting the required specifications with the lowest bid price per unit of measure, per delivery/storage location.

DISTRICT ONE

County Est. Quant. Cold Mix per Location Including Delivery M"g;j:e Unit Cost
Boone 0 Clinton @ WWV85-108 Cow Creek Rd, Wharton TON NO BID
Boone 30 Rock Creek-203 DOH Garage Rd, Danville TON NO BID
Boone 20 Seth-9288 Coal River Rd, Seth TON NO BID
Clay 0 Clay Headquarters-4476 Triplett Ridge Rd, Clay TON NC BID
Clay 0 Maysel 2054-Procious Maysel Rd, Maysel TON NO BID
Kanawha 20 Chelyan-14887 MacCorkle Ave, Cabin Creek TON NQ BID
Kanawha 0 Elkview-904 Old Frame Rd, Elkview TON NO BID
Kanawha 100 North Charleston-2800 West Washington St, Charleston TON NO BID
Kanawha 25 St. Albans-2334 MacCorkle Ave, St Albans TON NO BID
Kanawha 0 I-64 @ Rt. 119 and Penn, Ave-2266 Pennsylvania Ave, Charleston TON NQ BID
Kanawha 0 I-77 @ Sissonville-36 Allen Fork Rd, Sissonville TON NO BID
Kanawha 20 -79 @ Amma-3134 Amma Rd, Amma TON NO BID
Kanawha 20 Corridor G @ Alum Creek-401 Champion Dr, South Charleston TON NO BID
Mason 0 Glenwood 40940-Huntington Rd (WV2), Glenwood TON NO BID
Mason 0 Pt. Pleasant @ Fairground Rd-225 Fairground, Rd Point Pleasant TON NO BID
Mason 0 Pt. Pleasant @ Jackson Ave-2702 Jackson Ave, Paint Pleasant TON NO BID
Putnam 0 Red House-11923 Charleston Rd, Red House TON NQ BID
Putnam 0 Hurricane @ Rt. 34-3256 Teays Valley Rd, Hurricane TON NOQ BID
Putnam 0 Scary Creek-704 Winfield Rd, St. Albans TON NO BID
Putnam 50 US 35 @ Fraziers Bottom-2702 Jackson Ave, Point Pleasant TON NO BID

ATT A - Pricing Page

Page 1 of 1

6624C027



Vendor Name :

Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture

{Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE {ATT A}

Stone Asphalt, LLC

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall compiete the Pricing Page (ATT A) by providing a bid price for each Contract ltem listed. Vendor shall factor into their bid prices all equipment,
materials, delivery, and labor required. Separate delivery charges will not be allowed. This is a Multiple Vender award contract. Qualified responsibile vendors shall be awarded a

contract for the item bid meeting the required specifications with the lowest bid price per unit of measure, per delivery/storage location.

DISTRICT TWO

County | Est. Quant. Cold Mix per Location Including Defivery Unitof it cost

Measure

Cabell Unknown [Barboursville-6200 Rt 60 East, Barboursville TCN NO BID
Cabell Unknown |I-64 @ Huntington-3100 16th Street Rd, Huntington TON NO BID
Lincoln Unknown |West Hamlin-7338 State Rt 10, West Hamlin TON NO BID
Lincoln Unknown |Yawkey-4962 Midway Rd, Yawkey TON NO BID
Lincoln Unknown |Harts-1313 McClellan Hwy, South Harts TON NO BID
Logan Unknown iCorridor G @ Chapmanville-8100 Old Logan Rd, Chapmanville TON NO BID
Logan Unknown |Wilkinson-127 Springfield Rd, Wilkinsan TON NO BID
Logan Unknown |Man-4801 Buffalo Creek Rd, Amherstdale TON NQ BID
Mingo Unknown |Mingo County @Miller's Creek-1 Highway Garage Rd, Williamson TON NO BID
Mingo Unknown |Gilbert-2200 RT 52, Gilbert TON NO BID
Wayne Unknown  |Crum 20351-Tolsia Hwy, Crum TON NO BID
Wayne Unknown |Pritchard-1249 Prichard Rd, Prichard TON NO BID
Wayne Unknown [Wayne-326 Third St, Wayne TON NO BID

ATT A - Pricing Page

Pagelofl

6624C027



Vendor Name :

Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture
{Coid Mix)}

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Stone Asphalt, LLC

Mendor Instructions: Vender shall complete the Pricing Page (ATT A} by providing a bid price for each Contract Item listed. Vendor shall factor into their bid prices alt

equipment, materials, delivery, and labor required. Separate delivery charges will not be allowed. This is a Multiple Vendor award contract. Qualified responsible vendors
shall be awarded a contract for the item bid meeting the required specifications with the lowest bid price per unit of measure, per delivery/storage location.

DISTRICT THREE

Unit of

County Est. Quant. Cold Mix per Location Including Delivery Measure Unit Cost
Calhoun Unknown (Millstone-7619 8. Calhoun Hwy, Millstone TON NO BID
Jackson Unknown [Ripley-946 Claylick Rd, Ripley TON NO BID
Jacksen Unknown |1-77 @ Medina-2600 Medina Rd, Ravenswood TON NO BID
Pieasants Unknown |Belmont-401 Second St, Belmont TON NO BID
Pleasants Unknown |St. Mary's (Colin-Anderson Lot)-245 Landingfield Dr, St Marys TON NO BID
Ritchie Unknown |APD Pennshoro 41 Ritchie Industrial Park Rd, Pennsboro TON 14475
Ritchie Unknown |Ellenboro 731 Ellenboro Rd, Harrisville TON 14475
Ritchie Unknown |Corridor D @ Nutter Farm-171 Slocum Ln, Petroleum TON 148.75
Ritchie Unknown |Smithville-18 Main $t, Smithville TON 151.00
Roane Unknown |Lefthand-9734 Clay Rd, Left Hand TON NO BID
Roane Unknown |Ambler Hill-8818 Charelston Rd, Walton TON NO BID
Roane Unknown |Spencer-269 Charleston Rd, Spencer TON NO BID
Wirt Unknown |Elizabeth-56 Schoolview St, Elizabeth TON NO BID
Wood Unknown |Parkersburg-905 Lubeck Ave, Parkersburg TON NO BID
Wocd Unknown [Corridor D-253 River Hill Rd, Washington TON NO BID
Woced Unknown |I-77-1758 Mill Run Rd, Parkersburg TON NO BID

ATT A - Pricing Page

Page 1 of1

5624C027



Vendor Name :

Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture
(Cold Mix}

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A}

Stone Asphalt, LLC

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall complete the Pricing Page (ATT A) by providing a bid price for each Contract ltem listed. Vendor shall factor into their bid prices all

eguipment, materials, delivery, and labor required. Separate delivery charges will not be allowad. This is a Multiple Vendor award contract. Qualified responsible vendors
shall be awarded a contract for the item bid meeting the required specifications with the lowest bid price per unit of measure, per delivery/storage location

DISTRICT FOUR

Unit of

County Est. Quant. Cold Mix per Location Including Delivery Measure Unit Cost
Doddridge 10 West Union-1993 Smithton Rd, West Union TON 141.00
Harrison 50 Gore-119 Rail Cross Rd, Clarksburg TON 134.25
Harrison 10 I-79 @ Lost Creek-851 N. Streetcar Way, Lost Creek TON 134.25
Harrison 10 APD 50 @ Tunnel Hiil-281 Tunnel Hill Rd, Salem TON 136.25
Marion 25 Fairmont-916 Country Club Rd, Fairmont TON 127.75
Marion 25 Mannington-1386 E Main St, Mannington TON 131.50
Monongalia 10 I-79 @ Goshen Road-85 Goshen Rd, Morgantown TON 123.75
Monongalia 100 Ridgedale 1510-Grafton Rd, Morgantown TON 123.00
Monongalia 15 Pentress-5861 Mason Dixon Hwy, Bruceton Mills TON 130.50
Preston 50 Albright-216 St. Joe Rd, Albright TON 122.75
Preston 15 Bruceton-14115 N Preston Hwy, Bruceton Mills TON 127.75
Preston 10 Terra Aita-32353 Veterans Memorial Hwy, Terra Alta TON 124.75
Preston 10 Fellowsville-5213 George Washington Hwy, Tunnelton TON 124.00
Preston 25 Aurcra-23236 George Washington Hwy, Aurora TON 127.00
Preston 10 [-58 @ Copper's Rock-360 Rt. 73/73, Bruceton Mills TON 125.25
Taylor 100 Fetterman/Prunytown-1340 Trap Spring Rd, Grafton TON 127.25

ATT A - Pricing Page

Pagelofl

6624C027



Vendor Name :

Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture

(Cald Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Stone Asphalt, LLC

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall comptete the Pricing Page (ATT A) by providing a bid price for each Contract ltem listed. Vendor shall factor into their bid prices all
equipment, materials, delivery, and labor required. Separate delivery charges will not be allowed. This is a Multiple Vendor award contract. Qualified responsible vendors
shail be awarded a contract for the iterm bid meeting the required specifications with the fowest bid price per unit of measure, per delivery/storage location.

DISTRICT FIVE

County Est. Quant. Cold Mix per Location Including Delivery Unit of Unit Cost

Measure

Berkeley Unknown |I-81 @ Martinsburg-1867 Rock Cliff Dr, Martinsburg TON NO BID
Berkeley Unknown |I-81 @ Exit 8 Exit 8 off of [-81 TON NO BID
Grant Unknown |Petersburg-930 Lunice Creek Highway, Petersburg TON 140.00
Grant Unknown |Mt. Storm-8551 Union Hwy, Mt. Store TON 135.00
Grant Unknown |Corridor H @ Knobley Rd. TON 136.00
Hampshire Unknown |Romney 56-DOH Dr, Romney TON NO BID
Hampshire Unknown |Capon Bridge-34 State Hill, Capon Bridge TON NO BID
Hampshire Unknown |Slanesville-8051 Bloomery Pike, Slanesville TON NO BID
Hardy Unknown [Moorefield-2104 SR55, Moorefield TON 143.00
Hardy Unknown |Baker-386 Sperrys Run Rd, Baker TON 147.00
Jefferson Unknown |Charles Town-1301 Old Leetown Pike, Kearneysville TON NO BID
Mineral Unknown |New Creek-10800 Northwestern Turnpike, New Creek TON NO BID
Mineral Unknown [Sky Line-4947 Elk Garden Hwy, Elk Garden TON NO BID
Mineral Unknown |Short Gap-6385 Frantfort Hwy, Ridgeley TON NC BID
Mineral Unknown | District Headquarters-2120 Northwestern Turnpike, Burlington TON NO BID
Morgan Unknown |Berkeley Springs 166 DOH Ln, Berkeley Springs TON NO BID
Morgan Unknown |Largent-16964 Cacapcn Rd, Great Cacapon TON NO BID

ATT A - Pricing Page

Pagelofl

6624C027



Vencdor Name :

Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture

(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Stone Asphalt, LLC

Vendor instructions: Vendor shall complete the Pricing Page (ATT A} by providing a bid price for each Contract ltem listed. Vendor shall factor into their bid prices

all equipment, materials, delivery, and labor required. Separale delivery charges will not be allowed. This is a Multiple Vendor award contract, Qualified responsible
vendors shall be awarded a contract for the item bid meeting the required specifications with the lowest bid price per unit of measure, per delivery/storage location.

DISTRICT SIX
County Est. Quant. Jnit of Unit Cost
Cold Mix per Location Including Delivery Measure
Brooke 100 Wellsburg-615 Commerce St, Wellshurg TON 145.25
Brooke 0 Weirton-1225 Rice Rd, Weirton TON NO BID
Hancock 200 New Manchester-1936 Veterans Blvd, New Cumberland TON 152.25
Marshall 0 Glen Dale-100 Wheeling Ave, Glen Dale TON NO BID
Marshall 0 Cameron-33 Courtright Ln, Cameron TON NO BID
Ohio 100 Triadelphia-3870 National Rd, Triadelphia TON 146.00
Ohio 25 I-70 @ Triadelphia-566 Woodland Acres Rd, Wheeling TON 146.00
Tyler 0 Centerville-9919 Middie Island Rd, Centerville TON NO BID
Tyler 100 Sistersville-2566 Tyler Hwy, Sistersville TON 149.00
Tyler 0 Sistersville Old Headquarters TON NO BID
Wetzel 0 Hundred-2622 Hornet Hwy, Hundred TON NO BID
Wetzel 100 New Martinsville-45 Paducah Dr, New Martinsville TON 146.00
Wetzel 0 Pine Grove-12566 Shortline Hwy, Pine Grove TON NO BID
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Vendor Name :

Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture

(Celd Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Stone Asphalt, LLC

¥endor Instructions: Vendor shall complete the Pricing Page (ATT A} by providing a bid price for each Contract ltem listed. Vendor shall facter into their bid prices
all equipment, materials, delivery, and labor required. Separate delivery charges will not be allowed. This is a Multiple Vendor award contract. Qualified responsible
vendors shall be awarded a cantract for the item bid meeting the required specifications with the lowest bid price per unit of measure, per delivery/storage location.

DISTRICT EIGHT

County | Est. Quant. Cold Mix per Location Including Delivery Mlg:;grfe Unit Cost
Pendleton 0 Franklin 251-Maple Ave, Franklin TON NO BID
Pocahontas 0 Marlinton-25 Brush Country Rd, Marlinton TON NO BID
Randolph 0 Corridor H-Elkins 489 Leading Creek Rd, Montrose TON 130.00
Randolph 25 Elkins-76 Country Club Rd, Elkins TON 137.25
Tucker 0 Corridor H-Thomas 15933 Appalachian Hwy, Thomas TON 130.00
Tucker 0 Parsons-9209 Seneca Trail, Parsons TON 130.00
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Vendor Name :

Winter Grade Asphait Patching Mixture

(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE {(ATT A)

Stone Asphalt, LLC

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall complete the Pricing Page (ATT A) by providing a bid price for each Contract Item listed. Vendor shall facter into their bid prices all

equipment, materials, delivery, and labor required. Separate delivery charges will not be allowed. This is a Multiple Vendor award contract. Qualified responsible vendors
shall be awarded a contract for the item bid meeting the required specifications with the lowest bid price per unit of measure, per delivery/storage location.

DISTRICT NINE
: . . . Unit of .
County Est. Quant. Cold Mix per Location Including Delivery M Unit Cost
easure

Fayette 150 Oak Hill 3121-East Main St, Oak Hill TON 167.50
Fayette 50 Corridor L @ Qak Hill TON 168.00
Fayette 100 Lookout-4084 Clifftop Rd, Lookout TON 165.75
Fayette 25 Glen Ferris-5727 Midland Trail, Charlton Heights TON 168.75
Greenbrier 100 Lewisburg-2820 N. Jefferson $t, Lewisburg TON 165.75
Greenbrier 100 Crawley-157 Midland Trail, Crawley TON 171.75
Greenbrier 25 I-64 @ Hart's Run TON 172.25
Monroe 100 Union-875 Sweet Springs Valley Rd, Union TON 172.50
Monroe 50 Peterstown-511 Ballard-Red Sulphur Pkwy, Peterstown TON 190.75
Nicholas 50 Summersville-777 Turnpike Rd, Summersville TON 162.00
Nicholas 50 Curtin-5498 Richwood Rd, Richwood TON 163.00
Nicholas 25 Corridor L @ Muddlety-50 State Garage Rd, Summersville TON 157.00
Summers 50 Summers County Headquarters-20414 State Route 12, Hinton TON 182.00
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Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture
{Cold Mix}
ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Stone Asphalt, LLC

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall complete the Pricing Page {ATT A) by providing a bid price for each Contract ltem listed. Vendor shall factor into their bid
prices all equipment, materials, delivery, and labor required. Separate delivery charges will not be allowed. This is a Muitiple Vendor award contract. Qualified

responsible vendors shall be awarded a contract for the item bid meeting the required specifications with the lowest bid price per unit of measure, per
delivery/storage location,

DISTRICT TEN
County Est. Quant. Cold Mix per Location Including Delivery Unit of Unit Cost
Measure
McDowell 25 County Headquarters-100 Headquarters Ln, Havaco TON NO BID
Mercer 0 County Headquarters-82 New Hope Rd, Princeton TON NO BID
Raleigh 25 County Headquarters-379 Market Rd, Beckley TON NO BID
Wyoming 0 County Headquarters-1409 Bearhold Rd, Pineville TON NO BID
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Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture

{Cold Mix]

ATTACHMENT A-PRICING PAGE

Vendor Name : Stone Asphalt, LLC

Vendor Instructions: Please provide a bid price, including delivery, of Pre-Packaged Winter Grade Asphalt

Patching Mixture (Cold Mix) Material per pound for various WVDOH storage sites statewide. Separate delivery
charges will not be allowed. This is a Multiple Vendor award contract. Qualified responsible vendors shall be
awarded a contract that provides the Contract [tems meeting the required specifications and the lowest bid price

per distribution size for pre-packaged Cold Mix.

Pre-Packaged Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture (Cold Mix)

Package Sizes/Quantities

Cost
Contract Item Enter amounts per Unit of Measure p p:r
(unless already noted) for item bid. oun
, 50]pounds per b 23.65
Pre-Packaged for Short-Term Single Season , P & a9 -
Use No Bid pounds per pail No Bid
2800|pounds per pallet 1.45
. , ) 50)pounds per ba 23.65
High Performance Cold Mix-UPM Cold Mix or — | per 729 :
Equal No Bid pounds per pail No Bid
q 2800|pounds per pallet 1.45
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