West Virginia

Purchasing Division

The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
wWVOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West Virginia’s
procurement process, and to maintain the
transparency of the bid-opening process, this
documentation submitted online is publicly posted
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses
to this solicitation submitted to the Purchasing
Division in hard copy format.
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Procurement Folder: 1316495

Procurement Type: Ceniral Master Agreement

Vendor ID:  pO0000181078 |

Legal Name: BECKLEY CRANE & CONSTRUCTION INC
Alias/DBA:
Total Bid: S0.00

Response Date: 10/30/2023
Response Time: 151%
Responded By User ID:  rgoodwin1958 ‘ﬁ“l
First Name: Robin
Last Name: Goodwin

Email: rgocdwin@beckleycrane.con

Phone: 304-252-T263
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Proc Folder: 1316495

Solicitation Description: Tree Trimmer with Telescoping Boom w/o Operator

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement
Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2023-11-15 13:30 SR 0803 ESR10302300000002103 1
VENDOR
000000181078

BECKLEY CRANE & CONSTRUCTION INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2400000044
Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2023-10-30
Comments:

Response Time: 15:19:05

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep

304-558-2566

john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X FEIN#

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Rubber Tired 75' Telescoping Tree Trimmer  0.00000 DAY
w/o Operator-Day
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141702

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

Rubber Tired 75 Foot Telescoping Tree Trimmer w/o Operator - Daily

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Rubber Tired 75' Telescoping Tree Trimmer  0.00000 WK
w/o Operator-Week
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141702

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

Rubber Tired 75 Foot Telescoping Tree Trimmer w/o Operator - Weekly

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Rubber Tired 75' Telescoping Tree Trimmer  0.00000 MO

w/o Operator-Month
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141702

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Rubber Tired 75 Foot Telescoping Tree Trimmer w/o Operator - Monthly

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
4

Delivery Fee 1st Mile 0.00000 MILE

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification
72141702

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

Delivery Fee 1st Mile for Rubber Tired 75' Telescoping Tree Trimmer

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
Delivery Fee Each Additional Mile 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

72141702

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

Delivery Fee Each Additional Mile for Rubber Tired 75' Telescoping Tree Trimmer

Date Printed: ~ Nov 15, 2023
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Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
6

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Rubber Tired 55' Telescoping Tree Trimmer  0.00000 DAY
w/o Operator-Day

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification
72141702

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

Rubber Tired 55 Foot Telescoping Tree Trimmer w/o Operator - Daily

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
7

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Rubber Tired 55' Telescoping Tree Trimmer  0.00000 WK
w/o Operator-Week

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification
72141702

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

Rubber Tired 55 Foot Telescoping Tree Trimmer w/o Operator - Weekly

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
8

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Rubber Tired 55' Telescoping Tree Trimmer  0.00000 MO
w/o Operator-Month

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
72141702

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

Rubber Tired 55 Foot Telescoping Tree Trimmer w/o Operator - Monthly

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Delivery Fee 1st Mile 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

72141702

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

Delivery Fee 1st Mile for Rubber Tired 55' Telescoping Tree Trimmer

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

10 Delivery Fee Each Additional Mile 0.00000 MILE

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
72141702

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

Delivery Fee Each Additional Mile for Rubber Tired 55' Telescoping Tree Trimmer
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 Truck Bed Mounted 75' Telescoping Tree 0.00000 DAY
Trimmer - Daily

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

72141702
Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

Truck Bed Mounted 75' Telescoping Tree Trimmer - Daily

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 Truck Bed Mounted 75' Telescoping Tree 0.00000 WK

Trimmer - Weekly

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141702

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

Truck Bed Mounted 75' Telescoping Tree Trimmer - Weekly

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 Truck Bed Mounted 75' Telescoping Tree 0.00000 MO
Trimmer - Monthly
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141702

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

Truck Bed Mounted 75' Telescoping Tree Trimmer - Monthly

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 Delivery Fee 1st Mile 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

72141702

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

Delivery Fee 1st Mile for Truck Bed Mounted 75' Telescoping Tree Trimmer

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 Delivery Fee Each Additional Mile 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

72141702

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

Delivery Fee Each Additional Mile for Truck Bed Mounted 75' Telescoping Tree Trimmer
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Tree Trimmer with Telescoping Boom w/o 0.00000 EA
Operator
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141702

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

Tree Trimmer with Telescoping Boom for lease/rental from individuals and organizations, without Operator
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