
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1281540

Solicitation Description: Poly Pipe to restock inventory

Proc Type: Central Purchase Order

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2023-09-13 13:30 SR 0803 ESR09132300000001371 1

VENDOR

000000161230
MINERD & SONS INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2400000017

Total Bid: 72270 Response Date: 2023-09-13 Response Time: 13:18:12

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep
304-558-2566
john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 15" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene 

Pipe
400.00000 FT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40171600    

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
15" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene Pipe for Pendleton County

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 18" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene 

Pipe
400.00000 FT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40171600    

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
18" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene Pipe for Pendleton County

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 24" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene 

Pipe
500.00000 FT 32.500000 16250.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40171600    

Commodity Line Comments: Commodity Specifications:
This is Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene Pipe that does NOT have a pressure rating above 2500 PSI

Extended Description:
24" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene Pipe for Pendleton County

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 18" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene 

Pipe
400.00000 FT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40171600    

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
18" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene Pipe for Pocahontas County

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 24" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene 

Pipe
400.00000 FT 32.850000 13140.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40171600    

Commodity Line Comments: Commodity Specifications:
This is Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene Pipe that does NOT have a pressure rating above 2500 PSI
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Extended Description:
24" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene Pipe for Pocahontas County

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 18" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene 

Pipe
400.00000 FT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40171600    

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
18" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene Pipe for Randolph County

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 24" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene 

Pipe
340.00000 FT 32.000000 10880.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40171600    

Commodity Line Comments: Commodity Specifications:
This is Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene Pipe that does NOT have a pressure rating above 2500 PSI

Extended Description:
24" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene Pipe for Randolph County

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 18" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene 

Pipe
500.00000 FT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40171600    

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
18" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene Pipe for Tucker County

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 24" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene 

Pipe
500.00000 FT 32.000000 16000.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40171600    

Commodity Line Comments: Commodity Specifications:
This is Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene Pipe that does NOT have a pressure rating above 2500 PSI

Extended Description:
24" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene Pipe for Tucker County

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 15" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene 

Pipe
200.00000 FT   
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40171600    

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
15" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene Pipe for Materials Storeroom

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 18" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene 

Pipe
500.00000 FT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40171600    

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
18" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene Pipe for Materials Storeroom

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 24" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene 

Pipe
500.00000 FT 32.000000 16000.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40171600    

Commodity Line Comments: Commodity Specifications:
This is Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene Pipe that does NOT have a pressure rating above 2500 PSI

Extended Description:
24" Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene Pipe for Materials Storeroom


