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Vendor Name:_{\puasesn, Dozt SrsE'EORRUGATED PIPE MATERIALS

PART I

Vendors Instructions:

Vendors may bid any or all Contract Items listed below. This is a multiple vendor award contract. All qualified
responsible Vendors shall be awarded a contract for those Contract Items which meet all mandatory requirements of
this Contract. The low bid Vendor shall be determined per project, as per the Contract Specifications Section 4.1.
Vendor shall provide a Unit Cost bid for Contract Items listed below, for the lengths listed below. Bid price shall
include delivery FOB to the WVDOH destination designated on the Delivery Order at the time of need.

SINGLE WALL CORRUGATED POLY PIPE
Contract EST. Unit of
Item # Contract Item Description Length QTY. Measure Unit Cost
1 4" Poly Pipe Perforated Under-Drain Pipe, Per Coil 250 Feet 12 Each $0.47 per foot
2 6" Poly Pipe Perforated Under-Drain Pipe, Per Coil 100 Feet 12 Each $1.27 per foot

Part | - SINGLE WALL CORRUGATED POLY PIPE
ATT - A Pricing Pages

10F1

CMA 6623C042




Vendor: Avyanten, WInEE Sy CORRUGATED PIPE MATERIALS

PARTII
Vendors Instructions:
Vendors may bid any or all Contract Items listed below. This is a multiple vendor award contract. All gualified
responsible Vendors shall be awarded a contract for those Contract Items which meet all mandatory requirements
of this Contract. The low bid Vendor shall be determined per project, as per the Contract Specifications Section
4.1. Vendor shall provide a Unit Cost bid for Contract Items listed below, for the lengths listed below. Bid price
shall include delivery FOB to the WVDOH destination designated on the Delivery Order at the time of need.
HDPE PIPE, PROFILE WALL, 20 FT and 30 FT
Note: Split Couplings are incidental to HDPE and PP Pipe.
Contract Unit of
Item # Contract Item Description Length Est. Qty. | Measure Unit Cost
3 " . 20 FT 601 Each  |$6.90 per foot
15" HDPE Pipe, Profile Wall, Standard 0ET 3 Each $8.73 per foot
5 " . 20FT 3871 Each  |$9.60 per foot
5 18" HDPE Pipe, Profile Wall, Standard 0ET 700 Each $12.14 per fool
7 " . : 20 FT 1560 Each  |$17.00 per foot
8 24" HDPE Pipe, Profile Wall, Standard 0FT 350 Each $2151 per foot
9 " ) 20FT 277 Each  [$25.00 per foot
10 30" HDPE Pipe, Profile Wall, Standard 0ET 100 Each $31.62 per foot
11 Y : 20FT 7355 Each  [$33.00 per foot
) 36" HDPE Pipe, Profile Wall, Standard O ET 305 Each $43.13 per foot
13 " : 20FT 404 Each  [$57.00 per foot
1 48" HDPE Pipe, Profile Wall, Standard 0ET — 115 Each $74.51 per fool
15 " ., 20FT 274 Each  [$84.00 per foot
16 60" HDPE Pipe, Profile Wall, Standard 0ET 25 Each $109.80 per fool

Part IT - HDPE Pipe, Profile Wall 20 FT 30 FT
ATT - A Pricing Pages 10F1 CMA 6623C042



Vendor Name: _fwumvoey, Dassnoz Sysmwad, CORRUGATED PIPE MATERIALS

PART III

Vendors Instructions:
Vendors may bid any or all Contract Items listed below. This is a multiple vendor award contract. All qualified
responsible Vendors shall be awarded a contract for those Contract Items which meet all mandatory

requirements of this Contract. The low bid Vendor shall be determined per project, as per the Contract
Specifications Section 4.1. Vendor shall provide a Unit Cost bid for Contract Items listed below, for the lengths
listed below. Bid price shall include delivery FOB to the WVDOH destination designated on the Delivery
Order at the time of need.

POLYPROPYLENE PIPE, 20 FT and 30 FT

Note: Split Couplings are incidental to HDPE and PP Pipe.
Contract Unit of
Item# Contract Item Description Length | Est. Qty. Measure Unit Cost

17 ! : v 20FT 3 Each $15.50 per foot
18 15" PP Pipe, Dual Wall, Standard 30 FT ) Fach No Bid
19 " . 20FT 3 Each $22.00 per foot
20 18" PP Pipe, Dual Wall, Standard 30FT 3 Fach No Bid
21 " ) 20 FT 4 Each $36.69 per foot
o7 24" PP Pipe, Dual Wall, Standard 30 FT 3 Each No Bid
23 " : 20 FT 3 Each $57.00 per foot
>4 30" PP Pipe, Dual Wall, Standard 30FT 3 Each No Bid
25 " . 20 FT 3 Each $63.00 per foot
26 36" PP Pipe, Dual Wall, Standard 30FT 7 Each No Bid
27 " : 20FT 3 Each $124.00 per foot
8 48" PP Pipe, Dual Wall, Standard 30 FT 3 Fach No Bid
29 " . _ 20 FT 3 Each $170.00 per foot
30 60" PP Pipe, Dual Wall, Standard 30FT 3 Fach No Bid

Part lll - Polyproplene Pipe 20 FT AND 30 FT

ATT - A Pricing Pages 10F1

CMA 6623C042



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

Corru§ated Pipe Materials

SPECIFICATIONS

1. PURPOSE AND SCOPE: The West Virginia Purchasing Division is soliciting bids on
behalf of the West Virginia Division of Highways to establish an open-end, multiple
award contract for Corrugated Pipe Materials for WVDOH projects throughout the state
of West Virginia.

2. DEFINITIONS: The terms listed below shall have the following meanings assigned to
them throughout and for the purpose of this Solicitation. Additional definitions can be
found in Section 2 of the General Terms and Conditions.

2.1

2.2

23

24

25

2.6

2.7

“AASHTO?” - The American Association of State Highway and Transportation
Officials. Reference https://transportation.org/

“ADO” and “Agency Delivery Order” - A written order entered by WWDOH
personnel in the wvOASIS financial system against a master agreement,
authorizing quantities of commodities and/or services to be delivered in
accordance with all terms, conditions, and prices stipulated in the original contract.

“ASTM?” — The American Society for Testing and Materials.
https://www.astm.org/

“Contract Item(s)” - The list of items available for a Vendor to provide pricing as
identified in Section 3.2 of this Solicitation and referenced throughout.

“Contractor” or “Vendor” - Interchangeably used throughout this Solicitation
and in any cited Sections of the West Virginia Department of Transportation,
Division of Highways Standard Specifications, Roads and Bridges, adopted latest
Standard Specs edition, as amended, including any Supplementals and refers to
any entity submitting a bid in response to the Solicitation, the entity that has been
selected as the lowest responsible bidder, or the entity that has been awarded the
Contract, as context requires.

“Emergency Requests” — Work Orders requiring to be done without delay owing
to circumstances with regard to which the WVDOH could not have reasonably
expected and have been designated as such by a representative of the WVDOH.

“FOB” or “Free on Board” - Indicates that the price for goods includes delivery
at the Vendor’s expense to a specified point, and that the Vendor retains liability
for loss or damage until the goods are delivered.

Form Revised 10/27/2014 1 CMA 6623C042



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Corrugated Pipe Materials

Materials, equipment, and performance of this contract shall conform to, but are
not limited to, the requirements of Sections 604, 606, 713 and 714 as amended.

Free electronic copies of the Standard Specs and Supplementals are available at:
https://transportation.wv.gov/highways/TechnicalSupport/specifications/Pages/def

ault.aspx.

3.2 Contract Items and Mandatory Requirements: Vendor shall provide Agency
with the Contract Items listed below on an open-end and continuing basis.
Contract Items must meet or exceed the mandatory requirements as shown below.

3.2.1 PartI: Corrugated Polyethylene Underdrainage Pipe — Single Wall,
Contract Items 1 and 2, shall be bid in 100-foot and 250-foot increments.
Pipe shall conform to the requirements of Standard Specs Sections 606 and
714, as amended.

3.2.2 PartIl: Corrugated High-Density Polyethylene (HDPE) Pipe, Profile
Wall - Contract Items 3 through 16, shall be bid in 20-Foot and 30-Foot
length joints. Pipe shall conform to the requirements of Standard Specs
Sections 604 and 714, as amended, and AASHTO M 294, types “S™ or
“D”. Pipe shall be fabricated such that the connection of pipe sections will
form a continuous line free from irregularities in the flow line. Flexible
pipes shall be joined by bell and spigot joints, and the pipe shall be
installed to preserve the alignment, provide a leak resistant joint that
conforms to ASTM D3212 performance requirements, and prevent the
separation of sections. Vendors bidding must source approved
suppliers/fabricators from MCS&T, APL 714.019.003 Corrugated
Polyethylene Plastic Pipe, as amended. Reference:
https://transportation.wv.gov/highways/mest/Pages/APL._By Number.aspx

3.2.3 PartIIl: Corrugated Polypropylene (PP) Pipe, Dual Wall — Contract
Items 17 through 30, shall be bid in 20-foot and 30-foot length joints.
Corrugated PP Pipe shall conform to the requirements of Standard Specs
Sections 604 and 714.17, and ASTM F2881M or AASHTO M 330.
Flexible pipes shall be joined by bell and spigot joints, and the pipe shall be
installed to preserve the alignment, provide a leak resistant joint that
conforms to ASTM D3212 performance requirements, and prevent the
separation of sections. The dual wall pipe and fittings shall meet the
requirements of ASTM F2306/ F2306M, F2763, F2764/F2764M,
F2881/F2881M and F2947/F2947M or AASHTO M 330.

3.2.4 Split Couplings: Split Couplings are used occasionally by the WVDOH and

shall be incidental to the ordering of HDPE or PP pipe only. The cost of
Split Couplings should be factored into the bid price of pipe. Vendors shall

Form Revised 10/27/2014 3 CMA 6623C042



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Corrugated Pipe Materials

Standard Specs, with grated assemblies made of structural steel, suitable
welded, to form the open slot and hot-dip galvanized to meet provisions of
ASTM A 123. Pipe shall be in 20-foot sections. Note: Bands may or may not
be purchased when the pipe is purchased.

3.2.9 PART VIII: Aluminum Coated (Aluminized) Steel, Type II Corrugated
Metal Pipe, Contract Items 227 — 246 shall conform to the requirements of
Standard Specs Section 713.24 and AASHTO M 36. Pipe shall be in 20-foot
sections. Note: Bands may or may not be purchased when the pipe is
purchased.

3.2.10 PART IX: Aluminum Coated (Aluminized) Steel, Type II Corrugated
Metal Culvert Arch Pipe, Contract Items 247 - 318 shall conform to the
requirements of Standard Specs Section 713.24 and AASHTO M 36. Pipe
shall be in 20-foot sections. Note: Bands may or may not be purchased when
the pipe is purchased.

3.2.11 PART X: Aluminum Coated (Aluminized) Culvert Pipe (Type I),
Contract Items 319 - 398, reference Section 713.2 of the Standard Specs
and AASHTO M 36. Pipe shall be in 20-foot sections. Note: Bands may or
may not be purchased when the pipe is purchased.

3.2.12 PART XI: Corrugated Aluminum Alloy Under - Drain Pipe (Type III)
perforated, Contract Items 399-400, reference Section 713.2 of the
Standard Specs. Pipe shall be in 20-foot sections. Note: Bands may or may
not be purchased when the pipe is purchased.

PART XII: Three-Sided Shell and Full Aluminum Inverts, Contract
Items 401 - 1096, reference Section 713.18 of the Standard Specs.
Aluminum accessories for three-sided shells are available for bid within
each category of Corrugated Pipe Material on ATT A.

NOTE: Most structures with full aluminum inverts are limited to a
maximum of four feet of cover. Most three-sided (bottomless) structures
on concrete footings can handle up to five feet of cover. Consult the
manufacturer for the specifics on each size.

3.2.13 Sizes, Shapes, Corrugations, Metal Thicknesses: pipe shall be per the

following table unless otherwise noted on the Pricing Page (ATT A) for the
Pipe-Arch bid sizes:

Form Revised 10/27/2014 5 CMA 6623C042



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Corrugated Pipe Materials

4.2.1 The Pricing Pages contain a list of Contract Items and estimated purchase
volumes. The estimated purchase volume for each item represents the
approximate volume of anticipated purchases only. No future use of the
Contract or any individual item is guaranteed or implied.

4.2.2 Vendors should type or electronically enter the information into the Pricing
Pages spreadsheet to prevent errors in the evaluation. In most cases, the

Pricing Pages are available in wvOASIS within the solicitation attachments,
however, Vendors may request an electronic copy of the Pricing Pages
spreadsheet for bid purposes by sending an email request to the following

address: John.W.Estep@wv.gov

4.2.3 Changing a column or row description, Contract Item description, unit of
measure, or estimated quantities on the Pricing Pages, Attachment A
(ATT A), shall result in the disqualification of Contract Item bid on the
altered line. In circumstances when all Contract Items must be bid for bid
evaluation and contract award, the disqualification of any Contract Item
will result in the disqualification of the entire bid.

Submitting Pricing Pages other than those provided with this solicitation, as
described in Section 4.2, shall result in the disqualification of the Vendor’s
bid in its entirety.

Vendor entries of bid prices or other notations made in wvOASIS
commodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or
award.

4.3 Contract Award Transition: Upon award of this contract, the WVDOH
Operations Division will announce the effective date of use of this contract to the
Districts and the Vendors, whether it is by the effective date, the completed and
encumbered date, or an established date by the WVDOH. Upon the announced
effective date of use, any order issued prior to the award of the contract shall remain
in effect and should not be cancelled until that order is filled; however, after 10
working days of the Districts and Vendors notice, any order that has not been
completely filled by the Vendors shall NOT be completed and a cancellation notice
will be sent to that Vendor from the issuing District for cancellation of the balance of
that order only. No orders from prior contracts should be held open by the Districts
or Vendors longer than 10 working days after the effective date of use is announced
for the new contract.

4.4 Cooperative Contracting: The purchase prices on all Contract Items herein,
available for the WVDOH, shall be adoptable for other public agencies upon their
request. Agencies under the authority of the West Virginia Purchasing Division must
receive prior approval by the Purchasing Director.

Form Revised 10/27/2014 7 CMA 6623C042



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Corrugated Pipe Materials

WVDOH ADO, the Vendor shall advise the WVDOH in writing within five (5)
calendar days of their acceptance or refusal of the ADO. As verification of receipt,

Vendor must provide written acknowledgement of any ADOs, and any
Revisions/Modifications thereto sent by WVDOH. Failure to provide the
WVDOH with written acknowledgement of any ADQOs/Revisions within five (5)
days of the Order being sent shall be considered refusal of the ADQ. In the event
of refusal, the WVDOH at its own discretion shall cancel the ADO and may seek
to obtain the goods or services from the next low bid Vendor or proceed with an
emergency purchase from the open market.

6.2  Delivery Time: Vendor shall deliver standard orders within ten (10) working days
after orders are received. The minimum total dollar value order shall be no less
than $1,000.00. Additional shipping charges may be added by the Vendor to any
total dollar value order of less than $1,000.00 per delivery site. Vendor shall ship
all orders in accordance with the established delivery date and shall not hold orders
until a minimum delivery quantity is met unless otherwise directed by the
WVDOH.

6.3  Late Delivery: The Agency placing the order under this Contract must be notified
in writing if orders will be delayed for any reason. Any delay in delivery that could
cause harm to an Agency will be grounds for cancellation of a delayed order
and/or obtaining the items ordered from another awarded vendor or proceeding
with an Emergency Purchase from the open market.

64  The Agency placing the ADO under this Contract must be notified in writing by
the Vendor no later than five (5) business days prior to the delivery date noted
on the Agency’s order. Any failure to notify, acknowledge receipt of WVDOH’s
written ADOs/ Revisions resulting in delivery delay, or failure to start or complete
a project per the WVDOH scheduled due dates may be determined by the
WVDOH at its sole discretion as harmful to the Agency and as such, shall result in
WVDOH’s cancellation of the ADO and application of Liquidated Damages.

Any Agency seeking to obtain items from the open market under this provision
must first obtain approval of the West Virginia Purchasing Division.

6.4.1 Liquidated Damages: If the Vendor’s delivery or corrections of delivery
error exceeds the ADO completion due date or timeframe, the Vendor shall
agree that no extension of contract time will be granted unless Liquidated
Damages are applied by the WVDOH in the form of an off-set reduction to
the total amount of the Vendor’s final invoice. The WVDOH shall
calculate Liquidated Damages per project beginning on day one (1) after
the WVDOH’s specified ADO due date and in accordance with this
Section, the Contract’s Terms and Conditions, Standard Specs Section
108.7, and the following Standard Specs Section Table 108.7.1 - Schedule

Form Revised 10/27/2014 9 CMA 6623C042



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Corrugated Pipe Materials

purchase price, at the Agency’s discretion.

6.7  Return Due to Agency Error: Items ordered in error by the Agency will be
returned for credit within 30 days of receipt, F.0.B. Vendor’s location. Vendors
shall not charge a restocking fee if returned products are in a resalable condition.
Items shall be deemed to be in a resalable condition if they are unused and in the
original packaging. Any restocking fee for items not in a resalable condition shall
be the lower of the Vendor’s customary restocking fee or 5% of the total invoiced
value of the returned items.

7. VENDOR DEFAULT:
7.1  The following shall be considered a vendor default under this Contract.

7.1.1 Failure to provide Contract Items in accordance with the requirements
contained herein.

7.1.2  Failure to comply with other specifications and requirements contained
herein.

7.1.3 Failure to comply with any laws, rules, and ordinances applicable to the
Contract Services provided under this Contract.

7.1.4 Failure to remedy deficient performance upon request.
7.2  The following remedies shall be available to the Agency upon default.
7.2.1 Immediate cancellation of the Contract.

7.2.2 Immediate cancellation of one or more release orders issued under this
Contract.

7.2.3 Any other remedies available in law or equity.

Form Revised 10/27/2014 11 CMA 6623C042



DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as the
Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this Contract.

(Printed Name and Title) Jason Foster, Territory Manager
4640 Trueman Blvd, Hilliard OH 43026

(Phone Number) / (Fax Number) (3 04) 360-7386
(Email address) Jason.Foster@ads-pipe.com

(Address)

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wvOASIS, I certify that: I have reviewed this Solicitation/Contract in its entirety; that I
understand the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that
this bid, offer or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn;
that the product or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the
Solicitation/Contract for that product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor
accepts the terms and conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that
I am submitting this bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; that this bid or offer was
made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any entity submitting a bid or
offer for the same material, supplies, equipment or services; that this bid or offer is in all respects
fair and without collusion or fraud; that this Contract is accepted or entered into without any prior
understanding, agreement, or connection to any other entity that could be considered a violation of
law; that T am authorized by the Vendor to execute and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any
documents related thereto on Vendor’s behalf: that I am authorized to bind the vendor in a
contractual relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, the vendor has properly registered
with any State agency that may require registration.

By signing below, I further certify that I understand this Contract is subject to the
provisions of West Virginia Code § 54-3-62. which automatically voids certain contract
clauses that violate State law; and that pursuant to W. Va. Code 54-3-63. the entity
entering into this contract is prohibited from engaging in a boycott against Israel.

Advanced Drainage Systems, Inc.

Comoa) I f2 e ——
(Signature of Authorized Representative)
Mike Huebert, EVP of Sales

(Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative) (Date)
¥ (800) 835.7473. (614) 658-005%

(Phone Number) (Fax Number)
Michael.Huebert@adspipe.com
(Email Address)

’-:,':‘ T Commission #: 2023-RE-865017
;&gﬁ% My Commission Expires §7-16-28

Revised 11/1/2022 .



GENERAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS:

1. CONTRACTUAL AGREEMENT: Issuance of an Award Document signed by the
Purchasing Division Director, or his designee, and approved as to form by the Attorney
General’s office constitutes acceptance by the State of this Contract made by and between the
State of West Virginia and the Vendor. Vendor’s signature on its bid, or on the Contract if the
Contract is not the result of a bid solicitation, signifies Vendor’s agreement to be bound by and
accept the terms and conditions contained in this Contract.

2. DEFINITIONS: As used in this Solicitation/Contract, the following terms shall have the
meanings attributed to them below. Additional definitions may be found in the specifications
included with this Solicitation/Contract.

2.1. “Agency” or “Agencies” means the agency, board, commission, or other entity of the State
of West Virginia that is identified on the first page of the Solicitation or any other public entity
seeking to procure goods or services under this Contract.

2.2. “Bid” or “Proposal” means the vendors submitted response to this solicitation.

2.3. “Contract” means the binding agreement that is entered into between the State and the
Vendor to provide the goods or services requested in the Solicitation.

2.4. “Director” means the Director of the West Virginia Department of Administration,
Purchasing Division.

2.5. “Purchasing Division” means the West Virginia Department of Administration, Purchasing
Division.

2.6. “Award Document” means the document signed by the Agency and the Purchasing
Division, and approved as to form by the Attorney General, that identifies the Vendor as the
contract holder.

2.7. “Solicitation” means the official notice of an opportunity to supply the State with goods or
services that is published by the Purchasing Division.

2.8. “State” means the State of West Virginia and/or any of its agencies, commissions, boards,
etc. as context requires.

2.9. “Vendor” or “Vendors” means any entity submitting a bid in response to the

Solicitation, the entity that has been selected as the lowest responsible bidder, or the entity that
has been awarded the Contract as context requires.

Revised 11/1/2022



[ Fixed Period Contract with Renewals: This Contract becomes effective upon Vendor’s
receipt of the notice to proceed and part of the Contract more fully described in the attached

specifications must be completed within days. Upon completion of the
work covered by the preceding sentence, the vendor agrees that:

[ ] the contract will continue for years;

[ the contract may be renewed for successive

year periods or shorter periods provided that they do not exceed the total number of
months contained in all available renewals. Automatic renewal of this Contract is
prohibited. Renewals must be approved by the Vendor, Agency, Purchasing Division
and Attorney General’s Office (Attorney General approval is as to form only).

[] One-Time Purchase: The term of this Contract shall run from the issuance of the Award
Document until all of the goods contracted for have been delivered, but in no event will this
Contract extend for more than one fiscal year.

[[] Construction/Project Oversight: This Contract becomes effective on the effective start
date listed on the first page of this Contract, identified as the State of West Virginia contract
cover page containing the signatures of the Purchasing Division, Attorney General, and
Encumbrance clerk (or another page identified as
), and continues until the project for which the

vendor is providing oversight is complete.

[] Other: Contract Term specified in

4. AUTHORITY TO PROCEED: Vendor is authorized to begin performance of this contract on
the date of encumbrance listed on the front page of the Award Document unless either the box for
“Fixed Period Contract” or “Fixed Period Contract with Renewals” has been checked in Section 3
above. If either “Fixed Period Contract” or “Fixed Period Contract with Renewals” has been
checked, Vendor must not begin work until it receives a separate notice to proceed from the State.
The notice to proceed will then be incorporated into the Contract via change order to memorialize the
official date that work commenced.

S. QUANTITIES: The quantities required under this Contract shall be determined in accordance
with the category that has been identified as applicable to this Contract below.

Open End Contract: Quantities listed in this Solicitation/Award Document are
approximations only, based on estimates supplied by the Agency. It is understood and agreed
that the Contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the
Contract, whether more or less than the quantities shown.

[J Service: The scope of the service to be provided will be more clearly defined in the
specifications included herewith.

[[] Combined Service and Goods: The scope of the service and deliverable goods to be
provided will be more clearly defined in the specifications included herewith.

Revised 11/1/2022



8. INSURANCE: The apparent successful Vendor shall furnish proof of the insurance
identified by a checkmark below prior to Contract award. The insurance coverages identified
below must be maintained throughout the life of this contract. Thirty (30) days prior to the
expiration of the insurance policies, Vendor shall provide the Agency with proof that the
insurance mandated herein has been continued. Vendor must also provide Agency with
immediate notice of any changes in its insurance policies, including but not limited to, policy
cancelation, policy reduction, or change in insurers. The apparent successful Vendor shall also
furnish proof of any additional insurance requirements contained in the specifications prior to
Contract award regardless of whether that insurance requirement is listed in this section.

Vendor must maintain:

Commercial General Liability Insurance in at least an amount of: $1,000,000 per
occurrence.

[] Automobile Liability Insurance in at least an amount of: per
occurrence.

[J Professional/Malpractice/Errors and Omission Insurance in at least an amount of:
per occurrence. Notwithstanding the forgoing, Vendor’s are not required
to list the State as an additional insured for this type of policy.

[JCommercial Crime and Third Party Fidelity Insurance in an amount of:
per occurrence.

[] Cyber Liability Insurance in an amount of: per
occurrence.

[ Builders Risk Insurance in an amount equal to 100% of the amount of the Contract.

[]Pollution Insurance in an amount of: per occurrence.
[ Aircraft Liability in an amount of: per occurrence.
|

O

O
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17. ADDITIONAL FEES: Vendor is not permitted to charge additional fees or assess
additional charges that were not either expressly provided for in the solicitation published by the
State of West Virginia, included in the Contract, or included in the unit price or lump sum bid
amount that Vendor is required by the solicitation to provide. Including such fees or charges as
notes to the solicitation may result in rejection of vendor’s bid. Requesting such fees or charges
be paid after the contract has been awarded may result in cancellation of the contract.

18. FUNDING: This Contract shall continue for the term stated herein, contingent upon funds
being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise being made available. In the event funds are
not appropriated or otherwise made available, this Contract becomes void and of no effect
beginning on July 1 of the fiscal year for which funding has not been appropriated or otherwise
made available. If that occurs, the State may notify the Vendor that an alternative source of
funding has been obtained and thereby avoid the automatic termination. Non-appropriation or
non-funding shall not be considered an event of default.

19. CANCELLATION: The Purchasing Division Director reserves the right to cancel this
Contract immediately upon written notice to the vendor if the materials or workmanship supplied
do not conform to the specifications contained in the Contract. The Purchasing Division Director
may also cancel any purchase or Contract upon 30 days written notice to the Vendor in
accordance with West Virginia Code of State Rules § 148-1-5.2.b.

20. TIME: Time is of the essence regarding all matters of time and performance in this
Contract.

21. APPLICABLE LAW: This Contract is governed by and interpreted under West Virginia
law without giving effect to its choice of law principles. Any information provided in
specification manuals, or any other source, verbal or written, which contradicts or violates the
West Virginia Constitution, West Virginia Code, or West Virginia Code of State Rules is void
and of no effect.

22. COMPLIANCE WITH LAWS: Vendor shall comply with all applicable federal, state, and
local laws, regulations and ordinances. By submitting a bid, Vendor acknowledges that it has
reviewed, understands, and will comply with all applicable laws, regulations, and ordinances.

SUBCONTRACTOR COMPLIANCE: Vendor shall notify all subcontractors providing
commodities or services related to this Contract that as subcontractors, they too are
required to comply with all applicable laws, regulations, and ordinances. Notification
under this provision must occur prior to the performance of any work under the contract
by the subcontractor.

23. ARBITRATION: Any references made to arbitration contained in this Contract, Vendor’s
bid, or in any American Institute of Architects documents pertaining to this Contract are hereby
deleted, void, and of no effect.
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31. YOUR SUBMISSION IS A PUBLIC DOCUMENT: Vendor’s entire response to the
Solicitation and the resulting Contract are public documents. As public documents, they will be
disclosed to the public following the bid/proposal opening or award of the contract, as required
by the competitive bidding laws of West Virginia Code §§ 5A-3-1 et seq., 5-22-1 et seq., and
5G-1-1 et seq. and the Freedom of Information Act West Virginia Code §§ 29B-1-1 et seq.

DO NOT SUBMIT MATERIAL YOU CONSIDER TO BE CONFIDENTIAL, A TRADE
SECRET, OR OTHERWISE NOT SUBJECT TO PUBLIC DISCLOSURE.

Submission of any bid, proposal, or other document to the Purchasing Division constitutes your
explicit consent to the subsequent public disclosure of the bid, proposal, or document. The
Purchasing Division will disclose any document labeled “confidential,” “proprietary,” “trade
secret,” “private,” or labeled with any other claim against public disclosure of the documents, to
include any “trade secrets” as defined by West Virginia Code § 47-22-1 et seq. All submissions
are subject to public disclosure without notice.

32. LICENSING: In accordance with West Virginia Code of State Rules § 148-1-6.1.¢,
Vendor must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local
laws and requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited
to, the West Virginia Secretary of State’s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West
Virginia Insurance Commission, or any other state agency or political subdivision. Obligations
related to political subdivisions may include, but are not limited to, business licensing, business
and occupation taxes, inspection compliance, permitting, etc. Upon request, the Vendor must
provide all necessary releases to obtain information to enable the Purchasing Division Director
or the Agency to verify that the Vendor is licensed and in good standing with the above
entities.

SUBCONTRACTOR COMPLIANCE: Vendor shall notify all subcontractors
providing commodities or services related to this Contract that as subcontractors, they
too are required to be licensed, in good standing, and up-to-date on all state and local
obligations as described in this section. Obligations related to political subdivisions may
include, but are not limited to, business licensing, business and occupation taxes,
inspection compliance, permitting, etc. Notification under this provision must occur
prior to the performance of any work under the contract by the subcontractor.

33. ANTITRUST: In submitting a bid to, signing a contract with, or accepting a Award
Document from any agency of the State of West Virginia, the Vendor agrees to convey, sell,
assign, or transfer to the State of West Virginia all rights, title, and interest in and to all causes of
action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and the State
of West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the particular
commodities or services purchased or acquired by the State of West Virginia. Such assignment
shall be made and become effective at the time the purchasing agency tenders the initial payment
to Vendor.

34. VENDOR NON-CONFLICT: Neither Vendor nor its representatives are permitted to have
any interest, nor shall they acquire any interest, direct or indirect, which would compromise the
performance of its services hereunder. Any such interests shall be promptly presented in detail to

the Agency.
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39. REPORTS: Vendor shall provide the Agency and/or the Purchasing Division with the
following reports identified by a checked box below:

Such reports as the Agency and/or the Purchasing Division may request. Requested reports
may include, but are not limited to, quantities purchased, agencies utilizing the contract, total
contract expenditures by agency, etc.

Quarterly reports detailing the total quantity of purchases in units and dollars, along with a
listing of purchases by agency. Quarterly reports should be delivered to the Purchasing Division

via email at purchasing.division@wv.gov.

40. BACKGROUND CHECK: In accordance with W. Va. Code § 15-2D-3, the State reserves
the right to prohibit a service provider’s employees from accessing sensitive or critical
information or to be present at the Capitol complex based upon results addressed from a criminal
background check. Service providers should contact the West Virginia Division of Protective
Services by phone at (304) 558-9911 for more information.

41. PREFERENCE FOR USE OF DOMESTIC STEEL PRODUCTS: Except when
authorized by the Director of the Purchasing Division pursuant to W. Va, Code § SA-3-56,
no contractor may use or supply steel products for a State Contract Project other than those
steel products made in the United States. A contractor who uses steel products in violation of
this section may be subject to civil penalties pursuantto W. Va. Code § 5A-3-56. As used in
this section:

a. “State Contract Project” means any erection or construction of, or any addition to,
alteration of or other improvement to any building or structure, including, but not limited
to, roads or highways, or the installation of any heating or cooling or ventilating plants or
other equipment, or the supply of and materials for such projects, pursuant to a contract
with the State of West Virginia for which bids were solicited on or after June-6, 2001.

b. “Steel Products” means products rolled, formed, shaped, drawn, extruded, forged, cast,
fabricated or otherwise similarly processed, or processed by a combination of two or
more or such operations, from steel made by the open heath, basic oxygen, electric
furnace, Bessemer or other steel making process.

c. The Purchasing Division Director may, in writing, authorize the use of foreign steel
products if:

1. The cost for each contract item used does not exceed one tenth of one percent
(-1%) of the total contract cost or two thousand five hundred dollars ($2,500.00),
whichever is greater. For the purposes of this section, the cost is the value of the
steel product as delivered to the project; or

2. The Director of the Purchasing Division determines that specified steel materials

are not produced in the United States in sufficient quantity or otherwise are not
reasonably available to meet contract requirements.
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g I DATE(MM/DD/YYYY)
ACORD
e CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE 03/23/2023
THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.
IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy{ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed. If >
SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this 5.":_’
certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s). T
PRODUCER ﬁgﬂg\ﬂ §
Aon Risk Services Central, Inc. PHONE - FAX - .
chicago IL ogf}' ce (A/C. No. Exty: (B66) 283-7122 j fA. Noj: (800) 363-0105 E:
200 East Randolp E-MAIL °
Chicago IL 60601 USA ADDRESS: T
INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
INSURED INSURER A: Liberty Insurance Corporation 42404
Advanced Drainage Systems, Inc. INSURER B:
4640 Trueman Blvd
Hilliard OH 43026-2438 USA INSURER C:
INSURER D:
INSURER E:
INSURER F:
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 570098467189 REVISION NUMBER:
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABQVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESGRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS. Limits shown are as requested
| TESH TYPE OF INSURANCE DD SUB POLICY NUMBER aCr T | ey e LIMITS
A | X | cCOMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY TB/7641445606033 53}5155335 1/2024] EacH ocCURRENCE $2,000,000
= | DAMAGE TO FENTED
—l CLAIMS-MABE OGCUR PREMISES {Ea oceurrence) $2,000,000
MED EXP (Any one person) Excluded
] PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $2,000,000|
EN 'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $6,000,000 E
POLICY . [x] e LoG PRODUCTS - COMF/OP AGG $4,000,000 3
OTHER: §
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT b
{Ea accident) .
ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY ( Per person) §
| AOUWTNOESDONLY I:Ii%’;%%ULED BODILY INJURY (Per accident) %
— 1 y PROPERTY DAMAGE
| on eS| Roros ont (Per accident -5‘3
i I | 13
[ UMBRELLA LIAB OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE o
| ExcessLias CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE
[oED | [RETENTION
WORKERS COMPENSATION AND PER STATUTE | ’o'rH-
EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY Y/N e ER
ANY PROPRIETOR / PARTNER / EXECUTIVE E.L. EACH ACCIDENT
OFFICER/'MEMBER EXCLUDED? N/A
(Mandatory in NH) £.L. DISEASE-EAEMPLOYEE
Irf) gﬁ;gféﬂg’ﬁ ‘6":-9 OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE-POLICY LIMIT —
ety
=

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space Is required)
state of West virginia is included as additional Insured in accordance with the policy provisions of the General Liability

!

1900 Kanawha Bivd. E.,
Charleston wv 25305 USA

Bidg. 5

policy.
CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION
SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE THE
EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE
POLICY PROVISIONS.
State of west virginia AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

A Dt Foteies Contrand’s S oua

TR Bt e e

ACORD 25 (2016/03)
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