
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
 





Date Printed: Sep 15, 2022 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1087735

Solicitation Description: Roadway Salt - Sodium Chloride 6623C006

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2022-09-14 13:30 SR 0803 ESR09142200000001356 1

VENDOR

000000183941
CARGILL INC DEICING TECHNOLOGY BUSINESS UNIT

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2300000020

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2022-09-14 Response Time: 13:16:26

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep
304-558-2566
john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Roadway Salt - Sodium Chloride 0.00000 TON 4371712.500000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161506    

Commodity Line Comments: Please see attachments

Extended Description:
Roadway Salt - Sodium Chloride for use in snow removal and ice control throughout the state of West Virginia.
VENDOR NOTE:  Bid evaluation will be based on the bid prices submitted on the Pricing Pages Attachment A (ATT A) and Attachment B(ATT 
B).  Vendor's entries of bid prices or other notations made in the wvOASIS commodity lines/descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation 
or award.

































































































































Vendor Storage Site Locations
Pick-up Cost 

per Ton

BALTIMORE

2149 South Clinton St

Baltimore, MD 21224

6621C062  Salt Pick-up by Agency only

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment B - Pricing Pages by Pick-up

Vendor shall complete ATT B by identifying its storage site locations (physical 911 address) 

and provide a price per ton for roadway salt to be available for pick-up by WVDOH 

Agencies.  Vendor pricing shall include cost of  Vendor loading Agency trucks.

$95.00



Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Clinton @ WV85 1,000.00           

Rock Creek 2,500.00           

Seth 750.00              

4,250 NO BID #VALUE!

Widen Road & CR 11 2,000.00           

Maysel 100.00              

2,100 NO BID #VALUE!

Chelyan 1,500.00           

Elkview 2,200.00           

North Charleston 2,200.00           

St. Albans 2,500.00           

I-64 @ Rt. 119 and Penn. Avenue 1,200.00           

I-77 @ Sissonville 1,100.00           

I-79 @ Amma 1,100.00           

Corridor G @ Alum Creek 1,500.00           

13,300 NO BID #VALUE!

Glenwood 500.00              

Pt. Pleasant @ Fairground Rd. 5,000.00           

Pt. Pleasant @ Jackson Ave. -                    

5,500 NO BID #VALUE!

Red House 500.00              

Hurricane @ Rt. 34 2,500.00           

I-64 @ Scary Creek 1,000.00           

4,000 NO BID #VALUE!

29,150

Cargill, Incorporated-Salt, Road Safety

DISTRICT 1

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Putnam County Estimated Total

Mason County Estimated Total

Kanawha County Estimated Total

Clay County Estimated Total

Boone County Estimated Total

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price that 

populates in the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the Vendor's Price 

Per Ton bid entry. 

DISTRICT 1 ESTIMATED TOTAL

Boone

Putnam

Mason

Kanawha

Clay

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 1 of 11

6623C006



Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Barboursville / Cabell Co. HQ 3,250                    

Huntington I-64 Section 1 2,450                    

Huntington 31st Bridge 200                       

Huntington 17th St. Bridge -                           

5,900                    NO BID #VALUE!

West Hamlin 2,000                    

Yawkey 1,200                    

Harts 1,100                    

4,300                    NO BID #VALUE!

Corridor G @ Chapmanville 1,700                    

Wilkinson Substation 2,500                    

Man Substation 50                         

Hickory Lane -                           

4,250                    NO BID #VALUE!

Corridor G @ Miller's Creek, Bldg #03011 2,050                    

Mingo Cty @Miller's Creek, Bldg #03025 2,100                    

Gilbert Substation 1,150                    

Mingo 119 South -                           

5,300                    NO BID #VALUE!

Pritchard Substation 3,531                    

Wayne County Headquarters 2,700                    

Crum Substation 1,500                    

Heartland Intermodal Gateway -                           

7,731                    NO BID #VALUE!

27,481                  DISTRICT 2 ESTIMATED TOTAL

Wayne

Mingo

Lincoln

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price that populates in 

the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the Vendor's Price Per Ton bid entry. 

Cargill, Incorporated-Salt, Road Safety

DISTRICT 2

Cabell

Logan

Wayne County Estimated Total

Mingo County Estimated Total

Logan County Estimated Total

Lincoln County Estimated Total

Cabell County Estimated Total

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 2 of 11

6623C006



Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Calhoun Millstone 5500

5500 NO BID #VALUE!

Ripley / Jackson Co. HQ 2000

I-77 @ Medina 1300

3300 NO BID #VALUE!

Pleasants Belmont 1800

1800 NO BID #VALUE!

APD Pennsboro 1900

Ellenboro / Harrisville Substation 2500

Corridor D @ Nutter Farm 400

Smithville Substation 450

5250 NO BID #VALUE!

Lefthand @ WV 36 400

Ambler Ridge Substation @ US 119 100

Roane County HQ 1600

2100 NO BID #VALUE!

Wirt Harrisville Substation 900

900 NO BID #VALUE!

Parkersburg @ Rt. 95S 5600

I-77 @ Parkersburg 4500

Corridor D @ Riverhill 2100

12200 NO BID #VALUE!

31,050            

Calhoun County Estimated Total

Roane County Estimated Total

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price 

that populates in the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the 

Vendor's Price Per Ton bid entry. 

Cargill, Incorporated-Salt, Road Safety

DISTRICT 3

DISTRICT 3 ESTIMATED TOTAL

Wood

Roane

Ritchie

Jackson

Wood County Estimated Total

Wirt County Estimated Total

Ritchie County Estimated Total

Pleasants County Estimated Total

Jackson County Estimated Total

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 3 of 11

6623C006



Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Greenwood 200

West Union 800

1,000               NO BID #VALUE!

Harrison Co. HQ 3500

Saltwell 500

Lost Creek Substation 1000

Tunnel Hill Substation 1500

6,500               NO BID #VALUE!

Marion Co. HQ 1000

Mannington Substation 500

1,500               107.50$             161,250.00$               

Goshen Rd. Substation 2000

Monongalia Co. HQ 3000

Pentress Substation 500

5,500               NO BID #VALUE!

Bruceton Mills Substation 2500

Preston Co. HQ 1000

Terra Alta Substation 1000

Fellowsville Substation 1000

Aurora Substation 1000

Cooper's Rock Substation 1500

8,000               NO BID #VALUE!

Taylor Taylor Co. HQ 1,000               

1,000               101.24$             101,240.00$               

23,500             

Harrison County Estimated Total

Doddridge County Estimated Total

DISTRICT 4

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price that 

populates in the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the Vendor's Price 

Per Ton bid entry. 

Cargill, Incorporated-Salt, Road Safety

DISTRICT 4 ESTIMATED TOTAL

Preston

Monongalia

Marion

Harrison

Doddridge

Taylor County Estimated Total

Preston County Estimated Total

Monongalia County Estimated Total

Marion County Estimated Total

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 4 of 11

6623C006



Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Martinsburg Headquarters - 0571 Storage Bldg 1,000              

Tabler Station - 0502 Storage Bldg 1,000              

Berkeley County Headquarters 700                 

2,700              97.21$              262,467.00$               

Grant Co. HQ 800                 

Mt. Storm Substation 1,000              

Corridor H @ Knobley Road 1,600              

3,400              102.67$            349,078.00$               

Hampshire Co. HQ 800                 

Capon Bridge Substation 400                 

Slanesville 300                 

1,500              101.43$            152,145.00$               

Hardy Co. HQ 800                 

Baker Substation 800                 

1,600              107.30$            171,680.00$               

Jefferson County Headquarters - 0519 Storage Bldg 1,500              

9/340 Expressway Headquarters - 0564 Storage Bldg 1,500              

3,000              94.66$              283,980.00$               

Mineral Co. HQ 700                 

Skyline Substation 600                 

Short Gap Substation 300                 

District 5 HQ 100                 

1,700              NO BID #VALUE!

Morgan Co. HQ 800                 

Largent Substation 300                 

1,100              99.52$              109,472.00$               

15,000            

Hampshire

DISTRICT 5 ESTIMATED TOTAL

Morgan

Mineral

Jefferson

Hardy

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price that populates in the 

Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the Vendor's Price Per Ton bid entry. 

Cargill, Incorporated-Salt, Road Safety

DISTRICT 5

Mineral County Estimated Total

Jefferson  County Estimated Total

Morgan County Estimated Total

Grant

Hampshire County Estimated Total

Berkeley

Hardy County Estimated Total

Berkeley County Estimated Total

Grant  County Estimated Total

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 5 of 11

6623C006



Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Brooke County HQ 1800

US 22 Substation 1800

3,600 NO BID #VALUE!

Hancock Hancock County HQ 2800

2,800 NO BID #VALUE!

Marshall Co. HQ 2900

Lynn Camp Substation 700

Cameron Substation 1550

Sand Hill Substation 650

5,800 NO BID #VALUE!

Ohio Co. HQ 4000

I-70 Interstate HQ 3600

7,600 NO BID #VALUE!

Tyler Co. HQ 1100

Centerville Substation 800

1,900 NO BID #VALUE!

Wetzel Co. HQ 1100

Pine Grove Substation 700

Hundred Substation 900

2,700 NO BID #VALUE!

24,400            

DISTRICT 6

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price 

that populates in the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the 

Vendor's Price Per Ton bid entry. 

Cargill, Incorporated-Salt, Road Safety

Hancock County Estimated Total

Brooke County Estimated Total

DISTRICT 6 ESTIMATED TOTAL

Wetzel

Tyler

Ohio

Marshall

Brooke

Wetzel County Estimated Total

Tyler County Estimated Total

Ohio County Estimated Total

Marshall County Estimated Total

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 6 of 11

6623C006



Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Barbour Co. HQ (000111) 1,800              

Belington Substation (000113) 1,400              

3,200              96.77$               309,664.00$               

Braxton County HQ (000444) 800                  

Heaters Substation (000431) 600                  

Coon Knob Substation (000405) 1,400              

Burnsville Substation (000432) 1,400              

4,200              100.93$             423,906.00$               

Gilmer Gilmer County HQ (001110) 1,000              

1,000              NO BID #VALUE!

Lewis County HQ (002108) 1,200              

APD (Weston Mudlick)  (002187) 1,000              

2,200              103.12$             226,864.00$               

Clow Lot/Upshur County HQ (004912) 2,400              

Tennerton/Upshur County SubHQ (004903) 100                  

Kanawha Head 800                  

3,300              101.61$             335,313.00$               

Cherry Falls 500                  

RT 20/Cowen Substation (005110) 100                  

Webster County HQ @ Bolair 1000
Hacker Valley Substation (005120) 500                  

2,100              99.35$               208,635.00$               

16,000            

DISTRICT 7

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price that populates 

in the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the Vendor's Price Per Ton bid entry. 

Cargill, Incorporated-Salt, Road Safety

DISTRICT 7 ESTIMATED TOTAL

Webster

Upshur

Lewis

Braxton

Barbour

Webster County Estimated Total

Upshur County Estimated Total

Lewis County Estimated Total

Gilmer County Estimated Total

Braxton County Estimated Total

Barbour County Estimated Total

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 7 of 11

6623C006



Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Franklin, 220 North 600

Judy Gap Substation 500

Brandywine Stockpile 400

Onego Stockpile 400

Franklin Rt. 220 South Lot 350

2,250              106.47$            239,557.50$              

Pocahontas County HQ 800

Seebert Stockpile 600

Green Bank Substation 500

Bartow Lot 600

Snowshoe Stockpile 100

Slaty Fork Stockpile 450

3,050              103.91$            316,925.50$              

Randolph Co. HQ 900

Harman Substation 800

Coalton Substation 750

Valley Head Substation 600

Mill Creek Substation 650

Pickens Substation 350

Corridor H 900

4,950              99.83$              494,158.50$              

Tucker Co. HQ 800

Thomas Substation 600

Corrido H - Thomas 900

2,300              97.99$              225,377.00$              

12,550            

6621C062

DISTRICT 8 TOTAL

Randolph County Estimated Total

Pocahontas County Estimated Total

Pendleton County Estimated Total

Tucker County Estimated Total

Tucker

Randolph

Pocahontas

Pendleton

DISTRICT 8

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price that 

populates in the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the Vendor's 

Price Per Ton bid entry. 

Cargill, Incorporated-Salt, Road Safety

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 8 of 11

6623C006



Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Oak Hill APD 5700

Lookout Substation 0

Falls View Substation 0

5700 NO BID #VALUE!

Greenbrier Co. HQ 1500

Crawley Substation 2100

Hart's Run Substation 1300

4900 NO BID #VALUE!

Monroe Co. HQ 1000

Peterstown Substation 700

1700 NO BID #VALUE!

Nicholas Co. HQ 3000

Curtin Substation 2000

Corridor L/Muddlety Substation 3000

8000 NO BID #VALUE!

Summers Summers Co. HQ 1400

1400 NO BID #VALUE!

21,700            

6621C062

DISTRICT 9

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price that 

populates in the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the Vendor's Price 

Per Ton bid entry. 

Cargill, Incorporated-Salt, Road Safety

DISTRICT 8 TOTAL

Nicholas

Monroe

Greenbrier

Fayette

Summers County Estimated Total

Nicholas County Estimated Total

Monroe County Estimated Total

Greenbrier County Estimated Total

Fayette County Estimated Total

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 9 of 11

6623C006



Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

McDowell County HQ 2,000

Yukon Substation 300

Johnny Cake Substation 500

Raysal 500

3,300 NO BID #VALUE!

Mercer County HQ 2,600

Flat Top Substation 300

I-77 near Princeton 2,600

5,500 NO BID #VALUE!

Raleigh County HQ 8,000

Bolt Substation 100

Bragg Substation 5,000

13,100 NO BID #VALUE!

Wyoming County HQ 3,000

Still Run Substation 1,000

Hanover Outpost 100

4,100 NO BID #VALUE!

26,000             

6621C062

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price that 

populates in the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the Vendor's Price 

Per Ton bid entry. 

Cargill, Incorporated-Salt, Road Safety

McDowell County Estimated Total

Mercer County Estimated Total

Raleigh County Estimated Total

Wyoming County Estimated Total

DISTRICT 10 ESTIMATED TOTAL

DISTRICT 10

Wyoming

Raleigh

Mercer

McDowell

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 10 of 11

6623C006



Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Chelyan Maintenance 3,000              

Standard Maintenance 2,900              

5,900              NO BID #VALUE!

Mercer Princeton Maintenance 1,500              

1,500              NO BID #VALUE!

Beckley Maintenance 6,700              

Ghent Maintenance 4,100              

10,800            NO BID #VALUE!

18,200            

WV PARKWAYS AUTHORITY

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price 

that populates in the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the 

Vendor's Price Per Ton bid entry. 

Cargill, Incorporated-Salt, Road Safety

Raleigh

Kanawha

Raleigh County Estimated Total

Mercer County Estimated Total

Kanawha County Estimated Total

WV PARKWAYS ESTIMATED TOTAL

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 11 of 11
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