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Date Printed: Sep 15, 2022 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1087735

Solicitation Description: Roadway Salt - Sodium Chloride 6623C006

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2022-09-14 13:30 SR 0803 ESR09132200000001318 1

VENDOR

000000167452
MORTON SALT INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2300000020

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2022-09-13 Response Time: 12:37:21

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep
304-558-2566
john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation



Date Printed: Sep 15, 2022 Page: 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Roadway Salt - Sodium Chloride 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161506    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Roadway Salt - Sodium Chloride for use in snow removal and ice control throughout the state of West Virginia.
VENDOR NOTE:  Bid evaluation will be based on the bid prices submitted on the Pricing Pages Attachment A (ATT A) and Attachment B(ATT 
B).  Vendor's entries of bid prices or other notations made in the wvOASIS commodity lines/descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation 
or award.



Vendor Storage Site Locations
Pick-up Cost 

per Ton

Portsmouth, OH

5150 Gallia St. 

Portsmouth, OH 45662

Clifton Forge, VA

501 W. Ridgeway St.

Clifton Forge, VA 24422

Baltimore, MD

181 Marsh St.

Baltimore, MD 21230

6621C062  Salt Pick-up by Agency only

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment B - Pricing Pages by Pick-up

Vendor shall complete ATT B by identifying its storage site locations (physical 911 address) 

and provide a price per ton for roadway salt to be available for pick-up by WVDOH 

Agencies.  Vendor pricing shall include cost of  Vendor loading Agency trucks.

$85.00

$95.00

$90.00



DETROIT SALT COMPANY 
Page 117 

Safety Data Sheet (SDS) 

* 

* 

OSHA HazCom Standard 29 CFR 1910.1200(g) revised in 2012 and GHS Rev 03. 

Issue date 05/05/2020 Reviewed on 05/05/2020 

· Product Identifier

· Trade Name: Rock Salt for De-icing with YPS
· Relevant identified uses of the substance or mixture and uses advised against:
· Product Description: Sodium Chloride with YPS

· Details of the Supplier of the Safety Data Sheet:
· Manufacturer/Supplier:

Detroit Salt Company
12841 Sanders St.
Detroit, Ml 48217
313-841-5144
www.detroitsalt.com
sales@detroitsalt.com

· Emergency telephone number: 313-841-5144

· Classification of the substance or mixture: Non-Regulated Material
· Additional information:
Sodium Chloride

Sodium ferrocyanide decahydrate: Concentration is minimal and determined to be insignnificant. These 
minimal concentrations require no reporting. 

· Label elements:
· Hazard pictograms: Non-Regulated Material
· Signal word: Non-Regulated Material
· Hazard statements: Non-Regulated Material
· Unknown acute toxicity:
This value refers to knowledge of known, established toxicological or ecotoxicological values.
0 % of the mixture consists of component(s) of unknown toxicity.

· Classification system: NFPA/HMIS Definitions: 0-Least, 1-Slight, 2-Moderate, 3-High, 4-Extreme
· NFPA ratings (scale O - 4)

Health= 0 
Fire = 0 
Reactivity = 0 

· HMIS-ratings (scale O - 4)

Health= 1 
Fire = 0 
Physical Hazard = 0 

· Hazard(s) not otherwise classified (HNOC): None known

· Non-hazardous components:

CAS: 7647-14-5 Sodium Chloride 
RTECS: VZ4725000 

CAS: 14434-22-1 Sodium ferrocyanide decahydrate 

· Chemical characterization: Mixtures
· Description: Mixture of substances listed below with non-hazardous additions.

· Dangerous Components: Non-Regulated Material

95.5-99.7% 

:::::±0. 002-0. 00834 % 

(Contd. on page 2) 
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Safety Data Sheet (SOS) 
OSHA HazCom Standard 29 CFR 1910.1200(g) revised in 2012 and GHS Rev 03. 

Issue date 05/05/2020 Reviewed on 05/05/2020 

Trade Name: Rock Salt for De-icing with YPS 

· Additional information:
The exact percentages of the ingredients of this mixture are considered to be proprietary and are withheld in
accordance with the provisions of paragraph (i) of§ 1910.1200 of 29 CFR 1910.1200 Trade Secrets.

· Description of first aid measures
· General information:
Symptoms of poisoning may occur after exposure to dust, fumes or particulates; seek medical attention if
feeling unwell.

· A'fter inhalation: Supply fresh air; consult doctor in case of complaints.
· A'fter skin contact: If skin irritation occurs, consult a doctor.
· A'fter eye contact:
If eye irritation occurs, consult a doctor.
Rinse opened eye for several minutes under running water.

· A'fter swallowing:
If swallowed and symptoms occur, consult a doctor.
Rinse out mouth and then drink plenty of water.

· Information for doctor
· Most important symptoms and effects, both acute and delayed: No further relevant information available.
· Indication of any immediate medical attention and special treatment needed:
No further relevant information available.

· Extinguishing media
· Suitable extinguishing agents: Use fire fighting measures that suit the environment.
· For safety reasons unsuitable extinguishing agents: No further relevant information.
· Special hazards arising from the substance or mixture: No further relevant information available.
· Advice for firefighters
· Special protective equipment for firefighters:
As in any fire, wear self-contained breathing apparatus pressure-demand (NIOSH approved or equivalent) and
full protective gear to prevent contact with skin and eyes.

· Personal precautions, protective equipment and emergency procedures: Not required.
· Environmental precautions: No special measures required.
· Methods and material for containment and cleaning up:

Dispose of contaminated material as waste according to section 13.
Dispose of the collected material according to regulations.

· Reference to other sections:
See Section 7 for information on safe handling.
See Section 8 for information on personal protection equipment.
See Section 13 for disposal information.

· Protective Action Criteria for Chemicals

· PAC-1:

None of the ingredients are listed. 

· PAC-2:

None of the ingredients are listed. 

· PAC-3:
- -- -�---- -·- - - -

None of the ingredients are listed. 
(Contd. on page 3) 



DETROIT SALT COMPANY 
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Safety Data Sheet (SDS) 
OSHA HazCom Standard 29 CFR 1910.1200(g) revised in 2012 and GHS Rev 03. 

Issue date 05/05/2020 Reviewed on 05/05/2020 

Trade Name: Rock Salt for De-icing with YPS 

· Handling
· Precautions for safe handling: No special precautions are necessary if used correctly.
· Information about protection against explosions and fires: No special measures required.

· Conditions for safe storage, including any incompatibilities
· Storage
· Requirements to be met by storerooms and receptacles: No special requirements.
· Information about storage in one common storage facility: Not required.
· Further information about storage conditions: None.
· Specific end use(s): No further relevant information available.

· Additional information about design of technical systems: No further data; see section 7.

· Control parameters:
· Components with occupational exposure limits:
The product does not contain any relevant quantities of materials with critical values that have to be monitored
at the workplace.

· Additional information: The lists that were valid during the creation of this SOS were used as basis.

· Exposure controls:
· Personal protective equipment
· General protective and hygienic measures:

Keep away from foodstuffs, beverages and feed.
Wash hands before breaks and at the end of work.

· Breathing equipment: Not required.
· Protection of hands: Not required.
· Material of gloves: Not applicable.
· Penetration time of glove material: Not applicable.
· Eye protection: Not required.
· Limitation and supervision of exposure into the environment: None

· Information on basic physical and chemical properties
· General Information
· Appearance:

Form:
Color: 

· Odor:
· Odor threshold:

· pH-value:

· Change in condition
Melting point/Melting range:
Boiling point/Boiling range: 

· Flash point:

· Flammability (solid, gaseous):

· Ignition temperature:

Crystalline 
Translucent, grey or milky white 
Slight 
Not determined. 

Not determined. 

Not determined. 
�1,461 °C (�34.661 °F)

None 

Not determined. 

Not applicable 
(Contd. on page 4) 



DETROIT SALT COMPANY 
CENTRAL SALT Page 417 

* 

Safety Data Sheet (SOS) 
OSHA HazCom Standard 29 CFR 1910.1200(g) revised in 2012 and GHS Rev 03. 

Issue date 05/05/2020 Reviewed on 05/05/2020 

Trade Name: Rock Salt for De-icing with YPS 

· Decomposition temperature:

· Auto igniting:

· Danger of explosion:

· Explosion limits:
Lower:
Upper: 

· Vapor pressure:

· Density@ 20 °c (68 °F):

· Bulk density:
· Relative density:
· Vapor density:
· Evaporation rate:

· Solubility in I Miscibility with:
Water:

Not determined. 

Product is not self-igniting. 

Product does not present an explosion hazard. 

Not determined. 
Not determined. 

Not applicable. 

2.165 g/cm3 (18.0669 lbs/gal) 

�766.3-:;;;1 ,670.4 kg/m3 

Not determined. 
Not applicable. 
Not applicable. 

Soluble. 

· Partition coefficient (n-octanollwater): Not determined.

· Viscosity:
Dynamic:
Kinematic: 

· Solvent content:
voe content:

Solids content: 
· Other information:

Not applicable. 
Not applicable. 

0.00% 

100.0 % 
No further relevant information available. 

· Reactivity: No further relevant information available.
· Chemical stability: Product is stable under normal conditions.
· Thermal decomposition I conditions to be avoided: No decomposition if used according to specifications.
· Possibility of hazardous reactions: No dangerous reactions known.
· Conditions to avoid:
Contact with acids.
Moisture
Water

· Incompatible materials: Strong acids
· Hazardous decomposition products: No dangerous decomposition products known.

· Information on toxicological effects:
· Acute toxicity:

· LDILC50 values that are relevant for classification:

7647-14-5 Sodium Chloride

Oral LD50 '4,000 mg/kg (Mouse) 
3,000 mg/kg (Rat) 

Dermal LD50 >10,000 mg/kg (Rabbit) 
- - - - - - - - --- - - -

(Contd. on page 5) 



DETROIT SALT COMPANY 
CENTRAL SALT Page 517 

Safety Data Sheet (SDS) 
OSHA HazCom Standard 29 CFR 1910.1200(g) revised in 2012 and GHS Rev 03. 

Issue date 05/05/2020 Reviewed on 05/05/2020 

Trade Name: Rock Salt for De-icing with YPS 

· Primary irritant effect:
· On the skin: Not listed as irritant
· On the eye: Not listed as irritant
· Additional toxicological information:
The product shows the following dangers according to internally approved calculation methods for
preparations:

· Carcinogenic categories:

· /ARC (International Agency for Research on Cancer):

None of the ingredients are listed. 

1 • NTP (National Toxicology Program):

None of the ingredients are listed. 

· OSHA-Ca (Occupational Safety & Health Administration):

None of the ingredients are listed. 

· Toxicity:

· Aquatic toxicity:

7647-14-5 Sodium Chloride 

EC50 1340.7-469.2 mg/I (Water flea)

· Persistence and degradability: No further relevant information available.
· Behavior in environmental systems:
· Bioaccumulative potential: No further relevant information available.
· Mobility in soil: No further relevant information available.
· Additional ecological information:
· General notes:

= 

Do not allow undiluted product or product that has not been neutralized to reach ground water, water course or
sewage system.

· Results of PBT and vPvB assessment:
· PBT: Not applicable.
· vPvB: Not applicable.
· Other adverse effects: No further relevant information available.

· Waste treatment methods
· Recommendation:
Observe all federal, state and local environmental regulations when disposing of this material.

· Uncleaned packaging
· Recommendation: Disposal must be made according to official regulations.
· Recommended cleansing agent: Water, if necessary with cleansing agents.

· UN-Number:
· DOT, ADRIADN, IMDG, IATA
· UN proper shipping name:
· DOT, ADRIADN, IMDG, IATA

Non-Regulated Material 

Non-Regulated Material 
(Contd. on page 6) 



CENTRAL SALT Page 617 

Safety Data Sheet (SDS) 
OSHA HazCom Standard 29 CFR 1910.1200(g) revised in 2012 and GHS Rev 03. 

Issue date 05/05/2020 Reviewed on 05/05/2020 

Trade Name: Rock Salt for De-icing with YPS 

· Transport hazard class(es):

· DOT, ADRIADN, ADN, IMDG, IATA
· Class: Non-Regulated Material 
· Packing group:
· DOT, ADRIADN, IMDG, IATA Non-Regulated Material 
· Environmental hazards: Not applicable. 
· Special precautions for user: Not applicable. 
· Transport in bulk according to Annex II of
MARPOL73fl8 and the /BC Code: Not applicable. 

· UN "Model Regulation": Non-Regulated Material 

· Safety, health and environmental regulations/legislation specific for the substance or mixture:
· SARA (Superfund Amendments and Reauthorization):
· Section 355 (extremely hazardous substances):

None of the ingredients are listed.

· Section 313 (Specific toxic chemical listings):
None of the ingredients are listed.

· TSCA (Toxic Substances Control Act):
All components have the value ACTIVE.

· Hazardous Air Pollutants
None of the ingredients are listed.

· California Proposition 65:
· Chemicals known to cause cancer:
None of the ingredients are listed.

· Chemicals known to cause reproductive toxicity for females:
None of the ingredients are listed.

1 
• Chemicals known to cause reproductive toxicity for males:
None of the ingredients are listed.

· Chemicals known to cause developmental toxicity:
None of the ingredients are listed.

· New Jersey Right-to-Know List:

__ I 

- ---------------------------- -------, 

None of the ingredients are listed. 

, 
· New Jersey Special Hazardous Substance List:
None of the ingredients are listed.

· Pennsylvania Right-to-Know List:
None of the ingredients are listed.

- =-- - -��-��- =-�=---� -- - -- - --- -·

· Pennsylvania Special Hazardous Substance List:
None of the ingredients are listed. 

· Carcinogenic categories:
· EPA (Environmental-P-ro_t _e _c-ti _o _n _A_g_e_n_c_v,�1-: -

- None of the ingrectients are listed.
-=======-==

=
=====-====-======= 

· TL V (Threshold Limit Value established by ACG/H):
- -

-
- - --- --�- -- -------� - --�--

None of the ingredients are listed. 

J 

(Contd. on page 1j 



DETROIT SALT COMPANY 
CENTRAL SALT Page 717 

Safety Data Sheet (SDS) 
OSHA HazCom Standard 29 CFR 1910.1200(g) revised in 2012 and GHS Rev 03.

Issue date 05/05/2020 Reviewed on 05/05/2020 

Trade Name: Rock Salt for De-icing with YPS 

1 
• NIOSH-Ca (National Institute for Occupational Safety and Health):

None of the ingredients are listed. 

· GHS label elements Non-Regulated Material
· Hazard pictograms: Non-Regulated Material
· Signal word: Non-Regulated Material
· Hazard statements: Non-Regulated Material

· National regulations:

None of the ingredients are listed. 

· Chemical safety assessment: A Chemical Safety Assessment has not been carried out.

The information and recommendations in this safety data sheet are, to the best of our knowledge, accurate as 
of the date of issue. Nothing herein shall be deemed to create warranty, expressed or implied, and shall not 
establish a legally valid contractual relationship. It is the responsibility of the user to determine applicability of 
this information and the suitability of the material or product for any particular purpose. 

· Date of last revision/ revision number: 05/05/2020 I 5
· Abbreviations and acronyms:

ADR: The European Agreement concerning the International Carriage of Dangerous Goods by Road 
AON: The European Agreement concerning the International Carriage of Dangerous Goods by Inland Waterways
IMDG: International Maritime Code for Dangerous Goods
DOT: US Department of Transportation
IATA: International Air Transport Association
ACGIH: American Conference of Governmental Industrial Hygienists
EINECS: European Inventory of Existing Commercial Chemical Substances
ELINCS: European List of Notified Chemical Substances
GAS: Chemical Abstracts Service (division of the American Chemical Society)
NFPA: National Fire Protection Association (USA)
HMIS: Hazardous Materials Identification System (USA)
VOC: Volatile Organic Compounds (USA, EU) 
LC50: Lethal concentration, 50 percent
LD50: Lethal dose, 50 percent
PBT: Persistent, Bioaccumulative and Toxic
vPvB: very Persistent and very Bioaccumulative
NIOSH: National Institute for Occupational Safety and Health
OSHA: Occupational Safety & Health Administration
TLV: Threshold Limit Value
PEL: Permissible Exposure Limit
REL: Recommended Exposure Limit 

· * Data compared to the previous version altered. 
SOS created by MSDS Authoring Services www.msdsauthoring.com +1-877-204-9106



Treated Safe-T-Salt 

Page 1 of 13 

Safety Data Sheet 

1.1 Product identifier 

Product Name ● Safe-T-Salt
Synonyms ● Bulk Safe-T-Salt; Bulk Safe-T-Salt (Blue); Bulk Safe-T-Salt (Solar);

Safe-T-Salt (bagged with YPS)

CAS Number ● 7647-14-5

SDS  Number/Grade ● 91006

1.2 Relevant identified uses of the substance or mixture and uses advised against 
Relevant identified use(s) ●   Ice Control 

1.3 Details of the supplier of the safety data sheet 
Manufacturer ● Morton Salt, Inc.

444 W. Lake St. 
Chicago, IL 60606 
United States 

saltinfo@mortonsalt.com 
Telephone (General) ●      312-807-2000 

1.4 Emergency telephone number 

Manufacturer ● 312-807-2000

EU/EEC 
According to EU Directive 1272/2008 (CLP)/REACH 1907/2006 [amended by 453/2010] 
According to EU Directive 67/548/EEC (DSD) or 1999/45/EC (DPD) 

2.1 Classification of the substance or mixture 
CLP ●    Not classified 

DSD/DPD ● Not classified

2.2 Label Elements 
CLP 

Hazard statements ●    No label element(s) specifically required

DSD/DPD 
Risk phrases ●  No label element(s) specifically required 

2.3 Other Hazards 
CLP ● According to Regulation (EC) No. 1272/2008 (CLP) this material is not considered

hazardous.



Treated Safe-T-Salt 

Page 2 of 13 

DSD/DPD ● According to European Directive 1999/45/EC this preparation is not considered
dangerous.

United States (US) 
According to OSHA 29 CFR 1910.1200 HCS 

2.1 Classification of the substance or mixture 
OSHA HCS 2012 ●    Not classified 

2.2 Label elements 
OSHA HCS 2012 

Hazard statements ●    No label element(s) specifically required

2.3 Other hazards 
OSHA HCS 2012 ● This product is not considered hazardous under the U.S. OSHA 29 CFR 1910.1200

Hazard Communication Standard.

Canada 
According to WHMIS 

2.1 Classification of the substance or mixture 
WHMIS ●    Not classified 

2.2 Label elements 
WHMIS ● No label element(s) specifically required

2.3 Other hazards 
WHMIS ● In Canada, the product mentioned above is not considered hazardous under the

Workplace Hazardous Materials Information System (WHMIS).

3.1 Substances 

3.2 Mixtures 

● Material does not meet the criteria of a substance in accordance with Regulation (EC)
No 1272/2008.

Composition 
Chemica
l Name 

Identifiers % LD50/LC50 
Classifications According to 
Regulation/Directive 

Comments 

Sodium 
chloride 

CAS:7647-14-5 
EC 
Number:231- 
598-3

96% TO 
99% 

Ingestion/Oral-Rat 
LD50 • 3000 mg/kg 

EU DSD/DPD: Not Classified 
- Criteria not met
EU CLP: Not Classified - 
Criteria not met 
OSHA HCS 2012: Not 
Classified - Criteria not met 

May contain small quantities of 
naturally occurring calcium and 
magnesium salts 

Yellow 
Prusslate of 
Soda 

CAS:13601-19-9 
EC Number: 

< 0.01% NDA 
EU DSD/DPD: Data lacking 
EU CLP: Data lacking 
OSHA HCS 2012: Data lacking 

NDA 
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Prussian Blue 
CAS:14038-43-8 
EC Number: 

< 0.01% NDA 

EU DSD/DPD: Self Classified 
- Xi, R36
EU CLP: Self Classified - Eye 
Irrit. 2, H319 
OSHA HCS 2012: Eye Irrit. 2 

Only in Safe-T-Salt w/Blue 

4.1 Description of first aid measures 
Inhalation ● Move victim to fresh air. Administer oxygen if breathing is difficult. Give artificial

respiration if victim is not breathing. 
Skin ● IF ON SKIN: Wash with plenty of soap and water. If skin irritation occurs: Get medical

advice/attention.
Eye ● In case of contact with substance, immediately flush eyes with running water for at

least 20 minutes. If eye irritation persists: Get medical advice/attention.
Ingestion ● If large quantities are swallowed, call a physician immediately.

4.2 Most important symptoms and effects, both acute and delayed 
● Refer to Section 11 - Toxicological Information.

4.3 Indication of any immediate medical attention and special treatment needed 
Notes to Physician ● All treatments should be based on observed signs and symptoms of distress in the

patient. Consideration should be given to the possibility that overexposure to materials 
other than this product may have occurred. 

5.1 Extinguishing media 
Suitable Extinguishing Media ● Material is non-combustible. In case of fire use media as appropriate for surrounding 

fire. 
Unsuitable Extinguishing 
Media 

● No data available.

5.2 Special hazards arising from the substance or mixture 
Unusual Fire and Explosion 
Hazards 
Hazardous Combustion 
Products 

5.3 Advice for firefighters 

● No unusual fire or explosion hazards known.

● No data available

● Structural firefighters' protective clothing will only provide limited protection.
Wear positive pressure self-contained breathing apparatus (SCBA).

6.1 Personal precautions, protective equipment and emergency procedures 
Personal Precautions ● Wear suitable protective clothing, gloves, and eye/face protection.

Emergency Procedures ● Stop leak if you can do it without risk. Keep unauthorized personnel away. Use normal
clean up procedures.

6.2 Environmental precautions 
● None expected to be necessary if material is used under ordinary conditions and as

recommended.



Treated Safe-T-Salt 

Page 4 of 13 

6.3 Methods and material for containment and cleaning up 
Containment/Clean-up 
Measures 

● Carefully shovel or sweep up spilled material and place in suitable container.

6.4 Reference to other sections 
● Refer to Section 8 - Exposure Controls/Personal Protection and Section 13 - Disposal

Considerations.

7.1 Precautions for safe handling 
Handling ● Use good safety and industrial hygiene practices. Wash thoroughly after handling.

Keep out of reach of children. 

7.2 Conditions for safe storage, including any incompatibilities 
Storage ● Avoid storage with strong acids and strong oxidizing agents. Store in a dry place.

Incompatible Materials or 
Ignition Sources 

7.3 Specific end use(s) 

● Strong oxidizing agents, strong acids.

● Refer to Section 1.2 - Relevant identified uses.

8.1 Control parameters 

Exposure  Limits/Guidelines 
Result Canada Quebec Germany DFG Mexico OSHA 

Yellow Prusslate of 
Soda as Cyanide 
compounds 

TWAs Not established Not established 
5 mg/m3 TWA LMPE-PPT 
(as CN) 
as Cyanide compounds 

5 mg/m3 TWA (as CN) 
as Cyanide compounds 

Ceilings 

10 ppm Ceiling (as CN); 11 
mg/m3 Ceiling (as CN) 
as Cyanide compounds 

2 mg/m3 Peak 
(inhalable fraction, as 
CN) 
as Cyanide compounds 

Not established Not established 

MAKs Not established 

2 mg/m3 TWA MAK 
(inhalable fraction, as CN) 
as Cyanide compounds 

Not established Not established 

Exposure Control Notations 
Germany DFG 

•Yellow Prusslate of Soda as Cyanide Compounds: Pregnancy: (no risk to embryo/fetus if exposure limits adhered to (calculated as CN)) | Skin:
(skin notation)

8.2 Exposure controls 
Engineering 
Measures/Controls 

● Adequate ventilation systems as needed to control concentrations of airborne
contaminants below applicable threshold limit values.

Personal Protective Equipment 
Respiratory ● In case of insufficient ventilation, wear suitable respiratory equipment.

Eye/Face ● Wear safety glasses.

Skin/Body ● Wear appropriate gloves.

General Industrial Hygiene 
Considerations 

● Do not get in eyes or on skin or clothing. Handle in accordance with good industrial
hygiene and safety practice.
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Environmental Exposure 
Controls 

● Follow best practice for site management and disposal of waste.

Key to abbreviations 

PEL = Permissible Exposure Level determined by the Occupational Safety and Health Administration (OSHA) 

TWA   = Time-Weighted Averages are based on 8h/day, 40h/week  exposures 

OSHA = Occupational Safety and Health Administration 

9.1 Information on Physical and Chemical Properties 
Material Description 

Physical Form Solid Appearance/Description 
Colorless, white or 
multicolored crystals. 

Color Colorless, white or multicolored. Odor Odorless 

Particulate Type 
Dust 
Crystalline 

Particulate Size 
Variable 

Odor Threshold Data lacking 

General Properties 

Boiling Point 1413 C(2575.4 F) Melting Point 801 C(1473.8 F) 

Decomposition Temperature Data lacking pH 5 to 8 

Specific Gravity/Relative Density 2.165 Water=1 Water Solubility Soluble 0.36 g/cc @ 20 C(68 F) 

Viscosity Not relevant Explosive Properties Not relevant. 

Oxidizing Properties: Not relevant. 

Volatility 

Vapor Pressure 
1 mmHg (torr) @ 865 C(1589 F) 
Not relevant 

Vapor Density Data lacking 

Evaporation Rate Data lacking 

Flammability 

Flash Point Not relevant UEL Not relevant 

LEL Not relevant Autoignition Not relevant 

Flammability (solid, gas) Not flammable. 

Environmental 

Octanol/Water Partition coefficient Data lacking 

9.2 Other Information 
● No additional physical and chemical parameters noted.

10.1 Reactivity 

10.2 Chemical stability 

● No dangerous reaction known under conditions of normal use.

● Stable

10.3 Possibility of hazardous reactions
● Hazardous polymerization will not occur.

10.4 Conditions to avoid 
● Incompatible materials.
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10.5 Incompatible materials 
● Strong oxidizing agents, strong acids. 

10.6 Hazardous decomposition products 
● Will react with strong acids to generate hydrogen chloride and with strong oxidizing 

agents to generate chlorine gas. Yellow Prussiate of Soda (YPS) may decompose 
when in contact with strong acids releasing hydrogen cyanide gas. 

 
 

 

 
 

11.1 Information on toxicological effects 
 

GHS Properties Classification 

 
Acute toxicity 

EU/CLP • Classification criteria not met 

OSHA HCS 2012 • Classification criteria not met 

 
Aspiration Hazard 

EU/CLP • Classification criteria not met 

OSHA HCS 2012 • Classification criteria not met 

 
Carcinogenicity 

EU/CLP • Classification criteria not met 

OSHA HCS 2012 • Classification criteria not met 

 
Germ Cell Mutagenicity 

EU/CLP • Classification criteria not met 

OSHA HCS 2012 • Classification criteria not met 

 
Skin corrosion/Irritation 

EU/CLP • Classification criteria not met 

OSHA HCS 2012 • Classification criteria not met 

 
Skin sensitization 

EU/CLP • Classification criteria not met 

OSHA HCS 2012 • Classification criteria not met 

 
STOT-RE 

EU/CLP • Classification criteria not met 

OSHA HCS 2012 • Classification criteria not met 

 
STOT-SE 

EU/CLP • Classification criteria not met 

OSHA HCS 2012 • Classification criteria not met 

 
Toxicity for Reproduction 

EU/CLP • Classification criteria not met 

OSHA HCS 2012 • Classification criteria not met 

 
Respiratory sensitization 

EU/CLP • Classification criteria not met 

OSHA HCS 2012 • Classification criteria not met 

 
Serious eye damage/Irritation 

EU/CLP • Classification criteria not met 

OSHA HCS 2012 • Classification criteria not met 

Potential Health Effects 
Inhalation 

Acute (Immediate) ●  Under normal conditions of use, no health effects are expected. Inhalation of dust may 
cause mild irritation to mucous membranes, nose and throat. Symptoms may include 
coughing, dryness and sore throat. 

Chronic  (Delayed) ●    No data available. 

Skin 
Acute (Immediate) ●  Under normal conditions of use, no health effects are expected. 

Chronic  (Delayed) ●    No data available. 

Eye 
Acute (Immediate) ●   Based upon practical use and experience using this product eye irritation is not 

expected to occur. 

Chronic  (Delayed) ●    No data available. 
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Ingestion 
Acute (Immediate) ●  Ingestion may cause the following symptoms - diarrhea. 

Chronic  (Delayed) ●    No data available. 
 

Key to abbreviations 

LD   =  Lethal Dose 
 

 

 

 
 

12.1 Toxicity  
 

● Material data lacking. 

12.2 Persistence and degradability 
● Material data lacking. 

12.3 Bioaccumulative potential 
● Material data lacking. 

12.4 Mobility in Soil  

● Material data lacking. 

12.5 Results of PBT and vPvB assessment 
● No PBT and vPvB assessment has been conducted. 

12.6 Other adverse effects 
● No studies have been found. 

 
 

 

 
 

13.1 Waste treatment methods 
Product waste ●  Dispose of content and/or container in accordance with local, regional, national, and/or 

international regulations. 
Packaging waste ●  Dispose of content and/or container in accordance with local, regional, national, and/or 

international regulations. 
 

 

 

 

 
  14.1 UN 

number 
14.2 UN proper 
shipping name 

14.3 Transport hazard 
class(es) 

14.4 Packing 
group 

14.5 Environmental 
hazards 

DOT NDA Not regulated NDA NDA NDA 

TDG NDA Not regulated NDA NDA NDA 

IMO/IMDG NDA Not regulated NDA NDA NDA 

IATA/ICAO NDA Not regulated NDA NDA NDA 

14.6 Special precautions for 
user 
14.7 Transport in bulk 
according to Annex II of 
MARPOL 73/78 and the IBC 

Code 

● None known. 
 

● Not relevant. 
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15.1 Safety, health and environmental regulations/legislation specific for the substance or 
mixture 
SARA  Hazard Classifications ●   None 

 

State Right To Know 
Component CAS MA NJ PA 

Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 No No No 

Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 No No No 

Yellow Prusslate of 
Soda 

 

13601-19-9 
 

No 
 

Yes 
 

Yes 

 
Inventory 

Component CAS Canada DSL Canada NDSL China EU EINECS EU ELNICS 

Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Yes No Yes Yes No 

Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Yes No Yes Yes No 

Yellow Prussiate of 
Soda 

 

13601-19-9 
 

Yes 
 

No 
 

Yes 
 

Yes 
 

No 

 

Inventory (Con't.) 
Component CAS Japan ENCS Korea KECL TSCA 

Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Yes Yes Yes 

Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 No Yes Yes 

Yellow Prussiate of 
Soda 

 

13601-19-9 
 

Yes 
 

Yes 
 

Yes 

 

Australia 
 
 

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 
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• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 

 
Australia - Ozone Protection Act - Scheduled Substances 

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 

Australia - Priority Existing Chemical Program    

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 

Canada 
 

 

 

 

Europe 
 
 

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 

 
 

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 

 
  WHMIS     

Prussian Blue 

    

       

  

 

 

 

  

 

  

       

  WHMIS     

Prussian Blue 

    

       

  

 

 

 

  

 

 

  

 
       

Prussian Blue 
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• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 
 

EU - CLP (1272/2008) - Annex VI - Table 3.2 - Notes - Substances and Preparations 
 

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 

 
EU - CLP (1272/2008) - Annex VI - Table 3.2 - Safety Phrases 

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 

Mexico 
 

 

United States 
 

 

 

 
• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda as Cyanide 
compounds 

  (XCN where X=H or any other group where a formal dissociation may occur. For 
example KCN or Ca[CN]2) 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 
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U.S. -  CERCLA/SARA -  Hazardous Substances and their Reportable  Quantities 

 

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 
 

U.S. -  CERCLA/SARA -  Radionuclides  and  Their  Reportable Quantities 
 

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prussiate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 
 

U.S. - CERCLA/SARA - Section 302 Extremely Hazardous Substances EPCRA RQs 
 

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 
 

U.S. -  CERCLA/SARA -  Section 302 Extremely Hazardous Substances   TPQs 
 

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 
 

U.S. - CERCLA/SARA - Section 313 - Emission   Reporting 
 

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda as 
Cyanide compounds 

  1.0 % de minimis concentration (X+CN- where X = H+ or any other group where a formal 
dissociation can be made. For example KCN or Ca(CN)2. Chemical Category N106) 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 
 

U.S. - CERCLA/SARA - Section 313 - PBT Chemical   Listing 
 

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 

 
U.S. - RCRA (Resource Conservation & Recovery Act) - Phase 4 LDR Rule - Universal Treatment Standards 

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda as 
Cyanide compounds 

  1.2 mg/L (total, wastewater); 590 mg/kg (total, nonwastewater); 0.86 mg/L (amenable, 
wastewater); 30 mg/kg (amenable, nonwastewater) 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 

United States - California 
Environment 

U.S. -  California -  Proposition 65 -  Carcinogens List 
 

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 
 

U.S. - California - Proposition 65 - Developmental Toxicity 

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 
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• Yellow Prusslate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 
 

U.S. - California - Proposition 65 - Maximum Allowable Dose Levels (MADL) 
 

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 
 

U.S. - California - Proposition 65 - No Significant Risk Levels (NSRL) 
 

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 
 

U.S. - California - Proposition 65 - Reproductive Toxicity - Female 
 

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 

 
U.S. - California - Proposition 65 - Reproductive Toxicity - Male 

• Prussian Blue 14038-43-8 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda 13601-19-9 Not Listed 

• Yellow Prusslate of Soda as Cyanide compounds   Not Listed 

• Sodium chloride 7647-14-5 Not Listed 

United States - Pennsylvania 
 

 

 

15.2 Chemical Safety Assessment 
● No Chemical Safety Assessment has been carried out. 

 
 

 

 
 

Last  Revision Date ●   17/Nov/.2017 

Preparation  Date ●    4/Jan/2010 

Disclaimer/Statement of 
Liability 

● The responsibility to provide a safe workplace remains with the user. The user should 
consider the health hazards and safety information contained herein as a guide and 
should take those precautions required in an individual operation to instruct employees 
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Key to abbreviations 

NDA = No data available 

and develop work practice procedures for a safe work environment. The information 
contained herein is, to the best of our knowledge and belief, accurate. However, since 
the conditions of handling and use are beyond our control, we make no guarantee of 
results, and assume no liability for damages incurred by use of this material. It is the 
responsibility of the user to comply with all applicable federal, state, and local laws 
and regulations. Nothing contained herein is to be construed as a recommendation for 
use in violation of any patents or of applicable laws or regulations. 

 
  



































Anthony T. Patton, Director Bulk Deicing US Government Sales

444 West Lake St., Suite 3000, Chicago, IL 60606
For ordering: (855)665-4540

Fax: 312-896-9208

bids@mortonsalt.com

Morton Salt, Inc. 

Anthony T. Patton, Director Bulk Deicing US Government Sales

855-665-4540 Fax: 312-896-9208

bids@mortonsalt.com For ordering: BuyRoadSalt@mortonsalt.com



Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Clinton @ WV85 1,000.00           

Rock Creek 2,500.00           

Seth 750.00              

4,250 NO BID #VALUE!

Widen Road & CR 11 2,000.00           

Maysel 100.00              

2,100 NO BID #VALUE!

Chelyan 1,500.00           

Elkview 2,200.00           

North Charleston 2,200.00           

St. Albans 2,500.00           

I-64 @ Rt. 119 and Penn. Avenue 1,200.00           

I-77 @ Sissonville 1,100.00           

I-79 @ Amma 1,100.00           

Corridor G @ Alum Creek 1,500.00           

13,300 NO BID #VALUE!

Glenwood 500.00              

Pt. Pleasant @ Fairground Rd. 5,000.00           

Pt. Pleasant @ Jackson Ave. -                    

5,500 86.49$               475,695.00$               

Red House 500.00              

Hurricane @ Rt. 34 2,500.00           

I-64 @ Scary Creek 1,000.00           

4,000 89.58$               358,320.00$               

29,150

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price that 

populates in the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the Vendor's Price 

Per Ton bid entry. 

DISTRICT 1 ESTIMATED TOTAL

Boone

Putnam

Mason

Kanawha

Clay

Morton Salt, Inc. 

DISTRICT 1

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Putnam County Estimated Total

Mason County Estimated Total

Kanawha County Estimated Total

Clay County Estimated Total

Boone County Estimated Total

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 1 of 11

6623C006



Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Barboursville / Cabell Co. HQ 3,250                    

Huntington I-64 Section 1 2,450                    

Huntington 31st Bridge 200                       

Huntington 17th St. Bridge -                           

5,900                    85.54$               504,686.00$               

West Hamlin 2,000                    

Yawkey 1,200                    

Harts 1,100                    

4,300                    90.22$               387,946.00$               

Corridor G @ Chapmanville 1,700                    

Wilkinson Substation 2,500                    

Man Substation 50                         

Hickory Lane -                           

4,250                    96.84$               411,570.00$               

Corridor G @ Miller's Creek, Bldg #03011 2,050                    

Mingo Cty @Miller's Creek, Bldg #03025 2,100                    

Gilbert Substation 1,150                    

Mingo 119 South -                           

5,300                    96.54$               511,662.00$               

Pritchard Substation 3,531                    

Wayne County Headquarters 2,700                    

Crum Substation 1,500                    

Heartland Intermodal Gateway -                           

7,731                    87.13$               673,602.03$               

27,481                  

Cabell

Logan

Wayne County Estimated Total

Mingo County Estimated Total

Logan County Estimated Total

Lincoln County Estimated Total

Cabell County Estimated Total

DISTRICT 2 ESTIMATED TOTAL

Wayne

Mingo

Lincoln

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price that populates in 

the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the Vendor's Price Per Ton bid entry. 

Morton Salt, Inc. 

DISTRICT 2

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 2 of 11
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Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Calhoun Millstone 5500

5500 NO BID #VALUE!

Ripley / Jackson Co. HQ 2000

I-77 @ Medina 1300

3300 91.55$               302,115.00$               

Pleasants Belmont 1800

1800 NO BID #VALUE!

APD Pennsboro 1900

Ellenboro / Harrisville Substation 2500

Corridor D @ Nutter Farm 400

Smithville Substation 450

5250 NO BID #VALUE!

Lefthand @ WV 36 400

Ambler Ridge Substation @ US 119 100

Roane County HQ 1600

2100 99.81$               209,601.00$               

Wirt Harrisville Substation 900

900 NO BID #VALUE!

Parkersburg @ Rt. 95S 5600

I-77 @ Parkersburg 4500

Corridor D @ Riverhill 2100

12200 99.18$               1,209,996.00$            

31,050            DISTRICT 3 ESTIMATED TOTAL

Wood

Roane

Ritchie

Jackson

Wood County Estimated Total

Wirt County Estimated Total

Ritchie County Estimated Total

Pleasants County Estimated Total

Jackson County Estimated Total

Calhoun County Estimated Total

Roane County Estimated Total

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price 

that populates in the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the 

Vendor's Price Per Ton bid entry. 

Morton Salt, Inc. 

DISTRICT 3

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 3 of 11
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Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Greenwood 200

West Union 800

1,000               NO BID #VALUE!

Harrison Co. HQ 3500

Saltwell 500

Lost Creek Substation 1000

Tunnel Hill Substation 1500

6,500               NO BID #VALUE!

Marion Co. HQ 1000

Mannington Substation 500

1,500               NO BID #VALUE!

Goshen Rd. Substation 2000

Monongalia Co. HQ 3000

Pentress Substation 500

5,500               NO BID #VALUE!

Bruceton Mills Substation 2500

Preston Co. HQ 1000

Terra Alta Substation 1000

Fellowsville Substation 1000

Aurora Substation 1000

Cooper's Rock Substation 1500

8,000               NO BID #VALUE!

Taylor Taylor Co. HQ 1,000               

1,000               NO BID #VALUE!

23,500             DISTRICT 4 ESTIMATED TOTAL

Preston

Monongalia

Marion

Harrison

Doddridge

Taylor County Estimated Total

Preston County Estimated Total

Monongalia County Estimated Total

Marion County Estimated Total

Harrison County Estimated Total

Doddridge County Estimated Total

DISTRICT 4

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price that 

populates in the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the Vendor's Price 

Per Ton bid entry. 

Morton Salt, Inc. 

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 4 of 11
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Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Martinsburg Headquarters - 0571 Storage Bldg 1,000              

Tabler Station - 0502 Storage Bldg 1,000              

Berkeley County Headquarters 700                 

2,700              117.69$            317,763.00$              

Grant Co. HQ 800                 

Mt. Storm Substation 1,000              

Corridor H @ Knobley Road 1,600              

3,400              NO BID #VALUE!

Hampshire Co. HQ 800                 

Capon Bridge Substation 400                 

Slanesville 300                 

1,500              109.51$            164,265.00$              

Hardy Co. HQ 800                 

Baker Substation 800                 

1,600              113.99$            182,384.00$              

Jefferson County Headquarters - 0519 Storage Bldg 1,500              

9/340 Expressway Headquarters - 0564 Storage Bldg 1,500              

3,000              94.82$              284,460.00$              

Mineral Co. HQ 700                 

Skyline Substation 600                 

Short Gap Substation 300                 

District 5 HQ 100                 

1,700              115.35$            196,095.00$              

Morgan Co. HQ 800                 

Largent Substation 300                 

1,100              117.69$            129,459.00$              

15,000            

Berkeley

Hardy County Estimated Total

Berkeley County Estimated Total

Grant  County Estimated Total

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price that populates in the 

Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the Vendor's Price Per Ton bid entry. 

Morton Salt, Inc. 

DISTRICT 5

Mineral County Estimated Total

Jefferson  County Estimated Total

Grant

Hampshire County Estimated Total

Hampshire

DISTRICT 5 ESTIMATED TOTAL

Morgan

Mineral

Jefferson

Hardy

Morgan County Estimated Total

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 5 of 11
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Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Brooke County HQ 1800

US 22 Substation 1800

3,600 NO BID #VALUE!

Hancock Hancock County HQ 2800

2,800 NO BID #VALUE!

Marshall Co. HQ 2900

Lynn Camp Substation 700

Cameron Substation 1550

Sand Hill Substation 650

5,800 NO BID #VALUE!

Ohio Co. HQ 4000

I-70 Interstate HQ 3600

7,600 NO BID #VALUE!

Tyler Co. HQ 1100

Centerville Substation 800

1,900 NO BID #VALUE!

Wetzel Co. HQ 1100

Pine Grove Substation 700

Hundred Substation 900

2,700 NO BID #VALUE!

24,400            DISTRICT 6 ESTIMATED TOTAL

Wetzel

Tyler

Ohio

Marshall

Brooke

Wetzel County Estimated Total

Tyler County Estimated Total

Ohio County Estimated Total

Marshall County Estimated Total

DISTRICT 6

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price 

that populates in the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the 

Vendor's Price Per Ton bid entry. 

Morton Salt, Inc. 

Hancock County Estimated Total

Brooke County Estimated Total

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 6 of 11
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Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Barbour Co. HQ (000111) 1,800              

Belington Substation (000113) 1,400              

3,200              NO BID #VALUE!

Braxton County HQ (000444) 800                  

Heaters Substation (000431) 600                  

Coon Knob Substation (000405) 1,400              

Burnsville Substation (000432) 1,400              

4,200              NO BID #VALUE!

Gilmer Gilmer County HQ (001110) 1,000              

1,000              NO BID #VALUE!

Lewis County HQ (002108) 1,200              

APD (Weston Mudlick)  (002187) 1,000              

2,200              NO BID #VALUE!

Clow Lot/Upshur County HQ (004912) 2,400              

Tennerton/Upshur County SubHQ (004903) 100                  

Kanawha Head 800                  

3,300              NO BID #VALUE!

Cherry Falls 500                  

RT 20/Cowen Substation (005110) 100                  

Webster County HQ @ Bolair 1000
Hacker Valley Substation (005120) 500                  

2,100              NO BID #VALUE!

16,000            

Barbour

Webster County Estimated Total

Upshur County Estimated Total

Lewis County Estimated Total

Gilmer County Estimated Total

Braxton County Estimated Total

Barbour County Estimated Total

DISTRICT 7

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price that populates 

in the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the Vendor's Price Per Ton bid entry. 

Morton Salt, Inc. 

DISTRICT 7 ESTIMATED TOTAL

Webster

Upshur

Lewis

Braxton

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 7 of 11
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Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Franklin, 220 North 600

Judy Gap Substation 500

Brandywine Stockpile 400

Onego Stockpile 400

Franklin Rt. 220 South Lot 350

2,250               101.45$             228,262.50$               

Pocahontas County HQ 800

Seebert Stockpile 600

Green Bank Substation 500

Bartow Lot 600

Snowshoe Stockpile 100

Slaty Fork Stockpile 450

3,050               99.34$               302,987.00$               

Randolph Co. HQ 900

Harman Substation 800

Coalton Substation 750

Valley Head Substation 600

Mill Creek Substation 650

Pickens Substation 350

Corridor H 900

4,950               NO BID #VALUE!

Tucker Co. HQ 800

Thomas Substation 600

Corrido H - Thomas 900

2,300               NO BID #VALUE!

12,550            

6621C062

Pendleton

DISTRICT 8

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price that 

populates in the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the Vendor's Price 

Per Ton bid entry. 

Morton Salt, Inc. 

DISTRICT 8 TOTAL

Randolph County Estimated Total

Pocahontas County Estimated Total

Pendleton County Estimated Total

Tucker County Estimated Total

Tucker

Randolph

Pocahontas

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 8 of 11
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Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Oak Hill APD 5700

Lookout Substation 0

Falls View Substation 0

5700 103.54$            590,178.00$              

Greenbrier Co. HQ 1500

Crawley Substation 2100

Hart's Run Substation 1300

4900 114.34$            560,266.00$              

Monroe Co. HQ 1000

Peterstown Substation 700

1700 114.65$            194,905.00$              

Nicholas Co. HQ 3000

Curtin Substation 2000

Corridor L/Muddlety Substation 3000

8000 106.15$            849,200.00$              

Summers Summers Co. HQ 1400

1400 115.29$            161,406.00$              

21,700            

6621C062

DISTRICT 8 TOTAL

Nicholas

Monroe

Greenbrier

Fayette

Summers County Estimated Total

Nicholas County Estimated Total

Monroe County Estimated Total

Greenbrier County Estimated Total

Fayette County Estimated Total

DISTRICT 9

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price that 

populates in the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the Vendor's Price 

Per Ton bid entry. 

Morton Salt, Inc. 

ATT A - Pricing Pages by Delivery Page 9 of 11
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Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

McDowell County HQ 2,000

Yukon Substation 300

Johnny Cake Substation 500

Raysal 500

3,300 NO BID #VALUE!

Mercer County HQ 2,600

Flat Top Substation 300

I-77 near Princeton 2,600

5,500 NO BID #VALUE!

Raleigh County HQ 8,000

Bolt Substation 100

Bragg Substation 5,000

13,100 NO BID #VALUE!

Wyoming County HQ 3,000

Still Run Substation 1,000

Hanover Outpost 100

4,100 NO BID #VALUE!

26,000             

6621C062

Raleigh County Estimated Total

Wyoming County Estimated Total

DISTRICT 10 ESTIMATED TOTAL

DISTRICT 10

Wyoming

Raleigh

Mercer

McDowell

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price that 

populates in the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the Vendor's Price 

Per Ton bid entry. 

Morton Salt, Inc. 

McDowell County Estimated Total

Mercer County Estimated Total
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Vendor Name

County Delivery Site Location
 Estimated

Tonnage 
 Price per Ton  Extended Price 

Chelyan Maintenance 3,000              

Standard Maintenance 2,900              

5,900              NO BID #VALUE!

Mercer Princeton Maintenance 1,500              

1,500              NO BID #VALUE!

Beckley Maintenance 6,700              

Ghent Maintenance 4,100              

10,800            NO BID #VALUE!

18,200            

Raleigh

Kanawha

Raleigh County Estimated Total

Mercer County Estimated Total

Kanawha County Estimated Total

WV PARKWAYS ESTIMATED TOTAL

WV PARKWAYS AUTHORITY

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE

Attachment A - Pricing Pages by Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a unit price per ton for any or all Counties listed.

The Extended Price amount for each County will autofill upon Vendor entry of its Price Per Ton.  The price 

that populates in the Extended Price cells will be a result of the County’s estimated tonnage multiplied by the 

Vendor's Price Per Ton bid entry. 

Morton Salt, Inc. 
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Aimee Wilson
313-488-1910

awilson3@mortonsalt.com
 312-896-9208



I, Mac Warner, Secretary of State of the State of 
West Virginia, hereby certify that

MORTON SALT, INC.

 a corporation formed under the laws of Delaware filed an application to be registered as 
a foreign corporation authorizing it to transact business in West Virginia.  The 
application was found to conform to law and a “Certificate of Authority” was issued by 
the West Virginia Secretary of State on August 04, 2010.
 
 I further certify that the corporation has not been revoked by the State of West Virginia 
nor has a Certificate of Withdrawal been issued to the corporation by the West Virginia 
Secretary of State.
 
 Accordingly, I hereby issue this Certificate of Authorization

CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORIZATION

February 02, 2022

Validation ID:8WV0X_7XMEH

Notice: A certificate issued electronically from the West Virginia Secretary of State's Web site is fully and immediately valid and effective.  However, as an option, the issuance and validity of a certificate obtained electronically may 
be established by visiting the Certificate Validation Page of the Secretary of State's Web site, https://apps.wv.gov/sos/businessentitysearch/validate.aspx entering the validation ID displayed on the certificate, and following the 

instructions displayed.  Confirming the issuance of a certificate is merely optional and is not necessary to the valid and effective issuance of a certificate.



7/12/2022
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