
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1082116

Solicitation Description: ADDENDUM NO-1 STONE & AGG MAT.& DEL.TO EST LOC BY Vendor

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2022-08-17 13:30 SR 0803 ESR08172200000000858 1

VENDOR

VS0000018523
ROCKY GAP QUARRY LLC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2300000016

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2022-08-17 Response Time: 09:14:25

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep
304-558-2566
john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Item A Class 1 Aggregate 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Item B Class 2 Aggregate 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Item C Class 10 Aggregate 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Item D AASHTO #1 Aggregate 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Item E AASHTO #3 Aggregate 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    
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Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Item F AASHTO #4 Aggregate 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Item G AASHTO #467 Aggregate 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Item H AASHTO #57 Aggregate 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Item I AASHTO #67 Aggregate 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 Item J AASHTO #7 Aggregate 0.00000 TON   
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 Item K AASHTO #8 Aggregate 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 Item L AASHTO #9 Aggregate 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 Item M Stone for Gabions 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 Item N Fine Aggregate 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 Item OA Limestone Standard Abrasives 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 Item OB Sandstone Standard Abrasives 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 Item OC Steel Slag for SRIC 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 Item PA Limestone Modified Abrasives 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 Item PB Sandstone Modified Abrasives 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    
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Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 Item Q Rip Rap 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 Item R Shot Rock 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 Item S AASHTO #8 Modified 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 Item T AASHTO #9 Modified 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 Item U Pea Gravel 0.00000 TON   
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 Item V #11 Limestone Abrasives 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 Item W Quarry Waste 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 Item Z Imbricated Stone 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 Item AA Cinders 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Item X1 Haul, First Ton-Mile 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78180000    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30 Item X2 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78180000    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 Item Y1 Haul, First Ton-Mile 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78180000    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Item Y 2 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78180000    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT  B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on 
commodity lines in OASIS.















D10 LSGS

Stone & Aggregate Deliivery to Established Locations  Attachment A "ATT A"   2022

Enter Vendor Name:
L,S,G,S L,S,G,S L,S,G,S L,S,G,S L,S,G,S Steel Slag

Item # Grade Bid/Ton Bid/Ton Bid/Ton Bid/Ton Bid/Ton Bid/Ton
McDowell Havaco 1 A Class 1

5 E AASHTO #3
7 G AASHTO #467
8 H AASHTO #57

11 K AASHTO #8
12 L AASHTO #9 
13 M Gabion Stone
17 OC Steel Slag for SRIC
18 PA Limestone Mod. Abr.
19 PB Sandstone Mod. Abr.
21 R Shot Rock

McDowell Johnnycake Mtn. 1 A Class 1
5 E AASHTO #3
7 G AASHTO #467
8 H AASHTO #57

11 K AASHTO #8
12 L AASHTO #9 
13 M Gabion Stone
17 OC Steel Slag for SRIC
18 PA Limestone Mod. Abr.
19 PB Sandstone Mod. Abr.
21 R Shot Rock

McDowell Raysal 1 A Class 1
5 E AASHTO #3
7 G AASHTO #467
8 H AASHTO #57

11 K AASHTO #8
12 L AASHTO #9 
13 M Gabion Stone
17 OC Steel Slag for SRIC
18 PA Limestone Mod. Abr.
19 PB Sandstone Mod. Abr.
21 R Shot Rock

McDowell Yukon 1 A Class 1
5 E AASHTO #3
7 G AASHTO #467
8 H AASHTO #57

11 K AASHTO #8
12 L AASHTO #9 
13 M Gabion Stone
17 OC Steel Slag for SRIC
18 PA Limestone Mod. Abr.
19 PB Sandstone Mod. Abr.
21 R Shot Rock

Mercer Flat Top 1 A Class 1
5 E AASHTO #3
7 G AASHTO #467

11 K AASHTO #8
12 L AASHTO #9 
13 M Gabion Stone

Mercer Princeton I-77 1 A Class 1 22.65
12 L AASHTO #9 no bid

Mercer Princeton WV 20 1 A Class 1 22.65
5 E AASHTO #3 no bid
7 G AASHTO #467 no bid

11 K AASHTO #8 24.5
12 L AASHTO #9 no bid
13 M Gabion Stone 25.05

Raleigh Bolt 1 A Class 1
5 E AASHTO #3
8 H AASHTO #57

11 K AASHTO #8
12 L AASHTO #9 
13 M Gabion Stone

Raleigh Bragg I-64 1 A Class 1
5 E AASHTO #3
8 H AASHTO #57

11 K AASHTO #8
12 L AASHTO #9 
13 M Gabion Stone

Raleigh Skelton 1 A Class 1
5 E AASHTO #3
8 H AASHTO #57

11 K AASHTO #8
12 L AASHTO #9 
13 M Gabion Stone

Raleigh Coalfields 1 A Class 1
5 E AASHTO #3
8 H AASHTO #57

11 K AASHTO #8
12 L AASHTO #9 
13 M Gabion Stone

Wyoming Hanover 1 A Class 1
5 E AASHTO #3

11 K AASHTO #8
12 L AASHTO #9 
13 M Gabion Stone

21 R Shot Rock
Wyoming Pineville HQ 1 A Class 1

8 H AASHTO #57

County/Location

Rocky Gap Quarry, LLCDISTRICT 10

D10 LSGS 1 of 2 2022 Estab Loc.



D10 LSGS

Stone & Aggregate Deliivery to Established Locations  Attachment A "ATT A"   2022

Enter Vendor Name:
L,S,G,S L,S,G,S L,S,G,S L,S,G,S L,S,G,S Steel Slag

Item # Grade Bid/Ton Bid/Ton Bid/Ton Bid/Ton Bid/Ton Bid/TonCounty/Location

Rocky Gap Quarry, LLCDISTRICT 10

11 K AASHTO #8
12 L AASHTO #9 
13 M Gabion Stone
21 R Shot Rock

Wyoming Still Run 1 A Class 1
5 E AASHTO #3
8 H AASHTO #57

11 K AASHTO #8
12 L AASHTO #9 
13 M Gabion Stone
21 R Shot Rock

D10 LSGS 2 of 2 2022 Estab Loc.



Pricing Page Schedule VENDOR NAME Rocky Gap Quarry, LLC
ATTACHMENT A F.O.B. - Adjutant General's Office

STONE & AGGREGATE WITH DELIVERY TO ESTABLISHED LOCATIONS  2022
Estimated Location of

Contract Description Quantity DOH
Item Comm of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site

Brushfork/Bluefield Armory LIMESTONE BLAST
2915 Old Bramwell Road SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL
Bluefield, WV  24701 GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG

A 1 Class 1 500 Brushfork/Bluefield Armory 22.65
B 2 Class 2 500 Brushfork/Bluefield Armory 22.65
D 4 AASHTO #1 500 Brushfork/Bluefield Armory 25.60
G 7 AASHTO #467 500 Brushfork/Bluefield Armory no bid
H 8 AASHTO #57 500 Brushfork/Bluefield Armory 26.25
K 11 AASHTO #8 500 Brushfork/Bluefield Armory 24.50
L 12 AASHTO #9 500 Brushfork/Bluefield Armory no bid
M 13 Gabion Stone 500 Brushfork/Bluefield Armory 25.00
N 14 Fine Aggregates 500 Brushfork/Bluefield Armory 22.60

OA 15 Limestone Std Abr. 500 Brushfork/Bluefield Armory no bid
OB 16 Sandstone Std Abr. 500 Brushfork/Bluefield Armory no bid
OC 17 Steel Slag for SRIC 500 Brushfork/Bluefield Armory no bid
PA 18 Limestone Mod Abr. 500 Brushfork/Bluefield Armory no bid
PB 19 Sandstone Mod Abr. 500 Brushfork/Bluefield Armory no bid
Q 20 RipRap 500 Brushfork/Bluefield Armory 26.00
R 21 Shot Rock 500 Brushfork/Bluefield Armory 21.50
S 22 AASHTO #8M 500 Brushfork/Bluefield Armory no bid
W 26 Quarry Waste 500 Brushfork/Bluefield Armory 19.00

Morgantown Readiness Center LIMESTONE BLAST
90 Army Band Road SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL
Morgantown, WV  26505 GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG

A 1 Class 1 500 Morgantown Readiness Ctr
B 2 Class 2 500 Morgantown Readiness Ctr
D 4 AASHTO #1 500 Morgantown Readiness Ctr
G 7 AASHTO #467 500 Morgantown Readiness Ctr
H 8 AASHTO #57 500 Morgantown Readiness Ctr
K 11 AASHTO #8 500 Morgantown Readiness Ctr
L 12 AASHTO #9 500 Morgantown Readiness Ctr
M 13 Gabion Stone 500 Morgantown Readiness Ctr
N 14 Fine Aggregates 500 Morgantown Readiness Ctr

OA 15 Limestone Std Abr. 500 Morgantown Readiness Ctr
OB 16 Sandstone Std Abr. 500 Morgantown Readiness Ctr
OC 17 Steel Slag for SRIC 500 Morgantown Readiness Ctr
PA 18 Limestone Mod Abr. 500 Morgantown Readiness Ctr
PB 19 Sandstone Mod Abr. 500 Morgantown Readiness Ctr
Q 20 RipRap 500 Morgantown Readiness Ctr
R 21 Shot Rock 500 Morgantown Readiness Ctr
S 22 AASHTO #8M 500 Morgantown Readiness Ctr
W 26 Quarry Waste 500 Morgantown Readiness Ctr

Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.
DOH Storage Site

MERCER COUNTY

MONONGALIA COUNTY

CRFQ DOT2300000016 Exhibit A Pricing -Natl Guard Only Locations.xls 2022 1 of 1,  Tab MERCR.MON




