West Virginia

Purchasing Division

The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
wWVOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West Virginia’s
procurement process, and to maintain the
transparency of the bid-opening process, this
documentation submitted online is publicly posted
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses
to this solicitation submitted to the Purchasing
Division in hard copy format.
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Q . Lo
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2019 Washington Street East Solicitation Response

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

o

Proc Folder: 1082116
Solicitation Description: ADDENDUM NO-1 STONE & AGG MAT.& DEL.TO EST LOC BY Vendor

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement
Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2022-08-17 13:30 SR 0803 ESR08162200000000795 1
VENDOR

000000112046

MOUNTAIN AGGREGATES INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2300000016
Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2022-08-16 Response Time:
Comments:

13:04:03

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep

304-558-2566

john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X FEIN# DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed:  Aug 18, 2022 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Item A Class 1 Aggregate 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Iltem B Class 2 Aggregate 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Item C Class 10 Aggregate 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Iltem D AASHTO #1 Aggregate 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Iltem E AASHTO #3 Aggregate 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Date Printed:  Aug 18, 2022 Page: 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Iltem F AASHTO #4 Aggregate 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Iltem G AASHTO #467 Aggregate 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Item H AASHTO #57 Aggregate 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Iltem | AASHTO #67 Aggregate 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

10 Iltem J AASHTO #7 Aggregate 0.00000 TON
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 Iltem K AASHTO #8 Aggregate 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 Iltem L AASHTO #9 Aggregate 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 Item M Stone for Gabions 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 Iltem N Fine Aggregate 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Date Printed:  Aug 18, 2022 Page: 4 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 Item OA Limestone Standard Abrasives 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 Item OB Sandstone Standard Abrasives 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 Item OC Steel Slag for SRIC 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 Item PA Limestone Modified Abrasives 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 Item PB Sandstone Modified Abrasives 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600
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Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 Iltem Q Rip Rap 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 Item R Shot Rock 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 Item S AASHTO #8 Modified 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 Iltem T AASHTO #9 Modified 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

24 Iltem U Pea Gravel 0.00000 TON
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 Item V #11 Limestone Abrasives 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 Iltem W Quarry Waste 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 Item Z Imbricated Stone 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 Item AA Cinders 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Date Printed:  Aug 18, 2022 Page: 7 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Item X1 Haul, First Ton-Mile 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78180000

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30 Item X2 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78180000

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 Item Y1 Haul, First Ton-Mile 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78180000

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Item Y 2 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78180000

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Date Printed:  Aug 18, 2022 Page: 8 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Department of Administration
g\ |Purchasing Division

i=d 12019 Washington Street East
/' § | Post Office Box 50130

¥ |Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Centralized Request for Quote
Highways

Principal Contact : LLOYD SHEPHERD

Vendor Contact Phone: 606-832-2166

Extension: 859-299-7001

Proc Folder: 1082116 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: ADDENDUM NO-1 STONE & AGG MAT.& DEL.TO EST LOC BY Vendor |ADDENDUM NO_1
Update Specifications
Proc Type: Central Master Agreement
Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2022-08-15 2022-08-17 13:30 CRFQ 0803 DOT2300000016 2
BID RECEIVING LOCATION ..~ *
BID CLERK
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
PURCHASING DIVISION
2019 WASHINGTON STE
CHARLESTON WV 25305
us
'VENDOR )
Vendor Customer Code: 11111600
Vendor Name :MOUNTAIN AGGREGATES, INC
Address : P.0. Box 13130
Street :
City :LEXINGTON
State :ky Country :us Zip :40583-3130

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep

304-558-2566
john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X A

DATE 8-16-2022

s

174 S =
All offers subject c’/ conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed:  Aug 15, 2022

Page: 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05




ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

ADDENDUM NO_1

ADDENDUM No_1 issued to publish and distribute the attached information to the Vendor Community
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION:

The West Virginia Purchasing Division is soliciting bids on behalf of the WV Division of Highways and the WV Adjutant General's
Office/WV Army Reserve National Guard, to establish an open-end contract for various sizes and types of Stone, Aggregate, and
Cinder materials with delivery by Vendor (at Vendor's expense), F.O.B. to ESTABLISHED Agency Storage Sites ONLY throughout

the State of WV. Per the Bid Requirements, Specifications, Terms and Conditions attached to this solicitation.

INVOICETO =~ . . .|sweTO

VARIOUS AGENCY STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS
INDICATED BY ORDER

No City wv No City wv

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

1 Item A Class 1 Aggregate 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) AND ATT B (materials source) for providing its actual Bid. NOTE: Vendor, Do NOT

enter prices on commodity lines in OASIS.

Date Printed:  Aug 15, 2022 Page: 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05




SOLICITATION NUMBER: CRFQ DOT2300000016

Addendum Number: 1

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as CRFQ DOT23000000016
(“Solicitation™) to reflect the change(s) identified and described below.

Applicable Addendum Category:
[ 1 Modify bid opening date and time
[X] Modify specifications of product or service being sought
[ 1 Attachment of vendor questions and responses
[ ] Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet
[ } Correction of error

[ ] Other

Additional Documentation:
Revise Specs.

Bid Opening remains 08/17/2022 at 1:30pm

Terms and Conditions:
1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in full force and
effect.

2. Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by completing an
Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith. Failure to acknowledge addenda
may result in bid disqualification. The addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to
expedite document processing.



DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as the
Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this Contract.

(Name, Title) LLOYD SHEPHERD SALES MANAGER

(Printed Name and Title) LLOYD SHEPHERD SALES MANAGER

(Address) P.O.BOX 1310 LEXINGTON KY 40583-3130

(Phone Number) / (Fax Number) _606-832-2166 859-299-7001

(email address) rshepherd@mountaincompanies.com

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wvOASIS, I certify that: I have reviewed this Solicitation/Contract in its entirety; that I
understand the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that
this bid, offer or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn;
that the product or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the
Solicitation/Contract for that product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor
accepts the terms and conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that
I am submitting this bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; that I am authorized by
the vendor to execute and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents related thereto on
vendor’s behalf; that I am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to
the best of my knowledge, the vendor has properly registered with any State agency that may
require registration.

By signing below, I further certify that I understand this Contract is subject to the
provisions of West Virginia Code § 5A-3-62, which automatically voids certain contract
clauses that violate State law: and that pursuant to W. Va. Code 54-3-63, the entity
entering into this contract is prohibited from engaging in a boycott against Israel.

MOUNTAIN AGGREGATES ANC-

0

epresentative Name, Title)

RD

LLOYD SHEPH SALES MANAGER 8-16-2022
(Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative) (Date)
606-832-2166 859-299-7001

(Phone Number) (Fax Number)
rshepherd@mountaincompanies.com

" (Email Address)

Revised 07/01/2022



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Stone & Aggregate Delivery to Established Locations

9.2.1 Immediate cancellation of the contract.

9.2.2 Immediate cancellation of one or more delivery orders issued under this
contract.

9.2.3 Any other remedies available in law or equity.

10. MISCELLANEOUS:

10.1 No Substitutions: Vendor shall supply only Contract Items submitted unless a
contract modification is approved per the provisions contained in this contract.

10.2 Vendor Supply: Vendor must carry sufficient inventory of the Contract Items being
offered to fulfill its obligations under this contract. By signing its bid, Vendor certifies
that it can supply the Contract Items contained in its bid response.

10.3 Reports: For Items purchased during the term of this contract, the Vendor shall
provide the Agency with reports, in electronic spreadsheet format, with purchased
Contract Items, total dollar value, quantities, shipments, and delivery information,
quarterly, or annual summaries, or upon request. Failure to supply such reports may be
grounds for cancellation of this contract.

10.4 Contract Manager: During its performance of this contract, Vendor must designate
and maintain a primary Contract Manager responsible for overseeing Vendor’s
responsibilities under this contract. The Contract Manager must be available during
normal business hours to address any customer service or other issues related to this
contract. Vendor shall provide the Agency with its current email addresses,
billing/payment addresses, phone numbers, fax numbers, and any changes to the latter
or its Contract Manager during the life of the contract. Vendor should list its Contract
Manager and his or her contact information below.

Contract Manager: _ LLOYD SHEPHERD
Telephone Number: 606-832-2166

Fax Number: 606-832-2514

Email Address: rshepherd@mountaincompanies.com

Vendor shall inform the Agency in writing of any changes to the information provided
above and/or changes to support personnel supplied by the Vendor within ten (10)
calendar days of such changes. Failure to comply may be grounds for cancellation of
this contract.

Form Revised 10/27/2014 Page 20 of 2 2022 6623C004 Established Loc.



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Stone & Aggregate Delivery to Established Locations

10.2 Vendor Supply: Vendor must carry sufficient inventory of the Contract Items being
offered to fulfill its obligations under this contract. By signing its bid, Vendor certifies
that it can supply the Contract Items contained in its bid response.

10.3 Reports: For Items purchased during the term of this contract, the Vendor shall provide
the Agency with reports, in electronic spreadsheet format, with purchased Contract Items,
total dollar value, quantities, shipments, and delivery information, quarterly, or annual
summaries, or upon request. Failure to supply such reports may be grounds for
cancellation of this contract.

104 Contract Manager: During its performance of this contract, Vendor must designate and
maintain a primary Contract Manager responsible for overseeing Vendor’s
responsibilities under this contract. The Contract Manager must be available during
normal business hours to address any customer service or other issues related to this
contract. Vendor shall provide the Agency with its current email addresses,
billing/payment addresses, phone numbers, fax numbers, and any changes to the latter or
its Contract Manager during the life of the contract. Vendor should list its Contract
Manager and his or her contact information below.

Contract Manager: LLOYD SHEPHERD
Telephone Number: 606-832-2166

Fax Number: 606-832-2514
Email Address: rshepherd@mountaincompanies.com

Vendor shall inform the Agency in writing of any changes to the information provided
above and/or changes to support personnel supplied by the Vendor within ten (10)
calendar days of such changes. Failure to comply may be grounds for cancellation of
this contract.

Form Revised 10/27/2014 Page 19 of 19 2022 6623C004 Established Loc.



ATTACHMENT B (ATT B) Information Form
Stone & Aggregate with Delivery by Vendor to Established Locations 6621C072
[ETTeTyoarT

Vendor Name: MOUNTAIN AGGREGATES, INC

Vendors Phone #, Email Address to contact for placing Orders: 606-832-2166 rshepherd@mountaincompanies.com
Vendors Phone #, Email Address to contact for Invoices: 606-832-2166 rshepherd@mountaincompanies.com
Vendors Phone #, Email Address to contact for Payment: 606-832-2166 rshepherd@mountaincompanies.com

This ATT B must be completed and submitted with the bid and coordinate with the ltems pricing on the ATT A..
Vendors Sources/Plants Vendors Storage Sites
Source Name & Location (physical address),
Phone # Location (physical address), Phone #
PINE MOUNTAIN STONE QUARRY ) PINE MOUNTAIN STONE QUARRY
BURDINE,KY ON KY RT 805, LETCHER COUNTY, KY BURDINE,KY ON KY RT 805, LETCHER COUNTY, KY
&
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D2 LSGS
Stone & Aggregate Deliivery to Established Locations Attachment A "ATT A" 2022

DISTRICT 2 Enter Vendor Name: Mountain Aggregates, Inc
L,S,GS LSGS | LSGS | LSGS | LSGS | SteelSlag
L County/Location ltem# Grade Bid/Ton Bid/Ton Bid/Ton | Bid/Ton | Bid/Ton Bid/Ton
Cabell Barboursville 1]A Class 1
5|E AASHTO #3
71G AASHTO #467
8|H AASHTO #57
9|l AASHTO #67
11{K AASHTO #8
12[L AASHTO #9
13|M Gabion Stone
15[0A  |Limestone Std. Abr.
7]10C  |Steel Slag for SRIC
8|PA  [Limestone Mad. Abr.
20]Q RipRap
21|R Shot Rock
22|S AASHTO #8M
25{V #11 Limestone Abr,
Lincoln Harts 1A Class 1
2|B Class 2
E AASHTO #3
H AASHTO #57
111K AASHTO #8
13|M Gabion Stone
15]0A _ [Limestone Std. Abr.
17/0C _ [Steel Slag for SRIC
20(Q RipRap
21|R Shot Rock
228 AASHTO #8M
25|V #11 Limestone Abr.
Lincoln [West Hamiin 1]1A Class
2(B Class 2
5|E AASHTO #3
8|H AASHTO #57
9|l AASHTO #67
11K AASHTO #8
13|M Gabion Stone
15{0A  [Limestone Std. Abr.
17|0C _ |Steel Slag for SRIC
20|Q RipRap
21|R Shot Rock
22|S AASHTO #8M
25|V #11 Limestone Abr,
Linceln Yawkey 1]A Class 1
2|B Class 2
5|E AASHTO #3
8|H AASHTO #57
11K AASHTO #8
3|M Gabion Stone
15{0A  |Limestone Std. Abr.
7|0C _ [Steel Slag for SRIC
20|Q RipRap
21|R Shot Rock
22|85 AASHTO #8M
25|V #11 Limestone Abr. S
Logan Chapmanville Cor 1]A Class 1 $29.50
4|D AASHTO # $30.50
5|E AASHTO #3 $30.50
11K AASHTO #8 $43.00
13|M Gabion Stone

15|0A _ |Limestone Std. Abr.
17]0C  |Steel Slag for SRIC
18{PA Limestone Mod. Abr.
21[R Shot Rock
22|18 AASHTO #8M $43.00
25|V #11 Limestone Abr,
Logan Man 11A Class 1

4D AASHTO #1

5(E AASHTO #3

8[H AASHTO #57
1K AASHTO #8
13|M Gabion Stone
15]0A _ [Limestone Std. Abr.
17{0C __ |Steel Slag for SRIC
18|PA__ |Limestone Mod. Abr.
21[R Shot Rock
22|S AASHTO #8M
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D2 LSGS

Stone & Aggregate Deliivery to Established Locations Attachment A "ATT A" 2022

DISTRICT 2 Enter Vendor Name: Mountain Aggregates, Inc
L,8,GS LSGS | LSGS | LSGS | LSGS | SteelSlag
I CountyiLocation llem#  Grade Bid/Ton Bid/Ton | Bid/Ton | Bid/Ton | BidTon | Bid/Ton
25|V #11 Limestone Abr.
Logan Wilkinson 1A Class 1 $29.75
4|D AASHTO #1 $30.50
5|E AASHTO #3 $30.50
8|H AASHTO #57 $31.00
11{K AASHTO #8 $41.50
13|M Gabion Stone
15[0A _ |Limestone Std. Abr.
17[0C __|Steel Slag for SRIC
18|PA _ |Limestone Mod. Abr.
21|R Shot Rock
22|8 AASHTO #8M $41.50
[ 25|V #11 Limestone Abr.
Mingo Gilbert 1A Class 1
4D AASHTO #1
5|E AASHTO #3
8|H AASHTO #57
11{K AASHTO #8
13|M Gabion Stone
15[0A  |Limestone Std. Abr,
17|0C  |Steel Slag for SRIC
18[PA__|Limestone Mod. Abr.
21|R Shot Rack
22|S AASHTO #8M
25|V #11 Limestone Abr.
Mingo Miller Creek 1]A Class 1 $26.50
4|D AASHTO #1 27.50
5|E AASHTO #3 27.50
8|H AASHTO #57 28.50
111K AASHTO #8 36.75
13|M Gabion Stone
15]0A  |Limestone Std. Abr.

7|0C _ [Steel Slag for SRIC

8[PA |Limestone Mod. Abr.
21|R Shot Rock
22|S AASHTO #8M $36.75
25|V #11 Limestone Abr,

Wayne Crum 1]A Class 1
5|E AASHTO #3
71G AASHTO #467
8|H AASHTO #57
9l AASHTO #67

111K AASHTO #8

13|M Gabion Stone
15|0A  |Limestone Std. Abr.
7]10C__ |[Steel Slag for SRIC
8|PA _ [Limestone Mod. Abr.

21|R Shot Rock

2215 AASHTO #8M

25|V #11 Limestone Abr.

Wayne Pritchard 1]A Class 1
5|E AASHTO #3
71G AASHTO #467
8|H AASHTO #57
9 AASHTO #67
11K AASHTO #8
3|M Gabion Stone
5]0A  |Limestone Std. Abr.

17]0C__ [Steel Slag for SRIC
18[PA _|Limestone Mod. Abr.
21[R Shot Rock

22|15 AASHTO #8M

25|V #11 Limestone Abr,

Wayne Wayne 1|A Class 1
2|B Class 2
5|E AASHTO #3
7|G AASHTO #467
8[H AASHTO #57

AASHTO #67
111K AASHTO #8
13{M Gabion Stone
15]0A _ [Limestone Std. Abr.
17]0C__ [Steel Slag for SRIC
18JPA __ [Limestone Mod. Abr.
20]Q RipRap
21|R Shot Rock
22|8 AASHTO #8M
25|V #11 Limestone Abr.
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Limestone ONLY 1-10

Stone & Aggregate Deliivery to Established Locations Attachment A "ATT A" 2022
LIMESTONE ONLY for Areas in

Mountain Aggregates, Inc

Districts 1-10 Enter Vendor Name:
Limestone Limestone Limestone Limestone Limestone Limestone
ltem# Grade Bid /Ton Bid /Ton Bid /Ton Bid /Ton Bid /Ton Bid /Ton

Fayette JOak Hill 1 A [Class 1

5 E |AASHTO#3

9 | |AASHTO #67

10 J  |AASHTO #7

11 K |AASHTO #8

12 L |AASHTO #9

13 M |Gabion Stone

18 PA  |Limestone Mod. Abr,

21 R [Shot Rock

23 T |AASHTO #IM
Fayette |Glen Ferris 1 A |CLASS 1

5 E |AASHTO#3

9 | |AASHTO #67

13 M |Gabion Stone
Fayette JLookout 1 A |Class 1

5 E |AASHTO#3

9 | |AASHTO #67

10 J |AASHTO #7

11 K |AASHTO #8

12 L |AASHTO#3

13 M |Gabion Stone

18 PA  |Limestone Mod. Abr.

21 R |Shot Rock

23 T |AASHTO #9M
Fayette JFalls View

" AASHTO #8

12 L |AASHTO#9

18 PA |Limestone Mod. Abr.

23 T |AASHTO #3M
Fayette JOAK HILL APD US 19

12 L |AASHTO#9

23 T |AASHTO #9M
Cabell |Barboursville

5 E |AASHTO #3

8 H |AASHTO #57

9 | |AASHTO #67

22 S |AASHTO #8M

23 T |AASHTO #9M
Lincoln JHarts

5 E |AASHTO #3

8 H |AASHTO #57

22 S |AASHTO #8M

23 T |AASHTO #9M
Lincoln JWest Hamlin

5 E |AASHTO #3

8 H |AASHTO #57

9 | |AASHTO #67

22 S |AASHTO #8M

23 T |AASHTO #IM

Limestone ONLY 1-10 10of2
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Limestone ONLY 1-10

Stone & Aggregate Deliivery to Established Locations Attachment A "ATT A" 2022

LIMESTONE ONLY for Areas in

Mountain Aggregates, Inc

Districts 1-10 Enter Vendor Name:
Limestone Limestone Limestone Limestone Limestone Limestone
Lincoln |Yawksy
5 E |AASHTO#3
8 H |AASHTO #57
22 S |AASHTO #8M
23 T |AASHTO #9M
Logan |Chapmanville Corr G 4 D [AASHTO#1 30.50
5 E |AASHTO#3 30.50
22 S |AASHTO #8M 43.00
23 T |AASHTO#9M 43.00
Logan |Man
8 H |AASHTO #57
22 S [AASHTO #8M
23 T |AASHTO #IM
Logan |Wilkinson 4 D [AASHTO #1 30.50
5 E |AASHTO #3 30.50
8 H |AASHTO #57 31.00
22 S |AASHTO #8M 41,50
23 T |AASHTO #9M 41,50
Mingo |Gilbert 4 D [AASHTO#1
5 E |AASHTO#3
8 H |AASHTO #57
2 S [AASHTO #8M
23 T |AASHTO #9M
Mingo |Miller Creek 4 D |AASHTO#1 27.50
5 E JAASHTO #3 21.50
8 H JAASHTO #57 28.50
22 S |AASHTO #8M 36.75
23 T |AASHTO #9M 36.75
Wayne {Crum
5 E |AASHTO #3
8 H |AASHTO #57
9 | |AASHTO #67
22 S |AASHTO #8M
23 T |AASHTO #9M
Wayne |Pritchard 4 D |AASHTO #1
5 E |AASHTO #3
8 H |AASHTO #57
9 | |AASHTO #67
22 S |AASHTO #8M
23 T |AASHTO #9M
Wayne |Wayne 4 D [AASHTO#1
5 E |AASHTO #3
8 H |AASHTO #57
9 | |AASHTO #67
22 S |AASHTO #8M
23 T |AASHTO #OM
Limestone ONLY 1-10 20f2
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Pricing Page Schedule VENDOR NAME Mountain Aggregates, Inc

ATTACHMENT A F.0.B. - Adjutant General's Office
STONE & AGGREGATE WITH DELIVERY TO ESTABLISHED LOCATIONS 2022
Estimated Location of Bid Price ($/Ton) F.0.B.
Contract Description Quantity DOH DOH Storage Site
ltem  Comm of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site
LOGAN/MINGO COUNTY
Logan-Mingo Readiness Center LIMESTONE BLAST
361 22 Mine Road SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL
Holden, WV 25625 GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
A 1 |Class 1 500] Logan-Mingo Readiness Ctr 29.25
B 2 |Class 2 500( Logan-Mingo Readiness Ctr 29.25
D 4  |AASHTO #1 500| Logan-Mingo Readiness Ctr 30.25
G 7 |AASHTO #467 500| Logan-Mingo Readiness Ctr
H 8  |AASHTO #57 500| Logan-Mingo Readiness Ctr 30.25
K 11 |AASHTO #8 500| Logan-Mingo Readiness Ctr 40.50
L 12 |AASHTO#9 500| Logan-Mingo Readiness Ctr 40.50
M 13 |Gabion Stone 500| Logan-Mingo Readiness Ctr
N 14 [Fine Aggregates 500| Logan-Mingo Readiness Ctr
OA 15 |Limestone Std Abr. 500| Logan-Mingo Readiness Cir
OB 16 [Sandstone Std Abr. 500| Logan-Mingo Readiness Cir
0oC 17 |Steel Slag for SRIC 500| Logan-Mingo Readiness Ctr
PA 18 |Limestone Mod Abr. 500] Logan-Mingo Readiness Ctr
PB 19  [Sandstone Mod Abr, 500| Logan-Mingo Readiness Ctr
Q 20 |RipRap 500( Logan-Mingo Readiness Ctr
R 21 |Shot Rock 500| Logan-Mingo Readiness Cfr
S 22 |AASHTO #8M 500| Logan-Mingo Readiness Ctr
W 26 |Quarry Waste 500| Logan-Mingo Readiness Ctr

MARION COUNTY

Fairmont AFRC/HHB 1st 201st Field Artillery LIMESTONE BLAST
201 Artillery Drive SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL
Fairmont, WV 26554 GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
A 1 Class 1 500 Fairmont AFRC/HHB
B 2 |Class2 500 Fairmont AFRC/HHB
D 4  |AASHTO#1 500 Fairmont AFRC/HHB
G 7 |AASHTO #467 500 Fairmont AFRC/HHB
H 8 AASHTO #57 500 Fairmont AFRC/HHB
K 11 [AASHTO #8 500 Fairmont AFRC/HHB
L 12 |AASHTO#9 500 Fairmont AFRC/HHB
M 13 |Gabion Stone 500 Fairmont AFRC/HHB
N 14 |Fine Aggregates 500 Fairmont AFRC/HHB
OA 15 [Limestone Std Abr. 500 Fairmont AFRC/HHB
OB 16  |Sandstone Std Abr. 500 Fairmont AFRC/HHB
0C Steel Slag for SRIC 500 Fairmont AFRC/HHB
PA 18  |Limestone Mod Abr. 500 Fairmont AFRC/HHB
PB 19 |Sandstone Mod Abr. 500 Fairmont AFRC/HHB
Q 20 [RipRap 500 Fairmont AFRC/HHB
R 21 |Shot Rock 500 Fairmont AFRC/HHB
S 22 |AASHTO #8M 500 Fairmont AFRC/HHB
W 26 |Quarry Waste 500 Fairmont AFRC/HHB

WYV Exhibit A Pricing Natl Guard 2022 2022 10of 1, Tab LOG.MINGO.MAR



Pricing Page Schedule VENDOR NAME Mountain Aggregates, Inc
ATTACHMENT A F.O.B. - Adjutant General's Office
STONE & AGGREGATE WITH DELIVERY TO ESTABLISHED LOCATIONS 2022
Estimatex Location of Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.
Contract Description Quantity DOH DCH Storage Site
ltem  Comm of Aggregate  (TONS) Storage Site
LOGAN COUNTY
Logan County Airport LIMESTONE BLAST
3236 Band Mill Hollow Road SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL
Logan, WV 25601 GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
A 1 [Class 1 500  Logan County Airport 31.75
B 2 |Class 2 500]  Logan County Airport 31.75
D 4  |AASHTO#1 500| Logan County Airport 32.75
G 7 |AASHTO #467 500] Logan County Airport
H 8 |AASHTO #57 500 Logan County Airport 32.75
K 11 [AASHTO #8 500|  Logan County Airport 43.25
L 12 |AASHTO#9 500]  Logan County Airport 43.25
M 13 [Gabion Stone 500) Logan County Airport
N 14 |Fine Aggregates 500|  Logan County Airport
OA 15 |Limestone Std Abr. 500 Logan County Airport
OB 16 |Sandstone Std Abr. 500| Logan County Airport
ocC 17 [Steel Slag for SRIC 500/ Logan County Airport
PA 18  |Limestone Mod Abr. 500| Logan County Airport
PB 19 [Sandstone Mod Abr. 500/ Logan County Airport
Q 20 |[RipRap 500 Logan County Airport
R 21 [Shot Rock 500|  Logan County Airport
S 22  |AASHTO #8M 500 Logan County Airport
w 26 |Quarry Waste 500[ Logan County Airport
LOGAN COUNTY
Camp Branch Air Training Site (Alpha Natural Resourcg  LIMESTONE BLAST
Route 17, North SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL
Ethel, WV 25076 GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
A 1 Class 1 500 Camp Branch 31.75
B 2 |[Class 2 500 Camp Branch 31.75
D 4 [AASHTO #1 500 Camp Branch 32.75
G 7 |AASHTO #467 500 Camp Branch
H 8 |AASHTO#57 500 Camp Branch 32.75
K 11 |AASHTO #8 500 Camp Branch 43.25
L 12 |AASHTO#9 500 Camp Branch 43.25
M 13 |Gabion Stone 500 Camp Branch
N 14 |Fine Aggregates 500 Camp Branch
OCA 15 |Limestone Std Abr. 500 Camp Branch
OB 16 [Sandstone Std Abr, 500 Camp Branch
oC 17 |Steel Slag for SRIC 500 Camp Branch
PA 18  [Limestone Mod Abr. 500 Camp Branch
PB 19 [Sandstone Mod Abr, 500 Camp Branch
Q 20 |RipRap 500 Camp Branch
R 21 |Shot Rock 500 Camp Branch
S 22 |[AASHTO #8M 500 Camp Branch
w 26 |Quarry Waste 500 Camp Branch

WV Exhibit A Pricina Natl Guard 2022 2022
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Pricing Page Schedule VENDOR NAME Mountain Aggregates, Inc

ATTACHMENT A F.0.B. - Adjutant General's Office
STONE & AGGREGATE WITH DELIVERY TO ESTABLISHED LOCATIONS 2022
Estimated Location of Bid Price ($/Ton) F.0.B.
Contract Description Quantity DOH DOH Storage Site
ltem  Comm of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site
KANAWHA COUNTY
WV Air National Guard Base/Charleston LIMESTONE BLAST
1679 Coonskin Drive SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL
Charleston, WV 25311 GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
A 1 |Class1 500 WVANGB/Charleston
B 2 |[Class2 500 WVANGB/Charleston
D 4 |AASHTO #1 500 WVANGB/Charleston
G 7 |AASHTO #467 500 WVANGB/Charleston
H 8 |AASHTO#57 500 WVANGB/Charleston
K 11 |AASHTO #8 500 WVANGB/Charleston
L 12 |AASHTO #9 500 WVANGB/Charleston
M 13 |Gabion Stone 500 WVANGB/Charleston
N 14 |Fine Aggregates 500 WVANGB/Charleston
OA 15  |Limestone Std Abr. 500 WVANGB/Charleston
OB 16 [Sandstone Std Abr. 500 WVANGB/Charleston
0C 17 |Steel Slag for SRIC 500 WVANGB/Charleston
PA 18  [Limestone Mod Abr. 500 WVANGB/Charleston
PB 19 [Sandstone Mod Abr. 500 WVANGB/Charleston
Q 20 |RipRap 500 WVANGB/Charleston
R 21 [Shot Rock 500 WVANGB/Charleston
S 22 [AASHTO #8M 500 WVANGB/Charleston
w 26 |Quarry Waste 500 WVANGB/Charleston
LOGAN COUNTY
Logan Armory (Monaville) LIMESTONE BLAST
150 Armory Road SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL
Logan, WV 25601 GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
A Class 1 500] Logan Armory (Monaville) 31.25
B Class 2 500( Logan Armory (Monaville) 31.25
D AASHTO #1 500] Logan Armory (Monaville) 32.25
G AASHTO #467 500| Logan Armory (Monaville)
H AASHTO #57 500| Logan Armory (Monaville) 32.25
K AASHTO #8 500| Logan Armory (Monaville) 42.00
L AASHTO #9 500| Logan Armory (Monaville) 42.00
M Gabion Stone 500] Logan Armory (Monaville)
N Fine Aggregates 500| Logan Armory (Monaville)
OA Limestone Std Abr. 500| Logan Armory (Monaville)
0B Sandstone Std Abr. 500( Logan Armory (Monaville)
oc Steel Slag for SRIC 500| Logan Armory (Monaville)
PA Limestone Mod Abr. 500( Logan Armory (Monaville)
PB Sandstone Mod Abr. 500| Logan Armory (Monaville)
Q RipRap 500| Logan Armory (Monaville)
R Shot Rock 500| Logan Armory (Monaville)
S AASHTO #8M 500| Logan Armory (Monaville)
w Quarry Waste 500| Logan Armory (Monaville)
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ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM

SOLICITATION NO.: CRFO DOT2300000016

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[X] Addendum No. 1 [ 1 Addendum No.6
[ ] Addendum No.2 [ 1 Addendum No.7
[ 1 Addendum No. 3 [ ] Addendum No. 8
[ 1] Addendum No. 4 [ 1 Addendum No.9
[ 1 Addendum No. 5 [ ] Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. I
further understand that that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

MOUNTAIN AGGREGATES. INC
Comp

Anthorized Signature

8-16-2022
Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.



