



The following documentation is an electronically-submitted vendor response to an advertised solicitation from the *West Virginia Purchasing Bulletin* within the Vendor Self-Service portal at *wvOASIS.gov*. As part of the State of West Virginia's procurement process, and to maintain the transparency of the bid-opening process, this documentation submitted online is publicly posted by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at *WVPurchasing.gov* with any other vendor responses to this solicitation submitted to the Purchasing Division in hard copy format.

Header

List View

- General Information
- Contact
- Default Values
- Discount
- Document Information
- Clarification Request

Procurement Folder: 1021409

Procurement Type: Central Purchase Order

Vendor ID: 000000181078

Legal Name: BECKLEY CRANE & CONSTRUCTION INC

Alias/DBA:

Total Bid: \$0.00

Response Date: 06/22/2022

Response Time: 15:24

Responded By User ID: amaynard7263

First Name: Arnold

Last Name: Maynard

Email: amaynard@beckleycrane

Phone: 304-252-7263

SO Doc Code: CRFQ

SO Dept: 0506

SO Doc ID: BPH2200000003

Published Date: 7/7/22

Close Date: 7/12/22

Close Time: 13:30

Status: Closed

Solicitation Description: COMMAND TRAILER FOR CENTER FOR THREAT

Total of Header Attachments: 0

Total of All Attachments: 0



Department of Administration
 Purchasing Division
 2019 Washington Street East
 Post Office Box 50130
 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

**State of West Virginia
 Solicitation Response**

Proc Folder: 1021409
Solicitation Description: COMMAND TRAILER FOR CENTER FOR THREAT PREPAREDNESS
Proc Type: Central Purchase Order

Solicitation Closes	Solicitation Response	Version
2022-07-12 13:30	SR 0506 ESR06222200000008009	1

VENDOR
 000000181078
 BECKLEY CRANE & CONSTRUCTION INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0506 BPH2200000003
Total Bid: 0
Response Date: 2022-06-22
Response Time: 15:24:03
Comments:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Crystal G Husted
 (304) 558-2402
 crystal.g.husted@wv.gov

Vendor Signature X **FEIN#** **DATE**

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1	Tandem (spread) axle enclosed trailer	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.1 One (1) 8.5 foot by 24-foot tandem (spread) axle enclosed trailer

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2	Tubular frame	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.2 Tubular frame

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3	7.5-foot interior clearance	0.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.3 7.5-foot interior clearance

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4	7000-pound torsion axles (move back 4-inches, 22 degree	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
26111512			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.4 7000-pound torsion axles (move back 4-inches, 22 degrees)

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5	Exterior poly-core .080 aluminum siding, screwless, white	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
30151800			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.5 Exterior poly-core .080 aluminum siding, screwless, white

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6	Black-out package that includes ATP and all exterior trim	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.6 Black-out package that includes ATP and all exterior trim

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7	8 lug spider mag wheels each with E-rated 10 ply 235/80/16	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25172500			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.7 8 lug spider mag wheels each with E-rated 10 ply 235/80/16 radial tires

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8	Two (2), two-way sidewall vents (aluminum)	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.8 Two (2), two-way sidewall vents (aluminum)

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9	Insulated walls and ceiling	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.9 Insulated walls and ceiling

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10	Embossed white ceiling and walls (interior)	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.10 Embossed white ceiling and walls (interior)

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11	No-show, heavy-duty beavertail ramp	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.11 No-show, heavy-duty beavertail ramp

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12	Heavy duty transition flap	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.12 Heavy duty transition flap

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13	Passenger side entry door with 15 by 30-inch window	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.13 Passenger side entry door with 15 by 30-inch window

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14	Four (4) floor "D" rings at the rear	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.14 Four (4) floor "D" rings at the rear

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15	One (1) exterior GFI outlet with cover box	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.15 One (1) exterior GFI outlet with cover box

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16	Rubber coin plate on floor, ramp and flap	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.16 Rubber coin plate on floor, ramp and flap

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17	Separating wall the width of the unit with a latching pocket	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.17 One (1) separating wall the width of the unit with a latching pocket door (10 feet from the front of the unit)

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18	Wall mounted folding (murphy style) locking beds	2.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.18 Two (2) wall mounted folding (murphy style) locking beds on each side of the rear compartment

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19	50 Amp motor base plug	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.19 50 Amp motor base plug

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20	50 Amp panel box	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.20 50 Amp panel box

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21	25-foot lifeline	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.21 25-foot lifeline

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22	Four (4), 12-volt ceiling lights	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.22 Four (4), 12-volt ceiling lights

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23	MC cable	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.23 MC cable

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24	24 group battery with solar panel	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.24 24 group battery with solar panel

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25	Four (4), 12-volt exterior flood lights	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.25 Four (4), 12-volt exterior flood lights

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26	Eight (8) interior 110-volt outlets	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.26 Eight (8) interior 110-volt outlets

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27	15,000 BTU Air Conditioner with heat	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.27 15,000 BTU Air Conditioner with heat (centered to serve both compartments)

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28	One (1) 39-inch TV front compartment (center mount)	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.28 One (1) 39-inch TV front compartment (center mount)

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29	One (1) 42-inch TV rear compartment (drivers side mount)	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.29 One (1) 42-inch TV rear compartment (drivers side mount)

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30	Base cabinets	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
30161801			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.30 Base cabinets (drawer over door), L shaped along the front and drivers' side in the front compartment width plus 5 feet to the rear (countertop in middle for desk)

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31	Upper cabinets to match (4.1.28) with center cutaway for TV	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.31 Upper cabinets to match (4.1.28) with center cutaway for TV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32	6-foot closet in the rear compartment (passenger side)	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.32 One (1) 6-foot closet in the rear compartment (passenger side)

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33	Installed microwave oven	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
52141502			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.33 One (1) installed microwave oven

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34	Electric tongue jack with battery	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.34 One (1) electric tongue jack with battery

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
35	Radio with 4 speakers covering 2 zones	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25101939			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.35 One (1) radio with 4 speakers covering 2 zones (stream music, USB and CD)

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36	Generator	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
26111600			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.36 One (1) generator, mounted, at least 9,500 watts, super quiet inverter with Carbon Monoxide secure technology

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37	Shipping and Delivery Fee	1.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

4.1.37 Delivery of completed item to: WVDHHR Materials Management, 160 Jacobson Drive, Dock 11, Poca, WV 25159