
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1052010

Solicitation Description: ADDENDUM NO. 1 - EBAr70398r4 MULTI-SITE MAINTENANCE

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2022-07-07 13:30 SR 0439 ESR07072200000000107 1

VENDOR

VC0000007724
AGSTEN CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0439 EBA2200000006

Total Bid: 529812.75 Response Date: 2022-07-07 Response Time: 12:15:50

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Toby L Welch
(304) 558-8802
toby.l.welch@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 NORTHERN DISTRICT-MAINTENANCE & 

REPAIRS
    

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72121103    

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:
Multi-site building Maintenance and Repair Services:
Vendor must complete Exhibit A Pricing page in its entirety and submit it with their bid. Vendors must complete pricing pages for the district they 
are bidding on. Vendors do not have to bid on all three districts. Please see Section 5.2 of the RFQ Specifications for more information.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 CENTRAL DISTRICT-MAINTENANCE & 

REPAIRS
   327640.75

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72121103    

Commodity Line Comments: see attachment for pricing breakout

Extended Description:
Multi-site building Maintenance and Repair Services:
Vendor must complete Exhibit A Pricing page in its entirety and submit it with their bid. Vendors must complete pricing pages for the district they 
are bidding on. Vendors do not have to bid on all three districts. Please see Section 5.2 of the RFQ Specifications for more information.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 SOUTHERN DISTRICT-MAINTENANCE & 

REPAIRS
   202172.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72121103    

Commodity Line Comments: See attachment for pricing breakout

Extended Description:
Multi-site building Maintenance and Repair Services:
Vendor must complete Exhibit A Pricing page in its entirety and submit it with their bid. Vendors must complete pricing pages for the district they 
are bidding on. Vendors do not have to bid on all three districts. Please see Section 5.2 of the RFQ Specifications for more information.































Round trip travel time from Vendor's 

office to Agency's District office.  
0.00

no bid for this site

4.20

Building / Shelter Maintenance or 

Repair
HOURLY RATE X

ESTIMATED YEARLY 

QUANTITY
= YEARLY COST

STANDARD RATE -$                  
X

800
= -$                           

OVERTIME RATE -$                  
X

50
= -$                           

EMERGENCY RATE -$                  
X

30
= -$                           

TRAVEL RATE Hourly Rate
X

Avg. Vendor's office to tower 

round trip
X

Est. Annual 

trips X

Number of 

Travelers

Estimated round trip cost for two employees to 

travel from Vendor's office to Agency's office -$                  X 4.20 X 70 X 2
= -$                           

=  $                             -   

ESTIMATED YEARLY SUBCONTRACTOR 

COST
X MULTIPLIER = YEARLY COST

$20,000.00 X 0.00 = -$                           

ESTIMATED YEARLY PARTS COST X MULTIPLIER = YEARLY COST

$150,000.00 X 0.00 = -$                           

Subcontracted Tasks per section 3.1.3

Equipment Rental per section 3.1.5

TOTAL SUBCONTRACTOR YEARLY COST

Parts / Materials per section 3.1.4

TOTAL PARTS / MATERIALS YEARLY COST

EBAr70398r4, EXHIBIT A - PRICING PAGES - NORTHERN DISTRICT

Building / Shelter Maintenance or Repair per section 3.1.2

District office, Morgantown: 191 Scott Ave, Morgantown, WV 26508

Don't skip this!!

 TOTAL BUILDING YEARLY COST 

Average round trip travel time from Agency office to tower sites



ESTIMATED YEARLY EQUIPMENT 

RENTAL COST
X MULTIPLIER AT COST YEARLY COST

$10,000.00 X 0.00 = -$                           

NO BID FOR THIS SITE
-$                     TOTAL BID COST**

**TOTAL BID COST IS CALCULATED BY ADDING THE TOTAL YEARLY COST FOR EACH SECTION

* REQUIRED FIELDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED IN LIGHT ORANGE.

TOTAL EQUIPMENT YEARLY COST

NO BID FOR THIS SITE



Round trip travel time from Vendor's 

office to Agency's District office.  
0.80

3.75

Building / Shelter Maintenance or 

Repair
HOURLY RATE X

ESTIMATED YEARLY 

QUANTITY
= YEARLY COST

STANDARD RATE 83.75$             
X

800
= 67,000.00$               

OVERTIME RATE 120.90$           
X

50
= 6,045.00$                 

EMERGENCY RATE 120.90$           
X

30
= 3,627.00$                 

TRAVEL RATE Hourly Rate
X

Avg. Vendor's office to tower 

round trip
X

Est. Annual 

trips X

Number of 

Travelers

Estimated round trip cost for two employees to 

travel from Vendor's office to Agency's office 83.75$             X 3.75 X 70 X 2
= 43,968.75$               

=  $            120,640.75 

ESTIMATED YEARLY SUBCONTRACTOR 

COST
X MULTIPLIER = YEARLY COST

$20,000.00 X 1.15 = 23,000.00$               

ESTIMATED YEARLY PARTS COST X MULTIPLIER = YEARLY COST

$150,000.00 X 1.15 = 172,500.00$             

 TOTAL BUILDING YEARLY COST 

EBAr70398r4, EXHIBIT A - PRICING PAGES - CENTRAL DISTRICT

District office, Charleston: 600 Capitol St, Charleston, WV 25301

Don't skip this!!

Average round trip travel time from Agency office to tower sites

Building / Shelter Maintenance or Repair per section 3.1.2

Subcontracted Tasks per section 3.1.3

TOTAL SUBCONTRACTOR YEARLY COST

Parts / Materials per section 3.1.4

TOTAL PARTS / MATERIALS YEARLY COST

Equipment Rental per section 3.1.5



ESTIMATED YEARLY EQUIPMENT 

RENTAL COST
X MULTIPLIER AT COST YEARLY COST

$10,000.00 X 1.15 = 11,500.00$               

327,640.75$       TOTAL BID COST**

* REQUIRED FIELDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED IN LIGHT ORANGE.

**TOTAL BID COST IS CALCULATED BY ADDING THE TOTAL YEARLY COST FOR EACH SECTION

TOTAL EQUIPMENT YEARLY COST



Round trip travel time from Vendor's 

office to Agency's District office.  
3.00

4.00

Building / Shelter Maintenance or 

Repair
HOURLY RATE X

ESTIMATED YEARLY 

QUANTITY
= YEARLY COST

STANDARD RATE 83.75$             
X

800
= 67,000.00$               

OVERTIME RATE 120.90$           
X

50
= 6,045.00$                 

EMERGENCY RATE 120.90$           
X

30
= 3,627.00$                 

TRAVEL RATE Hourly Rate
X

Avg. Vendor's office to tower 

round trip
X

Est. Annual 

trips X

Number of 

Travelers

Estimated round trip cost for two employees to 

travel from Vendor's office to Agency's office 83.75$             X 4.00 X 50 X 2
= 33,500.00$               

=  $            110,172.00 

ESTIMATED YEARLY SUBCONTRACTOR 

COST
X MULTIPLIER = YEARLY COST

$20,000.00 X 1.15 = 23,000.00$               

ESTIMATED YEARLY PARTS COST X MULTIPLIER = YEARLY COST

$50,000.00 X 1.15 = 57,500.00$               

 TOTAL BUILDING YEARLY COST 

EBAr70398r4, EXHIBIT A - PRICING PAGES - SOUTHERN DISTRICT

District office, Beckley: 124 Industrial Park Rd, Beaver, WV 25813

Don't skip this!!

Average round trip travel time from Agency office to tower sites

Building / Shelter Maintenance or Repair per section 3.1.2

Subcontracted Tasks per section 3.1.3

TOTAL SUBCONTRACTOR YEARLY COST

Parts / Materials per section 3.1.4

TOTAL PARTS / MATERIALS YEARLY COST

Equipment Rental per section 3.1.5



ESTIMATED YEARLY EQUIPMENT 

RENTAL COST
X MULTIPLIER AT COST YEARLY COST

$10,000.00 X 1.15 = 11,500.00$               

202,172.00$       TOTAL BID COST**

* REQUIRED FIELDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED IN LIGHT ORANGE.

**TOTAL BID COST IS CALCULATED BY ADDING THE TOTAL YEARLY COST FOR EACH SECTION

TOTAL EQUIPMENT YEARLY COST


