
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
 





Date Printed: Dec 13, 2022 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1135670

Solicitation Description: Addendum #3 Statewide Contract for Computer Equipment

Proc Type: Statewide MA (Open End)

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2022-12-13 13:30 SR 0212 ESR12122200000002790 1

VENDOR

000000229286
TROXELL COMMUNICATIONS INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0212 SWC2300000010

Total Bid: 96000 Response Date: 2022-12-12 Response Time: 18:41:25

Comments: Bluum is offering our Shield ADP 4-year warranty as a competitive offer. We would be pleased to review the details 
with WV.

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Jessica L Hovanec
304-558-2314
jessica.l.hovanec@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Standard PC 3500.00000EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
3.1.2 Standard PC

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Power PC 3100.00000EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid.

Extended Description:
3.1.3 Power PC

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Fixed Workstation 250.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid.

Extended Description:
3.1.4 Fixed Workstation

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Standard Laptop 2500.00000EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid.

Extended Description:
3.1.5 Standard Laptop

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Power Laptop 9000.00000EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid.

Extended Description:
3.1.6 Power Laptop
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Tablet PC 2200.00000EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid.

Extended Description:
3.1.7 Tablet PC

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Mobile Workstation 500.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid.

Extended Description:
3.1.8 Mobile Workstation

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 20" Monitor 1500.00000EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid.

Extended Description:
3.1.9.1.1 20" Monitor

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 24" Monitor 10000.00000EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid.

Extended Description:
3.1.9.1.2 24" Monitor

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 27" Monitor 1900.00000EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid.

Extended Description:
3.1.9.1.3 27" Monitor
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 Digital Signature Pad 100.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid.

Extended Description:
3.1.9.2 Digital Signature Pad

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 Docking Station for Standard Laptop 2500.00000EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid.

Extended Description:
3.1.9.3 Docking Station for Standard Laptop

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 Docking Station for Power Laptop 9000.00000EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid.

Extended Description:
3.1.9.4 Docking Station for Power Laptop

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 Docking Station for Tablet 2200.00000EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid.

Extended Description:
3.1.9.5 Docking Station for Tablet

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 Docking Station for Mobile Workstation 500.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid.

Extended Description:
3.1.9.6 Docking Station for Mobile Workstation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 SSD SATA 1TB 2.5" 600.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid.

Extended Description:
3.1.9.7 SSD SATA 1TB 2.5"

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 SSD M.2 1TB NVME 2280 100.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid.

Extended Description:
3.1.9.8 SSD M.2 1TB NVME 2.5"

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 USB DVD/RW Drive 500.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid.

Extended Description:
3.1.9.9 Optional USB DVD/RW Drive

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 USB Smart Card Reader 100.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid.

Extended Description:
3.1.9.10 USB Smart Card Reader

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 Four-Year Accidental Damage Coverage 500.00000 EA 192.000000 96000.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43210000    

Commodity Line Comments: Bluum is offering our Sheild 4 year ADP Warranty for the bid.

Extended Description:
3.1.9.11 Four-Year Accidental Damage Coverage
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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Centralized Request for Quote

Info Technology

Proc Folder: 1135670 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: Addendum #3 Statewide Contract for Computer Equipment Addendum #3 to attach additional 

vendor questions and answers.

Proc Type: Statewide MA (Open End)

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version

2022-12-08 2022-12-13     13:30 CRFQ     0212     SWC2300000010 4

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

BID CLERK
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON ST E

CHARLESTON          WV     25305

US

VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code:

Vendor Name :

Address :

Street :

City :

State : Country : Zip :

Principal Contact :

Vendor Contact Phone: Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Jessica L Hovanec
304-558-2314
jessica.l.hovanec@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Bluum USA, Inc.

4675 E Cotton Ctr Blvd, Ste 155

Phoenix

Arizona              US                                                85040

Jennifer Nock, Account Executive

888-226-5727       3859

86-0716114                                              12-12-22
Melissa Curtis, VP Sales Operations

           Melissa Curtis
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ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
Addendum #3 to attach additional vendor questions and answers. 

Addendum #2 to answer an additional vendor question and answer. 

Addendum #1 to publish Vendor questions and answers and to move the bid opening date to 12/13/2022 at 1:30 PM ET. 

The West Virginia Purchasing Division is soliciting bids on behalf of the West Virginia Office of Technology (WVOT) to establish an 
open-end statewide contract for the purchase of Windows-based computers and peripherals per the Specifications and Terms and 
Conditions as attached hereto.

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 Standard PC 3500.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.2 Standard PC

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 Power PC 3100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.3 Power PC
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
3 Fixed Workstation 250.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.4 Fixed Workstation

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
4 Standard Laptop 2500.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.5 Standard Laptop
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
5 Power Laptop 9000.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.6 Power Laptop

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
6 Tablet PC 2200.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.7 Tablet PC
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
7 Mobile Workstation 500.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.8 Mobile Workstation

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
8 20" Monitor 1500.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.9.1.1 20" Monitor
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
9 24" Monitor 10000.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.9.1.2 24" Monitor

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
10 27" Monitor 1900.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.9.1.3 27" Monitor
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
11 Digital Signature Pad 100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.9.2 Digital Signature Pad

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
12 Docking Station for Standard Laptop 2500.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.9.3 Docking Station for Standard Laptop
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
13 Docking Station for Power Laptop 9000.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.9.4 Docking Station for Power Laptop

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
14 Docking Station for Tablet 2200.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.9.5 Docking Station for Tablet
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
15 Docking Station for Mobile Workstation 500.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.9.6 Docking Station for Mobile Workstation

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
16 SSD SATA 1TB 2.5" 600.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.9.7 SSD SATA 1TB 2.5"
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
17 SSD M.2 1TB NVME 2280 100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.9.8 SSD M.2 1TB NVME 2.5"

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
18 USB DVD/RW Drive 500.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.9.9 Optional USB DVD/RW Drive
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
19 USB Smart Card Reader 100.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.9.10 USB Smart Card Reader

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS 
INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
20 Four-Year Accidental Damage Coverage 500.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

43210000    

Extended Description:
3.1.9.11 Four-Year Accidental Damage Coverage

SCHEDULE OF EVENTS
Line Event Event Date
1 Technical Questions due by November 21, 2022 at 

10:00 AM ET
2022-11-21

$192.00               $96,000.00

Bluum    Shield ADP 4 Year                      483804
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SWC2300000010 Final Addendum #3 Statewide Contract 
for Computer Equipment



















































































































































 
SOLICITATION NUMBER: CRFQ SWC2300000010 

Addendum Number: 3 
The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as CRFQ SWC2300000010 
(“Solicitation”) to reflect the change(s) identified and described below. 
 
Applicable Addendum Category: 
 

[  ] Modify bid opening date and time  
 
[  ] Modify specifications of product or service being sought 
 
[ X  ] Attachment of vendor questions and responses 
 
[ ] Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet  
 
[  ] Correction of error 
 
[ ]  Other 

 
 
Description of Modification to Solicitation:   

 
1) To Answer additional Vendor Questions and Answers 
 

 
Additional Documentation:  Documentation related to this Addendum (if any) has been included herewith as 
Attachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference. 
 
 
Terms and Conditions: 
 

1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in full force and 
effect. 
 

2. Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by completing an 
Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith.  Failure to acknowledge addenda 
may result in bid disqualification.  The addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to 
expedite document processing. 

  



 
 

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM 
SOLICITATION NO.: CRFQ SWC2300000010               

 
 
Instructions:  Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this 
addendum acknowledgment form.  Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.  
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.   
 
 
Acknowledgment:  I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the 
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc. 

 
 
 
Addendum Numbers Received:  
(Check the box next to each addendum received)   

 
[  X  ]  Addendum No. 1  [     ]  Addendum No. 6 
 
[  X  ] Addendum No. 2  [     ] Addendum No. 7 

 
[  X  ] Addendum No. 3  [     ] Addendum No. 8 
 
[    ]  Addendum No. 4  [     ]  Addendum No. 9 
 
[    ] Addendum No. 5  [     ] Addendum No. 10 
 

 
I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid.  I 
further understand that that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral 
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding.  Only the 
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding. 
 
        

____________________________________________ 
         Company 

 
____________________________________________ 

                               Authorized Signature 
 
      ____________________________________________ 
         Date 
 

NOTE:  This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing. 
 
 

Bluum USA, Inc.

12-12-22

Melissa Curtis, VP Sales Operations           Melissa Curtis



SWC2300000010 Addendum #3 
Vendor Questions and Answers 

 
Q48) Section 5.2 Payment, indicates that OEMs shall accept payment in accordance with the payment 
procedures of the State of West Virginia. Will the State agree to payments terms of net 30 days? 
A48) The State strives for Net 30 days after acceptance of goods. 
 
Q49) On the wvOASIS portal, under the Respond To Lines tab, when you click on the “Additional Specs” 
button a pop-up window for Alternate Product Specifications and Alternate Shipping Specifications sections. 
Are Vendors only required to complete the Alternate Products Specifications and Shipping sections when 
Alternative Products are being proposed? 
A49) Correct 
 
Q50) If (a) relates to additional specs for the non-alternate proposed product, where do we enter information 
regarding alternate products?  
A50) In Vendor's response. 
 
Q51) Is it necessary to complete Additional Specs if Vendors are including datasheets? 
A51) No 
 
Q52) Can Vendors propose more than one (1) alternate product? 
A52) No. Vendor must bid the product it will supply. 
 
Q53) For the Fixed Workstation, would the State accept Qty (4) M.2 NVME 512 SSDs vs. Qty (4) 2.5" SSDs? 
A53) Yes 
 
Q54) And if yes, would the State consider changing the requirement to Qty (3) available PCIe slots instead of 
the original Qty (4) available slots requested (to allow room for the additional NVME drives)? 
A54) Yes 
 
Q55) For the Mobile Workstation, would the State consider a 15.6" screen instead of 16" minimum screen? 
A55) No 
 
 
 

 



With the recent implementation of remote and hybrid 
learning environments, thousands of devices are now in 
transit between schools and student homes.  This is driving 
an increase in accidental damage to devices. Combine that 
with a national laptop shortage and Technology departments 
are suddenly under an immense amount of pressure to keep 
working devices in circulation. What they need is a SHIELD.

The SHIELDSM Protection Program offers one of the best 
coverage plans in the industry. SHIELD acts as an extension 
of the original manufacturer (OEM) warranty and includes 
accidental damage protection. Bluum coordinates all repair 
services on behalf of the purchaser for devices covered under 
the original OEM warranty. This provides convenience and 
peace of mind for tech and IT teams who are already busy 
with multiple demands for their time.

Set up and deployment provided  
by Bluum 

Repairs done in 10 days plus 
shipping time*

Free shipping to and from 
school location

Single and multi-device 
packaging included

24/7 access to SHIELD 
Customer Service Portal 

Zero cost of ownership guarantee 
(no deductibles or fees)

PROGRAM FEATURES 
& BENEFITS

* Repair time subject to parts availability.

Enhanced Protection for
Laptops and Chromebooks

SHIELD  Protection 
Program Plans

SM

bluum.com

https://www.bluum.com


SINGLE AND MULTIPLE YEAR PROTECTION 
FOR COMPUTING DEVICES

Feature
SHIELD 

Extended
SHIELD 

with ADP
SHIELD 

with ADP Plus

*  	 Limited to 1 claim per serial number
v	 Cases included for Chromebooks only

SHIELD COVERS COMPUTING DEVICES FROM MULTIPLE MANUFACTURERS:

Trust Bluum for every aspect of your mobile device management—from purchase and 
deployment through repair, management, and end of life services.

Need more info?  Contact sales@bluum.com

SHIELD with 
ADP Premium

Extension of 
OEM warranty

Unlimited component 
failure repairs

Coverage from 
1 to 4 years

Tiered Pricing 

Shipping included 

Single and multi-device 
packaging

24/7 customer 
service available

Replacement, if not 
repairable

Unlimited accidental 
damage repair

Clip-on, 
always On case

Battery & power 
replacement program

Loss & Theft 
Coverage

* *

See Terms & Conditions for more information

v

mailto:sales%40trox.com?subject=SHIELD%20Inquiry
https://www.bluum.com
https://www.bluum.com/sales
https://www.bluum.com/demo
https://www.bluum.com

