
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
 



 



Date Printed: Nov 30, 2021 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 937308

Solicitation Description: ADDENDUM NO_1  Asphalt Materials, Pick Up by Agency

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2021-11-30 13:30 SR 0803 ESR11302100000003406 1

VENDOR

000000203089
WEST VIRGINIA PAVING INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2200000084

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2021-11-30 Response Time: 11:47:46

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep
304-558-2566
john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation



Date Printed: Nov 30, 2021 Page: 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Asphalt 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30121601    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:

Asphalt























































Vendor Name:

Asphalt Plant Name: 

Asphalt Plant Location:

(911 Address)

x

x

x

Unit of 

Measure
List Price

TON 62.50

TON No Bid

TON 71.00

TON 71.00

TON 73.00

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 78.75

TON No Bid

TON 78.75

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 78.75

TON 4.00

TON 12.00

DAY 3500.00

DAY 1000.00T2 Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day

West Virginia Paving, Inc.

Gallipolis, OH

Rt. 7 North

Gallipolis, Ohio  45631

Gallipolis Plant

S1 Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22

S2 Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments

T1 Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day

P Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave

Q Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave

R Asphalt Plant Run 

M Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave

N Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III

O Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III

J Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1

K Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1

L Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave

G Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave

H Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course

I Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave

D Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level

E Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV

F Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV

A Asphalt Section 401 - Base I

B Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave

C Asphalt Section 401 - Base II

District 8:  Pendleton, Pocahontas, Randolph and Tucker counties

District 9:  Fayette, Greenbrier, Monroe, Nicholas and Summers counties

District 10:  McDowell, Mercer, Raleigh and Wyoming counties

PART III:  ENTER PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE FOR CONTRACT ITEMS BID.

Contract 

Item # Contract Item Description

District 7:  Barbour, Braxton, Gilmer, Lewis, Upshur and Webster counties

District 1:  Boone, Clay, Kanawha, Mason and Putnam counties

Asphalt Materials Pick Up by Agency

ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: 

Vendor shall complete Parts I, II and III below in their entirety.  Failure to provide the Asphalt Plant Name 

and Asphalt Plant Location will result in the disqualification of corresponding Contract Items.  Vendor must 

complete a seperate Pricing Page (ATT A) for EVERY sourced Asphalt Plant providing Contract Items for 

pick up by WVDOH forces.  

PART I:  VENDOR & ASPHALT PLANT INFORMATION (Required)

District 2:  Cabell, Lincoln, Logan, Mingo and Wayne counties

District 3:  Calhoun, Jackson, Pleasants, Ritchie, Roane, Wirt and Wood counties

District 4:  Doddridge, Harrison, Marion, Monongalia, Preston and Taylor counties

District 5:  Berkeley, Grant, Hampshire, Hardy, Jefferson, Mineral and Morgan 

countiesDistrict 6:  Brooke, Hancock, Marshall, Ohio, Tyler and Wetzel counties

PART II:  WVDOH DISTRICTS SERVED BY ABOVE ASPHALT PLANT (Required).  Mark all Districts which include one or more counties 

served by the Asphalt Plant listed above in Part I.   

ATT A - Pick Up 2022  6622C011



Vendor Name:

Asphalt Plant Name: 

Asphalt Plant Location:

(911 Address)

x

Unit of 

Measure
List Price

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 68.00

TON 68.00

TON 70.00

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 74.00

TON No Bid

TON 74.00

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 74.00

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

DAY 3500.00

DAY 1000.00T2 Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day

West Virginia Paving, Inc.

Ashland Ky

300 Greenup Ave. 

Ashland, KY  41101

Ashland Plant

S1 Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22

S2 Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments

T1 Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day

P Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave

Q Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave

R Asphalt Plant Run 

M Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave

N Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III

O Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III

J Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1

K Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1

L Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave

G Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave

H Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course

I Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave

D Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level

E Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV

F Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV

A Asphalt Section 401 - Base I

B Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave

C Asphalt Section 401 - Base II

District 8:  Pendleton, Pocahontas, Randolph and Tucker counties

District 9:  Fayette, Greenbrier, Monroe, Nicholas and Summers counties

District 10:  McDowell, Mercer, Raleigh and Wyoming counties

PART III:  ENTER PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE FOR CONTRACT ITEMS BID.

Contract 

Item # Contract Item Description

District 7:  Barbour, Braxton, Gilmer, Lewis, Upshur and Webster counties

District 1:  Boone, Clay, Kanawha, Mason and Putnam counties

Asphalt Materials Pick Up by Agency

ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: 

Vendor shall complete Parts I, II and III below in their entirety.  Failure to provide the Asphalt Plant Name 

and Asphalt Plant Location will result in the disqualification of corresponding Contract Items.  Vendor must 

complete a seperate Pricing Page (ATT A) for EVERY sourced Asphalt Plant providing Contract Items for 

pick up by WVDOH forces.  

PART I:  VENDOR & ASPHALT PLANT INFORMATION (Required)

District 2:  Cabell, Lincoln, Logan, Mingo and Wayne counties

District 3:  Calhoun, Jackson, Pleasants, Ritchie, Roane, Wirt and Wood counties

District 4:  Doddridge, Harrison, Marion, Monongalia, Preston and Taylor counties

District 5:  Berkeley, Grant, Hampshire, Hardy, Jefferson, Mineral and Morgan 

countiesDistrict 6:  Brooke, Hancock, Marshall, Ohio, Tyler and Wetzel counties

PART II:  WVDOH DISTRICTS SERVED BY ABOVE ASPHALT PLANT (Required).  Mark all Districts which include one or more counties 

served by the Asphalt Plant listed above in Part I.   

ATT A - Pick Up 2022  6622C011



Vendor Name:

Asphalt Plant Name: 

Asphalt Plant Location:

(911 Address)

x

x

x

Unit of 

Measure
List Price

TON 61.00

TON 66.50

TON 66.00

TON 66.00

TON 68.00

TON No Bid

TON 70.00

TON 74.00

TON 84.00

TON 74.00

TON 83.00

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 95.00

TON No Bid

TON 83.00

TON 83.00

TON 74.00

TON 4.00

TON 12.00

DAY 3500.00

DAY 1000.00T2 Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day

West Virginia Paving, Inc.

Dunbar, WV

2902 Charles Ave.

Dunbar, WV  25064

Dunbar Plant

S1 Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22

S2 Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments

T1 Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day

P Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave

Q Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave

R Asphalt Plant Run 

M Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave

N Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III

O Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III

J Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1

K Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1

L Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave

G Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave

H Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course

I Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave

D Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level

E Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV

F Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV

A Asphalt Section 401 - Base I

B Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave

C Asphalt Section 401 - Base II

District 8:  Pendleton, Pocahontas, Randolph and Tucker counties

District 9:  Fayette, Greenbrier, Monroe, Nicholas and Summers counties

District 10:  McDowell, Mercer, Raleigh and Wyoming counties

PART III:  ENTER PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE FOR CONTRACT ITEMS BID.

Contract 

Item # Contract Item Description

District 7:  Barbour, Braxton, Gilmer, Lewis, Upshur and Webster counties

District 1:  Boone, Clay, Kanawha, Mason and Putnam counties

Asphalt Materials Pick Up by Agency

ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: 

Vendor shall complete Parts I, II and III below in their entirety.  Failure to provide the Asphalt Plant Name 

and Asphalt Plant Location will result in the disqualification of corresponding Contract Items.  Vendor must 

complete a seperate Pricing Page (ATT A) for EVERY sourced Asphalt Plant providing Contract Items for 

pick up by WVDOH forces.  

PART I:  VENDOR & ASPHALT PLANT INFORMATION (Required)

District 2:  Cabell, Lincoln, Logan, Mingo and Wayne counties

District 3:  Calhoun, Jackson, Pleasants, Ritchie, Roane, Wirt and Wood counties

District 4:  Doddridge, Harrison, Marion, Monongalia, Preston and Taylor counties

District 5:  Berkeley, Grant, Hampshire, Hardy, Jefferson, Mineral and Morgan 

countiesDistrict 6:  Brooke, Hancock, Marshall, Ohio, Tyler and Wetzel counties

PART II:  WVDOH DISTRICTS SERVED BY ABOVE ASPHALT PLANT (Required).  Mark all Districts which include one or more counties 

served by the Asphalt Plant listed above in Part I.   

ATT A - Pick Up 2022  6622C011



Vendor Name:

Asphalt Plant Name: 

Asphalt Plant Location:

(911 Address)

x

x

Unit of 

Measure
List Price

TON 69.75

TON 73.50

TON 74.00

TON 74.00

TON 76.00

TON No Bid

TON 76.00

TON 78.00

TON 81.00

TON 78.00

TON 81.00

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 90.00

TON No Bid

TON 79.00

TON 79.00

TON 78.00

TON 4.00

TON 12.00

DAY 3500.00

DAY 1000.00T2 Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day

West Virginia Paving, Inc. 

Beaver, WV

195 Southern Industrial Drive

Beaver, WV  25813

Beaver Plant

S1 Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22

S2 Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments

T1 Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day

P Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave

Q Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave

R Asphalt Plant Run 

M Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave

N Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III

O Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III

J Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1

K Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1

L Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave

G Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave

H Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course

I Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave

D Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level

E Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV

F Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV

A Asphalt Section 401 - Base I

B Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave

C Asphalt Section 401 - Base II

District 8:  Pendleton, Pocahontas, Randolph and Tucker counties

District 9:  Fayette, Greenbrier, Monroe, Nicholas and Summers counties

District 10:  McDowell, Mercer, Raleigh and Wyoming counties

PART III:  ENTER PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE FOR CONTRACT ITEMS BID.

Contract 

Item # Contract Item Description

District 7:  Barbour, Braxton, Gilmer, Lewis, Upshur and Webster counties

District 1:  Boone, Clay, Kanawha, Mason and Putnam counties

Asphalt Materials Pick Up by Agency

ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: 

Vendor shall complete Parts I, II and III below in their entirety.  Failure to provide the Asphalt Plant Name 

and Asphalt Plant Location will result in the disqualification of corresponding Contract Items.  Vendor must 

complete a seperate Pricing Page (ATT A) for EVERY sourced Asphalt Plant providing Contract Items for 

pick up by WVDOH forces.  

PART I:  VENDOR & ASPHALT PLANT INFORMATION (Required)

District 2:  Cabell, Lincoln, Logan, Mingo and Wayne counties

District 3:  Calhoun, Jackson, Pleasants, Ritchie, Roane, Wirt and Wood counties

District 4:  Doddridge, Harrison, Marion, Monongalia, Preston and Taylor counties

District 5:  Berkeley, Grant, Hampshire, Hardy, Jefferson, Mineral and Morgan 

countiesDistrict 6:  Brooke, Hancock, Marshall, Ohio, Tyler and Wetzel counties

PART II:  WVDOH DISTRICTS SERVED BY ABOVE ASPHALT PLANT (Required).  Mark all Districts which include one or more counties 

served by the Asphalt Plant listed above in Part I.   

ATT A - Pick Up 2022  6622C011



Vendor Name:

Asphalt Plant Name: 

Asphalt Plant Location:

(911 Address)

x

x

Unit of 

Measure
List Price

TON 68.00

TON 68.00

TON 68.00

TON 68.00

TON 70.00

TON 76.00

TON 71.00

TON 74.00

TON 80.00

TON 74.00

TON 78.00

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 80.00

TON 80.00

TON 74.00

TON 4.00

TON 12.00

DAY 3500.00

DAY 1000.00T2 Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day

West Virginia Paving, Inc.

Huntington WV

40222 Ohio River Road

Huntington, WV  25702

Huntington Plant

S1 Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22

S2 Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments

T1 Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day

P Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave

Q Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave

R Asphalt Plant Run 

M Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave

N Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III

O Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III

J Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1

K Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1

L Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave

G Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave

H Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course

I Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave

D Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level

E Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV

F Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV

A Asphalt Section 401 - Base I

B Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave

C Asphalt Section 401 - Base II

District 8:  Pendleton, Pocahontas, Randolph and Tucker counties

District 9:  Fayette, Greenbrier, Monroe, Nicholas and Summers counties

District 10:  McDowell, Mercer, Raleigh and Wyoming counties

PART III:  ENTER PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE FOR CONTRACT ITEMS BID.

Contract 

Item # Contract Item Description

District 7:  Barbour, Braxton, Gilmer, Lewis, Upshur and Webster counties

District 1:  Boone, Clay, Kanawha, Mason and Putnam counties

Asphalt Materials Pick Up by Agency

ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: 

Vendor shall complete Parts I, II and III below in their entirety.  Failure to provide the Asphalt Plant Name 

and Asphalt Plant Location will result in the disqualification of corresponding Contract Items.  Vendor must 

complete a seperate Pricing Page (ATT A) for EVERY sourced Asphalt Plant providing Contract Items for 

pick up by WVDOH forces.  

PART I:  VENDOR & ASPHALT PLANT INFORMATION (Required)

District 2:  Cabell, Lincoln, Logan, Mingo and Wayne counties

District 3:  Calhoun, Jackson, Pleasants, Ritchie, Roane, Wirt and Wood counties

District 4:  Doddridge, Harrison, Marion, Monongalia, Preston and Taylor counties

District 5:  Berkeley, Grant, Hampshire, Hardy, Jefferson, Mineral and Morgan 

countiesDistrict 6:  Brooke, Hancock, Marshall, Ohio, Tyler and Wetzel counties

PART II:  WVDOH DISTRICTS SERVED BY ABOVE ASPHALT PLANT (Required).  Mark all Districts which include one or more counties 

served by the Asphalt Plant listed above in Part I.   

ATT A - Pick Up 2022  6622C011



Vendor Name:

Asphalt Plant Name: 

Asphalt Plant Location:

(911 Address)

x

x

Unit of 

Measure
List Price

TON 79.50

TON 83.00

TON 87.50

TON 87.50

TON 89.00

TON 89.00

TON 85.00

TON 93.00

TON 94.00

TON 93.00

TON 94.00

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 94.00

TON 94.00

TON 93.00

TON 4.00

TON 12.00

DAY 3500.00

DAY 1000.00T2 Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day

West Virginia Paving, Inc.

Whitman, WV

US 119 Whitman Creek Road

Whitman, WV  25652

Whitman Plant

S1 Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22

S2 Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments

T1 Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day

P Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave

Q Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave

R Asphalt Plant Run 

M Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave

N Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III

O Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III

J Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1

K Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1

L Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave

G Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave

H Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course

I Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave

D Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level

E Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV

F Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV

A Asphalt Section 401 - Base I

B Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave

C Asphalt Section 401 - Base II

District 8:  Pendleton, Pocahontas, Randolph and Tucker counties

District 9:  Fayette, Greenbrier, Monroe, Nicholas and Summers counties

District 10:  McDowell, Mercer, Raleigh and Wyoming counties

PART III:  ENTER PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE FOR CONTRACT ITEMS BID.

Contract 

Item # Contract Item Description

District 7:  Barbour, Braxton, Gilmer, Lewis, Upshur and Webster counties

District 1:  Boone, Clay, Kanawha, Mason and Putnam counties

Asphalt Materials Pick Up by Agency

ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: 

Vendor shall complete Parts I, II and III below in their entirety.  Failure to provide the Asphalt Plant Name 

and Asphalt Plant Location will result in the disqualification of corresponding Contract Items.  Vendor must 

complete a seperate Pricing Page (ATT A) for EVERY sourced Asphalt Plant providing Contract Items for 

pick up by WVDOH forces.  

PART I:  VENDOR & ASPHALT PLANT INFORMATION (Required)

District 2:  Cabell, Lincoln, Logan, Mingo and Wayne counties

District 3:  Calhoun, Jackson, Pleasants, Ritchie, Roane, Wirt and Wood counties

District 4:  Doddridge, Harrison, Marion, Monongalia, Preston and Taylor counties

District 5:  Berkeley, Grant, Hampshire, Hardy, Jefferson, Mineral and Morgan 

countiesDistrict 6:  Brooke, Hancock, Marshall, Ohio, Tyler and Wetzel counties

PART II:  WVDOH DISTRICTS SERVED BY ABOVE ASPHALT PLANT (Required).  Mark all Districts which include one or more counties 

served by the Asphalt Plant listed above in Part I.   

ATT A - Pick Up 2022  6622C011



Vendor Name:

Asphalt Plant Name: 

Asphalt Plant Location:

(911 Address)

x

x

x

Unit of 

Measure
List Price

TON 61.00

TON 66.50

TON 66.00

TON 66.00

TON 68.00

TON No Bid

TON 70.00

TON 74.00

TON 84.00

TON 74.00

TON 83.00

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 95.00

TON No Bid

TON 83.00

TON 83.00

TON 74.00

TON 4.00

TON 12.00

DAY 3500.00

DAY 1000.00T2 Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day

West Virginia Paving, Inc

Poca, WV

Wright Road

Poca, WV  25159

Poca Plant

S1 Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22

S2 Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments

T1 Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day

P Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave

Q Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave

R Asphalt Plant Run 

M Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave

N Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III

O Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III

J Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1

K Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1

L Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave

G Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave

H Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course

I Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave

D Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level

E Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV

F Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV

A Asphalt Section 401 - Base I

B Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave

C Asphalt Section 401 - Base II

District 8:  Pendleton, Pocahontas, Randolph and Tucker counties

District 9:  Fayette, Greenbrier, Monroe, Nicholas and Summers counties

District 10:  McDowell, Mercer, Raleigh and Wyoming counties

PART III:  ENTER PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE FOR CONTRACT ITEMS BID.

Contract 

Item # Contract Item Description

District 7:  Barbour, Braxton, Gilmer, Lewis, Upshur and Webster counties

District 1:  Boone, Clay, Kanawha, Mason and Putnam counties

Asphalt Materials Pick Up by Agency

ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: 

Vendor shall complete Parts I, II and III below in their entirety.  Failure to provide the Asphalt Plant Name 

and Asphalt Plant Location will result in the disqualification of corresponding Contract Items.  Vendor must 

complete a seperate Pricing Page (ATT A) for EVERY sourced Asphalt Plant providing Contract Items for 

pick up by WVDOH forces.  

PART I:  VENDOR & ASPHALT PLANT INFORMATION (Required)

District 2:  Cabell, Lincoln, Logan, Mingo and Wayne counties

District 3:  Calhoun, Jackson, Pleasants, Ritchie, Roane, Wirt and Wood counties

District 4:  Doddridge, Harrison, Marion, Monongalia, Preston and Taylor counties

District 5:  Berkeley, Grant, Hampshire, Hardy, Jefferson, Mineral and Morgan 

countiesDistrict 6:  Brooke, Hancock, Marshall, Ohio, Tyler and Wetzel counties

PART II:  WVDOH DISTRICTS SERVED BY ABOVE ASPHALT PLANT (Required).  Mark all Districts which include one or more counties 

served by the Asphalt Plant listed above in Part I.   

ATT A - Pick Up 2022  6622C011



Vendor Name:

Asphalt Plant Name: 

Asphalt Plant Location:

(911 Address)

x

x

Unit of 

Measure
List Price

TON 55.50

TON 56.75

TON 60.00

TON 60.00

TON 60.00

TON 60.00

TON 60.00

TON 65.00

TON 68.00

TON 65.00

TON 68.00

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 72.00

TON No Bid

TON 67.00

TON 67.00

TON 65.00

TON 4.00

TON 12.00

DAY 3500.00

DAY 1000.00T2 Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day

West Virginia Paving, Inc.

Elkins, WV

Rt. 33 Kelly Mountain Road

Elkins, WV  26241

Elkins Plant

S1 Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22

S2 Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments

T1 Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day

P Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave

Q Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave

R Asphalt Plant Run 

M Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave

N Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III

O Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III

J Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1

K Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1

L Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave

G Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave

H Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course

I Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave

D Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level

E Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV

F Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV

A Asphalt Section 401 - Base I

B Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave

C Asphalt Section 401 - Base II

District 8:  Pendleton, Pocahontas, Randolph and Tucker counties

District 9:  Fayette, Greenbrier, Monroe, Nicholas and Summers counties

District 10:  McDowell, Mercer, Raleigh and Wyoming counties

PART III:  ENTER PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE FOR CONTRACT ITEMS BID.

Contract 

Item # Contract Item Description

District 7:  Barbour, Braxton, Gilmer, Lewis, Upshur and Webster counties

District 1:  Boone, Clay, Kanawha, Mason and Putnam counties

Asphalt Materials Pick Up by Agency

ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: 

Vendor shall complete Parts I, II and III below in their entirety.  Failure to provide the Asphalt Plant Name 

and Asphalt Plant Location will result in the disqualification of corresponding Contract Items.  Vendor must 

complete a seperate Pricing Page (ATT A) for EVERY sourced Asphalt Plant providing Contract Items for 

pick up by WVDOH forces.  

PART I:  VENDOR & ASPHALT PLANT INFORMATION (Required)

District 2:  Cabell, Lincoln, Logan, Mingo and Wayne counties

District 3:  Calhoun, Jackson, Pleasants, Ritchie, Roane, Wirt and Wood counties

District 4:  Doddridge, Harrison, Marion, Monongalia, Preston and Taylor counties

District 5:  Berkeley, Grant, Hampshire, Hardy, Jefferson, Mineral and Morgan 

countiesDistrict 6:  Brooke, Hancock, Marshall, Ohio, Tyler and Wetzel counties

PART II:  WVDOH DISTRICTS SERVED BY ABOVE ASPHALT PLANT (Required).  Mark all Districts which include one or more counties 

served by the Asphalt Plant listed above in Part I.   

ATT A - Pick Up 2022  6622C011



Vendor Name:

Asphalt Plant Name: 

Asphalt Plant Location:

(911 Address)

x

x

Unit of 

Measure
List Price

TON 58.00

TON 60.50

TON 62.00

TON 62.00

TON 64.00

TON 73.75

TON 63.50

TON 66.50

TON 75.50

TON 66.50

TON 74.50

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 77.50

TON No Bid

TON 75.50

TON 75.50

TON 66.50

TON 4.00

TON 12.00

DAY 3500.00

DAY 1000.00T2 Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day

West Virginia Paving, inc.

Scherr, WV

Greenland Gap Road

Scherr, WV  26726

Scherr Plant

S1 Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22

S2 Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments

T1 Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day

P Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave

Q Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave

R Asphalt Plant Run 

M Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave

N Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III

O Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III

J Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1

K Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1

L Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave

G Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave

H Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course

I Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave

D Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level

E Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV

F Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV

A Asphalt Section 401 - Base I

B Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave

C Asphalt Section 401 - Base II

District 8:  Pendleton, Pocahontas, Randolph and Tucker counties

District 9:  Fayette, Greenbrier, Monroe, Nicholas and Summers counties

District 10:  McDowell, Mercer, Raleigh and Wyoming counties

PART III:  ENTER PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE FOR CONTRACT ITEMS BID.

Contract 

Item # Contract Item Description

District 7:  Barbour, Braxton, Gilmer, Lewis, Upshur and Webster counties

District 1:  Boone, Clay, Kanawha, Mason and Putnam counties

Asphalt Materials Pick Up by Agency

ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: 

Vendor shall complete Parts I, II and III below in their entirety.  Failure to provide the Asphalt Plant Name 

and Asphalt Plant Location will result in the disqualification of corresponding Contract Items.  Vendor must 

complete a seperate Pricing Page (ATT A) for EVERY sourced Asphalt Plant providing Contract Items for 

pick up by WVDOH forces.  

PART I:  VENDOR & ASPHALT PLANT INFORMATION (Required)

District 2:  Cabell, Lincoln, Logan, Mingo and Wayne counties

District 3:  Calhoun, Jackson, Pleasants, Ritchie, Roane, Wirt and Wood counties

District 4:  Doddridge, Harrison, Marion, Monongalia, Preston and Taylor counties

District 5:  Berkeley, Grant, Hampshire, Hardy, Jefferson, Mineral and Morgan 

countiesDistrict 6:  Brooke, Hancock, Marshall, Ohio, Tyler and Wetzel counties

PART II:  WVDOH DISTRICTS SERVED BY ABOVE ASPHALT PLANT (Required).  Mark all Districts which include one or more counties 

served by the Asphalt Plant listed above in Part I.   

ATT A - Pick Up 2022  6622C011



Vendor Name:

Asphalt Plant Name: 

Asphalt Plant Location:

(911 Address)

x

x

Unit of 

Measure
List Price

TON 64.00

TON 67.50

TON 72.00

TON 72.00

TON 74.00

TON No Bid

TON 71.00

TON 75.00

TON 84.50

TON 75.00

TON 83.50

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 74.50

TON 74.50

TON 75.00

TON 4.00

TON 12.00

DAY 3500.00

DAY 1000.00T2 Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day

West Virginia Paving, Inc.

Asbury, WV

Rt. 60, West Lewisburg

Asbury, WV  24916

Alta Plant

S1 Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22

S2 Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments

T1 Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day

P Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave

Q Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave

R Asphalt Plant Run 

M Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave

N Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III

O Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III

J Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1

K Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1

L Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave

G Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave

H Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course

I Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave

D Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level

E Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV

F Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV

A Asphalt Section 401 - Base I

B Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave

C Asphalt Section 401 - Base II

District 8:  Pendleton, Pocahontas, Randolph and Tucker counties

District 9:  Fayette, Greenbrier, Monroe, Nicholas and Summers counties

District 10:  McDowell, Mercer, Raleigh and Wyoming counties

PART III:  ENTER PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE FOR CONTRACT ITEMS BID.

Contract 

Item # Contract Item Description

District 7:  Barbour, Braxton, Gilmer, Lewis, Upshur and Webster counties

District 1:  Boone, Clay, Kanawha, Mason and Putnam counties

Asphalt Materials Pick Up by Agency

ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: 

Vendor shall complete Parts I, II and III below in their entirety.  Failure to provide the Asphalt Plant Name 

and Asphalt Plant Location will result in the disqualification of corresponding Contract Items.  Vendor must 

complete a seperate Pricing Page (ATT A) for EVERY sourced Asphalt Plant providing Contract Items for 

pick up by WVDOH forces.  

PART I:  VENDOR & ASPHALT PLANT INFORMATION (Required)

District 2:  Cabell, Lincoln, Logan, Mingo and Wayne counties

District 3:  Calhoun, Jackson, Pleasants, Ritchie, Roane, Wirt and Wood counties

District 4:  Doddridge, Harrison, Marion, Monongalia, Preston and Taylor counties

District 5:  Berkeley, Grant, Hampshire, Hardy, Jefferson, Mineral and Morgan 

countiesDistrict 6:  Brooke, Hancock, Marshall, Ohio, Tyler and Wetzel counties

PART II:  WVDOH DISTRICTS SERVED BY ABOVE ASPHALT PLANT (Required).  Mark all Districts which include one or more counties 

served by the Asphalt Plant listed above in Part I.   

ATT A - Pick Up 2022  6622C011



Vendor Name:

Asphalt Plant Name: 

Asphalt Plant Location:

(911 Address)

x

x

x

Unit of 

Measure
List Price

TON 72.25

TON 74.50

TON 81.00

TON 81.00

TON 82.00

TON No Bid

TON 78.00

TON 83.50

TON 84.50

TON 83.50

TON 87.00

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 91.50

TON No Bid

TON 82.50

TON 82.50

TON 83.50

TON 4.00

TON 12.00

DAY 3500.00

DAY 1000.00T2 Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day

West Virginia Paving, Inc.

Summersville, WV

2816 Frontage Road

Summersville, WV  26651

Summersville Plant

S1 Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22

S2 Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments

T1 Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day

P Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave

Q Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave

R Asphalt Plant Run 

M Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave

N Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III

O Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III

J Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1

K Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1

L Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave

G Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave

H Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course

I Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave

D Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level

E Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV

F Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV

A Asphalt Section 401 - Base I

B Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave

C Asphalt Section 401 - Base II

District 8:  Pendleton, Pocahontas, Randolph and Tucker counties

District 9:  Fayette, Greenbrier, Monroe, Nicholas and Summers counties

District 10:  McDowell, Mercer, Raleigh and Wyoming counties

PART III:  ENTER PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE FOR CONTRACT ITEMS BID.

Contract 

Item # Contract Item Description

District 7:  Barbour, Braxton, Gilmer, Lewis, Upshur and Webster counties

District 1:  Boone, Clay, Kanawha, Mason and Putnam counties

Asphalt Materials Pick Up by Agency

ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: 

Vendor shall complete Parts I, II and III below in their entirety.  Failure to provide the Asphalt Plant Name 

and Asphalt Plant Location will result in the disqualification of corresponding Contract Items.  Vendor must 

complete a seperate Pricing Page (ATT A) for EVERY sourced Asphalt Plant providing Contract Items for 

pick up by WVDOH forces.  

PART I:  VENDOR & ASPHALT PLANT INFORMATION (Required)

District 2:  Cabell, Lincoln, Logan, Mingo and Wayne counties

District 3:  Calhoun, Jackson, Pleasants, Ritchie, Roane, Wirt and Wood counties

District 4:  Doddridge, Harrison, Marion, Monongalia, Preston and Taylor counties

District 5:  Berkeley, Grant, Hampshire, Hardy, Jefferson, Mineral and Morgan 

countiesDistrict 6:  Brooke, Hancock, Marshall, Ohio, Tyler and Wetzel counties

PART II:  WVDOH DISTRICTS SERVED BY ABOVE ASPHALT PLANT (Required).  Mark all Districts which include one or more counties 

served by the Asphalt Plant listed above in Part I.   

ATT A - Pick Up 2022  6622C011



Vendor Name:

Asphalt Plant Name: 

Asphalt Plant Location:

(911 Address)

x

x

Unit of 

Measure
List Price

TON 53.75

TON 59.50

TON 66.50

TON 66.50

TON 67.50

TON No Bid

TON 66.50

TON 68.75

TON 76.00

TON 68.75

TON 76.00

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 75.00

TON 75.00

TON 68.75

TON 4.00

TON 12.00

DAY 3500.00

DAY 1000.00T2 Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day

West Virginia Paving, Inc.

Ingleside, WV

6941 Ingleside Drive

Princeton, WV 24740

Princeton Plant

S1 Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22

S2 Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments

T1 Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day

P Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave

Q Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave

R Asphalt Plant Run 

M Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave

N Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III

O Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III

J Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1

K Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1

L Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave

G Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave

H Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course

I Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave

D Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level

E Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV

F Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV

A Asphalt Section 401 - Base I

B Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave

C Asphalt Section 401 - Base II

District 8:  Pendleton, Pocahontas, Randolph and Tucker counties

District 9:  Fayette, Greenbrier, Monroe, Nicholas and Summers counties

District 10:  McDowell, Mercer, Raleigh and Wyoming counties

PART III:  ENTER PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE FOR CONTRACT ITEMS BID.

Contract 

Item # Contract Item Description

District 7:  Barbour, Braxton, Gilmer, Lewis, Upshur and Webster counties

District 1:  Boone, Clay, Kanawha, Mason and Putnam counties

Asphalt Materials Pick Up by Agency

ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: 

Vendor shall complete Parts I, II and III below in their entirety.  Failure to provide the Asphalt Plant Name 

and Asphalt Plant Location will result in the disqualification of corresponding Contract Items.  Vendor must 

complete a seperate Pricing Page (ATT A) for EVERY sourced Asphalt Plant providing Contract Items for 

pick up by WVDOH forces.  

PART I:  VENDOR & ASPHALT PLANT INFORMATION (Required)

District 2:  Cabell, Lincoln, Logan, Mingo and Wayne counties

District 3:  Calhoun, Jackson, Pleasants, Ritchie, Roane, Wirt and Wood counties

District 4:  Doddridge, Harrison, Marion, Monongalia, Preston and Taylor counties

District 5:  Berkeley, Grant, Hampshire, Hardy, Jefferson, Mineral and Morgan 

countiesDistrict 6:  Brooke, Hancock, Marshall, Ohio, Tyler and Wetzel counties

PART II:  WVDOH DISTRICTS SERVED BY ABOVE ASPHALT PLANT (Required).  Mark all Districts which include one or more counties 

served by the Asphalt Plant listed above in Part I.   

ATT A - Pick Up 2022  6622C011



Vendor Name:

Asphalt Plant Name: 

Asphalt Plant Location:

(911 Address)

x

x

Unit of 

Measure
List Price

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 73.00

TON 73.00

TON 75.00

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 76.00

TON No Bid

TON 76.00

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 90.00

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 76.00

TON 4.00

TON 12.00

DAY 3500.00

DAY 1000.00T2 Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day

West Virginia Paving, Inc.

Ripley, WV

2187 Ripley Road

Ripley, WV  25271

Ripley Plant

S1 Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22

S2 Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments

T1 Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day

P Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave

Q Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave

R Asphalt Plant Run 

M Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave

N Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III

O Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III

J Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1

K Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1

L Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave

G Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave

H Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course

I Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave

D Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level

E Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV

F Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV

A Asphalt Section 401 - Base I

B Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave

C Asphalt Section 401 - Base II

District 8:  Pendleton, Pocahontas, Randolph and Tucker counties

District 9:  Fayette, Greenbrier, Monroe, Nicholas and Summers counties

District 10:  McDowell, Mercer, Raleigh and Wyoming counties

PART III:  ENTER PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE FOR CONTRACT ITEMS BID.

Contract 

Item # Contract Item Description

District 7:  Barbour, Braxton, Gilmer, Lewis, Upshur and Webster counties

District 1:  Boone, Clay, Kanawha, Mason and Putnam counties

Asphalt Materials Pick Up by Agency

ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: 

Vendor shall complete Parts I, II and III below in their entirety.  Failure to provide the Asphalt Plant Name 

and Asphalt Plant Location will result in the disqualification of corresponding Contract Items.  Vendor must 

complete a seperate Pricing Page (ATT A) for EVERY sourced Asphalt Plant providing Contract Items for 

pick up by WVDOH forces.  

PART I:  VENDOR & ASPHALT PLANT INFORMATION (Required)

District 2:  Cabell, Lincoln, Logan, Mingo and Wayne counties

District 3:  Calhoun, Jackson, Pleasants, Ritchie, Roane, Wirt and Wood counties

District 4:  Doddridge, Harrison, Marion, Monongalia, Preston and Taylor counties

District 5:  Berkeley, Grant, Hampshire, Hardy, Jefferson, Mineral and Morgan 

countiesDistrict 6:  Brooke, Hancock, Marshall, Ohio, Tyler and Wetzel counties

PART II:  WVDOH DISTRICTS SERVED BY ABOVE ASPHALT PLANT (Required).  Mark all Districts which include one or more counties 

served by the Asphalt Plant listed above in Part I.   

ATT A - Pick Up 2022  6622C011



Vendor Name:

Asphalt Plant Name: 

Asphalt Plant Location:

(911 Address)

x

Unit of 

Measure
List Price

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 66.50

TON 66.50

TON 67.50

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 72.00

TON No Bid

TON 72.00

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON No Bid

TON 72.00

TON 4.00

TON 12.00

DAY 3500.00

DAY 1000.00T2 Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day

West Virginia Paving, Inc

Bluefield, VA

2967 Virginia Ave.

Bluefield, VA   24605

Bluefield Plant

S1 Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22

S2 Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments

T1 Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day

P Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave

Q Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave

R Asphalt Plant Run 

M Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave

N Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III

O Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III

J Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1

K Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1

L Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave

G Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave

H Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course

I Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave

D Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level

E Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV

F Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV

A Asphalt Section 401 - Base I

B Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave

C Asphalt Section 401 - Base II

District 8:  Pendleton, Pocahontas, Randolph and Tucker counties

District 9:  Fayette, Greenbrier, Monroe, Nicholas and Summers counties

District 10:  McDowell, Mercer, Raleigh and Wyoming counties

PART III:  ENTER PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE FOR CONTRACT ITEMS BID.

Contract 

Item # Contract Item Description

District 7:  Barbour, Braxton, Gilmer, Lewis, Upshur and Webster counties

District 1:  Boone, Clay, Kanawha, Mason and Putnam counties

Asphalt Materials Pick Up by Agency

ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: 

Vendor shall complete Parts I, II and III below in their entirety.  Failure to provide the Asphalt Plant Name 

and Asphalt Plant Location will result in the disqualification of corresponding Contract Items.  Vendor must 

complete a seperate Pricing Page (ATT A) for EVERY sourced Asphalt Plant providing Contract Items for 

pick up by WVDOH forces.  

PART I:  VENDOR & ASPHALT PLANT INFORMATION (Required)

District 2:  Cabell, Lincoln, Logan, Mingo and Wayne counties

District 3:  Calhoun, Jackson, Pleasants, Ritchie, Roane, Wirt and Wood counties

District 4:  Doddridge, Harrison, Marion, Monongalia, Preston and Taylor counties

District 5:  Berkeley, Grant, Hampshire, Hardy, Jefferson, Mineral and Morgan 

countiesDistrict 6:  Brooke, Hancock, Marshall, Ohio, Tyler and Wetzel counties

PART II:  WVDOH DISTRICTS SERVED BY ABOVE ASPHALT PLANT (Required).  Mark all Districts which include one or more counties 

served by the Asphalt Plant listed above in Part I.   

ATT A - Pick Up 2022  6622C011
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