West Virginia

Purchasing Division

The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
wWVOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West Virginia’s
procurement process, and to maintain the
transparency of the bid-opening process, this
documentation submitted online is publicly posted
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses
to this solicitation submitted to the Purchasing
Division in hard copy format.
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Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder : 660917

Solicitation Description : ADDENDUM 1 TRAFFIC SIGNAL PARTS (8520C3003)

Proc Type : Central Master Agreement

Date issued

Solicitation Closes

Solicitation Response

Version

2020-02-06
13:30:00

SR 0803 ESR02062000000004591

1

LVENDOR

VS0000007588
JQ&GINCCO

Solicitation Number:

Total Bid :

Comments:

$0.00

CRFQ 0803

DOT2000000111

Response Date: 2020-02-06 Response Time:

13:12:08

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Crystal G Hustead

(304) 558-2402
crystal.g.hustead@wv.gov

Signature on File

FEIN #

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 TRAFFEIC SIGNAL PARTS FOR 0.00000 EA $1.000000 $0.00
MAINTENANCE
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161504
PRICING TO BE INCLUDED ON THE ATTACHED EXHIBIT A PRICING PAGE

Extended Description :
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Exhibit A Pricing Page

CRFQ DOT2000000111
NLt:‘Ter ;sut::::feds l\/tljer:z::e Description l::':;s':: Unit Price Total Cost
SECTION 1
1 20 ea Siemens Eagle Traffic Controller M60 Series or equivalent 46161504| $ 2,500.00 | $ 50,000.00
2 10 ea Siemens Eagle Master Traffic Controller M60 Series or equivalent 46161504 S 2,500.00 | S 25,000.00
3 30 ea Repairs of Siemens Eagle Traffic Controllers 46161504 $ 500.00 | $ 15,000.00
4 1 ea Eagle Traffic Signal TS2 Pole Mounted Signal Cabinet or equivalent 46161504 $ 7,500.00| $ 7,500.00
5 1 ea Eagle TS2 Ground Mounted Traffic Signal Cabinets or equivalent 46161504| S 8,000.00| $ 8,000.00
SECTION 2
6 20 ea Econolite Cobalt ATC Traffic Signal Controller or eugivalent 46161504 $ 2,500.00| S 50,000.00
7 20 ea Repair of Econolite Traffic Controller 46161504 $ 500.00 | $ 10,000.00
8 1 ea Econolite TS2 Pole Mounted Signal Cabinet or equivalent 46161504| S 7,500.00 | S 7,500.00
9 1 ea Econolite TS Ground Mounted Signal Cabinet or equivalent 46161504 S 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00
SECTION 3
10 10 ea Iteris RZ4 Vehicle Detection Camera or equivalent 46161504 S 1,500.00 [ S 15,000.00
11 5 ea Repair of Iteris RZ4 Video Detection Camera or equivalent 46161504 $ 600.00 | $ 3,000.00
12 10 ea Iteris Vehicle Detection Card or equivalent 46161504| S 3,700.00 | S 37,000.00
13 10 ea Repair of Iteris Video Detection Card 46161504 $ 600.00 | $ 6,000.00
SECTION 4
14 10 ea Autoscope Vehicle Detection Video Camera or equivalent 46161504| S 1,500.00 | S 15,000.00
15 10 ea Repair of Autoscope Vehicle Detection Camera or equivalent 46161504 $ 600.00 | $ 6,000.00
16 10 ea Autoscope Vehicle Detection Cards or equivalent 46161504 S 3,700.00 | S 37,000.00
17 10 ea Repair of Autoscope Vehicle Detection Cards 46161504 $ 600.00 | $ 6,000.00
SECTION 5
18 1 ea Wavetronix Smart Sensor Matrix Vehicle Detection Radar or eugivalent 46161504 No Bid
19 1 ea Wavetronix Smart Sensor"Advance" Matrix Vehicle Detection Radar or equivalent 46161504 No Bid
20 10 ea Wavetronix Smart 2-Channel Detection Card or equivalent 46161504 No Bid
21 5 ea Wavetronix 4-Channel Vehicle DetectionCard or equivalent 46161504 No Bid
SECTION 6
22 1 ea Econolite Accuscan "Stop Bar"+Advance Model 500 or Equal Vehicle Detection Radar 46161504 No Bid
23 1 ea Econolite Accuscan "Stop Bar"+ Advnace Model 600c or equal Vehicle Detection Radar 46161504 No Bid
24 10 ea Econolite Accuscan model TMIB2 or equal Detection Radar Controller Interface Card 46161504 No Bid
SECTION 7
25 30 ea TOMAR Preemption Control Systems Detectors or eugivalent 46161504| $ 3,000.00 | $ 90,000.00
26 20 ea TOMAR Preemption Control Systems Detection Cards or equivalent 46161504| $ 800.00 [ $ 16,000.00
27 15 ea Repair of TOMAR Preemption Control Systems Detection Cards or eugivalent 46161504| $ 1,500.00 [ $  22,500.00
SECTION 8
28 30 ea Traffic Signal Conflict Monitor 46161504 $ 600.00 | S 18,000.00
29 15 ea Traffic Signal Malfunction Management Unit 46161504 $ 858.00 [ $ 12,870.00
30 30 ea Trafffic Signal Bus Interface Unit 46161504 $ 220.00 | $ 6,600.00
31 150 ea Green LED Signal Lamp 46161504 $ 30.00 | $ 4,500.00
32 150 ea Yellow LED Signal Lamp 46161504| S 30.00| $ 4,500.00
33 150 ea Red LED Signal Lamp 46161504 $ 30.00 | $ 4,500.00
34 30 ea LED Pedestrain Signal Head with Housing and Mounting Hardware 46161504| $ 330.00 | $ 9,900.00
35 30 ea Audible Pedestrian Push Button 46161504 $ 900.00 [ $ 27,000.00
36 50 ea TS1 Cabinet Power Supply 46161504 $ 210.00 | $ 10,500.00
37 15 ea TS2 Cabinet Power Supply 46161504 $ 425.00 | $ 6,375.00
38 5 ea Time Clocks 46161504 S 560.00 | $ 2,800.00
39 50 ea 56K Wired Modems 46161504| S 600.00 | $ 30,000.00
40 20 ea Flash Transfer Relays 46161504 S 35.00 | $ 700.00
41 5 ea Solar Flasher Controller 46161504 $ 230.00| $ 1,150.00
42 5 ea Solar Flasher Motor Unit 46161504 $ 100.00 | $ 500.00
SECTION 10
43 20 ea ENCOM Radio Transceivers or equivalent 46161504 $ 3,215.00 | S  64,300.00
SECTION 11
44 10 ea Intuicom Radio Transceivers or equivalent 46161504| S 1,900.00 [ S 19,000.00




