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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

1 TRAFFIC SIGNAL PARTS FOR
MAINTENANCE

0.00000 EA $0.000000 $0.00

46161504

PRICING TO BE INCLUDED ON THE ATTACHED EXHIBIT A PRICING PAGE





















Exhibit A Pricing Page from MoboTrex, Inc.

Item 

Number

Estimated 

Quantities

Unit of 

Measure
Description

UNSPC 

CODE
Unit Price Total Cost

SECTION 1

1 20 ea Siemens Eagle Traffic Controller M60 Series or equivalent 46161504 3,225.00$         64,500.00$       

2 10 ea Siemens Eagle Master Traffic Controller M60 Series or equivalent 46161504 3,425.00$         34,250.00$       

3 30 ea Repairs of Siemens Eagle Traffic Controllers 46161504 1,400.00$         42,000.00$       

4 1 ea Eagle Traffic Signal TS2 Pole Mounted Signal Cabinet or equivalent 46161504 9,725.00$         9,725.00$         

5 1 ea Eagle TS2 Ground Mounted Traffic Signal Cabinets or equivalent 46161504 9,975.00$         9,975.00$         

SECTION 2

6 20 ea Econolite Cobalt ATC Traffic Signal Controller or euqivalent 46161504 -$                   No Bid

7 20 ea Repair of Econolite Traffic Controller 46161504 -$                   No Bid

8 1 ea Econolite TS2 Pole Mounted Signal Cabinet or equivalent 46161504 -$                   No Bid

9 1 ea Econolite TS Ground Mounted Signal Cabinet or equivalent 46161504 -$                   No Bid

SECTION 3

10 10 ea Iteris RZ4 Vehicle Detection Camera or equivalent 46161504 1,875.00$         18,750.00$       

11 5 ea  Repair of Iteris RZ4 Video Detection Camera or equivalent 46161504 350.00$             1,750.00$         

12 10 ea Iteris Vehicle Detection Card or equivalent 46161504 3,500.00$         35,000.00$       

13 10 ea  Repair of Iteris Video Detection Card 46161504 550.00$             5,500.00$         

SECTION 4

14 10 ea Autoscope Vehicle Detection Video Camera or equivalent 46161504 -$                   No Bid

15 10 ea Repair of Autoscope Vehicle Detection Camera or equivalent 46161504 -$                   No Bid

16 10 ea Autoscope Vehicle Detection Cards or equivalent 46161504 -$                   No Bid

17 10 ea Repair of Autoscope Vehicle Detection Cards 46161504 -$                   No Bid

SECTION 5

18 1 ea Wavetronix Smart Sensor Matrix Vehicle Detection Radar or euqivalent 46161504 -$                   No Bid

19 1 ea Wavetronix Smart Sensor"Advance" Matrix Vehicle Detection Radar or equivalent 46161504 -$                   No Bid

20 10 ea Wavetronix Smart 2-Channel Detection Card or equivalent 46161504 -$                   No Bid

21 5 ea Wavetronix 4-Channel Vehicle DetectionCard or equivalent 46161504 -$                   No Bid

SECTION 6

22 1 ea Econolite Accuscan "Stop Bar"+Advance Model 500 or Equal Vehicle Detection Radar 46161504 -$                   No Bid

23 1 ea Econolite Accuscan "Stop Bar"+ Advnace Model 600c or equal Vehicle Detection Radar 46161504 -$                   No Bid

24 10 ea Econolite Accuscan model TMIB2 or equal  Detection Radar Controller Interface Card 46161504 -$                   No Bid

SECTION 7

25 30 ea TOMAR Preemption Control Systems Detectors Model 4090-1-SD 46161504 350.00$             10,500.00$       

26 20 ea TOMAR Preemption Control Systems Detection Cards Model 4080V2-2 46161504 625.00$             12,500.00$       

27 15 ea Repair of TOMAR Preemption Control Systems Detection Cards or euqivalent 46161504 300.00$             4,500.00$         

SECTION 8

28 30 ea Traffic Signal Conflict Monitor 46161504 750.00$             22,500.00$       

29 15 ea Traffic Signal Malfunction Management Unit 46161504 700.00$             10,500.00$       

30 30 ea Trafffic Signal Bus Interface Unit 46161504 155.00$             4,650.00$         

31 150 ea Green LED Signal Lamp 46161504 40.00$               6,000.00$         

32 150 ea Yellow LED Signal Lamp 46161504 40.00$               6,000.00$         

33 150 ea Red LED Signal Lamp 46161504 40.00$               6,000.00$         

34 30 ea LED Pedestrain Signal Head with Housing and Mounting Hardware 46161504 300.00$             9,000.00$         

35 30 ea Audible Pedestrian Push Button 46161504 570.00$             17,100.00$       

36 50 ea TS1 Cabinet Power Supply 46161504 220.00$             11,000.00$       

37 15 ea TS2 Cabinet Power Supply 46161504 425.00$             6,375.00$         

38 5 ea Time Clocks 46161504 475.00$             2,375.00$         

39 50 ea 56K Wired Modems 46161504 125.00$             6,250.00$         

40 20 ea Flash Transfer Relays 46161504 25.00$               500.00$             

41 5 ea Solar Flasher Controller 46161504 125.00$             625.00$             

42 5 ea Solar Flasher Motor Unit* 46161504 24.00$               120.00$             

SECTION 10

43 20 ea ENCOM Radio Transceivers or equivalent 46161504 1,150.00$         23,000.00$       

SECTION 11

44 10 ea Intuicom Radio Transceivers or equivalent 46161504 -$                   No Bid
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TOMAR 4090 Series Detectors offer these important 
features:

•	 Closed loop self-test for detector welfare, monitoring 
and reporting (ST models only). 

•	 Military derived sensor technology for direct sunlight 
rejection and detection performance unmatched by 
ANY other system.  

•	 Fully encapsulated electronics for complete 
resistance to water, heat, and vibration. 

•	 Complete electronics protection from damage due 
to miswiring or electrical transients. 

•	 Simple advanced detector installation without any 
special cabling for enhanced detection around 
corners and over hills. 

•	 Tool-less tilt/swivel for each detector head makes 
aiming easy 

TOMAR’s 4090 Series Optical Preemption Detectors 
sense the optical pulses emitted by properly equipped 
emergency or transit vehicles. Mounted to observe 
the approaches of an intersection, 4090 Detectors are 
used with TOMAR 2000, 3000 and 4000 Series Optical 
Signal Processors to inform the traffic control system 
of the presence of designated vehicles.

The 4090-x-ST detectors incorporate a self-test feature 
for true closed loop detector and wiring welfare 
monitoring. Each 4090-X-ST detector includes a small 
infrared LED which periodically injects a special test 
signal into the detectors photo sensor. The 2140, 3140 
and 4140 Series OSPs receive the special test signal 
and therefore know that the detector is fully functional. 
Should a detector fail self-test a front panel indication 
and an entry in the OSP log indicate the problem.

Using 4090 Series detectors and Strobecom II 
throughout your traffic control system reduces 
emergency response time, allows emergency vehicles 
to travel with greater safety, and improves transit 
vehicles timeliness.

4090 Series OPTICAL PREEMPTION DETECTORS



TOMAR Electronics, Inc.     2100 W. Obispo Ave.     Gilbert, AZ 85233  USA     (800) 338-3133 tel     (800) 688-6627 fax     www.tomar.com

Optical Preemption & Priority Control Systems

PUB-0129

Specifications for 4090 Series Detectors

Item Description

Maximum Range 2500 feet minimum when used with a TOMAR Optical Signal Processor.

Optical Pulse Rise Time Discrimination The 4090 Series input stages are optimized for the detection of strobe pulses with a rise time from start of 
pulse to peak of pulse of 10 microseconds or less. Slower pulses such as varying sunlight and incandescent 
emergency lighting will be highly attenuated and substantially ignored by the detector’s digital 
discriminators.

4090-x-ST self testing detectors The 4090-x-ST Series incorporate a self-test feature for true closed loop detector sensor and wiring 
welfare monitoring.

Field of View 13 degrees conical centered about the viewport normal axis (typical).

Power Requirements VOLTAGE: 12 to 30VDC CURRENT: 15 mA maximum

Wiring Connections Blue Wire - GROUND
Yellow - SIGNAL
Orange Wire - +12 to 30 VDC
Shield and Drain Wire - CONNECT TO BLUE WIRE AT TRAFFIC CABINET

Temperature Range -40° Celsius to +75° Celsius

Physical Construction The 4090 Series enclosures are black, glass-filled, UV stabilized, polyamide suitable for all-weather use. All 
electronic circuitry is completely encapsulated in polyurethane for protection from shock, vibration, and 
moisture. A weep hole is provided for allowing the escape of condensation or other internal moisture build-
up in the sight tube of the detector.

Mounting The 4090 Series are easily mounted using standard hardware on either span wire or mast arm. The unit has a 
3/4” female pipe mount hub and internal terminal block for connection to a 3/C shielded detector cable.

***** See catalog page 23 for available mounting hardware.

TRUE 10 Year Warranty!
10 year warranty covers the 4090 Series and all STROBECOM 
II components. Unlike other manufacturers, TOMAR’s ten 
year warranty has NO fees or charges for warranty repairs 
after five years.

NOTICE: The sale of these items are restricted to state and local governments and to authorized distributors only.

4090 detector series ordering information

Catalog Number Description

4090-1-SD One direction, one channel detector, no self-test 
(for model 2070, 2080, and 3080 optical signal 
processors).

4090-21-SD Two direction, one channel detector, no self-test 
(for model 2070, 2080, and 3080 optical signal 
processors)

4090-22-SD Two direction, two channel detector, no self-test 
(for model 2070, 2080, and 3080 optical signal 
processors)

4090-1-ST One direction, one channel detector, with self-test 
(for model 2140, 3140, and 4140 optical signal 
processors)

4090-21-ST Two direction, one channel detector, with self-test 
(for model 2140, 3140, and 4140 optical signal 
processors)

4090-22-ST Two direction, two channel detector, with self-test 
(for model 2140, 3140, and 4140 optical signal 
processors)



4080 Version 2, two channel, optical signal 
processor with Integrated Confirmation

W W W . T O M A R . C O M @ t o m a r U S A

CLEARING THE  WAY

4080V2-2 

• INTEGRATED CONFIRMATION technology   
powers IC enabled 4000 series TOMAR 
Strobecom II detectors to be powered and 
controlled over the standard preemption 
detector cable.  No additional power supplies, 
mounting, programming, or wiring required.

• TRUE CONFIRMATION, when combined with 
INTEGRATED CONFIRMATION is the only 
preemption system that provides real, 
closed-loop, visual feedback to vehicle drivers 
that the intersection is in preempt

•  Active Reflection Suppression prevents cross 
street preemption due to reflected emitter 
energy.  TOMAR’s advanced digital signal 
processing eliminates this troublesome side 
effect making detector installation and setup 
far less critical.

• PLUG-and-PLAY firmware allows the addition 
of detectors and other accessories to the 
system without manual configuration.  Buy only 
the equipment needed today and add more 
capability later saving precious funds.

•  Expansion Port provides easy connection of 
the 4080V2-2 to other accessory modules

Installed inside the traffic cabinet, the 4080V2-2 optical signal 
processor provides power for 4000 series optical detectors, 
receives, decodes, and prioritizes emitter signals from the 
detectors, powers and activates Integrated Confirmation 
lights.

Equipped with TOMAR’s patented (US patent 8,742,946) 
INTEGRATED CONFIRMATION technology, the 4080V2-2 
powers and controls the high intensity LED confirmation lights 
integrated into up to four 4000 series IC enabled detectors 
over standard preemption detector cable with no additional 
power supply, mounting, programming, or wiring. Integrated 
Confirmation equipped intersections provide visual feedback 
of intersection preemption to vehicle drivers and citizens for 
enhanced safety. When combined with TOMAR’s True 
Confirmation feature the integrated LED confirmation lights 
provide real closed-loop visual feedback that the traffic 
controller is actually in preemption providing enhanced 
right-of-way.

The 4080V2-2 is delivered default programmed to respond on 
a first-come first-served basis to optical signals from vehicles 
within two signal bands. Emergency Band signals are typically 
emitted by emergency vehicles to effect a preemption of 
normal traffic control timing and are given the highest priority 
to allow rapid emergency vehicle response with enhanced 
safety. Transit Band signals are generally emitted by transit or 
other non-emergency municipal vehicles to effect a priority 
change for the vehicle’s approach direction without necessarily 
interrupting traffic control timing. Up to 65,000 vehicles in each 
signal band can be individually identified and responded to. 

The 4080V2-2 OSP is compatible with NEMA TS-1, TS-2, and 
CA/NY 170 and 2070 controllers, and meets all NEMA and 
Caltrans environmental requirements. The 4080V2-2 plugs 
directly into standard preemption card slots and does not use 
internal 24VDC cabinet power. For controllers without a 
preemption card slot the TOMAR 1881 rack provides the 
necessary hardware and harnessing to allow simple connection 
to detectors and controller inputs.
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CLEARING THE  WAY

Specifications
Item

Signal

Signal Acquisition Time

Range

Description

Ordering Info
Catalog Number Description

True 10 year warranty!
10 year warranty covers the 4000 Series and all STROBECOM II components. Unlike other manufacturers, 
TOMAR’s ten year warranty has NO fees or charges for warranty repairs after five years. 
NOTICE: The sale of these items are restricted to state and local governments and to be authorized distributors only. 

4080V2-2 Two channel Optical Signal Processor with
INTEGRATED CONFIRMATION.

The 4080V2-2 shall be capable of receiving, decoding, and prioritizing the Emergency band 
and Transit band signals transmitted by all TOMAR and competitive emitters. The 4080V2-2 
shall be jumper configurable to accept or reject older non-identifying optical signals. Up to 
65,000 vehicles in each signal band shall be individually identifiable.

The 4080V2-2 shall be capable of powering and operating up to two TOMAR 4000 series 
Integrated Confirmation enabled detectors over up to 600’ of preemption detector cable 
per IC enabled detector.

Up to two 4000 series IC enabled detectors (maximum of four LED confirmation lights total) 
plus four additional non-IC enabled detectors 

120/240VAC 50/60Hz

The 4080V2-2 shall provide two optically-isolated output channels for placing NEMA 
standard signal level calls on traffic controller preempt inputs.

The 4080V2-2 shall have two optically-isolated inputs for connecting to traffic controller 
preempt status outputs.

Typical signal acquisition time shall be approximately 2.5 seconds. Acquisition time will vary 
depending on the number of signals present simultaneously and on the density of optical 
noise.

2500 feet maximum adjustable down to 200 feet in 255 steps for each signal band and each 
approach.

Priority Determination

Output Signals

Input Signals

Confirmation Lights

Maximum Detectors

Input power shall be MOV protected from AC mains transients.  Detector inputs shall be TVS 
protected from electrical transients.

Transient Protection

A ½ amp fuse shall be included in the input power connection to protect cabinet wiringFusing

Electrical Requirements

-40 to +75 degrees CTemperature Range

The 4080V2-2 shall be delivered with default priority grouping, responding on a first-come, 
first-served basis to signals within each signal band. Signals in the Emergency signal band shall 
be given priority over signals in the transit signal band.

Using configuration jumpers, the user can enable or disable certain signal types, modify transit 
priority, configure the confirmation light patterns, and enable or disable True Confirmation 
operations.












