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Purchasing Divison State of West Virginia

A | 2019 Washington Street East
| Bost Offles Bax 50150 Request for Quotation

5. J | Charleston, WV 25305-0130 19 — Highways

Proc Folder: 660917
Doc Description: TRAFFIC SIGNAL PARTS (8520C3003)

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Date lgsued Solicltation Closes | Solicitation No Version
2020-01-17 2020-02-06 CRFQ 0803 QOT2000000111 1
13:30:00

BID CLERK
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
PURCHASING DIVISION
2019 WASHINGTON ST E
CHARLESTON wv 25305

us

Vendor N. rs d elphone ur:
Moborrey Goll- 693 - 3412
1450 Smé:o\) R;ébc. Vr.
?ow‘v»hs\, Vi 3139

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Crystal G Hustead
(304) 558-2402
crystal.g .hustead@JN.QOV
{

Signature X / ) . i FEIN # 3L - 26{ 6 ¥4 4 DATE © L/bg' }'LOT-D

All offers subject fo all terms aﬂondltl conlalned In this sollcitation

Page : 1 FORM ID : WV-PRC-CRFQ-001
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THE STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA PURCHASING DiVISION FOR THE AGENCY, WEST VIRGINIA DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS, IS SOLICITING
BIDS TO ESTABLISH AN OPEN-END CONTRACT FOR TRAFFIC SIGNAL PARTS PER THE ATTACHED DOCUMENTS.

“MQUESTIONS REGARDING THE SOLICITATION MUST BE SUBMITTED IN WRITING TO CRYSTAL.G.HUSTEAD@WV.GOV PRIOR TO THE
QUESTION PERIOD DEADLINE CONTAINED IN THE INSTRUCTIONS TO VENDORS SUBMITTING BIDS**

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
TRAFFIC ENGINEERING DIVISION TRAFFIC ENG. TSC - SIGNAL MAINTENANCE
1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, BLDG 5 RM A550 180 DRY BRANCH DR
CHARLESTON Wv25305-0430 CHARLESTON WV 25306
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Prica Total Price
1 TRAFFIC SIGNAL PARTS FOR 0.00000 EA
MAINTENANCE
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Modal #
46161504

Extended Description :
PRICING TO BE INCLUDED ON THE ATTACHED EXHIBIT A PRICING PAGE

Event Date

Ling Event
1 VENDOR QUESTION DEADLINE 2020-01-24

Page: 2
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Document Phase

| DOT2000000111 Final

[ - r
Document Description
| TRAFFIC SIGNAL PARTS (8520C3003)

l_’age 3
of 3

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions
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%, | Purchasing Divison State of West Virginia
| 23 Wmbingon Steot o Request for Quoiation
Chacleston, WV 253050130 19 — Highways

Proc Folder: 660917
Doc Description: ADDENDUM 1 TRAFFIC SIGNAL PARTS (8520C3003)

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Date Issued Solicifation Cioses | Solicitation No Version
2020-01-24 2020-02-06 CRFQ 0803 DOY2000000111 2 T
13:30:00

RS
BID CLERK

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON STE

CHARLESTON wv 25305
us

Vendor Name, Address and Telephone Number!

Moporrex
$04-¢2%- 94121
(550 Grenbing fidge Pr.

Covketon, VA 73139

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Crystal G Hustead

*(304) 558-2402
crystal.g.hustead@wv.gov

Signature X /W FEIN# 3b- st‘afth DATE ozlo(p /ZDZD

All offers subjectto all tarms and condflons contsined In this solicitation

Page: i FORM ID : W\V-PRC-CRFQ-001
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THE STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA PURCHASING DIVISION Fi
BIDS TO ESTABLISH AN OPEN-END CONTRACT FOR TRA

**QUESTIONS REGARDING THE SOLICITATION MUST BE SUBMITTED |

QUESTION PERIOD DEADRLINE CONTAINED IN THE

OR THE AGENCY. WEST VIRGINIA DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS, IS SOLICITING
FFIC SIGNAL PARTS PER THE ATTACHED DOCUMENTS.

N WRITING TO CRYSTAL.G. HUSTEAD@WV.GOV PRIOR TO THE
INSTRUCTIONS TO VENDORS SUBMITTING BIDS™

INVETCEO e e

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF RIGHWAYS

TRAFFIC ENGINEERING DIVISION TRAFFIC ENG, TSC - SIGNAL MAINTENANGE
1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, BLDG 5 RM A550 180 DRY BRANGH OR

CHARLESTON WA/25305-0430 CHARLESTON WV 25308
us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Oty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 TRAFFIC SIGNAL PARTS FOR 0.00000 EA

MAINTENANCE

Comm Codo Manutacturer Specification Modal #
46161504

Extended Degcription :

PRICING TO BE INCLUDED ON THE ATTACHED EXHIBIT A PRICING PAGE

G
] Event
VENDOR QUESTION DEADLINE

- |

Event Date
2020-0124

Page: 2
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SOLICITATION NUMBER _; CRFQ DOT2000000111
Addendum Number: 1

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as
(“Solicitation”) to reflect the change(s) identified and described below.

Applicable Addemdum Category:
[ ] Modify bid opening date and time
[ ] Modify specifications of product or service being sought
[¢] Attachment of vendor questions and responses
[ | Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet
[ ] Correction of error

[ ] Other

Description of Modification to Solicitation:
1. To provide answers o vendor questions

No other changes
Bid apening remains 02/06/2020 at 1:30 PM

Additional Documentatjon: Documentation related to this Addendam (if any) has been
included herewith as Attachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference.

Terms and Conditions:

1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in
full force and effect.

2. Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by
completing an Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. The addendum
acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

Reviged 6/82012

ll
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ATTACHMENT A

. Revised 6/b2012
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Addendum #1 CRFQ DOT20000000111/ Traffic Signal Parts

Questlon 1- Item #28: Did you need that shelf or rack mount? How many channels?

Answer 1- Shelf mount. Please see the specification In section 3.1.28.1

Questions 2- Item #29: Is the part number MMU16LEIP what you are looking for?

Answer 2 ~ Please see the specifications in section 3.1.29.1

Question 3 -item #34: Did you want poly or aluminum for the signal? What kind of mounting?
Clamshell, SOP or Post top?

Answer 3 - Poly and Clamshell.

Questions 4 -Item #38: Did you want RTC or Eltec? What model # are you looking for?

Answer 4- Please see the specifications in sections 3.1.38.1

Questions 5- Item #41: Do you have a part number | could use as a reference?

Answer 5- Please see specifications in 3.1.41.1

Question & - Item #42: Do you have a part number | could use as 3 reference?

Answer 6- Please see specifications in sections 3.1.42.1

Question 7- Can you tell us the project numbers and dates for previous contracts for this work?

Answer 7- Requesting copies of previously awarded contracts, other solicitations, or documents related
to previous contracts through the question and answer process included in this solicitation is not
appropriate. Requests for documentation of this nature can be obtained by interested parties through a

Freedom of Information Act request.
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ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO,: DOT2000000111

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualificatior.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:

(Check the box next to each addendum received)

( \/] Addendum No. ] [ ] Addendum No.6
[ 1 Addendum No. 2 [ ] Addendum No.7
[ 1 Addendum No, 3 [ ] Addendum No. 8
[ ] Addendum No. 4 [ ] Addendum No.9
[ ] Addendum No, 5 [ ] Addendum No. 10

Iunderstand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. 1
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

M DLOH‘LT

4 fé;j\m
( Wd Signature

021’° (OJZM.O

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.
Revised 6/8/2012
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Exhlblt A Pricing Page from MoboTrex, Inc,
CRFQ DOT2000000111
Item Estimated Unit of L UNSPC 5
Number | Quantitles | Measure Description CODE Unit Price Total Cost
SECTION 1
1 20 ea Siemens Eagls Traffic Controller ME0 Serfes or equivalent 46161504 & 3,22500| § 6450000
2 10 ea Siemens Eagle Master Traffic Controllar ME0 Series or equivalent 46161504| S 3,425.00 | 5 34,250.00
3 30 ea Repasirs of Slemens Eagle Traffic Controflers 46161504] $ 1,40000( $ 42,000.00
4 1 ea Engle Traffic Signal TS2 Pole Mounted Signal Cabinat ar equivalent 46161504] § 9,725.00| § 9,725.00
5 1 ea Eagle TS2 Ground Mounted Traffic Signal Cabinets or ecuivalent 46161504/ §  9,975.00| S 9,975.00
SECYION 2
6 20 ea Econolite Cobalt ATC Traffic Slgnal Controfler or eugivalent 46161504/ S - No Bid
7 20 ea Repalr of Econolite Traffic Controller 46161504 § - No Bid
8 1 e3 Econolite TS2 Pole Mounted Slgnal Cabinet or equivalent 46161504 S - No Bld
9 1 ea Econalite TS Ground Mounted Signal Cabinet or eguivalent 46161504 S - NoBid |
SECTION 3
10 10 ) Iterls RZ4 Vehicle Detectlon Camera or eguivalent 46161504) $  1,875.00| $ 18,750.00
11 5 ea Repalr of Iteris RZ4 Video Detection Camera or equlvalent 46161504 S 350.00 | $ 1,750.00
12 10 ea Iterls Vehlcle Detection Card or equlvalent 46161504] $ 3,500.00 | $ 35,000.00
13 10 ea Repair of hteris Video Detection Card 46161504 $ £50.00 | § 5,500.00
SECTION 4
14 10 a3 Autoscope Vehicle Detection Video Camera or equivalent 46161504, $ - No Bld
15 10 e Repair of Autoscope Vehicle Detection Camera ar equivalent 46161504] S - No Bld
16 10 ea Autoscope Vehicle Detection Cards or equivalent 46161504| - No Bid
17 10 ea Repair of Autoscope Vehicle Detectlon Cards 46161504| S - No Bid
SECTION S
18 1 ea Wavetronix Smart Sensor Matrlx Vehicle Detection Radar or eugivalent 461615084, S - No Bid
19 b ea Wavetronix Smart Sensor”Advance" Matrix Vehicle Detection Radar or equivalent 46161504| $ - No Bid
20 10 ea Wavetronlx Smart 2-Channel Detectlon Card or equivalent 46161504 § - Na Bid
21 5 e3 Wavetronix 4-Channel Vehicle DetectionCard ar equivalent 46161504 $ - No Bid
SECTION 6
22 1 ea Econolite Accuscan “Stop Bar"+Advance Model 500 or Equal Vehicle Detection Radar 46161504| § - No Bid
23 1 e3 Ecanalite Accuscan "Stop Bar'+ Advnace Model 600c or equal Vehicle Detection Radar 46161504| 3 - No Bid
24 10 23 Econolite Accuscan model TMIB2 or equal Detection Radar Controller Interface Card 46161504] 5 - No Bid
SECTION ?
25 30 ea TOMAR Preemption Control Systems Detectors Madel 4090-1-SD 46161504| $ 350.00| § 10,500.00
26 20 €a TOMAR Preemption Control Systems Detectian Cards Mode] 4080vV2-2 46161504] § 625.00 | $ 12,500.00
27 15 ea Repalr of TOMAR Preemptlon Control Systems Detectlon Cards or eugivalent 46161504] S 300.00| & 4,500.00
SECTION 8
28 30 ea Traffic Signal Conflict Monitor 46161504 § 750.00 | $ 22 500.00
29 15 ea Traffic Signal Malfunction Management Untt 46161504 S 700.00 | § 10,500,00
30 30 ea Traffflc Signal Bus interface Unit 46161504| § 15500 S 4,650.00
31 150 ea Green LED Signal Lamp 46161504| $ 4000 5 6,000.00
32 150 €2 Yellow LED Slgnal Lamp 46161504] $ 4000 | $ 6,000.00
33 150 ea Red LED Signal Lamp 46161504 $ 4000 & 6,000.00
34 30 ea LED Pedestrain Slgnal Head with Housing and Mounting Hardware 46161504| § 300.00| S 9,000.00
35 30 ea Audible Pedestrian Push Button 46161504| S 57000 § 17,100.00
a6 50 €3 TS1 Cabinet Power Supply 46161504 S 22000 | $ 11,000.00
37 15 ea T52 Cablnet Power Supply 46161504| S 42500] S 6,375.00
38 5 e3 Time Clacks 46161504| § 475.00| § 2,375.00
39 S0 e3 SEK Wired Modems 46161504 5 125.00 | § 6,250.00
40 20 €3 Flash Transfer Relays 45161504 $ 2500 $ 500.00
41 5 ea Solar Flasher Controlier 46161504| $ 125.00| § 625,00
42 S ea Solar Flasher Motor Unit® 46161504 $ 2400 $ 120.00
SECTION 10 o
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tem Estimated Unit of UNSPC
Number | Quantities | Measure Description CODE Unit Price Total Cost
43 20 ea ENCOM Radio Transceivers or equlvalent 46161504 $ 1,150.00| § 23,000.00
SECTION 11
44 10 ea intulcom Radie Transceivers or equivalent 46161504 S - No Bid

Data sheets Attached for items 25 and 26 as current equivalent models from Tomar.

The solar flasher motor unit described by P/N RU4204 [n the spec is an AC driven flasher. We
have bld an equivalent. However, we feel this should have been a DC driven flasher for a
solar application. For 3 solar powered flasher, we would bld an Eltec P/N F5-3 at a cost of

$190.00 each. See attached data sheet.
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0 Series Detectors

4090 Seri €S OPTICAL PREEMPTION DETECTORS

TOMAR's 4090 Series Optical Preemption Detectors
sense the optical pulses emitted by properly equipped
emergency or transit vehicles. Mounted to observe
the approaches of an intersection, 4090 Detectors are
used with TOMAR 2000, 3000 and 4000 Series Optical
Signal Processors to inform the traffic control system
of the presence of designated vehicles.

The 4090-x-ST detectors incorpotate a self-test feature
for true closed loop detector and wiring welfare
monitoting. Each 4090-X-ST detector includes a small
infrared LED which periodically injects a special test
signal into the detectors photo sensor. The 2140, 3140
and 47140 Series OSPs receive the special test signal
and therefore know that the detector is fully functional.
Should a detector fail selftest a front panel indication
and ah entry in the OSP log indicate the problem.

Using 4090 Series detectors and Strobecom I
throughout your traffic control system reduces
emergency respanse time, allows emergency vehicles
to travel with greater safety, and improves transit
vehicles timeliness.

TOMAR 4090 Series Detectors offer these impertant
features:

Closed loop self-tast for detactor welfare, monitoring
and reporting (ST models only).

Military derived sensor technology for direct sunlight
rejection and detaction performance unmatched by
ANY other system,

Fully encapsulated electronics for complete
resistance to water, heat, and vibration.

Complete efectronics protection from damage due
to miswiring or electrical transients.

Simple advanced detector installation without any
special cabling for enhanced detection around
corners and over hills.

Tool-less tilt/swivel for each detector head makas
aiming easy




Rece ived: 8043791016 Feb 6 2020 01:17om PO
FEB/06/2020/THU 12:47 P RGA LLC. PAX No. 804-373-1016 P 014

“Optical Preemption & Priority C"c‘};‘xi?‘croi Systems -

Specifications for 4090 Series Detectors

(R , P : .
| tem - Description
Maximum Range ' 2500 feet minimum wien usad wath a TOMAR Optical Signal Processor.
- QOptiea| Pulse Rlse Time Oiscrimination " The 4090 Ssries input stages ere optimized for the detection of strobe pulses with a rise time from atart m‘

- pulse to peak of pulse of 10 microseconds or fess. Slower pulses such as varying sunlight and incandescent
- emergency lighting will be highly attenuated and substantislly ignored by the datector's digital
: dtsc« iminators.

4090-%-5T zelf tasting detectors The 4090-%¢-5T Serles incorporate & self-test feature for true closed lcop detector sensor and wiring
o ‘ ¢ welfare monitaring.
Fisld of View : 13 degrees conical centersd about the viewport normal axis {typical).
Pawer Requirements VOUTAGE: 12 to 30VDC CURRENT: 15 mA maximum
Wiring Connections i Blus Wire - GROUND
: Yellow - SIGNAL
. Orange Wire ~ +12 10 30 VDC

Shieid and Drain Wire - CONNECT TQ BLUE WIRE AT TRAFFIC CABINET
. Temperatire Range ' -40° Celscus to +75° Celsita
The 4090 Sarlee enclosures are black glass-fllled uv stablllzed polyamide suitable for all-weather use. All

. slectronic Sreuitry i completely encapsuleted in polyurethane for protection from shock, vibration, and
. maoisture, A weep hole is provided for alfowing the ascape of condensation or other imternal moiature build-

" up in the sight tube of the detector. - -

Mounting Ths 4090 Series are easily mourted using standard hardware on enther gpan wire or mast arm. The unit hss a
. 3/4” fermals pipe mount hub and intemal terminal block for connection to a 3/C shielded detactor cable.

" Physical Construction

“rev See catalog page 23 for available mounting hardware.

4090 detector serles nrdarmg mformatlon

i
!

- e - e
; i
:

4090-1-SD | Ope diraction, one channe! detector, no self-test
i {for model 2070, 2080, and 3080 oprical signal
proc::sors)

; 4090-21-SD Two direznon one channel detector, no solf-tost
! ! Har model 2070, 2060, and 3080 optical signal
3 processors)

40%0-22-5D | Two dlrecuon two chanuel derecto- na se{f test |
{for model 2070, 2080, and 3080 eptical signsl |
processors) !
]

}

L

; 4090-1-ST One direction, one channe! detector, with self-test
: i {for model 2140, 3140, and 4140 optical signat
procmssors)

4090-21-87 Two direction, one channel detector, with self-test
(for madef 2140, 3140, and 4140 optical signal
pracessars)

4090-22-ST I Twe direction, two thannel detactor, with self-test
: {for model 2140, 3140, and 4140 optjce| signal
| processors)

TRUE 10 Year Warranty!
10 year warranty covers the 4090 Series and all STROBECOM apaer o .

Il components. Unlike ather manufacturers, TOMAR's ten . . .
year warranty has NO fees or charges for warsanty repairs
after five years.

NOTICE: The sale of these items are reswicted to state and local governments and to autharized distributors only.
TOMAR Eleteanlzs, Int.

TOMAR Elactronics, Inc, 2100 W. Obispo Ave.  Gilbert, AZ 85233 USA  (300) 338-3133te]  (800) 688-6627 fax  www.tomar.com

PUR-012¢
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CLEARTHGTHE WAY

» INTEGRATED CONFIRMATION technology
powers IC enabled 4000 series TOMAR
Strobecom |l detectors to be powered and
controlled over the standard preemption
detector cable. No additional power supplies,
mounting, programming, or wiring required.

¢ TRUE CONFIRMATION, when combined with
INTEGRATED CONFIRMATION is the only
preemption system that provides real,
closed-loop, visual feedback to vehicle drivers
that the intersection is in preempt

¢ Active Reflection Suppression prevents cross
street preemption due to reflected emitter
energy. TOMAR's advanced digital signal
processing eliminates this troublesome side
effect making detector installation and setup
far less critical.

» PLUG-and-PLAY firmware allows the addition
of detectors and other accessofies to the
system without manual configuration. Buy only
the equipment needed today and add more
capability later saving precious funds.

» Expansion Port provides easy connection of
the 4080V2-2 to other accessory modules

Feb § 2000010 PO
P. 015

FAX No. 804-379-1016

4080V2-2

4080 Version 2, two channel, optical signal
processor with Integrated Confirmation

Installed inside the traffic cabinet, the 4080V2-2 optical signal
processor provides power for 4000 series optical detectors,
receives, decodes, and prioritizes emitter signals from the
detectors, powers and activates Integrated Confirmation

lights.

Equipped with TOMAR's patented (US patent 8,742,946)
INTEGRATED CONFIRMATION technology, the 4080V2-2
powers and controls the high intensity LED confirmation lights
integrated into up to four 4000 series IC enabled detectors
over standard preemption detector cable with no additional
power supply, mounting, programming, or wiring, Integrated
Confirmation equipped intersections provide visual feedback
of intersection preemption to vehicle drivers and citizens for
enhanced safety. When combined with TOMAR's True
Confirmation feature the integrated LED confirmation lights
provide real closed-loop visual feedback that the traffic
controller is actually in preemption providing . enhanced
right-of-way.

The 4080V2-2 is delivered default programmed to respond on
a first-come first-served basis to optical signals from vehicles
within two signal bands. Emergency Band signals are typically
emitted by emergency vehicles to effect a preemption of
normal traffic control timing and are given the highest priority
to allow rapid emergency vehicle response with enhanced
safety. Transit Band signals are generally emitted by transit or
other non-emergency municipal vehicles to effect a priority
change for the vehicle’s approach direction without necessarily
interrupting traffic control timing. Up to 65,000 vehicles in each
signal band can be individually identified and responded to.

The 4080V2-2 OSP is compatible with NEMA TS-1, TS-2, and
CA/NY 170 and 2070 controllers, and meets all NEMA and
Caltrans environmental requirements. The 4080V2-2 plugs
directly into standard preemption card slots and does not use
internal 24VDC cabinet power. For controllers without a
preemption card slot the TOMAR 1881 rack provides the
necessary hardware and harnessing to allow simple connection
to detectors and controller inputs,




FEB/06/2020/TEU 12:47 PM

TOW/

TLERRING THE

WAY

Feb & 2000 01:1mn
P.016

Rece ived:8043791016
FAX No. 804-379-1016

RGA LLC.

Specifications
[ Item E Description
1 Signal The 4080V2-2 shall be capable of recsiving, decoding, and prioritizing the Emergency band

and Transit band signals transemitted by ofl TOMAR and compstitive emitters. The 4080v2-2
shall be jumper configurable to acceEt or reject older non-identifying optical signals. Up to
65,000 vehicles in sach signal band shall be individually identifiable.

Signal Acqulsition Time

Typical signal acquisition time shall be approximately 2.5 seconds. Acquisition time will vary
depending on the numker of signals presert simultaneously and on the density of optical

noise,
Range 2500 feet maximum adjusteble down to 200 feet in 255 steps for each signal band and each
approach.

Priority Determination

The 4080V2-2 zhall be delivered with default priori;y groupme, responding on a first-come,
first-served basis to gignalz within each signal band. Signals in the Emergency signal band shall
be given priarity over signals in the transit signal band.

Using configuration jumpers, the user can enable or disable certain signal types, modify transit
priority, configure the confirmation light patterns, and enable or disable True Confirmation

operations.

Output Signals

The 4080V2-2 shall provide two optically-isolated output channels for plecing NEMA
standard signal level calls on traffic controller praempt (nputs.

Input Signals

The 4080V2-2 shall have two optically-lsalated inputs for connacting to traffic controller
presmpt status outputs.

Confirmation Lights

The 4080V2-2 shall be capable of powering and operating up to two TOMAR 4000 serles
Integrated Conflrmation enshled detectors over up to 600’ of presmption detector cable
per (C enabled detector.

Maximum Detectors

Ur ta two 4000 series [C enabled detectors {maximum of four LED confirmatian lights total)
plus four additional non-IC enabled detectors

Electrical Requirernents

120/240VAC 50/60Hz

Temperature Range

-40to +75 degrees C

Transient Protection

Input power shall be MOV protected from AC maing trensionts. Detsctor inputs shall be TVS
pratected from alectrical transients.

Fusing

A Y% amp fuse shall be included in the input power connection to protect cabinet wiring

Ordering Info

'5C'at.alog Number .. - Description o : . ]
4080V2-2 Two channel Optical Signal Processor with
INTEGRATED CONFIRMATION.

TRUE 10 YERR WARRANTY!

POt

10 year warranty covers the 4000 Series and all STROBECOM Il components. Unlike other manufacturers,
TOMAR's ten year warranty has NO fees or charges for warranty repairs after five years.

NOTICE: The sale of these items are restricted to state and local governments and to be authorized distributors only.
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FS-3 DC FLASHER

ELTEC’s FS-3 DC flasher for traffic warning systetns combines the funciionality of both the FS-2A (wig-
wag) and the FS-28 (RRFB) models. it uses salid state circuitry and an integrated microprocessor for
multiple programming options with minimal power consumption. it is typically mounted on the cabinet
back panei where there is a ready source of 11 4VDC-30VDC. The FS-3 is generally used in solar
powered flashing beacon caution systems but can also be integrated into AC systems (power supply
added.)

The FS-3isinterchangeable; the dimensions are the same asthe FS-2Aand FS-2B. When programming
the flash pattern for a Rectangular Rapid Ftashing Beacon (RRFB) pedestrian crossing, bothh FHWA
approved flash patterns are offered: either the preferred Wig-Wag plus Simultanecus (WW+S) or the
earlier flash pattern of 2/4-1.

STANDARD FEATURES
» Multiple Flash Patterns « Low Power Consumplion

- Round Beacons: Wig-Wag « Multipurpose Programming
* Duty Cycle of 50% ON/OFF (2 LEDs) » Night Run Only Feature: Dusk to Dawn
* Duty Cycle of 40% ON/ 60% OFF (1 LED) « Optionat Night Dimming (with photo celf)

- Rectangular Rapid Flashing Beacons (RRFB)
* WWS
* /41

ELIEC
FS-3

12/24 VBC PLASHER

SLECTROIROINKS CORP.

P
SR 2775
oL IBOCIAR o

SPECIFICATIONS

DIimensions ... ccvverrnarrrrrasssesecas et et e et e en et e 164"H x 5.5"L x 2.65"W
Input Voltage RaNGe ... o.ecerrenieeeeeee e sttt v ettt et 11.4VDC 1o 30VDC
Maximum LOAU POWET ...........cocvrveererercnecaesiamsssecrevssamssaresssrenne 40 Watts per Output Circuit
Temperature RaNGe ... oo rscs st e s 34°Cto+74° C
FIASH CIECUILS «..cee ettt cecnrasre e et sens s resssssa e s e s sana st a e anseans 1 or 2 Circuits
Flash Rates.....ccccoooeoiiiciiineas 75 *FPM for RRFB pattems; 55 FPM for Wig-Wag patterns
Night DIMMING ..ot Automatic via Photocell (may be disabled)
Night RUN Ol ....coccoeeein i v e e Enabled/Disabfed via Internal Switch

*Ftashes Per Minute

ELECTROTECHNICS CORPORATION
1310 Commeice Street, Marshall, TX 75672

800-227-1734 903-938-1901 Fax 903-838-1977

sales@elteccorp.com Rov. 1216
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West Virginia Ethics Commission

Disclosureof-Interested Parties to Contracts

Pursuant to W. Va. Code § 6D-1-2, a state agency may not enter into a contract, or a sefies of related
contracls, that has/have an aclual or estimated value of $1 million or tore until the business entity submits
to the coniracting state agency a Disdosure of Interested Parties to the applicable conract. in addition,
the business entity awarded a contract is obligated to submiit a supplemental Disclosure of Interested
Parties reflecting any new or differing interested parties to the contract within 30 days following the
completion or termination of the applicable contract.

Far purposes of camplying with these reguirements, the following definitions apply:

"Business entlly” means any entity recognized by law through which business is conducted, Including a
sole proprietarship, partnership or corperation, but does not include publicly traded companies listed on a
national or international stock exchange.

“Interested party® or "Interesied parlies’ means:

(1) A business entity performing wark or service pursuant to, or in furtherance of, the applicable contract,
incluging specifically sub-cantractors;

(2) the person(s) who have an ownership interost equal to or greater than 25% in the business ehtity
performing work or service pursuant to, or in furtherance of, the applicatide cortract. (This subdivision

does not apply to a publicly traded company); and
(3) the person or business entity, if any, that served as a compensated broker or intermediary to actively

fagilitate the applicabie conlract or negotiated the terms of the applicable contract with the stats agency,
(This subdivisicn does not apply to persons or business entities performing legal services related to
the negotiation or drafting of the applicable cantract.)

"Stafe agency” means a board, commission, office, department or other agency in the executive, judicial
or legislative branch of siate government, including publicly funded institutions of higher education:
Provided, that for purposes of W. Va. Code § 6D-1-2, the West Virginla Investment Management Board
shall not be deemed 1 state agency nor aubject to the requirements of thet provision.

The contracting business entity must complete this form and submit it to the contracting state agency priar
to contract award and to complete another form within 30 days of contract completion or termination.

This form was created by the State of West Virginia Ethics Commission, 210 Brooks Street, Sufte 300,
Chartestan, WV 25301-1804. Telephone: (304)658-0864; fax: (304)558-2169; e-mail; pthics@wv.qoy:

webslte: www.othics, wv.qov.

Revissd June 8, 2018
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West Virginia Ethics Commission
Disclosure of interested Parties to Contracts
{Required by W. Va. Code § 6D-1-2)

Name of Contracting Business Entity: M""Tffﬁ , (ﬁLc Addrees: 1550 STANDNG RIIGE DR
RouATaN . VA 23137

Name of Authorized Agent: N/A* Address:

Contract Number: DOT 2.00¢00 1/ 1 Contract Description: TRAFRC. §iatrvi( R

Governmentu) agency awarding sontract: verr °{l TMO%'ZT"@

O Check here if this Is a S8upplemental Disclosure

List the Names of Interested Parties to the contract which are known or reasanably anticipated by the contracting business
entity for each category below (altach addiional peges If necessary):

1. Subedntractors or other entitles performing work or service under the Contract
Check here if none, othefwise list entity/individual names below.

2. Anygerson or entity who owns 25% or more of contracting entity (not applicable to publicly traded entities)
Check here if none, otherwige list entity/individual names below.

3. Any person or entity that facllitated, or negotiated the terms of, the applicable cantract (excluding legal
e related to the negotiation or drafting of the applicable contract)

ck here if none, otherwise list entity/individual nemes helow.

Che
Signature: /’Z.._- /ﬁ(ﬁ Dete Signed: __ 2./4 T@o

Notary Veriffcation
state of _V1€p(014 , County of __ POLAHATAL)
l, Pwe D THowBerd , the authorized agent of the contracting business
entity listed above, being duly swom, acknowledge that the Disclosure hereln is being made under oath and under the
penatty of perjury.
4

Takan, swom to and subscribed before me this __ (. = day of __FEBRvML , 2020

Notaty Public’s Sigagtuee THOMPSON
Tab I State A T P’é‘ikf'm?a.m of Virginia
Date Received by State Agsncy; Notary Publle
Date submitted to Ethice Commission: g | Commeion N T 0%
Governmental agency submitting Disclosure: My Commis

Reviged June 8, 2018
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STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Dlvislon

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS: Under W. Va. Code § 522-1(i), the contracling public enlity shall not award a
conglruction contract to any bidder that is known o be in default on any monetary obligation cwed to the state or a
polifical aubdivision of the state, including, but not limited to, oblfgations related to payroli taxes, property taxes, sales and
use taxes, fire servica fees, or other fines or fees,

ALL CONTRACTS: Under W. Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awanded by the state
or any of its poiftical subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor whet the vendor or prospective vender or a related
parly to the vendor or prospective vender is a deblor and: (1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand
dolters in the aggregate; or {2) the debtor i in employer dafault.

EXGEPTION: The prohibition listed above doas not apply where a vendor has contested any tax adminiatered pursuant to chapter
glevan of he W. Va. Code, workers' compensation pramium, parmit fee or environmental fee or ugsescment and the matter has
not become final or where the vendor has entared into & payment pian or sgreement and the vondor le not in defaull of any of the
provisions of such plan or agreement,

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt" means any assessment, premium, penelty, fine, tax or other amount af money owed to tha state or any of ita political
subdivisione because of a judgment, fins, pammit vicigtion, license sesessment, defaulted warkers' compensalion premium, penalty
or tither s3sarsment pressntly delinquant or due and requirad t be paid to the stale or any of i (editical subdivisfons, including
any Interast or additionsl pensitfes accruad therson,

“Employar dofault™ mears having an oulstanding balancs or liablkty 1o the old fund or to the uningured employers' fund or being
n policy defauk, as defined In W, Va. Code § 23-2¢-2, fallure fo meintalin mandatory warkore' compenaation covarage, or faijtre to
flly meet its obligations as & workers' compensatian eelf-inaured employer. An employer is fot in employer default If 1t has entered
inta a repayment agreament with the Insurance Commissloner end remeins in compliance with the obllgations under the

repayment agreement.

“Related party” means a parly, whether an individual, corponation, parinerahip, association, imied liabifity company or any other
form or buelness association or other entity whatscever, related fo any vendar by biood. marisge, owrership or cantract through
which the parly hae & relationship of ownership or ather interest with the venidor so that the party will aciually or by effect recelve or
control @ postion of the benefit, profit or other eonslderetion from perfarmanca of a vendor contract with the party recafving an
amount that meeta or exceed Eve parcant of the folal contract amount,

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor's authorized gigner affirme and acknowledges under penalty of
law for falee swearing (W. Va. Code §61-8-3) that: (1) for construction contracts, the vendor is not In default on
any monbsfary obligation owed to the state or a political subdivision of tha state, and (2) for all other contracts,

that neither vendor nor any rolated party owe a debt as defined above and that nalther vendor nor any related
party are in empioyer defsuit as deflnad above, uniess the debt or employer default Is permitted under the

axception above.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:

Vendor's Name: Mo be 77'3)4 > ( ao-

Authorized Signsture: /FL- k Date: 2‘/4- (20

State of ViRgoine 4 g
Countyof _iDigatfaTirr towit

Taken, subscribed, and swom to before me this_& day of _FEBZdé 2080
My Commission expires e 3¢ , 2023,

//Z( s
AFFIX SEAL HERE NOTARY PUBLIC

Furchacing Atlidsvit (Revisad 01/19/2018)

PAUL DAVIO THOMPSON
Commonwealth of Virginla
Natary Public
Commission No, 7328571
My Commissicn Expires 12/31/2023
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DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as the
Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this Contract,

j’uSoﬂ A“l“"f:!"-fm! j;\s(LL S«[q KQ,proSe)\H\‘-‘:UC
(Nﬁhe, Title) !

(Vrinted Ntfie and Title)

_IS%0 steatiny Rilye Dy Rowbotnn U 23i39
(Address) / /

KoY- $73-8H(Z

(Phone Number) / (Fax Number)

d/ﬂmbl_rf‘:.f (28 Mobvh‘vi L Lovn ' .
(emajl address)

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentstion
through wvOASIS, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand
the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid, offer
or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unileterally withdrawn; that the product
or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements comtained in the Solicitation for that
product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and
conditiona contained in the Solicitation, inless otherwise stated herein; that I am submitting this
bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; that T am authorized by the vendor to execute
and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor’s behalf; that

I am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to the best of my
knowledge, the vendor has properly registered with any State agency that may require
registration,

Mo(n'hu( g T

(Cqmpany)

(#luthorizeli Sfenature) (Representative Name, Title)
'D:.)ev\ /iH-tLerf-r j:za'\lu Sktus Qt.?%SmJ-wHVL

(Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative)

ez/ hé/zow
(Date) '

70M- 795~ 41 i
(Phone Nomber) (Fax Number)

Revised 01/09/2020




