
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Proc Folder :

Solicitation Description :

Proc Type :

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

Solicitation Response

Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East

Charleston, WV 25305-0130
Post Office Box 50130

State of West Virginia

677076

ADDENDUM 2 ASPHALT - MAT. AND PICKUP BY WVDOH  (6620C037)

Central Master Agreement

2020-01-30

13:30:00

SR 0803 ESR01292000000004451 1

 VENDOR

000000203375

KELLY PAVING INC

Comments:

Total Bid : Response Date: Response Time:Total Bid : 

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2000000108

$0.00 2020-01-29 12:10:23

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Signature on File FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001

Crystal G Hustead

(304) 558-2402
crystal.g.hustead@wv.gov
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

1 ASPHAT MATERIALS AND PICKUP
BY WVDOH

0.00000 EA $0.000000 $0.00

30121601

ASPHALT - MATERIALS AND PICKUP BY WVDOH PER THE ATTACHED PRICING PAGES/E-CATALOG

Comments: Kelly Paving Weirton, Plant #23















































































SUPPLIER 

PART NUMBER

SUPPLIER NAME MANUFACTURER PART 

NUMBER

ITEM 

DESCRIPTION

EXTENDED DESCRIPTION UNIT OF 

MEASURE

LIST PRICE DELIVERY 

DAYS

1-A 1-A Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No bid 5
1-B 1-B Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No bid 5
1-C 1-C Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No bid 5
1-D 1-D Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No bid 5
1-E 1-E Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No bid 5
1-F 1-F Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No bid 5
1-G 1-G Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No bid 5
1-H 1-H Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No bid 5
1-I 1-I Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
1-J 1-J Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No bid 5
1-K 1-K Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No bid 5
1-L 1-L Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No bid 5
1-M 1-M Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No bid 5
1-N 1-N Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No bid 5
1-O 1-O Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No bid 5
1-OA 1-OA Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
1-OB 1-OB Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
1-P 1-P Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No bid 5
1-Q 1-Q Asphalt District 1 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No bid 5
1-R 1-R Asphalt District 1 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No bid 5
1-AQ1 1-AQ1 Asphalt District 1 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No bid 5
1-AQ2 1-AQ2 Asphalt District 1 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No bid 5
2-A 2-A Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No bid 5
2-B 2-B Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No bid 5
2-C 2-C Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No bid 5
2-D 2-D Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No bid 5
2-E 2-E Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No bid 5
2-F 2-F Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No bid 5
2-G 2-G Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No bid 5
2-H 2-H Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No bid 5
2-I 2-I Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
2-J 2-J Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No bid 5
2-K 2-K Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No bid 5
2-L 2-L Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No bid 5
2-M 2-M Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No bid 5
2-N 2-N Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No bid 5
2-O 2-O Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No bid 5
2-OA 2-OA Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
2-OB 2-OB Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
2-P 2-P Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No bid 5
2-Q 2-Q Asphalt District 2 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No bid 5
2-R 2-R Asphalt District 2 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No bid 5
2-AQ1 2-AQ1 Asphalt District 2 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No bid 5
2-AQ2 2-AQ2 Asphalt District 2 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No bid 5
3-A 3-A Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No bid 5

REVISED 1/24/2020
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3-B 3-B Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No bid 5
3-C 3-C Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No bid 5
3-D 3-D Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No bid 5
3-E 3-E Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No bid 5
3-F 3-F Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No bid 5
3-G 3-G Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No bid 5
3-H 3-H Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No bid 5
3-I 3-I Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
3-J 3-J Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No bid 5
3-K 3-K Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No bid 5
3-L 3-L Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No bid 5
3-M 3-M Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No bid 5
3-N 3-N Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No bid 5
3-O 3-O Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No bid 5
3-OA 3-OA Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
3-OB 3-OB Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
3-P 3-P Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No bid 5
3-Q 3-Q Asphalt District 3 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No bid 5
3-R 3-R Asphalt District 3 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No bid 5
3-AQ1 3-AQ1 Asphalt District 3 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No bid 5
3-AQ2 3-AQ2 Asphalt District 3 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No bid 5
4-A 4-A Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No bid 5
4-B 4-B Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No bid 5
4-C 4-C Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No bid 5
4-D 4-D Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No bid 5
4-E 4-E Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No bid 5
4-F 4-F Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No bid 5
4-G 4-G Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No bid 5
4-H 4-H Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No bid 5
4-I 4-I Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
4-J 4-J Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No bid 5
4-K 4-K Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No bid 5
4-L 4-L Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No bid 5
4-M 4-M Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No bid 5
4-N 4-N Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No bid 5
4-O 4-O Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No bid 5
4-OA 4-OA Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
4-OB 4-OB Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
4-P 4-P Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No bid 5
4-Q 4-Q Asphalt District 4 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No bid 5
4-R 4-R Asphalt District 4 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No bid 5
4-AQ1 4-AQ1 Asphalt District 4 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No bid 5
4-AQ2 4-AQ2 Asphalt District 4 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No bid 5
5-A 5-A Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No bid 5
5-B 5-B Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No bid 5
5-C 5-C Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No bid 5
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5-D 5-D Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No bid 5
5-E 5-E Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No bid 5
5-F 5-F Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No bid 5
5-G 5-G Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No bid 5
5-H 5-H Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No bid 5
5-I 5-I Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
5-J 5-J Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No bid 5
5-K 5-K Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No bid 5
5-L 5-L Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No bid 5
5-M 5-M Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No bid 5
5-N 5-N Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No bid 5
5-O 5-O Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No bid 5
5-OA 5-OA Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
5-OB 5-OB Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
5-P 5-P Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No bid 5
5-Q 5-Q Asphalt District 5 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No bid 5
5-R 5-R Asphalt District 5 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No bid 5
5-AQ1 5-AQ1 Asphalt District 5 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No bid 5
5-AQ2 5-AQ2 Asphalt District 5 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No bid 5
6-A Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-A Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON $56.00 5
6-B Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-B Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON $58.00 5
6-C Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-C Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON $56.50 5
6-D Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-D Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON $56.50 5
6-E Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-E Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON $61.00 5
6-F Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-F Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON $63.50 5
6-G Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-G Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON $56.50 5
6-H Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-H Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON $63.00 5
6-I Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-I Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON $65.00 5
6-J Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-J Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON $63.00 5
6-K Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-K Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON $64.00 5
6-L Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-L Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON $69.50 5
6-M Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-M Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON $72.50 5
6-N Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-N Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON $72.00 5
6-O Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-O Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON $74.00 5
6-OA Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-OA Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON $65.00 5
6-OB Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-OB Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON $65.00 5
6-P Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-P Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Plant Run TON $63.00 5
6-Q Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-Q Asphalt District 6 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON $5.00 5
6-R Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-R Asphalt District 6 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON $8.50 5
6-AQ1 Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-AQ1 Asphalt District 6 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY $5,000.00 5
6-AQ2 Kelly Paving, Weirton Plant #23 6-AQ2 Asphalt District 6 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY $1,000.00 5
7-A 7-A Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No bid 5
7-B 7-B Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No bid 5
7-C 7-C Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No bid 5
7-D 7-D Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No bid 5
7-E 7-E Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No bid 5
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7-F 7-F Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No bid 5
7-G 7-G Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No bid 5
7-H 7-H Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No bid 5
7-I 7-I Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
7-J 7-J Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No bid 5
7-K 7-K Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No bid 5
7-L 7-L Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No bid 5
7-M 7-M Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No bid 5
7-N 7-N Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No bid 5
7-O 7-O Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No bid 5
7-OA 7-OA Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
7-OB 7-OB Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
7-P 7-P Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No bid 5
7-Q 7-Q Asphalt District 7 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No bid 5
7-R 7-R Asphalt District 7 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No bid 5
7-AQ1 7-AQ1 Asphalt District 7 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No bid 5
7-AQ2 7-AQ2 Asphalt District 7 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No bid 5
8-A 8-A Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No bid 5
8-B 8-B Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No bid 5
8-C 8-C Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No bid 5
8-D 8-D Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No bid 5
8-E 8-E Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No bid 5
8-F 8-F Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No bid 5
8-G 8-G Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No bid 5
8-H 8-H Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No bid 5
8-I 8-I Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
8-J 8-J Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No bid 5
8-K 8-K Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No bid 5
8-L 8-L Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No bid 5
8-M 8-M Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No bid 5
8-N 8-N Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No bid 5
8-O 8-O Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No bid 5
8-OA 8-OA Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
8-OB 8-OB Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
8-P 8-P Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No bid 5
8-Q 8-Q Asphalt District 8 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No bid 5
8-R 8-R Asphalt District 8 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No bid 5
8-AQ1 8-AQ1 Asphalt District 8 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No bid 5
8-AQ2 8-AQ2 Asphalt District 8 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No bid 5
9-A 9-A Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No bid 5
9-B 9-B Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No bid 5
9-C 9-C Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No bid 5
9-D 9-D Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No bid 5
9-E 9-E Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No bid 5
9-F 9-F Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No bid 5
9-G 9-G Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No bid 5
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9-H 9-H Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No bid 5
9-I 9-I Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
9-J 9-J Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No bid 5
9-K 9-K Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No bid 5
9-L 9-L Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No bid 5
9-M 9-M Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No bid 5
9-N 9-N Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No bid 5
9-O 9-O Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No bid 5
9-OA 9-OA Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
9-OB 9-OB Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
9-P 9-P Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No bid 5
9-Q 9-Q Asphalt District 9 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No bid 5
9-R 9-R Asphalt District 9 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No bid 5
9-AQ1 9-AQ1 Asphalt District 9 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No bid 5
9-AQ2 9-AQ2 Asphalt District 9 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No bid 5
10-A 10-A Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No bid 5
10-B 10-B Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No bid 5
10-C 10-C Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No bid 5
10-D 10-D Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No bid 5
10-E 10-E Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No bid 5
10-F 10-F Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No bid 5
10-G 10-G Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No bid 5
10-H 10-H Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No bid 5
10-I 10-I Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
10-J 10-J Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No bid 5
10-K 10-K Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No bid 5
10-L 10-L Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No bid 5
10-M 10-M Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No bid 5
10-N 10-N Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No bid 5
10-O 10-O Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No bid 5
10-OA 10-OA Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
10-OB 10-OB Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No bid 5
10-P 10-P Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No bid 5
10-Q 10-Q Asphalt District 10 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No bid 5
10-R 10-R Asphalt District 10 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No bid 5
10-AQ1 10-AQ1 Asphalt District 10 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No bid 5
10-AQ2 10-AQ2 Asphalt District 10 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No bid 5



VENDOR NAME ______________________________________________________Kelly Paving, Inc., Rayland Division

If a Vendor will be supplying materials from multiple Plant Locations and ALL pricing is the same, ALL Plant

Locations can be listed on one Information Attachment Form and one bid submission is acceptable.

If a Vendor will be supplying materials from multiple Plant Locations, at varying prices, additional , separate

bid submissions must be submitted for each Plant Location bid.  Multple Plant Locations with varying prices,

Vendor's Plant Location:

Vendor's Plant Location:

Vendor's Plant Location:

Vendor's Plant Location:

INFORMATION ATTACHMENT FORM

Vendor’s Storage Sites

Asphalt - Materials and Pickup by WVDOH Forces, ONLY

Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.

shall be submitted on separate bid submissions.

Kelly Paving, Inc., Weirton, Plant #23

4260 Freedom Way

Weirton, WV 26062

Plant Manager: Ken Vargo

Phone (304) 748-1450

Cell (740) 819-4834


