
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Proc Folder :

Solicitation Description :

Proc Type :
Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

Solicitation Response
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East

Charleston, WV 25305-0130
Post Office Box 50130

State of West Virginia

658944
HERBICIDES, ADJUVANTS & MISC. (6620C029)

Central Master Agreement

2020-01-29
13:30:00

SR 0803 ESR01242000000004332 1

 VENDOR
000000120160

ARBORCHEM PRODUCTS

Comments:

Total Bid : Response Date: Response Time:Total Bid : 

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2000000106

$0.00 2020-01-24 14:01:39

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Signature on File FEIN # DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001

Crystal G Hustead
(304) 558-2402
crystal.g.hustead@wv.gov
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

1 HERBICIDES ,ADJUVANTS & MISC.
PRODUCTS

0.00000 EA $0.010000 $0.00

10171700

PRICING TO BE INCLUDED ON ATTACHED PRICING PAGES

Comments: Todd Hagenbuch 570-401-7098



Arborchem Products (Division of Asplundh Tree Expert LLC) 

941 Nixon Drive 

Mechanicsburg, PA 17055 

Todd Hagenbuch 570-401-7098 

Office 717-766-6661

           Todd Hagenbuch 23-1277550 1-15-20











































   Sales Manager and Vegetation Management Specialist

Todd Hagenbuch      Sales Manager and Vegetation Management Specialist

           Todd Hagenbuch

941 Nixon Drive Mechanicsburg, PA 17055

570-401-7098/ 717-795-8234

thagenbuch@arborchem.com

Arborchem Products (Division of Asplundh Tree Expert LLC)

           Todd Hagenbuch Sales Manager

Todd Hagenbuch  Sales Manager

1-15-20

570-401-7098   &   717-795-8234
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Proc Folder:

Doc Description:

Proc Type:
Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version

Request for Quotation
State of West Virginia

2019 Washington Street East
Purchasing Divison

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 19 Highways

658944

HERBICIDES, ADJUVANTS & MISC. (6620C029)

Central Master Agreement

2020-01-10 2020-01-29
13:30:00

CRFQ 0803 DOT2000000106 1

 BID RECEIVING LOCATION

  VENDOR                                                                                                                   
Vendor Name, Address and Telephone Number:

BID CLERK
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
PURCHASING DIVISION
2019 WASHINGTON ST E
CHARLESTON WV 25305
US

FORM ID : WV-PRC-CRFQ-001

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
DATEFEIN # Signature X 

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Crystal G Hustead
(304) 558-2402
crystal.g.hustead@wv.gov

Arborchem Products (Division of Asplundh Tree Expert LLC) 

941 Nixon Drive 

Mechanicsburg, PA 17055 

717-766-6661 office 

717-795-8234 fax

Contract contact: Todd Hagenbuch 570-401-7098 

 thagenbuch@arborchem.com

           Todd Hagenbuch 23-1277550 1-24-20
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 ADDITIONAL INFORMATION:                                                                                                        

THE STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA PURCHASING DIVISION FOR THE AGENCY, WEST VIRGINIA DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS, IS SOLICITING
BIDS TO ESTABLISH AN OPEN-END CONTRACT FOR HERBICIDES, ADJUVANTS, AND MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS PER THE
ATTACHED DOCUMENTS.

***QUESTIONS REGARDING THE SOLICITATION MUST BE SUBMITTED IN WRITING TO CRYSTAL.G.HUSTEAD@WV.GOV PRIOR TO THE
QUESTION PERIOD DEADLINE CONTAINED IN THE INSTRUCTIONS TO VENDORS SUBMITTING BIDS***

 INVOICE TO                                                                                                           SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS
AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999

US

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 HERBICIDES ,ADJUVANTS & MISC.

PRODUCTS
0.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

10171700

PRICING TO BE INCLUDED ON ATTACHED PRICING PAGES

 SCHEDULE OF EVENTS                                                                                                        

EventLine Event Date
1 VENDOR QUESTION DEADLINE 2020-01-17





                                                                                      Herbicide Ajuvant Misc & Products

                                                                                             Exhibit A Pricing Page- Herbicide

                                                                                          

the Product Trade Name and EPA Registration number for each product that the Vendor is bidding whether the Vendor

is bidding the Product Trade Name requested or an "or equal" product.

If the Vendor fails to provide the required information, the Vendor's bid will be disqualified for that Contract Item.

HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per

Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost

DOH-1H Water Soluble Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing:

    Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate   

    Phosphate Ester Surfactant 50.20%

Product Trade Name:  Roundup Pro Concentrate or equal _________

EPA Registration Number: 524-529

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 6000 gallon 20.00$         120,000.00$   

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 6000 gallon 20.00$         120,000.00$   

C) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 6000 gallon 20.00$         120,000.00$   
D) Supplied in 265 gallon returnable/refillable shuttle. 500 gallon 20.00$         10,000.00$     

DOH-2H Dispersible Granules Containing:  Sulfometuron Methyl 75%

Product Trade Name:  Oust XP or equal _______________________

EPA Registration Number: 432-1552

A) Supplied in 3 pound containers in lots of 24 pounds (8 - 31 lbs ctn) 100 pound 35.00$         3,500.00$       

B) Supplied in 3 pound containers 100 pound 35.00$         3,500.00$       

DOH-3H Aqueous Solution Containing:  Imazapyr 2 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Arsenal Powerline or equal  Bidding Polaris

EPA Registration Number: 228-534

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 150 gallon 59.50$         8,925.00$       

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 150 gallon 59.50$         8,925.00$       

DOH-4H Aqueous Carrier Containing:  Pendimethalin 3.8 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Pendulum AquaCap or equal ______________

EPA Registration Number: 241-416

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 600 gallon 65.00$         39,000.00$     

DOH-5H Water Soluble Concentrate Containing:  Triciopyr 3 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name: Garlon 3A 

EPA Registration Number: 62719-37

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 500 gallon 60.00$         30,000.00$     

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 500 gallon 60.00$         30,000.00$     

C) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 450 gallon 60.00$         27,000.00$     

DOH-6H Water Soluble Concentrate Containing:  Triciopyr 4 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Garlon 4 Ultra 

EPA Registration Number: 62719-527

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 250 gallon 79.00$         19,750.00$     

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 270 gallon 79.00$         21,330.00$     

C) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 240 gallon 79.00$         18,960.00$     

DOH-7H Water Soluble Liquid Containing:  Triciopyr 4 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Vastlan™ 

EPA Registration Number: 62719-687

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 250 gallon 87.50$         21,875.00$     

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 270 gallon 87.50$         23,625.00$     

C) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 240 gallon 87.50$         21,000.00$     

DOH-8H Water Soluble Dispersible Granule Containing:  Diuron 80.00%

Product Trade Name:  Karmex DF or equal ____________________

EPA Registration Number: 

A) Supplied in 5 pound bags in lots of 10 bags 1000 pound No Bid No Bid

B) Supplied in 25 pound bags 2000 pound No Bid No Bid

DOH-09H Water Soluble Liquid Containing:  Dimethylamine Salt of 2, 4-D acid 3.8 lbs/gallon/56.3%

Product Trade Name:  Freelexx or equal ______________________

EPA Registration Number: 62719-634

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon 20.00$         2,000.00$       

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 100 gallon 20.00$         2,000.00$       

C) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 100 gallon 20.00$         2,000.00$       

DOH-10H Water Soluble Liquid Containing Ammonium Salt of Imazapic 23.60%

Vendors may bid any or all Contract Items.  Per Section 3.2.2 of the contract specifications, the Vendor SHALL provide 



HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per

Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost

Product Trade Name:  Plateau or equal..Imazapic 2SL

EPA Registration Number: 71368-118

A) Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons 50 gallon 115.50$       5,775.00$       

DOH-11H Dispersible Liquid Containing:  Hexazinone 2 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Velpar L or equal _______________________

EPA Registration Number: 

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallon No Bid No Bid

DOH-12H Dry Flowable Containing:  Metsulfuron Methyl 60%

Product Trade Name:  Escort XP 

EPA Registration Number: 432-1549

A) Supplied in 16 ounce containers in lots of 8 pounds (8-16 oz ctn) 2400 ounce 3.25$           7,800.00$       

B) Supplied in 16 ounce containers 2400 ounce 3.25$           7,800.00$       

C) Supplied in 64 ounce returnable/refillable containers 2400 ounce No Bid No Bid

DOH-13H Dry Flowable Containing:  Chlorsulfuron 75%

Product Trade Name:  Telar XP

EPA Registration Number: 432-1561

A) Supplied in 16 ounce containers in lots of 8 pounds (8-16 oz ctn) 160 ounce 16.50$         2,640.00$       

DOH-14H Liquid Solution Containing:

    2, 4-D, 2- ethylhexyl ester                              32.45%

    2, 4-DP-p, 2-ethylhexyl ester 15.90%

    Dicamba            5.38%

Product Trade Name:  BK-800 or equal _______________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon No Bid No Bid

B) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 100 gallon No Bid No Bid

DOH-15H Dry Flowable Containing:  Tebuthiuron 20%

Product Trade Name:  Spike 20 P or equal _____________________

EPA Registration Number: 62719-121

A) Supplied in 4 pound containers in lots of 48 pounds (12 4 lbs ctn) 48 pound No Bid No Bid

B) Supplied in 25 pound bags 50 pound 9.99$           499.50$          

DOH-16H Water Soluble Emulsfiable Concentrate Containing:  Clopyralid 3 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Transline or equal ______________________

EPA Registration Number: 62719-259

A) Supplied in .5 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons 25 gallon No Bid No Bid

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 25 gallon 160.00$       4,000.00$       

DOH-17H Aqueous Solution Containing:

    Isopropylamine Salt of Imazapyr                                                    27.60%

Product Trade Name:  Polaris SP or equal   Bidding Polaris

EPA Registration Number: 228-534

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallon 59.50$         2,975.00$       

DOH-18H Aqueous Solution Containing:

    Diglycolamine Salt of 3, 6-Dichloro-0-Anisic Acid                       4 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Vanquish or equal _____________________

EPA Registration Number: 228-397

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 300 gallon 48.90$         14,670.00$     

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 300 gallon 50.50$         15,150.00$     

DOH-19H Aqueous Solution Containing:  Triciopyr .75 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Pathfinder II or equal ___________________

EPA Registration Number: 62719-176

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon 44.50$         4,450.00$       

DOH-20H Water Soluble Emulsfiable Concentrate Containing:

    Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate                                                    53.80%

Product Trade Name:  Rodeo or equal _______________________

EPA Registration Number: 62719-324

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon 21.00$         2,100.00$       

B) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 100 gallon 21.00$         2,100.00$       

DOH-21H Liquid Containing:  Aminopyralid 40.60%

Product Trade Name:  Milestone

EPA Registration Number:  62719-519

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 12 quarts 200 quarts 75.00$         15,000.00$     

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallon 300.00$       15,000.00$     

DOH-22H Water Dispersible Granular Material Containing:  Prodiamine 65%

Product Trade Name:  Endurance or equal     

EPA Registration Number: 



HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per

Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost

A) Supplied in 5 pound bags in lots of 50 pounds 100 pound No Bid No Bid

B) Supplied in 10 pound bags in lots of 50 pounds 100 pound No Bid No Bid

DOH-23H Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing:  Fluazifop-P-butyl 6.75%

Product Trade Name:  Ornamec or equal ______________________

EPA Registration Number: ____________________________________

A) Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons 16 gallon No Bid No Bid

DOH-24H Dispersible Granule Containing:

    Imazapyr                                                                                           7.78%

    Diuron                                                                                             62.22%

Product Trade Name:  Imazuron or equal ______________________

EPA Registration Number: 228-654

A) Supplied in 10 pound bags in lots of 40 pounds 50 pound 9.50$           475.00$          

DOH-25H Water Soluble Dry Granule Containing:  Sulfosulfuron 75%

Product Trade Name:  Outrider or equal _____________________

EPA Registration Number: 59639-223

A) Supplied in 20 ounce bottles in lots of 200 ounces (10 - 20 oz ctn) 400 ounce 15.00$         6,000.00$       

DOH-26H Liquid Containing:  Diuron 40%

Product Trade Name:  Diuron 4L or equal _____________________

EPA Registration Number: ____________________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallon No Bid No Bid

DOH-27H Liquid Containing:  Fluroxypyr 45.52%

Product Trade Name:  Vista XRT or equal ______________________

EPA Registration Number: 62719-586

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon 180.00$       18,000.00$     

DOH-28H Wettable Granule Formulation Containing:

    Sodium Salt of Diflufenzopy:  2-(1-[([3,5-Difluorophenylamino] 

    Carbonyl)-Hydrazono]ethyl)-3-Pyridinecarboxylic Acid, Sodium Salt                        21.30%

    Sodium Salt of Dicamba:  3,6-dichloro-o-anisic Acid                                          55.00%

Product Trade Name:  Overdrive or equal _____________________

EPA Registration Number: 7969-150

A) Supplied in 7.5 pound containers in lots of 30 pounds (4 - 7.5 lbs ctn) 100 pound 44.00$         4,400.00$       

DOH-29H Dispersible Granules Containing:

    Sulfometuron Methyl                                                                      56.25%

    Chlorsulfuron                                                                                 18.75%

Product Trade Name:  Landmark XP or equal __________________

EPA Registration Number: ____________________________________

A) Supplied in 4 pound containers in lots of 32 pounds (8 - 4 lbs ctn) 100 pound No Bid No Bid

B) Supplied in 64 ounce returnable/refillable containers 1600 ounce No Bid No Bid

DOH-30H Dispersible Granules Containing:

    Sulfometuron Methyl                                                                      56.25%

    Metsulfuron Methyl                                                                       15.00%

Product Trade Name:  Oust Extra or equal _____________________

EPA Registration Number: 432-1557

A) Supplied in 4 pound containers in lots of 32 pounds (8 - 4 lbs ctn) 400 pound 35.00$         14,000.00$     

B) Supplied in 64 ounce returnable/refillable containers 6400 ounce No Bid No Bid

C) Supplied in 12 pound containers 400 pound 35.00$         14,000.00$     

DOH-31H Dry Flowable Granule Containing:

    Bromacil                                                                                           40%

    Diuron                                                                                              40%

Product Trade Name:  Krovar I DF or equal ___________________

EPA Registration Number: ___________________________________

A) Supplied in 6 pound containers in lots of 48 pounds (8 - 6 lbs ctn) 50 pound No Bid No Bid

DOH-32H Liquid Containing:

    Dimethylamine Salt of 2,4-Dichlovophenoxyacetic Acid                      24.58%

    Dimethylamine Salt of Dicamba (3,6-Dichloro-o-Anisic Acid)               12.82%

Product Trade Name:  Veteran 720 or equal ___________________

EPA Registration Number: ___________________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon No Bid No Bid

B) Supplied in 30 gallon drums 100 gallon No Bid No Bid

DOH-33H Water Soluble Dispersible Extruded Paste Granule Containing:

    Imazapyr 31.60%

    Aminocyclopyrachlor 22.80%

    Metsulfuron methyl 7.30%



HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per

Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost

Product Trade Name:  Viewpoint™ or equal ___________________

EPA Registration Number: 432-1580

A) Supplied in 5 pound containers in lots of 40 pounds (8 - 5 lbs ctn) 100 pounds 69.00$         6,900.00$       

B) Supplied in 5 pound containers 100 pounds 69.00$         6,900.00$       

DOH-34H Non-Selective Control of Emerged and Pre-Emerged Broadleaf

and Grass Weeds Containing:

    Indaziflam 0.089%

    Diquat Dibromide 0.890%

    Glypghosat Isopropylamine Salt 20.460%

Product Trade Name:  Esplanade EZ or equal _________________

EPA Registration Number: 432-1528

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons 44.90$         2,245.00$       

DOH-35H Liquid Containing:

    Indaziflam                                               (1.67 pounds per gallon) 19.05%

Product Trade Name:  Esplanade 200SC or equal ______________

EPA Registration Number: 432-1516

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 1 gallon quart 327.04$       -$                

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons gallons 1,189.12$    -$                

DOH-36H A pre-emergence and early post-emergence product to control 

broadleaf weeds and annual grasses Containing:

    Penoxsulam: 2-(2,2-difluoroethoxy)-N-(5,8-dimethoxy[1,2,4]

       triazolo[1,5c]pyrimidin-2-yl)-6-(trifluoromethyl)benzenesulfonamide

    Oxyfluorfen: 2-chloro-1-(3-ethoxyl-4-nitrophenoxy)-4-(trifluoromethyl)

        benzene

Product Trade Name:  Cleantraxx™ or equal _________________

EPA Registration Number: 62719-702

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons 135.50$       6,775.00$       

DOH-37H Plant Growth Regulator Containing:

    Mefluidide, diethanolamine salt 21.45%

    Imazethapyr, ammonium salt 4.09%

    Imazapyr, ammonium salt 0.15%

Product Trade Name:  Stronghold or equal ____________________

EPA Registration Number: _________________________________

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 1 gallon 50 gallons No Bid No Bid

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons No Bid No Bid

DOH-38H Turf and Ornamental Growth Regulator Containing:

    Flauzifop-P-Butyl 24.50%

Product Trade Name:  Fusilade II or equal _________________

EPA Registration Number: ______________________________

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 1 gallons 50 gallons No Bid No Bid

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons No Bid No Bid

DOH-39H Soluble Liquid for Non-Crop Use Containing:

    Potassium salt of aminocyclopyrachlor - Potassium salt of 6-amino-5-

        chloro-2-cyclopropyl-4-pyrimidinecarboxylic acid

Product Trade Name:  Method® 240SL or equal ________________

EPA Registration Number: 432-1565

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons 322.56$       16,128.00$     

0.850%

40.310%

25%



                                                                                     Herbicide Ajuvant Misc & Products

                                                                                               Exhibit B  Pricing Page-Adjuvants

the Product Trade Name and EPA Registration number for each product that the Vendor is bidding whether the Vendor

is bidding the Product Trade Name requested or an "or equal" product.

If the Vendor fails to provide the required information, the Vendor's bid will be disqualified for that Contract Item.

ADJUVANTS Cost Per

Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description Quantity Measure Measure Cost

DOH-1A Water Soluble Blue Liquid Spray Pattern Indicator

Product Trade Name:    Bullseye or equal ____________________
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon

DOH-2A Diluent with Emulsifiers

Product Trade Name: Hygrade EC or Arborchem Basal Oil or Bark Oil EC  

          or Penevator or equal __________________________
A) Supplied in                      containers in lots of                          . 100 gallon

DOH-3A Non-Ionic Surfactant -90% 

Product Trade Name: _____________________________________
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon

DOH-4A Non-Ionic, Low Foam Penetrating Surfactant with Lecithin

    Drift Control Agent

Product Trade Name:  Liberate® or equal __________________________   
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon

DOH-5A Concentrate Spray Adjuvant with Lecitech®

    Methylated Seed Oil

Product Trade Name:  MSO® Concetrate or equal ___________________   
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon

DOH-6A Liquid Drift Control Agent

Product Trade Name: _____________________________________

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 12 quarts. 400 quart

DOH-7A Granular/Flake Drift Control Agent

Product Trade Name: _____________________________________

A) Supplied in 32 ounce containers in lots of 12 containers. 48 container

DOH-8A Aquatic Surfactant

Product Trade Name: _____________________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon

DOH-9A Water Soluble Liquid Spray Pattern Indicator

Product Trade Name:  Blueprint Plus or equal  Hilight Blue
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon  containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon 45.00$          4,500.00$     

DOH-10A Non-Ionic Sticker Spreader

Product Trade Name:  Nu-Film-IR or equal  Arborfilm IR
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon  containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon 35.50 3,550.00$     

DOH-11A Ready-to-Use Formula Containing Paraffinic Oil Emulsifiers

Product Trade Name:  Thinvert RTU or equal _______________________
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon 11.00 1,100.00$     

B) Supplied in 15 gallon drum. 100 gallon 10.50 1,050.00$     

DOH-12A Miscible-Dispersible Liquid Defoamer (10% Active Ingredient)

Product Trade Name: Arborchem Liquid Defoamer
A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 12 quarts per ctn 120 quarts 9.50 1,140.00$     



                                                                                                        Herbicide Ajuvant Misc & Products

                                                                                                     Exhibit C Pricing Page-Miscellaneous

                                                                                                    

the Product Trade Name and EPA Registration number for each product that the Vendor is bidding whether the Vendor

is bidding the Product Trade Name requested or an "or equal" product.

If the Vendor fails to provide the required information, the Vendor's bid will be disqualified for that Contract Item.

MISCELLANEOUS Cost Per

Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description Quantity Measure Measure Cost

DOH-1M Pressure Rinser

Product Trade Name:  Easy Rinse or equal _______________________

A) Supplied per each. 25 each No Bid No Bid

DOH-2M Biostimulant Containing

    Soluble Potash                                            1.00%

    Iron                                                              0.36%

    Manure Extract                                            79.30%

    Humic and Fulvic Acid Extract                       9.00%

    Kelp Extract                                                 1.20%

    Organo-Modified Silaxane Surfactant           0.36%

Product Trade Name:  Launch or equal _________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 10 gallon No Bid No Bid

DOH-3M 5-gallon Backpack Sprayer

Product Trade Name:  Birchmeier or equal _______________________

A) Supplied per sprayer 10 each 270.00$          2,700.00$         

B) Supplied per each gasket set for Sprayer Pump 10 set No Bid No Bid

C) Supplied per each Valve and Wand Repair Kit 10 kit No Bid No Bid

DOH-4M 2-Quart Handheld Pressure Sprayer

Product Trade Name:  Tolco or equal ___________________________

A) Supplied per each sprayer 10 each 22.00$            220.00$            

DOH-5M Closed System Backpack Sprayer

Product Trade Name:  Birchmeier BCS or equal __________________

A) Supplied per each sprayer 10 each 365.00$          3,650.00$         

B) Supplied per each gasket Set for Sprayer Pump 10 set No Bid No Bid

C) Supplied per each Valve and Wand Repair Kit 10 kit No Bid No Bid

DOH-6M 32 ounce Eye Wash Bottle

Product Trade Name: _____________________________________

A) Supplied per each. 25 bottle 18.00$            450.00$            



WVDOH 2020 Herbicide Bid - Arborchem Products – Equivalent Products Label and SDS links 

 

Polaris Label  http://www.cdms.net/ldat/ld8KR000.pdf 

Polaris SDS http://www.cdms.net/ldat/mp8KR001.pdf 

Imazapic 2SL IVM Label http://www.cdms.net/ldat/ldDMC000.pdf 

Imazapic 2SL SDS http://www.cdms.net/ldat/mpDMC001.pdf 

Hilight Blue Dye Label http://arborchem.com/label-sds/label_BASF_Hi-Light_Blue.pdf 

Hilight Blue Dye SDS http://arborchem.com/label-sds/sds_BASF_Hi-Light_Blue.pdf 

Aquachem 90 Label http://arborchem.com/label-sds/label_Adjuvant_Aquachem90.pdf 

Aquachem 90 SDS http://arborchem.com/label-sds/sds_Adjuvant_Aquachem90.pdf 

MES 100 Label https://s3-us-west-1.amazonaws.com/www.agrian.com/pdfs/Drexel_MES-

100TM_Label1h.pdf 

MES 100 SDS https://s3-us-west-1.amazonaws.com/www.agrian.com/pdfs/Drexel_MES-100_MSDS3.pdf 

Control Label http://arborchem.com/label-sds/label_Adjuvant_Control.pdf 

Control SDS http://arborchem.com/label-sds/sds_Adjuvant_Control.pdf 

Arborfilm IR Label http://arborchem.com/label-sds/label_Adjuvant_ArborFilmIR.pdf 

Arborfilm IR SDS http://arborchem.com/label-sds/sds_Adjuvant_ArborFilmIR.pdf 

 

 



 
 
 
 
 

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA 

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION 
PURCHASING DIVISION 

2019 WASHINGTON STREET, EAST 

CHARLESTON, WEST VIRGINIA  25305-0130 

 
 

 

State of West Virginia Bid Opportunity 
 
 

Solicitation Type    CRFQ 
Solicitation No.    DOT2000000106 
Description:    Herbicides, Adjuvants & MISC    
Deadline for Q&A:   01/17/2019             10:00   AM  
Mandatory Bid Conference:  N/A  
Bid Closing Date and Time:  01/29/2020              1:30    PM  

 
Dear Potential Bidder: 
 
Your business has been identified as a potential vendor by the requesting agency for the 
solicitation noted above.   
 
Should your business be interested in this bid opportunity, please visit www.wvOASIS.gov, and 
click on the Vendor Self Service (VSS) Portal. At the welcome screen, please review any 
announcements and log into your account or click on the “Public Access” button in the bottom 
left of the page in order to view the West Virginia Purchasing Bulletin. At the West Virginia 
Purchasing Bulletin page, you may view all bid opportunities or you may search for the 
solicitation noted above by typing the solicitation number in the “keyword search” box. All 
modifications to solicitations prior to award will be noted as an “addendum” and also available at 
this same location. 
 
The West Virginia Purchasing Bulletin lists all bid opportunities more than $10,000 for the state 
of West Virginia. Solicitations prefaced with an “A” are agency-delegated bid opportunities 
expected to be $25,000 or less; those prefaced with an “C” are central Purchasing Division 
solicitations expected to exceed $25,000.  
 
Additional information may be accessed by clicking on the summary or details of the solicitation.   
 
Should you decide to bid on this opportunity, you may submit a bid through the acceptable 
delivery methods including electronic submission via wvOASIS system, hand delivery, delivery 
by courier, or by facsimile; however, the Purchasing Division cannot accept bids via electronic 
mail. 
 
Thank you for your interest in doing business with the State of West Virginia. Should you have 
any questions regarding becoming a registered vendor with the Purchasing Division, please visit 
our vendor registration webpage at http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/VendorReg.html.  
 
West Virginia Purchasing Division 
WVPurchasing.gov  

 

ALLAN L. MCVEY 
CABINET SECRETARY  

 

W. MICHAEL SHEETS 
DIRECTOR 

 



Has met the requirements of the State Code of West Virginia, Chapter 19, Article 16A, Section 7, to 
engage in the business of applying pesticides.

Visit https://wvplants.wvda.us for pesticide exam and recertification meeting locations and to review your 
business information. 

Arborchem Products
941 Nixon Drive
Mechanicsburg PA 17055

DEALER OF RESTRICTED USE PESTICIDES

Commissioner of Agriculture

David Krause, Bryan Rose

Categories of Operation:

Issued to:

License No:

Qualifying Individual:

ØØ1D6ZPlants ID:

DEALER OF RESTRICTED USE PESTICIDES

12/9/2019Date Issued:
12/31/2020Expiration Date:



Arborchem Products
941 Nixon Drive
Mechanicsburg PA 17055

Expires: 12/31/2020

Bryan Rose

7,12

C07194
Commercial Pesticide Applicator

Bryan Rose

Continuing Education
Credit Information

Credits 
Acquired

Credits 
Required

Credits 
Needed

7-Right-of-Way/Industrial 
Weed 49 20 0 Due 12/31/2021

12-Pesticide Storage & 
Distribution 6 20 14 Due 12/31/2021

This document will serve as your West Virginia pesticide certification.  Please print 
to carry with you or save on any electronic device. If you have any questions, please 
call our office at 304-558-2209 or visit the website:  https://wvplants.wvda.us .

Visit https://wvplants.wvda.us for pesticide exam and recertification meeting locations and to review your 
business information. (Your Plants ID: ØØ1FWG and your Pin: 33615).

WEST VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE
Pesticide Regulatory Programs
1900 Kanawha Blvd. East
Charleston, WV 25305-0190

FOR USE ONLY IN CATEGORIES LISTED
WEST VIRGINIA CERTIFICATION

NOT
TRANSFERABLE

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE




