
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Proc Folder :

Solicitation Description :

Proc Type :

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

Solicitation Response

Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East

Charleston, WV 25305-0130
Post Office Box 50130

State of West Virginia

507420

ADDENDUM 2 SMARTNET OR EQUAL(63190024)

Central Contract - Fixed Amt

2019-11-13

13:30:00

SR 0803 ESR11131900000002989 1

 VENDOR

000000230321

ZONES LLC

Comments:

Total Bid : Response Date: Response Time:Total Bid : 

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2000000042

$0.00 2019-11-13 12:55:08

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Signature on File FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001

Crystal G Hustead

(304) 558-2402
crystal.g.hustead@wv.gov
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

1 7X24 CISCO SMARTNET OR
EQUAL FOR CISCO EQUIPMENT

8.00000 EA $0.000000 $0.00

81112300

7x24 CISCO SMARTNET MAINTENANCE FOR CISCO EQUIPMENT OR EQUAL

Comments: Please see attached spreadsheet for pricing

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

2 8X5 NBD CISCO SMARTNET OR
EQUAL FOR CISCO EQUIPMENT

29.00000 EA $0.000000 $0.00

81112300

8X5 NEXT BUSINESS DAY SMARTNET FOR CISCO EQUIPMENT OR EQUAL

Comments: Please see attached spreadsheet for pricing



Item 

Number 
QTY

RFQ 

Section
Item ID Description Model Number Serial Number SmartNet Type

Alternative 

Part number
Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Total Extended

3.1.1 8 3.1.1.1 ASA5525-K8
ASA-5525 X with SW 8GE Data 1GE 

Mgt AC DES
ASA5525-K8 FGL17084182  7x24  $      1,414.22  $                                     1,414.22 

3.1.1.2 ASA5525-K8
ASA-5525 X with SW 8GE Data 1GE 

Mgt AC DES
ASA5525-K8 FTX1819103T  7x24  $      1,407.37  $                                     1,407.37 

3.1.1.3 DOT-B5-2-SW1 WS-C4510R+E 10 Slot Switch WS-C4510R+E FOX1608G8UZ  7x24  $      4,056.59  $                                     4,056.59 

3.1.1.4 DOT-B5-2-SW2 WS-C4510R+E 10 Slot Switch WS-C4510R+E FOX1608GREA  7x24  $      4,056.59  $                                     4,056.59 

3.1.1.5 DOT-B5-4-SW2 WS-C4510R+E 10 Slot Switch WS-C4510R+E FOX1608GGKH  7x24  $      4,056.59  $                                     4,056.59 

3.1.1.6
DOT-B5-4CORE-

SW1
Catalyst 6500 13-slot Chassis System WS-C6513-E FOX1607G0A7  7x24  $   14,342.01  $                                  14,342.01 

3.1.1.7
DOT-B5-8-4510-

SW1
WS-C4510R+E 10 Slot Switch WS-C4510R+E FOX1608H4YY  7x24  $      4,056.59  $                                     4,056.59 

3.1.1.8
DOT-B5-8-4510-

SW2
WS-C4510R+E 10 Slot Switch WS-C5410R+E FOX1608G8VB  7x24  $      4,056.59  $                                     4,056.59 

3.1.1 27 3.1.1.9 DOT-D1DistrictHQ Cisco 3945 Router 3945 FOC14341EUE  8x5xNBD 

3.1.1.10 DOT-D3DistrictHQ Cisco 2951 Router 2951
FJC1927A1LY

 8x5xNBD 

No Bid as item 

is covered till 

16/7/2020

3.1.1.11 DOT-D4DistrictHQ Cisco 2951 Router 2951
FTX1814AJ4U

 8x5xNBD  $         882.41  $                                        882.41 

3.1.1.12 DOT-D5DistrictHQ Cisco 2951 Router 2951
FTX1814AJ4T

 8x5xNBD  $         882.41  $                                        882.41 

3.1.1.13 DOT-D6DistrictHQ Cisco 2951 Router 2951
FTX1637ALCB

 8x5xNBD  $         744.89  $                                        744.89 

3.1.1.14 DOT-D8DistrictHQ Cisco 2951 Router 2951
FJC1927A1LZ

 8x5xNBD 

No Bid as item 

is covered till 

16/7/2020

3.1.1.15 DOT-EqDiv Cisco 2951 Router 2951
FTX1721AKWM

 8x5xNBD  $         882.41  $                                        882.41 

3.1.1.16 DOT-D1DryBranch Cisco 2921 Router 2921
FTX1518ALKV

 8x5xNBD  $         533.28  $                                        533.28 

3.1.1.17 DMV-Beckey Cisco 2951 Router 2951
FTX1412AH9J

 8x5xNBD  $         580.51  $                                        580.51 

REVISED 11/7/19-EXHIBIT A - PRICING PAGE

LOCATION - Building 5, Room 920, Charleston WV

TOTAL INSTALLATION & DELIVERY COST



Item 

Number 
QTY

RFQ 

Section
Item ID Description Model Number Serial Number SmartNet Type

Alternative 

Part number
Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Total Extended

REVISED 11/7/19-EXHIBIT A - PRICING PAGE

LOCATION - Building 5, Room 920, Charleston WV

TOTAL INSTALLATION & DELIVERY COST

3.1.1.18 DMV-Elkins Cisco 2951 Router 2951
FTX1824AHC2

 8x5xNBD  $         505.23  $                                        505.23 

3.1.1.19 DMV-Fairmont Cisco 2951 Router 2951
FJC1927A1RL

 8x5xNBD 

No Bid as item 

is covered till 

16/7/2020

3.1.1.20 DMV-Flatwoods Cisco 2951 Router 2951
FTX1412AH8H

 8x5xNBD  $         580.51  $                                        580.51 

3.1.1.21 DMV-Franklin Cisco 2911Router 2911
FJC1927A1RQ

 8x5xNBD 

No Bid as item 

is covered till 

16/7/2020

3.1.1.22 DMV-Hansfrod Cisco 2921 Router 2921
FTX1412AH8N

 8x5xNBD  $         580.51  $                                        580.51 

3.1.1.23 DMV-KanawhaCity Cisco 4510 Router 4510
FOX1339G9U2

 8x5xNBD 

3.1.1.24 DMV-Kerneysville Cisco 2911 Router 2911
FJC1927A1RN

 8x5xNBD 

No Bid as item 

is covered till 

16/7/2020

3.1.1.25 DMV-Lewisburg Cisco 2911 Router 2911
FJC1927A1RM

 8x5xNBD 

No Bid as item 

is covered till 

16/7/2020

3.1.1.26 DMV-Logan Cisco 2921 Router 2921
FTX1412AH8C

 8x5xNBD  $         581.51  $                                        581.51 

3.1.1.27 DMV-Moorefield Cisco 2911 Router 2911
FTX1813AKCT

 8x5xNBD  $         404.34  $                                        404.34 

3.1.1.28 DMV-Morgantown Cisco 2921 Router 2921
FTX1412AH98

 8x5xNBD  $         580.51  $                                        580.51 

3.1.1.29 DMV-Moundsville Cisco 3941 Router 3941
FTX1637AL42

 8x5xNBD  $         464.10  $                                        464.10 

3.1.1.30 DMV-Parkersburg Cisco 3945 Router 3945
FOC14341EQM

 8x5xNBD 

3.1.1.31 DMV-Princeton Cisco 2911 Router 2911
FJC1927A1RR

 8x5xNBD 

No Bid as item 

is covered till 

16/7/2020

3.1.1.32 DMV-Romeny Cisco 2911 Router 2911
FTX1721AHQN

 8x5xNBD  $         404.34  $                                        404.34 

3.1.1.33 DMV-Spencer Cisco 2911 Router 2911
FTX1813AKCP

 8x5xNBD  $         404.34  $                                        404.34 

3.1.1.34 DMV-Summersville Cisco 2911 Router 2911
FTX1721AHQG

 8x5xNBD  $         404.34  $                                        404.34 



Item 

Number 
QTY

RFQ 

Section
Item ID Description Model Number Serial Number SmartNet Type

Alternative 

Part number
Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Total Extended

REVISED 11/7/19-EXHIBIT A - PRICING PAGE

LOCATION - Building 5, Room 920, Charleston WV

TOTAL INSTALLATION & DELIVERY COST

3.1.1.35 DMV-Welch Cisco 2911 Router 2911
FJC1927A1RP

 8x5xNBD 

No Bid as item 

is covered till 

16/7/2020

3.1.1.36 DMV-Winfield Cisco 2921 Router 2921
FTX1512AHDX

 8x5xNBD  $         505.23  $                                        505.23 

3.1.1.37 DMV-OAH Cisco 2921 Router 2921
FTX1510AHUS

 8x5xNBD  $         631.73  $                                        631.73 

3.1.1.38 DOT-D7HQ-2951 Cisco 2951 Router 2951
FJC1927A1LW

 8x5xNBD 

 No Bid as 

item is 

covered till 

 $                                   47,999.15 TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID →  













































Randell Murphy

Accoungt Manager

233 N Michigan Ave Suite 2600 Chicago, IL 60601

253-205-3403

Randell.murphy@zones.com



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM 
SOLICITATION NO.

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by 
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum 
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. 

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the 
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or �pecification, etc. 

Addendum Numbers Received: 
(Check the box next to each addendum received) 

D Addendum No. 1 
D Addendum No. 2 
D Addendum No. 3 
D Addendum No. 4 
D Addendum No. 5

D Addendum No. 6 
D Addendum No. 7 
D Addendum No. 8 
D Addendum No. 9 
D Addendum No. 10 

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. 
I further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral 
discussion held between Vendor's representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only 
the information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is 
binding. 

Zones, LLC
Company 

��on Bailey, VP, Business and Legal Affairs
Authorizecl Signature 

7/29/2019 

Date 

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite 
document processing. 

Revised 06/05/2019 































Randell Murphy
253-205-3403 

253-205-2403 
Randell.murphy@zones.com






