West Virginia

Purchasing Division

The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
wWVOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West Virginia’s
procurement process, and to maintain the
transparency of the bid-opening process, this
documentation submitted online is publicly posted
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses
to this solicitation submitted to the Purchasing
Division in hard copy format.
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Purchasing Division

Post Office Box 50130

2019 Washington Street East

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Proc Folder : 635711

Proc Type : Statewide MA (Open End)

Solicitation Description : ADDENDUM_1: MVTRUCK20 - 2020 OR LATEST MODEL VEHICLE

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2019-10-04 SR 0212 ESR10031900000002193 1
13:30:00
LVENDOR
000000176670
WHITESIDE OF ST CLAIRSVILLE INC
Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0212 SwC2000000001
Total Bid : $0.00 Response Date: 2019-10-03 Response Time: 10:33:43
Comments:
FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Mark A Atkins
(304) 558-2307
mark.a.atkins@wv.gov
Signature on File FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Page: 1

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Vendor shall use Exhibit_A Pricing 0.00000 EA $0.000000 $0.00
Page(s) for bid pricing.
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25100000

Extended Description :  [MVTRUCK20 - 2020 or latest model vehicle:

Note: Vendor shall use Exhibit_A Pricing Page(s) for bid pricing.
If vendor is submitting a bid online, Vendor should enter $0.00 in the Oasis commodity line.

Vendor shall enter pricing into the Exhibit_A Excel pages and must attach with bid.
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_ Vendor Name:
Manufacturer/Brand CHEVROLET

_|Vehicle Requirements:
| Classificat Full Size Van
10 Drive: Rear wheel

WD (00 |~ O (LN W P =
I I I

Class 20 - Automobile Full Size Van

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

WHITESIDE OF ST CLt Vendor Ct BRIAN MCCULLEY
Phone No 7.41EH09
| Model Name & NMum EXPRESS 2500 12 PAS Email:

fleet@whitesides.com

11 |Passenger 8 minimum (including driver) Standard ¢ Color Description

13 Wheelbas 134 in., minimum

14 GVWR: 6250 Ibs. min, 9330 lbs. max.
15 Engine: 6 cylinder minimum for gasolin GBA

16 Additional Requirements:

19 Vendor Bid Response:
20 |Vehicle fu Unit Price
21 Gasoline 24820
22 Flex-fuel 25696
23_Diese| 28336
24 CNG/Bifue 0
25 Hybrid ]
26 Options:

27 |[FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

12 Doors: 5, minimum: 1 Left Front, 1 Ri G7C

GAN

Gl

28 FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M

29

30 *Mote - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.
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GAZ

RED

SILVER
WHITE
BLACK

DARK GRAY
17 The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment reguirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.
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1] Class 21 - Automobile Full Size Van
2_
3_
4_Vend0r Name: WJITESIDE OF ST CLA Vendor Cc BRIAN MCCULLEY
5 |Manufacturer/Brand CHEVROLET Phone No 740-695-0211
6 |Model Name & Mum EXPRESS 2500 12 PAS Email: fleet@whitesides.com
?,
8 |Vehicle Requirements:
9 |Classificat Full Size Van
10 |Drive: Rear wheel Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors
11 |Passenger 12 minimum (including driver] Standard ¢ Color Description
12 |Doors: 5, minimum: 1 Left Front, 1 Rig G7C RED
13 |Wheelbas 134 in., minimum GAN SILVER
14 |GVWR: 6250 Ibs. min, 9930 lbs. max. GAZ WHITE
15 |Engine: 6 cylinder minimum for gasolin GBA BLACK
16 |Additional Requirements: GJI DARL GRAY
17 |The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.
18 |
19 |Vendor Bid Response:
20 |Vehicle fu Unit Price
21 |Gasoline 24320
22 |Flex-fuel 25696
23 | Diesel 28336
24 |CNG/Bifut 0
25 |Hybrid ]
26 |Options:
27 |FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 50
28 |FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M 1
29 |
30 |*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.
31 |
32 |
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34 |
35 |
36|
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41 |
an
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1] lCIass 22 - Automobile Full Size Van
2_
3_
4_Vendor Name: WHITESIDE OF ST CL Vendor Cc BRIAN MCCULLEY
5 |Manufacturer/Brand CHEVROLET Phone No 740-695-0211
6 |Model Name & Num EXPRESS 3500 15 PAS Email: fleet@whitesides.com
7_
8 |Vehicle Requirements:
9 |Classificat Full Size Van
10 | Drive: Rear Wheel Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors
11 |Passenget 15 minimum (including driver) Standard ¢ Color Description
12 |Doors: 5, minimum: 1 Left Front, 1 Rig G7C RED
13 |Wheelbas 134 in., minimum GAN SILVER
14 |GVWR: 6250 Ibs. min, 9930 lbs. max. GAZ WHITE
15 |Engine: 6 cylinder minimum for gasolin GBA BLACK
16 |Additional Requirements: Gl DARK GRAY
17 |The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.
18
19 |Vendor Bid Response:
20 |Vehicle fu Unit Price
21 |Gasoline 27937
22 |Flex-fuel 28814
23 | Diesel 31453
24 |CNG/Bifue 0
25 |Hybrid 0
26 |Options:
27 |FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 50
28 |FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M 1
29|
30 | *Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.
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1] lCIass 23 - Automobile Cargo Van
2_
3_
4 |Vendor Name: WHITESIDE OF ST CL4Vendor Cc BRIAN MCCULLEY
5 | Manufacturer/Brand CHEVROLET Phone Mo 740-895-0211
6 |Model Name & Num EXPRESS 2500CARGC Email: fleet@whitesides.com
?_
8 |Vehicle Requirements:
8 |Classificat Cargo Van
10 |Drive: 2 wheel, rear wheel, or front w Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors
11 |Passenger 2 minimum (including driver) Standard ( Color Description
12 |Doors: 3, minimum G7C RED
13_Whee|bas 118 in., minimum GAN SILVER
14 |GVWR: 6250 Ibs. min, 9930 lbs. max. GAZ WHITE
15 |[Engine: 6 cylinder minimum for gasolir GBA BLACK
16 |Additiona Rear door windows GJI DARK GRAY
17 |The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.
18

19 |Vendor Bid Response:
20 |Vehicle fu Unit Price

21 |Gasoline 22458
22 |Flex-fuel 23334
23 | Diesel 25974
24 |CNG/Bifut 0
25 |Hybrid 0
26 |Options:

27 |FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 50
28 |FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M

29

30 |*Note - The above delivery "options” above are not evaluated as part of the award.
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1] lCIass 24 - Automobile Large Pick Up Regular Cab
2 —
3 —
4 |Vendor Name: WHITESIDE OF ST CL4 Vendor Ce BRIAN MCCULLEY
5 : Manufacturer/Brand CHEVROLET Phone No 740-695-0211
6 |Model Name & Num SILVERAO 2500 4WD Email: fleet@whitesides.com
?_
8 |Vehicle Requirements:
9 |Classificat Large Pick Up Reg Cab
10: Drive: AWheel/all wheel Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors
11 |Passenget 2 minimum (including driver] Standard (Color Description
12_ Doors: 2, minimum G7C RED
13 |Wheelbas 133 in., minimum GAZ WHITE
14 |GVWR: 8650 lbs. min, 10,000 Ibs. max. GAN SILVER
15: Engine: 8 cylinder minimum for gasolir GAO DARK BLUE
16 | Tow Packz Installed Hitch & Wiring GBA BLACK
17 |Bed Lengt Standard length meeting speci GJI DARK GRAY
18 |Installed Drop-In Liner or Spray-In Liner GNK BROWN

19 | The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.
20 \Vendor Bid Response:

2 :Vehicle fu Unit Price

22 |Gasoline 29482
23 |Flex-fuel 0
24 |Diesel 38337

25 | CNG/Bifue 0

26 | Hybrid 0
27 |Options:
28 |[FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 50

29 |[FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M

30

31 |*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.
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llclass 25 - Automobile Large Pick Up Extended Cab

_Vendor Name: WHITESIDE OF ST CLY Vendor CcBRIAN MCCULLEY
_|Manufacturer/Brand CHEVROLET SILVERA Phone No 740-695-0211
_|Model Name & Number: Email: fleet@whitesides.com

_|Vehicle Requirements:
|Classificat Large Pick Up Extended Cab
10 |Drive: 4 Wheel/All wheel with High/L Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

W0 = W s W R e
I £

11 |Passenger4 minimum (including driver) Standard ( Color Description

12 |Doors: 4, minimum G7C RED
13_Whee|bas 141 in., minimum GAZ WHITE

14 |GVWR: 8600 Ibs. min, 10,000 lbs. max GAN SILVER

15 |Engine: 8 cylinder minimum for gasolin GAO DARK BLUE
16 |Off Road FIncludes but not limited to: Lim GBA BLACK

17 |Tow Packz Installed Hitch & Wiring Gl DARK GRAY
18 |Slush/All 'Installed on driver and passeng GNK BROWN

19 |Bed: Short, with installed drop-in liner or spray-in liner.

20 |Sliding re: Not Required

2 :Additional Requirements:

22 |The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

23 |Vendor Bid Response:

24 |Vehicle fuUnit Price
25 |Gasoline 31226
26 |Options: o

27 |Diesel 40226

28 |cNG/Bifus 0
29 |Hybrid 0

30 |Options:
31 |FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 50
32 |FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M
33 |
34 |*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.
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1] _|Class 26 - Automobile Large Pick Up Crew Cab
2..
3._
4 Vendor Name: WHITESIDE OF ST CL4 Vendor C¢ BRIAN MCCULLEY
5 | Manufacturer/Brand CHEVROLET Phone No 740-695-0211
6 |Model Name & Num CHEVROLET SILVERA Email: fleet@whitesides.com
?._
8 |Vehicle Requirements:
9 |Classificat Large Pick Up Crew Cab
10 | Drive: Rear Wheel Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors
11 |Passenget 5 minimum (including driver) Standard ( Color Description
12 |Doors: 4 full doors, minimum G7C RED
13 |Wheelbas 148 in., minimum GAN SILVER
14 |GVWR: 8,730 Ibs. min, GAZ WHITE
15 |Engine: 8 cylinder minimum for gasolir GBA BLACK
16 | Tow Packz Installed Hitch & Wiring Gl DARK GRAY
17 |Additional Requirements: GAO DARK BLUE
18 |Installed Drop-In Liner or Spray-In Liner GNK BROWN
19 |The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.
20

21 |Vendor Bid Response:
22 |Vehicle fu Unit Price
23 |Gasoline 29713

24 |Flex-fuel 1]

25 |Diesel 38713

26 | CNG/Bifut 0
27 |Hybrid 0
28 |Options:

29 |[FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 50

30 |FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M
21

32 | *Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.
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1] lclass 27 - Automobile Large Pick Up Crew Cab
2 —
3 —
4 | Vendor Name: WHITESIDE OF ST CL4 Vendor Cc BRIAN MCCULLEY
5 | Manufacturer/Brand CHEVROLET Phone No 740-695-0211
6 |Model Name & Num SILVERADO 2500 CREEmail: fleet@whitesides.com
?_
8 |Vehicle Requirements:
9 |Classificat Large Pick Up Crew Cab
10 |Drive: 4wD Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors
11 |Passenget 5 minimum (including driver) Standard (¢ Color Description
12 |Doors: 4 full doors, minimum G7C RED
13 |Wheelbas 148 in., minimum GAZ WHITE
14 |GVWR: 8,750 Ibs. min, GAN SILVER
15 |Engine: 8 cylinder minimum for gasolin GAO DARK BLUE
16 |Tow Pack: Installed Hitch & Wiring GBA BLACK
17 |Bed: Minimum 8 Ft Bed. GNK BROWN
18 |Installed Drop-In Liner or Spray-In Liner  GJI DARK GRAY

19 |The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.
20 |Vendor Bid Response:

2 :Vehicle fu Unit Price

22 |Gasoline 32449
23 |Flex-fuel 0

24 |Diesel 41445

25 |CNG/Bifu 0

26 |Hybrid 0
27 |Options:
28 |FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 50

29 |FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M

30

31 |*Note - The above delivery "options” above are not evaluated as part of the award.
32

23

34
35|
36

37

38 |
39 |
40|
Y]

a0

=

[

» Class 20 Class 21 Class 22 Class 23 Class 24 Class 25 Class 26 Class 27 | Class 28 Class 29 Class 30 Class 31 Class 32 Cla .. 1



AutoSave RUCK xls - Protected View - Repaired - Excel

File Home Insert Page Layout Formulas Data Review View Help Acrobat £ Search

@ PROTECTED VIEW Be careful—files from the Internet can contain viruses. Unless you need to edit, it's safer to stay in Protected View, Enable Editing
Al A f
A B | C | [} | E | F | G | H | | 1 | K | L | M N | o} | P | Q | R |
1] lCIass 28 - Automobile Large Pick Up Crew Cab
2 —
3 |
4 | Vendor Name: WHITESIDE OF ST CL{ Vendor CcBRIAN MCCULLEY
5 |Manufacturer/Brand CHEVROLET Phone No 740-695-0211
6 |Model Name & Num SILVERADO 2500 CRE Email: fleet@whitesides.com
?_
8 |Vehicle Requirements:
9 |Classificat Large Pick Up Crew Cab
10 |Drive: 4 Wheel/All Wheel with High a Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors
11 |Passenget 5 minimum (including driver) Standard tColor Description
12 |Doors: 4 full doors, minimum G7C RED
lB_Wheerasl48in., minimum GAZ WHITE
14 |GVWR: 8,800 |bs. min, 10,000. Ibs. ma GAN SILVER
15 |Engine: 8 cylinder minimum for gasolin GAO DARK BLUE
16 |Off Road FIncludes but not limited to: Lim GBA BLACK
17 |Bed: Short bed, with installed drop- GNK BROWN
18 | Tow Pack:Installed Hitch & Wiring GJI DARK GRAY

19 |Slush/All- Installed on driver and passenger front and second row, except where vinyl floor covering is present.
20 |sliding Re Mot Required

21 |Additional Requirements:

22 | The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

23 |Vendor Bid Response:
24 |Vehicle fu Unit Price

25 |Gasoline 32711

26 |Flex-fuel ]

27 |Options:  DIESELADD $9000.00

28 |CNG/Bifut o

29 |Hybrid 0

30 |Options:

31 |FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 50
32 |FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M 1
33 |

34 |*Note - The above delivery "options” above are not evaluated as part of the award.
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1] lCIass 29 - Automobile Large Pick Up Regular Cab
2_
3
4:Vendor Name: WHITESIDE OF ST CL{ Vendor CcBRIAN MCCULLEY
5 | Manufacturer/Brand CHEVROLET Phone No 740-695-0211
6 | Model Name & Num SILVERADQ 2500 4w Email: fleet@whitesides.com
?_
8 |Vehicle Requirements:
9 |Classificat Large Pick Up Reg Cab
10 |Drive: 4 Wheel/all wheel Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors
11 |Passenger 2 minimum (including driver) Standard ( Color Description
12 |Doors: 2, minimum GTC RED
13 |Wheelbas 133 in., minimum GAZ WHITE
14 |GVWR: 10,000 lbs. min, GAN SILVER
15 |Engine: 8 cylinder minimum for gasolir GAO DARK BLUE
16 |Off Road F Includes but not limited to: Lin GBA BLACK
1?: Bed: Long bed with installed drop-ir GNK BROWN
18 |Tow Pack: Installed Hitch & Wiring Gl DARK GRAY

19: Snow ploy Installed
20 |Additional Requirements:

21 |The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

22 |Vendor Bid Response:
23 |Vehicle fu Unit Price
24 |Gasoline 30669
25 |Flex-fuel o]

26 |Diesel 39669

27 | CNG/Bifue 0

28 |options: 0
29 |Options:
30 |FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 50

31 |FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M

32

33 | *Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.
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1 | lCIass 30 - Automobile 1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel, Super Cab
2_
3,
4 _Vendor Name: WHITESIDE OF ST CL4Vendor Ct BRIAN MCCULLEY
5 |Manufacturer/Brand CHEVROLET Phone No 740-695-0211
6 Model Name & Num SILVERADO 3500 4WIEmail: fleet@whitesides.com
2
8 |Vehicle Requirements:
9 |Classificat 1 Ton Dual Rear wheel super cab
10 | Drive: 4 Wheel Drive Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors
11 |Passenger Minimum of 5{including driver Standard ( Color Description
12|Doors: 4, minimum G7C RED
13 |Wheelbas 158" —165" GAZ WHITE
14 |GVWR: 13,000 minimum GAN SILVER
15 [Engine:  Minimum 6.6 Liter Turbo Diese GAO DARK BLUE
16 |Torque: Minimum of 765 lb. ft. GBA BLACK
l?: Rear Axle: Minimum 3.73 Ratio (gas), Mini GNK BROWN
18 | Tow Capai 19,000 Ibs. minimum Gl DARK GRAY

19 | Tow Packe Installed Receiver Hitch & 7-pin Wiring, Trailer Tow Side Electric Mirrors, Factory Installed Electric Trailer Brake Controller
20 |Slush/All 1Installed on driver and passenger frant and second row, except where vinyl floor covering is present.
21 |Bed: Spray-in bed liner only

22 |Additiona Installed Side Step Bars, All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame mounted with jack

23 |Additional Requirements:

24 \The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

25 |Vendor Bid Response:
26 |Vehicle FuUnit Price
27 |Diesel 51368

28 |Gasoline 42868

29 |Options:
30 |FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 50
31 |FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M
32|
33 | *Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.
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1] lCIass 31 - Automobile 1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel, Crew Cab
2 -
3 5|
4 _Vendor MName: WHITESIDE OF ST CL4 Vendor C¢ BRIAN MCCULLEY
5 |Manufacturer/Brand CHEVROLET Phone No 740-695-0211
6 |Model Name & Num SILVERADO 3500 4w| Email: fleet@whitesides.com
?_
8 |Vehicle Requirements:
3 |Classificat1Ton Dual Rear wheel Crew Cab
10 | Drive: 4 Wheel Drive Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors
11 | Passenger Minimum of 5{including driver Standard ( Color Description
12_ Doors: 4, minimum G7C RED
13 | Wheelbas 158" —170" GAZ WHITE
14 |[GYWR: 13,000 minimum GAN SILVER
15 |Engine:  Minimum 6.6 Liter Turbo Diese GAO DARK BLUE
16 |Torque: Minimum of 765 Ib. ft. GBA BLACK
17 |Rear Axle:Minimum 3.73 Ratio (gas), Mini GNK BROWN
18 | Tow Capar 19,000 lbs. minimum GJI DARK GRAY

19 | Tow Packz Installed Receiver Hitch & 7-pin Wiring, Trailer Tow Side Electric Mirrors, Factory Installed Electric Trailer Brake Controller
20 |Slush/All 1Installed on driver and passenger front and second row, except where vinyl floor covering is present.
21 Bed: Spray-in bed liner only

22 |Additiona Installed Side Step Bars, All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame mounted with jack
23 |Additional Requirements:
24 |\ The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

25 |Vendor Bid Response:

26 |Vehicle FuUnit Price

27 | Diesel 44710
28 |Gasoline 35710
29 | Options:

30 |FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 50

31 |FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M
32

33 |*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.
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1 lclass 32 - Automabile 1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel, Cab/Chassis, Regular Cab
2 —
3 —
4 |Vendor Name: WHITESIDE OF ST CLY Vendor Cc BRIAN MCCULLEY
5 |Manufacturer/Brand NO BID Phone No.:
6 |Madel Name & Number: Email:
?_
8 |Vehicle Requirements:
9 |Classificat 1 Ton Dual Rear wheel Regular cab

10 | Drive: 2 Wheel Drive Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

11 |Passenget Minimum of 3{including driver Standard ¢ Color Description

12_ Doors: 2, minimum

13 |Wheelbas 135" — 145"

14 |GVWR: 13,000 minimum

15 |Engine:  Minimum 8 cylinder gasoline engine

16 | Transmiss Automatic

17 |Torque:  Minimum of 400 Ib. ft.

18 |Rear Axle: Minimum 3.73 Ratio Limited Slip/Traction Lock with Dual Rear Wheels

139 |Tow Packe Towing Harness, Trailer Tow Side Electric Mirrors, Factory Installed Electric Trailer Brake Controller
20 |Slush/All 1 Installed on driver and passenger front and second row, except where vinyl floor covering is present.
21 |Bed: Must be able to accept bed body minimum length 9"

22 |Additiona Installed Side Step Bars, All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame mounted with jack

23 |Additiona PTO Take-off Provision

24 |The vehicle bid shall include the standard eguipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

25 |Vendor Bid Response:

26 |Vehicle FLUnit Price
27 |Gasoline NO BID
28 |Options:

29 |FOB Dealership: (Deduct) ]
30 |FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M §
31 |
32 | *Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.
33|
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1 | lCIass 33 - Automobile 1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel, Cab/Chassis, Regular Cab
2_
3_
4_Vendor MName: WHITESIDE OF ST CL4 Vendor Cc BRIAN MCCULLEY
5| Manufacturer/Brand CHEVROLET Phone No 740-695-0211
6 |Model Name & Num SILVERADO 3500 2wl Email: fleet@whitesides.com
?_
8 |Vehicle Requirements:
9 |Classificat 1 Ton Dual Rear wheel Regular cab
10 | Drive: 2 Wheel Drive Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors
11 |Passengel Minimum of 3({including driver Standard ¢ Color Description
12 |Doars: 2, minimum G7C RED
13 | Wheelbas 135" — 145" GAZ WHITE
14 |GVWR: 13,000 minimum GAN SILVER
15 |[Engine:  Minimum 6.2 Liter Turbo Diese GAO DARK BLUE
16 |Transmiss Automatic GBA BLACK
17 |Torque:  Minimum of 765 Ib. ft. GNK BROWN
18 |Rear Axle!Minimum 3.42 Ratio Limited Sli GJI DARK GRAY
19 |Tow Pack: Towing Harness, Trailer Tow Side Electric Mirrors, Factory Installed Electric Trailer Brake Controller
20 |Slush/All 1Installed on driver and passenger front and second row, except where vinyl floor covering is present.
21 |Bed: Must be able to accept bed body minimum length 9
22 |Additiona Installed Side Step Bars, All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame mounted with jack
23 |Additiona PTO Take-Off Provision
24 |The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.
25 |Vendor Bid Response:
26 |Vehicle FuUnit Price
27 | Diesel 38410
28 |Options:
29 |FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 50
30 |FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M 1
31
32 |*Note - The above delivery "options” above are not evaluated as part of the award.
33 |
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1] lCIass 34 - Automobile 1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel, Cab/Chassis, Regular Cab
2_
3_
4_Vend0r Name: WHITESIDE OF ST CL Vendor CcBRIAN MCCULLEY
5 |Manufacturer/Brand NO BID Phone No.:
6 |Model Name & Number: Email:
?_
8 |Vehicle Requirements:
9 |Classificat 1 Ton Dual Rear wheel Regular cab
10 | Drive: 4 Wheel Drive Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors
11 |Passenger Minimum of 3{including driver Standard ¢ Color Description
12 |Doors: 2, minimum
13 |Wheelbas 135" — 145"
14_ GVWR: 13,000 minimum
15 |Engine:  Minimum 8 cylinder gasoline engine
16 |Transmiss Automatic
17 |Torque:  Minimum of 400 Ib. ft.
18 |Rear Axle:Minimum 3.73 Ratio Limited Slip/Traction Lock with Dual Rear Wheels
19 | Tow Pack: Towing Harness, Trailer Tow Side Electric Mirrors, Factory Installed Electric Trailer Brake Controller
20 |Slush/All 1 Installed on driver and passenger front and second row, except where vinyl floor covering is present.
21 |Bed: Must be able to accept bed body minimum length 9
22 |Additiona Installed Side Step Bars, All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame mounted with jack
23 |Additiona PTO Take-Off Provision
24 |The vehicle bid shall include the standard eguipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.
25 |Vendor Bid Response:
26 | Vehicle Fy Unit Price
27 |Gasoline NO BID
28 |Options:
20 |FOB Dealership: (Daduct) ]
30 |FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M $
31 |
32 | *Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.
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1 | lCIass 35 - Automobile 1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel, Cab/Chassis, Regular Cab
2 —
3 —
4_Vend0r Name: WHITESIDE OF ST CU Vendor Cc BRIAN MCCULLEY
5 | Manufacturer/Brand CHEVROLET Phone Mo 740-695-0211
6 | Model Name & Num SILVERADO 3500 4WI|Email: fleet@whitesides.com
?_
8 |Vehicle Requirements:
9 |Classificat 1 Ton Dual Rear wheel Regular cab
10 |Drive: 4 Wheel Drive Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors
11 |Passenger Minimum of 3{including driver Standard ¢ Color Description
12_ Doors: 2, minimum G7C RED
13 | Wheelbas 135" — 145" GAZ WHITE
14 |GVWR: 13,000 minimum GAN SILVER
15 |[Engine:  Minimum 6.2 Liter Turbo Diese GAO DARK BLUE
16 | Transmiss Automatic GBA BLACK
17 [Torgue:  Minimum of 765 Ib. ft. GNK BROWN
18 |Rear Axle: Minimum 3.42 Ratio Limited SIiGJI DARK GRAY

19: Tow Pack: Towing Harness, Trailer Tow Side Electric Mirrors, Factory Installed Electric Trailer Brake Controller

20 |Slush/All Installed on driver and passenger front and second row, except where vinyl floor covering is present.

21 |Bed: Must be able to accept bed body minimum length 9

22 |Additiona Installed Side Step Bars, All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame mounted with jack

23 |Additiona PTO Take-Off Provision

24 |The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.
25 |Vendor Bid Response:

26 |Vehicle FuUnit Price

27 | Diesel 41911

28 |
29 |Options:

30 |FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 50
31 |FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M
32 |
33 |*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.
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1] Class 36 - Automobile 1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel, Cab/Chassis, Crew Cab
2_
3_
4 |Vendor Name: WHITESIDE OF ST CL4Vendor Contact:
5 |Manufacturer/Brand NO BID Phone No.:
6 |Model Name & Number: Email:
?_
8 |Vehicle Requirements:
9 |Classificat 1 Ton Dual Rear wheel Crew cab
10 | Drive: 2 Wheel Drive Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors
11 |Passenget Minimum of 5{including driver Standard (¢ Color Description
12 |Doors: 4, minimum
13 |Wheelbas 170" — 180"
14_ GVWR: 13,000 minimum
15 |Engine:  Minimum 8 cylinder gasoline engine
16 |Transmiss Automatic
17 |Torque:  Minimum of 400 Ib.ft.
18 |Rear Axle: Minimum 3.73 Ratio Limited Slip/Traction Lock with Dual Rear Wheels
19 | Tow Packe Towing Harnes, Trailer Tow Side Electric Mirrors, Factory Installed Electric Trailer Brake Controller
20 |Slush/All 1Installed on driver and passenger front and second row, except where vinyl floor covering is present.
21 |Bed: Must be able to accept bed body minimum length 9°
22 |Additiona Installed Side Step Bars, All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame mounted with jack
23 |Additiona PTO Take-Off Provision
24 | The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.
25 |Vendor Bid Response:
26 |Vehicle FuUnit Price
27 |Gasoline NO BID
28 |Options:
29 |FOB Dealership: (Deduct) S
30 |[FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M &
31
32 | *Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.
33
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1 | lCIass 37 - Automobile 1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel, Cab/Chassis, Crew Cab
2_
3,
4_Vendor Name: WHITESIDE OF ST CL4 Vendor CcBRIAN MCCULLEY
5 |Manufacturer/Brand CHEVROLET Phone No 740-695-0211
6 |Model Name & Num SILVERADO 3500 2WI Email: fleet@whitesides.com
?_
8 |Vehicle Requirements:
9 |Classificat 1 Ton Dual Rear wheel Crew cab
10 |Drive: 2 Wheel Drive Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors
11 |Passenget Minimum of 5{including driver Standard tColor Description
12 |Doors: 4, minimum GAZ WHITE
lB_WheeraS 170" — 180" G7C RED
14 |GVWR: 13,000 minimum GAN SILVER
15 [Engine:  Minimum 6.2 Liter Turbo Diese GAO DARK BLUE
16 |Transmiss Automatic GBA BLACK
17 |Torque:  Minimum of 765 Ib. ft. GNK BROWN
18 |Rear Axle: Minimum 3.42 Ratio Limited SliGJI DARK GRAY
19 | Tow Packe Towing Harnes, Trailer Tow Side Electric Mirrors, Factory Installed Electric Trailer Brake Controller
20 |Slush/All 1Installed on driver and passenger front and second row, except where vinyl floor covering is present.
21 |Bed: Must be able to accept bed body minimum length 9
22 |Additiona Installed Side Step Bars, All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame mounted with jack
23 | PTO Take-Off Provision
24 |The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.
25 |Vendor Bid Response:
26 |Vehicle FuUnit Price
27 |Diesel 41305
28 |Options:
29 |FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 50
30 |FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M 1
31
32 | *Note - The above delivery "options” above are not evaluated as part of the award.
33
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1] | _|Class 38 - Automobile 1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel, Cab/Chassis, Crew Cab
2 —
3 —
4 |Vendor Name: WHITESIDE OF ST CL{ Vendor Contact:
5 _Manufacturer/ﬂrand NO BID Phone No.:
6 |Model Name & Number: Email:
?._
8 |Vehicle Requirements:
9 |Classificat1Ton Dual Rear wheel Crew cab
10 |Drive: 4 Wheel Drive Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors
11 |Passenget Minimum of 5{including driver Standard ( Color Description

12 |Doors: A Full, minimum

13 |Wheelbas 170" — 180"

14_ GVWR: 13,000 minimum

15 |Engine:  Minimum 8 cylinder gasoline engine

16 |Transmiss Automatic

17 |Torgue:  Minimum of 400 Ib. ft.

18 |Rear Axle:Minimum 3.73 Ratio Limited Slip/Traction Lock with Dual Rear Wheels

19 | Tow Packz Towing Harness, Trailer Tow Side Electric Mirrors, Factory Installed Electric Trailer Brake Controller
20 |Slush/All 'Installed on driver and passenger front and second row, except where vinyl floor covering is present.

21 |Bed: Must be able to accept bed body minimum length 9*
22 |Additiona Installed Side Step Bars, All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame mounted with jack
23 PTO Take-Off Provision

24 | The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.
25 Vendor Bid Response:

26 |Vehicle FuUnit Price

27 |Gasoline NOBID

28: Options:
29 |[FOB Dealership: (Deduct) s

30 |FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M 3
31
32 | *Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.
33 |
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1] Class 39 - Automobile 1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel, Cab/Chassis, Crew Cab
2_
3 —
4_Vendor Name: WHITESIDE OF ST CL{ Vendor Cc BRIAN MCCULLEY
S_Manufacturer/Brand CHEVROLET Phone No 740-695-0211
6 |Model Name & Num SILVERADO 3500 CRE Email: fleet@whitesides.com
?_
8 |Vehicle Requirements:
9 |Classificat 1 Ton Dual Rear wheel Crew cab
10 | Drive: 4 Wheel Drive Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors
11 | Passenget Minimum of 5{including driver Standard (Color Description
12 |Doors: 4 Full, minimum GAZ WHITE
13_Whee|bas 170" —180" G7C RED
14 |GVWR: 13,000 minimum GAMN SILVER
15 |Engine:  Minimum 6.2 Liter Turbo Diese GAO DARK BLUE
16 | Transmiss Automatic GBA BLACK
17 |Torque:  Minimum of 765 Ib. ft. GNK BROWN
18 |Rear Axle:Minimum 3.42 Ratio Limited SIiGJI DARK GRAY
18 |Tow Pack: Towing Harness, Trailer Tow Side Electric Mirrors, Factory Installed Electric Trailer Brake Controller
20 |Slush/All 1 Installed on driver and passenger front and second row, except where vinyl floor covering is present.
21 |Bed: Must be able to accept bed body minimum length 9'
22 |Additiona Installed Side Step Bars, All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame mounted with jack
23| PTO Take-Off Provision
24 |The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.
25 |Vendor Bid Response:
26 |Vehicle FuUnit Price
27 |Diesel 45405
28 |Options:
28 |FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 50
30 |FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per M 1
31
32 | *Note - The above delivery "options” above are not evaluated as part of the award.
33 |
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