
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Proc Folder :

Solicitation Description :

Proc Type :

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

Solicitation Response

Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East

Charleston, WV 25305-0130
Post Office Box 50130

State of West Virginia

496559

ADDENDUM 4 6619C050-WINTER GRADE BIT PATCHING MIX(COLD MIX)

Central Master Agreement

2018-12-06

13:30:00

SR 0803 ESR12051800000002644 1

 VENDOR

000000203375

KELLY PAVING INC

Comments:

Total Bid : Response Date: Response Time:Total Bid : 

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT1900000040

$0.00 2018-12-05 09:02:03

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Signature on File FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001

Crystal Rink

(304) 558-2402
crystal.g.rink@wv.gov
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

1 WINTER GRADE BITUMINOUS
PATCHING MIXTURE - COLD MIX

1.00000 TON $0.000000 $0.00

30121601

WINTER GRADE BITUMINOUS PATCHING MIXTURE - COLD MIX

Comments: Please see the attachment "Exhibit A Pricing Pages" for tonnage prices per Deliver/Storage Site







































































































































ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED?

INSR ADDL SUBR
LTR INSD WVD

PRODUCER
CONTACT
NAME:

FAXPHONE
(A/C, No):(A/C, No, Ext):

E-MAIL
ADDRESS:

INSURER A :

INSURED INSURER B :

INSURER C :

INSURER D :

INSURER E :

INSURER F :

POLICY NUMBER
POLICY EFF POLICY EXP

TYPE OF INSURANCE LIMITS(MM/DD/YYYY) (MM/DD/YYYY)

AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY

UMBRELLA LIAB

EXCESS LIAB

WORKERS COMPENSATION
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES  (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

EACH OCCURRENCE $
DAMAGE TO RENTEDCLAIMS-MADE OCCUR $PREMISES (Ea occurrence)

MED EXP (Any one person) $

PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $

GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $

PRO-
POLICY LOC PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGGJECT 

OTHER: $
COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT

$(Ea accident)

ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY (Per person) $
OWNED SCHEDULED

BODILY INJURY (Per accident) $AUTOS ONLY AUTOS

HIRED NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE
$AUTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY (Per accident)

$

OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE

CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $

DED RETENTION $

PER OTH-
STATUTE ER

E.L. EACH ACCIDENT

E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE $
If yes, describe under

E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMITDESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #

COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY

Y / N

N / A
(Mandatory in NH)

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE    EXPIRATION    DATE    THEREOF,    NOTICE   WILL   BE   DELIVERED   IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

THIS  IS  TO  CERTIFY  THAT  THE  POLICIES  OF  INSURANCE  LISTED  BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED.    NOTWITHSTANDING  ANY  REQUIREMENT,  TERM  OR  CONDITION  OF  ANY  CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE  MAY  BE  ISSUED  OR  MAY  PERTAIN,  THE  INSURANCE  AFFORDED  BY  THE  POLICIES  DESCRIBED  HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

THIS  CERTIFICATE  IS  ISSUED  AS  A  MATTER  OF  INFORMATION  ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE  DOES  NOT  AFFIRMATIVELY  OR  NEGATIVELY  AMEND,  EXTEND  OR  ALTER  THE  COVERAGE  AFFORDED  BY THE POLICIES
BELOW.    THIS  CERTIFICATE  OF  INSURANCE  DOES  NOT  CONSTITUTE  A  CONTRACT  BETWEEN  THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT:    If  the  certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If  SUBROGATION  IS  WAIVED,  subject  to  the  terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement.  A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION.  All rights reserved.ACORD 25 (2016/03)

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE
DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)

$

$

$

$

$

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD

D1BNELSON

Lisa Trnian

12/03/2018

SHEL&SA-23

B
AUC-0113421-03

A

CPP 0895439

A

CPP 0895439

10,000

25,000,000

25,000,000

No Phys Damage

$1mil

2,000,000

1,000,000

2,000,000

OH Employr Liab 25,000

1,000,000

2,000,000

2,000,000

X

X

X

X

X

X X

X

X

X

X

X

X

C WCB1017233

License # 954553

04/01/2018 04/01/2019

04/01/2018 04/01/2019

04/01/2018 04/01/2019

04/01/2018 04/01/2019

Solicitation No. CRFQ 0803 DOT1900000040 6619C050 Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mix (Cold Mix)
State of West Virginia (WV Dept. of Hwys) is included as Additional Insured under the General Liability and Automobile Liability per blanket forms:  GA233 
02/07: AA4171 11/05.

AssuredPartners of Ohio, LLC
3900 Kinross Lakes Parkway #300
Richfield, OH 44286

(440) 356-2126(440) 895-6584

State of West Virginia - WVDOH
1900 Kanawha Blvd. E
Building Five, Room A737
Finance & Administration, Division of Highways,
Charleston, WV 25302

Kelly Paving, Inc.
P.O. Box 366
Williamstown, WV 26187

Cincinnati Insurance Company

American Guarantee & Liab Ins

BrickStreet Insurance

10677

26247

X

X

lisa.trnian@AssuredPartners.com

WOS/Statutory/Broad 1,000,000WV WC Brickstreet



Pricing Page, Exhibit A

Winter Grade Bituminous Patching - Cold Mix

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICT 1

AWARD SHALL BE BASED ON THE LOW-BID UNIT

COST PER TON, PER DELIVERY/STORAGE SITE.

Unit of Estimated Unit Cost Extended

County Delivery/Storage Site Measure Number Tons Per Ton Cost

Boone Clinton @ WV85 TON 100

Boone Rock Creek TON 200

Boone Seth TON 50

Clay Widen Road & CR 11 TON 150

Clay Maysel TON 0

Kanawha Chelyan TON 150

Kanawha Elkview TON 100

Kanawha North Charleston TON 100

Kanawha St. Albans TON 100

Kanawha I-64 @ Rt. 119 and Penn. Avenue TON 50

Kanawha I-77 @ Sissonville TON 100

Kanawha I-79 @ Amma TON 30

Kanawha Corridor G @ Alum Creek TON 20

Mason Pt. Pleasant TON 250

Putnam Red House TON 75

Putnam Hurricane @ Rt. 34 TON 75

Putnam Scary TON 70

Putnam US 35 @ Fraziers Bottom TON 40

*Quantities listed in this RFQ are approximations only.  It is understood and agreed that the contract shall

cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than

the quantities shown below.   There is no guarantee purchase.

the quantities shown below.   There is no guarantee purchase.



Pricing Page, Exhibit A

Winter Grade Bituminous Patching - Cold Mix

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICT 2

AWARD SHALL BE BASED ON THE LOW-BID UNIT

COST PER TON, PER DELIVERY/STORAGE SITE.

Unit of Estimated Unit Cost Extended

County Delivery/Storage Site Measure Number Tons Per Ton Cost

Cabell Barboursville TON 300

Cabell I-64 @ Huntington TON 0

Lincoln West Hamlin TON 20

Lincoln Yawkey TON 20

Lincoln Harts TON 20

Logan Corridor G @ Chapmanville TON 0

Logan Wilkinson TON 0

Logan Man TON 0

Mingo Mingo County @Miller's Creek TON 150

Mingo Gilbert TON 0

Wayne Crum TON 50

Wayne Pritchard TON 50

Wayne Wayne TON 100

*Quantities listed in this RFQ are approximations only.  It is understood and agreed that the contract shall

cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than

the quantities shown below.   There is no guarantee purchase.



Pricing Page, Exhibit A

Winter Grade Bituminous Patching - Cold Mix

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICT 3

AWARD SHALL BE BASED ON THE LOW-BID UNIT

COST PER TON, PER DELIVERY/STORAGE SITE.

Unit of Estimated Unit Cost Extended

County Delivery/Storage Site Measure Number Tons Per Ton Cost

Calhoun Millstone TON 200

Jackson Ripley TON 300

Jackson I-77 @ Medina TON 20

Pleasants Belmont TON 50

Pleasants St. Mary's (Colin-Anderson Lot) TON 0

Ritchie APD Pennsboro TON 0

Ritchie Ellenboro TON 75

Ritchie Corridor D @ Nutter Farm TON 0

Ritchie Smithville TON 30

Roane Lefthand @ WV 36 TON 0

Roane Ambler Hill @ US 119 TON 0

Roane Spencer TON 200

Wirt Elizabeth TON 75

Wood Parkersburg @ Rt. 95S TON 150

Wood Corridor D @ River Hill TON 0

Wood I-77 @ Mill Run Road TON 35

*Quantities listed in this RFQ are approximations only.  It is understood and agreed that the contract shall

cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than

the quantities shown below.   There is no guarantee purchase.



Pricing Page, Exhibit A

Winter Grade Bituminous Patching - Cold Mix

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICT 4

AWARD SHALL BE BASED ON THE LOW-BID UNIT

COST PER TON, PER DELIVERY/STORAGE SITE.

Unit of Estimated Unit Cost Extended

County Delivery/Storage Site Measure Number Tons Per Ton Cost

Doddridge Smithburg TON 100

Harrison Gore TON 300

Harrison I-79 @ Lost Creek TON 75

Harrison APD 50 @ Tunnel Hill TON 75

Marion Fairmont TON 100

Marion Mannington TON 75

Monongalia I-79 @ Goshen Road TON 15

Monongalia Ridgedale TON 400

Monongalia Pentress TON 100

Preston Albright TON 300

Preston Bruceton TON 100

Preston Terra Alta TON 100

Preston Fellowsville TON 100

Preston Aurora TON 100

Preston I-68 @ Copper's Rock TON 25

Taylor Fetterman/Prunytown TON 75

*Quantities listed in this RFQ are approximations only.  It is understood and agreed that the contract shall

cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than

the quantities shown below.   There is no guarantee purchase.



Pricing Page, Exhibit A

Winter Grade Bituminous Patching - Cold Mix

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICT 5

AWARD SHALL BE BASED ON THE LOW-BID UNIT

COST PER TON, PER DELIVERY/STORAGE SITE.

Unit of Estimated Unit Cost Extended

County Delivery/Storage Site Measure Number Tons Per Ton Cost

Berkeley I-81 @ Martinsburg TON 300

Berkeley I-81 @ Exit 8 TON 0

Grant Petersburg TON 50

Grant Mt. Storm TON 25

Grant Corridor H @ Knobley Road TON 0

Hampshire Romney TON 80

Hampshire Capon Bridge TON 30

Hampshire Slanesville TON 0

Hardy Moorefield TON 75

Hardy Baker TON 75

Jefferson Charles Town TON 100

Mineral New Creek TON 50

Mineral Sky Line TON 0

Mineral Short Gap TON 25

Mineral District Headquarters TON 0

Morgan Berkeley Springs TON 150

Morgan Largent TON 0

*Quantities listed in this RFQ are approximations only.  It is understood and agreed that the contract shall

cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than

the quantities shown below.   There is no guarantee purchase.



Pricing Page, Exhibit A

Winter Grade Bituminous Patching - Cold Mix

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICT 6

AWARD SHALL BE BASED ON THE LOW-BID UNIT

COST PER TON, PER DELIVERY/STORAGE SITE.

Unit of Estimated Unit Cost Extended

County Delivery/Storage Site Measure Number Tons Per Ton Cost

Brooke Wellsburg TON 200 91.40 18,280.00

Brooke Weirton TON 0 No Bid No Bid

Hancock New Manchester TON 300 92.19 27,657.00

Marshall Glen Dale TON 600 89.62 53,772.00

Marshall Cameron TON 350 98.20 34,370.00

Ohio Triadelphia TON 200 91.56 18,312.00

Ohio I-70 @ Triadelphia TON 100 91.56 9,156.00

Tyler Centerville TON 100 102.16 10,216.00

Tyler Sistersville TON 200 99.52 19,904.00

Tyler Sistersville Old Headquarters TON 0 No Bid No Bid

Wetzel Hundred TON 350 101.27 35,444.50

Wetzel New Martinsville TON 200 97.12 19,424.00

Wetzel Pine Grove TON 100 102.48 10,248.00

*Quantities listed in this RFQ are approximations only.  It is understood and agreed that the contract shall

cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than

the quantities shown below.   There is no guarantee purchase.



Pricing Page, Exhibit A

Winter Grade Bituminous Patching - Cold Mix

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICT 7

AWARD SHALL BE BASED ON THE LOW-BID UNIT

COST PER TON, PER DELIVERY/STORAGE SITE.

Unit of Estimated Unit Cost Extended

County Delivery/Storage Site Measure Number Tons Per Ton Cost

Barbour Phillipi TON 25

Braxton Laurel Court TON 60

Braxton I-79 @ Coon Knob TON 30

Braxton I-79 @ Burnsville TON 30

Gilmer Glenville Headquarters TON 50

Lewis Weston (Ben Dale) TON 50

Upshur Clow Lot @ Buckhannon TON 60

Webster Cherry Falls TON 25

Webster Cowen TON 20

Webster Hacker Valley TON 20

*Quantities listed in this RFQ are approximations only.  It is understood and agreed that the contract shall

cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than

the quantities shown below.   There is no guarantee purchase.



Pricing Page, Exhibit A

Winter Grade Bituminous Patching - Cold Mix

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICT 8

AWARD SHALL BE BASED ON THE LOW-BID UNIT

COST PER TON, PER DELIVERY/STORAGE SITE.

Unit of Estimated Unit Cost Extended

County Delivery/Storage Site Measure Number Tons Per Ton Cost

Pendleton Franklin TON 100

Pocahontas Marlinton TON 25

Randolph Elkins TON 125

Tucker Parsons TON 60

*Quantities listed in this RFQ are approximations only.  It is understood and agreed that the contract shall

cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than

the quantities shown below.   There is no guarantee purchase.



Pricing Page, Exhibit A

Winter Grade Bituminous Patching - Cold Mix

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICT 9

AWARD SHALL BE BASED ON THE LOW-BID UNIT

COST PER TON, PER DELIVERY/STORAGE SITE.

Unit of Estimated Unit Cost Extended

County Delivery/Storage Site Measure Number Tons Per Ton Cost

Fayette Oak Hill TON 200

Fayette Corridor L @ Oak Hill TON 0

Fayette Lookout TON 100

Fayette Glen Ferris TON 100

Greenbrier Lewisburg TON 125

Greenbrier Crawley TON 100

Greenbrier I-64 @ Hart's Run TON 15

Monroe Union TON 325

Monroe Peterstown TON 0

Nicholas Summersville TON 200

Nicholas Curtin TON 100

Nicholas Corridor L @ Muddlety TON 50

Summers Hinton TON 100

*Quantities listed in this RFQ are approximations only.  It is understood and agreed that the contract shall

cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than

the quantities shown below.   There is no guarantee purchase.



Pricing Page, Exhibit A

Winter Grade Bituminous Patching - Cold Mix

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICT 10

AWARD SHALL BE BASED ON THE LOW-BID UNIT

COST PER TON, PER DELIVERY/STORAGE SITE.

Unit of Estimated Unit Cost Extended

County Delivery/Storage Site Measure Number Tons Per Ton Cost

McDowell County Headquarters TON 0

Mercer County Headquarters TON 0

Raleigh County Headquarters TON 60

Wyoming County Headquarters TON 0

*Quantities listed in this RFQ are approximations only.  It is understood and agreed that the contract shall

cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than

the quantities shown below.   There is no guarantee purchase.


