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December 11, 2018

Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

SUBJECT: #496152 - Limestone Sand

To whom it may concern,

We are pleased to give you our offer for this bid.
Attached you will also find the files below:

1. Bid Documents

2. GDI Past Performance References

3. List of Contract-Green Dream International

Please also note that Green Dream is registered in SAM

Should you have further questions, please contact Alberto Larson at telephone number

Best Regards,

Alberto Larson

Logistic Manager

Green Dream International
Phone: 814 208 8558

Fax: 202-204-8444
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L PucksiogDvisen State of Wast Virginia
By | shington ast- ol
5 | Post Office Box 50430 Request for Quotation
{ | Charleston, WV 25305-0130 21— info Technulogy
Proc Foider: 408152
Dae: Description: Limastofie Sand (Opet-End)
Proc Type: Central Master Agreement .
Date igsuved Solickation Closgs | Solisitation No Varsion
2018-11-28 2018-12.41 CRFQ 313 DEP18C0SOCDYY {
13,30:00
S TN TR
ERD 'CI..ERK
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
PURCHASING DIVISIGN
ZMSWASHINGTON STE
CHARILESTON Wi 28305
L%

Vendor Nama, Mdms and Talephnne Numbnr:"
Green I_)ream InFernanonal LLC Fax:202 204 8444
2331 Mill Rd, Suite 100

Tel: 202-470-4600

Alexandria, VA 22314

[FOR INFORMATION GONTAGT THE BUYER

Jessits B Ghambars
{304) 558-0048
fessivas.chambers@uwy ~nv

Signatura X Varand FEiNg 46-0522758 pate December 11, 2018

Al offers subgect o @l terms dimvd coudﬁious Tantained in thia aoliciiation

Page: 1 FORM 1Y | WALPRC.CRFG-001
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111808

Extended Description :
28.0 Raleigh County - Limesione Sand

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
OFFICE OF AML&R

801 &7TH ST SE

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY GRDER

CHARLESTON WV 25304 ho City WV 95959

Us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Gy Unii lssue Unit Price Totai Price

29 28.0 Randolph County - Limesione 2000.00000 TON 24.41 48,820.00
Sand

Comm Caode Manufacturer Specification Model ¥

11111808

Extended Description :
29.0 Randoiph County - Limestone Sand

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
OFFICE OF AML&R

601 5YTH 8T 5E

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY CRDER

CHARLESTON WV25304 No City WY 98989
s us
Linge Comm Ln Desc ty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
30 30.0 Taylor County - Limestona 25.00000 TON no bid
Sand
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Modet #
11111808

Extended Description :
30.0 Taylor County - Limestone Sand

Page: 13
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ENVIROCNMENTAL PROTECTION
OFFICE OF AMLER

801 877H ST Sk
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STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY CRDER

CHARLESTON WV25304 No City WV 98990
us Us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit issue Unit Price Total Price
H 31.0 Tucker County - Limestone 300.00000 TON no bid
Sand
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111808

Extended Description :
31.0 Tucker Courty - Limestone Sand

ENVIROMMENTAL PROTECTION
QOFFICE OF AML&R

801 57TH ST 8E

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUZ LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

CHARLESTON WV25304 No City WAV 99999

Us us

Line Comin L Desc Qty Unit issue Lnit Price Total Price

32 3:2.0d Upshur County - Limestone 1000.00000 TON 2549 25 490.00
San

Comuin Code Manufacturer Specification Mocdel &

11411808

Extended Description :
32.0 tipshur County - Limestone Sand

ENVIRCNMENTAL PROTECTION
OFFICE OF AMLER

801 87TTH 8T SE

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS iNDICATED BY CRDER

Sand

CHARLESTON WV25304 Ne City WY 98009

us Us

Line Comm Ln Desc Gty Unit lssue unii Price Total Price
33 33.0 Webster County - Limestone 25.00000 TON no bid

Page: 14
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Comm Goda Manufacturer Specification Moclel #
11111608

Extended Degcription :
33.0 Webster County -~ Limestone Sand

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
OFFICE OF AML&R VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY GRDER

601 BYTH ST SE

CHARLESTCON WV 25304 Ne City Wv 95999
us us
Ling Comm Ln Dasc Gty Unit lssue Unit Price Total Price
34 34.0 Wyoming County - Limestone 25.00000 TON no bid
Sand
Comm Coda Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111608

Extended Degscription :
34.0 Wyoming County - Limestone Sand

Page: 15
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REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Limestone Sand — Coaificld Connties of WV

8.1.4 Failure to remedy deficient perfonmance upon request.
8.2 The following remedies shall be available to Agency upon defaalt,
§.2.1 Immediate cancellation of the Contragt,

8.2.2 lmmediate cancellation of one or more release onders isswed under this
Confract.
8:2.3 Any other remedies available in law or equity,

9. MISCELLANEOUS;

9.1 No Substitutions: Vendor shall supply only Contract. tems submitted in response
1o the Solicitation unless a contract modification is approved irt accordance with the
provisions contained in this Contract,

9.2 Vendor Supply: Vendor must earry sufficicnt inventory of the Contract Tters being
offered to fulfill its ﬂbhgalmnx under this Contract. By signibg its bid, Vendor
certifies that it can supply the Contract Items contained in its bid response:

9.3 Reports: Vendor shall provide quarterly reports and annual summaries to the
Agency showing the Ageney's itéms purchaséd, quantities of items purchased, dnd
total doliar value of the items purchased. Vendor shall also provide reports, npon
request, showing the items purchased during the teem of this Coutract, the guantity
purchased for cach of those items, and the total value of purchases for each of those
items. Failure to supply such reports may be grounds for cancellation of this
Contract.

9.4 Contract Manager: During its performance of this Contract, Vendor must designate
and mamntain a primary cootract manager responsible for overseeing Vendor's
résponsibilities under this Contract. The Contract manager must be available during
normal business hours o address any customer service or other issucs related to this
Contract. Vendor should list its Contract manager and his or het contact information
helow.

Contract Manager: __ Alberto Larson

Telephone Number: _814 208 8558

Fax Npmber: 202-204-8444

Fmail Address: a.larson@greendreamgr .COm

Revised B/1072017
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Past Performance
REFERENCES

Experience No. 1

Contract/Work type: _ Aggregate for Withlacoochee State Forest

Contract Number (if applicable): _ITB/FFS-17 /18-48

Total Contract Value: $ 705,400.00

Agency/firm for who work was performed: _ Florida Department of Agricultureand Consumer Services

Contact person at the site: Telephone #: _(352) 797-4124 (352) 442-7891 (Cell)

E-mail address: Melvin.Reeselr@freshfromfloridacom

Month/Year work began: Month/Year work ended: May 3, 2018 2H00E0NG
Brief description uf duties: Green Dream Supplied and delivered 20,000 tons of # 57 and 5,000 tons of clean fill
sand. 5,000 tons of #57 was delivered in June 2018 - We did not encounter any problems that hindered

; Fthe proi ime. We had a OC off tte at all Fimes.

Experience No. 2
Contract/Work type: ___Aggregate and chip rock delivery

Contract Number (if applicable): _AG9JGPP160156 =

Total Contract Vahlue: $ 1,662,998

Agency/firm for who work was performed: USDA FOREST SERVICE

Contact person at the site: Telephone #: 530478 6162

E-mail address: rgarleb@fsfedus =~

Month/Year work began Month/Year work ended: __ 01/17/2017 30/11/2017

was so good that the Forest Service increased the scope for nearly $300 000 more. We had a QC officer on
site at all times.
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Experience No. 3
Contract/Work type: Paving in Elwha & Mora, Olympic National Park

Contract Number (if applicable): _ INP16PC00727

Total Contract Value: $141,263
Agency/firm for who work was performed: _ NATIONAL PARK SERVICE, OLYMPIC NATIONAL PARK

Contact person at the site: Telephone #: 360-565-3175

E-mail address: cody manzer@nps.gov

Month/Year work began Month/Y ear work ended: __ 07/18/2017 6/13/2018

Brief description of duties; _Green Dream supplied aggregate for National Park Service for the paving project
located in Olympic National Park. We used a local paving subcontractor who was familiar with all the
] i i ime wi : officer on site at

(l ] LINE PTOIE OT1] [1] VIO Il PIODICIT £y DAl 3

=4 CINCT dN O ACTE dDIE

all times.

Experience 4
Contract/Work type: __ Provide and delivery of crushed lime aggregate

Contract Number (if applicable): __AG3434C160003

Total Contract Value: $ 1,000,000

Agency/firm for who work was performed: __ USDA FOREST SERVICE

Contact person at the site: Telephone #: 3045362144

E-mail address: cledwards@fs.fed.us

Month/Year work began: Month/Yesr work ended: ___ 06/09/2017 4/5/2018

Brief description of duties: __Green Dream provided and delivered aggregate for Forest Service
and the project was finished ontime and without anv problems and the client was happy with our

—performance, We had a QC officer on site at all times,
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Washington 140P8318P0074 ggggg 0f 2300 tan of different size of INPS. Ashford WA $103,975.40
. The order is 5000 Tone but they needed NC Department of
ehiCarina 4800020214 2000 Tons now and the rest later. Transportation $135,000.00-
Florida Department of
PO #5-4200-G1480 Supply of Fish Grade Limestone Agriculiure and Consumer $47,385.00
Services
Supply of Lime Rock Material for Solid Waste |Brevard County Government
|PC # 4500099155 I andfile) Center $80,953.63
N Supply of Four materials for Department of
'W91QF4-16-A-0006 Army MICC FORT LEAVENWORTH IMICC FORT LEAVENWORTH $146,095.60
OP-MT-18-001 ngox:.?n of 2800 ten of Ballast # 3 to Sonor:na-Mann Area Rail $99,496.56
Delivery of 10600 ton CLASS 5 Wo01UZ USPFO FOR NORTH
WO01UZ-18-P-5008 I;\GGREGATE $127,700.00
Delivery of 4000 tons 3/4 Inch Minus Crushed -
PO # 140P1418P00S4 Weed Free Gravel NPS. Glacier NP MT $45,880
Supply and delivery of Surface Treatment I
1/18/2448 Agaregate (Type D, Grade 4) Denton County $169,000.00
North Carolina OQT-4800028756 |Sand 1-S IDeparlmant of Transportation $59,850.00
Nerth Carclina 4800028755 Aggregate ABC IDepartmant of Transportation $157,500.00
Supply and delivery of Rip Rap and FWS, DIVISION OF
jASIBEDIES Limestone CONTRACTING AND GR $23,596.68
140L8218P0037 Aggregate (Grading "W™) Road base |Department of the Interior 517,994.00
140F0418P0156 Limestone IDepartment of the Interior $70,789.63
12569R18D0008 Road Repair IDIG Department ﬂgriculture 1$10,000,000.00
12343418D0002 Supply and Delivery of Aggregate Department of Agriculture $39,899.65
140F0418P0137 i o ST pIRsprand Department of the interior $49,398.00
4300576052 DSA Litile Medix Road FD 9 DCNR-PA $207,049.50
W912E K-16-A-0004 Aggregate IDepartment of Army $14,005.00
46367 Stone Department of Transportation $143,500.00
6055E10001588 iLimestone Department of Transporiation $58,185,00
W52P1J-17-D-3000 |Base Course Depariment of Army $163,100.00
INorth Carolina 4800028602 Supplying Sand Department of Transportation $117,000.00
Jhiissouri JIFBGOSSE18001513 Pug Mill Aggregate iDepanment of Transporiation $110,790.00
Missouri 1518 Pug Mill Aggregate Department of Transportation $448,200.00
174718 {MBC STONE FOR DISTRICT 6 ROADS Sc‘;ﬂ:’tyca"’""a Florence $283,106.25
1817118 Macadam Base Course-phase 2 gg‘::‘wca"’""a Florence $408,996.00
North Dakota 18P0020P 00001 Eggeris Playground |Department of the Army $58,724.00
California 140P8418P0013. Delivery of Aggregaie leamem of the Interior $23,802.84
Mississippi 140F0418Q0011 Crushed Limeston US Fish & Wildlife Service $524,188.45
South Carolina 103732 Macadam Base Course-phase 1 Florence County $534,006.00
North Carolina 4800028458 Aggregate State of North Carolina $123,750.00
Oklahoma 56584 Class A sand State of Oklahoma $19,950.00
Oklahoma 56581 Class A sand State of Oklahoma $19,950.00
North Careolina INCBE72 Aggregate State of North Carolina $11,025.00
North Carolina |NC.8694 regate State of North Carolina 511,815.00
North Carolina ~ INC6041 ABC Aggregaie State of North Carolina b24,500.00
South Carolina 4400017562 |Rip Rap, CRUSHER RUN, AND SAND SC-Transportation $163,231.00
South Carolina 4400017421 Bailast/Granite Stone SC-Natural Resources $39,750.00
Oklahoma W52P1J-17-D-3000 McAlester Aggregate |Department of the Army $2,837,250.00
California W01152-17-P-1077 Base Rock and Sand |Depariment of the Army $93,146.00 |
W912DQ17A1015 Gravel Depariment of the Army $37,502.62
W912DQ17A1015x% IRip Rap Department of the Army $50,316.40
F17PX02523 ISl.ppIying Ditch Lining & Limerock Department of the Intedor $109,851.00
F17PX02612 |Gravel Big Oaks JUs Fish & Wildiife Service $25,000.00
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2016

Califomia AG-OACT-P-17-0224 __|Gravel mfe Service 537,536.00 |
Tennessee F17PX02386 Supplying Limestone and Gab@_ Department of the Interior 520,843.00
North Carolina  |F17PX02027 Ig%ﬁéi:‘gﬁgiﬁ:gm GRAVEL, |Depanment of the Interior $428,075.00
Washington W9123F-17-A-0007 |Gravel, Sand and Rock [Department of the Army $14,8506,00
South Carolina 440001 68975 Granite Stone SC-Transportation $12,780.00
HHSI1245201701298P 'Chainlink Fence Department of Health $22,505.99
F17PX01877 Gravel (Deliver & Tailgate spread) JUS Fish & Wildlife Service $25,000.00
4400016967 CR14 Crusher Run SC-General Services $47,275.00
4400016840 JMLBC SC-Transportation $194,700.00
L16PA00088 ICrushed Aggregate |Depariment of the Interior $19,995.00
4600584183 |cR14 Crusher Run IsC-Correction b22,692.00
P16PC00727 Paving in Elwha & Mora IDepartment of the Interior $29,740.00
|AG-04N7-C-17-0020 Fish Gravel Department of Agriculture $44,667.00
JF17PX01191 REPLACE ROCK PILE Department of the Interior $45,270.65
F17PX00140 Red Clay Dirt Department of the Interior $22,667.00

supply of Crushed Rock Gravel for five Years
W9115A-17.D-1002 ID%"‘;mm July 2017 o July 6, 2022 Department of the Army $6,960,308.20
FA462617P0026 Supplying Base Course and Concrete Department of Air Force $29,801.00
W912K6-17-Q0025  [Supply of gravel and Geotextile Efa;‘;“:'mf;‘“’d Bureauof Dept ] ¢q4 00534
WO12KC-17-P-0077 Dark Limestone {Department of the Amy $14,318.50
4300544693 Callen Run DSA JState of Pennsylvania $99,970.00
F17PX00351 Red Clay Dirt 1Cepariment of the Interior $77,200.00
N00244-17-P-0254 Crushed Gravel {Depariment of the Navy $29,886.90
US ARMY CORPS OF

WB12P5-17-P-0047 supply of BEACH SAND ENGINEERS- CELRN-RC-N $26,124.00
4300543880 [Top Soil |State of Pennsylvania $20,216.25
ini AG-3434-C-16-0003 Gravel JUS Fish & Wildlife Service $1,000,000.00
n P18PC00727 Paving in Elwha & Mora |Cepartment of the Interior $141,263.00
|R18PX00867 JAagregate Stockpile |Bureau of Reclamation $136,000.00
JW91QF4-16-A-0006 JRock&Ice Control JCepartment of the Amy $665,000.00
JLI6PBOO766 Crushed Aggregate Department of the Interior $18,887.50
JFA4819-16-P-3037 Crushed Concrete Depariment of the Air Force $47,470.00
WA4WEM-16-P-0393 Raock Department of the Army $118,600.00
R16PX00673 Wildcat Riprap sunply Deparment of the Interior $11,960.00
JSouth Carolina \W3912QG-16-C-0004 Gravel i-D;.partment of the Amy $690,815.00
JAtizona P16PX02223 |Road Base nggartment of the Interior $21,585.00
Chio W91364-16-P-0118 |Gravel Aggregates Department of the Army $11,728.60
JPennsylvania 4300505388 |Top Soil Penn DOT $30,640.50
yWashington 310PO1612109 jPit Run 'State of Washington $22,500.00
JFlorida P16PX01212 Rip Rap Department of the Interior $11,380.40
Washington 4800011575 Crushed Aggregate City of Tacoma $196,940.00
South Carolina W9124C-16-P-0033 Ballast Rocks Department of the Army $27.,000.00
Arkansas V¥811RP-16-D-0001 Roadway Materials |Department of the Army $270,752.00
Washington R16PX00283 Gravel, Sand, Rip-Rap |Department of the Interior $11,120.00
Washington R16PX00263 Gravel, Sand, Rip-Rap |Department of the Interior 514,208.00
Washington |F16PX00483 Rock Delivery Department of the Interior $21,203.00
Chio P16PX00580 |Materials For Sylvan Dam Project Department of the Interior $21,185.00
California F16PX00429 |Roofing Replacement |Depariment of the Interior $25,688.00
Wisconsin W012E5-16-D-0004 Rock |Department of the Amy $321,5689.96
South Carclina 4400012170 FLBC limestone IState of South Carolina $74,520.00
Cklahoma W52P1J-15-D-3038 Aggregate Department of the Amy $3,000,000.00
Arizona 11135-C A@Maierials Maricopa County-Arizona $1,063,500.00
Colorado P15PX04247 Crusher Fines JDepariment of the interior $39,071.00
Guam FA5240-15-P-0182 Crushed Stone |Department of the Air Force $45,340.00
Texas F15PS00955 |timestone Roadbase {Department of the Interior $76,844.55
liniose W52P1J-16-D-3026 approved aggregate stone products 2015- US Army Contracting $3.33,200.00

Command Rock Island




