



914118

Cover Page

TO: Michelle Childers

From: Jeff Wilkinson - NN Seed Co.

RE: 2018 TREE SEED BID

Phone # 419.989.1119

Email nuts242@earthlink.net

RECEIVED  
 2018 SEP -4 PM 1:33  
 WV PURCHASING  
 DIVISION

**Exhibit A Pricing Page  
Hardwood and Conifer Seed**

Clements Seed Needs Fall 2018						
Item #	Common Name	Scientific name	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Pounds required	Extended Cost
3.1.2.1	Red Oak	Quercus rubra	per pound	\$ 2.10	500	\$1050.00
3.1.2.2	White Oak	Quercus alba	per pound	\$ 2.00	3,000	\$6,000.00
3.1.2.3	Chestnut Oak	Quercus prinus	per pound		500	NO BID
3.1.2.4	Black Walnut	Juglans nigra	per pound		2,000	NO BID
3.1.2.5	Sawtooth Oak	Quercus acutissima	per pound	\$ 2.50	100	\$ 250.00
3.1.2.6	Butternut	Juglans Cinerea	per pound	\$ 3.00	250	\$ 750.00
3.1.2.7	Black Cherry	Prunus serotina	per pound		150	NO BID
3.1.2.8	Sugar Maple	Acer saccharum	per pound		150	NO BID
3.1.2.9	Shagbark Hickory	Carya ovata	per pound	\$ 2.75	750	2062.50
3.1.2.10	Red Maple	Acer rubrum	per pound		100	NO BID
3.1.2.11	Sycamore	Platanus occidentalis	per pound		20	NO BID
3.1.2.12	River Birch	Betula nigra	per pound		10	NO BID
3.1.2.13	Black Locust	Robinia pseudoacacia	per pound		60	NO BID
3.1.2.14	Silky Dogwood	Cornus amomum	per pound		20	NO BID
3.1.2.15	Chinese Chestnut	Castanea mollissima	per pound		200	NO BID
3.1.2.16	Redbud	Cercis canadensis	per pound		40	NO BID
3.1.2.17	European Black Alder	Ainus glutinosa	per pound		6	NO BID
3.1.2.18	Virginia Pine	Pinus virginiana	per pound		3	NO BID
3.1.2.19	White Pine	Pinus Strobus	per pound		25	NO BID
3.1.2.20	Norway Spruce	Picea abies	per pound		20	NO BID
3.1.2.21	Scotch Pine (Spanish)	Pinus sylvestris	per pound		2	NO BID
3.1.2.22	American Plum	Prunus americana	per pound		225	NO BID
3.1.2.23	Hazlenut	Corylus americana	per pound		250	NO BID
3.1.2.24	Black Chokeberry	Aronia Melanocarpa	per pound		2	NO BID
<b>Total Bid Amount</b>						<b>\$10,112.50</b>

\*\*\*Total Bid Amount will be used to help vendors submit bids electronically in wvOASIS. If submitting bid electronically, enter total bid amount in commodity line and attach Exhibit A Pricing Page. Enter a zero (0) or "no bid" on the items you are not bidding.\*\*\*