The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
wVvOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West
Virginia’s procurement process, and to maintain the
transparency of the bid-opening process, this
documentation submitted online is publicly posted
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor
responses to this solicitation submitted to the
Purchasing Division in hard copy format.
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Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder : 393118

Solicitation Description : ADDENDUM_1: ASPHALT - MATERIALS & PICKUP BY WVDOH

Proc Type : Central Master Agreement

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2017-12-20 SR 0803 ESR12201700000002849 1
13:30:00
LVENDOR
000000176284
GREER INDUSTRIES INC
Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT1800000046
Total Bid : $0.00 Response Date: 2017-12-20 Response Time: 10:21:29
Comments:
FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Mark A Atkins
(304) 558-2307
mark.a.atkins@wv.gov
Signature on File FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Page: 1

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 ASPHAT MATERIALS AND PICKUP
BY WVDOH
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30121601

Extended Description :

ASPHALT - MATERIALS AND PICKUP BY WVDOH PER THE ATTACHED PRICING PAGES/E-CATALOG:
VVendor shall use the Exhibit A Pricing Pages for bid pricing.

If bidding online, vendor must attach the pricing pages and information attachment to their bid.
See Section 18 of Instructions to Bidders for additional information.
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2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130 )
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 19 - Highways

Purchasing Divison State of West Virginia
Request for Quotation

Proc Folder: 393118

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Doc Description: ADDENDUM_1: ASPHALT - MATERIALS & PICKUP BY WVDOH

Date Issued Solicitation Closes | Sollcitation No Version
2017-12-07 2017-12-20 CRFQ 0803 DOT1800000046 2
13:30:00
[BIGIRECENING LOCATIONIL i Gl e [y o g o R AT ) i z
BID CLERK
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
PURCHASING DiVISION
2019 WASHINGTON ST E
CHARLESTON WV 253056
us
VENDQRE i a8l = I R AR o e =i RO AR i B

Vendor Nama, Address and Telaphone Number:

BUCKEYE ASPHALT COMPANY
PO BOX 1900

MORGANTOWN, WV 26507
304-594-1768

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Mark A Atkins

(304) 558-2307

mark.a.atkins@wv.gov

SIgnatur%“ROBERT A. HENN FEW# 34-0737241

pate 12/19/2017

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Pago: 1

FORM ID : VW-PRC-CRFQ-001




[ADDITIONAL INFORMAITON:

ADDENDUM_1: ls issued for the following:
1. To move the bid opening date from 12/13/2017 to 12/20/2017 at 1:30pm EST.
2. To publish the Agency responses to the questions submitted by Vendors during the Tachnical Questioning period

NO OTHER CHANGES MADE.

The West Virginia Purchasing Division is soliciting bids on behalf of the West Virginia Division of Highways to establish an open-end asphalt
materlals and pickup contract for use on preventive maintenance and repair projects throughout the state of West Virginia by West Virginia
Division of Highways forces from the Vendor's plant per attached documents.

NV O O B e i | DI i e [ 1oy B [T SRIBONRES A Lot o RV ol il Ao 2y v ek
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City WV99899 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc ) ' Qty Unit Issue Unlt Price Total Price
1 ASPHAT MATERIALS AND PICKUP 0.00000
BY WVDOH
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Modol #
30121601

Extendeod Description :
ASPHALT - MATERIALS AND PICKUP BY WVDOH PER THE ATTACHED PRICING PAGES/E-CATALOG:

Vendor shall use the Exhibit A Pricing Pages for bid pricing.
If bidding anline, vendor must attach the pricing pages and information attachment to their bid.
See Section 18 of Instructions to Bidders for additional information,

SGF AT A A R e R O EE
Line Evont Event Date
1 Technical Questions due by: 2017-12-05

Page: 2



SOLICITATION NUMBER: CRFQ 0803 DOT1800000046

Addendum Number: 1

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as CRFQ 0803 DOT 1800000046
(“Solicitation”) to reflect the change(s) identified and described below.

Applicable Addendum Category:
[X] Modify bid opening date and time
[ 1] Modify specifications of product or service being sought
[X] Attachment of vendor questions and responses
[ ] Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet
[ 1 Correction of error

[ ] Other

Description of Modification to Solicitation:
1. To move the bid opening date from 12/13/2017 to 12/20/2017 at 1:30pm EST.
2. To publish the Agency responses to the questions submitted by Vendors during the
Technical Questioning period.

NO OTHER CHANGES MADE.

Additional Documentation: Documentation related to this Addendum (if any) has been included herewith as
Attachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference.

Terms and Conditions:
1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in full force and

effect.

2. Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by completing an
Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith. Failure to acknowledge addenda
may result in bid disqualification. The addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to
expedite document processing.



Attachment_A Asphalt — Materials and Pickup by WVDOH

Addendum #1 CRFQ DOT1800000046

Question #1  In section 4.2 the instructions indicate that a bidder should use the bidding index
for Fuel and Asphalt adjustments for January 2018, as the basis for material
bidding. As this information will not be available until after the first of the year,
and as these bids are due on December 13, 2017, it is not possible to use the
January 2018 indexes. Does this mean we should use the December 2017 index?

Response #1 Please revise the bidding index date indicated in Section 4.2 of the contract
specifications from January 2018 to December 2017.




ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: CRFQ 0803 DOT1800000046

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[\/{ Addendum No. 1 [ 1 Addendum No. 6
[ ] Addendum No.2 [ ] Addendum No. 7
[ ] Addendum No. 3 [ ] Addendum No. 8
[ ] Addendum No. 4 [ 1 Addendum No.9
[ ] Addendum No. 5 [ 1 Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. I
further understand that that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

BUCKEYE ASPHALT COMPANY

= | Company

77 <~ ROBERT A. HENN
Authorized Signature
DECEMBER 19, 2017
Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.



DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as the
Contract AdminiStpatgr and thg initial point of contact for matters relating to this Contract.

LA —
(Name, Title)

ROBERT A. HENN, VICE PRESIDENT
(Printed Name and Title)

PO BOX 1900 MORGANTOWN, WV 26507
(Address)

304-594-1768 / 304-594-2220
(Phone Number) / (Fax Number)
bhenn@greerindustries.com
(email address)

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wvOASIS, I certify that [ have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand
the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid, offer
or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the product
or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for that
product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and
conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that [ am submitting this
bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; that T am authorized by the vendor to execute
and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor’s behalf; that

I am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to the best of my
knowledge, the vendor has properly registered with any State agency that may require
registration.

- BUCKEYE ASPHALT COMPANY
(Companyy b

y L "Zé»//é—ROBERT A. HENN, VICE PRESIDENT
(Authorized Signature) (Representative Name, Title)

ROBERT A. HENN, VICE PRESIDENT
(Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative)

DECEMBER 19, 2017
(Date)

304-594-1768 / 304-594-2220
(Phone Number) (Fax Number)

Revised 11/14/2017



CRFQ 0803 DOT 1800000046
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Asphalt
Materials and Pickup by Agency

11. MISCELLENOUS:

11.1 No Substitutions: The Vendor shall supply only Contract Items submitted in
response to this Solicitation unless a contract modification is approved in
accordance with the provisions contained in this Contract.

11.2  Vendor Supply: The Vendor must carry sufficient inventory of the Contract
Items being offered to fulfill its obligations under this Contract. By signing its
bid, the Vendor certifies that it can supply the Contract Items contained in its bid
response.

11.3 Reports: The Vendor shall provide quarterly reports and annual summaries to
the Agency showing the Contract Items purchased, quantities of Contract Items
purchased and the total dollar value of the Contract Items purchased. The Vendor
shall also provide reports, upon request, showing the Contract Items purchased
during the term of this Contract, the quantity purchased for each of those Contract
Items and the total value of purchases for each of those Contract Items. Failure to
supply such reports may be grounds for cancellation of this Contract.

11.4 Contract Manager: During its performance of this Contract, the Vendor must
designate and maintain a primary contract manager responsible for overseeing the
Vendor’s responsibilities under this Contract. The Contract manager must be
available during normal business hours to address any customer service or other
issues related to this Contract. The Vendor should list its Contract manager and
his or her contact information below.

Contract Manager: _ ROBERT A. HENN

Telephone Number: 304-594-1768
Fax Number: 304-594-2220

Email Address: bhenn@greerindustries.com

Revised 10/27/2014



INFORMATION ATTACHMENT FORM
Vendor’s Storage Sites
Asphalt - Materials and Pickup by WVDOH Forces, ONLY

VENDOR NAME: BUCKEYE ASPHALT COMPANY
Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.

If a Vendor will be supplying materials from multiple Plant Locations and ALL pricing is the same, ALL Plant
Locations can be listed on one Information Attachment Form and one bid submission is acceptable.

If a Vendor will be supplying materials from multiple Plant Locations, at varying prices, additional , separate
bid submissions must be submitted for each Plant Location bid. Multple Plant Locations with varying prices,
shall be submitted on separate bid submissions.

Vendor's Plant Location:

BUCKEYE ASPHALT COMPANY
442 BLANEY HOLLOW ROAD RT. 857
MORGANTOWN, WV 26508

Vendor's Plant Location:

Vendor's Plant Location:

Vendor's Plant Location:




VENDOR CUSTOMER _mSUPPuER NAME MAN |MANUFA |COMMODITY |ITEM DESCRIPFTION |EXTENDED DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE asT mRO MOD |DRA |PIEC |SERI [SPEC|SIZE |COL [PICT

CODE R PART UFA |CTURER |CODE PRICE VERY|DUC [EL WIN [E AL |IFIC OR |URE
NUMBE CTU |PART DAY |T/CA G NUM (ATIO FILE
R RER |NUMBER S TEG BER [N NAM

NAM ORY E
E

A A 1A 30121601 ‘Asphalt DisinG 1 - Asphall Section 401 - Base | TON NOBID | 5 WA |N/A|N/A [NA |N/A |NA NA TNA
1B NA |1-B 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Aspnalt Section 407 - 37.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [NA|N/A|NA[N/ATN/A|NATNATNA
7€ WA [i-C 301215601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphall Section 401 - Base 11 TON NOBID | 5 [NAIN/A[N/A|NA|NA [NATN/ATN/A
1-D ‘|WA 1-D 30121601 Asphalt District T - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON NO B 5 |N/ATN/A|N/A |N/A [N/A |N/ATNTATN/A
it I_NE TE 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphall Section 401 - Wearing IV TON NO BID | 5 [NAITN/JAIN/ATN/ATN/ATNATNATNA
i-F NA [1-F 30121601 Asphalt Dislrict 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [N/ATN/AIN/ATN/A|N/ATNATNATN/A
1G NA [1-G 30121601 Asphalt Distnct 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 |[N/A|N/A|N/ATN/ATN/A TNATN/ATN/A
A NA [1-H 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphall Seciion 401 - Scratch Course TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A|N/A [NTATNTATNA
] NA -] 30121601 Asphalt Disinct T - Asphalt Section 402 - 9 5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [NATNWATN/A[N/A [N/A [NTATNTATNIA
T NA [1-d 367216071 Asphalt Districl 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON NO B 5 |NZATN/A [N/A [NJA [N/A [NTA |NTA TN/A,
IES NA 1K 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 |[NATN/ATN/ATN/A [N/A [N/A E'NIA N/A
[ES N/A [1-L 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Aspnait Section 401 - 4 /5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [NA|N/A|N/AN/ATN/ATNATNATN/A
1-M NA [T-M 30121801 Asphall District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 |INA|N/A|N/A |N/A [N/A [NA [NTA N/A
1-N N/A |T-N 30127601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphait Section 401 - Weaning 1l TON N ID | 5 [NA[N/A|N/A|N/ATN/ATNTATNIATN/A
1-0 A [1-0 30121601 Asphalt Distnct 1 - Asphatt Section 402 - Wearing 111 TON NOBID | 5 |NIA[N/A|N/A [N/A [NIA [NTA [NTA [N/A
1-P NA [1-P 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphaii Piant Run TON NOBID | 5 [N/ATN/A|N/A|N/A|N/A [NAATN/ATN/A
1-Q WA 1-Q |30121501 Asphalt District 1 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/A[N/A|N/AN/A [NATRNTATN/A
TR NA |7 30121607 Asphan District 1 - Surchamge for PG Binder - 76 minus 42 - ordered 1400 Lon INCIements TON NO BID | 5 |NIA|NIA |N/A [NIA | NIA [FIA [NTA [NIA
1-AQ1 N/A [1-AQT  [30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Off-Seasan Planl Opening - First Day DAY NOBID | 5 [N/ATNJATN/A|[N/A [N/A [N7ATNTATNTA
1-A02 N/A |1-AG2  [30121601 Asphall Districl 1 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY NOBID | 5 |N/A|N/A[NJA [N7A [N7A [NTA [NTATN/A
2% TR (2R TEB0T | Asphal Distict 2 - Asphal Seclion 407 - Base | TON NO BID | 5 |NA |NIA | N/A [N/A | NIA | NI [NIA A
2B N/A 2B |30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphall Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 |[N/A|N/A|NA|N/ATN/ATNATN/AN/A
2-C NA |2-C 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I1 TON NO Bl 5 [NATN/ATN/A [N/A [NVA [NVATNTATNIA
7D WA |20 30121601 Asphalt Disinct 2 - Asphall Seclion 401 - Patch and Level TON NOBID | 5 |N/ATN/A[N/A [N/A [N/A [NTATRNTATNIA
2E N/A |2E 30121801 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Seclion 401 - Wearing 1V TON NO BID | 5 [NJATNIATN/A [NIA [N/A |N/A [NTATNIA
2F NA |2-F 30121601 Asphalt Distnct Z - Asphan Seclion 402 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [NAIN/ATN/ATN/A [N/A [NANTATNTA
2-G NA [2-G 30121601 Asphalt Gistrict 2 - Asphalt Section 407 - 1Smm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 |N/A|N/A[NJA [FIA [N/A |NTA [NA TN/A
ZH N/A [2-H |30121601 Asphalt Disinct 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scralch Course TON NOBID | 5 |NA|N/A|N/A[N/A[N/ANA|NIATN/A
2-t N/A 21 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Seclion 402 - 9, 5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [NA[N/A|N/ATN/ATNIA INTA [N/A
2] N/A |2-J 30121601 Asphatt Disinict 2 - Asphatt Seclion 401 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 |MA|NIA|NA [NIAN/A [NA [NIA [NIA
2K NA |2-K [30121601 Asphalt Distict 2 - Asphalt Seclion 402 - Wearing 1 TON NO BI 5 |NIE[N/A |NIA [N/A [N/A [NTA TNTE [NIA
2L N/A |2-L 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphall Section 407 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 |NATN/ATN/ATN/A|N/A [NTATNTATNIA
PET] A |20 30121601 |Asphal District 2 - A=phall Secion 402 - & 75mm Superpave TON NO BID | 5 |N/A [NIA [N/A [NIA |NIZ | FUA |NTA [N7A
2-N WA |2-N 30121601 Asphalt Disirict 2 - Asphait Section 401 - Weanng 1] TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/ATN/ATN/A|NATNIA|N/A
[2-0 WA |20 30121801 Asphalt District 2 - Asphall Section #02 - Wearning 11| TON NOBID| 5 ANA INATNIATN/ATNATN/ATN/A
2-P WA |2-F 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphall Plani Run TON NO 5 [NTATN/A |N/AN/A [N7ATNTATNIA [N/A.
7Q WA [Za 30121601 Asphalt Disirict 2 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NO Bl 5 [N/ATN/A|N/ATN/A [N/A|NTATNZATN/A
2R NA 2R 30121601 Asphalt Distnict 2 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON NOB 5 [N/AIN/A|N/A|N/A |N/ATNATRTATNIA
AT N/A [2-AQ7  [30121601 Asphall District 2 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Firsi Day DAY NOBID | 5 |[NA|N/A[NA|NA[NA|NVA[NATNA
2-AQ2 N/A |2-A02  [30121601 Asphall District 2 - Of-Season Piant Opening - Eaeh Additonal Day DAY NOBID | 5 [N/ATN/AIN/ATN/ATN/A [NTATNIATNIA




[VENDOR CUSTOMER | SUFPLIE|SUPPLIER NAME MAN |MANUFA [COMMODITY |ITEM DESCRIFTION |EXTENDED DESCRIFTION UNIT OF MEASURE _ |IST DELI [FRO |MOD |DRA |PIEC |SERI |SPEC|SIZE |COL |PICT
CODE R PART UFA [CTURER |CODE PRICE VERY|RUC [EL  [wIN [E  [AL  J1FIC OR |URE
NUMBE CTU [PART DAY [Trca G NUM [ATTO FILE
R RER |NUMBER s |rec BER [N NAM
NAM ORY E
E
A NA [A - [P0TZI00T  |Asphalt DIStGL 3 - Asphall Section 401 - Base | TON NOBID | 5 |NA[NA|NANANANEATNA
3B NA |3B 30127601 Asphalt Distnci 3 - Asphail Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 |[NA|N/A |N/A|N/A|N/A [N/ATNTA N/A
3C WA |3C 30121601 Asphar Distric 3 - Asphall Section 401 - Base 11 TON NO BID | 5 [NATN/ATN/A|N/A|N/A [NATNTATN/A
30 NA [3-D 30121601 Asphatt Distrc 3 - Aspnall Seclian 407 - Pateh and Level TON NOBID | 5 |N/A[N/A|NJA [NZA [N/A [NIA [NIA | NFA
3E N/A|3E 30121601 Asphatt Castrict 3 - Asphalt Section 407 - Weanng 1V TON NOBID | 5 |NA|N/A|N/AIN/ATN/ATNATN/ATN/A
3F NA [3F 30121601 ‘Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Seclion 402 - Wearing IV TON NO BID | 5 [NVNATN/A|N/AIN/ATN/A [NATRZATNA
3G NA |36 [30121801 Asphalt Disinct 3 - Asphait Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON NO BID | 5 [NATN/ATN/ATN/A [N/A[NTA|NIATNIA
3-H WA &A 30121601 Asphalt Disinct 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON NOBID | 5 [N/ATN/ATN/A|N/A|N/AN/A|NTATN/A
3 NA |31 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 |NA|N/A|N/A|N/AN/A [N/A [N/ATN/A
3 N/A [3-J 30121801 Asphalt Distnct 3 - Asphail Section 407 - Weanng 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AIN/ATN/ATN/ATNATN/A
3K N/A 3K 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [NAIN/A|N/A[N/A|N/A [NTATNATN/A
3L NA [3L 30121601 Asphall Disinct 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 |[NA[N/AIN/AIN/ATN/ATN/ATNIATN/A
M WA 3™ 30121601 Asphatlt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4,75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [NATN/A|N/A|N/AN/A [NATN/ATN/A
3N NA [3N 30121601 Asphalt Distnct 3 - Aspnalt Section 401 - Wearing 11l TON NO BID | 5 [N/ATN/AIN/A|N/A|N/ATNATNATN/A
30 NA |30 30121601 Asphalt Disinct 3 - Aspnall Section 402 - Weanng 11l TON NG BI 5 |NTAIN/A|N/AN/A [N/A [NATNTATNTA
3P NA |3-P 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Plant Run TON NOBID | 5 |NA[N/A|N/ANA N/A [N/ANATN/A
3Q N/A {3 30121601 Asphall District 3 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/ATN/ATN/A|N/ATN/ATN/A
3R NA 3R 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON NOBID | 5 [NAIN/A|N/ATN/ATN/ATNATNATN/A
3-AQ1 N/A {3-AQ1  |30121601 Asphall District 3 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY NO BID | 5 [N/A|N/AJN/A[N/ATN/A [N/ATNJATN/A
3-AQZ2 NA [3-AQZ [30121601 Aephat District 3 - Off-Season Plant Opening - E3cn Acditional Day DAY NO Bl 5 |[NTATN/ATN/A [N/A |N/A [NTATNTATNTA
000000176276 . A [#A 30121601 |asphat DiStnG: 4 - Asphan Seciion 401 - Base | TON 45.50] 5 |N/A|N/A|NJA |NIA|N/A WA |NIA |N/A
0DO0001 78276 ASPHALT CO. 4B 30121601 Asphalt Distnct 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON 49.50] 5 [N/ATN/ATN/A|N/A [N/A [NTATNIATN/A
000000176276 E ABFHA 4C 30121601 |Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base Il TON 52.00] 5 |N/ATN/A|N/ATN/A|N/A|NA|NATN/A
000000175276 4D 30121601 Asphalt Distnct 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Palch and Level TON 52,00| 5 |[N/AIN/AINATN/ATN/ATN/ATNTATNIA
000000176276 53 30121601 |Asphall District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON 52.00] 5 |N/A|N/A|N/A|N/A WA [NA|NA|N/A
000000176276 4F 30121601 Asphali District 4 - Asphall Seclion 402 - Wearing IV TON 57.00] 5 |[N/A|N/AJN/A|N/A|N/ATNATNTATNIA
000000178278 4G 30121601 Asphal District 4 - Asphall Section 401 - 18mm Superpave TON 52.00 5 [N/ATN/A|N/A|N/AIN/A|NTATN/AN/A
000000176276 +H 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphall Section 401 - Scratch Course TON 54.00| 5 |N/A[N/A|N/A[N/A [N/A|NATNATNIA
000000176276 4 30121601 Asphall Distnct 4 - Asphalt Seclion 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON 58,50| 5 |[NVAIN/A[N/ATN/ATN/A [N/ATNTATNTA
000000176276 +J 30121801 Asphalt District 4 - Asphall Section 407 - Wearing 1 TON 54.00| 5 |N/AIN/ATN/ATN/A [N/A [NTATNTATNIA
000000176276 4K 30121601 Asphall Distiic: 4 - Asphali Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON 59.00] 5 |N/AIN/A|N/A[N/ATN/ATNATNATN/A
000000178275 4L 30121601 Aspitall District 4 - Asphalt Sectlan 407 - 2.75mm Superpave TON 75.00] 5 |[N/AIN/AN/ATN/ATN/A [NATNATN/A
00000176276 M 301216017 [asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4 75mm Superpave TON 80.00] 5 [N/A|N/A|N/ATN/ATN/ATNIATN/ATNIA
000000176276 4N 30121601 |Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Sestlon 407 - Weanng 111 TON 66.00] 5 |N/AIN/AIN/AIN/ATN/ATNATNIATN/A
D00000176276 4-C 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 2402 - Wearing 111 TON 76.00] 5 [N/AIN/A|N/AN/ATN/ATNTATNZATN/A
D0D000176276 4P 30121601 [asphatt District 4 - Asphalt Plant Run TON 54.00] 5 [N/AIN/A|N/A|N/A|N/A [NIA|NTA|NIA
000000176276 4Q 30121601 Asphalt Distict 4 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON 4.55| 5 |N/ATN/ATN/ATN/A [N/A [N/ATRIATNIA
000000176276 4R 30721601 Asphall District 4 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton Increments TON 9.25| 5 |N/AIN/JA[N/ATN/A|N/A|NTATNIATNIA
00000176276 4-AQ1  [30129807  |Asphalt Distnct 4 - Ofi-Season Plant Opening - Firt bay DAY 4000.00] 5 [N/AIN/A[N/ATN/A|N/A|NTA|NFATN/A
000000176276 A2 |30121601 Asphall District 4 - Off-Season Piant Opening - Each Additonal Day DAY 1000.00] 5 |[N/A|N/A [N/A [N7A [N/A |N7A |N7A [N/A
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A A |3-A TS0121601 Asphall istrict 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | T-O_N NO B.I'D 5 Nﬁ N/ATN/A [NFA NIX N/ATN/A|N/A
5B NA |58 30121601 Asphall District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/ATN/ATN/ATN/A|N/A [N7ATNTATNIA
5-C NA [5C 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/ATN/ATNATN/ATN/A
5D N/A [5-D 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON NOBID | 5 |[N/A[N/A|[N/A|N/ATN/AN/ATN/ATN/A
5E NA |5E 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphall Section 401 - Wearing IV TON NO BID | 5 |N/A[NJA[N/A [N/A |N/A [NTA [NTRTN/A
5F NA |5-F 301Z1601 Asphalt Distict 5 - Asphall Section 402 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [NAIN/A[N/A[N/A [N/A [NATNTATNIA
5E NA [5G 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphall Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AINJAIN/ATN/AIN/A[NTATNTATNA
5H NA |5H 30121601 Asphalt Distnet 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON NOBID | 5 [N/ATN/ATN/A |N/ATN/A |N/A|N/ATNIA
5 INED 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphall Setiian 402 - @.5mm Supermave TON NO 5 |NATN/ATN/A INJATN/A [N7ATNTATNTA
) NA [5-J 30121601 Asphatt Distnct 5 - Asphait Section 407 - Wearing 1 TON NO Bi 5 |NTATNJA [N/A [N7A [NTA [NTA NTATNTA
5K NA |5K 30121601 Asphalt Districl 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 |[N/A[N/A[N/ATN/ATN/A [NTATNTATN/A
5L |NA [5-L 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphall Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NO BID | 5 |N/A|N/A |N/A [NJA |NJA [NTA TNTATRNGA
EET] NA [5M 30121601 Asphall District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/ATN/JATN/A|N/A |N/A [NATNATNA
|5~ NTE-N 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Axphalt Saction 401 - Wearing 111 TON NO BID | 5 [N/ATN/ATN/ATN/ATN/A [N/ATN/ATNIA
50 NA |50 30121601 Asphalt Districl 5 - Asphall Section 402 - Wearing Il TON NOBID | 5 |[N/AIN/AIN/A[N/ATN/A [TNATNATN/A
5P NA 5P 30121601 Asphalt Districl 5 - Asphalt Plant Run TON NOBID | 5 |N/A|N/AIN/A |N/AN/AINANIA N/A
5Q NA [5Q 30127601 Asphalt District 5 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/ATN/ATN/ATN/ATNTATN/A
SR N/A |5R 30121601 Asphalt Distrct 5 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON NOBID | 5 [NA[N/AIN/AIN/ATN/ATN/ATN/ATN/A
5201 N/A [5-AQ1  |30127601 Asphalt Districl 5 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Firsl Day DAY NOBID | 5 [NATN/A|N/AIN/A N/A [NATNATNA
S-A0Z NA |5AGZ  |30121601 Asphalt Distnct 5 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY NOBID | 5 [NATN/ATN/A [N/A [N/A [NATNTATNIA
000000176276 7y BUCKEYE ASPHALT C WA oA 30121601 Asphalt Distnct 6 - Asphal Sechon 401 - Base | TON ~49.50] 5 |N/A|N/A|INA IN/AN/A TNAIN/A
000000176276 6B UCKEYE ASPHALT CO. N/A 6B 30121601 Asphall District & - Asphall Section 401 - 37 5mim Supspave TON 4950 5 |[N/A[N/A|N/A [N/AIN/AIN/ATN/ATN/A
D0D000176276 5-C BUCKEYE LT CO NA BT 30121601 Asphall Distnct 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base || TON 52.00] 5 |N/AIN/AIN/ATN/ATN/A|N/ATN/ATNA
000000176276 F.»D BLCKEY' HALT CO. NA 6D 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON 52.00] 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/ATN/ATNTATRNATN/A
DO0000176276 |5—E BUCKETE ASPHALT NA [6-E 30121601 Asphalt Diistrict & - Asphalt Section 407 - Wearing [V TON 52.00] 5 |NAIN/ATN/AIN/ATN/ATNATNIATN/A
00000176276 IF BUCKEYE ASPHALT GO, |NA |6F 130121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON 57.00] 5 |NA[N/A|N/AIN/A [N/A|NAINATNA
D0D000176276 [FG  [BUCKEVE ASPHALT CO. NA [5G 30127601 Asphalt Districl 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON 52.00] 5 |NWA|N/AIN/A[N/A NJA|NATNATNA
0000001 78278 &H BUCKEYE ASPHALT CO NA [6-H 30121601 Asphalt Districl 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON 54.00] 5 [N/ATNJATN/ATN/A|N/A[NATNTATNA
000000176276 EYE ASPHALT CO. NA |61 30127601 Asphah Districl 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON 5850| 5 |NIA|N/A|NJAIN/A |N/A|NAINIATNIA
|onooon17a2?s 2 NA [6-J 30121601 Asphalt Distnct 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON 54.00] 5 [NJATNJATN/ATN/A|N/A [N/ATNTATNTA
D00000176276 NA [BK 30121601 Asphalt Districi 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON 59.00] 5 [N/ATNJAIN/ATN/A|N/A|NATNIATNIA
000000176276 BUCKEVYE ASPHALT CO. WA |6-L 30121601 Asphalt District @ - Asphall Saction 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 75.00] 5 |NAIN/AIN/ATN/ATN/A |NTATNTATNIA
000000176276 SPHA 30127601 Asphall Disticl 6 - Asphall Section 402 - 4 75mm SUpeTpave TON 80.00] 5 |N/A|N/A|N/A[N/ATN/ATN/ATR/ATN/A
000000176276 30121601 Asghalt Bistict 8 - Asphall Section 401 - VWeanng 11l TON 66.00] 5 [N/A|N/A|N/A|N/A |N/A [NATNATN/A
000000176276 30121601 Asphatt Distnict 6 - Asphall Section 402 - Wearing Il TON 76.00] 5 [N/ATN/ATN/ATN/A|N/A[NATNIATNA
D00000176276 &P 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Plant Run TON 54.00] 5 [N/ATN/ATN/ATN/ATN/A|NATNTATN/A
000000176276 NA [6-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON 455 5 [NFATN/ATN/ATN/ATN/A [NTA|NTATNIA
[booo00176276 R |BUCKEYE ASPHALT CO, NA [6R 30127601 Asphalt District 6 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton inGrements TON 9.25| 5 |N/A|N/A|N/A|N/A[NJA [NATNIA|NA
D00000176276 6AQ1 [l Y T CO. NA |6-AQ1  [30121601 Asphail District & - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY 4000.00] 5 |NIA|NJA [N/A [N/A [N/A |NTA [NTA TNTA
000000176276 6-AQ2 |BUCKEYE ASI T CO. N/A 16-AGZ  [30127601 Asphall Distnict 6 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY 1000.00 5 |N/A|N/A|N/AN/ATN/ATNATN/ATNA
TR A |T-A 30121601 ‘Asphalt District 7 - Asphall Section 407 - Base | TON NOBID | 5 |N/A|N/A |N/A|N/A N/A |N/A [NTA [NIA
7-B N/A [7-B 30121601 Asphall District 7 - Asphall Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | & A IN/A [N/A [N/A TN/A [NTATNFATN/A
7-C N/A 17-C 30127601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base Il TON NO Bi 5 [NATN/ATN/A [N/A |N/A [N7ATNTATN/A
7-D NA 17-D 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphall Section 401 - Paich and Level TON NOBID | 5 |NA|N/A[N/A[N/AIN/A |NA [NATNA
TE WA |7-E 30121601 Asphall Districi 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON OBID | 5 |NA[N/A[N/AN/ATNATNATNATN/A
7-F NA [7-F 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 |[N/A|N/A[N/AIN/ATN/ATNATNATN/A
7-G NA |7-G 30121601 Asphall District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON NO BID | 5 [N/ATNJATN/A|N/A [N/A [NTA [RTA TNTA
7-H NA |7-H 30121601 Asphall Districi 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON NO 5 [NJATN/A [N/ATN/A [NTA |NTATNTA TN/A
7 NA [T+ 30121601 Asphait District 7 - Asphall Section 402 - 5.5mm Superpave TON NO Bi 5 |N/A|NJA [N/A [N/A [NTA [N7A [NTATNIA
70 N/A |7 30127601 Asphall District 7 - Asphait Secfion 401 - Wearing 1 TON NO BI 5 |N/ATN/AN/A|N/A|N/A |[NTATNTATN/A
TR NA [TK 30121801 Azphall Districd 7 - Aspnai Saction 402 - Weanng | TON NO Bi 5 |NTANIA [N/A [NIA | NZA [N7A [NTE TNA
7L NA [7L 30121601 Asphall District 7 - Asphalt Section 407 - 4.7 5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/A[N/ATN/A[N/A|NTANFATN/A
™ NA [T 30721607 Asphalt Disirct 7 - Asphall Section 402 - 4, 75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 |N/A|N/A [NIA [NTA [NIA [NTA [RTA TNTA
TN NIA | TN 30121607 Asphait Dielrict 7 - Asphalt Section 407 - Weanng 1M1 TON NOBID | 5 |NIA|N/A [N/A [NIA [NiA [NIA [NTA TNIA
7-0 N/A [7-0 30127601 Asphatt District 7 - Asphall Seciion 402 - Vveanng 11| TON NOBID | 5 |N/A|N/A[N/A|N/A[N/ATNTATNIA|N/A
7P Ni& [T-F 30727607 Asphail Distnct 7 - Asphall Plant Run TON NQBID | 5 |NIA|NIA [N/A |N/A [NIA [NIE TR |NTA
7-Q NA7-Q 30121601 Anphait Distnct 7 - Surchamge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NOBID | 5 |N/A|N/A |N/A [N/A [N/A [NTATNIA N/A




VENDOR CUSTOMER SUPPFLIE{SUPPLIER NAME MAN |MANUFA (COMMODITY |ITEM DESCRIFTION |EXTENDED DESCRIFTION UNIT OF MEASURE usT DELI [PRO |MOD |DRA |PIEC |SERI [SPEC|SIZE [COL EPICr
CODE R PART UFA |CTURER |CODE PRICE VERY|DUC |EL WIN |E AL IFIC OR (URE
NUMBE CTU |PART DAY |T/CA G NUM [ATID FILE
R RER {NUMBER s TEG BER [N NAM
NAM ORY E
E
T == ————
TR WA 7R 30121601 |Asphalt |DISINGL 7 - SUrGharge for PG Binder - 76 Minus 22 - orered In 400 Ton merements TON NOBID | 5 |FUA | N/A N/A | NIA NIA NI | NI [NIA
AT WA [7-AQT 30727601 |asphatt Distict 7 - Off-Seasan Plant Gpening - Bt Doy DAY NOBID | 5 |N/A |[N/A|N/A /A |N/A [N/A |N/A [NTA
7-AQ2 WA [T-AQZ  [30121601 |Asphatt District 7 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY NOBID | 5 |[NA N/A [NVA [N/A [N7A [NTA [NFA |NTA
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50121601 [Asphat [Dsinct & - R=pran Section 401 - Base | TON NO BID | 5 |\UA|N/A [NIA | N/A [NIA [N [NTA [NIA
30121601 Asphalt District 8- Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 |[NAIN/A[N/ATN/ATN/A NTA{N/A
30121601 Asphalt Distnct 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base 11 TON NOBID | 5 [NA|N/A [N/A [N/A|N/A [NTA[NTATN/A
30121601 Asphalt Distnct 8 - Asphall Section 401 - Patch and Level TON NO BID | 5 |[N/ATN/ATN/A|N/A|N/A [NTATNIATN/A
30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphall Section 401 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 |[N/AIN/AIN/ATN/ATN/A [NA|TNATN/A
30121601 Asphalt Disinct 8 - Aspnall Section 402 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 |[N/A|N/A[NAIN/ATN/ATNATN/ATN/A
30121601 ‘Asphait District 8 - Asphalt Seclion 401 - 19mm Superpave TON BID | 5 [N/A|[N/A[N/A[N/A|N/A [NTATNATN/A
30121601 ‘Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Seclion 401 - Scratch Course TON NO BID | 5 [NATN/AIN/A|N/A |N/A NATNTATN/A
30121601 ‘Asphalt Disinct 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON NO BID | 5 [NATN/AIN/ATN/A|N/A [NFATNIATN/A
30121601 Asphalt Distnct 8 - Asphalt Seciion 401 - Wearing 1 TON NO BID | 5 [N/ATN/ATN/ATN/ATN/A [NTATNTATN/A.
30121601 Asphalt Disinct 8 - Asphalt Seclion 402 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/ATN/AIN/ATN/AN/A [NFATNTATN/A
30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Seclion 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 |NA|N/A|N/A[N/AN/A [NTA [NTA TN/A
[WA[8 30121801 |Aephalt District & - Asphalt Seciion 402 - 4.15mm Superpave TON NO BID | 5 [NIA]NANJATNIA TNIA IAINIA,
3N I’liA BN 30121601 Asphalt Distnict 8 - Asphalt Seclion 401 - Wearing 1l TON NO BID | 5 [N/ATN/AIN/A|N/AIN/ATRATNATN/A
&0 WA |50 30121601 Asphalt Disinct & - Asphaht Section 402 - Wearing 11l TON NO BI 5 [N/ATN/ATN/A|N/A |N/A [NTATNTATNIA
—]Etp WA [&P 30121601 Asphalt Distnict § - Asphalt Plani Run TON NOBID | 5 |N/A|N/A|NIA|NA|NA INA[NATNA
Q NA |&a 30121601 Asphalt Disirict 8 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/JA|N/ATN/ATN/ATNATNATN/A
|_sz _iﬁ/A B8R 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON NOBID | 5 [NAIN/AIN/A|N/ATN/ATN/ATN/ATN/A
&AQT N/A [8-AQ1  [30121601 Asphall District 8 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Firsl Day DAY NOBID | 5 [N/AINJAINJA[N/ATN/ATN/ATN/ATN/A
AQ2 N/A |&AQ2Z |301z1601 Asphall Districi & - Ofi-Season Plan Opening - Each Additional Day DAY NOBID | 5 [N/A|N/A|N/AIN/ATN/ATN/ATN/ATN/A
TA NA |A (30121801 ‘Asphalt Disinct 9 - Aspnalt Section 401 - Base | TON NOBID | 5 |NA|N/A[NA|NAINA NA|NANA
9B 30127601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37, 5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [NAIN/A|IN/AIN/ATN/ATNTATN/ATN/A
S-C 30121601 Asphall District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base Il TON N 1D | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/ATN/ATNATN/ATN/A
];:—D 30127601  |asphait Distncl 8 - Asphall Section 401 - Patch and Level TON NOBID | 5 [NATN/ATN/A|N/A TN/A[NATNATNIA
SE 30121601 Asphall District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [NVAIN/ATN/ATN/ATN/ATNATN/ATNIA
OF 30121601 Asphalt Distnct 9 - Asphall Section 402 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 |[N/A[N/ATN/E[NFATNIA INFA TNFA TN/A
%G 30127601 Asphalt Distnct 9 - Asphalt Section 407 - 19mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [NAIN/AIN/AIN/ATN/ATNATN/ATN/A
SH 30121601 Asphalt Distnct 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON NO BID | 5 [NJATN/AIN/A|N/AIN/ATN/A N/A
& 30121601 Asphalt Districl 9 - Asphall Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [NFA|N/ATN/A[N/A|N/A[N/ATN/ATNIA
ad 30121601 Asphalt Districi 9 - Asphall Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON NO Bi 5 |NTATN/A|N/A|N/A|N/A [NTATNTATN/A
K 30121601 Asphatt District & - Asphalt Section 402 - Weanng 1 TON NO Bl 5 |NFATN/ATN/A [N/AN/A [NTATNTATNIA
L 30121601 Asphalt Distnct @ - Asphalt Section 407 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/ATN/ATN/ATN/A|N/ATNIATNA
SM 30121601 Asphalt Distnict 9 - Aspnall Section 402 - 4. 75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 |N/A|N/A [N/A [N/A [NIA [NIA [NTATNTA
TN NA [N [30121601  |asphat District - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 11l TON NOBID | 5 |N/A|N/A|N/A [N/A [IN/A [N/A [NTA [N/A
20 NA |80 30121601 Asphalt Distnct 9 - Asphall Section 402 - Wearing 111 TON N 10 | 5 [NIA|IN/A[N/A N/ATN/ATNTATNTATN/A
9P NA [P 30121801 Asphalt District 9 - Asphall Planl Run TON NO Bl 5 |N/ATN/A [NIA [N/A [N/A WA TNTA TNIA
5] WA [oQ 30121601 Fsphart Distncl @ - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NOBID | § |NIA|N/A|N/A [NIA [N/A |NTA TRTA [N/A
SR A [oR 30121601 Asphalt Disinet 8 - Surcharge for PG Binder- 76 minus 22 - ordered In 400 160 Increments. TON NOBID | 5 |[N/AIN/ATN/ATN/A|N/A [NTATNTATN/A
SAQ1 N/A_[9-AQ1  |a0i21601 Asphatt Distict & - Of-Season Plent Opening - First Day DAY BID | 5 |NAIN/ANIATNIATNA [NTATNTATN/A
5-AQ2 A |[9AQZ  |30121801 Asphalt Districl 8 - Off-Season Piant Opening - Each Addmonal Day DAY NOBID | & ATNIA [NA |NTA [NJA TNTA TNZATN/A
TOA WA |10/ [36121601  |asphalt Titcl 10 - ASphaf Section 407 - Base | TON NO BID | 5 |WA | N/A |NIA [N/ |NTA |NIA [FOA TNIA
10-6 WA [10-B  [s0121801 Asphalt District 10 - Asphall Section 401 - 37.56mm Superpave TON NO BID | 5 |NA|NA|N/A |NA [N/A [NTA [NTATN/A
10-C Ni& [10-C 30121607 Asphalt District 10 - Asphall Section 01 - Base 1l TON NOBID| 5 EINIATNIA |N/ATN/A|NTATNZATNTA
10-D NA [10-D 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON NOBID | 5 [NAIN/AIN/AIN/ATN/ATNIATNFATN/A
10-E NA [10-E 30121601 Asphalt Disies 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Weanng 1V TON NOBID | 5 [N/ATN/ATN/A|N/A [N/A|NTATNATNIA
10-F WA |10-F 30121601 Asphan District 10- Asphalt Saction 402 - Wearnng vV TON NOBID | 5 [NATN/ATN/ATN/ATNA [NFATNFATNIA
10-G NA“[10-G 30721601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphall Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [NJAIN/ATN/ATN/ATNIA [NFATNZATN/A
10-H N/A [10-H 30121601 ‘Asphait Distnct 10 - Asphall Section 401 - Soralch Coursa TON NOBID | 5 A TNA [NIA [NIA TNA, [NTA | NTA
[ NA (T8 30121607 Asphall District 10 - Asphall Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/ATN/A|N/A|N/A [NiA [NTAT N/A
10-0 WA |10 30121601 Asphall District 16 - Aspnall Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 |NA[N/A[N/A [N/A [N/A|NTATNTATNIA
T0-K ~ WA 10K 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphall Secton 402 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 |NTA[N/ATNA [NA |NA [NA [NATNIA
T0-L NA [10-L 30121601 Asphalt District 30 - Asphalf Section £01 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [NATN/ATN/ATN/ATN/A [NATNTATNIA
10-M N/A [10-M 30121601 Asphall District 10 - Asphalt Sediion 402 - 4. 76mm Superpave TON NOBID | & [NATN/ATNATNATNAINATNATNA
TON WA [T0N  [30121801 | Asphatt DHstrict 1C - Asphall Seclion 407 - Weanng 11l TON NOBID | 5 |N/A|N/A [NZA [FIA | N/A [T [N TRTA
10-0 N/A"[10-0 30121601 Asphatt Distnict 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing Il TON NOBID | 5 |[N/AIN/AN/AIN/ATN/A|NATN/ATNIA
10-P NA [16-F 30121601 Asphalt Disingt 10 - Asphall Plant Run TON NOBID | 5 [NATN/ATN/A [N/A [NIA TNETRTATNA
10-Q NA [10-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NO Bl 5 |N/ATN/ATN/ATN/A TN/A [NTATRTATNA
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CODE R PART UFA |[CTURER |CODE PHRICE VERY|DUC |EL WIN (E AL EFIC OR |URE
NUMBE cTu [parT oAy |Tica G NUM |aTIC FILE
R RER |NUMBER £ TEG BER |N NAM
NAM oRY E
E
e e e === — =
10K NA |10R - [30121607  |Asphalt District 10 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 200 1o Increments TON BiD 1 5 N/A [N/A |N/A |N/A | A | NOA INTA
To-AQT WA [10-AQT 30121601 Aspral District 10 - ON-Seasan Flam Opening - FIrsl Day DAY NO Bl 5 [NAN/A|N/A|NANA INA|N/A
A2 WA |10-AGQZ |30121601 Asphall District 10 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY NOBID | 5 |NA|N/A[N/A|N/A [N/A |N/A[NAN/A




WV-10 State of West Virginia
Approved / Revised
09116117 VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1. Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia, or bidder is a partnership, association
or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West
Virginia, for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a resident vendor partnership, association, or corporation with at least eighty percent of ownership interest
of bidder held by another entity that meets the applicable four year residency requirement; or,

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; of,

U K

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

ad
[

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor that employs a minimum of one hundred state residents, or a nonresident vendor which
has an affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia and
employs a minimum of one hundred state residents, and for purposes of producing or distributing the commaodities or
completing the project which is the subject of the bidder's bid and continuously over the entire term of the project, on
average at least seventy-five percent of the bidder's employees or the bidder's affiliate’s or subsidiary's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years and the
vendor’s bid; or,

Ds»

Application is made for 5% vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,

Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

LB

Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commaodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor’s bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

Dsn

7. Application is made for preference as a non-resident small, women- and minority-owned business, in accor-
dance with West Virginia Code §5A-3-59 and West Virginia Code of State Rules.

[:I Bidder has been or expects to be approved prior to contract award by the Purchasing Division as a certified small, women-
and minority-owned business.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) rescind the contract or purchase order;
or (b) assess a penalty against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to
the contracting agency or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder

and if anythmg contained within this certificate changes durlng the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchas-
%@ROBERT A. HENN

ing Division in writing immediately.
*Check any combination of preference consideration(s) indicated above, which you are entitled to receive.

Bidder: BUCKEYE ASPHALT COMPANY Signe ’

Date: DECEMBER 19, 2017 Title: VICE PRESIDENT




STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS: Under W. Va. Code § 5-22-1(i), the contracting public entity shall not award a
construction contract to any bidder that is known to be in default on any monetary obligation owed to the state or a
political subdivision of the state, including, but not limited to, obligations related to payroll taxes, property taxes, sales and

use taxes, fire service fees, or other fines or fees.

ALL OTHER CONTRACTS: Under W. Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by
the state or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or
a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and: (1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one

thousand doliars in the aggregate; or (2) the debtor is in employer default.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition listed above does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to chapter
eleven of the W. Va. Code, workers’ compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the matter has
not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the

provisions of such plan or agreement.

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its political
subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers’ compensation premium, penalty
or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including

any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.
“Employer default” means having an outstanding balance or liability to the old fund or to the uninsured employers' fund or being
in policy default, as defined in W. Va. Code § 23-2c¢-2, failure to maintain mandatory workers' compensation coverage, or failure to

fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An employer is not in employer default if it has entered
into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Commissioner and remains in compliance with the obligations under the

repayment agreement.

“Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other
form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or contract through
which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive or
control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an

amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total contract amount.

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor’s authorized signer affirms and acknowledges under penalty of
law for false swearing (W. Va. Code §61-5-3) that: (1) for construction contracts, the vendor is not in default on
any monetary obligation owed to the state or a political subdivision of the state, and (2) for all other contracts,
that neither vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined above and that neither vendor nor any related
party are in employer default as defined above, unless the debt or employer default is permitted under the

exception above.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:
Vendor's Name: BUCKEYE ASPHALT COMPANY

Authorized Signature: M%E@W/‘/ROBERT A. HENN Date: PECEMBER 19, 2017

/
state of WEST VIRGINIA
t MONONGALIA o it

County o

ﬂday of DECEMBER 20

Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this

My Commission expires \’C/@/u_é’,x ;} 9 ,201.7..

“llmmunuummumummmn|I|IIN9TARY PUBLICK

OFFICIAL SEAL

% STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

: NOTARY PUBLIC
J Heather L, Page
B . 570 Canyon Rd.,
; CI:}lrgrg]antown, WV 26508
mission
T FlllllllIrl!lllllltllllﬁ:?::iflﬁ?ﬁl?;ﬁ?lzlzﬂ
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Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 07/07/2017)

AFFIX SEAL HERE'

.— WEST '




West Virginia Ethics Commission .
Disclosure of Interested Parties to Contracts
(Required by W. Va. Code § 6D-1-2)

GREER INDUSTRIES, INC. pqdress: 570 CANYON ROAD
MORGANTOWN, WV 26508

Contracting Business Entity:

Authorized Agent: ROBERT A. HENN, VP Address: 570 CANYON ROAD MGT, WV 26508

Governmental agency awarding contract: STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

[0 Check here if this is a Supplemental Disclosure

List the Names of Interested Parties to the contract which are known or reasonably anticipated by the contracting business
entity for each category below (attach additional pages if necessary):

1. Subcontractors or other entities performing work or service under the Contract
Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

2. Any person or entity who owns 25% or more of contracting entity (not applicable to publicly traded entities)
[J Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.
JOHN R. RAESE & DAVID A. RAESE

3. Any person or entity that facilitated, or negotiated the terms of, the applicable contract (excluding legal
services related to the negotiation or drafting of the applicable contract)

[J Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

Fz(:)EsEElcz-ri;;t;;égééifit::ik
Signature: 7 /M/ Date Signed: DECEMBER 19, 2017

T

Notary Verification

1, ROBERT A. HENN , the authorized agent of the contracting business
entity listed above, being duly sworn, acknowledge that the Disclosure herein is being made under oath and under the
penalty of perjury.

%Mfiw’ L‘q?w"u

Notary Publﬁ: 5;8|gnatu|emumumm|||m|m|m|mmm|

Taken, sworn to and subscribed before me this 19

: , OFFICIAL SEAL
To be completed by State Agenc \ STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
d  NOTARY PUBLIC

Date Received by State Agency:
Date submitted to Ethics Commission:
Governmental agency submitting Disclosure:

Heather L. Page

4 570 Canyon Rd.

s ¥’  Morgantown, WV 26508
s My Commission Expires Feb, 9, 2022
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WESTVIRGINIA
CONTRACTOR
LICENSING
BOARD

PAAAAAAAAY

CONTRACTOR LICENSE

Authorized by the

West Virginia Contractor Licensing Board

Number: WV003348

Classification:

ASPHALT
SPECIALTY

GREER INDUSTRIES INC
DBA GREER INDUSTRIES INC
570 CANYON ROAD
MORGANTOWN, WV 26508

Date Issued Expiration Date
SEPTEMBER 05, 2017 SEPTEMBER 05, 2018
& g
L w2 A Pl e
Neas T b v/ Sl Lty
A _thorizcd Company Signa‘tﬂre Chair, West Virginia Contractor

Licensing Board

This license, or a copy thereof, must be posted in a conspicuous place at every construetion site where work is being
performed. This license number must appear in all advertisements, on all bid submissions and on all fully executed
and binding contracts. This license cannot be assigned or transferred by licensee. Issued under provisions of West
Virginia Code, Chapter 21, Ardicle 11.



DATE {(MM/DDIYYYY)

N
AEQRD" CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE ORI

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the cortificate holder Is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(les) must be endorsed. If SUBROGATION 1S WAIVED, subject to
the terms and conditions of the policy, certaln policles may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the

certificate holder In lleu of such endorsement(s). -
PRODUGER SONTAGT
Marsh USA Inc. —EL e B FAX
gllt); };PG hF’I’z:i,'oQo,1&‘;3112"292 300 WC. "lo. Emk: - — (AIG, te):
sburgh,
Alln: Joshua Zunlc 412-552-6066 ADORESS) — -
INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
101962--EXCES-17-18 INSURER A : Charter Oak F ire Insurance Company. 25815
INSURED . The Standard Firs insurance Compan 19070
Grear Induslrles, Inc. INFLIREE R 'a a ,' e aalt — L
Dba Greer Asphalt Company INSURER € ¢ BrickStreet Mutual insurance Co. ) |12372
P.0. Box 1900 R D - NiA NIA
INSURER D :
Morganiown, WV 26507-1900 T = — = = =
i suRer e : NA_ — e
INSURER F :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: CiE-004839475-21 REVISION NUMBER:5

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS,

far TYPE OF INSURANGCE m POLIDY NUMBER SO e | é’ﬂ";',w L LIMITS
A | X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY Y-630-20100622-COF-17 01/01/2017 01/01/2018 EACH QCCURRENCE s 1,000,000
= a2 R N L ALY
il lCLAIMS MADE LJ OCCUR p,ﬁ‘fﬁ‘%éﬂ,ﬁﬂﬂéﬁmm: 5 300,000
i P_@Mgﬁ‘lom"m SEDUG _MED EXP {Any one person) $ 10,000
! PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | § 1,000,000
_C_'-E_N'L AGBREG: ATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: | GENERAL AGGREGATE s 2,000,000
|eouey| | B [ %] oc PROBLCTS - COMP/OP AGG | $ 2,000,000
QTHER - g s
810- COF- 1017201 FARTNET SINGILE LW
A | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY Y-810-20101108-COF-17 000172017 |01/01/2018 _fegﬁgg_d_gﬁl_' GLE L 5 1,000,000
X | any auto | BODILY INJURY (Per parson) | 5
Qb&rggVNED ] /SKS%QU;EE; BODILY INJURY‘(Per accident)| § -
- ) \
| Hrep AUTOS B o OWNED COMP/COLL DED: $1000 ;Ji-?fféﬁl‘.}.?" AGE $
. H'RED COMP/GOLI. DED: $10C0 $
| umBRELLA LIAB OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE 13
| EXCESS LIAB 'CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE %
oo | | Retenmions 3
B |WORKERS COMPENSATION YC-UB-2010063-4-17 ofioTet? 0101208 X lPER [ 1] OTH-
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY YiN . X . LSTAWUTE LER
ANY PROPRIETORIPARTNERIEXECUTIVE I_Nl . {CT. IL, IN, MD, MI, NG, PA} €.l EACH ACCIDENT s 1,000,000
| > Ik B L -

C | {Mandatory In NH) — WCB1011617 (Wv) 011012017 |01/012018 £.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE] § 1,000,000
If yas, doacribe undar . ) 3 - = =
DESCRIPTION QF OPERATIGNS bilow E L DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | 3 1,000,000

i
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Scheduls, may be attached If more space is required)
CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION
Stale of West Virginls SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
Depaﬁmenlof{\(?mlnlslrallon THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
Purchasing Division ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.
2019 Washington Slreet Easl
(Oagsioagad S50 AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE
of Mareh USA Inc.
Manashi Mukherjee Manisons Macte nurdet

!
© 1988-2014 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved,
ACORD 25 (2014/01) The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD




