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Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East

Charleston, WV 25305-0130
Post Office Box 50130

State of West Virginia

393118

ADDENDUM_1: ASPHALT - MATERIALS & PICKUP BY WVDOH

Central Master Agreement

2017-12-20

13:30:00

SR 0803 ESR12151700000002685 1

 VENDOR

000000112893

CAMDEN MATERIALS LLC

Comments:

Total Bid : Response Date: Response Time:Total Bid : 

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT1800000046

$0.00 2017-12-15 15:16:47

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Signature on File FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001

Mark A Atkins

(304) 558-2307
mark.a.atkins@wv.gov
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Extended Description :

1 ASPHAT MATERIALS AND PICKUP
BY WVDOH

30121601

ASPHALT - MATERIALS AND PICKUP BY WVDOH PER THE ATTACHED PRICING PAGES/E-CATALOG:
Vendor shall use the Exhibit A Pricing Pages for bid pricing.
If bidding online, vendor must attach the pricing pages and information attachment to their bid.
See Section 18 of Instructions to Bidders for additional information.
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000000112893 1-A Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-A 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 1-B Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-B 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 1-C Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-C 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 1-D Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-D 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 1-E Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-E 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 1-F Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-F 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 1-G Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-G 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 1-H Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-H 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 1-I Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-I 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 1-J Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-J 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 1-K Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-K 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 1-L Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-L 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 1-M Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-M 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 1-N Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-N 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 1-O Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-O 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 1-P Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-P 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 1-Q Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 1-R Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-R 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 1-AQ1 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 1-AQ2 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 1-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-A Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-A 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-B Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-B 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-C Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-C 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-D Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-D 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-E Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-E 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-F Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-F 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-G Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-G 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-H Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-H 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-I Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-I 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-J Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-J 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-K Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-K 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-L Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-L 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-M Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-M 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-N Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-N 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-O Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-O 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-P Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-P 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-Q Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-R Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-R 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-AQ1 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 2-AQ2 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 2-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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000000112893 3-A Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-A 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON 58.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 3-B Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-B 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON 59.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 3-C Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-C 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON 58.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 3-D Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-D 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON 58.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 3-E Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-E 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON 59.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 3-F Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-F 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON 67.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 3-G Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-G 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON 60.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 3-H Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-H 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON 60.25 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 3-I Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-I 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON 69.25 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 3-J Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-J 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON 61.25 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 3-K Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-K 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON 69.25 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 3-L Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-L 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 67.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 3-M Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-M 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 68.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 3-N Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-N 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON 66.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 3-O Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-O 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON 67.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 3-P Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-P 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Plant Run TON 60.25 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 3-Q Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON 5.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 3-R Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-R 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON 15.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 3-AQ1 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY 3500.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 3-AQ2 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 3-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY 800.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-A Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-A 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-B Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-B 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-C Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-C 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-D Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-D 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-E Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-E 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-F Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-F 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-G Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-G 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-H Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-H 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-I Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-I 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-J Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-J 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-K Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-K 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-L Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-L 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-M Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-M 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-N Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-N 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-O Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-O 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-P Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-P 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-Q Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-R Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-R 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-AQ1 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 4-AQ2 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 4-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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000000112893 5-A Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-A 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 5-B Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-B 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 5-C Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-C 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 5-D Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-D 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 5-E Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-E 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 5-F Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-F 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 5-G Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-G 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 5-H Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-H 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 5-I Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-I 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 5-J Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-J 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 5-K Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-K 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 5-L Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-L 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 5-M Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-M 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 5-N Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-N 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 5-O Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-O 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 5-P Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-P 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 5-Q Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 5-R Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-R 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 5-AQ1 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 5-AQ2 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 5-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-A Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-A 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-B Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-B 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-C Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-C 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-D Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-D 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-E Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-E 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-F Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-F 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-G Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-G 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-H Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-H 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-I Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-I 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-J Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-J 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-K Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-K 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-L Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-L 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-M Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-M 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-N Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-N 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-O Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-O 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-P Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-P 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-Q Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-R Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-R 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-AQ1 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 6-AQ2 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 6-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 7-A Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-A 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 7-B Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-B 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 7-C Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-C 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 7-D Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-D 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 7-E Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-E 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 7-F Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-F 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 7-G Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-G 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 7-H Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-H 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 7-I Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-I 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 7-J Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-J 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 7-K Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-K 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 7-L Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-L 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 7-M Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-M 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 7-N Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-N 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 7-O Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-O 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 7-P Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-P 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 7-Q Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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000000112893 7-R Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-R 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 7-AQ1 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 7-AQ2 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 7-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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000000112893 8-A Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-A 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 8-B Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-B 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 8-C Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-C 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 8-D Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-D 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 8-E Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-E 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 8-F Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-F 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 8-G Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-G 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 8-H Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-H 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 8-I Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-I 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 8-J Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-J 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 8-K Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-K 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 8-L Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-L 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 8-M Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-M 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 8-N Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-N 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 8-O Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-O 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 8-P Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-P 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 8-Q Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 8-R Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-R 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 8-AQ1 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 8-AQ2 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 8-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-A Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-A 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-B Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-B 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-C Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-C 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-D Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-D 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-E Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-E 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-F Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-F 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-G Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-G 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-H Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-H 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-I Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-I 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-J Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-J 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-K Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-K 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-L Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-L 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-M Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-M 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-N Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-N 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-O Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-O 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-P Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-P 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-Q Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-R Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-R 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-AQ1 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 9-AQ2 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 9-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 10-A Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-A 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 10-B Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-B 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 10-C Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-C 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 10-D Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-D 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 10-E Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-E 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 10-F Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-F 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 10-G Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-G 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 10-H Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-H 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 10-I Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-I 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 10-J Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-J 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 10-K Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-K 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 10-L Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-L 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 10-M Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-M 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 10-N Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-N 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 10-O Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-O 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 10-P Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-P 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 10-Q Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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000000112893 10-R Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-R 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 10-AQ1 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
000000112893 10-AQ2 Camden Materials, LLC N/A 10-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A


