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BID CLERK

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON ST E
CHARLESTON Wwv 25305
us

Vendor Name, Address and Telephone Number:

Appalachian Aggregates, LLC
21071 Midland Tri W
Lewisburg, WV 24901

304-392-5872

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Mark A Atkins
(304) 558-2307
mark.a.atkins@wv.gov

Signature X ] ) @ sumid (§m FEIN # 01-0640503 DATE Q-29-17

All offers subject to all terms ‘conditions conta n is solicitation

Page: 1 FORMID : WV-PRC-CRFQ-001



| ADDITIONAL INFORMAITON:

The West Virginia Purchasing Division is soliciting bids on behalf of the West Virginia Division of Highways and The West Virginia Adjutant
General Office-West Virginia Army Reserve National Guard, to establish an open-end contract for various sizes and types of Stone, Aggregate
and Cinders for Delivery of these items by the Vendor to established locations throughout the State of West Virginia for use by the West Virginia
Division of Highways and the Adjutant Generals Office-West Virginia Army Reserve National Guard per attached documents.

This contract shall be F.O.B. Agency established Storage Sites ONLY, DELIVERY by the Vendor.

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 Vendor shall use Exhibit_A Pricing 0.00000 EA
Pages for bid pricing.
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Extended Description :

STONE-AGGREGATE-CINDERS

2018 MATERIAL & DELIVERY BY THE VENDOR;:

Note: Vendor shall use Exhibit_A Pricing Page(s) for bid pricing.

If bidding online vendor should enter $0.00 in the Oasis commodity line.

Vendor must attach the Exhibit_A pricing page and the Exhibit_B Information Attachment Form to their bid.
See Section 18 of Instructions to Bidders for additional information.

[SCHEDULE OF EVENTS
Line Event Event Date
1 Technical Questions due by 2:00pm EST:  2017-09-22

Page : 2



| Document Phase Document Description ‘ Page 3 ‘
DOT1800000026 Final STONE AGGREGATE CINDERS 2018 of 3
MATERIAL&DELIVERY BY THE VENDOR | \

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions



DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as the
Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this Contract.

Sales Manager

(Name, Title)
Doug Canterbury, Sales Manager

(Printed Name and Title)
21071 Midland Trl W - LeW|sburg, WV 24901

(Address)
304-392-5872 304-392-5828

(Phone Number) / (Fax Number)
__doug.canterbury@appaggwv.com

(email address)

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wvOASIS, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand
the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid,
offer or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the
product or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for
that product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and
conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that T am submitting this
bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; that I am authorized by the vendor to execute
and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor’s behalf; that
I am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to the best of my
knowledge, the vendor has properly registered with any State agency that may require
registration.

Appalachian Aggregates LLC

(Compané
m;‘é%;&ug Canterbury, Sales Manager

(Auti@hzed Slgnature)\{ﬁggentatlve Name, Title)

Doug Canterbury, Sales Manager

(Prmted Name and Title of Authorized Representatlve)

S-29~\T

(Date)
304-392-5872  304-392-5828

(Phone Number) (Fax Number) -

Revised 08/31/2017



West Virginia Ethics Commission

S

v &
! srapek Vo

Disclosure of Interested Parties to Contracts

Pursuant to W. Va. Code § 6D-1-2, a state agency may not enter into a contract, or a series of related contracts,
that has/have an actual or estimated value of $100,000 or more until the business entity submits to the
contracting state agency a Disclosure of Interested Parties to the applicable contract. In addition, the business
entity awarded a contract is obligated to submit a supplemental Disclosure of Interested Parties reflecting any
new or differing interested parties to the contract within 30 days following the completion or termination of the
applicable contract.

For purposes of complying with these requirements, the following definitions apply:

"Business entity” means any entity recognized by law through which business is conducted, including a
sole proprietorship, partnership or corporation.

"Interested party" or “Interested parties” means:

(1) A business entity performing work or service pursuant to, or in furtherance of, the applicable
contract, including specifically sub-contractors;

(2) the person(s) who have an ownership interest equal to or greater than 25% in the business
entity performing work or service pursuant to, or in furtherance of, the applicable contract.
(This subdivision does not apply to a publicly traded company); and

(3) the person or business entity, if any, that served as a compensated broker or intermediary to
actively facilitate the applicable contract or negotiated the terms of the applicable contract with
the state agency. (This subdivision does not apply to persons or business entities performing
legal services related to the negotiation or drafting of the applicable contract.)

“State agency” means a board, commission, office, department or other agency in the executive, judicial
or legislative branch of state government, including publicly funded institutions of higher education:
Provided, that for purposes of W. Va. Code § 6D-1-2, the West Virginia Investment Management Board
shall not be deemed a state agency nor subject to the requirements of that provision.

The contracting business entity must complete this form and submit it to the contracting state agency prior to
contract award and to complete another form within 30 days of contract completion or termination.

This form was created by the State of West Virginia Ethics Commission, 210 Brooks Street, Suite 300,
Charleston, WV 25301-1804. Telephone: (304)558-0664; fax: (304)558-2169; e-mail: ethics@wv.gov; website:
www.ethics.wv.qov.




West Virginia Ethics Commission

Disclosure of Interested Parties to Contracts

Contracting business entity: ~\PPalachian Aggregates, LLC
Address: 21071 Midland Trl W - Lewisburg, WV 24901

Contracting business entity’s authorized agent: PD ! 'E\E;*s\
24901
Number or title of contract: CRFQ 0803 DOT1800000026

Address: 21071 Midland Trl W - Lewisburg,
Type or description of contract: Stone Aggregate Cinders 2017 Material & Delivery By The Vendor

Governmental agency awarding contract: West V'rgm'a Division of nghways

Names of each Interested Party to the contract known or reasonably anticipated by the contracting business
entity (aftach additional pages if necessary):

Signature: N —n Q m Date Signed: Q28
\

[J Check here if this is a Supplemental Disclosure.

Verification

State of\Nc:&.‘\_\l'\{ 6\1} TAY¥ , County of ' ce’/nb Vier

l, , the authorized agent of the
contracting business entity listed above, being duly sworn, acknowledges that the Disclosure herein is being
made under oath and under the penalty of perjury.

Taken, sworn to and subscribed before me this 28»1./&\ day ofge/g\-cmbe/ ,2*0 l’—)

§ N oARY PUBLICOFFIGAL SEAL f _
e PHYLLIS G. BURNS %‘ é’ W
State of West Virginia

"’““‘"‘,".;'Z'.'m"'mmi U Notary Public’s Signature

LEWISBURG, WEST VIRGINIA 24901 J

To be completed by State Agency:
Date Received by State Agency:

Date submitted to Ethics Commission:

Governmental agency submitting Disclosure:




STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS: Under W. Va. Code § 5-22-1(i), the contracting public entity shall not award a
construction contract to any bidder that is known to be in default on any monetary obligation owed to the state or a
political subdivision of the state, including, but not limited to, obligations related to payroll taxes, property taxes, sales and
use taxes, fire service fees, or other fines or fees.

ALL OTHER CONTRACTS: Under W. Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by
the state or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or
a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and: (1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one
thousand dollars in the aggregate; or (2) the debtor is in employer default.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition listed above does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to chapter
eleven of the W. Va. Code, workers’ compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the matter has
not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the
provisions of such plan or agreement.

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its political
subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers’ compensation premium, penalty
or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including
any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

“Employer default” means having an outstanding balance or liability to the old fund or to the uninsured employers' fund or being
in policy default, as defined in W. Va. Code § 23-2¢-2, failure to maintain mandatory workers’ compensation coverage, or failure to
fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An employer is not in employer default if it has entered
into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Commissioner and remains in compliance with the obligations under the
repayment agreement.

“Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other
form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or contract through
which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect recsive or
control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an
amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total contract amount.

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor’s authorized signer affirms and acknowledges under penalty of
law for false swearing (W. Va. Code §61-5-3) that: (1) for construction contracts, the vendor is not in default on
any monetary obligation owed to the state or a political subdivision of the state, and (2) for all other contracts,
that neither vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined above and that neither vendor nor any related
party are in employer default as defined above, unless the debt or employer default is permitted under the
exception above.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:
Vendor's Name: Appalachian Aggregates, LLC

Authorized Signature: 3'—*——'\ Q mﬂ Date: Q- 2.8~1)

State of \N &S‘\’\l\(mf\ta—

!
County of kpwre:e,/\b he&er , to-wit:

Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me thls2'6 day of &Q'L:,N\b:,/ , 20"_—1.
My Commission expires N\A«u\ \@ , 2020

AFFIX SEALHERE $%% "PHYLLISG.BURNS NOTARY PUBLIC %Z&« K%W

A State of West Virginia
9 My Commission Expires May 18, 2020

Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 07/07/2017)

1

187 CIRCLE DRIVE
LEWISBURG, WEST VIRGINIA 24901




WV-10 4 Fovised State of West Virginia
Approve evise: ; .
15/16/15 VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Vendor Preference, if applicable.

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification:

Bidder is a resident vendor partnership, association, or corporation with at least eighty percent of ownership interest
of bidder heid by another entity that meets the applicable four year residency requirement; or,

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor that employs a minimum of one hundred state residents, or a nonresident vendor which
has an affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia and
employs a minimum of one hundred state residents, and for purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or
completing the project which is the subject of the bidder’s bid and continuously over the entire term of the project, on
average at least seventy-five percent of the bidder's employees or the bidder’s affiliate’s or subsidiary’s employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years and the
vendor’s bid; or,

Application is made for 5% vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,

Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commaodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor’s bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

7. Application is made for preference as a non-resident small, women- and minority-owned business, in accor-
dance with West Virginia Code §5A-3-59 and West Virginia Code of State Rules.

|:[ Bidder has been or expects to be approved prior to contract award by the Purchasing Division as a certified small, women-
and minority-owned business.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the

requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) rescind the contract or purchase order;

or (b) assess a penalty against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to

the contracting agency or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder
and if anything contained within this certificate changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchas-
ing Division in writing immediately.

Bidder: Arpalachian Aggregates, LLC Slgned: N g m— X
Date: q—l%— ‘.’) Title: sales Manager g ﬁ

*Check any combination of preference consideration(s) indicated above, which you are entitled to receive.

00 ML
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Certificate of Insurance

THIS CERTIFICATE ISISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON YOU THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS CERTIFICATE IS NOT AN
INSURANCE POLICY AND DOES NOT AMEND, EXTEND, OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES LISTED BELOW. POLICY LIMITS ARE NO LESS THAN THOSE

LISTED. ALTHOUGH POLICIES MAY INCLUDE ADDITIONAL SUBLIMIT/LIMITS NOT LISTED BELOW.

This is to Certify that

éggglgcrz]hie;n Aggregates, LLC l .

arles Avenue .

Dunbar W 25064 N Liberty Mutual.
OF INSURED N

INSURANCE

L |

is, at the issue date of this certificate, insured by the Company under the policy(ies) listed below. The insurance afforded by the listed policy(ies) is subject to all their terms, exclusions and
Conditions and is not altered by any requircment, term or condition of any contract or other document with respect to which this certificate may be issued.

0 EXP DATE
CONTINUQUS
TYPE OF POLICY O POLICY NUMBER LIMIT OF LIABILITY
EXTENDED
M POLICY TERM
WORKERS 9/1/2018 WA7-C8D-004095-027 fﬁ&%ﬁ?&ﬁﬁ%&?@“ﬁi‘}g‘f EMPLOYERS LIABILITY
COMPENSATION WC7-C81-004005-017 WA Wy - =Pt O N0 oo iy b iy
' 1 OO0.000Each Accident
-017: Wi Bodily Injury By Disease
$1,000.000 001
Bodily Injury By Disease
$1.000.000 ¢ perics
COMMERCIAL General Aggregate
GENERAL LIABILITY | 9/1/2018 TB2-C81-004095-117 $2,000.000
4 occurrence -Per Project Aggregate included.  [p4,ct;7 Comploted Operations Aggregate
$2,000,000
D CLAIMS MADE Each Occurrence
$2,000,000
RETRO DATE Personal & Advertising Injury
$2,000,000 Per Person / Organization
Other ther
Damage to Premises Rented to |Medical Exp: $50,000
You: §250,000
AUTOMOBILE Each Accident—Single Limit
LIABILITY 9/1/2018 AS2-C81-004095-127 $2,000,000 B1. And P.D. Combined
m Each Person
OWNED
m NON-OWNED Each Accident or Occurrence
m HIRED Each Accident or Occurrence
OTHER I 9/1/2017 - 9/1/2018 | AS2-C81-054502-527 Pr%siggtl)%amagg IgBly
i i -$10, om
Automobile policy _310’000 &omg DE
ADDITIONAL COMMENTS
WVDOT-Division of Highways is listed as additional insured, where required by written contract.

* If the certificate expiration date is continuous or extended term, you will be notified if coverage is terminated or reduced before the certificate expiration date.

NOTICE OF CANCELLATION: (NOT APPLICABLE UNLESS A NUMBER OF DAY IS ENTERED BELOW.) .
BEFORE THE STATED EXPIRATION DATE THE COMPANY WILL NOT CANCEL OR REDUCE THE Liberty Mutual
INSURANCE AFFORDED UNDER THE ABOVE POLICIES UNTIL AT LEAST 30 DAYS NOTICE Insurance Group
OF SUCH CANCELLATION HAS BEEN MAILED TO:

T Jllise K Rece

Valerie Reece

I—— WVDOT-Division of Highways

g5 1900 Kanawha Blvd. East AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE
£3 Bidg. 5 Room A737 112 Brent Way
© Charleston, WV 25305 Hurricane, WV 25526 800-332-3226  8/21/2017

l I OFFICE PHONE DATEISSUED

This certificate is executed by LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE GROUP as respects such insurance as is afforded by those Companies NM 772 07-10
37328412 | LM_44 | 9/17-9/1B - Standard Limits 2/2 | Donna Smitala | 8/21/2017 3:54:27 PM (CDT) | Page 1 of 1 C‘

LDI COI 268896 02 11



Exhibit_B CRFQ 0803 DOT1800000026 INFORMATION ATTACHMENT FORM

Vendor's Storage Sites -- REQUIRED TO BE SUBMITTED WITH BID
2018 Stone and Aggregate - Material and Delivery by Vendor ONLY

VENDOR NAME: Appalacian Aggregates, LLC

Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.
A Vendor may submit more than one Vendor’s Storage Sites information on one Information Attachment Form
ONLY if bid pricing is the SAME for all Storage Sites and all WVDOH locations bid. A separate Information
Attachment Form MUST be submitted when bid price varies between Vendor's Storage Sites.

Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel, Sand, Blast Furnance Slag and Steel Slag

a) SOURCE OF MATERIAL (all sources for which bid prices apply (e.g., Quarry location if Sandstone
or Limestone; dredging or pit location if Gravel; production plant name and location if Slag)

Alta, WV - Limestone

b) EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S): A separate bid schedule
must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.

Alta - 12 Miles West of Lewisburg On Route 60

Cinders

c¢) SOURCE OF MATERIAL: Name and Location of plant which produces Cinder material.

d) EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S) A separate bid schedule
must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.




Exhibit_B CRFQ 0803 DOT1800000026 INFORMATION ATTACHMENT FORM

Vendor's Storage Sites -- REQUIRED TO BE SUBMITTED WITH BID
2018 Stone and Aggregate - Material and Delivery by Vendor ONLY

VENDOR NAME:  Appalacian Aggregates, LLC

Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.
A Vendor may submit more than one Vendor’s Storage Sites information on one Information Attachment Form
ONLY if bid pricing is the SAME for all Storage Sites and all WWDOH locations bid. A separate Information
Attachment Form MUST be submitted when bid price varies between Vendor's Storage Sites.

Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel, Sand, Blast Furnance Slag and Steel Slag

a) SOURCE OF MATERIAL (all sources for which bid prices apply {e.g., Quarry location if Sandstone
or Limestone; dredging or pit location if Gravel; production plant name and location if Slag)

Mt Hope, WV - Sandstone

b) EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S): A separate bid schedule
must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.

1700 North Sandbranch Road
Mt Hope, WV

Cinders

¢) SOURCE OF MATERIAL: Name and Location of plant which produces Cinder material.

d) EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S) A separate bid schedule
must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.

W



Exhibit_B S - CRFQ 0803 DOT1800000026 INFORMATION-ATTACHMENT FORM

Vendor's Storage Sites -- REQUIRED TO BE SUBMITTED WITH BID
2018 Stone and Aggregate - Material and Delivery by Vendor ONLY

VENDOR NAME: Appalacian Aggregates, LLC

Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.
A Vendor may submit more than one Vendor’s Storage Sites information on one Information Attachment Form
ONLY if bid pricing is the SAME for all Storage Sites and all WVDOH locations bid. A separate Information
Attachment Form MUST be submitted when bid price varies between Vendor's Storage Sites.

Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel, Sand, Blast Furnance Slag and Steel Slag

a) SOURCE OF MATERIAL (all sources for which bid prices apply (e.g., Quarry location if Sandstone
or Limestone; dredging or pit location if Gravel; production plant name and location if Slag)

Mill Point, WV - Limestone

b) EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S): A separate bid schedule
must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.

Mill Point - 1/2 Mile West of Intersection of Route 39 and Route 219

Cinders

¢) SOURCE OF MATERIAL: Name and Location of plant which produces Cinder material.

d) EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S) A separate bid schedule
must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.




Exhibit_A Pricing Page Schedule VENDOR NAME Appalachian Aggregates, LLC
F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 7 2018
Estimated Location of Bid Price ($/Ton) F.0.B.
Contract Description Quantity DOH DOH Storage Site
ltem of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site
LIMESTONE BLAST
BRAXTON COUNTY SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
A [Class 1 500 Coon Knob |-79 21.55
K |AASHTO #38 500 Coon Knob I-79 25.70
L |AASHTO#9 1500 Coon Knob I-79 32.65
M  |Gabion Stone 100 Coon Knob I-79 25.70
OA  |Limestone Std Abr. 500 Coon Knob |-79 25.70
OB  |Sandstone Std Abr. 500 Coon Knob I-79 29.15
PA  [Limestone Mod Abr. 500 Coon Knob I-79 25.70
PB  |Sandstone Mod Abr. 500 Coon Knob I-79 29.15
BRAXTON COUNTY
K [AASHTO #8 1000 Gassaway NO Bid
OA |Limestone Std Abr, 2500 Gassaway NO Bid
OB  |Sandstone Std Abr. 2500 Gassaway No Bid
PA  |Limestone Mod Abr. 500 Gassaway No Bid
PB  |Sandstone Mod Abr. 500 Gassaway No Bid
BRAXTON COUNTY
K |AASHTO#8 2000 Heaters NO Bid
OA  |Limestone Std Abr. 1500 Heaters No Bid
OB |Sandstone Std Abr. 1500 Heaters No Bid
PA  [Limestone Mod Abr. 500 Heaters No Bid
PB |[Sandstone Maod Abr, 500 Heaters NO Bid
BRAXTON COUNTY
A |[Class 1 10000 Laurel No Bid
B |Class2 7500 Laurel No Bid
D |AASHTO #1 500 Laurel No Bid
E [AASHTO#3 2000 Laurel No Bid
G |AASHTO #467 500 Laurel No Bid
H |AASHTO #57 500 Laurel No Bid
K |AASHTO#8 2500 Laurel NO Bid
L |AASHTO#9 1000 Laurel No Bid
M  |Gabion Stone 500 Laurel NO Bid
OA |Limestone Std Abr. 500 Laurel NO Bid
OB  |Sandstone Std Abr. 500 Laurel No Bid
PA  |Limestone Mod Abr. 500 Laurel No Bid
PB  |Sandstone Mod Abr. 500 Laurel No Bid
R  |Shot Rock 1000 Laurel No Bid

\3



Exhibit_A Pricing Page Schedule VENDOR NAME Appalachian Aggregates, LLC
F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 7 2018
Estimated Location of Bid Price ($/Ton) F.0.B.
Contract Description Quantity DOH DOH Storage Site
Item of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site
LIMESTONE BLAST
WEBSTER COUNTY SANDSTONE | FURNACE STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
K |AASHTO #8 | 250] Cowen| |No Bid
WEBSTER COUNTY
K |AASHTO #8 | 250 Cherry Falls| | No Bid |
WEBSTER COUNTY
A [Class 1 2500 Big Ditch Lake 17.55
B |[Class2 1500 Big Ditch Lake 17.55
D |AASHTO #1 1000 Big Ditch Lake 21.60
E  |AASHTO#3 1000 Big Ditch Lake 21.60
K |AASHTO #8 1500 Big Ditch Lake 21.85
L |AASHTO #9 1000 Big Ditch Lake 37.10
M |Gabion Stone 500 Big Ditch Lake 21.60
OA  |Limestone Std Abr. 2500 Big Ditch Lake 21.60
OB  [Sandstone Std Abr. 2500 Big Ditch Lake 31.15
PA  [Limestone Mod Abr. 500 Big Ditch Lake 27.60
PB |Sandstone Mod Abr. 500 Big Ditch Lake 31.15
R [Shot Rock 500 Big Ditch Lake 28.85
WEBSTER COUNTY
A [Class 1 2000 Hacker Valley No Bid
B |[Class2 5000 Hacker Valley No Bid
D |AASHTO #1 250 Hacker Valley No Bid
E  |AASHTO #3 500 Hacker Valley No Bid
G |AASHTO #467 2500 Hacker Valley No Bid
K |AASHTO #8 1000 Hacker Valley No Bid
L |AASHTO#9 500 Hacker Valley No Bid
M |Gabion Stone 250 Hacker Valley NO Bid
OA  [Limestone Std Abr. 1500 Hacker Valley NO Bid
OB  [Sandstone Std Abr. 1500 Hacker Valley No Bid
PA  |Limestone Mod Abr. 500 Hacker Valley NO Bid
PB  |Sandstone Mod Abr, 500 Hacker Valley No Bid
R [Shot Rock 500 Hacker Valley No Bid

™



Exhibit_A Pricing Page Schedule Vendor Name: _ Appalachian Aggregates. LLC
F.0.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 1 2018
Estimated Location of Bid Price ($/Ton) F.0.B.
Contract Description Quantity DOH DOH Storage Site
ltem of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site
LIMESTONE BLAST
CLAY COUNTY SANDSTONE | FURNACE STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND| SLAG SLAG
A Class 1 3700 Maysel 24.34
D AASHTO #1 400 Maysel 25.34
E AASHTO #3 1300 Maysel 25.34
G AASHTO #467 3000 Maysel 25.34
L AASHTO #9 1000 Maysel 28.95
M Gabion Stone 500 Maysel 27.15
N Fine Aggregate 100 Maysel 28.05
OA  |Limestone Std Abr. 2500 Maysel 24.85
OB Sandstone Std Abr. 2500 Maysel 28.90
PA  [Limestone Mod Abr. 2500 Maysel 24.85
PB Sandstone Mod Abr. 2500 Maysel 28.90
S AASHTO #8M 3000 Maysel 27.80
CLAY COUNTY
A Class 1 3700 Widen Road CR 11 19.44
E AASHTO #3 1300 Widen Road CR 11 21.74
G AASHTO #467 3000 Widen Road CR 11 21.74
L AASHTO #9 1000 Widen Road CR 11 30.85
M Gabion Stone 500 Widen Road CR 11 21.90
N Fine Aggregate 100 Widen Road CR 11 27.90
OA Limestone Std Abr, 2500 Widen Road CR 11 21.85
OB  |Sandstone Std Abr. 2500 Widen Road CR 11 27.15
PA Limestone Mod Abr. 2500 Widen Road CR 11 21.85
PB Sandstone Mod Abr. 2500 Widen Road CR 11 27.15
S AASHTO #8M 3000 Widen Road CR 11 23.30
KANAWHA COUNTY
A Class 1 2500 Chelyan NO Bid
D AASHTO #1 600 Chelyan No Bid
E AASHTO #3 1800 Chelyan No Bid
G AASHTO #467 1000 Chelyan No Bid
L AASHTO #9 1000 Chelyan No Bid
M Gabion Stone 500 Chelyan No Bid
N Fine Aggregate 100 Chelyan No Bid
OA  |Limestone Std Abr. 2500 Chelyan No Bid
OB  |Sandstone Std Abr. 2500 Chelyan No Bid
PA  |Limestone Mod Abr. 2500 Chelyan No Bid
PB Sandstone Mod Abr. 2500 Chelyan No Bid
S AASHTO #3M 3000 Chelyan No Bid
U Pea Gravel 500 Chelyan No Bid
v #11 Limestone Abr. 1500 Chelyan No Bid




Exhibit_A Pricing Page Schedule VENDOR NAME ___ Appalachian Aggregates, LLC
F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 8 2018
A Estimated Location of Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.
Contract Description Quantity DOH DOH Storage Site
ltem of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site
B LIMESTONE BLAST
PENDLETON COUNTY SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
A Class 1 1000 Judy Gap No Bid
B Class 2 1000 Judy Gap No Bid
I AASHTO #67 500 Judy Gap No Bid
K |AASHTO #8 1000 Judy Gap No Bid
L AASHTO #9 1000 Judy Gap NO Bid
OA  |Limestone Std Abr. 4000 Judy Gap No Bid
OB Sandstone Std Abr. 4000 Judy Gap No Bid
PA  |Limestone Mod Abr. 3300 Judy Gap No Bid
PB  [Sandstone Mod Abr. 3300 Judy Gap No Bid
PENDLETON COUNTY
A Class 1 1000 Onego No Bid
B Class 2 1000 Onego No Bid
1 AASHTO #67 500 Onego No Bid
K AASHTO #8 1000 Onego NO Bid
L AASHTO #9 1000 Onego NO Bid
QA Limestone Std Abr, 3000 Onego No Bid
OB  |Sandstone Std Abr. 3000 Onego No Bid
PA  |Limestone Mod Abr. 2200 Onego NO Bid
PB Sandstone Mod Abr. 2200 Onego NO Bid
POCAHONTAS COUNTY
A Class 1 1500 Green Bank 12.79
B Class 2 2500 Green Bank 12.79
2| AASHTO #67 300 Green Bank 17.99
K AASHTO #8 2000 Green Bank 18.49
L AASHTO #9 500 Green Bank 28.30
OA  |Limestone Std Abr. 2000 Green Bank 17.19
OB Sandstone Std Abr, 2000 Green Bank No Bid
PA  |Limestone Mod Abr. 1500 Green Bank 17.19
PB Sandstone Mod Abr. 1500 Green Bank No Bid
POCAHONTAS COUNTY
A Class 1 1500 Hillsboro 11.48
B Class 2 5000 Hillshoro 11.48
[ AASHTO #67 1000 Hillshoro 13.09
L AASHTO #9 1000 Hillshoro 23.49
OA  [Limestone Std Abr. 1000 Hillshoro 11.89
OB Sandstone Std Abr. 1000 Hillsboro No Bid

\



Exhibit_A Pricing Page Schedule

VENDOR NAME Appalachian Aggregates, LLC

F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 8 2018
Estimated Location of Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.
Contract Description Quantity DOH DOH Storage Site
ltem of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site
LIMESTONE BLAST
POCAHONTAS COUNTY SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
B Class 2 1000 Linwood 13:34
K AASHTO #8 1000 Linwood 14.24
L |AASHTO#9 500 Linwood 29.85
OA  |Limestone Std Abr. 2500 Linwood 14,49
OB Sandstone Std Abr. 2500 Linwood No Bid
PA  |[Limestone Mod Abr. 2500 Linwood 14.49
PB Sandstone Mod Abr. 2500 Linwood No Bid
POCAHONTAS COUNTY
A [Class 1 3000 Marlington 12.39
B Class 2 5000 Marlington 12.39
I AASHTO #67 1000 Marlington 13.94
K AASHTO #8 6000 Marlington 13.14
L AASHTO #9 1000 Marlington 21.90
OA  |Limestone Std Abr. 2000 Marlington 13.14
OB  [Sandstone Std Abr. 2000 Marlington No Bid
PA  [Limestone Mod Abr. 3000 Marlington 13.74
PB Sandstone Mod Abr. 3000 Marlington No Bid
POCAHONTAS COUNTY
[ AASHTO #67 300 Seebert 13.34
K AASHTO #8 2000 Seebert 12.19
OA Limestone Std Abr. 4000 Seebert 12.19
OB Sandstone Std Abr. 4000 Seebert No Bid
PA Limestone Mod Abr. 4000 Seebert 12.19
PB Sandstone Mod Abr. 4000 Seebert No Bid
POCAHONTAS COUNTY
A Class 1 1500 Thornwood 14.94
B Class 2 1000 Thornwood 14.94
K AASHTO #8 1000 Thornwood 19.14
OA  |Limestone Std Abr. 2000 Thornwood 18.74
OB Sandstone Std Abr, 2000 Thornwood No Bid
PA  |Limestone Mod Abr. 4000 Thornwood 18.74
PB  [Sandstone Mod Abr. 4000 Thornwood NO Bid
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Exhibit_A Pricing Page Schedule VENDOR NAME Appalachian Aggregates, LLC
F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 9 2018
Estimated Location of Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.
Contract Description Quantity DOH Storage Site
ftem of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site
LIMESTONE BLAST
FAYETTE COUNTY SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
A Class 1 20000 Oak Hill 15.84
E AASHTO #3 1000 Oak Hill 17.74
F AASHTO #4 5000 Oak Hill 17.74
G AASHTO #467 5000 Oak Hill 18.00
H AASHTO #57 5000 Oak Hill 18.00
I AASHTO #67 4000 Qak Hill 18.00
J AASHTO #7 5000 Oak Hill No Bid
K AASHTO #8 5000 Oak Hill 19.40
L AASHTO #9 20000 Oak Hill 19.94
M Gabhion Stone 5000 Oak Hill 17.94
0A Limestone Std Abr. 5000 Qak Hill 21.29
‘OB Sandstone Std Abr. 5000 Oak Hill 18.55
PA Limestone Mod Abr. 4000 Oak Hill 21.29
PB  [Sandstone Mod Abr, 4000 Oak Hill 18.55
Q Rip Rap 5000 Oak Hill 22.40
R Shot Rock 5000 Oak Hill 21.85
S AASHTO #8M 2500 Oak Hill 19.64
U Pea Gravel 2000 Oak Hill ‘No Bid
FAYETTE COUNTY
A Class 1 20000 Lookout 13.74
E AASHTO #3 5000 Lookout 16.28
H AASHTO #57 5000 Lookout 16.49
I AASHTO #67 2000 Lookout 16.49
J AASHTO #7 5000 Lookout NO Bid
K AASHTO #8 5000 Lookout 16,89
L AASHTO #9 15000 Lookout 20.19
M Gabion Stone 5000 Lookout 16.75
OA Limestone Std Abr. 5000 Lookout 16.94
OB  |[Sandstone Std Abr, 5000 Lookout 21.45
PA Limestone Mod Abr. 4000 Lookout 16.94
PB  |Sandstone Mod Abr. 4000 Lookout 21.45
Q Rip Rap 5000 Lookout 24.00
R Shot Rock 5000 Lookout 22.80
S AASHTO #8M 2500 Lookout 16.69
U Pea Gravel 1000 Lookout NO Bid
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Exhibit_A Pricing Page Schedule VENDOR NAME Appalachian Aggregates, LLC
F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 9 2018
Bid Price ($/Ton)
Estimated Location of F.O.B.
Contract Description Quantity DOH DOH Storage Site
Item of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site
LIMESTONE
FAYETTE COUNTY ONLY
A Class 1 Limestone 20000 Qak Hill 17.49
E AASHTO #3 Limestone 5000 Oak Hill 20.80
I AASHTO #67 Limestone 5000 Oak Hill 20.80
J AASHTO #7 Limestone 5000 Oak Hill NO Bid
K AASHTO #8 Limestone 10000 Oak Hill 21.04
L AASHTO #9 Limestone 10000 Qak Hill 22.19
M Gabion Stone Limestone 5000 Oak Hill 20.80
PA Limestone Mod Abr. | Limestone 5000 Oak Hill 21.04
R Shot Rock Limestone 5000 Qak Hill 27.50
T AASHTO #9M Limestone 5000 Oak Hill Z2.19
FAYETTE COUNTY
A Class 1 Limestone 8000 Glen Ferris 17.49
E AASHTO #3 Limestone 2500 Glen Ferris 20.80
i AASHTO #67 Limestone 2000 Glen Ferris 20.80
M Gabion Stone Limestone 2000 Glen Ferris 20.80
FAYETTE COUNTY
A Class 1 Limestone 20000 Lookout 13.09
E AASHTO #3 Limestone 5000 Lookout 17.95
I AASHTO #67 Limestone 5000 Lookout 17.95
J AASHTO #7 Limestone 5000 Lookout No Bid
K AASHTO #8 Limestone 5000 Lookout T8.715
L AASHTO #9 Limestone 15000 Lookout 19.94
M Gabion Stone Limestone 5000 Lookout 17.95
PA Limestone Mod Abr. | Limestone 5000 Lookout 17.65
R Shot Rock Limestone 5000 Lookout 24.80
T AASHTO #9M Limestone 5000 Lookout 19.94
FAYETTE COUNTY
K AASHTO #8 Limestone 3000 Falls View 23.25
L AASHTO #9 Limestone 2500 Falls View 23.69
PA Limestone Mod Abr. | Limestone 2500 Falls View 23.25
T AASHTO #9M Limestone 2500 Falls View 23.69
FAYETTE COUNTY
L AASHTO #9 Limestone 10000 Oak Hill APD-US19 22.19
T AASHTO #9M Limestone 2000 Qak Hill APD-US19 22.19
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Exhibit_A Pricing Page Schedule VENDOR NAME __ Appalachian Aggregates, LLC
F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 9 2018
Estimated Location of Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.
Contract Description Quantity DOH DOH Storage Site
ltem of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site
LIMESTONE BLAST
GREENBRIER COUNTY SANDSTONE | FURNACE STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND, SLAG SLAG
A Class 1 4000 Crawley 8.99
B Class 2 10000 Crawley 8.99
E  |AASHTO#3 750 Crawley 17.89
H AASHTO #57 4000 Crawley 11.89
| AASHTO #67 5000 Crawley 11.89
K AASHTO #8 8000 Crawley 11.99
L AASHTO #9 4000 Crawley 15.20
M Gabion Stone 500 Crawley 11.89
OA Limestone Std Abr. 2500 Crawley 11.99
OB  [Sandstone Std Abr. 2500 Crawley No Bid
Q Rip Rap 1000 Crawley 20.85
R Shot Rock 1000 Crawley 20.35
T AASHTO #IM 2500 Crawley 15.20
GREENBRIER COUNTY
L AASHTO #9 5000 Harts Run |-64 16.29
OA  [Limestone Std Abr. 2000 Harts Run [-64 14.45
OB  |Sandstone Std Abr. 2000 Harts Run |-64 NO Bid
T AASHTO #M 2000 Harts Run |1-64 16.29
GREENBRIER COUNTY
A Class 1 6000 Lewisburg 9.20
B Class 2 10000 Lewisburg 9.20
E AASHTO #3 1000 Lewisbhurg 13.39
H AASHTO #57 4000 Lewisburg 13.39
[ AASHTO #67 5000 Lewisburg 13.39
K AASHTO #8 8000 Lewisburg 13.69
L AASHTO #9 6000 Lewisburg 15.90
M Gabion Stone 1000 Lewisburg 13.39
OA  [Limestone Std Abr. 2500 Lewisburg 13.69
OB  [Sandstone Std Abr, 2500 Lewisburg No Bid
Q Rip Rap 1500 Lewisburg 21.40
R Shot Rock 1000 Lewishurg 21.10
T AASHTO #IM 2500 Lewisburg 15.90




Exhibit_A Pricing Page Schedule VENDOR NAME Appalachian Aggregates, LLC
F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 9 2018
_ Estimated Location of Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.
Contract Description Quantity DOH DOH Storage Site
ftem of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site
LIMESTONE BLAST
MONROE COUNTY SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
A Class 1 2500 Peterstown No Bid
B Class 2 6000 Peterstown No Bid
E AASHTO #3 500 Peterstown No Bid
H _ |AASHTO #57 500 Peterstown No Bid
K AASHTO #8 1500 Peterstown No Bid
L AASHTO #9 3000 Peterstown No Bid
M Gabion Stone 500 Peterstown NO Bid
PA Limestone Mod Abr. 1000 Peterstown No Bid
PB Sandstone Mod Abr. 1000 Peterstown No Bid
T AASHTO #IM 1000 Peterstown No Bid
MONROE COUNTY
A Class 1 6000 Union 11.94
B Class 2 22000 Union 11.94
E AASHTO #3 500 Union 16.70
H AASHTO #57 2000 Union 16.70
[ AASHTO #67 500 Union 16:.70
K AASHTO #8 3000 Union 16.95
L AASHTO #9 5000 Union 18.65
M Gabion Stone 1000 Union 16:70
PA Limestone Mod Abr, 1000 Union 16.85
PB Sandstone Mod Abr. 1000 Union NO Bid
Q Rip Rap 1000 Union 23.90
R Shot Rock 1000 Union 23.40
T AASHTO #9M 1000 Union 18.65
NICHOLAS COUNTY
A Class 1 5000 Curtin 14:19
B Class 2 5000 Curtin 14.19
E AASHTO #3 500 Curtin 16.90
I AASHTO #67 1000 Curtin 17:15
K AASHTO #8 2000 Curtin 16.14
L AASHTO #9 500 Curtin 22.79
M Gabion Stone 500 Curtin 16.90
PA  |Limestone Mod Abr. 6000 Curtin 16.14
PB Sandstone Mod Abr. 6000 Curtin No Bid
Q Rip Rap 500 Curtin 25.70
R Shot Rock 500 Curtin 25.20
T AASHTO #9M 500 Curtin 22:79
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Exhibit_A Pricing Page Schedule VENDOR NAME Appalachian Aggregates, LLC
F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 9 2018
Estimated Location of Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.
Contract Description Quantity DOH DOH Storage Site
Item of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site
LIMESTONE BLAST
NICHOLAS COUNTY SANDSTONE | FURNACE STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
L AASHTO #9 6000 Muddlety Lot 22.45
T AASHTO #IM 3000 Muddlety Lot 22.45
NICHOLAS COUNTY
A Class 1 14000 Summersville Rt. 39 15.89
B Class 2 2500 Summersville Rt. 39 15.89
E AASHTO #3 1000 Summersville Rt, 39 20.24
H  |AASHTO #57 1000 Summersville Rt. 39 20.24
[ AASHTO #67 2000 Summersville Rt. 39 20.24
K AASHTO #8 1500 Summersville Rt. 39 20.54
L AASHTO #9 10000 Summersville Rt. 39 22.39
M Gabion Stone 2000 Summersville Rt. 39 20.24
PA Limestone Mod Abr. 2500 Summersville Rt. 39 20.54
PB  |Sandstone Mod Abr. 2500 Summersville Rt. 39 21.95
Q Rip Rap 1500 Summersville Rt. 39 27.90
R Shot Rock 500 Summersville Rt. 39 27.30
T AASHTO #9M 4000 Summersville Rt. 39 22.39
SUMMERS COUNTY
A Class 1 20000 Hinton 12.29
B Class 2 30000 Hinton 12.29
E AASHTO #3 2000 Hinton 16.45
H AASHTO #57 3000 Hinton 16.45
K AASHTO #8 3000 Hinton 16.85
L AASHTO #9 7000 Hinton 18.15
M Gabion Stone 500 Hinton 16.45
PA Limestone Mod Abr. 500 Hinton 16.85
PB Sandstone Mod Abr. 500 Hinton 24.55
Q Rip Rap 1000 Hinton 24.15
R Shot Rock 500 Hinton 23.85
T AASHTO #9IM 1000 Hinton 18.15
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Exhibit_A Pricing Page Schedule VENDOR NAME __Appalachian Aggregates, LLC

F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 10 2018
Estimated Location of Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.
Contract Description Quantity DOH DOH Storage Site
Item of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site
LIMESTONE BLAST
MERCER COUNTY SANDSTONE | FURNACE STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
A Class 1 8500 Flat Top 18.79
E AASHTO #3 2000 Flat Top 19.89
G AASHTO #467 2000 Flat Top 19.89
K AASHTO #8 7500 Flat Top 21.64
L AASHTO #9 500 Flat Top 24 .15
M (Gabion Stone 500 Flat Top 20.89
MERCER COUNTY
A Class 1 500 Princeton - | 77 NO Bid
L AASHTO #9 3000 Princeton - | 77 No Bid
MERCER COUNTY
A Class 1 20000 Princeton - WV 20 NO Bid
E AASHTO #3 2000 Princeton - WV 20 No Bid
G AASHTO #467 1000 Princeton - WV 20 NO Bid
K AASHTO #8 15000 Princeton - WV 20 No Bid
L AASHTO #9 2500 Princeton - WV 20 No Bid
M Gabion Stone 3500 Princeton - WV 20 No Bid
RALEIGH COUNTY
A Class 1 7000 Bolt NO Bid
E AASHTO #3 1200 Bolt No Bid
H AASHTO #57 4000 Bolt No Bid
K AASHTO #8 3000 Bolt No Bid
L AASHTO #9 3000 Bolt No Bid
M Gabion Stone 1000 Boit No Bid
RALEIGH COUNTY
A Class 1 7000 Bragg - I-64 NO Bid
E AASHTO #3 1200 Bragg - 1-64 No Bid
H AASHTO #57 300 Bragg - I-64 NO Bid
K AASHTO #8 10000 Bragg - |-64 NO Bid
L AASHTO #9 10000 Bragg - I-64 No Bid
M Gabion Stone 500 Bragg - I-64 NO Bid




Exhibit_A Pricing Page Schedule VENDOR NAME Appalachian Aggregates, LLC
F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 10 2018
Estimated Location of Bid Price ($/Ton) F.0.B.
Contract Description Quantity DOH DOH Storage Site
item of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site
LIMESTONE BLAST
RALEIGH COUNTY SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG

A Class 1 10000 Skelton 15.74
E AASHTO #3 1000 Skelton 16.94
H AASHTO #57 300 Skelton 16.94
K AASHTO #8 10000 Skelton 19.90
L AASHTO #9 10000 Skelton 21.35
M Gabion Stone 500 Skelton 18.84

WYOMING COUNTY
A Class 1 3000 Hanover No Bid
E AASHTO #3 1000 Hanover No Bid
K AASHTO #8 500 Hanover NO Bid
L AASHTO #9 2000 Hanover No Bid
M Gabion Stone 500 Hanover NO Bid
R Shot Rock 2000 Hanover No Bid

WYOMING COUNTY
A Class 1 400( Pineville - Headquarters No Bid
H AASHTO #57 2500| Pineville - Headquarters NO Bid
K AASHTO #8 500{ Pineville - Headquarters No Bid
L AASHTO #9 2000{ Pineville - Headquarters No Bid
M Gabion Stone 1000| Pineville - Headquarters NO Bid
R Shot Rock 1000 Pineville - Headquarters NO Bid

WYOMING COUNTY
A Class 1 3000 Still Run No Bid
E AASHTO #3 1500 Still Run No Bid
H AASHTO #57 2500 Still Run No Bid
K AASHTO #8 1000 Still Run NO Bid
L AASHTO #9 2000 Still Run No Bid
M Gabion Stone 1500 Still Run No Bid
R Shot Rock 1000 Still Run NO Bid
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