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Proc Folder :

Solicitation Description :

Proc Type :

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

Solicitation Response

Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East

Charleston, WV 25305-0130
Post Office Box 50130

State of West Virginia

403006

DIETARY SUPPLEMENTS

Central Master Agreement

2018-01-09

13:30:00

SR 0613 ESR01091800000003001 1

 VENDOR

000000184288

MCKESSON MEDICAL SURGICAL MINNESOTA SUPPLY INC

Comments:

Total Bid : Response Date: Response Time:Total Bid : 

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0613 VNF1800000010

$46,118.20 2018-01-09 09:19:01

Please see McKesson's two uploaded attachments for detailed submission information. Please
contact Government.Bids@McKesson.com with any questions. Thank you for this opportunity!

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Signature on File FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001

Crystal Rink

(304) 558-2402
crystal.g.rink@wv.gov
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

1 THICKENED NECTAR TEA 300.00000 CASE $11.930000 $3,579.00

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

2 THICKENED NECTAR ORANGE 200.00000 CASE $13.640000 $2,728.00

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

3 THICKENED NECTAR WATER 300.00000 CASE $10.520000 $3,156.00

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

4 THICKENED NECTAR CRANBERRY 300.00000 CASE $11.930000 $3,579.00

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

5 THICKENED NECTAR APPLE 300.00000 CASE $11.940000 $3,582.00

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

6 THICKENED NECTAR PEACH
MANGO

300.00000 CASE $11.880000 $3,564.00

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

7 THICKENED HONEY TEA 150.00000 CASE $12.060000 $1,809.00

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

8 THICKENED HONEY ORANGE 100.00000 CASE $13.810000 $1,381.00

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTCHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

9 THICKENED HONEY WATER 150.00000 CASE $10.520000 $1,578.00

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

10 THICKENED HONEY CRANBERRY 150.00000 CASE $12.060000 $1,809.00

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTCHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

11 THICKENED HONEY APPLE 150.00000 CASE $12.060000 $1,809.00

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTCHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

12 THICKENED HONEY PEACH
MANGO

150.00000 CASE $12.010000 $1,801.50

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

13 MED PASS OR EQUAL VANILLA
FLAVORED

100.00000 CASE $4.810000 $481.00

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

Comments: Sell price UOM is the EACH (32oz)

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

14 MED PASS OR EQUAL BUTTER
PECAL FLAVOR

50.00000 CASE $4.810000 $240.50

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

Comments: Sell price UOM is the EACH (32oz)

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

15 MED PASS OR EQUAL FRUIT
BERRY FLAVOR

50.00000 CASE $4.810000 $240.50

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

Comments: Sell price UOM is the EACH (32oz)
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

16 MED PASS OR EQUAL SUGAR
FREE VANILLA

75.00000 CASE $5.220000 $391.50

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

Comments: Sell price UOM is the EACH (32oz)

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

17 ENSURE CLEAR OR EQUAL APPLE
FLAVOR

100.00000 CASE $18.210000 $1,821.00

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTCHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

18 ENSURE CLEAR OR EQUAL
BERRY FLAVORED

100.00000 CASE $18.210000 $1,821.00

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

19 ENSURE CLEAR OR EQUAL
PEACH FLAVOR

100.00000 CASE

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

20 ENSURE CLEAR OR EQUAL
POMEGRANATE FLAVOR

100.00000 CASE

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

21 ENSURE ORIGINAL OR EQUAL
VANILLA FLAVOR

30.00000 CASE $10.800000 $324.00

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

22 ENSURE ORIGINAL OR EQUAL
CHOCOLATE FLAVOR

30.00000 CASE $22.210000 $666.30

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

23 ENSURE ORIGINAL OR EQUAL
BUTTER PECAN FLAVOR

30.00000 CASE $10.800000 $324.00

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

24 CARNATION INSTANT BREAKFAST
DRINK MIX OR EQUAL FRENCH

25.00000 CASE $28.560000 $714.00

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

25 CARNATION INSTANT BREAKFAST
DRINK MIX OR EQUAL

25.00000 CASE $37.890000 $947.25

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

26 CARNATION INSTANT BREAKFAST
DRINK MIX OR EQUAL VANILLA

25.00000 CASE

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

27 CARNATION INSTANT BREAKFAST
DRINK MIX OR EQUAL

25.00000 CASE $28.560000 $714.00

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

28 CARNATION INSTANT BREAKFAST
DRINK MIX OR EQUAL S/F

25.00000 CASE $37.890000 $947.25

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

29 SUGAR FREE MAGIC CUPS OR
EQUAL VANILLA

300.00000 CASE

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

30 SUGAR FREE MAGIC CUPS OR
EQUAL CHOCOLATE

300.00000 CASE

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

31 SUGAR FREE MAGIC CUPS OR
EQUAL STRAWBERRY

300.00000 CASE

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS



Page : 10

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

32 THICKENED DAIRY IN NECTAR 40.00000 CASE $25.880000 $1,035.20

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

33 THICKENED DAIRY IN HONEY 40.00000 CASE $26.300000 $1,052.00

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

34 PRO SOURCE OR EQUAL BERRY
PUNCH

40.00000 CASE $100.580000 $4,023.20

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS



  
 

 

McKesson Medical-Surgical Minnesota Supply Inc. 

8121 10th Avenue North 

Golden Valley, MN 55427 

 

www.mckesson.com 

 
 
 
 
 

January 8, 2018 

 

 

Via Electronic Submission wvOASIS 

Crystal Rink 

State of WV Purchasing Division 

2019 Washington St E 

Charleston, WV 25305 

 

RE:  State of West Virginia RFQ #VNF1800000010 – Dietary Supplements 

 

Dear Ms. Rink:  

 

McKesson Medical-Surgical Minnesota Supply Inc. (“McKesson”) is pleased to submit the following response 

to the State of West Virginia (the “State”) for Dietary Supplements. 

 

Please note that the products being submitted for Section 3.1.3 (Med Pass or Equal) are 32oz containers and the 

UOM per Sell Price is the EACH.   

Per Section 39 (“Additional Agency and Local Government Use”) of the Instructions to Vendors, McKesson 

would like to note that, if awarded, the contract would be available for Veterans Nursing Facility locations only.  Per 

Section 5.1 (“Ordering”) of the Specifications, McKesson would like to note that SupplyManagerSM, our web-based 

ordering platform, is available to those who prefer an online ordering option.  SupplyManager provides real-time 

information on the availability of products, as well as, order status information.  SupplyManager includes features, such 

as, creating custom order lists, determining product usage, tracking 12-month trends and the ability to access reports with 

a click of a button.  When using SupplyManager to place orders, the system will indicate if a product is in stock, on 

backorder, has limited quantities in stock or if the product is shipping from another distribution center.  If a product is on 

backorder, the individual placing the order will be asked if they would like to order a recommended substitute (if 

McKesson has been made aware of a substitute) or leave the item on back order.  This satisfies the requirement in Section 

6.2 (“Late Delivery) of the Specifications. 

If I can answer any questions that you may have, please feel free to contact me directly.  Thank you for this 

opportunity and we look forward to doing business with you! 

 

Sincerely, 

Kimberly R. Zabriskie 

Kimberly R. Zabriskie 

Proposal Specialist 

(800) 328-8111 

Government.Bids@McKesson.com  

mailto:Government.Bids@McKesson.com
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 ADDITIONAL INFORMAITON:

THE STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA PURCHASING DIVISION FOR THE AGENCY, WEST VIRGINIA VETERANS NURSING FACILITY, IS
SOLICITING BIDS TO ESTABLISH AN OPEN-END CONTRACT TO PROVIDE THE AGENCY WITH DIETARY SUPPLEMENTS PER THE
ATTACHED.

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

1 THICKENED NECTAR TEA 300.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

2 THICKENED NECTAR ORANGE 200.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

$11.93                          $3,579.00

Hormel                 Thick & Easy 4oz cup, Tea Flavor, Nectar Consistency           28259

$13.64                         $2,728.00

Hormel              Thick & Easy 4oz cup, Orange Flavor, Nectar Consistency        49144
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

3 THICKENED NECTAR WATER 300.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

4 THICKENED NECTAR CRANBERRY 300.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

5 THICKENED NECTAR APPLE 300.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

$10.52                          $3,156.00

   Hormel              Thick & Easy 4oz cup, Lemon Water Flavor, Nectar Consistency   23061 

$11.93                          $3,579.00

Hormel            Thick & Easy 4oz Cup, Cranberry Flavor, Nectar Consistency      39705

$11.94                          $3,582.00

Hormel                  Thick & Easy 4oz Cup, Apple Flavor, Nectar Consistency       41530
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 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

6 THICKENED NECTAR PEACH
MANGO

300.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

7 THICKENED HONEY TEA 150.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

8 THICKENED HONEY ORANGE 100.00000 CASE

$11.88                           $3,564.00

Hormel       Thick & Easy 4oz Cup, Peach Mango Flavor, Nectar Consistency    78768 

$12.06                          $1,809.00

Hormel             Thick & Easy 4oz Cup, Tea Flavor, Honey Consistency               32870

$13.81                           $1,381.00
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTCHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

9 THICKENED HONEY WATER 150.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

10 THICKENED HONEY CRANBERRY 150.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTCHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

Hormel              Thick & Easy 4oz Cup, Orange Flavor, Honey Consistency        32192

$10.52                         $1,578.00

Hormel        Thick & Easy 4oz Cup, Lemon Water Flavor, Honey Consistency     46056

$12.06                          $1,890.00

  Hormel           Thick & Easy 4oz Cup, Cranberry Flavor, Honey Consistency       20160
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 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

11 THICKENED HONEY APPLE 150.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTCHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

12 THICKENED HONEY PEACH
MANGO

150.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

13 MED PASS OR EQUAL VANILLA
FLAVORED

100.00000

$12.06 $1,809.00

Hormel Thick & Easy 4oz Cup, Apple Flavor, Honey Consistency          12687

$12.01 $1,801.50

Hormel       Thick & Easy 4oz Cup, Peach Mango Flavor, Honey Consistency    78769

$4.81 $481.00
EACH
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

14 MED PASS OR EQUAL BUTTER
PECAL FLAVOR

50.00000

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

15 MED PASS OR EQUAL FRUIT
BERRY FLAVOR

50.00000

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

Hormel Med Pass 2.0, 32oz, Vanilla 27016

EACH
$4.81 $240.50

Hormel Med Pass 2.0, 32oz, Butter Pecan 46463

EACH
$4.81 $240.50

Hormel Med Pass 2.0, 32oz, Wild Berry 35985
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 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

16 MED PASS OR EQUAL SUGAR
FREE VANILLA

75.00000

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

17 ENSURE CLEAR OR EQUAL APPLE
FLAVOR

100.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTCHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

18 ENSURE CLEAR OR EQUAL
BERRY FLAVORED

100.00000 CASE

$5.22 $391.50

Hormel Med Pass 2.0, 32oz, No Sugar Added, Vanilla 22649

EACH

$18.21 $1,821.00

Hormel Ensure Clear, 8oz, Apple 64903

$18.21 $1,821.00
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

19 ENSURE CLEAR OR EQUAL
PEACH FLAVOR

100.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

20 ENSURE CLEAR OR EQUAL
POMEGRANATE FLAVOR

100.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

Hormel Ensure Clear, 8oz, Mixed Berry 64900

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID 
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 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

21 ENSURE ORIGINAL OR EQUAL
VANILLA FLAVOR

30.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

22 ENSURE ORIGINAL OR EQUAL
CHOCOLATE FLAVOR

30.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

23 ENSURE ORIGINAL OR EQUAL
BUTTER PECAN FLAVOR

30.00000 CASE

$10.80 $324.00

Hormel Ensure, 8oz, Vanilla 50460 

$22.21 $666.30

Hormel Ensure, 8oz, Chocolate 58293

$10.80 $324.00



Page : 11

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

24 CARNATION INSTANT BREAKFAST
DRINK MIX OR EQUAL FRENCH

25.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

25 CARNATION INSTANT BREAKFAST
DRINK MIX OR EQUAL

25.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

Hormel Ensure, 8oz, Butter Pecan 51892

$28.56 $714.00

Nestle Carnation Instant Breakfast, French Vanilla 11004659

$37.89 $947.25

Nestle Carnation Instant Breakfast, Chocolate 11004657



Page : 12

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

26 CARNATION INSTANT BREAKFAST
DRINK MIX OR EQUAL VANILLA

25.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

27 CARNATION INSTANT BREAKFAST
DRINK MIX OR EQUAL

25.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

28 CARNATION INSTANT BREAKFAST
DRINK MIX OR EQUAL S/F

25.00000 CASE

NO BID NO BID

$28.56 $714.00

Nestle Carnation Instant Breakfast, Strawberry 11001937

$37.89 $947.25
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

29 SUGAR FREE MAGIC CUPS OR
EQUAL VANILLA

300.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

30 SUGAR FREE MAGIC CUPS OR
EQUAL CHOCOLATE

300.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 Nestle Carnation Instant Breakfast, No Sugar Added, Chocolate        12159425

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID



Page : 14

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

31 SUGAR FREE MAGIC CUPS OR
EQUAL STRAWBERRY

300.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

32 THICKENED DAIRY IN NECTAR 40.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

33 THICKENED DAIRY IN HONEY 40.00000 CASE

NO BID                         NO BID

$25.88                          $1,035.20

Hormel      Thick & Easy Thickened Dairy Product, 32oz, Nectar Consistency      73625

$26.30                          $1,052.00



Page : 15

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV26301

US

DIVISION OF VETERANS AFFAIRS
1 FREEDOMS WAY

CLARKSBURG WV 26301

US

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

34 PRO SOURCE OR EQUAL BERRY
PUNCH

40.00000 CASE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

50500000

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SPECS FOR MORE DETAILS

 SCHEDULE OF EVENTS

EventLine Event Date
1 QUESTION DEADLINE 10AM EST 2017-12-22

Hormel         Thick & Easy Thickened Dairy Product, Honey Consistency            73626

$100.58                        $4,023.20

Medtrition                            ProSource Plus, 32oz, Berry Punch                           11661



























































Michelle Stanley
800-328-8111

800-237-9766
Michelle.Stanley@McKesson.com







ITEM 
NUMBER

3.1.1

3.1.2

3.1.3

3.1.4

3.1.5
30 cases

$

$324.00

PEACH

VANILLA

$18.21

$18.21

$ NO BID

$10.80

POMEGRANATE
100 cases$ NO BID $

McKesson #64032600, Hormel #64903, 24EA/CS

ENSURE ORIGINAL OR EQUAL

100 cases
McKesson #64902600, Hormel #64900, 24EA/CS

McKesson #76692624, Hormel #78769, 24EA/CS

McKesson #70162601, Hormel #27016, 32oz., 1/EA

McKesson #46462601, Hormel #46463, 32oz., 1/EA

McKesson #35952601, Hormel #35985, 32oz., 1/EA

McKesson #22642601, Hormel #22649, 32oz., 1/EA

THICKENED HONEY CONSISTENCY

McKesson #32872600, Hormel #32870, 24EA/CS

McKesson #71102600, Hormel #50460, 24EA/CS

McKesson #76682624, Hormel #78768, 24EA/CS PEACH MANGO
$11.88 300 cases $3,564.00

McKesson #32192600, Hormel #32192, 24EA/CS

McKesson #46152600, Hormel #46056, 24EA/CS

McKesson #20162600, Hormel #20160, 24EA/CS

McKesson #12682600, Hormel #12687, 24EA/CS

$1,809.00

$1,381.00

$1,578.00

$1,809.00

$1,809.00
CRANBERRY

APPLE

$12.06

200 cases

300 cases

$3,579.00

$3,582.00

300 cases

$5.22 75 $391.50
SUGAR FREE VANILLA

PEACH MANGO

$13.81

$10.52

$12.06

$12.06

TEA

ORANGE

CRANBERRY

APPLE

$11.93

$11.94

$12.01

WATER

150 cases

THICKENED NECTOR CONSISTENCY 

McKesson #28292600, Hormel #28259, 24EA/CS TEA

ORANGE

WATER

McKesson #97052600, Hormel #39705, 24EA/CS

McKesson #41532600, Hormel #41530, 24EA/CS

CRFQ VNF1800000012 DIETARY SUPPLEMENT ‐EXHIBIT A PRICING PAGE

ITEM DESCRIPTION  UNIT PRICE ESTIMATED QUANTITY TOTAL PRICE FLAVORS

McKesson #49142600, Hormel #49144, 24EA/CS

McKesson #23362600, Hormel #23061, 24EA/CS

$3,579.00

$2,728.00

$3,156.00

$11.93

$13.64

$10.52

$1,801.50

150 cases

100 cases

150 cases

150 cases

150 cases

300 cases

300 cases

$481.00

$240.50

$240.50

ENSURE CLEAR OR EQUAL

BERRY

100 cases

100 cases
APPLE

$4.81

$4.81

$4.81

100

50

50

MEDPASS OR EQUAL

VANILLA

BUTTER PECAN

FRUIT BERRY

$1,821.00

$1,821.00



3.1.6

3.1.7

3.1.8

3.1.9 PROSOURCE PLUS OR EQUAL

STRAWBERRY
$ NO BID 300 cases $

HONEY CONSISTENCY 
$26.30 40 cases

McKesson #76252608, Nestle #73625, 8EA/CS

McKesson #36262600, Nestle #73626, 8EA/CS
$1,052.00

CARNATION INSTANT BREAKFAST DRINK MIX OR EQUAL 1.26 OZ. PKTS

McKesson #53062600, Nestle #11004659, 60EA/CS FRENCH VANILLA
25 cases $714.00

30 cases $666.30

$10.80 30 cases $324.00
CHOCOLATE

BUTTER PECAN

$22.21
McKesson #92832600, Hormel #58293, 24EA/CS

McKesson #18922600, Hormel #51892, 24EA/CS

McKesson #70502600, Hormel #50648, 24EA/CS

$28.56

$37.89

$ NO BID

CHOCOLATE

STRAWBERRY
$10.80 30 cases $324.00

STRAWBERRY
$28.56 25cases $714.00

$947.25

300 cases

McKesson #53422605, Nestle #11004657, 60EA/CS

SUGAR FREE CHOCOLATE
$37.89 25 cases

25 cases

25 cases

$25.88 40 cases $1,035.20

$947.25

$
CHOCOLATE

VANILLA

McKesson #86502610, Nestle #11001937, 60EA/CS (Sold by the BX/10 @ $4.76/BX)

McKesson #66112600, Nestle #12159425, 64EA/CS

$

$

THICKENED DAIRY

$ NO BID

$ NO BID

300 cases

$46,442.20

TOTAL BID AMOUNT

VENDOR NAME: McKesson Medical‐Surgical Minnesota Supply Inc.

ADDRESS: 8121 10th Avenue North  

                     Golden Valley, MN 55427

****ESTIMATED QUANTITIES ARE ONLY AN ESTIMATE AND ONLY USED FOR BIDDING PURPOSES.  THIS IS NOT A GAURANTEE OF PURCHASE****
          

SUGAR FREE MAGIC CUPS OR EQUAL

VANILLA

NECTOR CONSISTENCY

PHONE: (800) 328‐8111

EMAIL: Government.Bids@McKesson.com

SIGNATURE:                                                                                                                                                                               Date:  1/08/18

McKesson #11662600, Medtrition #11661, 4EA/CS BERRY PUNCH
$100.58 40 cases $4,023.20

VENDOR INFORMATION 




