A iy,
%

Plll'ﬂllﬂSIlI[l Division

The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
wvOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West
Virginia’s procurement process, and to maintain the
transparency of the bid-opening process, this
documentation submitted online is publicly posted
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor
responses to this solicitation submitted to the
Purchasing Division in hard copy format.
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Solicitation Response(SR) | Dept: 0202  ID: ESR01231700000003361

Ver.: 1

[eHCIEINM GO N ENGOI Contact | Default Values | Discount | Document Information

Procurement Folder: 251921 SO Doc Code: CRFQ
Procurement Type: Central Master Agreement SO Dept: 0303
Vendor ID: 000000197898 g’] SO Doc ID: DOT1700000045
Legal Name: W L CONSTRUCTION & PAVING INC Published Date: 120/17
Alias/DBA: Close Date: 125117
Total Bid: 50.00 Close Time: 13:30
Response Date: 01/23/2017 Status: Closed
Response Time: 10:13 Sclicitation Description: Addendum No. 4 - ASPHALT- A
MATERIAL AND PICKUP BY v
Total of Header Attachments: 4
Total of All Attachments: 4




Purchasing Division

Post Office Box 50130

2019 Washington Street East

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Proc Folder : 281921

Proc Type : Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Description : Addendum No. 4 - ASPHALT - MATERIAL AND PICKUP BY WVDOH

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2017-01-25 SR 0803 ESR01231700000003361 1
13:30:00
LVENDOR
000000197898
W L CONSTRUCTION & PAVING INC
Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT1700000045
Total Bid : $0.00 Response Date: 2017-01-23 Response Time: 10:13:19
Comments:
FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Mark A Atkins
(304) 558-2307
mark.a.atkins@wv.gov
Signature on File FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 ASPHALT - MATERIAL AND
PICKUP BY WVDOH
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30121601
ASPHALT - MATERIAL AND PICKUP BY WVDOH PER THE PRICING PAGES/E-CATALOG

Extended Description :
Vendor shall use Exhibit A Pricing Page for bid pricing. If bidding online vendor must attach the pricing page and
information attachment to their bid. See Section 18 of Instructions to Bidders for additional information.
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VENDOR CUSTOMER SUPPLIE|SUPPLIER NAME MAN |MANUFA |COMMODITY [ITEM DESCRIPTION |EXTENDED DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE  [LIST DELI [PRO |MOD |DRA |PIEC |SERI |SPEC|SIZE |[CcoL |PICT
CODE R PART UFAC|CTURER |CODE PRICE VERY|DUC [EL |WIN [E AL [IFIC OR |URE
NUMBE TURE|PART DAY |T/CA G NUM |ATIO FILE
R R NUMBER S TEG BER |N NAM
NAM ORY E
E
197898 1-A Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |1-A 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON NOBID | 5 [N/AN/AIN/AN/A [N/A[N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 1-B Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |1-B 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 1-C Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [1-C 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base Il TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 1-D Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |1-D 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 1-E Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [1-E 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 1-F Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |1-F 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 1-G Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [1-G 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 1-H Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |1-H 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 1l Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [1-1 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 1-J Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [1-3 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 1-K Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [1-K 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 1-L Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [1-L 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A |N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 1-M Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [1-M 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/A IN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 1-N Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |1-N 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 11 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 1-0 Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [1-0 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1| TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 1-P Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |1-P 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Plant Run TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 1-Q Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [1-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 1-R Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [1-R 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 1-AQ1 |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |1-AQ1  |[30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY NOBID | 5 |[N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 1-AQ2 |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |1-AQ2 [30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 2-A Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |2-A 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON NOBID | 5 [N/AN/AIN/AN/A [N/A[N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 2-B Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [2-B 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A |N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 2-C Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [2-C 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base Il TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 2-D Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [2-D 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 2-E Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [2-E 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 2-F Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |2-F 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 2-G Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [2-G 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/A IN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 2-H Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [2-H 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 2-1 Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [2-1 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 2-J Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [2-3 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 2-K Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [2-K 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 2-L Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [2-L 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 2-M Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |2-M 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/A IN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 2-N Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [2-N 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing |11 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 2-0 Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [2-0 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1| TON NOBID | 5 |[N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 2-P Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [2-P 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Plant Run TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 2-Q Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [2-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 2-R Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [2-R 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 2-AQ1 |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |2-AQ1  |30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 2-AQ2 |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |2-AQ2 [30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A |N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 3-A Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |3-A 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON NOBID | 5 [N/AN/AIN/AN/A[N/AN/ATN/ATN/A
197898 3-B Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |3-B 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 3-C Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [3-C 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON NOBID | 5 |[N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/AN/A[N/AN/A
197898 3-D Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |3-D 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A |N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 3-E Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [3-E 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 3-F Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |3-F 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
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197898 3-G Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [3-G 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 3-H Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [3-H 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 3 Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |3-1 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 3-J Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [3-3 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 3-K Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [3-K 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 3-L Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [3-L 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 3-M Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |3-M 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 3-N Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |3-N 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1| TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 3-0 Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |3-O0 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing |11 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 3-P Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [3-P 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Plant Run TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 3-Q Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |3-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 3-R Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |3-R 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 3-AQ1 |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |3-AQ1 [30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 3-AQ2 |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |3-AQ2  [30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 4-A Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |4-A 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON NOBID | 5 [N/ATN/AN/A [N/A |N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 4-B Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |4-B 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 4-C Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [4-C 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base Il TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 4-D Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [4-D 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 4-E Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |4-E 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 4-F Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [4-F 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 4-G Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |4-G 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 4-H Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [4-H 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 4-| Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |41 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A |N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 4-] Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [4-3 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 4-K Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [4-K 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 4-L Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [4-L 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 4-M Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |4-M 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 4-N Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |4-N 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1| TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 4-0 Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |4-O 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing |11 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 4-P Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [4-P 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Plant Run TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 4-Q Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |4-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 4-R Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |4-R 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 4-AQ1 |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |4-AQ1 [30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 4-AQ2 |[Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |4-AQ2  |30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY NOBID | 5 |[N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 5-A Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |5-A 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON 44.75] 5 |[N/AIN/AIN/AIN/AIN/A IN/ATN/ATN/A
197898 5-B Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |5-B 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON 46.25| 5 |N/AIN/A[N/AN/A [N/A [N/JAN/A [N/A
197898 5-C Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |5-C 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON 51.80] 5 |N/A|IN/A|IN/A|IN/A|IN/A|N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 5-D Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |5-D 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON 51.80| 5 [N/AIN/A[N/AN/A [N/A [N/AN/A[N/A
197898 5-E Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |5-E 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON 51.80| 5 |N/AIN/A|IN/A|IN/A|IN/A|N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 5-F Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |[5-F 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 |[N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A|N/A[N/AN/A
197898 5-G Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |5-G 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON 50.00] 5 |N/AIN/A|IN/A|IN/A|IN/A|N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 5-H Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [5-H 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON 56.85| 5 |N/AIN/A[N/AN/A [N/A [N/AN/AIN/A
197898 5-1 Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |51 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON 56.00] 5 |N/AIN/A|IN/A|IN/A|IN/A|N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 5-J Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [5-3 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON 56.85| 5 |N/AIN/A[N/AN/A [N/A [N/JAN/AIN/A
197898 5-K Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |5-K 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON 58.00] 5 |N/A|IN/A|IN/A|IN/A|IN/A|N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 5-L Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [5-L 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 |[N/A[N/A IN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
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197898 5-M Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |5-M 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NO BID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 5-N Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |5-N 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1| TON NOBID | 5 |[N/A[N/A IN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 5-0 Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |5-0 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing |11 TON NO BID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A |N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 5-p Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [5-P 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Plant Run TON 56.85| 5 |N/AIN/A[N/AN/A [N/A [N/AN/AIN/A
197898 5-Q Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |5-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON 3.00] 5 |IN/AIN/AIN/AIN/AIN/A|N/AIN/AIN/A
197898 5-R Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |5-R 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON 10.00] 5 [N/AN/AIN/A[N/A [N/A [N/A[N/AIN/A
197898 5-AQ1 |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |5-AQ1 [30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY 4500.00] 5 |N/AIN/A|IN/AIN/AIN/AN/AIN/AIN/A
197898 5-AQ2 |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |5-AQ2  [30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY 1000.00] 5 [N/AIN/A[N/AN/A [N/A IN/JAIN/AIN/A
197898 6-A Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |6-A 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON NOBID | 5 [N/ATN/AN/A [N/A |N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 6-B Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |6-B 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 6-C Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |6-C 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base Il TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 6-D Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [6-D 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 6-E Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |6-E 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A |N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 6-F Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [6-F 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/A IN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 6-G Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |6-G 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 6-H Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [6-H 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 6-1 Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |6-1 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 6-J Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [6-3 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 6-K Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |6-K 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 6-L Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |6-L 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 6-M Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |6-M 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 6-N Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |6-N 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1| TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 6-0 Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |6-O 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing |11 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A |N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 6-P Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [6-P 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Plant Run TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 6-Q Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |6-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 6-R Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |6-R 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 6-AQ1 |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |6-AQ1 [30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 6-AQ2 |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |6-AQ2  [30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 7-A Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |7-A 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON NO BID | 5 [N/ATN/AN/A [N/A |N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 7-B Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |7-B 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 7-C Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |7-C 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 7-D Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [7-D 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 7-E Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |7-E 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 7-F Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [7-F 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/A IN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 7-G Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |7-G 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 7-H Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [7-H 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 7-1 Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |71 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 7-J Strasburg Plant 312 N/A 7-3 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 7-K Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |7-K 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 7-L Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |7-L 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A|N/A[N/AN/A
197898 7-M Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |7-M 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/ATN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 7-N Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |7-N 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1| TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/AN/A[N/AN/A
197898 7-0 Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |7-O0 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing |11 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 7-P Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [7-P 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Plant Run TON NOBID | 5 |[N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/AN/A[N/AN/A
197898 7-Q Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |7-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A |N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 7-R Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |7-R 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
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197898 7-AQ1 |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |7-AQ1  [30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 7-AQ2 |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |7-AQ2  |30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY NOBID | 5 |[N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 8-A Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |8-A 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON NOBID | 5 [N/ATN/AN/A [N/A |N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 8-B Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [8-B 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 8-C Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [8-C 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base Il TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 8-D Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [8-D 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 8-E Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |8-E 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 8-F Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [8-F 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 8-G Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |8-G 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 8-H Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [8-H 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 8- Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |8-1 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 8-J Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [8-3 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 8-K Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [8-K 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A |N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 8-L Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [8-L 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/A IN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 8-M Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |8-M 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 8-N Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |8-N 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1| TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 8-0 Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |8-O0 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing |11 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 8-P Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [8-P 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Plant Run TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 8-Q Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |8-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 8-R Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [8-R 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 8-AQ1 |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |8-AQ1 [30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 8-AQ2 |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |8-AQ2  [30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 9-A Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |9-A 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON NOBID | 5 [N/ATN/AN/A [N/A |N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 9-B Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |9-B 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 9-C Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |9-C 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 9-D Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [9-D 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 9-E Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |9-E 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 9-F Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [o-F 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 9-G Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |9-G 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 9-H Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [9-H 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 9- Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |9-1 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 9-J Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [9-3 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 9-K Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [9-K 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 9-L Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [9-L 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/A IN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 9-M Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |9-M 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 9-N Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |9-N 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1| TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A
197898 9-0 Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |9-O 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing |11 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 9-p Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [9-P 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Plant Run TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 9-Q Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |9-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 9-R Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |9-R 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A|N/A[N/AN/A
197898 9-AQ1 |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |9-AQ1  [30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A |N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 9-AQ2 |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |9-AQ2  [30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 10-A Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |10-A 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON NO BID | 5 [N/ATN/AN/A [N/A |N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 10-B  |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |10-B 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 |[N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/AN/A[N/AN/A
197898 10-C  |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |10-C 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A |N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 10-D  |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |10-D 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A




VENDOR CUSTOMER SUPPLIE[SUPPLIER NAME MAN [MANUFA [cOMMODITY [ITEM DESCRIPTION [EXTENDED DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE  [LIST DELI [PRO [mMoOD [DRA [PIEC [SERI [SPEC]SIZE [coL [picT
CODE R PART UFAC|CTURER |CODE PRICE VERY|DUC |[EL WIN |E AL IFIC OR |URE

NUMBE TURE|PART DAY [T/CA G NUM [ATIO FILE

R R NUMBER S TEG BER [N NAM

NAM ORY E
E

197898 10-E Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |10-E 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 10-F  |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |10-F 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 10-G  |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |10-G 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 10-H  |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |10-H 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 10-1 Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |10-1 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 10-J Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [10-J 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 10-K Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |10-K 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 10-L  |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |10-L 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 10-M  |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |10-M 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 10-N  |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |10-N 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing |1l TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 10-O  |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |10-0 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing Il TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/AIN/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 10-P  [Strasburg Plant 312 N/A [10-P 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Plant Run TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/AIN/AN/A [N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 10-Q |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |10-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A |N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 10-R  |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |10-R 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON NOBID | 5 [N/A[N/A IN/AN/A[N/A [N/A[N/AN/A
197898 10-AQ1 |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |10-AQ1 [30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY NOBID | 5 [N/AIN/AIN/A|N/A N/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
197898 10-AQ2 |Strasburg Plant 312 N/A |10-AQ2 [30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY NOBID | 5 |[N/A[N/AIN/AN/A[N/A[N/A[N/AN/A




INFORMATION ATTACHMENT
Vendor’s Storage Sites
Bituminous Asphalt - Materials and Pickup by WVDOH ONLY

VENDOR NAME __ W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.
Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.
If a Vendor will be supplying materials from multiple Plant Locations and ALL pricing is the same, ALL Plant

Locations can be listed on one Information Attachment form and one bid submission is acceptable.
If a Vendor will be supplying materials from multiple Plant Locations, at varying prices, additional , separate

bid submissions must be submitted for each Plant Location bid. Multple Plant Locations with varying prices,

shall be submitted on separate bid submissions.

Vendor's Plant Location:

Plant 312
866 Oranda Road
Strasburg, Virginia 22656

Vendor's Plant Location:

Vendor's Plant Location:

Vendor's Plant Location:




CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE PAGE

By signing below, or submitting documentation through the West Virginia Vendor Self Service
Portal website, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand the
requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid, offer or
proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the product or
service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for that product
or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and conditions
contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that [ am submitting this bid, offer or
proposal for review and consideration; that I am authorized by the vendor to execute and submit
this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor’s behalf; that I am
authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge,
the vendor has properly registered with any State agency that may require registration.

Lk) (. Ccm‘)\-(utcx‘to/\ > a\/tm IY\C‘

(Full Company Name)

(Authori;éd Si'gn;ture)
Teddy L. D Yes |0r° \CC'(’ Monag e

(Print or Type Name and Title

of81gnatory)54_b (‘?3| _ 9774_'

(Phone Number)
540~ L2 -4250
(Fax Number)
TwrnTeRZ @ LW -L dopsTRUCcT Iow, Cort
(Email address)
| oo/ 17
(Date) ! ’

Form pre-approved by DOH legal division on July 12, 2016.
Attorney signature not required.



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.:_ Dot )] 00000045  F.6.i7

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)
e

dendum No. 1 [] Addendum No. 6
dAddendum No. 2 [] Addendum No. 7
D/ ddendum No. 3 [] Addendum No. 8
J;ddendum No. 4 [] Addendum No. 9
[ ] Addendum No. 5 [[] Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. 1
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

L\)-L CoA‘)\‘FuC‘\‘\‘OI\ & fav iho) | Thc.

wny Name v

Authorized &ignature

[foo]17

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite
document processing.
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