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Vendor Name, Address and Telephone Number:

RBS Inc.
PO 490
WSS, WV 24986

FOR IN#ORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Misty Delong
{304) 558-8802

misty.m.delong@wv.gov

Signature X WMF’\ / FEIN # 55'0477\65

DATE ZW/‘ 16

All offars subject to all terms \nd conditions contained In this solicitation

Page: 1

FORM ID : WV-PRC-CRFQ-001



ACORD.

Cllent#: 534075

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

18RBSING

DATE (WWDIVYYYY)
9/23/2015

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE GOVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: I the cetificate holder Iz an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy{ies) must be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
the terms and conditions of the pelicy, certaln policiea may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate dosa not confer rights to the
certHicate holder in lieu of auch endorsement(s).

BB&T-Carson Insurance Services PHORE 304 346-0806 FAX o, 8887513002
601 Tennessee Avenue m%m' i
Charleston, WV 25302 . INSURER(S} AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
304 346-0806 INSURER A - TTavelers Indemnity Company of 25666
INSURED RBSI #wsuren g ; Travelers Indemnity Company 25658
ne
. Travelers Pr Casualty Co 25674
P O Box 490 — 2pery Sestaly
White Sulphuy Springs, WV 24936 msm:sns:
INSUHERF ;

COVERAGES

CERTIFICATE NUMBER:

REVISION NUMBER:

THIS 15 TO CERTIFY THAT THE PCLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
GERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJEGT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCGLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLIGIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

| Jrouer (X BE [ o

(N TYPE OF INSURANCE T, POLICY NUMBER | ERDEN e | RBD YD | LitrTS
A | X[ COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABNLITY X | X |DTCOb614B420TIA1S H0/01/2015] 10/01/2016] Fack occuRRence 151,000,000
| cLAMS MADE @ CCCUR B A e | $300,000
|_X| PD Ded:10,000 WED EXP {Any one pesson {55,000
|| | PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | 51,000,000
GENL AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $2,000,000

PRODUCTS - COMPRP AGa | $2,000,000
$

OTHER: . .

A | AUTOMOBILE LIABIITY X | X |DT&105614B420TIL15 10/01/2015(10/01/2016 (€2 acrisenty 51,000,000
| _X| any AuTO BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
|| AL SUmED s BODILY MNJURY (Per accidend) | $

[ PROPERTY DAMAGE
Xl wrepautos X |Agos | (Pat acent ¢
: $
B | xjweRelaB | X | ocour DTSMCUP5614B420IND [10/01/2015| 10/01/2016 EACH OCCURRENCE $5.000,000
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE . 145,000,000
oep | X| rerenmons10000 ,

C [Hsuer cumeEaTION) . X | DTJUB5615B08715 10/01/2015/ 10/61/2016 X B | [8F
mpmmgpm%xscmEm i Inciudes IWV I_?‘!'oad Form EL. EACH ACCIDENT $1,000,000
"{Ilmdgbry intap Emplovers Liabliity |SecHon | EL pisease -Eaemeiovee! 51,000,000
DESCRIPTION OF CPERATIONS belaw 23-4-2(d)(2)(ii} of WV Gode EL DISEASE - POLiCY LT | $1.000 000

** Supplemental Name **
Policy# DTCO5614B420TIA15

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 107, Additionat Remarks Schedute, may be altached fl more space is required?
** Workers Comp Information **

Proprietors/Partners/Executive Officers/Members Excluded: Ronaid B Snyder, President

Charleston, WV 25305

(See Attached Descriptions)
_CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION
- SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
State of West Virginia THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
2018 Washington Street, East P

ACCORDANCE WITH THE DOLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED AEPRESENTATIVE

Glom. Ko PPic Loy~

ACORD 25 (201401) 1 of2

#514835964/M14834167

© 1988-2014 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD
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CERTIFICATIONAND SIGNATURE PAGE

By signing below, or submitting documentation through wvOASIS, I certify that I have reviewed
this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand the requirements, terms and conditions, and
other information contained herein; that this bid, offer or proposal constitutes an offer to the
State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the product or service proposed meets the
mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for that product or service, unless
otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and conditions contained in the
Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that I am submitting this bid, offer or proposal for
review and consideration; that I am authorized by the vendor to execute and submit this bid,
offer, or proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor’s behalf; that I am authorized to
bind the vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, the vendor
has properly registered with any State agency that may require registration.

RRE  Tnc

(CW /.0, 225 Tne

(Authorlz ignature) (Representatlve Name, Title)

64S 2211 304-645.2597 /Iar J6

(Phone Number) (Fax Number) (Date)

Revised 10/27/2015



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete
And Controlled Low-Strength Material

(Wliam Spudet

Contract Manager:

Telephone Numbers: __ 304. b5, 7777}
Fax Number: 0d. 645, 2597
Email Address: bhillErbsing . com

Revised 10/27/2014



INFORMATION ATTACHMENT
Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.
Ready Mix Concrete and CLSM

If a Vendor will be supplying materials from multiple Piant Locations and ALL pricing is the same, ALL Plant

Locations can be listed on one information Attachment form and one bid submission is acceptable.
If a Vendor will be supplying materials from multiple Plant Locations. at varying prices, additional , separate

bid submissions must be submitted for each Plant Location bid. Multple Plant Locations with varying prices,
shall be submitted on separate bid submissions.

ﬂPer Section 3.2.3 Certified Plant, the Vendor shall provide the source provider/plant name and the 911 address
or the most recent physical street address, city and state. The Vendor should provide the Certified Plant Code.

4 B.S. _Jnc - Qrecnbier “Ready Mix is Plant currently certified:
€Y 00 West, Inchghrial Way “ YES or NO
(aldwell WV Zdazs ' | Certified Plant Code:

' &0z 30

Per Section 3.2.3 Certified Plant, the Vendor shall provide the source provider/plant name and the 911 address

or the most recent physical street address, city and state. The Vendor should provide the Certified Plant Code.

Is Plant currently certified:
YES or NO

Certified Plant Code:

Per Section 3.2.3 Certified Plant, the Vendor shall provide the source provider/plant name and the 911 address

Jor the most recent physical street address, city and state. The Vendor should provide the Certified Plant Code.

Is Plant currently cerfified:
YES or NO

Certified Plant Code:

- - o = — = —— = =

Per Section 3.2.770alcium Chlonﬁg baéé& écc-élé_rétdr brand rie;q_uestai i-s HE-f 2_2 If;Véﬁ&ori_s bi&ding an
“or equal to" product, the name and any product identification numbers shail be listed below.

_loctaccel —_]

LI METRTN I ot B T D TS M T R A AN IA e i i 37

A Y == =]

Per Section 3.2.7.2 Non-CaHJm Chloride based accelerator brand requested is Darex Set. If a Vendor is Eidding
an “or equal to" product, the name and any product identification numbers shall be listed below.

olar SeA

=S .
e -

Per Section 3273 Suber Plastici'z'er;br-and requeétéd s Eucon 3?._If a Vén?ior is -l:-oi&dinahar; "or equéi tc_:"'.
product, the name and any product identification numbers shall be listed below.
beace 1 /3998374




'VENDOR CUSTOMER CODE| SUPPLT

Wm\ue AN [MaNUF ITEM DESCRIFTION J exTENDED DESCRIFTION UNLT OF MEASURE  JursT prace o |rroo]mon Jora Jrecd senr |spec Jsze PICT
UFAC ODE very Jucty e Jwing CIA ) 5T=" R fure
‘TURE |R PART NUM | TTON FILE
3 NUMBE GORY] BER NAME
HAMEJR
D00OKIIT 44 B0 RBS Inc., Greenbriar M __|WA (801 [30111505 Mix Concrets Districi € - Glass A Concrefe - 2-2.90 CY CY No Bid 7 |NA [NIA INIA [N/A Jia [NUA A (AT |
DO00I20144 802 RBS Inc, Greanbrie: Ready M __|Wa |8-02 _ |30111505 Reacy Mix Conorete Disirict 8 - Slass A Concrate - 3-3.99 GY CY No Bid 7_INA INIA 1A [N/A INVA [NUA (/A INIA | ]
D0000020144 803 ABS Inc, Gresnbrier Readv M |wa 1803 |30111508 Reauy Mix Concrete Dishict 8 - Sfuss A Concrela - 4-4.06 CY oY No Bid 7_{PNA INA J01a, [NUA [NGA TA [NV TR | |
00000020144 BO4 RBS Inc., Grasnbriar Mix  |twa |804  ]301116508 Raudy Mix Concrete Disliict 4 - Glass A Concrela - 5 CY AND OVER CY Na Bid T _{N/A INiA [a (NUA A [JA TN TN |
00000020144 805 RBS Inc., Grasnbrior M |nws B805  [30111505 Mbx Concrale Districl 8 - Class B Concrete - 2-2.60 G cY 223.15] 7 INVA T |NA [NVA [ iA [Nis, [hra (NGa ] ]
00000020144 806 RBS Inc. Greonbrier Ready Mix A 608 [30111505 Mix Concrete District 3 - Glase 5 Concrets - 3-3.60 CY cY 195.33] 7 INGA [N/A (s INvA [00a [ [ia [N |
00000020144 807 RBS Inc., Greenbriar Ready Mix  |wiA 607 |3p111505 Mix Concrets Disiriet 3 - Ciass B Concrets - 4-4.90 CY CY. 150.55| 7 IN/A [NUA (o [NvA (s s (NGA TNIA ]
00000020144 808 RBS Inc., Greanbrier Ready Mix _ |wa Je-08  |30111605 Mix Concrets Disiried B - Class B Concrabe - 5 CY AND OVER Y 131.95] 7 INVA IN/A (A INGA | NFA [ [NGA [N
00000020144 808 RBS Inc., Greanbriar My |ne 1800 30111505 Mbx Concrale Diairicl B - Clasa G Concrte - 2-2.88 &Y Y No Bld 7_INiA Inua, [N7A INGA (DA ENA TNAA [NiA | ]
00000020+ 44 810 RBS Inc., Greanbrier Mix |wa |8-10 (30111505 Mix Concrete Dlatrict B - Class G Concrota - 3-3.60 &Y Y No Bld 7_INZA { s, [NEA TNA | INZA, [ GA TNZA [NIA
00000020444 E11 RBS Inc., Gresnbrisr Mix  Ina 1811 |30111505 Rendy Mix Concrata Dialiict 8 - Class C Concrels - 4466 CY CY I|No Bid Z_INVA | NJA |NGA FRUA NS INAA THZA T | |
60000020144 B12 RBS Inc., Greenbrier Mix  Jwa 832 Ja0111505 M Concrets Diatiici 8 - Clags G Concrals - 5 CY AND GVER CY Na Bid 7N INGA NS [NUA /A TMA [IVA THIA ] |
00000020144 843 RBS Inc., Graanbrier Mo fwa 343 011505 Mbx Goncrete District & - Ciass D Goncrete -2-2.66 CY CY No Bid 7 _{N/A INIA INGA [MUA MUA TNA |N/A IR T |
00000020144 514 RBS Inc., Greanbiier M WA |814  |30111505 Mix Gonerele District & - Class D Cancrete - 3-3.66 CY CcY No Bid 7 _{NJA INIA ENGA [ NGA, |NAA TNZA |NJA JAA Y |
00000020144 815 RBS Inc., Greenbrisr Ready Mix__|Wa |8-15_ | 30111305 Mix Goncrete: District 8 - Claus O Goncrele - 4495 CY cY No Bid 7 _{NIA INIA (DA {NAA |GA BRI [NAA ALY |
00000020144 818 RBS Inc., Qreenbriwr Ready Mix | WA |8-18 | 3od11568 Mix Concrele: Disiricl 8 - Clas D Goncrele - 5 &Y AND GVER CY Ne Bid 7 _{NJA INIA [N |NGA [NIA [ MUA [NAA TNV T |
00005020144 17 RES Inc., Greenbrisr Mix__|Wwa 817 _[30111505 Mix Concrete. Districl & - Claes H Concrete - 2-2.99 CY CY No Bid 7 _INIA INIA [NGA | NAA TNEA /A [NAS TRUAT |
00000020144 518 RBS Inc, Greenbrinr Ready Mx__ |Wa |8-18  |30111508 Ready Mix Concrate Distrigt 8 - Chiwe H Goncrate - 3-3.89 CY CY No Bid 7 INIA JNIA [N [NGA INA [N/A NS TNAA ] |
DO000AZ0144 B8 RBS Inc, Greenbriar Ready Mix___|Wa |8-18 _ |30111508 Reacy Mix Goncrate District 8 - Cluxe H Concrete - 4-4.99 CY CY No Bid T_IN/A INA | A (A TN | A TNAA [NVA
00000020144 B20 ABS Inc., Gresobrer Ready Mix  (twa 1820 30111508 Raudy Mix Concrete Disliict 4 - Class H Concraie - 6 CY AND OVER CY No Bid 7 _LRUA INGA A [NA INeA (A [BUA IR | ]
DOD00020144 821 RBS Inc., Grasnbrier Ready Mic WA 18-21 130111505 Ready Mix Concrete District 8 - Class K Concrete - 2-2.69 CY CY 285.75] 7 |W/A INA NS [NGA INGA [NJA WA TNIA | |
00000020144 822 RES Inc., Grasnbrier Reacy Mix  |WA 1822 [30111605 Mix Concrete Disiriet 3 - Class K Concrete - 3-3.66 CY cY 230111 7 [N/A [N/A [/o | [ s [NA TN | |
00000020144 823 RBS Inc., Greenbrier Ready Mix _ |wA 1823 |3m 11505 Mix Concrete Distriet 3 - Clase K Cancrate - 4-4.66 CY cY 20050 7 [nA [Nia IN/A, INVA | NVA NJA, A TNEA | |
00000020744 524 RBS Inc., Greanhrisr Ready X |ma |8-24  [3ni11505 Mix Concrele Disirici 8 - Class K Goncrele - 5 CY AND OVER cY 175.22! 7 {NIA INIA [/ [NAA (DU FRss, NS (DA ] ]
00000020144 525 RES Inc., Greanhriny Wix__ |wia |825  [30111508 Mix Concmls District 8 - Mudilied Class K Conciste, 8 12 Bag Mix Siliosous Sand - 2-2.99 CY Y No Bid 7 IN/A INIA, [Mra |NGA [MUA [NsA T [NA ] ]
00000020144 826 RBS Inc., Greanbriay Mix__|wa |828  [30111508 Ready Mix Goncrste District 8 - Madified Ciass K Cancrale, & 1/2 Bag Mb, Siicacus Sand -3-3.86 CY cY No Bid 7 INiA JNZA [Nra INUA [NA [NrA (A [NA ] ]
00000020144 827 RBS Inc., Gresnbriay W< |nwa |827  Jao111505 Reagy Mix Goncrete Dlglrict 8 - Madified Class K Cancrate, & 1/2 Bag Mix, Sliceous Sand - 4-4.99 CY. cY No Bid 7_JNUA INJA [N (A TN/A | aA | INGA | NIA | ]
GO000020144 629 | RBS Inc., Gresnbrier Mbe twa |328 J30111505 Raady Mix Goncrete Dialrict & - Madifled Cleas X Concrate, § 1/2 Bag Mix, Slicsous Sand -5 CY AND OVER, Y No Bld 7_{MNA IN/A INGA [N [NAA INAA [NVA TNIA | |
G0000020144 529 RBS Inc., Gresbrier M s 329 [3011505 Mix Concrele District & - CLSM Tvpe A -2-266 CY CY Nc Bld 7 _{BUA IN/A INGA [MUA |AA IMAA TNVA [HiA | |
00000020144 430 RBS Inc. Srenbiier M [NA |B30 | 30111505 Mix Ganersts: District & - CLEM Type A - 3-9.660 CY CcY No Bid NIA [NJA TNGA [NUA [N/A TNZA TNA i |
00020020144 831 RBS Inc, Gmenbrier Ready Mx | WA 1831 | 30411505 Mix Concrate Dislrict 8 - GLSM Tvpe A - 4-4.56 CY. cY No Bid NIA |NAA | NGA [N/A (/A TNGA TNIA (A ] |
00000020144 432 RS Inc, Greanbiisr M |WA |B32  |30111505 Mix Concrate D¥slrici 8 - GLSM Typm A - § CY AND OVER cY Ne Bid NiA [N/A | NGA [NIA (/A TNV [N (A ] |
00030020144 B33 RES |nc., Greenbiiar Mix  |Wa |8-53  |301iiSes Mix Conarele Disirict 8 - CLSM Tipa B - 2.2.60 CY cY Ne Bid N [NUA | NGA [NAA [N/A [NV (s (A ] |
000044 B-34 RES Inc., Greentrisr Mx |Wia [B34 [30114505 Mix Conorste Dislrict 8 - CLSM Type B - 3-9.80 &Y CY Mo Bid T, |N/A {NIA [N/A [NJA [INGA TV [his (s | ]
00000020144 B35 RS Ine., Gieenorier Mx  [wa |B35 _[30111505 Reacy Mix Conoret Dislrict 8 - CLSM Typs B - 4408 &Y cY Ne Bid 7 |N/A IN/A [NZA (DA TNZA NA A (s | ]
00000020144 838 RBS Inc,, Groanbiier M |twA |8.38  |30113505 Ready Mix Concrete Diglict 8 - L84 Typs B - 5 CY AND OVER cY Ne Bld 7_INA IN/A | NUA [NA INGA [NGA [N/ s |
00000020144 B37 RES Inc, Gresnbrier Mk |WwA 1837  |somisos Mix Conerete District 8 - CLEM Type & - 2-2.99 CY Y Ng Eld T_|INIA PNIA [NJA INVA [NGA NS [owA Nia [ |
00000020144 838 RES inc, Greenbrier Reurly Mix _ |WA 838  [30111505 Mix Concrutn District 8 - CLEM Type © - 2-3.99 CY CY No Bid 7_|NIA | WA |NJA [NVA [NGA (26 [NGA INia | ]
00000020144 835 RBS Ino, Gresnbrier Reudy Mix __|WA 830 [30111505 M Conrain Disirict B - CLSM Typé C - 44.89 CY CY Mo Bid 7_|INIA | WA | NJA TNGA [a7a Tve [N s | |
00000020144 840 RBS Inc, Gresnbrier My |NA_IB40 30111505 Mbx Conciate Diatricl B - CLSM Type € - 5 GY AND OVER cY No Bki 7 |NIA |NA TN/A TNGA (/A [iwa J0A [Ns ||
000000201 44 41 RBS inc. Gresnbrier Wi WA |841 (30171505 M Conotela Diarict B - AddRtional Hout - Cast per CY per mila over five mlies: CY No &id 7_|NA | NA INVA IN/A (/A foure [iea s |
00000020144 642 RBS Inc., Greenbrier Mz |WA 1842 30111505 Mbx Conruta Dialrict B - Addonal Haul - Gosl per Truck Load par mile gvat fva miies TRKL 4.36] 7 {N/A INJA [N/A INGA |A TR0 [NA [a |
00000020144 843 RES Ino., Greenbrier M [N |843  |30111505 Ready Mix Concrata Diuirict 8 - Addiilonal Gosl - ta provide Class B Concsele uaing Sifoeaus Sand CY 23.06] 7 IN/A {N/A [N/A IN/A J0A [N INEA s [
00000020144 844 RES Inc., Greenbrier Raady Mix _ |wa_[444  )sp111505 Ready Mix Concrata Disirict 8 - AdoHlonal Cost - per bag for increassd coment cantant above the targat va.us CY B.00| 7 JN/A IN/A [N/A TN/A [N/A [NV TNUA A ||
000000201144 B4S RBS Inc., Greenbrier Wb Ihh l8a5  |30111505 Mic Concrele Districl 8 - Admbdurs: - Whiinr-reducing sat retarder CY 270] 7 |NIA [NIA JNGA TNGA | A [NGA A (s | ]
00000020124 848 RBS Inc., Greenbrier Wi [ [sas [aoimises Mix Concrate District 8 - Admbdure: - Walsr pachicer CY 0.00| 7 |hA iwa [N/A [NiA [owa [ea A T ||
00000020144 847 RBS Inc. Greenbrier Ready Mix  _|WA_|8-47  |30111505 Mix Conerate District & - Admbdure: - Culoium Chioride bass acoalerator, HE-122 or “or equal 10" OZ 0.17] 7 [NVA INA IN/A INUA [/A INGA (A (s | |
00000020144 843 RBS Ino. Greenbrier Remdy Mix | WA _|B-4B  |30111505 Mix Concrats Cislrict & - Admbedure: - Non-Gaiclum Chlorids based nooeleralor, Darex Set or “ar squal to™ [¢74 £.30] 7 IN/A INA | WA JN/A /A INGA [NJA (s ]
00080020144 849 RES tnc, Greenbiter Mix _|WA |B<a  |30111505 Mix Concrale Disiricl & - Admbriure: - Super plashictzer, Eucon 37 or "of equal o™ oz 0.30] 7 IN/A INA INA INJA [iA [NUA Thoa A ] |
0000GAI01 44 B-50 RHS Inc., Greenbriar Mix__|NA 860 [30111505 Mix Conorete District 8 - Adwi¥iure: - Flber CY 7.25] 7 INIA INIA TNGA IN/A [N/A [NVA [N (sl |
00000026144 B-51 RBS Inc, Greenbriar Mk __|twa a1 |30t11sas Reaey Mix Conorete Dislrict § - Adivture: - Heated Cancraty. CY 7.001 7 INA INIA INIA INA Jha (VA [ A ]
00000020144 852 RBS Inc., Greanbrier Ml |twa jase2 |3otisos Ready Mix Goncrats Disirict 8 - Adwivdury: - Ics LB 0.50] 7 IN/AJNIA | WA Jewa INoA s [pus s | |
00000020744 855 RES Inc., Grannbrisr Mix Inva J853  |30111505 Mx Concrele Distlet 3 - Adiitional Gast - Lo add oament bo the bransik mixer t the project siie, provided and iransporbed by the Visndor, CY Mo Bid T_|NA INA |NIA [NAA IN/A [MIA [NJA TNIA
00000020144 B54 RBS Inc_ Gresnbrier Ready Mix  [na Je-s4  |30111505 Iix Concrete District 3 - Addiional Cast - to 89 cement 10 the ranslt mixer at the projest ake, pravided by the Vendor, it ransported by tha WYDOH. Y No Bid T_{BUA INGA [RA [NFA INGA [ NIA |BIA [ NiA | |
00000020144 855 RES Inc., Greenbriar Ready Mk |M/a |e-55  [30111505 Ruady Mix Conorete District 8 - Penally Charge - for unficacing time In axceas of lan (10) minutes per CY TRKM 1.00] 7 [WA FNZA | NIA [NFA TZa TRTATRUA TN
00000020144 Eaul RES na, Gresnbrier Wix |wa |eat  [30911508 Mix Concrals Disiricl 9 - Glass A Concrals - 2.2.88 CY CY No Big N/A | NZA Th/A [NGA (A TN/A (s o ] |
00000070144 90z RES ino., Greenbrier Mix_ |WA |602  |30114505 Mix Concmin Diatriol 9 - Class A Concrais - 3.3.89 &Y cY No Bid NiA |NVA [NFA |NAA T NGA INAA [N (A ] |
00000020144 803, RBS Ing,, Greenbriar Mbx  |WA |§03  [30111505 Ready Mix Conciats Dislrict B - Class A Concmte - 4-4.99 CY cY No Bid 7 JN/A INA |NJA INGA VA [noa TR TNFs | |
DODOOOZ0H 44 804 RBS In¢:., Greenhrir Mix  |WA |8.04 |20111505 Ready Mix Concrete Dielrict 8 - Ciuag A Conciie - § CY AND QVER cY o Bid 7 _IN/A [N/A INFA [NGA TN/A |NGA (N7 (s |
00000020144 805 RBS Ine., Greenbriar Mic  JWwA |905 |30111505 Raady Mix Concrete Disirict 8 - Cinag B Conofele - 7-299 GY cY 228.50) 7 INGA |N/A {NGA | NA [NEA (DA TNGA JNEA [ |
00000020144 508 RBS In¢., Graenbrier Mix  JWA_ja06  [3011505 Mb Conerets District 9 - Ciass B Conerela - 3-3.99 GY 196.00) 7 |WUA [N/ [NpA [NUA [a s [NiA INA|
00000020144 807 RBS Inc., Greenbrier M [NA_1807 |30111505 Mix Conerete District 9 - Clags B (;oncrols - 4-4.98 GY CY 150.50| 7 [huA [Nfa [niA [NVA [sa |NiA [ b [NeA |
00008020144 908 RBS Inc, Greenbrier Ready Mix  |WA _Jo-08  |3p1m5s0s Mix Conerete Diatrict B - Cings B Concreie - 5 CY AND OVER cY 131.95] 7 |N/A [N/A INJA INVA [ [NA A fnia ] |
00000020144 9-00 RBS Inc, Greenbrler ReadyMix | WA |08 |30111508 Ready Mix Conerele. Datricl B - Clags C Conolele - 2-2.98 GY CY No Bid. T_IN/A IN/A TNVA [NZA (A [NiA, (A s |
DO003020144 910 RBS in¢,, Greanhiier Mix | |610  |3a111s05 Mix Conorele Distric! € - Class C Concrete - 3-3.99 CY cY Ne Bid 7 IN/A IN/A |NGA |NJA [NV PUA [Nia sl |
00000026144 11 RE3 inc, Grecnbiiar M IwA [9-11  |301its508 Ready Mix Conarete Disbict 3 - Ciase C Conarste - 4-4.99 CY CY Ne Bid 7 IN/A INUA INAA |NJA [NUA (s Thia s ] |
00000028144 B2 RES Inc, Greenbrier Mix __INw# o1z 1301508 Mix Cancrala Dislrict 9 - Clasa & Cancrsls - 5 CY AND OVER cY N Bid 7 IN/A IN/A |N/A |NJA NGA, [Dua Tia s | |
00000020144 12 RES Ing,, Gregnbricr Mk WA o913 [30i11505 Mix Concrsta Diatrick 9 - Class D Cancrale -2.2.00 CY oY No Bid 7_IN/A INiA INA [N/A TN/A A [N/a fns |
00000020144 14 RBS Ing., Greenbrier Mk WA 814 [30111505 Mix Concrmla Diatrict 9 - Clasa D Conomie - 3-3.80 CY oY No Bid 7 INA INVA | NJA [NVA TNIA /A [N/A (N |
0000002144 8-15 RES Inc, Grasnbrier Reacy Mix  |N/A 815 30111506 M Gonogate District 9 - Clam= D Concgele - 4.4.99 CY ki No Bid T _INGA INIA [N/A [NVA INGA WA |NGA [NvA | ]
00000020144 818 RBS Iné:, Greanbrier Mx  |WA |5.18  [30111505 Mix Concrele Districl B - Class D Congiete - § CY AND GVER CY No Bld T _|WAA PNIA INJA INVA INGA |Na, [irA Nia [
DOO0DD20144 817 RBS Inc., Greenbrier Mic _{ha |9-17  |30111505 Ready Mix Conomta Dialrict 8- Class H Conetata -2-2.88 ©Y CY Mo Bld T_|IA |NGA |NJA INGA TNGA INA [NA IR | ]
Se000020144 518 RBS Ino., Greenbrier Mbc a4 191 |30111505 Ready Mi: Ceneiata Diairict 8- Class H C oncrete - 3-3.88 GY CY No Bid 7 |NIA | WA IN/A [NGA (/A [h/n [MNGA Ta | ]
00000020144 5139 RBS Inc., Greenbrier Mix  twa 8919 30111505 Randy Mbx Cenciota Dialrict 9 - Claes H Conerate - 4-4.99 GY oY No Bid 7 _IN/A INUA /A INZA T IUA [NA IN/A TN | |
0000020144 820 RES Inc., Grsenbrier Mic  |wA _|a20  |so111505 Randy Mix Concrete Dislrict 8 - Cluas H Congrele - CY AND OVER CY No Bid 7_{NA 1A INGA TNGA [N/A, [NGA INGA A | ]
00000020144 921 RBS Inc., Greenbrar M A Js21  |soinisos Ready Mk Cancrete Digliict 8- Cinoa K Cohorete - 2-2.99 CY CY 272.00] 7 JN/A INJA [NJA [NZA [02e |NGA TDua (oA [ |
02000020144 522 RBS Ina., Gresnbricr Mk [wa Jo92  |30111505 Mix Goncrete Distriot 9 - Class K Concrela - 3-3.99 CY. CY - 254.20] 7 |MUA INJA INGA [ NA A A (NG [NIA
00000020144 423 RES Ing., Greenbrier M |WA |23 2111505 Mix Gancrats Disirict § - Class K Cancreta - 4-4.69 CY CY 224.67] 7 IN/A [niiA [N (A [NGA [NGA THA fea ] ]
00000020144 924 RBS Inc. Greenbrier Ready M | WA |8-24  |98111508 Mix Concraty Dhalric - Glass K Concrat - 5 CY AND OVER CcY 181,00] 7 |N/A [N/A | NZA [NIA INVA TNVA [hiA A | |
00000020744 925 RBS In._ Groanbrier Resdy Mix _ [WA [9-25  |30111505 Mix Conorels Disirici § - ModHied Class K Concrele, B 1/Z Bag Mix Siiceous Sand - 2-2.60 &Y cY No Bid NiA |N/A | NGA [NIA (/A TRVA o A ) |
00000020144 926 RBS Inc., Gresnbrier Resdy Mix | WA _|0-26  |30111505 Ready Mix Conofete District & - Mndifiodf Ciags K Concrele, 8 172 Bag Mk, Sifcanys Sand - 3399 CY CY Mo Bid N/A INGA |NVA |NIA |NAA [N/A [N/D, (hs | |
000000201 44 927 RBS ing. Grsenbrier Mix  |NA_ 827  |30111505 Raacy Mix Concrete Dislrict 9 - Modified Class K Conaate, 8 172 Bag Mix, Siicanus Sand - 4-4.50 CY Y No Bid T |NAA INIA [Na PGS THIA [ e, | iA |NEA
00000020144 828 RBS In¢., Greenbrie: Mix  |WA_Ja28  |3oin1ses Raay Mix Concrete Disirict 9 - Modified Clags K Conarale, 3 1/2 Bag Mix, Siicaous Sand - § CY AND OVER CY No Bid 7 NEIM NUA [N/A INIA [NA [Nia INes |




O U PR LU SURPLE SUPPLIER NAME i [Manur |coMmoomry  frrem pescrrriion EXTENDED DESCRIPTION UMIT OF MEASURE | LisT prece oewt ora |receserr Jspec faize T
R uFAC | AcT) 06E VERY JUCT/ [E.  JWINGY AL i
PART TURE JR FART e [Tion
MUMBE R [woraee GoRY] BER
13 nanglr
4 L] KBS Inc:, Grasnbrier WA {929 11 b Coneints District 6 CLSM Typa A - 2.2.60 CY cY Bl T {bA Tniia [NGA A Thuia, [k Trea NAl |
930 RBS e Greanbrior p 11508 Mix Con Diatrict - L8 A - 3399 oY Y No Bid 7 {NUA [aia, Towia Tiuia [rues, [owia Trars s, |
100000024+ I B31_ |30711805 Mix 8-CLSM Typa & - 4-4.99 Y No Bid 7 |NA A [Nva TNVA Thia Tavia e ||
00000020144 ! M 832 [3041505 Mix B -CL5M Type A - SCY AND OVE Y No Bid T JNA TR, [oura TR [ruie, Tpwa Tous (i, __
144 Ing, Grean M I lo3y  [3044 Fandy Mb Cancreis Dhairicl 8- CLIN Type B -2-2.99- cY No Bid il LT TN O 7 T R T Ty | |
COO00020144 834 RES Inc, M T 30111505 Mix Disvict 8- CLEM Type B - 3.3.99 &Y CY o Bid N/A |NiA INVA, | s, [NZA, WA INA] |
000000201 B35 RBS Ine. M |neA [a3s 11505 Mi: Con 8-C B-44B9CY cY No NIA IN/A TNGA |orA A TNVA, NA| |
FBS Ing., G 30111505 M Con Diabicy § - CLEM Typa § . 5 &Y AND OVER CcY No Bid 7_Jhwa [Nia A TNia [oa Thva Jwa [N, |
Greenhy iy 537 __|3111505 Disdrict 9. CL SM Type © - 2:2 99 CY CY No B 7 |Wia TNia Tiwa Tnes Tia Jege T [Nia, ||
1 RBS | 3011508 Com B [+ oY [+34 & Bid /A | NUA, TRZA WA |NVA THZA, TNVA
ne. Mk JWA_|930  [s9111805 Max 8-CcLaM C -44e8cy cY Ng. Bid A IN/A [N Tha [NfA Tooa Tva T |
000000201 44 940 e, Mix__ (WA 40  |3om ix B C - B CY AND OVEf CY No A TNVA |NA | A TNVA [ra |
144 LT RBS Ipc., Gregnbrior L [T 113 Can Dialticd % - | Hf - il ower Bve mikes (%24 Nt DA WA FUA T, e [hwa, Tha i, [ |
000000201144 in:, Mx_ N4 loss  |ampisos Mix 3 - Adiiiopel Haul_- Cot Load per mlis cyer fve mies TRKL 4000 7 IN/A IR [NIA A Thua [N/A (A LY
00000020144 843 g 11506 Mix Dintrict B -Agdbanal Gos. - Gless 8 Cons Skicunus Sard CY 23.001 7 IN/A InA N [NGA TNVA TS, TNZA, L
944 RBA B84 {30114 Chilrict 8 - Adcitiona) Cosl. - par | r I contant sbave the walue cY 200] 7 |nAINA N/ [IN2A DA | A TNFA. ]
0000002071 111505 Disdricd 8 - Admbdure: - Wl sel reinar cY 270] 7 BUA [NiA TRUA [NiA Ta Trs (A, |
0000002011 REBS In; Mix 11508 Can il §-. re: - Water CcY 0.00) 7 A LNIA TNIA INGA | A ThA [ |
7 rpeny lix 847 130111505 Concr sl 9 - Adivhure: - lor, HE-122 of “or equad 19" oz 017 7 NIA [NUA TIA Tra (/A T s ]
00000030444 M fuas | |20111505 2-Ad i um Ehigida Sccelerstor, Darex Sek o1 “or oq.inl 1~ [=4 0.20| 7 IN/A TN/A [A [NUA A [hia [hia Tauia -
144 Inc, Mix_ oA lods  [aeinsos Ml Con 9-Admidure: - Eunon 37 of “or equul " 0Z 0.30] 7 i (A TN/A A [WA Thia T Thea
B50 RBS | rer wa logo  [aon M Disirict 8 - Add : - Fiber cY 7.251 7 Jtuia IN/A TNGA TNA Toua Trus [hua Jos T
NA_195 11 Mix Disfrict B - Admbeure: - CY 7.00) 7 INA NEA T N/A [INA TNTA | NIA ||
1 In M 11505 Ditzicd § - slca L| 0. MAA ThuiA TNGA Tiuia [ NA INIA ] |
44 119 2 - Addiconl Cost - 1o add o mbose 3t the And trap 13 Y Bid 7_INA [NUA TINIA NIA Tha, Nvm pucs, |
44 ! 1565 Mix Concrate -AddRianal ~ 10 mild ceinenk fo the irnslt mber ot he ity by the Vondas, but the CY Bid F_INA INiA [Nia N/A TN/A TN | NA
44 55 RES Inc, Mic JWA |955 |30111505 Concraty Clalrict 9 Chegre - for unlonding Bme jn excess of ten (10) minules par GY TRIKM 1 T INA { e, [ouge Tiuce [owe Joosa, Trus, Towa 5




STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

MANDATE: Under W. Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any
of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party
to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and: (1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in
the aggregate; or (2) the debtor is in employer default.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition listed above does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to
chapter eleven of the W. Va. Code, workers’ compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and
the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not
in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its
political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers'
compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state
or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

“Employer default” means having an outstanding balance or liabiiity to the old fund or to the uninsured employers'
fund or being in policy default, as defined in W. Va. Code § 23-2¢-2, failure to maintain mandatory workers’
compensation coverage, or failure to fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An
employer is not in employer default if it has entered into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Gommissioner
and remains in compliance with the obligations under the repayment agreement,

“Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company
or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage,
ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that
the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from
performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total
contract amount.

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor’s authorized signer affirms and acknowledges under penalty of
law for false swearing (W. Va. Code §61-5-3) that neither vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined

above and that neither vendor nor any related party are in employer default as defined above, unless the debt or
employer default is permitted under the exception above.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:

Vendor's Name: Q gs } T\(\C, .
Authorized Signature: L\//Vt/l/(dl_,.._(/ Date: \g m ar \ !O

State of (A}PU'L VFR.ai MO
~
County of G Reen bfZ.i'e | to-wit:

Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this [ day of _MJ\, 20/
My Commission expires el 1O ., 20/6.
AFFIX SEALHERE 55 000se000900000605055- NOTARY PUBLIC -

b
NOTARY PUBLIC 33
STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA <>)
CHERYLL HAWKINS &
RES, INC/UNION CONCRETE
P VINGINIA 24857 $
. 5 MAXWELTON, WEST VIRG b
MY COMRAISEION EXPIRES APRIL 10,»2}!\)!@ @
EM&;WW{. LE S e S D SN L

[

Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 08/01/2015)




wero State of West Virginia
zheis . VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Vendor Preference, if applicable.

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification:

Bidder is a resident vendor partnership, association, or corporation with at least eighty percent of ownership interest
of bidder held by another entity that meets the applicable four year residency requirement: or,

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four {4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

Appiication is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years

immediately preceding submission of this bid: or,

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor that employs a minimurn of one hundred state residents, or a nonresident vendor which
has an affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia and
employs a minimum of one hundred state residents, and for purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or
completing the project which is the subject of the bidder's bid and continuously over the entire term of the project, on
average at least seventy-five percent of the bidder's employees or the bidder’s affiliate’s or subsidiary’s employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years and the

vendor's bid; or,

Appliication is made for 5% vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2} or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; o,

Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who Is a veteran for the reason checked:
Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is

submitted; or,

Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commaodities or completing the project which Is the subject of the vendor's bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

7. Application Is made for preference as a non-resident small, women- and minority-owned business, in accor-
dance with West Virginia Code §5A-3-59 and West Virginia Code of State Rules.

D Bidder has been or expects to be approved priorto contract award by the Purchasing Division as a certified small, women-
and minority-owned business.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the

requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) rescind the contract or purchase order:

or (b) assess a penalty against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to

the contracting agency or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information vetifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information

deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true and accurate in all respects; and that If a contract is issued to Bidder
nd if anything contalned within this certificate changes during the term of the coniract, Bidder will notify the Purchas-

::;:Hoé:inp;vti? g I\m mied\(:jély. Signed: \"-/‘ '“M"' !V
Date: ch W\Df Ho Thile: \/2. ﬂ\@s j;V\-L

*Check any combination of preference consideration(s) indicated above, which you are entitied to recaive.
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