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{ADDITIONAL INFORMAITON:

The West Virginia Purchasing Division is soliciting bids on behalf of the West Virginia Division of Highways to establish an open-end contract for
various sizes and types of Stone, Aggregate and Cinders for pick up by West Virginia Division of Highways Forces from the Vendor's Storage Site.

This contract shall be F.O.B. Vendor's Storage Site ONLY, PICKUP by WVDOH forces.

INVOICE TO SHE TO
ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE CF WEST VIRGINIA
! VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City Wwv999e9 No City WV 909999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 STONE, AGGREGATE AND 0.00000Q TCN
CINDERS - MAT & PICKUP BY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Extended Description :

STONE, AGGREGATE AND CINDERS - MAT & PICKUP BY WVDOH FORCES

Enter pricing in attached pricing pages. If bidding online - enter the price of the first line that you are bidding into the WVQasis commodity line.
The WVQasis commodity line will not be evaluated as part of the bid.

[ SCHEDIILE OF EVEN?S ]

Line Event Event Date
1 Technical Questions Due 2015-10-19
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Document Phase

Final

Document Description
STONE, AGGREGATE AND CINDERS -
MAT & PICKUP BY WWDOH FORCES
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ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions




INSTRUCTIONS TO VENDORS SUBMITTING BIDS

1. REVIEW DOCUMENTS THOROUGHLY: The attached documents contain a solicitation
for bids. Please read these instructions and all documents attached in their entirety. These
instructions provide critical information about requirements that if overlooked could lead to
disqualification of a Vendor’s bid. All bids must be submitted in accordance with the
provisions contained in these instructions and the Solicitation. Failure to do so may result in
disqualification of Vendor’s bid.

2. MANDATORY TERMS: The Solicitation may contain mandatory provisions identified by

the use of the words “must,” “will,” and “shall.” Faiture to comply with a mandatory term in
the Solicitation will result in bid disqualification.

3. PREBID MEETING: The item identified below shall apply to this Solicitation.
A pre-bid meeting will not be held prior to bid opening.

[0 A NON-MANDATORY PRE-BID meeting will be held at the following place and
time:

[] A MANDATORY PRE-BID meeting will be held at the following place and time:

All Vendors submitting a bid must attend the mandatory pre-bid meeting. Failure to attend
the mandatory pre-bid meeting shall result in disqualification of the Vendor’s bid. No one
person attending the pre-bid meeting may represent more than one Vendor.

An attendance sheet provided at the pre-bid meeting shall serve as the official document
verifying attendance. The State will not accept any other form of proof or documentation to
verify attendance. Any person attending the pre-bid meeting on behalf of a Vendor must list
on the attendance sheet his or her name and the name of the Vendor he or she is representing,
Additionally, the person attending the pre-bid meeting should include the Vendor’s E-Mail
address, phone number, and Fax number on the attendance sheet. It is the Vendor’s
responsibility to locate the attendance sheet and provide the required information. Failure to
complete the attendance sheet as required may result in disqualification of Vendor’s bid.
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A bid that is not submitted electronically through wvOASIS should contain the information
listed below on the face of the envelope or the bid may be rejected by the Purchasing
Division.:

SEALED BID:
BUYER:
SOLICITATION NO.:
BID OPENING DATE:
BID OPENING TIME:
FAX NUMBER:

In the event that Vendor is responding to a request for proposal, and choses to respond in a
manner other than by electronic submission through wvOASIS, the Vendor shall submit one
original technical and one original cost proposal plus NA convenience copies of each to
the Purchasing Division at the address shown above. Additionally, if Vendor does not submit
its bid through wvOASIS, the Vendor should identify the bid type as either a technical or
cost proposal on the face of each bid envelope submitted in response to a request for proposal
as follows:

BID TYPE: (This only applies to CRFP)

D Technical

[ ] Cost

7. BID OPENING: Bids submitted in response to this Solicitation will be opened at the
location identified below on the date and time listed below. Delivery of a bid after the bid
opening date and time will result in bid disqualification. For purposes of this Solicitation, a
bid is considered delivered when confirmation of delivery is provided by wvOASIS (in the
case of electronic submission) or when the bid is time stamped by the official Purchasing
Division time clock (in the case of hand delivery).

Bid Opening Date and Time: November 10, 2015 at 1:30 PM, EST.

Bid Opening Location: Department of Administration, Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

8. ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: Changes or revisions to this Solicitation will be
made by an official written addendum issued by the Purchasing Division. Vendor should
acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this Solicitation by completing an Addendum
Acknowledgment Form, a copy of which is included herewith. Failure to acknowledge
addenda may result in bid disqualification. The addendum acknowledgement should be
submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

Revised 05/20/2015



same preference made available to any resident vendor. Any non-resident small, women-
owned, or minority-owned business must identify itself as such in writing, must submit that
writing to the Purchasing Division with its bid, and must be properly certified under W. Va.
CSR § 148-22-9 prior to contract award to receive the preferences made available to resident
vendors. Preference for a non-resident small, women-owned, or minority owned business
shall be applied in accordance with W. Va. CSR § 148-22-9,

17. WAIVER OF MINOR IRREGULARITIES: The Director reserves the right to waive
minor irregularities in bids or specifications in accordance with West Virginia Code of State
Rules § 148-1-4.6.

18. ELECTRONIC FILE ACCESS RESTRICTIONS: Vendor must ensure that its
submission in wvOASIS can be accessed by the Purchasing Division staff immediately upon
bid opening. The Purchasing Division will consider any file that cannot be immediately
opened and/or viewed at the time of the bid opening (such as, encrypted files, password
protected files, or incompatible files) to be blank or incomplete as context requires, and are
therefore unacceptable. A vendor will not be permitted to unencrypt files, remove password
protections, or resubmit documents after bid opening if those documents are required with
the bid.

Revised 05/20/2015



3. CONTRACT TERM: RENEWAL: EXTENSION: The term of this Contract shall be
determined in accordance with the category that has been identified as applicable to this
Contract below:

Term Contract
Initial Contract Term: This Contract becomes effective on
Award and extends for a period of one
year(s).

Renewal Term: This Contract may be renewed upon the mutual written consent of
the Agency, and the Vendor, with approval of the Purchasing Division and the
Attorney General’s office (Attorney General approval is as to form only). Any
request for renewal should be submitted to the Purchasing Division thirty (30) days
prior to the expiration date of the initial contract term or appropriate renewal term. A
Contract renewal shall be in accordance with the terms and conditions of the original

contract. Renewal of this Contract is limited to two successive one (1)
year periods or multiple renewal periods of less than one year, provided that the
multiple renewal periods do not exceed 24 months in total. Automatic

renewal of this Contract is prohibited. Notwithstanding the foregoing, Purchasing
Division approval is not required on agency delegated or exempt purchases. Attorney
General approval may be required for vendor terms and conditions.

Delivery Order Limitations: In the event that this contract permits delivery orders, a
delivery order may only be issued during the time this Contract is in effect. Any
delivery order issued within one year of the expiration of this Contract shall be
effective for one year from the date the delivery order is issued. No delivery order
may be extended beyond one year after this Contract has expired.

[[] Fixed Period Contract: This Contract becomes effective upon Vendor’s receipt of the
notice to proceed and must be completed within days.

[] Fixed Period Contract with Renewals: This Contract becomes effective upon Vendor’s
receipt of the notice to proceed and part of the Contract more fully described in the
attached specifications must be completed within days.
Upon completion, the vendor agrees that maintenance, monitoring, or warranty services
will be provided for one year thereafter with an additional successive
one year renewal periods or multiple renewal periods of less than one year provided that
the multiple renewal periods do not exceed months in total.
Automatic renewal of this Contract is prohibited.

[ 1 One Time Purchase: The term of this Contract shall run from the issuance of the Award
Document until all of the goods contracted for have been delivered, but in no event will
this Contract extend for more than one fiscal year.

|:| Other: See attached.
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[] BID BOND: All Vendors shall furnish a bid bond in the amount of five percent
(5%) of the total amount of the bid protecting the State of West Virginia. The bid
bond must be submitted with the bid.

[ ] PERFORMANCE BOND: The apparent successful Vendor shall provide a
performance bond in the amount of . The performance bond
must be received by the Purchasing Division prior to Contract award. On
construction contracts, the performance bond must be 100% of the Contract value.

[ ] LABOR/MATERIAL PAYMENT BOND: The apparent successful Vendor shall
provide a labor/material payment bond in the amount of 100% of the Contract value.
The labor/material payment bond must be delivered to the Purchasing Division prior
to Contract award.

In lieu of the Bid Bond, Performance Bond, and Labor/Material Payment Bond, the
Vendor may provide certified checks, cashier’s checks, or irrevocable letters of credit.
Any certified check, cashier’s check, or irrevocable letter of credit provided in lieu of a
bond must be of the same amount and delivered on the same schedule as the bond it
replaces. A letter of credit submitted in lieu of a performance and labor/material payment
bond will only be allowed for projects under $100,000. Personal or business checks are
not acceptable.

|:| MAINTENANCE BOND: The apparent successful Vendor shall provide a two (2)
year maintenance bond covering the roofing system. The maintenance bond must be
issued and delivered to the Purchasing Division prior to Contract award.

INSURANCE: The apparent successful Vendor shall furnish proof of the following
insurance prior to Contract award and shall list the state as a certificate holder:

Commercial General Liability Insurance: In the amount of $1.000.000.00
of more.

[] Builders Risk Insurance: In an amount equal to 100% of the amount of the
Contract.

O 0000
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12.

13.

14,

15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

20.

ACCEPTANCE/REJECTION: The State may accept or reject any bid in whole, or in part.
Vendor’s signature on its bid signifies acceptance of the terms and conditions contained in
the Solicitation and Vendor agrees to be bound by the terms of the Contract, as reflected in
the Award Document, upon receipt.

FUNDING: This Contract shall continue for the term stated herein, contingent upon funds
being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise being made available. In the event funds
are not appropriated or otherwise made available, this Contract becomes void and of no
effect beginning on July 1 of the fiscal year for which funding has not been appropriated or
otherwise made available.

PAYMENT: Payment in advance is prohibited under this Contract. Payment may only be
made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services. The Vendor shall submit
invoices, in arrears.

TAXES: The Vendor shall pay any applicable sales, use, personal property or any other
taxes arising out of this Contract and the transactions contemplated thereby. The State of
West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such
taxes.

CANCELLATION: The Purchasing Division Director reserves the right to cancel this
Contract immediately upon written notice to the vendor if the materials or workmanship
supplied do not conform to the specifications contained in the Contract. The Purchasing
Division Director may also cancel any purchase or Contract upon 30 days written notice to
the Vendor in accordance with West Virginia Code of State Rules § 148-1-7.16.2.

TIME: Time is of the essence with regard to all matters of time and performance in this
Contract.

APPLICABLE LAW: This Contract is governed by and interpreted under West Virginia
law without giving effect to its choice of law principles. Any information provided in
specification manuals, or any other source, verbal or written, which contradicts or violates
the West Virginia Constitution, West Virginia Code or West Virginia Code of State Rules is
void and of no effect.

COMPLIANCE: Vendor shall comply with all applicable federal, state, and local laws,
regulations and ordinances. By submitting a bid, Vendor acknowledges that it has reviewed,
understands, and will comply with all applicable law.

PREVAILING WAGE: On any contract for the construction of a public improvement
whose cost at the time the contract is awarded will be paid with public money in an amount
greater than $500,000, Vendor and any subcontractors utilized by Vendor shall pay a rate or
rates of wages which shall not be less than the fair minimum rate or rates of wages
(prevailing wage), as established under West Virginia Code §§ 21-5A-1 et seq. Vendor shall

Revised 05/20/2015



29,

30.

31.

CONFIDENTIALITY: The Vendor agrees that it will not disclose to anyone, directly or
indirectly, any such personally identifiable information or other confidential information
gained from the Agency, unless the individual who is the subject of the information consents
to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the Agency’s policies,
procedures, and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality Policies and
Information Security Accountability Requirements, set forth in
http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy/default. himl.

DISCLOSURE: Vendor’s response to the Solicitation and the resulting Contract are
considered public documents and will be disclosed to the public in accordance with the laws,
rules, and policies governing the West Virginia Purchasing Division. Those laws include, but
are not limited to, the Freedom of Information Act found in West Virginia Code §§ 29B-1-1
et seq. and the competitive bidding laws found West Virginia Code §§ 5A-3-1 et seq., 5-22-1
et seq., and 5G-1-1 et seq.

If a Vendor considers any part of its bid to be exempt from public disclosure, Vendor must so
indicate by specifically identifying the exempt information, identifying the exemption that
applies, providing a detailed justification for the exemption, segregating the exempt
information from the general bid information, and submitting the exempt information as part
of its bid but in a segregated and clearly identifiable format. Failure to comply with the
foregoing requirements will result in public disclosure of the Vendor’s bid without further
notice. A Vendor’s act of marking all or nearly all of its bid as exempt is not sufficient to
avoid disclosure and WILL NOT BE HONORED. Vendor’s act of marking a bid or any part
thereof as “confidential” or “proprietary” is not sufficient to avoid disclosure and WILL
NOT BE HONORED. A legend or other statement indicating that all or substantially all of
the bid is exempt from disclosure is not sufficient to avoid disclosure and WILL NOT BE
HONORED. Additionally, pricing or cost information will not be considered exempt from
disclosure and requests to withhold publication of pricing or cost information WILL NOT
BE HONORED.

Vendor will be required to defend any claimed exemption for nondisclosure in the event of
an administrative or judicial challenge to the State’s nondisclosure. Vendor must indemnify
the State for any costs incurred related to any exemptions claimed by Vendor. Any questions
regarding the applicability of the various public records laws should be addressed to your
own legal counsel prior to bid submission.

LICENSING: In accordance with West Virginia Code of State Rules §148-1-6.1.7, Vendor
must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and
requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the
West Virginia Secretary of State’s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia
Insurance Commission, or any other state agency or political subdivision. Upon request, the
Vendor must provide all necessary releases to obtain information to enable the Purchasing
Division Director or the Agency to verify that the Vendor is licensed and in good standing
with the above entities.

Revised 05/20/2015



36.

37.

38.

39.

40.

not limited to, Workers’ Compensation and Social Security obligations, licensing fees, etc.
and the filing of all necessary documents, forms, and returns pertinent to all of the foregoing.
Vendor shall hold harmless the State, and shall provide the State and Agency with a defense
against any and all claims including, but not limited to, the foregoing payments,
withholdings, contributions, taxes, Social Security taxes, and employer income tax returns.

INDEMNIFICATION: The Vendor agrees to indemnify, defend, and hold harmless the
State and the Agency, their officers, and employees from and against: (1) Any claims or
losses for services rendered by any subcontractor, person, or firm performing or supplying
services, materials, or supplies in connection with the performance of the Contract; (2) Any
claims or losses resulting to any person or entity injured or damaged by the Vendor, its
officers, employees, or subcontractors by the publication, translation, reproduction, delivery,
performance, use, or disposition of any data used under the Contract in a manner not
authorized by the Contract, or by Federal or State statutes or regulations; and (3) Any failure
of the Vendor, its officers, employees, or subcontractors to observe State and Federal laws
including, but not limited to, labor and wage and hour laws.

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT: In accordance with West Virginia Code § 5A-3-10a, all
Vendors are required to sign, notarize, and submit the Purchasing Affidavit stating that
neither the Vendor nor a related party owe a debt to the State in excess of $1,000. The
affidavit must be submitted prior to award, but should be submitted with the Vendor’s bid. A
copy of the Purchasing Affidavit is included herewith.

ADDITIONAL AGENCY AND LOCAL GOVERNMENT USE: This Contract may be
utilized by and extends to other agencies, spending units, and political subdivisions of the
State of West Virginia; county, municipal, and other local government bodies; and school
districts (“Other Government Entities”). This Contract shall be extended to the
aforementioned Other Government Entities on the same prices, terms, and conditions as
those offered and agreed to in this Contract. If the Vendor does not wish to extend the prices,
terms, and conditions of its bid and subsequent contract to the Other Government Entities,
the Vendor must clearly indicate such refusal in its bid. A refusal to extend this Contract to
the Other Government Entities shall not impact or influence the award of this Contract in any
manner.

CONFLICT OF INTEREST: Vendor, its officers or members or employees, shall not
presently have or acquire an interest, direct or indirect, which would conflict with or
compromise the performance of its obligations hereunder. Vendor shall periodically inquire
of its officers, members and employees to ensure that a conflict of interest does not arise.
Any conflict of interest discovered shall be promptly presented in detail to the Agency.

REPORTS: Vendor shall provide the Agency and/or the Purchasing Division with the
following reports identified by a checked box below:

Such reports as the Agency and/or the Purchasing Division may request. Requested
reports may include, but are not limited to, quantities purchased, agencies utilizing the
contract, total contract expenditures by agency, etc.

Revised 05/20/2015



43,

For the purposes of this section, the cost is the value of the steel product as delivered to
the project; or

d. The D;rectbf 0fthe P:chﬁ,asfng Division determines that specified steel materials are not
produced ifi the United. States in sufficient quantity or otherwise are not reasonably
available to fget cofiirict requirements.

PREFERENCE FOR USE OF DOMESTIC ALUMINUM, GLASS, AND STEEL: In
Accorditice ‘with W;.V4. Code § 5-19-1 et seq., and W. Va. CSR § 148-10-1 et seq., for
every cohttatt or subctniract: subject to the limitations contained herein, for the construction,
reconsttuietion; altetation, repair, improvement or maintenance of public works or for the
purchase of any, itérti of rvachinety or equipment to be used at sites of public works, only
domestic alugfilifum;” glags br steel products shall be supplied unless the spending officer
determines, in" Writing; after the receipt of offers or bids, (1) that the cost of domestic
aluminum, glass-or steél products is unreasonable or inconsistent with the public interest of
the State of West Vitginia, {?) that domestic aluminum, glass or steel products are not
produced in sufficient duantities to meet the contract requirements, or (3) the available
domestic altninum; gliss; or steel do not meet the contract specifications. This provision
only applies fo putili¢ works contracts awarded in an amount more than fifty thousand dollars
(850,000) or public wotks contracts that require more than ten thousand pounds of steel
products. .. s

The cost of domestig aluninum, glass, or steel products may be unreasonable if the cost is
more than twenty petéent (20%) of the bid or offered price for foreign made aluminum,
glass, or steel products. If the domestic aluminum, glass or steel products to be supplied or
produced in a “sitbstantial labor surplus area”, as defined by the United States Department of
Labor, the cost vf domestic aluminum, glass, or steel products may be unreasonable if the
cost is more thah thirty percent (30%) of the bid or offered price for foreign made aluminum,
glass, or steel products.

This preference shall be applied to an item of machinery or equipment, as indicated above,
when the item is a single unit of equipment or machinery manufactured primarily of
aluminum, glass or steel, is part of a public works contract and has the sole purpose or of
being a permanent part of a single public works project. This provision does not apply to
equipment or machinery purchased by a spending unit for use by that spending unit and not
as part of a single public works project.

All bids and offers including domestic aluminum, glass or steel products that exceed bid or
offer prices including foreign aluminum, glass or steel products after application of the
preferences provided in this provision may be reduced to a price equal to or lower than the
lowest bid or offer price for foreign aluminum, glass or steel products plus the applicable
preference. If the reduced bid or offer prices are made in writing and supersede the prior bid
or offer prices, all bids or offers, including the reduced bid or offer prices, will be reevaluated
in accordance with this rule.

Revised 05/20/2015



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.:

Tnstructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the

necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
{Check the box next to each addendum received)

[~ Addendum No. 1 [} Addendum No.6
[T~ Addendum No. 2 Addendum No. 7
[ ] AddendumNo.3 [ ] AddendumNo.8
[ ] Addendum No.4 [} AddendumNo.9
[ ] AddendumNo.5 [ ] Addendum No. 10

1 understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid.
I further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor's representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only
the information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is
binding.

Atlas Towing Company
Compan

VP

Authorized Signature

10/30/15
Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite
document processing.

Revised 05/20/2015



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

Stone, Aggregate and Cinders — Materials and Pickup by Agency ONLY

SPECIFICATIONS

1. PURPOSE AND SCOPE: The West Virginia Purchasing Division is soliciting bids on
behalf of the West Virginia Division of Highways to establish an open-end contract for
various sizes and types of Stone, Aggregate and Cinders for pick up by West Virginia
Division of Highways Forces from the Vendo:’s Storage Site.

This contract shall be F.O.B. Vendor’s Storage Site ONLY, PICKUP by WVDOH forces.

2. DEFINITEONS: The terms listed below shall have the meanings assigned to them
below. Additional definitions can be found in section 2 of the General Terms and

Conditions.

2.1 “Contract Item” or “Contract Items” means the list of items identified in Section
3, Subsection 1 below.

2.2 “Pricing Pages” means the schedule of prices contained in wvOASIS or attached
hereto as Exhibit A and used to evaluate the Solicitation.

2.3 “Solicitation” means the official notice of an opportunity to supply the State with
goods or services that is published by the Purchasing Division.

24 “WVDOH?” used throughout this Solicitation means the West Virginia Division of
Highways.

2.5 “AASHTO?” used throughout this Solicitation means American Association of
State Highway and Transportation Officials. Reference: www.transportation.org.

2.6 “Contractor” or “Vendor” used throughout this Solicitation and in any cited
sections of the West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways
Standard Specifications, Roads and Bridges, adopted latest Standard Spec book
edition, as modified by all subsequent annual Supplemental Specifications, are
interchangeable.

2.7 “Standard Specs” used throughout this Solicitation means the West Virginia

Department of Transportation, Division of Highways Standard Specifications,
Roads and Bridges, adopted latest Standard Spec book edition, as modified by all
subsequent annual Supplemental Specifications.

Revised 10/27/2014



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Stone, Aggregate and Cinders — Materials and Pickup by Agency ONLY

NOTE 2: Abrasives shall conform to the following specifications:

A. Quality
1. The liquid limit shall not exceed 25 and the plasticity index shall not exceed 6.
2. Total deleterious substances including, but not limited to metal, glass, clay,
shale, and thin or elongated pieces shall not exceed 3% of the dry weight of the
total sample. Deleterious content shall be determined on that fraction of material
retained on the U.S. Standard No. 4 (4.75 mm) sieve.
3. When gravel is used as an abrasive, the material retained on the No. 8, sieve
shall have a majority of crushed particles.

B. Gradation
The material shall conform to the following gradation requirements determined in
accordance with AASHTO T-27:

SIEVE SIZE % PASSING BY WEIGHT
Standard Modified
1/2 inch 100 100
3/8 inch 85-100 85-100
No. 100 0-10 04

NOTE 3: In addition to meeting the gradation requirements of AASHTO No. 8 and
No. 9 aggregate in table 703.4, Modified AASHTO No. 8 and Modified AASHTO
No. 9 aggregate shall have a maximum of 2% passing the No. 200 sieve, when
sampled at the source (the Vendor’s last point of possession), prior to shipment, as
determined by AASHTO T-11 and T-27. The aggregates shall be crushed with a
minimum of 80% two face fracture. Modified AASHTO No. 8 and Modified
AASHTO No. 9 aggregate shall meet all other requirements for AASHTO No. 8
and AASHTO No. 9 aggregate.

NOTE 4: With exception of the following contract items, grading on all specified
sieve sized for material furnished shall be determined by AASHTO T-27 (Dry Test
Only) or by AASHTO T-27 with AASHTO T-11:

Item J, AASHTO No. 7

Item K, AASHTO No. 8

Item L, AASHTO No. 9

Item S, AASHTO No. 8 Modified

Item T, AASHTO No. 9 Modified
The grading for the above items shall be determined by AASHTO T-27 and
AASHTO T-11.

NOTE 5: Cinders (Power Plant Slag) shall conform to the following specifications:
A. Definition
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REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Stone, Aggregate and Cinders ~ Materials and Pickup by Agency ONLY

3.4 Sampling and Testing:

Sampling and testing for quality of all items furnished in this contract will be the
responsibility of the WVDOH. Minimum frequency of sampling and testing for
quality on all materials (other than those sources already covered by the
WVDQOH’s “commercial source” approval) will be at least one sample every six
days of shipment (or if tested during production, at least one sample every six
days of production).

Other minimum frequencies shall be in accordance with the following:

Property Frequency
Gradation - One sample per each day of shipment or if
Delivered Material tested during production, one sample per

each day of production. See Note 1 below.

Gradation - {A-1 Source) One sample per each week of
WVDOH Pick-up shipment per MP 700.00.52; or if tested
during production, one sample per each day
of production. See Note 1 below.
(A-2 Source) One sample per 250 tons
shipped and a minimum of one per week
shipment.

Moisture Content See Note 2 below.

All samples taken by the Vendor shall be by a Certified Aggregate Sampler or
Certified Aggregate Inspector. Tests shall be performed by a Certified Aggregate
Inspector.

NOTE 1: The Vendor will be responsible for providing test results attesting to the
gradation of materials delivered. Gradation results from the production source
will be acceptable.

NOTE 2: In the event visual inspection of the aggregate indicates excess or
unusual moisture beyond what is normally expected in the aggregate, the
WVDOH reserves the right to determine the moisture content by standard
methods. If this becomes necessary, the net weight of the portion represented will
be adjusted utilizing the test results obtained by the WVDOH in accordance with
MP 700.00.22. Items OA, OB, PA and PB (Abrasives) will be considered fine
aggregate outlined in MP 700.00.22.
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REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Stone, Aggregate and Cinders — Materials and Pickup by Agency ONLY

When the total degree of non-conformance has been established and it is 12 or
less, the material will be paid for at an adjusted contract price as specified in

Table 2.
TABLE 2
DEGREE OF PERCENT OF CONTRACT
NON-CONFORMANCE PRICE TO BE REDUCED

1.0 TO 3.0 2
3.1 TOS5.0 4
5.1 TO8.0 7
8.1 TO12.0 11

Greater than 12 b

*The WVDOH will make a special evaluation of the material and determine the
appropriate action.

In the event the WVDOH picks up a specific quantity of material from a
stockpile, and said quantity is less than the total quantity contained in the
stockpile and it has been determined from this certified test data that a
non-conforming sub-lot(s) is contained in said stockpile, the price reduction shall
be calculated for the specific quantity as follows:

The percent price reduction shall be determined as set forth above for the
non-conforming sub-lot. The quantity represented by the non-conforming sub-lot
shall then be calculated as a percent of the total (total material contained in the
stockpile). To determine the price reduction on the specific quantity picked up,
multiply the percent of non-conforming material contained in the stockpile by the
quantity picked up, and reduce this quantity by the percent price reduction as
determined.

Example: If it has been determined that a stockpile of 100 tons contains 10
percent failing material, and said material is to have its price reduced by 4
percent, then the actual quantity picked up, say 15 tons, will be multiplied by 0.10
(10 percent failing material) which equals 1.5 tons. These 1.5 tons will thus have
its price reduced by 4 percent. The remaining 13.5 tons will be paid for at full
contract price.

PQn

D | 1- = AP (price to be paid

1000t after adjustment)

WHERE T = tonnage picked up
P = percent price reduction

Revised 10/27/2014



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Stone, Aggregate and Cinders — Materials and Pickup by Agency ONLY

3.6.2 The Pricing Page shall be F.O.B. Vendor’s Storage Site, Contract Items
A-W and AA.

3.6.3 Vendor’s bid price per Contract Item, shall include the loading of
WVDOH trucks by the Vendor.

A Vendor may submit more than one Vendor’s Storage Sites information on
one Information Attachment form ONLY if bid pricing is the SAME for all

Storage Sites and all WVDOH locations bid. A separate bid submission and
Information Attachment form MUST be submitted when bid price varies
between Vendor’s Storage Sites.

Vendor’s bid will be disqualified if both documents are not submitted with their
bid packet for each Storage Site.

4. CONTRACT AWARD:

4.1 Contract Award: The Contract is intended to provide Agencies with a purchase
price on all Contract Items. A Contract shall be awarded to all Vendors that
provide the Contract Items meeting the required specifications.

4.2 Pricing Pages: Vendor shall complete the Pricing Pages per instructions in
section 3.6, Bid Instructions.

The Pricing Pages contain a list of the Contract Items F.O.B. Vendor’s Storage.
There is no anticipated purchase/pickup volume. Pickup from a Vendor’s Storage
Site is normally only used when delivery is not feasible for a WVDOH project. No
future use of the Contract or any individual item is guaranteed or implied.

Vendor should electronically enter the information into the Pricing Pages, through
wvOASIS, if available, or as an electronic document. In most cases, the Vendor
can request an electronic copy of the Pricing Pages for bid purposes by sending an
email request to the following address: Misty.M.Delong@wv.gov.

4.3 Contract award transition: Upon the award of this contract, whether the effective
date or the completed and encumbered date or an established date by the WVDOH,
the WVDOH Maintenance Division will announce the effective date of use of this
contract to the Districts and the Vendors. Upon the announced effective date of use
by the WVDOH Maintenance Division to the Districts and Vendors, any Delivery
Order issued toward the 2015 Spring/Summer Contracts shall remain in effect and
should not be cancelled until that Delivery Order is filled; however, after ten (10)
working days of the Districts and Vendors notice, any Delivery Order that has not
been completely filled by the Vendors from the 2015 Spring/Summer Contracts

Revised 10/27/2014



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Stone, Aggregate and Cinders — Materials and Pickup by Agency ONLY

Agency with appropriate return packaging upon request. All returns of
unacceptable items shall be F.O.B. the Agency’s location. The returned product
shall either be replaced, or the Agency shall receive a full credit or refund for the
purchase price, at the Agency’s discretion.

7.2  Return Due to Agency Error: Items ordered in error by the Agency will be
returned for credit within 30 days of receipt, F.O.B. Vendor’s location. Vendor
shall not charge a restocking fee if returned products are in a resalable condition.
Items shall be deemed to be in a resalable condition if they are unused and in the
original packaging. Any restocking fee for items not in a resalable condition shall
be the lower of the Vendor’s customary restocking fee or 5% of the total invoiced
value of the returned items.

8. VENDOR DEFAULT:
8.1  The following shall be considered a vendor default under this Contract.

8.1.1 Failure to provide Contract Items in accordance with the requirements
contained herein.

8.1.2 Failure to comply with other specifications and requirements contained
herein.

8.1.3 Failure to comply with any laws, rules, and ordinances applicable to the
Contract Services provided under this Contract.

8.1.4 Failure to remedy deficient performance upon request.
8.2  The following remedies shall be available to Agency upon default.
8.2.1 Immediate cancellation of the Contract.

8.2.2 Immediate cancellation of one or more release orders issued under this
Contract.

8.2.3 Any other remedies available in law or equity.

9, MISCELLANEOUS:
9.1 No Substitutions: Vendor shall supply only Contract Items submitted in

response to the RFQ unless a contract modification is approved in accordance
with the provisions contained in this Contract.

Revised 10/27/2014



INFORMATION ATTACHMENT
Vendor's Storage Sites
2015/2016 Stone and Aggregate - Materials and Pickup by WVDOH ONLY

VENDOR NAME __ Atlas Towing Company

Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submisston.
A Vendor may submit more than one Vendor's Storage Sites information on one Information Attachment form

ONLY if bid pricing is the SAME for all Storage Sites and all WVDOH locations bid. A separate bid submission
and Information Attachment form MUST be submitted when bid price varies between Vendor's Storage Sites.

Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel, Sand, Blast Furnance Slag and Steel Slag

a) SOURCE OF MATERIAL {all sources for which bid prices apply {e.g., Quarry lccation if Sandstone
or Limestone; dredging or pit location if Gravel; production plant name and location if Slag}
Mulzer Crushed Stone- Charlestown, New Amsterdam, & Cape Sandy Quarries

Riverside Stone- Wolf Creek Quarry

b) EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S): A separate bid schedule
must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.

1334 Staunton Turnpike

Parkersburg, West Virginia 26104

304-428-4445

ICinders

¢) SOURCE OF MATERIAL: Name and Location of plant which produces Cinder material.

d} EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE{S) A separate bid schedule
must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' stcrage sites.




Pricing Page

VENDOR NAME Atlas Towing Company

Material and pick up by the WVDOH forces from the Vendor's Storage Site, ONLY.

Bid Price per Ton items A-W and AA
F.O.B. Vendor's Storage Site
Limestone,
Contract Sandstone, | Blast Furnace
Item Description of Material Gravel, Sand ~ Slag Steel Slag
A |Class | Aggregate 19.80
B Class 2 Aggregate 19.80
C Class 10 Aggregate 19.80
D AASHTO #1 Aggregate 21.80
E AASHTO #3 Aggregate 21.80
F AASHTO #4 Aggregate 21.80
G AASHTO #467 Aggregate 21.80
H AASHTO #57 Aggregate 21.80
1 AASHTO #67 Aggregate 22.80
J AASHTO #7 Aggregate no bid
K AASHTO #8 Aggregate 23.30
L AASHTO #9 Aggregate 35.75
M Stone for Gabions 27.80
N Fine Aggregate 18.50
OA  |Limestone Standard Abrasives no bid
OB  [Sandstone Standard Abrasives no bid
PA  Limestone Modified Abrasives no bid
PB Sandstone Modified Abrasives no bid
Q Rip Rap no bid
R Shot Rock no bid
S AASHTO #8 Modified 24.30
T  |AASHTO #9 Modified 36.75
U Pea Gravel no bid
\Y 11 Limestone Abrasives no bid
W |Quarry Waste no bid
AA  [Cinders I




ACORD’
N

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (MM/DDAYYYY)
10/8/2015

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: if the certificate holder Is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(les) must be endorsed. If SUBRCGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
the terms and conditions of the pollcy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate doas not confer rights to the
cortificate holder in lleu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER
Reagle & Padden, Inc.

ﬁaﬂa!!":‘.‘cr Irlena Barnhouse
%ﬁjmz (304) 422-8476
L. . irlenafreagle-padden.com

| A% Noy; (3041 428-7374

200 Star Avenua, Suite 210 ADDRESS;
Erooices 0004303
Parkersburg WV _26101 INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
INSURED insurer A Cincinnati Insurance Co. 10677
INSURER B :
Atlas Towing Company INSURER G :
PO Box 1632 INSURBR D :
INSURERE :
Parkarsburg WV 26102-1632 INSURERF ;
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER:2015 GL Certificates REVISION NUMBER:

INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TE
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFF
- EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES, LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS,

THIS 18 TO GERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TG THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
RM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
ORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HE_@N IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,

INSR AGDLTSUBRT P Y Ei
LTR TYPE OF INSURANCE INSR | WvD POLICY NUMBER, (ARDSYYY)| |§ BN YY) LINITS
GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OGCURRENCE $ 1,000,000
o | "DAMAGE TO RE
X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY D APMSES Ea ogerance) | $ 50,000
A | CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR FNP0158387 19/20/2015 [8/20/2018 | yep exp tany one person} | $ 5,000
- PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | $ 1,000,000
- GENERAL AGGREGATE [] 2,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | § 2,000,000
x|rouey] 158% [ e 3
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY COMBINED SINGLE LIMT |
—1 (Ea accidenl)
X | any auto BODILY INJURY (Fer person} | § 1,000,000
ERAD158387 B/20/2015 [9/20/2018 L !
A | | AL OWNEDAUTOS BODILY INJURY (Per acaident)|
|| SCHEDULED AUTOS EROPERTBAAGE s
|___| nmep autos (Per accident)
NON-QWNED AUTOS Uninsured molorist Bl-singla | $ 1,000,000
Uncarinsured matorist Bt single | $ 1,000,000
| X | UMBRELLA LIAB OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE $ 4,000,000
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $
| | DEDUCTIBLE L 5
A RETENTION _$ ENP0158387 /20/2015 /2072018 s
WG STATU- -
WORKERS COMPENBATION [esiis] 1o
ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE E.L EACH ACCIDENT 3
OFFICERMEMBER EXCLUDED? NIA
{Mandatory in NH} E.L DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEH §
If yas, describe under
CRIPTION OF OPERATIONS balow E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | §
A |Inland Marine NPO158387 /20/2015 [9/20/2018
Equipment - All Risk r

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS ! VEHIGLES {Attach ACORD 101, Addltiona| Remarks Schedule, If more space Is requirad}

Re: Building Supplies b
CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION
SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
S end od : ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.
WV Division of Highways
1900 Kanawha Blvd East
Charleston, WV 25305 AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE
Irlene Barnhousa/INB \%\1 47 gW“
ACORD 25 (2009/09} © 1988-2008 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

INS025 {200008)

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD




weto State of West Virginia
ers " VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Vendor Preference, if applicable.

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the
ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has
maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately
preceding the date of this certification; o,

Bidderis a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headguarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submissicn of this bid; or,

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a
minimum of ene hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder's affiliate’s or subsidiary’s employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state
continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

Application is made for 5% vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,

Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individuat resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor wha is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor’s bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

7. Application is made for preference as a non-resident small, women- and minority-owned business, In accor-
dance with West? Virginia Code §5A-3-59 and West Virginia Code of Stafe Rules.

E:I Bidder has been or expects to be approved prior to contract award by the Purchasing Division as a certified small, women-
and minority-owned business.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penalty
against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to the contracting agency
or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.
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By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disciose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifles that this certificate is true
and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder 2nd if anything contained within this certificate

changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasi i ing immediately.
Bidder: Atlas Towing Company Signed

Date;: 10/30/15 Title: Vice-President




STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

MANDATE: Under W. Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any
of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party
to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and: (1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in
the aggregate; or (2) the debtor is in employer default.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition listed above does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to
chapter eleven of the W. Va. Code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and
the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not
in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amourit of money owed to the state or any of its
political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers’
compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state
or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

“Employer default” means having an outstanding balance or liability to the old fund or to the uninsured employers'
fund or being in policy default, as defined in W. Va. Code § 23-2c-2, failure to maintain mandatory workers'
compensation coverage, or failure to fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An
employer is not in employer default if it has entered into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Commissioner
and remains in compliance with the obligations under the repayment agreement.

“Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company
or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage,
ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that
the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from
performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total
contract amount.

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor’s authorized signer affirms and acknowledges under penalty of
law for false swearing (W. Va. Code §61-5-3) that neither vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined
above and that neither vendor nor any related party are in employer default as defined above, unless the debt or
employer default is permitted under the exception above.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:
Vendor's Name: Atlas Towing COI’T‘lQaDM\

\ZP 10/30/15
Authorized Signature: W&: Date: /30/

state of VVESt Virginia
County of Wood , to-wit:
Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this J© day of /0 ,20/S87
My Commission expires ﬂ" m:lr 7 , 202}
AFFIX SEAL HERE QOTARY PUBLICW
OFFICIAL BEAL
NOTARY PUBLIC
STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA Purchasing Affldavit (Revised 06/01/2015)
ROBERT A CRISS
105 MINERAL WELLS HAHTS

MINERAL WELLS, WV 26150
My Commisslon Expiras May 7, 2023




