



Purchasing Division
 2019 Washington Street East
 Post Office Box 50130
 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
 Request for Quotation

Proc Folder: 25221

Doc Description: Chemicals for Pipestem Golf Courses

Proc Type: Central Purchase Order

Date Issued	Solicitation Closes	Solicitation No	Version
2014-09-16	2014-10-07 13:30:00	CRFQ 0310 DNR1500000029	1

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

BID CLERK
 DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
 PURCHASING DIVISION
 2019 WASHINGTON ST E
 CHARLESTON WV 25305
 US

VENDOR

Vendor Name, Address and Telephone Number:

Agrium Advanced Technologies
 121 PFlugh Rd.
 Butler, PA 16001
 724-865-9180

10/06/14 09:50:49AM
 West Virginia Purchasing Division

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Dean Wingerd
 (304) 558-0468
 dean.c.wingerd@wv.gov

Signature X

FEIN # 20-4910688

DATE 10-2-14

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150		SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR	
PIPESTEM	WV25979-0150	PIPESTEM	WV 25979-0150
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
1	Milorganite min form 6-2-0 greens grade organ fert or equal	6000.00000	LB	.32	\$1,920.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Milorganite; minimum formula 6-2-0 greens grade organic fertilizer, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150		SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR	
PIPESTEM	WV25979-0150	PIPESTEM	WV 25979-0150
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
2	Bensumec 4LF Preemergent Grass & Weed Herb, or equal	15.00000	GL	\$119.00	\$1785.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Bensumec 4LF Preemergent Grass & Weed Herbicide; minimum 46% active ingredient Benzenesulfonamide, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150		SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR	
PIPESTEM	WV25979-0150	PIPESTEM	WV 25979-0150
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
3	Anderson's Fungicide IX, snow mold control, gran, or equal	1500.00000	LB	No Bid	

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Anderson's Fungicide IX, snow mold control, granular, minimum active ingredient, chlorobeb 3.2%, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150 PIPESTEM US	WV25979-0150	SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR PIPESTEM US	WV 25979-0150

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
4	Milorganite; min. formula 6.0.2 classic fertilizer, or equal	6000.00000	LB	<i>No Bid</i>	

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Milorganite; minimum formula 6.0.2 classic fertilizer with minimum 4% iron, must be slow release, must be water soluble, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150 PIPESTEM US	WV25979-0150	SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR PIPESTEM US	WV 25979-0150

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
5	Daconil AN flowable fungicide; liquid formula, or equal	20.00000	GL	<i>\$47.00</i>	<i>\$940.00</i>

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Daconil AN flowable fungicide; liquid formula, with minimum active ingredient chlorothalonil 38.5%, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150		SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR	
PIPESTEM	WV25979-0150	PIPESTEM	WV 25979-0150
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
6	Lebanon Turf, minimum formula 21-0-10 fertilizer, or equal	2000.00000	LB	<i>No Bid</i>	

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Lebanon Turf, minimum formula 21-0-10 fertilizer, medium granular, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150		SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR	
PIPESTEM	WV25979-0150	PIPESTEM	WV 25979-0150
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
7	Cleary 3336 Turf Fungicide, or equal	48.00000	PK	<i>\$ 33.92</i>	<i>\$ 1628.16</i>

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Cleary 3336 Turf Fungicide, all water soluble; must be in 2 pound packs, with minimum formula of 50% thiophanate methyl, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150		SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR	
PIPESTEM	WV25979-0150	PIPESTEM	WV 25979-0150
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
8	Banner Maxx Fungicide, or equal	32.00000	PT	<i>\$ 214.00/gal.</i>	<i>\$ 856.00</i>

*Pl. no longer available
only gallons*

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Banner Maxx Fungicide, with minimum active ingredient Propiconazole 14.3 %, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150 PIPESTEM US	WV25979-0150	SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR PIPESTEM US	WV 25979-0150

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
9	Anderson's Greens Grade, or equal	5000.00000	LB		
				No Bid.	

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Anderson's Greens Grade, minimum formula 19-3-19, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150 PIPESTEM US	WV25979-0150	SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR PIPESTEM US	WV 25979-0150

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
10	Subdue Maxx fungicide, or equal	8.00000	GL	\$510.00	\$4080.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Subdue Maxx fungicide, with minimum active ingredient, mefenoxam 22%, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150		SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR	
PIPESTEM	WV25979-0150	PIPESTEM	WV 25979-0150
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
11	Fore, rain shield, water soluble 6 lb packs, or equal	48.00000	PKG	<i>\$54.84</i>	<i>\$2632.32</i>

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :
Fore, rain shield, water soluble pakcs, must be in 6 pound packs, minimum active ingredient Mancozeb, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150		SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR	
PIPESTEM	WV25979-0150	PIPESTEM	WV 25979-0150
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
12	Lebanon Turf, min form 15-0-5 fairway grade fert, or equal	15000.00000	LB	<i>No Bid</i>	

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :
Lebanon Turf, minimum formula 15-0-5 fairway grade fertilizer, with minimum 1.14% active ingredient pre-emergent herbicide (benefin/trifluralin) Team, controlled release, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150		SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR	
PIPESTEM	WV25979-0150	PIPESTEM	WV 25979-0150
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
13	Anderson's Fluid Fertilizer, or equal	40.00000	GL	<i>No Bid</i>	

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Anderson's Fluid Fertilizer, minimum formula 29-2-3, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150 PIPESTEM US	WV25979-0150	SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR PIPESTEM US	WV 25979-0150

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
14	Chipco Signature fungicide, or equal	132.00000	LB	<i>\$25.25/4</i>	<i>\$3333.00</i>

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Chipco Signature fungicide, minimum active ingredient aluminum tris 80%, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150 PIPESTEM US	WV25979-0150	SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR PIPESTEM US	WV 25979-0150

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
15	Primo Maxx with min formula 11.3% Trinexapac-ethyl, or equal	2.00000	GL	<i>\$283.00</i>	<i>\$566.00</i>

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Primo Maxx, with minimum formula 11.3% Trinexapac-ethyl, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150 PIPESTEM WV25979-0150 US		SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR PIPESTEM WV 25979-0150 US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
16	Dursban 50 WSP insecticide, or equal	80.00000	PKG	\$36.96	\$2956.80

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Dursban 50 WSP insecticide, must be in 1.75 pound water soluble packs, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150 PIPESTEM WV25979-0150 US		SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR PIPESTEM WV 25979-0150 US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
17	Bayleton Granular Lebanon Turf Fungicide, or equal	2500.00000	LB	\$3.02	\$7550.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Bayleton Granular Lebanon Turf Fungicide, minimum active ingredient Triadenfon, contains minimum 1% Bayleton granulate product to be dry applied, non-burning granulate, dust free particle, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150 PIPESTEM WV25979-0150 US		SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR PIPESTEM WV 25979-0150 US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
18	Rubigan AS Turf and Ornamental Fungicide, or equal	4.00000	GL	\$372.00	\$1488.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Rubigan AS Turf and Ornamental Fungicide, minimum active ingredient Fenarimol 11.6%, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150 PIPESTEM US	WV25979-0150	SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR PIPESTEM US	WV 25979-0150

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
19	Spectro 90 WDG, or equal	24.00000	PKG	\$ 59.50	\$1428.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Spectro 90 WDG, with minimum active ingredients Chlorothalonil 72% and Thiophanate0methyl 18%; must be in 5 pound packs, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150 PIPESTEM US	WV25979-0150	SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR PIPESTEM US	WV 25979-0150

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
20	Daconil Ultrex, or equal	160.00000	LB	\$8.00	\$1280.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Daconil Ultrex, minimum active ingredient Chlorothalonil 82.5%, must be in 5 pound bags, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150		SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR	
PIPESTEM	WV25979-0150	PIPESTEM	WV 25979-0150
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
21	Torque Fungicide, or equal	4.00000	GL	\$368.00	\$1472.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Torque Fungicide, Minimum active ingredient, Tebuconazole 38.7%, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150		SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR	
PIPESTEM	WV25979-0150	PIPESTEM	WV 25979-0150
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
22	Hem Turf Track Blue pkgd in indiv water disburs pkg or equal	100.00000	PKG	No Bid	

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Hem, Turf Track Blue, packaged in individual, water disburseable packages. Each packet treats up to 150 gallons, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150		SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR	
PIPESTEM	WV25979-0150	PIPESTEM	WV 25979-0150
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
23	Primer Select, Enhanced matrix flow soil surfactant or equal	30.00000	GL	No Bid	

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Primer Select, Enhanced matrix flow soil surfactant. Ai = Alcoxylated Polyols, or equal. Packaged in 5 gallon containers, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150		SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR	
PIPESTEM	WV25979-0150	PIPESTEM	WV 25979-0150
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
24	Arena 0.5 Insecticide, or equal	1.00000	TON	\$ 3400.00	\$ 3400.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Arena 0.5 Insecticide. Packaged in 25 pound granular containers, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150		SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR	
PIPESTEM	WV25979-0150	PIPESTEM	WV 25979-0150
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
25	Drive 75 DF, Quinclorac SPC 75DF, or equal	8.00000	LB	\$ 48.00	\$ 384.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Drive 75 DF, Quinclorac SPC 75DF, packaged in 1 pound containers, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150		SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR	
PIPESTEM	WV25979-0150	PIPESTEM	WV 25979-0150
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
26	Cleary's Chem Antifoam, Dimethypolysiloxane 1.25% or equal	16.00000	QT	No Bid	

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Cleary's Chemical Antifoam, Dimethypolysiloxane 1.25% suspension, or equal.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK RR 20 BOX 150		SUPERINTENDENT DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES PIPESTEM STATE PARK 3405 PIPESTEM DR	
PIPESTEM	WV25979-0150	PIPESTEM	WV 25979-0150
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
27	Bio Sea, Sea weed extract, or equal	15.00000	GL	No Bid	

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
10171600			

Extended Description :

Bio Sea, Sea weed extract, guaranteed analysis, 1-0-0, 0.5% magnesium, 0.2% Boron, 0.1% iron, 12 % cold processed sea weed, or equal.

DNR150000029	Document Phase Final	Document Description Chemicals for Pipestem Golf Co urses	Page 13 of 13
---------------------	---------------------------------------	---	--

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions