
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.   As  part  of  the  State  of  West 
Virginia’s procurement process, and to maintain the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted online  is publicly posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov  with  any  other  vendor 
responses  to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the 
Purchasing Division in hard copy format. 
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VersionSolicitation NoSolicitation ClosesDate issued

Proc Folder :

Solicitation Description :

Proc Type :

Solicitation Response

Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East

Charleston, WV 25305-0130
Post Office Box 50130

State of West Virginia

105385

Addendum 1 Sodium Chloride (Roadway Salt)

Central Master Agreement

2015-06-24

13:30:00

SR 0803 ESR06241500000004491 1

 VENDOR

VS0000005841

Midwest Salt LLC

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Signature X FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001

Misty Delong

(304) 558-8802
misty.m.delong@wv.gov
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

1 Sodium Chloride (Roadway Salt) 0.00000 TON $0.00 $0.00

46161506

Sodium Chloride (Roadway Salt)































































Pricing Exhibit A Sodium Chloride
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Vendor shall bid all of a County's delivery/storage sites at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all locations.  Vendor may bid any or all Counties.

Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Guaranteed Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 1

Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost

Boone Clinton @ WV85 850
Boone Rock Creek 1,300
Boone Seth 850
Boone Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 3,000 $90.05 $270,150.00
Clay Widen Road & CR 11 1,350
Clay Maysel 450
Clay Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 1,800 No Bid No Bid
Kanawha Chelyan 2,000
Kanawha Elkview 1,850
Kanawha North Charleston 2,000
Kanawha St. Albans 3,000
Kanawha I-64 @ Scary Creek 2,000
Kanawha I-64 @ Rt. 119 and Penn. Avenue 1,700
Kanawha I-77 @ Sissonville 1,350
Kanawha I-79 @ Amma 1,700
Kanawha Corridor G @ Alum Creek 1,700
Kanawha Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 17,300 No Bid No Bid
Mason Pt. Pleasant 3,000
Mason Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 3,000 $78.73 $236,190.00
Putnam Red House 1,300
Putnam Hurricane @ Rt. 34 1,700
Putnam US 35 1,500
Putnam Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 4,500 $83.05 $373,725.00

Estimated Total per District 29,600 $880,065.00

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.

It is understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,

whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120 maximum.
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Vendor shall bid all of a County's delivery/storage sites at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all locations.  Vendor may bid any or all Counties.

Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Guaranteed Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 2

Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost

Cabell Barboursville 6500
Cabell I-64 @ Huntington 2200
Cabell Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 8700 No Bid No Bid
Lincoln West Hamlin 1750
Lincoln Yawkey 1300
Lincoln Harts 1300
Lincoln Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 4350 $82.05 $356,917.50
Logan Corridor G @ Chapmanville 2250
Logan Wilkinson 1700
Logan Man 1300
Logan Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 5250 No Bid No Bid
Mingo Corridor G @ Miller's Creek, Bldg #03011 1800
Mingo Mingo Cty @Miller's Creek, Bldg #03025 2000
Mingo Gilbert 650
Mingo Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 4450 No Bid No Bid
Wayne Pritchard 2200
Wayne Wayne 2000
Wayne Crum 1400
Wayne Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 5600 $79.47 $445,032.00

Estimated Total per District 28,350 $801,949.50

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.

It is understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,

whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120 maximum.
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Vendor shall bid all of a County's delivery/storage sites at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all locations.  Vendor may bid any or all Counties.

Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Guaranteed Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 3

Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost

Calhoun Millstone 3,000
Calhoun Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 3,000
Jackson Ripley 3,000
Jackson I-77 @ Medina 1,400
Jackson Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 4,400
Pleasants Belmont 2,500
Pleasants Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 2,500
Ritchie APD Pennsboro 2,000
Ritchie Ellenboro 3,000
Ritchie Corridor D @ Nutter Farm 400
Ritchie Smithville 300
Ritchie Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 5,700
Roane Lefthand @ WV 36 700
Roane Ambler Ridge @ US 119 200
Roane Spencer 1,400
Roane Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 2,300
Wirt Elizabeth 1,400
Wirt Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 1,400
Wood Parkersburg @ Rt. 95S 5,000
Wood I-77 @ Parkersburg 3,500
Wood Corridor D @ Riverhill 2,000
Wood Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 10,500

Estimated Total per District 29,800 No Bid

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.

It is understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,

whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120 maximum.
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Vendor shall bid all of a County's delivery/storage sites at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all locations.  Vendor may bid any or all Counties.

Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Guaranteed Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 4

Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost

Doddridge Smithburg 1,700
Doddridge Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 1,700
Harrison Gore 5,000
Harrison Saltwell 700
Harrison I-79 @ Lost Creek 1,900
Harrison APD 50 @ Tunnel Hill 2,000
Harrison Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 9,600
Marion Fairmont 1,400
Marion Mannington 750
Marion Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 2,150
Monongalia I-79 @ Goshen Road 2,500
Monongalia Ridgedale 5,500
Monongalia Pentress 1,100
Monongalia Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 9,100
Preston Bruceton Mills 5,000
Preston Albright 2,000
Preston Terra Alta 1,000
Preston Fellowsville 1,000
Preston Aurora 1,000
Preston I-68 @ Cooper's Rock 2,500
Preston Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 12,500
Taylor Fetterman/Prunytown 2,000
Taylor Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 2,000

Estimated Total per District 37,050 No Bid

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.

It is understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,

whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120 maximum.
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Vendor shall bid all of a County's delivery/storage sites at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all locations.  Vendor may bid any or all Counties.

Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Guaranteed Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 5

Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost

Berkeley I-81 @ Martinsburg (0571) 1,000
Berkeley 1867 Rock Cliff Drive (0502) 1,500
Berkeley I-81 @ Exit 8 (0571) 950
Berkeley Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 3,450
Grant Petersburg 1,300
Grant Mt. Storm 1,500
Grant Corridor H @ Knobley Road (0582) 3,500
Grant Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 6,300
Hampshire Romney 1,800
Hampshire Capon Bridge 1,000
Hampshire Slanesville 1,000
Hampshire Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 3,800
Hardy Moorefield 1,400
Hardy Baker 1,800
Hardy Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 3,200
Jefferson Charles Town (0519) 3,000
Jefferson Charles Town - New Shed (0564) 3,000
Jefferson Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 6,000
Mineral New Creek 1,000
Mineral Sky Line 750
Mineral Short Gap 750
Mineral District Headquarters 1,000
Mineral Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 3,500
Morgan Berkeley Springs 1,600
Morgan Largent 500
Morgan Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 2,100

Estimated Total per District 28,350 No Bid

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.

It is understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,

whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120 maximum.
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Vendor shall bid all of a County's delivery/storage sites at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all locations.  Vendor may bid any or all Counties.

Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Guaranteed Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 6

Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost

Brooke Wellsburg 1500
Brooke Weirton 1000
Brooke Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 2500
Hancock New Manchester 2800
Hancock Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 2800
Marshall Glen Dale 3000
Marshall Cameron 1500
Marshall Sand Hill 750
Marshall Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 5250
Ohio Triadelphia 4000
Ohio I-70 @ Triadelphia 3000
Ohio Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 7000
Tyler Sistersville 1200
Tyler Centerville 1000
Tyler Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 2200
Wetzel New Martinsville 1000
Wetzel Pine Grove 800
Wetzel Hundred 1200
Wetzel Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 3000

Estimated Total per District 22,750 No Bid

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.

It is understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,

whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120 maximum.
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Vendor shall bid all of a County's delivery/storage sites at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all locations.  Vendor may bid any or all Counties.

Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Guaranteed Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 7

Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost

Barbour Phillipi 2,700
Barbour Belington 1,800
Barbour Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 4,500
Braxton Gassaway 2,000
Braxton Heaters 1,200
Braxton I-79 @ Coon Knob 2,600
Braxton I-79 @ Burnsville 2,700
Braxton Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 8,500
Gilmer Glenville 1,700
Gilmer Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 1,700
Lewis Weston (Ben Dale) 2,600
Lewis Corridor H @ Mudlick 1,400
Lewis Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 4,000
Upshur Clow Lot @ Buckhannon 4,400
Upshur Tennerton 200
Upshur Kanawha Head 1,000
Upshur Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 5,600
Webster Cherry Falls 1,000
Webster Cowen 1,000
Webster Hacker Valley 500
Webster Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 2,500

Estimated Total per District 26,800 No Bid

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.

It is understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,

whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120 maximum.
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Vendor shall bid all of a County's delivery/storage sites at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all locations.  Vendor may bid any or all Counties.

Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Guaranteed Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 8

Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost

Pendleton Franklin, 220 North 750
Pendleton Judy Gap 600
Pendleton Brandywine 400
Pendleton Onego 300
Pendleton Franklin, 220 South 200
Pendleton Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 2250
Pocahontas Marlinton 900
Pocahontas Seebert 600
Pocahontas Greenbank 500
Pocahontas Bartow (Thornwood) 550
Pocahontas Snowshoe 200
Pocahontas Slaty Fork 600
Pocahontas Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 3350
Randolph Elkins 2000
Randolph Harman 1000
Randolph Coalton 1100
Randolph Valley Head 800
Randolph Mill Creek 1200
Randolph Pickens 500
Randolph Corridor H Lot @ Elkins 2000
Randolph Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 8600
Tucker Parsons 1200
Tucker Thomas 1100
Tucker Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 2300

Estimated Total per District 16,500 No Bid

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.

It is understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,

whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120 maximum.
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Vendor shall bid all of a County's delivery/storage sites at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all locations.  Vendor may bid any or all Counties.

Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Guaranteed Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 9

Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost

Fayette Oak Hill 2000
Fayette Lookout 1500
Fayette Falls View 0
Fayette Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 3500
Greenbrier Lewisburg 1600
Greenbrier Crawley 2900
Greenbrier I-64 @ Hart's Run 1000
Greenbrier Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 5500
Monroe Union 1000
Monroe Peterstown 1000
Monroe Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 2000
Nicholas Summersville 2000
Nicholas Curtin 1500
Nicholas Corridor L @ Muddlety 500
Nicholas Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 4000
Summers Hinton 1500
Summers Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 1500

Estimated Total per District 16,500 No Bid

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.

It is understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,

whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120 maximum.
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Vendor shall bid all of a County's delivery/storage sites at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all locations.  Vendor may bid any or all Counties.

Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Guaranteed Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 10

Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost

McDowell Havaco 2,000
McDowell Yukon 300
McDowell Johnnycake Mountain 600
McDowell Raysel 600
McDowell Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 3,500
Mercer Princeton @ WV 20 4,500
Mercer Flat Top 1,000
Mercer I-77 @ Princeton 4,000
Mercer Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 9,500
Raleigh Skelton 7,500
Raleigh Bolt 1,000
Raleigh I-64 @ Bragg 5,000
Raleigh Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 13,500
Wyoming Pineville 3,000
Wyoming Still Run 2,500
Wyoming Hanover 100
Wyoming Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 5,600

Estimated Total per District 32,100 No Bid

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.

It is understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,

whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120 maximum.
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Vendor shall bid all of a County's delivery/storage sites at one unit price per County.
No Bid Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all locations.  Vendor may bid any or all Counties.

Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Guaranteed Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".

Delivery:  F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
WV Turnpike

Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost

Kanawha Chelyan 1,000
Kanawha Standard 3,500
Kanawha Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 4,500
Mercer Princeton 1,500
Mercer Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 1,500
Raleigh Beckley 8,500
Raleigh Ghent 5,000
Raleigh Total Guaranteed Quantity for County 13,500

Estimated Total per District 19,500 No Bid

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.

It is understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,

whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120 maximum.
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F.O.B. Vendor's Storage Site
For pickup by WVDOH Forces.

Location of Storage Site Cost Per Ton*
38.755330,‐82.908585

Portsmouth, OH

*Bid price shall include cost of
 vendor loading District's trucks.

$70.43







DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE
THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the
certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

CONTACTPRODUCER NAME:
FAXPHONE
(A/C, No):(A/C, No, Ext):

E-MAIL
ADDRESS:

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #

INSURER A :

INSURED INSURER B :

INSURER C :

INSURER D :

INSURER E :

INSURER F :

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

ADDL SUBRINSR POLICY EFF POLICY EXP
TYPE OF INSURANCE LIMITSPOLICY NUMBERLTR (MM/DD/YYYY) (MM/DD/YYYY)INSR WVD

GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE $
DAMAGE TO RENTED

COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY $PREMISES (Ea occurrence)

CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR MED EXP (Any one person) $

PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $

GENERAL AGGREGATE $

GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG $
PRO- $POLICY LOCJECT

COMBINED SINGLE LIMITAUTOMOBILE LIABILITY (Ea accident) $

BODILY INJURY (Per person) $ANY AUTO
ALL OWNED SCHEDULED BODILY INJURY (Per accident) $
AUTOS AUTOS

NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE $HIRED AUTOS (Per accident)AUTOS

$

UMBRELLA LIAB EACH OCCURRENCE $OCCUR

EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $

$DED RETENTION $
WC STATU- OTH-WORKERS COMPENSATION

TORY LIMITS ERAND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY Y / N
ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE E.L. EACH ACCIDENT $

N / AOFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED?
(Mandatory in NH) E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE $
If yes, describe under

E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT $DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES  (Attach ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, if more space is required)

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

© 1988-2010 ACORD CORPORATION.  All rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORDACORD 25 (2010/05)

MIDWE25 OP ID: M1

08/14/14

847-758-1000
Corkill Insurance Agency, Inc.
25 Northwest Pt Blvd Ste 625
Elk Grove Village, IL 60007
Carolyn Hanna

847-758-1200

The Hanover Insurance Company 22292
The HartfordMidwest Salt, LLC

1715 E. Wilson Street Unit 1
Batavia, IL 60510

1,000,000

A X OBCA053878 07/14/14 07/14/15 1,000,000

X 10,000

1,000,000

X EPLI 25K 2,000,000

2,000,000

Emp Ben. 1000/3000

1,000,000

A X AWCA053868 07/14/14 07/14/15

X X

X 2,000,000

A OBCA053878 07/14/14 07/14/15

X 0

B 83WECBS3629 07/14/14 07/14/15 500,000

500,000

500,000

Proof of insurnace.                                                         

SAMPO01

Sample Certificate




