
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.   As  part  of  the  State  of  West 
Virginia’s procurement process, and to maintain the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted online  is publicly posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov  with  any  other  vendor 
responses  to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the 
Purchasing Division in hard copy format. 
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VersionSolicitation NoSolicitation ClosesDate issued

Proc Folder :

Solicitation Description :

Proc Type :

Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State Of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

80830

ADDENDUM NO. 2 -EXTEND BID OPENING-STONE DELIVERY

Central Master Agreement

2015-04-09

13:30:00

SR 0803 ESR03311500000002888 1

 VENDOR

000000207612

SOUTHERN WV ASPHALT INC

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Signature X FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001

Crystal Rink

(304) 558-2402
crystal.g.rink@wv.gov
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

1 STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS -
MATERIAL & DELIVERY BY

0.00000 TON $0.00

11111600

ADDENDUM NO. 2 - TO EXTEND THE BID OPENING FROM 04/01/2015 TO 04/09/2015 AT 1:30 PM.  SEE
ATTACHED PAGES.

STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - MATERIAL & DELIVERY BY VENDOR



Pricing Page Schedule VENDOR NAME _____________Southern WV Asphalt, Inc.

 Kelly Mt. Quarry
F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 7 2015 Spring/Summer

Estimated Location of

Contract Description Quantity DOH
Item of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site

LIMESTONE BLAST

SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL

GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG

A Class 1 2000 Belington 14.50$                  NO BID NO BID

B Class 2 1500 Belington 14.50$                  NO BID NO BID

D AASHTO #1 500 Belington 17.50$                  NO BID NO BID

E AASHTO #3 500 Belington 17.50$                  NO BID NO BID

G AASHTO #467 700 Belington NO BID NO BID NO BID

H AASHTO #57 1000 Belington 18.35$                  NO BID NO BID

K AASHTO #8 1500 Belington 18.35$                  NO BID NO BID

L AASHTO #9 1000 Belington 19.35$                  NO BID NO BID

M Gabion Stone 200 Belington 17.10$                  NO BID NO BID

OA Limestone Std Abr. 3000 Belington 18.10$                  NO BID NO BID

OB Sandstone Std Abr. 3000 Belington NO BID NO BID NO BID

PA Limestone Mod Abr. 500 Belington NO BID NO BID NO BID

PB Sandstone Mod Abr. 500 Belington NO BID NO BID NO BID

R Shot Rock 500 Belington 26.25$                  NO BID NO BID

A Class 1 6000 Philippi 16.10$                  NO BID NO BID

B Class 2 3000 Philippi 16.10$                  NO BID NO BID

D AASHTO #1 500 Philippi 18.85$                  NO BID NO BID

E AASHTO #3 500 Philippi 19.35$                  NO BID NO BID

G AASHTO #467 2000 Philippi NO BID NO BID NO BID

H AASHTO #57 1200 Philippi 20.35$                  NO BID NO BID

K AASHTO #8 2500 Philippi 20.60$                  NO BID NO BID

L AASHTO #9 1500 Philippi 21.60$                  NO BID NO BID

M Gabion Stone 500 Philippi 19.35$                  NO BID NO BID

OA Limestone Std Abr. 5000 Philippi 20.50$                  NO BID NO BID

OB Sandstone Std Abr. 5000 Philippi NO BID NO BID NO BID

PA Limestone Mod Abr. 500 Philippi NO BID NO BID NO BID

PB Sandstone Mod Abr. 500 Philippi NO BID NO BID NO BID

R Shot Rock 500 Philippi 28.25$                  NO BID NO BID

A Class 1 500 Burnsville I-79 NO BID NO BID NO BID

K AASHTO #8 1000 Burnsville I-79 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BARBOUR COUNTY

Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.

DOH Storage Site

BARBOUR COUNTY

BRAXTON COUNTY



L AASHTO #9 1000 Burnsville I-79 NO BID NO BID NO BID

M Gabion Stone 500 Burnsville I-79 NO BID NO BID NO BID

OA Limestone Std Abr. 1500 Burnsville I-79 NO BID NO BID NO BID

OB Sandstone Std Abr. 1500 Burnsville I-79 NO BID NO BID NO BID

PA Limestone Mod Abr. 500 Burnsville I-79 NO BID NO BID NO BID

PB Sandstone Mod Abr. 500 Burnsville I-79 NO BID NO BID NO BID



Pricing Page Schedule VENDOR NAME _____________Southern WV Asphalt, Inc.

 Kelly Mt. Quarry
F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 8 2015 Spring/Summer

Estimated Location of

Contract Description Quantity DOH
Item of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site

LIMESTONE BLAST

SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL

GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG

A Class 1 1000 Brandywine NO BID NO BID NO BID

B Class 2 450 Brandywine NO BID NO BID NO BID

I AASHTO #67 500 Brandywine NO BID NO BID NO BID

K AASHTO #8 1000 Brandywine NO BID NO BID NO BID

L AASHTO #9 1000 Brandywine NO BID NO BID NO BID

OA Limestone Std Abr. 2000 Brandywine NO BID NO BID NO BID

OB Sandstone Std Abr. 2000 Brandywine NO BID NO BID NO BID

PA Limestone Mod Abr. 1600 Brandywine NO BID NO BID NO BID

PB Sandstone Mod Abr. 1600 Brandywine NO BID NO BID NO BID

A Class 1 2500 Franklin - US 220N NO BID NO BID NO BID

B Class 2 2700 Franklin - US 220N NO BID NO BID NO BID

D AASHTO #1 1000 Franklin - US 220N NO BID NO BID NO BID

H AASHTO #57 1000 Franklin - US 220N NO BID NO BID NO BID

I AASHTO #67 1000 Franklin - US 220N NO BID NO BID NO BID

K AASHTO #8 950 Franklin - US 220N NO BID NO BID NO BID

L AASHTO #9 2000 Franklin - US 220N NO BID NO BID NO BID

M Gabion Stone 135 Franklin - US 220N NO BID NO BID NO BID

OA Limestone Std Abr. 2400 Franklin - US 220N NO BID NO BID NO BID

OB Sandstone Std Abr. 2400 Franklin - US 220N NO BID NO BID NO BID

PA Limestone Mod Abr. 4400 Franklin - US 220N NO BID NO BID NO BID

PB Sandstone Mod Abr. 4400 Franklin - US 220N NO BID NO BID NO BID

A Class 1 275 Franklin - US 220S NO BID NO BID NO BID

B Class 2 1160 Franklin - US 220S NO BID NO BID NO BID

D AASHTO #1 1000 Franklin - US 220S NO BID NO BID NO BID

H AASHTO #57 500 Franklin - US 220S NO BID NO BID NO BID

I AASHTO #67 500 Franklin - US 220S NO BID NO BID NO BID

K AASHTO #8 700 Franklin - US 220S NO BID NO BID NO BID

L AASHTO #9 2000 Franklin - US 220S NO BID NO BID NO BID

M Gabion Stone 500 Franklin - US 220S NO BID NO BID NO BID

OA Limestone Std Abr. 2400 Franklin - US 220S NO BID NO BID NO BID

PENDLETON COUNTY

Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.

DOH Storage Site

PENDLETON COUNTY

PENDLETON COUNTY



OB Sandstone Std Abr. 2400 Franklin - US 220S NO BID NO BID NO BID

PA Limestone Mod Abr. 1300 Franklin - US 220S NO BID NO BID NO BID

PB Sandstone Mod Abr. 1300 Franklin - US 220S NO BID NO BID NO BID































VENDOR NAME Southern West Virginia Asphalt, Inc.

A Vendor may submit more than one Vendor’s Storage Sites information on one Information Attachment form
ONLY if bid pricing is the SAME for all Storage Sites and all WVDOH locations bid.  A separate bid submission 
and Information Attachment form MUST be submitted when bid price varies between Vendor's Storage Sites.

a)  SOURCE OF MATERIAL (all sources for which bid prices apply (e.g., Quarry location if Sandstone 
     or Limestone; dredging or pit location if Gravel; production plant name and location if Slag)

b)  EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S):  A separate bid schedule 
     must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.

c)  SOURCE OF MATERIAL:  Name and Location of plant which produces Cinder material.

d)  EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S)  A separate bid schedule
      must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.

Cinders

Rt. 33 Kelly Mountain Road
Elkins, WV 26241

Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel, Sand, Blast Furnance Slag and Steel Slag

Same

INFORMATION ATTACHMENT
Vendor’s Storage Sites

2015 Spring and Summer - Materials and Delivery by Vendor ONLY

Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.












