Y ;;;S%Si"hsf Di:"s";t e State of West Virginia
ashington Street Eas #
| Post Office Box 50130 Request for Quotation

#x3| Charleston, WV 25305-0130 =

Proc Folder: 52818

Doc Description: ADDENDUM NO. 01 TO CHANGE THE BID OPENING DATE
Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2014-12-01 2014-12-09 CRFQ 0402 EDD1500000009 2
13:30:00

BID CLERK |—

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON ST E

CHARLESTON Wv 25305
us

Vendor Name, Address and Telephone Number:

Heritage Bus Sales, Inc.
408 New Goff Mountain Road
Cross Lanes, WV 25313
304-345-2490

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Phillip Uy

(304) 558-2686

puy@access.k12.wv.us

Signature X ’Zi/,é/,;\_, D OMM,/FE.N# 201602832 oate  12-11-14

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Page : 1 FORM ID : WV-PRC-CRFQ-001



SOLICITATION NUMBER: CRFQ EDD1500000009
Addendum Number: 1

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as
(“Solicitation™) to reflect the change(s) identified and described below.

Applicable Addendum Category:
[¢"] Modify bid opening date and time
[ | Modify specifications of product or service being sought

[ | Attachment of vendor questions and responses

[ | Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet
[ | Correction of error
[ | Other

Description of Modification to Solicitation:
To change the bid opening date to December 9, 2014 at 1:30 PM EST

Additional Documentation: Documentation related to this Addendum (if any) has been
included herewith as Attachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference.

Terms and Conditions:

1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in
full force and effect.

2. Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by
completing an Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. The addendum
acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

Revised 6/8/2012



ATTACHMENT A

Revised 6/8/2012



WV _PURCHASING ACA SECT Fax 304-558-4115 Dec 5 2014 01:3%9m P001/011

| Purchiasing Divison State of West Virginia

2018 Washington Streel East :
Post Office Box 50130 Request for Quotation

.§| Chariestoh, WV 253050140 =

U

f Proc Feidar: 52848
i Doc Desciiption: ADDENDUM NO. 02 TO CHANGE THE BID OPENING DATE
,!_ Proc Type: Central Master Agreament

i
jDate Issuad Solicitatlor Cloges ! Solicltation N¢ Yersion :
] 2014-12-05 2014-12-12 CRFQ 0402 EDD500000009 4

L B II 13:30:00 J

BID CLERK

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
PURCHASING DiViSiON

2019 WASHINGTON ST E
CHARLESTON Wy 25305
us

!
|
{
i
i
|
i
J

]\.’endo,- Nesme, Address and Telephone Mumber:

i Heritage Bus Sales, Inc.

l 408 New Goff Mountain Road E

Cross Lanes, WV 25313 §

304-345-2490 E
|

FOR INFORMATIGN CONTACT THE BUYER

Crystal Rink
(304) 558-2402
Crystal.g Ank@wv.gov

Signature X 75/4%0\/&) UA&W“//FEIN# 201602832 DATE 12-11-14 ;

All offers subject to all tarms and conditlons coritained In this saliciation

Page: 1 FCRM (D : VWW-PRC-CRFQ-001



WV PURCHASING ACA SECT Fax 304-558-4115 Dec 5 2014 01:40pm P002/011

SOLICITATION NUMBER: CRFQ EDD1500000009
Addendum Number: 2

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as
("Schictation™) to reflect the change(s) identified and described below.

Applicable Addendum Category:
] Modify bid opening date and time
I 1 Modify specifications of product or service being sought
Iv'] Attachment of vendor questions and responses
[ | Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet
[v'| Correction of error

[ 1 Other

Description of Modification to Solicitation:

To exiend the bid opening date ‘o December 12, 2014 at 1:30 PM EST
To attach corrected pricing pages

To provide answers to vendor questions

To correct buyer ic Crystal Rink

Additional Documentation: Documentation related to this Addendum (if any) has been
included herewith as Attachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference.

Terms aud Conditions:

1. All provisions of the Soljcitation and other addenda not modified herein shal! remain in
fuli force and effect.

2. Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by
completing an Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith,
Faijure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. The addendum
acknowledgement should be submitred with the bid to expedite document processing.

Revised 6/8/2012

o ]



Revised 6/8/2012

Wv PURCHASING ACA SECT Fax 304-558-4115

ATTACHMENT A

Dec 5 2014 01:40pm  P003/011

[42]



SBUS-15
Questions and Responses

10 Number thirty-four “Instructions to Vendors” Purchase Card Acceptance — This year, it
appears the vendor’s will be required to accept the State Purchasing Card as a method of
payment for school buses. There has been much discussion in previous year’s, that this
method of payment will increase the cost of buses due to the significant fees which will be
assessed on the vendor. For that reason, it has not been required in the past. | want

“confirmation, that it is the intent to require this method of paymént and not justan

oversight.

1R. The State Purchasing Card is an option, but will not be required for this contract.

2Q. Page three “ West Virginia Minimum Requirements” Brakes — Letter B. — As it is written
with the Comma following the word “device” it would be required to provide both a “Wig
Wag"” and a “Buzzer’. We understood the requirement to be one or the other, not both?

2R. One or the other, not both.

3Q. Electrical System page six — Letter C. Lamps and signals — The International Corporation
system works with the “Engine Running” and the “Park Brake Valve” released. In other
words, when the engine is on and the bus is able to move, the daytime running lights will be
on. Does this meet the intent of this requirement? Otherwise, as was discussed, lights
would shine at football games when the bus was being run to keep it warm etc

3R. No, this does not meet the intent of the specifications. Please follow the language of the
Policy 4334 specifications.

4Q. We would also ask that consideration be given to extending the bid opening date by a
minimum of ten days, if all parties were in agreement.

4A. We are unable to extend 10 days.

5Q. Who is the buyer for this solicitation, Crystal or Phillip

5R. Crystal is a senior buyer at the Purchasing Division, and Phillip works for WVDE.

6Q. In "instructions to vendors submitting bids" #6,(attached) | plan on submitting my bid via
overnight package, NOT wvOasis. Please tell me exactly how the label should read that will
be on my overnight package:
SEALED BID: ?77?
BUYER: ??7?
SOLICITATION NO: CRFQ 0402 EDD1500000009 BID OPENING DATE: 12/09/2014 BID
OPENING TIME: 1:30 PM EST FAX NUMBER: ???7?

6R. SEALED BID: CRFQ 0402 EDD1500000009
BID OPENING DATE: 12/12/2014
BID OPENING TIME: 1:30 PM EST
FAX NUMBER:304-558-4115

7Q. I would like to use the pricing pages "SBUS15 Pricing Pages.doc" that | printed off the
wvOASIS site for this solicitation, pages 1 to 5 (attached) even though the heading says
SBUS14 Pricing Pages. Is this acceptable?

7R. Yes, but page has been corrected.




SBUS-15
Questions and Responses

Do | have to use the 30 page pricing document form which is on the wvOASIS web site (a2

8Q.
page partial is attached),actually, it is on the site 4 times? If so, please give me an idea as to
what you want printed under "specification" page #2 and "unit issue" and "specification" on
page 3?

8R. “Unit issue” indicates EA (Each), and the” Unit Price” is per each specufled bus (Comm Ln

: | Desc). “Comm Ln Desc” is the Commodity Line Description.

9Q. If 1am required to use the 30 page pricing document, which one of the 4 attachments on
the solicitation site do | use?

9R. If submitting your bid through OASIS you will need to utilize the system, or you can print the
attached pricing page and submit a paper copy.

10Q. Can this bid be faxed? If so, to what number?

10R. Fax #: 304-558-4115

11Q. Is it possible to get a checklist of items that must be included in the bid package?

11R. Completed Pricing Pages

Purchasing Affidavit
Addendum Acknowledgement
Signature Page




WV PURCHASING ACA SECT Fax_304-558-4115 Dec 5 2014 02:42pm P001/004

&y, | Purchasing Divison State of West Virginia
SE% | 2019 Washington Street East Request for Quotation

< é:n:. ¥
#7481 Charlesten, WV 25305-0130 -

- 17§l Post Offics Box 30130

Ig Proc Foldear: 52818 i
Dae Description: ADDENDUM NO. 3 TO CHANGE THE BID OPENING DATE TO 12/1114 i

Proc Type: Central Master Agreermant i

Date Issued Soiicitation Closes Sollcitation No Vérsion :
2014-1205 2014-12-11 CRFQ 0402 EDD15£0000009 5 ;

13:30:00 i

i

]
BID CLERK l
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATICN ;
]

I

t

PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGCTON ST &

CHARLESTON Wy 25305
us

Vendor Name, Address and Tzlephone Number: !
Heritage Bus Sales, Inc. !
408 New Goff Mountain Road

Cross Lanes, WV 25313 ;
304-345-2490 !

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER “'[
Phiilip Uy |
(304) 558-2686

puy@access.k12.wv.us

¥ / ‘/. -~ \ ) ﬁ
Signature X Q'L’Mﬂ__, Q @A’v"/\—/’/FEQN# 201602832 oaTe 12-11-14 I

All offers subject to all terms and cenditions contained in this solicitation

Page: 1 FORM iD : vi'V-PRC-CRFQ-001



WV PURCHASING ACA SECT Fax 304-558-4115 Dec 5 2014 02:42pm P002/004
2

SOLICITATION NUMBER: CRFQ EPD1500000069
Addendum Number: 3

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as
(“Solicitation™) to reflect the change(s) identified and described below,

Applicable Addendum Category:
I 1 Modify bid opening date and time
[ | Modify specifications of product or service being sought
{ | Attachment of vendor guestions and responses
[ ] Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet
[ | Correction of error
[ | Other

Description of Medification to Solicitation:
T change the bid opening date to December 11,2014 at 1:30 PM EST

Additional Documentation: Documentation related to this Addendum (if any) has been
included hercwith as Attachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference.

Terms and Conditions:

L All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shajl remazin in
full force and effect,

2. Vendor should acknowiedge receipt of all addenda jssued fer this Solicitation by
completing an Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. The addendum
acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid 1o expedite document processing.

Revised ¢/8/2012



WV PURCHASING ACA SECT Fax 304-558-4115 Dec 5 2014 02:42pm P003/004
3

ATTACHMENT A

Revised &/8/2002



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: CRFQ 0402 EDD1500000009

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[ XX  Addendum No. 1 [ ] Addendum No. 6
[¥X]  Addendum No. 2 [ ] Addendum No.7
[XX] Addendum No. 3 [ 1 Addendum No. 8
[ ] Addendum No. 4 [ 1 Addendum No.9
[ ] Addendum No. 5 [ ] Addendum No. 10

I'understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. 1
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding,

Heritage Bus Sales, Inc.

Company

Wellr D). —

Authorized Signature
12=-11-14

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.
Revised 6/8/2012



Purchasing Divison

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Request for Quotation

Proc Folder: 52818

Doc Description: VARIOUS SCHOOL BUSES

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Date Issued Solicitation Closes | Solicitation No

Version

2014-11-17 2014-12-10 CRFQ
13:30:00

0402 EDD1500000009

1

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

BID CLERK

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON ST E

CHARLESTON wv
us

25305

VENDOR

Vendor Name, Address and Telephone Number:

Heritage Bus Sales, Inc.
408 New Goff Mountain Road
Cross Lanes, WV 25313
304-345-2490

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Phillip-Uy. . e =
(304) 558-2686

puy@access.k12.wv.us

. , - ~
Signature X Zé/é"g&m’v U:[/LMEW# 201602832

piie 12-11-14

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Page: 1

FORM ID : WV-PRC-CRFQ-001




INVOICE TO SHIP TO
ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No Gity © Wv92999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 TRANSIT UNITS, 71 PASSENGER, 1.00000 EA NO BID
210 HP, FE
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500
NO BID
Extended Description :
TRANSIT UNITS, 71 PASSENGER, 210 HP, FE
INVOICE TO SHIP TO
ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 TRANSIT UNITS, 71 PASSENGER, 1.00000 EA
225 HP, FE NO BID
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500 NO BID
Extended Description :
TRANSH‘UNHS,71PASSENGER,QZSHP,FE
INVOICE TO SHIP TO
ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VAMOUSLOCAHONSASINNCATEDBYORDER
No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit'i?-r“ice - o Totaﬁ’rlcé —
3 TRANSIT UNITS, 71 PASSENGER, 1.00000 EA 94,108.00 94,108.00
2225 HP,RE (225 HP) $94, $94,

Page: 2




Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification Model #

25101500 ic

TRANSIT 71 225 HP RE

RE

Extended Description :
TRANSIT UNITS, 71 PASSENGER, 2225 HP, RE

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
4 DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV
FOR 71 PASSENGER TRANSIT per Unit 1 $1,500.00 $1,500.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121603

I1C DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV RE MODEL

Extended Description :

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV FOR 71 PASSENGER TRANSIT UNITS.

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 89999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
5 TRANSIT UNITS, 77 PASSENGER, 1.00000 EA

210 HP, FE NO BID
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500

NO BID

Extended Description :
TRANSIT UNITS, 77 PASSENGER, 210 HP, FE

Page: 3




INVOICE TO

SHIP. TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
6 TRANSIT UNITS, 77 PASSENGER, 1.00000 EA

225 HP, FE NO BID
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500

NO BID

Extended Description :
TRANSIT UNITS, 77 PASSENGER, 225 HP, FE

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV89999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

7 TRANSIT UNITS, 77 PASSENGER, 1.00000 EA $99,037.00 $99,037.00
225 HP, RE ?

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

25101500 Ic TRANSIT 77 PASSENGER RE

Extended Description :
TRANSIT UNITS, 77 PASSENGER, 225 HP, RE

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
“Line “CommLnDesc aty - Unit Issue UnitPrice  TotalPrice
8 DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV : )
FOR 77 PASSENGER TRANSIT 1 per unit  $1,500.00 $1,500.00

Page: 4



.1Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

78121603

ICC

TRANSIT 77 Passenger

RE

Extended Description :

ALL STATE AGENCIES

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WVS9999 No City Wv 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

9 TRANSIT UNITS, 84 PASSENGER, ~ 1.00000 EA NO BID
240 HP, FE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

25101500

NO BID

Extended Description :

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City Wv99999 No City WV 99999
us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
10 TRANSIT UNITS, 84 PASSENGER, 1.00000 EA

240 HP, RE $100,915.00 $100,915.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

5101500
2 IC TRANSIT 84 Passenger RE

Extended Description :
TRANSIT UNITS, 84 PASSENGER, 240 HP, RE

Page: 5



INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARICUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
11 DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV .

FOR 84 PASSENGER, TRANSIT 1 peE ORlE $1,500.00 $1,500.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121603
IC TRANSIT 84 Passenger RE

Extended Description :

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV FOR 84 PASSENGER, TRANSIT UNITS

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV90999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
12 TRANSIT UNITS, 89 PASSENGER, 1.00000 EA
240 HP, FE NO BID
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500 NO BID
Extended Description :
TRANSIT UNITS, 89 PASSENGER, 240 HP, FE
INVOICE TO SHIP TO
ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
[Line  Comm Ln Desc T Qty Unit Issue ~ UnitPrice " Total Price
13 TRANSIT UNITS, 89 PASSENGER, 1.00000 EA $103,559.00 $103,559.00
240 HP, RE

Page: 6




Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
e101600 IC TRANSIT 89 Passenger RE
Extended Description :

TRANSIT UNITS, 89 PASSENGER, 240 HP, RE

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

" FOR 8 PASSENIGER, TRANSIT per unit  $1,500.00  $1,500.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603 IC TRANSIT 89 Passenger RE

Extended Description :

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV FOR 89 PASSENGER, TRANSIT UNITS

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY CRDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
15 CONVENTIONAL UNITS, 24 EA

PASSENGER, TYPE A-130 HP NO BID
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500

Extended Description :

CONVENTIONAL UNITS, 24 PASSENGER, TYPE A-130 HP

Page: 7




INVOICE TO

SHIP. TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City

No City WV99999 WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
16 CONVENTIONAL UNITS, 24 1.00000 EA

PASSENGER, TYPE A -LPG NO BID
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500 NO BID

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNITS, 24 PASSENGER, TYPE A - LPG FUELED

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
17 CONVENTIONAL UNITS, 24 1.00000 EA

PASSENGER, TYPE B-130 HP NO BID
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500 NO BID

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNITS, 24 PASSENGER, TYPE B-130 HP

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

WV 99999

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City No City WV 99999
us us
I6:  GamilAnies T Uritlsswe  Unitprics  TotalPrico
18 DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV
F/ 24 PASSENGER NO BID

Page: 8




Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603
NO BID

Extended Description : !
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV F/ 24 PASSENGER CONVENTIONAL UNIT

INVOICE TO | SHIP.TO
ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
19 CONVENTIONAL UNITS, 30 1.00000 EA NO BID
PASSENGER, TYPE A - 130 HP
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500
NO BID

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNITS, 30 PASSENGER, TYPE A - 130 HP

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City WV99899 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
20 CONVENTIONAL UNITS, 30 1.00000 EA

PASSENGER, TYPE A - LPG NO BID
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500

NO BID

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNITS, 30 PASSENGER, TYPE A - LPG FUELED

Page: 9



INVOICE TO

SHIP. TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
21 CONVENTIONAL UNITS, 30 1.00000 EA NO BID

PASSENGER, TYPEB - 130 HP
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500
NO BID

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNITS, 30 PASSENGER, TYPE B - 130 HP

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
22 DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV

F/ 30 PASSENGER NO BID

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

NO BID

Extended Description :
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV F/ 30 PASSENGER CONVENTIONAL UNIT

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999

us us
Line  CommLnDesc ay Unitlssue  UnitPrice  Total Price | ]
23 CONVENTIONAL UNITS, 35 1.00000 EA $74,606.00 $74,606.00

PASSENGER, REGULAR, 175 HP

Page: 10



Comm Code

Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

25101500

IC

35 Passenger Regular 175 HP

CE

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNITS, 35 PASSENGER, REGULAR, 175 HP

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
24 CONVENTIONAL UNITS, 35 1.00000 EA

PASSENGER, REGULAR, LPG NO BID
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500

NO BID

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNITS, 35 PASSENGER, REGULAR, LPG FUELED

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No Gity WV 99899 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
25 DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV

F/35 PASSENGER, per unit $1,500.00 $1,500.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121603

IC 35 Passenger Regular 175 HP- CE

Extended Description :
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV F/35 PASSENGER, CONVENTIONAL UNIT
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ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
26 CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 47 1.00000 EA ' 'S )
PASSENGER, REGULAR -190HP $76,826.00 $76,826.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500 -
IC 47 Passenger Regular 190 HP CE

Extended Description :
CONVENT!ONAL UNIT, 47 PASSENGER REGULAR 190HP

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

R B T O

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 989999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
27 CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 47 1.00000 EA

PASSENGER, REGULAR -LPG NO BID
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500

NO BID

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 47 PASSENGER REGULAR -LPG FUELED

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

PASSENGER, REGULAR -210HP

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty ~ UnitIssue Unit Price Total Price
28 CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 47 1.00000 EA $77,074.00 $77,074.00
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Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification Model #

25101500
IC

47 Passenger Regular 210 HP

CE

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 47 PASSENGER, REGULAR -210

HP

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
29 DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON,WV :

F/47 PASSENTER, CONV. UNIT L per unit $1,500.00 $1,500.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121603

IC 47 Passenger Regular CE

Extended Description :

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON,WV F/47 PASSENTER, CONV. UNIT DIESEL

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
30 DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON,WV

F/47 PASSENTER, CONV UNIT NO BID
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121603 NO BID

Extended Description :

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON,WV F/47 PASSENTER, CONV UNIT PROPANE
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INVOICE TO

SHIPTO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

WV 99999

No City WV99999 No City

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

T R e T ese00 s
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

2510La00 IC 53 Passenger Regular 190 HP CE

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 53 PASSENGER, REGULAR - 190HP

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
32 CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 53 1.00000 EA

PASSENGER, REGULAR - LPG NO BID

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

25101500

NO BID

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 53 PASSENGER, REGULAR - LPG FUELED

INVOICE TO SHIP. TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV85999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Lﬁ Deéc — Qty — _-_“E.li-f I-e.'.s-ue — Umt P-n-‘ic'e — :I-'_u_::;al Briceﬁ
33 CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 53 1.00000 EA $77,074.00 $77,074.00

PASSENGER, REGULAR - 210HP
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Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

25101500

IC 53 Passenger Regular 210 HP CE

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 53 PASSENGER, REGULAR - 210HP

INVOICE TO

SHIP. TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
s per unit  $1,500.00  $1,500.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121508 IC 53 Passenger Regular CE

Extended Description :

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON,WV F/53 PASSENGER CONV. UNIT DIESEL

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99989 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

35 DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON,WV T
F/53 PASSENGER CONV. UNIT NO BID

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

NO BID

Extended Description :

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON,WV F/53 PASSENGER CONV. UNIT PROPANE
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INVOICE TO

SHIPTO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATICNS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

WV99999

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
36 CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 59 1.00000 EA
PASSENGER, REGULAR - 190 HP $77,427.00 $77,427.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500
IC 59 Passenger Regular 190 HP CE

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 59 PASSENGER, REGULAR - 190 HP

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
37 CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 59 1.00000 EA

PASSENGER, REGULAR - LPG NO BID
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500

NO BID

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 59 PASSENGER, REGULAR - LPG FUELED

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIQUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99599 No City WV 99999
us us
[Lne  CGommlnbDesc  ay " Unitlssue _ UnitPrice "~ Total Price
38 CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 59 1.00000 EA
PASSENGER, REGULAR - 210 HP $77,614.00 $77,614.00
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|Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

25101500

IC 59 Passenger Regular 210 HP ' CE

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 59 PASSENGER, REGULAR - 210 HP

JO’@' Y

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

* FI59 PASSENGER GONV. UNIT 1 per unit  $1,500.00  $1,500.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603 IC 59 Passenger Regular CE

Extended Description :

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV F/59 PASSENGER CONV. UNIT DIESEL

i Al T

INVOICETO I

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

NO BID

No City WV99989 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
40 DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV

F/59 PASSENGER CONV UNIT NO BID
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121603

Extended Description :

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV F/59 PASSENGER CONV UNIT PROPANE
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INVOICE TO

SHIP. TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99989 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
41 CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 65 1.00000 EA $79,149.00 $79,149.00
PASSENGER, 210 HP
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500
IC 65 Passenger Regular 210 HP CE

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 65 PASSENGER, 210 HP

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
42 CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 65 1.00000 EA

PASSENGER. 225 HP $79,149.00 $79,149.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500

IC 65 Passenger Regular 225 HP CE

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 65 PASSENGER, 225 HP

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

PASSENGER, LPG FUELED

No City WV 98999 No City WV 99999

us us

["Line ~ CommLnDesc — ay Unitlssue  UnitPrice  Total Price

43 CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 65 1.00000 EA $89,737.00 $89,737.00
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Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification Model #

25101500

IC 65 Passenger Regular LPG Fuel CE

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 65 PASSENGER, LPG FUELED

INVOICE TO

SHIP.TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
A per wnit  $1,500.00  $1,500.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603 IC 65 Passenger Regular CE

Extended Description :

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV F/ 65 PASSENGER CONV UNIT DIESEL

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
* Pl 65 PASSENGER GONV ONIT 1 per unit  $1,500.00  $1,500.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

e IC 65 Passenger Regular LPG Fuel CE

Extended Description :

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV F/ 65 PASSENGER CONV UNIT PROPANE
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INVOICE TO

SHIPTO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
NN 0w K 300 979300
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

25101500 IC 71 Passenger Regular 210 HP CE

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 71 PASSENGER, REGULAR - 210 HP

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV98999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
47 CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 71 1.00000 EA

PASSENGER, REGULAR - LPG #88,947.00 $89,947.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500

IC 71 Passenger Regular LPG Fuel CE

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 71 PASSENGER, REGULAR - LPG FUELED

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line ComanDesc B Qtyﬁi — Unit Iséiu; ,,,, Uﬁi{Fric.:e - -Tl'o_t_.;lml;ricei -
48 DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV 1 per unit $1,500.00 $1,500.00

F/71 PASSENGER CONV UNIT
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Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification Model #

78121603

IC

71 Passenger Regular

CE

Extended Description :

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV F/71 PASSENGER CONV UNIT DIESEL

INVOICE TO

SHIP.TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99009 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
49 DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV ,

F/71 PASSENGER CONV UNIT 4 per unit $1,500.00 $1,500.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121603

IC 71 Passenger Regular LPG Fuel CE

Extended Description :

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV F/71 PASSENGER CONV UNIT PROPANE

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
50 CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 77 1.00000 EA $83,935.00 $83,935.00
PASSENGER, REGULAR - 210 HP
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500
IC 77 Passenger Regular 210 HP CE

Extended Description :

CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 77 PASSENGER, REGULAR - 210 HP
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INVOICE TO

SHIP. TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

51 CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 77 1.00000 EA $83,935.00 $83,935.00
PASSENGER, REGULAR - 225 HP

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

=OAS0p IC 77 Passenger Regular 225 HP CE

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 77 PASSENGER, REGULAR - 225 HP

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

P IO LT o $94,528.00  $94,528.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Za1ised IC 77 Passenger Regular LPG Fuel CE

Extended Description :
CONVENTIONAL UNIT, 77 PASSENGER, REGULAR - LPG FUELED

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Liinei _“-.C‘.;o'mm[nibesc-_. — T Eiw Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
53 DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON,WV F/ F
77 PASSENGER CONV. UNIT 1 per unit $1,500.00 $1,500.00

Page :

22




Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

78121603

IC 77 Passenger Regular CE

Extended Description :

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON,WV F/ 77 PASSENGER CONV. UNIT DIESEL

INVOICE TO

SHIP.TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV999899 No City WV 29999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
54 DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON,WV F/ .
77 PASSENGER CONV. UNIT per unit $1,500.00 $1,500.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121603

IC 77 Passenger Regular LPG Fuel CE

Extended Description :

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON,WV F/ 77 PASSENGER CONV. UNIT PROPANE

INVOICE TO

SHIP. TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
55 SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL  1.00000 EA $78,585.00 $78,585.00
35 PASSENGER - 175 HP
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500 .
IC 35 Passenger Special Needs 175 HP CE

Extended Description :

SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL 35 PASSENGER - 175 HP
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INVOICE TO

SHIP.TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
56 SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL 1.00000 EA

35 PASSENGER - LPG FUELED NO BID
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500

NO BID

Extended Description :

SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL 35 PASSENGER - LPG FUELED

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 995899 Na City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
57 SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL  1.00000 EA 80

47 PASSENGER - 190 HP 78098000 #80,980.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500

IC 47 Passenger Special Needs 190 HP CE

Extended Description :

SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL 47 PASSENGER - 190 HP

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty " UnitIssue Unit Price Total Price
58 SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL  1.00000 EA
47 PASSENGER - LPG FUELED NO BID
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Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification Model #

25101500

NO BID

Extended Description :

SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL 47 PASSENGER - LPG FUELED

INVOICE TO

SHIP.TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
59 SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL ~ 1.00000 EA $80,980.00 $80,980.00
53 PASSENGER - 210 HP ‘
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500
TG 53 Passenger Special Needs 210 HP CE

Extended Description :

SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL 53 PASSENGER - 210 HP

INVOICE TO

SHIP. TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV89999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
60 SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL 1.00000 EA

53 PASSENGER - LPG FUELED NO BID
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500 NO BID

Extended Description :

SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL 53 PASSENGER - LPG FUELED
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INVOICE TO

SHIPTO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

25101500 IC 59 Passenger Special Needs 210 HP CE

Extended Description :
SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL 59 PASSENGER - 210 HP

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99929 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
62 SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL  1.00000 EA
59 PASSENGER - LPG FUELED NO BID
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
01
25101500 NO BID
Extended Description :
SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL 59 PASSENGER - LPG FUELED
INVOICE TO SHIP TO
ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price '
63 SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL  1.00000 EA 83,031.00 83,031.00
65 PASSENGER - 225 HP %83, g, U8
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Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

25101500
IC

65 Passenger Special Needs 225 HP

CE

Extended Description :
SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL 65 PASSENGER - 225 HP

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV98999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
64 SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL 1.00000 EA

65 PASSENGER - LPG FUELED $93,619.00 $93,619.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500

IC 65 Passenger Special Needs LPG Fuel CE

Extended Description :

SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL 65 PASSENGER - LPG FUELED

INVOICE TO

SHIP. TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
65 SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL  1.00000 EA

71 PASSENGER - 225 HP $83,069.00 $83,069.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101500

IC 71 Passenger Special Needs 225 HP CE

Extended Description :
SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL 71 PASSENGER - 225 HP
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INVOICE TO

SHIP.TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
e e . $92,662.00  493,662.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

2511500 IC 71 Passenger Special Needs LPG Fuel CE

Extended Description :
SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL 71 PASSENGER - LPG FUELED

INVOICE TO

SHIP. TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

T MR SO 1m0 i $7,662.00  387,662.09
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

25101500 IC 77 Passenger Special Needs 225 HP CE

Extended Description :
SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL 77 PASSENGER - 225 HP

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

us us
e “GommLnDéac — — Qy ~ Unitlssue Unit Price Total Price
68 SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL  1.00000 EA
77 PASSENGER - LPG FUELED $98,255.00 $98,255.00
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

5101500
2510 IC /7 Passenger Special Needs LPG Fuel CE

Extended Description :
SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL 77 PASSENGER - LPG FUELED
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EXHIBIT B
SBUS15 Pricing Pages

TRANSIT UNITS

71 Passenger

210HP, FE $ NO BID

225HP, FE $ NO BID

225HP, RE $_94,108.00

Delivery to Charleston, WV $ 1,500.00
77 Passenger

210HP, FE $ NO BID

225HP, FE $ NO BID

225HP, RE $__99,037.00

Delivery to Charleston, WV $ 1,500.00
84 Passenger

240HP, FE $___ N0 BID

240HP, RE g

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV 1,500.00
89 Passenger

240HP, FE $___No BID

240HP, RE _$_103,559.00

Delivery to Charleston, WV $ 1,500.00
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EXHIBIT B
SBUS15 Pricing Pages

CONVENTIONAL UNITS

24 Passenger

Type A - 130HP
Type A - LPG fueled
Type B — 130HP
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV

30 Passenger
Type A —-130HP
Type A - LPG fueled
Type B - 130HP
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV

35 Passenger
Regular - 175HP
Regular — LPG fueled
Delivery To Charleston, WV

47 Passenger
Regular - 190HP
Regular — LPG fueled
Regular - 210HP
Delivery To Charleston, WV
DELIVERY, LPG, TO CHARLESTON, WV
53 Passenger
Regular - 190HP
Regular — LPG fueled
Regular - 210HP
Delivery To Charleston, WV
DELIVERY, LPG, TO CHARLESTON, WV
59 Passenger
Regular - 190HP
Regular - 210HP
Regular — LPG fueled
Delivery To Charleston, WV
DELIVERY, LPG, TO CHARLESTON, WV
65 Passenger
Regular - 210HP
Regular - 225HP
Regular — LPG fueled
Delivery To Charleston, WV
DELIVERY, LPG, TO CHARLESTON, WV

el

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

©= & O

NO BID

NO BID

_NO:BID

© £ A

74,606

.00

NO BID

& & &N

1,500.

00

76,826,

00

NO BID

77,074,

00

1,500.

00

Rl

N/A

76,826

.00

NO_ BID

77,074,

00

1,500.

00

N/A

77,427,

00

77,614

.00

NO BID

1,500

.00

F n o

N/A

79,149,

00

79,149.

00

89,737.

00

1,500.

00

i n

1,500.

00
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EXHIBIT B
SBUS15 Pricing Pages

71 Passenger

Regular - 210HP

Regular — LPG fueled

Delivery To Charleston, WV
DELIVERY, LPG, TO CHARLESTON, WV

77 Passenger

Regular - 210HP

Regular - 225HP

Regular — LPG fueled

Delivery To Charleston, WV
DELIVERY, LPG, TO CHARLESTON, WV

79,354,

00

89.947.

00

1,500.

“r €h tH

1,500.

00

83,935,

00

83,935

00

94,528.

00

1,500

.00

1,500.

00
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175HP

LPG fueled
DELIVERY TO

190HP .
LPG fueled
DELIVERY TO

210 HP
LPG fueled
DELIVERY TO

210 HP
LPG fueled

DELIVERY TO

225 HP
LPG fueled
DELIVERY TO

225 HP
LPG fueled
DELIVERY TO

225 HP

LPG fueled
DELIVERY TO

CHARLESTON,

CHARLESTON ,

CHARLESTON,

CHARLESTON ,

CHARLESTON ,

CHARLESTON ,

CHARLESTON ,

Special Needs — Conventional

EXHIBIT B
SBUS15 Pricing Pages

WV

WV

Wv

WV

wv

WV

Wv

35 Passenger

47 Passenger

53 Passenger

59 Passenger

65 Passenger

71 Passenger

77 Passenger

$ 78,585.00

$ NO BID
$_ 1.500.00

80,980.00

$
- $_NO BID
$

1,500.00

$ 80,980.00

$ NO BID
$ 1,500.00

$ 81,521.00

$_No BID
$ 1,500.00

$ 83,031.00
$_93,619.00

$ 1,500.00

$ 83,069.00

.$_93,662.00_

$_1,500.00

$ 87,662.00
98,255.00

e 1 200,00
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EXHIBITB
SBUS15 Pricing Pages
DELIVERY:
Bidders must state number of days after receipt of order (ARO) for b'us delivery. Number

of days for delivery shall be no greater than 120 days. This does include “letters of
intent”. -

Buses will be delivered within 120 daysARO.

Unit Vendor:_ Heritage Bus Sales, Inc.

c. ~ 7\
William D. Duncan %,{,/%N Z,«) /x(_,)-an-m—————--

Print Name) (Signature)

Date  12-11-14

Phone 304-345-2490

Toll Free Phone Number 844-484-2287

Fax: 304-759-9807

Email . bduncan@heritagetrks.com

Page 5 of 5



CERTIFICATIONAND SIGNATURE PAGE
By signing below, or submitting documentation through wvOASIS, I certify that I have reviewed
this Solicitation in its entirety; understand the requirements, terms and conditions, and other
information contained herein;-that I-am-submitting this-bid, offer-or proposal for reviéw and
consideration; that I am authorized by the vendor to execute and submit this bid, offer, or
proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor’s behalf; that I am authorized to bind the
vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, the vendor has

properly registered with any State agency that may require registration,

Heritage Bus Saltes; Tncs
(Company) )

%’?,é//gw len~"W.D. Duncan President
(Authorized Signature) (Representative Name, Title)

304-345-2490 304-759-9807 12-11-14
(Phone Number) (Fax Number) (Date)

Revised 08/08/2014



Rev. 04/14 State of West Virginia
_VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application* is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation miethod only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1. Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this certification: or,

Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the
ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has
maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately
preceding the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

2. Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a
minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder's affiliate’s or subsidiary’s employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state
continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

4. Application is made for 5% vendor preference for the reason checked:
XXXZBidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,

5. Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:
Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves orthe National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

6. Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:
Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

7 Application is made for preference as a non-resident small, women- and minority-owned business, in accor-
dance with West Virginia Code §5A-3-59 and West Virginia Code of State Rules.

Bidder has been or expects to be approved prior to contract award by the Purchasing Division as a certified small, women-
and minority-owned business.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid: or (b) assess a penalty
against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to the contracting agency
or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

w

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
———-authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate'inform'ati'onverifyinmhat‘dedEfr'h’aS‘pﬁid‘*v' -

the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other infarmation

deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true
and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate
changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Division ‘inar\iting immediately.

: 727 . f )
Bidder: Heritage Bus Sales, Inc. S@nedtj&ikié%iwuf EX Ko

Date:  12-11-14 ; Title:

President




RFQ No. CRFQ 0402 EDD1500000009

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

MANDATE: Under W. Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any
of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party
to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and: (1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in
the aggregate; or (2) the debtor is in employer default.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition listed above does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to
chapter eleven of the W. Va. Code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and

DEFINITIONS: ..

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its
political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers’
compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state
or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon,

“Employer default” means having an outstanding balance or liability to the old fund or to the uninsured employers'
fund or being in policy default, as defined in W. Va, Code § 23-2¢-2, failure to maintain mandatory workers'
compensation coverage, or failure to fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An
employer is not in employer default if it has entered into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Commissioner
and remains in compliance with the obligations under the repayment agreement.

“Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company
or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage,
ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that
the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from
performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total
contract amount.

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor’s authorized signer affirms and acknowledges under penalty of
law for false swearing (W. Va. Code §61-5-3) that neither vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined
above and that neither vendor nor any related party are In employer default as defined above, unless the debt or
employer default is permitted under the exception above.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:

Vendor's Name: _Heritage Bus Sales s ;nc i

Authorized Signature: ?//{Cﬁ{w ;(/ . L&«w—*‘“‘""\ Date: 12-11-14

State of _West Virginia

County of _Kanawha , to-wit:

Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me thisl ltldayof _ December , 2014
£y ) i

My Commission expires L O S s} 20 0l

OFFICIAL SEAL
MOTARY PUBLIC
STAVE OF WEST VIRGINIA
JENNIFER ASEURY
HEAITAGE TRUGK CEMTERS

408 GOFF MOUNTAIN ROAD b
CROSS LANES, WV 25313 -«;)
My commission expires Octaber 23, 2020 :

NOTARY PUBLIC _ \l\)g U&l}«'\«\/””"

Lurchasing Affidavit (Revised 07/0 1/?2X)




